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The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
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Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2300000122
Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2023-04-27
Comments:

Response Time:
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FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep

304-558-2566

john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X FEIN#

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 GeoMelt 55 Liquid Organic Additive 275 0.00000 EA
gallon tote
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161506

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2

GeoMelt 55 Liquid Organic 500-2000 gallons 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification Model #
46161506

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 GeoMelt 55 Liquid Organic Additive 0.00000 GL 3.010000 0.00
2001-4000 gallons
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161506

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Beet- Heet Concentrate - 2001-4000 gallons

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 GeoMelt 55 Liquid Organic Additive 4001 or  0.00000 GL 2.230000 0.00
greater gallons

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

46161506
Commodity Line Comments: Beet-Heet Concentrate - 4001-4599 gallons

**Full Load - 4600 gallons - $2.18/gallon
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Portable Storage Unit Rental, minimum 3800 0.00000 MO
gallons

Comm Code
24111803

Manufacturer Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Date Printed:  May 2, 2023 Page: 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Portable Storage Unit Return, per rental unit  0.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

24111803

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Demurrage, charged after 2 hr grace period, 0.00000 EA 125.000000 0.00
per each 1/4 HR
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
76122401

Commodity Line Comments: Demurrage after 2 Hour Grace Period per each 1/4 hour
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  May 2, 2023 Page: 3 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05
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BEET HEET®

U713 RED HOT GIREEN (2131E]3
Brought to you by

4

A Klink Group Company klinkgroup.com and sole
developer, manufacturer and distributor of BEET HEET®,
the best performing deicer in North America.

BEET HEET®

users have won the national APWA
Excellence in Snow & Ice Control
Award 9 times in the last 13 years!

it

Beer Meer® ——
cmmﬂa n Is research for winter highway maintenance

P Qualified
99% Biodegradable Broducts List

“Readily” Biodegradable in 8 days!

BEET HEET IS NOT BEET JUICE!!


http://www.klinkgroup.com/
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BEET HEET®
PERFORMANCE IS EVERYTHING!

SALT STOCKPILE TREATMENT

BEET HEET® Concentrate (BHC)

+ Evenly apply to salt at 5 gallons per ton and turn until uniformly coated and colored.
* Rock salt must have a moisture content of less than 1.5%

+ If the salt’s moisture content is greater than 1.5%, apply at 4 gallons per ton
Benefits at 5 gal/ton

* Melts up to 65.1% more ice than untreated rock salt at 5 gal. per ton at 25°F*

* Melts up to 153.2% more ice than untreated rock salt at 5 gal. per ton at 15°F*

» Melts up to 38.1% more ice than 32% CacCl, treated salt at 5 gal. per ton at 25°F*
* Reduce salt application rates 28% at 25°F if transitioning from “beet juice” pre-wet.
* Reduce salt application rates 27% at 25°F if transitioning from 32% CaCl, pre-wet.
» Reduce salt application rates 39% at 25°F if transitioning from untreated rock salt.
» Low effective working surface temperature, Lower than -12.5°F

SALT PRE-WETTING

BEET HEET® Blends

* BHC can be used as a pre-wet at 100%, but we recommend cutting BHC with 23.3% NacCl
brine 50% to 75%.

» Apply at 5 to 20 gallons per ton depending on blend ratio and incoming weather.

Benefits

* Melts up to 65% more ice than untreated rock salt at 25°F*

* Melts up to 153% more ice than untreated rock salt at 15°F*

» Melts up to 38% more ice than 32% CaCl, treated salt at 25°F*

* Reduce salt application rates up to 28% at 25°F if transitioning from beet juice pre-wet

* Reduce salt application rates up to 39% at 25°F if transitioning from untreated rock salt

+ Low effective working surface temperature, -22.5°F

DIRECT APPLICATION ANTI-ICING & DEICING

* Apply at 20 to 57.5 gallons per I/m depending on BHC/NaCl brine blend and temperature.
Benefits

* Melts up to 26% more ice than 23.3% NacCl brine at 20°F*

* Melts up to 19% more ice than a 10/15/75 “super-mix” anti-icer at 20°F*

* Melts up to 16% more ice than a S30/70 “beet juice” anti-icer at 20°F*

+ Far superior anti-bonding properties allowing much easier snow and ice removal
 Superior residual properties reducing the number of applications per event and season

* Low effective working surface temperature, -12.5°F to -17.5°F

* Advanced Laboratories, Inc. Salt Lake City, Utah
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BEET HEET®

Brine treated rock salt is nearly 50% more costly to
use than self made BEET HEET® Severe treated salt!

1,000 tons at Brine Treated
$75.00 per ton Rock Salt

= $75,000
\$75,000

E____A.—-——-—H'\

10,000 gallons of
brine at $0.20 $77’OOO

per gallon = $2,000 Total Cost

609.2 tons at = . /’17;— >

$75.00 per ton = A [T S

= $45,690\ Severe | -:li-o
$45 690 Rock Salt

6,092 gallons of-self

made BEET HEET

Severe at $1.04 $52’025
per gallon = $6,336 Total Cost




BEET HEET®

RETURN ON INVESTMENT (ROI)

Self Made BEET HEET Severe Pre-wet
"]

23.3% NaCl Brine Pre-wet

394%

Before Integrating BH Severe- BEET HEET Severe Treated Salt 10 gal/ton (projected)

Current tons of salt being used per season 1,000
Gallons of 23.3% Brine required at 10 gallons per ton. 10,000
Total cost of rock salt purchases $75,000.00
Total cost of 23.3% Brine $2,000.00
Total cost in rock salt purchases, and 23.3% Brine purchases, if any $77,000.00

After Integrating BH Severe- BEET HEET Severe Treated Salt 10 gal/ton (projected)

Tons of BH Severe treated salt needed to melt the same amount of ice 609
Gallons of BH Severe required at 10 gallons per ton. 6,092
Total cost of rock salt purchases after integrating BH Severe $45,689.66
Total cost of BH Severe $6,335.63
Total cost in rock salt purchases and BH Severe purchases $52,025.29

Savings by Integrating BH Severe- BEET HEET Severe Treated Salt 10 gal/ton (projected)

Number of 25 ton semi-trailer loads of rock salt (sodium chioride) Saved by using BH Severe 15.6
Net total savings realized on investment in BH Severe $24,974.71
Net total return on investment in BH Severe 394.19%
Rock salt reduction required using BH Severe to reach the BREAK EVEN POINT 9.84%

How much is your $0.20 23.3% Brine actually costing your agency in lost savings (per gal.)
Your current material COsts (rock salt & pre-wet) USiNg 23.3% Brine are much higher.




BEET HEET®
BEET HEET®vs. beet juice

DE-SUGARED 55% Solids Beet Juice

Consistency - Very Inconsistent (Easily verified by laboratory testing)

Total Sugar Content 18.3% (Average)

Total Chloride Content 0.6% (Average)

Total Active Ingredient Content <18.9% (Average) (48% less vs. BHC)

Price Per each 1% of Active Ingredient = $0.096 (90% higher vs. BHC)

Breathtaking Odor.

Proneto Bacterial Growth (Bacteriaconsumes sugar, reduces activeingredient content)
Plugging Issues (Tank sludge and plugging issues widely reported)

Promoted as “non-chloride” deicer but can’t melt ice without adding chloride! Once
activated with chloride, beet juice is a chloride deicer.

At 5 gal. per ton, beet juice treated salt melts about 22.4% less ice than BHC at 25°F.

BEET HEET® Concentrate (BHC)

Absolutely NO “beet juice” added

Contains processed beet molasses. (No sludge or plugging issues)
Consistency - Very Consistent (molasses is not a waste-stream product)
Total Sugar Content >15.1%

Total Chloride Content >21.4% (Over 35 times more vs. beet juice)

Total Active Ingredient Content >36.5% (93% more vs. beet juice)

Price Per 1% of Active Ingredient = $0.048 (47% lower vs. beet juice)

Odor — Coffee, Syrup or Chocolate (sweet compared to beet juice)

Bacteria can’t survive in BHC (no loss of active ingredient)

No Plugging or Tank Slugging Issues (none reported)

Stand Alone Ice Melter (no time and effort of mixing with chloride required)
At 5 gal/per ton, BHC treated salt melts about 28.8% more ice than beet juice at 25°F.

Conclusion

Beet juice costs 90% more than BHC when considering price per each 1% of active
ingredient! Because beet juice contains 48% |ess active ingredient than BHC, beet juice
treated salt melts about 22.4% less ice than BHC treated salt at 25°F. Therefore, beet
juice users must use about 28.8% more salt to melt the same amount of ice as BHC
treated salt. This means that beet juice users are discharging much more chloride into
their local environment than necessary.

They’re also spending much more on rock salt than necessary. Transitioning to BHC
would allow current beet juice users to reduce their salt application rates by about 22.4%
and still melt the same amount of ice as beet juice treated salt. Transitioning to BHC
would also decrease beet juice user’s chloride emissions and salt costs by about 22.4%.
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BEET HEET®
BEET HEET®vs. beet juice

Category BEET HEET 55% Sol_ids
Concentrate Beet Juice
Plugging of Strainers & Nozzles No Yes
Bacterial Growth/Diminishing Active Ingredient No Yes
Fallout/Tank Sludge No Yes
Requires Added Chloride to Melt Ice No Yes
Appearance Dark Brown Dark Brown
Odor Coffee - Syrup Offensive
Specific Gravity 1.29 +/- 0.015 1.27 +/- .02
Freeze Point -23.8°F -22.5°F*
Weight/Gallon Ibs. 10.75 +/- .10 10.5 +/- .20

Solids Content (by weight)(by volume)

(39%)(51%) +/- 2%

(43%)(55%) +/- 2%

Ingredient Consistency

Very Consistent

Very Inconsistent

Non-Exothermic (NaCl)(KCI) Chloride Content by weight

6.4% +/- .5%

0.6%* +/- .5%

Exothermic (CaCl2)(MgCl2) Chloride Content by weight

15.0% +/- .5%

0.0%*

Sugar Content by weight

15.1% +/- .5%

18.3%* +/- .5%

Total Active Ingredient Content by weight

36.5% +/- 1% (+93%)

18.9%* +/- 1% (-48%)

Ice Melt Performance @ 25°F (Treated salt @ 5 gal/ton) 28% more 22% less

Ice Melt Performance @ 15°F (Treated salt @ 5 gal/ton) 38% more 27% less
Chloride Emissions @ 25°F (Treated salt @ 5 gal/ton) 22% less t 28% more t
Chloride Emissions @ 15°F (Treated salt @ 5 gal/ton) 27% less T 38% more t
Average Delivered Cost Per Gallon (315 mi from plant) $1.88 $1.88
Average Delivered Cost Per Each 1% of Active Ingredient 0.052 (47% lower) | $0.099 (90% higher)
Average Delivery Time 24 to 48 hours 3to 5 days

* Averaged count due to product inconsistency

1 Based on the amount of treated rock salt required to melt the same amount of ice.

This Is Simple Logic

More Active Ingredient = Better Performance
Better Performance = Lower Application Rates
Lower Application Rates = Lower Material Costs
Lower Application Rates = Lower Chloride Emissions

10




BEET HEET®
BEET HEET®vs. CaCl2

32% Calcium Chloride (CacCl,)

» Total Sugar Content 0.0%

» Total Chloride Content 32.0%

» Total Active Ingredient Content 32% (12.3% less vs. BHC)

* PNS Corrosion Value = 121 (717.5% more corrosive than BHC)

+ At 7 gal/ton, 32% CaCl, treated salt melts about 27.5% |ess ice than BH at 25°F.

* 32% CaCl, cannot darken rock salt or brine like BHC does! The darker rock salt and
brine are, the more solar radiation (heat) they absorb. If they are absorbing heat, they
are emitting heat as well.

BEET HEET® Concentrate (BHC)

» Total Sugar Content >15.1%

» Total Chloride Content >21.4%

+ Total Active Ingredient Content >36.5% (14.0% more vs. 32% CacCl,)

* PNS Corrosion Value = 14.8 (87.7% less corrosive than 32% CacCl,)

+ At 5gal. per ton, BHC treated salt melts about 38.1% more ice than 32% CacCl, treated
salt at 25°F.

+ BHC darkens rock salt and brine, transforming them into solar radiation absorbers
and heat emitters. At 27°F, BHC treated rock salt can be as much as 5°F warmer than
white rock salt. A 50/50 blend of BHC and 23.3% NaCl brine can be as much as 10°F
warmer than a clear chloride solution.

Conclusion

Because 32% CaCl, contains 12.3% less active ingredient than BHC and does not contain
any sugar, 32% CacCl, treated salt melts about 27.5% |ess ice than BHC treated salt at
25°F. Therefore, 32% CacCl, users must use about 38.1% more salt to melt the same
amount of ice as BHC treated salt. This means that 32% CacCl, users are discharging
about 38.1% more chloride into their local environment than necessary. They’re also
spending about 38.1% more on rock salt than necessary.

Transitioning to BHC would allow current 32% CacCl, users to reduce their salt application
rates by about 27.5% and still melt the same amount of ice as 32% CacCl, treated salt.
They would also be reducing their chloride emissions and rock salt costs by about 27.5%.

Because 32% CaCl, does not contain dark sugar like BHC, (See page 4 of this booklet) it
has no ability to transform rock salt or brine into radiation absorbers and heat emitters.
This, along with a 27.5% lower ice melt capacity makes it impossible for 32% CaCl, to
outperform BHC in the laboratory or in the field. Couple these performance shortcomings
with the fact that 32% CacCl, is over 700% more corrosive than BHC, it’s very difficult to
justify the use of 32% CaCl, over BHC.
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BEET HEET®
CORROSION DATA

How does BEET HEET® Concentrate (BHC) compare to other popular deicers when it
comes to corrosion value?

* 32% calcium chloride is more than 700% more corrosive than BHC.
* 23.3% sodium chloride brine is 575% more corrosive than BHC.

+ A typical “super-mix” deicer containing 10% 32% CacCl,, 15% beet juice and 75%
23.3% NaCl, is 400% more corrosive than BHC.

» Deicers containing beet juice and 23.3% NaCl brine are significantly more
corrosive than BHC and they don’t even contain performance enhancing
exothermic chlorides.

K-Tech uses all natural sugars to reduce BHC’s corrosion rate. Many, if not all,
deicers claiming similar corrosion rates contain added chemicals to reduce corrosion
values because they do not contain enough sugar to reduce corrosion values much.
BHC contains no added corrosion inhibiting chemicals, just all natural sugar.

NACE Standard TM0169-95 as modified by the
Pacific Northwest Snowfighters
Relative Corrosion

32%

Calcium
Chloride

23.3%
NaCl

g Brine
‘» : 575.6%
o) iy

= i E more
[} g 15 corrosive
o than
S BEET
9 HEET
é Conc.

1 BEETHEET i
Severe

BEETHEET ia
Conc.
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BEET HEET®
TECHNICAL DATA SHEET

DESCRIPTION
BEET HEET® Concentrate (BHC) is an organic based, corrosion inhibited, liquid deicer.

BHC is a ready-to-use salt stockpile treatment. BHC can also be cut 50/50 with low cost
23.3% Sodium Chloride (NaCl) brine to create BEET HEET® Severe (BHS) a low cost, high
performance, salt pre-wetting agent or direct application deicer/anti-icer.

COMPOSITION

Beet Molasses (Liquid Sugar)

Calcium Chloride (Liquid CaCl,) (Exothermic Chloride)
Magnesium Chloride (Liquid MgCl,) (Exothermic Chloride)
Potassium Chloride (Liquid KCI) (Non-exothermic Chloride)
Sodium Chloride (Liquid NaCl) (Non-exothermic Chloride)

PERFORMANCE
BHC, contains more total active ingredient than any deicer in North America.

BHC and BHS have greater ice melt capacities than 32% CacCl,, 28% MgCl,, and “beet juice”
deicers, at all temperature ranges.

BHC and BHS provide far superior anti-bonding and residual effects than 32% CacCl,, 28%
MgCl,, and 23.3% NaCl deicers.

ENVIRONMENT
BHC and BHS have passed the rigorous testing standards of the Pacific Northwest
Snowfighters and are listed on the Clear Roads Qualified Products List.

BHC is 99% biodegradable, and achieves the “readily biodegradable” criteria by day 8.

Due to superior ice melting and residual performance, no other salt pre-wetting agent in
North America can reduce chloride emissions as much as BHC and BHS.

TYPICAL PROPERTIES

Appearance Dark Brown Liquid

pH 6.0-8.0

Specific Gravity 1.29 +/- .015

Lbs. Per Gallon 10.75 +/- 0.10

Solids Content (39% wt/wt) (51% wt/vol) +/- 2%
Odor Chocolate/Syrup/Coffee.
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BEer HEET°

U113 RED HOT GIREEN [e)3lE/5lr
Your options

Self-cut Concentrate
BEeT HEET® CONCENTRATE with 4 Chlorides & 4 Carbohydrates = $1.46 per gal
BEET HEET® CONCENTRATE cut 1:1 with your brine to make BEET HEET® SEVERE
BEeer HEET® CONCENTRATE cut 2:3 with your brine to make BEET HEET® MODERATE
BEET HEET® CONCENTRATE cut 1:2 with your brine to make BEET HEET® TYPICAL

Self-Blended “Super-Blends”

Costing examples with self-manufactured NaCl brine at $0.20 per gallon
BEeT HEET® SEVERE = 50% CowncentrAaTE + 50% NaCl
BEET HEET®° MODERATE
BEET HEET"® TYPICAL

Best
Ice Melter
Period!

Lowest
Priced

Concentrate
Available!

$0.83 per gal

$0.71 per gal
33% ConcenTRATE + 67% NaCl = $0.62 per gal

40% ConcenTtraTE + ©0% NaCl

PRICES DO NOT INCLUDE FREIGHT



BEET HEET®
TRANSITION MADE SIMPLE

If you know the blend and temp, you know the rate!

Operator Cab Card

Suggested* Salt Pre-Wetting Blend & Application Rates

BEET HEET

Deicer Blend BEET HEET Severe BEET HEET | BEET HEET | BEET HEET | BEET HEET
Concentrate Moderate Typical 30/70 25/75
Super Severe
Blend | %of BEET HEET Concentrate 100 50 40 33 30 25
Ratio | o5 0f 23.3% NaCl Brine 0 50 60 67 70 75
Deicer application Rate (Gallons/Ton) 5 10 12.5 15 16.5 20

25°F 1 Salt Application Rate (Pounds L/M)

25°F | Salt Application Rate (Pounds L/M)

20°F | Salt Application Rate (Pounds L/M)

ALl
Al

{es

pro

2 |
1jaed

15°F | Salt Application Rate (Pounds L/M)

10°F | Salt Application Rate (Pounds L/M)

o new.C

1STO!

ners

5°F | Salt Application Rate (Pounds L/M)

0°F | Salt Application Rate (Pounds L/M)

The effective low working surface temperature of rock salt treated with a 50/50 BHC/NaCl brine pre-wet is -22.5°F.

SPECIALTY COATINGS, INC.

The data and information presented herein are based upon tests, research and reports which are considered to
be reliable and accurate. The data and information are presented without warranty, guarantee or liability on our
part, and are presented to the customer for his or her own consideration, investigation and verification. Because
of numerous factors affecting test results, seller makes no warranty of any kind, express or implied, other than the
product conforms to its applicable current standard specifications.
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Denver Preston
P.O. Box 428, 111 W Garfield St
Ashley, IN 46705

Office 1-260-587-3888
Cell/Text 1-260-585-0332
dpreston@ktechcoatings.com

www.ktechcoatings.com

YouTube: ktechcoatings


http://www.ktechcoatings.com/
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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)
4/24/2023

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the
certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

e Kawe:_ ' Sandy Roth

e Dehnayes Grou

1146 Go bl tit Bos PN, Ext; 260-424-5826 (IS, Noj: 260-627-4132
i E-MAIL

Suite 100 ADDRESS: Sandy@dehayes.com

Fort Wayne IN 46845

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #

INSURER A : EMC Property and Casualty Insurance Company 25186

KTECSPE-01
INKS-L"I%ESH Specialty Coatings, LLC MELRERS:
P.O. Box 428 INSURERC -
Ashley IN 46705 INSURER D :
INSURERE :
INSURERF :

COVERAGES

CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 351830903

REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

INSR | ADDL|SUBR] » POLICY EFF | POLICY EXP
LTR | TYPE OF INSURANCE INSD |vai POLICY NUMBER | (MM/DD/YYYY) | (MM/DD/YYYY) LIMITS
A | X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY | 5x48548 8/30/2022 8/30/2023 | EACH OCCURRENCE $ 1,000,000
T DAMAGE TO RENTED T
| CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR . | PREMISES (Ea occurrence) | S 500,000
| ‘ ‘ MED EXP (Any one person) $ 10,000
— L
‘ PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | § 1,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: ; ‘ GENERAL AGGREGATE $ 2,000,000
X lpouey | |FE& | |Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | § 2,000,000
|
OTHER ‘ §
A | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY 5X48548 8/30/2022 aisorzozs | QOMBINEDSINGLELMIT g 00 no
X | ANy AUTO ‘ BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
ALL OWNED | SCHEDULED 0
pLOY | BEe \ BODILY INJURY (Per accident)| §
X | NON-OWNED \ PROPERTY DAMAGE s
7~ | HIREDAUTOS | 2 | AUTOS | (Per accident)
| | s
|
A | X | UMBRELLA LIAB X | occur 5X48548 8/30/2022 8302023 | EACH OCCURRENCE $ 2,000,000
| ) Eial ‘ E 000,
EXCESSLIAB | CLAIMS-MADE | AGGREGATE $ 2,000,000
DED ‘ | RETENTION § | $
A |WORKERS COMPENSATION 5X48548 8/30/2022 8/30r2023 | X | BER ‘ OTH-
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY il ‘ _ STATUTE ER S
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE ‘ | E.L. EACH ACCIDENT $ 500,000
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? } NIA I - -
(Mandatory in NH) | E L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE § 500,000
If yes, describe under ‘ -
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below ‘ E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | § 500,000
A | Leased/Rented Equipment 5X48548 8/30/2022 8/30/2023 | Limit 200,000
Deductible 2,500
|

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

State of West Virginia

Dept of Administration, Purchasing Division

2019 Washington St. E
P.O. Box 50130
Charletston WV 25305-0130

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHQRI;ED REPRESENTATIVE
s ¢
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GENERAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS:

1. CONTRACTUAL AGREEMENT: Issuance of an Award Document signed by the
Purchasing Division Director, or his designee, and approved as to form by the Attorney
General’s office constitutes acceptance by the State of this Contract made by and between the
State of West Virginia and the Vendor. Vendor’s signature on its bid, or on the Contract if the
Contract is not the result of a bid solicitation, signifies Vendor’s agreement to be bound by and
accept the terms and conditions contained in this Contract.

2. DEFINITIONS: As used in this Solicitation/Contract, the following terms shall have the
meanings attributed to them below. Additional definitions may be found in the specifications
included with this Solicitation/Contract.

2.1. “Agency” or “Agencies” means the agency, board, commission, or other entity of the State
of West Virginia that is identified on the first page of the Solicitation or any other public entity
seeking to procure goods or services under this Contract.

2.2. “Bid” or “Proposal” means the vendors submitted response to this solicitation.

2.3. “Contract” means the binding agreement that is entered into between the State and the
Vendor to provide the goods or services requested in the Solicitation.

2.4. “Director” means the Director of the West Virginia Department of Administration,
Purchasing Division. :

2.5. “Purchasing Division” means the West Virginia Department of Administration, Purchasing
Division.

2.6. “Award Document” means the document signed by the Agency and the Purchasing
Division, and approved as to form by the Attorney General, that identifies the Vendor as the
contract holder.

2.7. “Solicitation” means the official notice of an opportunity to supply the State with goods or
services that is published by the Purchasing Division.

2.8. “State” means the State of West Virginia and/or any of its agencies, commissions, boards,
etc. as context requires.

2.9. “Vendor” or “Vendors” means any entity submitting a bid in response to the

Solicitation, the entity that has been selected as the lowest responsible bidder, or the entity that
has been awarded the Contract as context requires.
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3. CONTRACT TERM; RENEWAL; EXTENSION: The term of this Contract shall be
determined in accordance with the category that has been identified as applicable to this
Contract below:

Term Contract

Initial Contract Term: The Initial Contract Term will be for a period of _©ne (1) Year

. The Initial Contract Term becomes effective on the effective start
date listed on the first page of this Contract, identified as the State of West Virginia contract
cover page containing the signatures of the Purchasing Division, Attorney General, and
Encumbrance clerk (or another page identified as )s
and the Initial Contract Term ends on the effective end date also shown on the first page of this
Contract.

Renewal Term: This Contract may be renewed upon the mutual written consent of the Agency,
and the Vendor, with approval of the Purchasing Division and the Attorney General’s office
(Attorney General approval is as to form only). Any request for renewal should be delivered to
the Agency and then submitted to the Purchasing Division thirty (30) days prior to the expiration
date of the initial contract term or appropriate renewal term. A Contract renewal shall be in
accordance with the terms and conditions of the original contract. Unless otherwise specified
below, renewal of this Contract is limited to _ Three @) successive one (1) year
periods or multiple renewal periods of less than one year, provided that the multiple renewal
periods do not exceed the total number of months available in all renewal years combined.
Automatic renewal of this Contract is prohibited. Renewals must be approved by the Vendor.
Agency, Purchasing Division and Attorney General’s office (Attorney General approval is as to
form only)

[[] Alternate Renewal Term — This contract may be renewed for
successive year periods or shorter periods provided that they do not exceed
the total number of months contained in all available renewals. Automatic renewal of this
Contract is prohibited. Renewals must be approved by the Vendor, Agency, Purchasing
Division and Attorney General’s office (Attorney General approval is as to form only)

Delivery Order Limitations: In the event that this contract permits delivery orders, a delivery
order may only be issued during the time this Contract is in effect. Any delivery order issued
within one year of the expiration of this Contract shall be effective for one year from the date the
delivery order is issued. No delivery order may be extended beyond one year after this Contract
has expired.

[[JFixed Period Contract: This Contract becomes effective upon Vendor’s receipt of the notice
to proceed and must be completed within days.
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[] Fixed Period Contract with Renewals: This Contract becomes effective upon Vendor’s
receipt of the notice to proceed and part of the Contract more fully described in the attached
specifications must be completed within days. Upon completion of the
work covered by the preceding sentence, the vendor agrees that:

[ ] the contract will continue for years;

[] the contract may be renewed for successive

year periods or shorter periods provided that they do not exceed the total number of
months contained in all available renewals. Automatic renewal of this Contract is
prohibited. Renewals must be approved by the Vendor, Agency, Purchasing Division
and Attorney General’s Office (Attorney General approval is as to form only).

[[] One-Time Purchase: The term of this Contract shall run from the issuance of the Award
Document until all of the goods contracted for have been delivered. but in no event will this
Contract extend for more than one fiscal year.

[] Construction/Project Oversight: This Contract becomes effective on the effective start
date listed on the first page of this Contract, identified as the State of West Virginia contract
cover page containing the signatures of the Purchasing Division, Attorney General, and
Encumbrance clerk (or another page identified as
), and continues until the project for which the

vendor is providing oversight is complete.

[[] Other: Contract Term specified in

4. AUTHORITY TO PROCEED: Vendor is authorized to begin performance of this contract on
the date of encumbrance listed on the front page of the Award Document unless either the box for
“Fixed Period Contract” or “Fixed Period Contract with Renewals™ has been checked in Section 3
above. If either “Fixed Period Contract” or “Fixed Period Contract with Renewals” has been
checked, Vendor must not begin work until it receives a separate notice to proceed from the State.
The notice to proceed will then be incorporated into the Contract via change order to memorialize the
official date that work commenced.

5. QUANTITIES: The quantities required under this Contract shall be determined in accordance
with the category that has been identified as applicable to this Contract below.

Open End Contract: Quantities listed in this Solicitation/Award Document are
approximations only, based on estimates supplied by the Agency. It is understood and agreed
that the Contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the
Contract, whether more or less than the quantities shown.

[[] Service: The scope of the service to be provided will be more clearly defined in the
specifications included herewith.

[[] Combined Service and Goods: The scope of the service and deliverable goods to be
provided will be more clearly defined in the specifications included herewith.
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[[] One-Time Purchase: This Contract is for the purchase of a set quantity of goods that
are identified in the specifications included herewith. Once those items have been delivered,
no additional goods may be procured under this Contract without an appropriate change
order approved by the Vendor, Agency, Purchasing Division, and Attorney General’s
office.

[[] Construction: This Contract is for construction activity more fully defined in the
specifications.

6. EMERGENCY PURCHASES: The Purchasing Division Director may authorize the Agency
to purchase goods or services in the open market that Vendor would otherwise provide under this
Contract if those goods or services are for immediate or expedited delivery in an emergency.
Emergencies shall include, but are not limited to, delays in transportation or an unanticipated
increase in the volume of work. An emergency purchase in the open market, approved by the
Purchasing Division Director, shall not constitute of breach of this Contract and shall not entitle
the Vendor to any form of compensation or damages. This provision does not excuse the State
from fulfilling its obligations under a One-Time Purchase contract.

7. REQUIRED DOCUMENTS: All of the items checked in this section must be provided to the
Purchasing Division by the Vendor as specified:

[]LICENSE(S) / CERTIFICATIONS / PERMITS: In addition to anything required under the
Section of the General Terms and Conditions entitled Licensing, the apparent successful Vendor
shall furnish proof of the following licenses, certifications, and/or permits upon request and in a
form acceptable to the State. The request may be prior to or after contract award at the State’s
sole discretion.

[

O

The apparent successful Vendor shall also furnish proof of any additional licenses or
certifications contained in the specifications regardless of whether or not that requirement is
listed above.
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8. INSURANCE: The apparent successful Vendor shall furnish proof of the insurance
identified by a checkmark below prior to Contract award. The insurance coverages identified
below must be maintained throughout the life of this contract. Thirty (30) days prior to the
expiration of the insurance policies, Vendor shall provide the Agency with proof that the
insurance mandated herein has been continued. Vendor must also provide Agency with
immediate notice of any changes in its insurance policies, including but not limited to, policy
cancelation, policy reduction, or change in insurers. The apparent successful Vendor shall also
furnish proof of any additional insurance requirements contained in the specifications prior to
Contract award regardless of whether that insurance requirement is listed in this section.

Vendor must maintain:

Commercial General Liability Insurance in at least an amount of; 1.000000.00 per
occurrence. '

[] Automobile Liability Insurance in at least an amount of: per
occurrence.

[[] Professional/Malpractice/Errors and Omission Insurance in at least an amount of:
per occurrence. Notwithstanding the forgoing, Vendor’s are not required
to list the State as an additional insured for this type of policy.

[[] Commercial Crime and Third Party Fidelity Insurance in an amount of:
per occurrence.

[[] Cyber Liability Insurance in an amount of: per
occurrence.

[[] Builders Risk Insurance in an amount equal to 100% of the amount of the Contract.

[] Pollution Insurance in an amount of: per occurrence.

[] Aircraft Liability in an amount of: per occurrence.

O

O

1
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9. WORKERS’ COMPENSATION INSURANCE: Vendor shall comply with laws
relating to workers compensation, shall maintain workers’ compensation insurance when
required, and shall furnish proof of workers® compensation insurance upon request.

10. VENUE: All legal actions for damages brought by Vendor against the State shall be brought
in the West Virginia Claims Commission. Other causes of action must be brought in the West
Virginia court authorized by statute to exercise jurisdiction over it.

11. LIQUIDATED DAMAGES: This clause shall in no way be considered exclusive and shall
not limit the State or Agency’s right to pursue any other available remedy. Vendor shall pay
liquidated damages in the amount specified below or as described in the specifications:

O for

Liquidated Damages Contained in the Specifications.

[] Liquidated Damages Are Not Included in this Contract.

12. ACCEPTANCE: Vendor's signature on its bid, or on the certification and signature page,
constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn, signifies that the product
or service proposed by vendor meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation
for that product or service, unless otherwise indicated, and signifies acceptance of the terms and
conditions contained in the Solicitation unless otherwise indicated.

13. PRICING: The pricing set forth herein is firm for the life of the Contract, unless specified
elsewhere within this Solicitation/Contract by the State. A Vendor’s inclusion of price
adjustment provisions in its bid, without an express authorization from the State in the
Solicitation to do so, may result in bid disqualification. Notwithstanding the foregoing,
Vendor must extend any publicly advertised sale price to the State and invoice at the lower of
the contract price or the publicly advertised sale price.

14. PAYMENT IN ARREARS: Payments for goods/services will be made in arrears only
upon receipt of a proper invoice, detailing the goods/services provided or receipt of the
goods/services, whichever is later. Notwithstanding the foregoing, payments for software
maintenance, licenses, or subscriptions may be paid annually in advance.

15. PAYMENT METHODS: Vendor must accept payment by electronic funds transfer and
P-Card. (The State of West Virginia’s Purchasing Card program, administered under contract
by a banking institution, processes payment for goods and services through state designated
credit cards.)

16. TAXES: The Vendor shall pay any applicable sales, use, personal property or any other
taxes arising out of this Contract and the transactions contemplated thereby. The State of
West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.
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17. ADDITIONAL FEES: Vendor is not permitted to charge additional fees or assess
additional charges that were not either expressly provided for in the solicitation published by the
State of West Virginia, included in the Contract, or included in the unit price or lump sum bid
amount that Vendor is required by the solicitation to provide. Including such fees or charges as
notes to the solicitation may result in rejection of vendor’s bid. Requesting such fees or charges
be paid after the contract has been awarded may result in cancellation of the contract.

18. FUNDING: This Contract shall continue for the term stated herein, contingent upon funds
being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds are
not appropriated or otherwise made available, this Contract becomes void and of no effect
beginning on July 1 of the fiscal year for which funding has not been appropriated or otherwise
made available. If that occurs, the State may notify the Vendor that an alternative source of
funding has been obtained and thereby avoid the automatic termination. Non-appropriation or
non-funding shall not be considered an event of default.

19. CANCELLATION: The Purchasing Division Director reserves the right to cancel this
Contract immediately upon written notice to the vendor if the materials or workmanship supplied
do not conform to the specifications contained in the Contract. The Purchasing Division Director
may also cancel any purchase or Contract upon 30 days written notice to the Vendor in
accordance with West Virginia Code of State Rules § 148-1-5.2.b.

20. TIME: Time is of the essence regarding all matters of time and performance in this
Contract.

21. APPLICABLE LAW: This Contract is governed by and interpreted under West Virginia
law without giving effect to its choice of law principles. Any information provided in
specification manuals, or any other source, verbal or written, which contradicts or violates the
West Virginia Constitution, West Virginia Code, or West Virginia Code of State Rules is void
and of no effect.

22. COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS: Vendor shall comply with all applicable federal, state, and
local laws, regulations and ordinances. By submitting a bid, Vendor acknowledges that it has
reviewed, understands, and will comply with all applicable laws, regulations, and ordinances.

SUBCONTRACTOR COMPLIANCE: Vendor shall notify all subcontractors providing
commodities or services related to this Contract that as subcontractors, they too are
required to comply with all applicable laws, regulations, and ordinances. Notification
under this provision must occur prior to the performance of any work under the contract
by the subcontractor.

23. ARBITRATION: Any references made to arbitration contained in this Contract, Vendor’s
bid, or in any American Institute of Architects documents pertaining to this Contract are hereby
deleted, void, and of no effect.
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