
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 769708

Solicitation Description: Water Treatment Chemicals
Caustic Soda/Soda Ash Briquettes

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2020-10-06 13:30 SR 0313 ESR09302000000002732 1

VENDOR

VS0000013561
PHOENIX SOLUTIONS LLC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0313 DEP2100000008

Total Bid: 893838.150000000023283064365386962890625Response Date: 2020-09-30 Response Time: 13:05:36

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Joseph E Hager III
(304) 558-2306
joseph.e.hageriii@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Liquid Caustic Soda Bulk- Region 1 100000.00000GL 1.240000 124000.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12352316    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:

20% liquid caustic soda bulk delivery to Region One (1) (F.O.B.)  
(Counties of: Monongalia, Preston, Tucker, Grant, Mineral)

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 Liquid Caustic Soda Tote - Statewide 5.00000 EA 797.750000 3988.75

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12352316    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:

20% liquid caustic soda tote delivered Statewide due to unforeseen or urgent situations (F.O.B.)

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 Soda Ash Briquettes Region 1 5.00000 PLLT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
47101600    

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Soda Ash Briquettes delivery to Region One (1) (F.O.B.)  
(Counties of: Monongalia, Preston, Tucker, Grant, Mineral)

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 Soda Ash Briquettes Region 2 5.00000 PLLT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
47101600    

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Soda Ash Briquettes delivery to Region Two (2) (F.O.B.)  (Counties of: Harrison, Marion, Barbour, Upshur, Randolph, Lewis)
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 Soda Ash Briquettes Region 3 5.00000 PLLT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
47101600    

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Soda Ash Briquettes delivery to Region Three (3)  (F.O.B.)  
(Counties of: Nicholas, Fayette, Raleigh, Greenbrier)

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 Soda Ash Briquettes Region 4 5.00000 PLLT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
47101600    

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Soda Ash Briquettes delivery to Region Four (4)  (F.O.B.)  
(Counties of: Clay, Kanawha, Boone, Logan, Mingo)

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 Soda Ash Briquettes Statewide 5.00000 PLLT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
47101600    

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Soda Ash Briquettes delivery Statewide due to unforeseen or urgent (F.O.B.)

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Liquid Caustic Soda Bulk - Region 2 125000.00000GL 1.240000 155000.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12352316    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:

20% liquid caustic soda bulk delivery to Region Two (2) (F.O.B.)
(Counties of: Harrison, Barbour, Upshur, Randolph, Lewis)



Date Printed: Oct 6, 2020 Page: 4 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Liquid Caustic Soda Bulk - Region 3 175000.00000GL 3.000000 525000.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12352316    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:

20% liquid caustic soda bulk delivery to Region Three (3) (F.O.B.)
(Counties of: Nicholas, Fayette, Raleigh, Greenbrier)

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Liquid Caustic Soda Bulk - Region 4 10000.00000GL 3.000000 30000.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12352316    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:

20% liquid caustic soda bulk delivery to Region Four (4) (F.O.B.)
(Counties of: Clay, Kanawha, Boone, Logan, Mingo)

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Liquid Caustic Soda Bulk- Statewide 15000.00000GL 3.000000 45000.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12352316    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:

20% liquid caustic soda bulk  delivery Statewide due to unforeseen or urgent situations (F.O.B.)

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Liquid Caustic Soda Tote - Region 1 5.00000 EA 446.740000 2233.70

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12352316    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:

20% liquid caustic soda tote delivered to Region One (1) (F.O.B.)  
(Counties of: Monongalia, Preston, Tucker, Grant, Mineral)
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Liquid Caustic Soda Tote- Region 2 5.00000 EA 446.740000 2233.70

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12352316    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:

20% liquid caustic soda tote delivered to Region Two (2) (F.O.B.)
(Counties of: Harrison, Barbour, Upshur, Randolph, Lewis)

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Liquid Caustic Soda Tote- Region 3 5.00000 EA 574.380000 2871.90

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12352316    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:

20% liquid caustic soda tote delivered to Region Three (3) (F.O.B.)
(Counties of: Nicholas, Fayette, Raleigh, Greenbrier)

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Liquid Caustic Soda Tote - Region 4 5.00000 EA 702.020000 3510.10

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12352316    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:

20% liquid caustic soda tote delivered to Region Four (4) (F.O.B.)
(Counties of: Clay, Kanawha, Boone, Logan, Mingo)



























































































































http://www.olinchloralkali.com/
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