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GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
PURCHASE ORDER/CONTRACT

1. ACCEPTANCE: Seller shall be bound by this order and its terms and conditions upon receipt of this order.

5 APPLICABLE LAW: The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing
Division shall govern all rights and dulies under the Contract, including without limitation the validity of this

Purchase Order/Contract.

% NON-FUNDING: Al services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Orders/Contracts are o be
continued for the terms of the Purchase Order/Contract, confingent upon funds being appropriated by the
Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise avallable
for these services or goods, this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.

4. COMPLIANCE: Seller shall comply with all Federal, State and local laws, regulations and ordinances including,
but not limited to, the prevailing wage rates of the WV Division of Labor,

5. MODIFICATIONS: This writing is the parties final expression of infent. No modification of this order shall be
binding unless agreed to in writing by the Buyer.

6. ASSIGNMENT: Neither this Order nor any monies due, or to become due hersunder may be assigned by the
Seller without the Buyer's consent.

7. WARRANTY: The Seller expressly warrants that the goods and/or services covered by this order will:
{a} conform to the specifications, drawings, samples or other description fumished or specified by the
Buyer; {b} be merchantable and fit for the purpose intended: andfor {c} be free from defect in material
and workmanship.

8. CANCELLATION: The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written
notice to the sellet.

9. SHIPPING, BILLING & PRICES: Prices are those stated in this order. No price increase will be accepted
without written authority from the Buyer. ANl goods or services shall be shipped on or before the date

specified in this Order.

10. LATE PAYMENTS: Payments may only be made after the defivery of goods or services. [nterest may be
paid on late payments in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

11. TAXES: The State of West Virginia is exempt from Federal and State laxes and will not pay or reimburse
such taxes.

12. RENEWAL: Any reference fo automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Conftract may be renewed only upon
mutual written agreement of the parties.

13. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, the State may deem
this contract null and void, and terminate such contract without further order.

14. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and available online at the Purchasing Division's web site
(htip:l/mnmw.state.wv.us/admin/purchaselvrclhipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement Provided that,
the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Enfity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health
Information (45 CFR §160.103} to the vendor.

15, WEST VIRGINIA ALCOHOL & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT: If this Contract constitutes a public improvement
construction confract as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 2t of the West Virginia Code ("The West Virginia Alcohol
and Drug-Free Warkplace Act’), then the following language shall hereby become part of this Confract: "The
contractor and its subcontractors shall implement and maintain a written drug-free workplace policy in compliance
with the West Virginia Alcohol and Drug-Free Workplace Act, as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code. The coniractor and its subcontractors shall provide a sworn statement in writing, under the
penalfies of perjury, that they maintain a valid drug-free work place policy in compliance with the West Virginia
and Drug-Free Workplace Act. It is understood and agreed that this Confract shall be cancelled by the awarding
authority if the Contractor: 1) Fails to implement its drug-free workplace policy; 2) Fails to provide information
regarding implementation of the confractor's drug-free workplace policy at the request of the public authority; or
3) Provides to the public authority faise informafion regarding the contractor's drug-free workplace policy.”

Rev. 5/19/09
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SBUS10 Pricing Pages

210HP, FE, Automatic Transmission
225HP, FE, Automatic Transmission
225HP, RE, Automatic Transmission
Delivery to Charleston, WV

210HP, FE, Automatic Transmission
225HP, FE, Automatic Transmission
225HP, RE, Automatic Transmission
Delivery to Charleston, WV

240HP, FE, Automatic Transmission
240HP, RE, Automatic Transmission

240HP, FE, Automatic Transmission

240HP, RE, Automatic Transmission
Delivery to Charleston, WV

Transit Unit Vendor:

TRANSIT UNITS

71 Passenger

77 Passenger

84 Passenger

83 Passenger

BWAB Interpational LLC

Chhees R Benne i

QJ&&iﬁh>éZG&MﬂNJ6L/L

Print Name)

Date  10-19-2009

{(Signature)

Phone  304-204-2601

Toll Free Phone Number

800-350-5448

Fax: 304-204-2606

Emai chennett@bwabintl.com

No Bid

No Bid

90,900.00

A £ B o3

1,100.00

No Bid

No Bid

85,200.00

5 €7 L 5

1,100.00

No Bid

95,400.00

No Bid

97,000.00

3 0 £H

1,100.00




SBUS10 Pricing Pages

CONVENTIONAL UNITS

24 Passenger

Type A1 — 130HP — Automatic Transmission
Type B — 130HP — Automatic Transmission

30 Passenger

Type A1~ 130HP —~ Automatic Transmission
Type B — 130HP — Automatic Transmission

35 Passenger
Regular - 178HP - Automalic Transmission
Sp. Education - 175MP - Automatic Transmission
Deglivery To Charleston, WV

47 Passenger
R@guiar - 190HP - Automatic Transmission
Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission
Sp. Education - 190HP - Automatic Transmission
Delivery To Charleston, WV

53 Passenger
Regular - 190HP - Automatic Transmission
Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission
Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission
Delivery To Charleston, WV

59 Passenger

Regular - 180HP - Autcmatic Transmission
Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission

Delivery To Charleston, WV
55 Passenger

Regufar - 210HP ~ Automatic Transmission
Regular - 2256HP Automatic Transmission

Delivery To Charleston, WV

$ No Bid

$ 68,400.00
% No Bid

& 68,900.00
$ 75,800.00
$ 79,700.00
$_1,100.00
$ 76,700.00
$ 76,700.00
$  80,000.00
$ 1,100.00
$_ 76,800.00
$ 76,800.00
$  76,800.00
$_1,100.00
$ 77,700.00
$__77,700.00
% 1,100,600
$_ 77,8008.00
$  77,900.00
$ 1,100.00




SBUS1TO Pricing Pages
CONVENTIONAL UNITS - Continued

71 Passenger

Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission $ 78,600.00

Delivery To Chariesion, WV $.1,100.00

77 Passenger

Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission 3T B82,900.00
Regular - 225HP - Automatic Transmission $ 82,500.00
Delivery Te Charlesion, WV $ 1,100.00

DELIVERY:

Bidders must state number of days after receipt of order (ARO) for bus delivery. Number of days
for delivery shall be no greater than 120 days. This does include “letters of intent”,

Buses will be delivered within __ 120 days ARQ.

Conventional Unit Vendor: BWAB International LLC

Charles B Beanett QJ)\AFJ\,Q;L, Q @2/"%@"/141

Print Name) (Signature)

Date 10-19-2009

Phone-  304-204-2601

Toll Free Phone Number 800-350-5448

Fax:_ 304-204-2606

Emazil cbennett@bwabintl.com




SBUS10 Pricing Pages

Special Needs — Conventional

2410 HP - Automatic Transmission

210 HP - Automatic Transmission

255 HE - Automatic Transmission

225 HP —~ Automatic Transmission

225 HP — Automatic Transmission

53 Passenger

58 Passenger

85 Passenger

71 Passenger

77 Passenger

79,900.00

$1,100.00

82,600.00

83.200.00

87,900.00
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