

NYO-OH

T

MODIZEN

State of West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

PURCHASE ORDER NO. SBUS08B PAGE 1

BLANKET RELEASE

00

CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES, INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS. QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS PURCHASE ORDER SHOULD BE DIRECTED TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.

CHANGE ORDER

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR **TERMS AND CONDITIONS** 

\*507143237

BY ORDER

ALL STATE AGENCIES

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

724-898-2472 BLUE BIRD BUS SALES OF PITT IN 5374 WILLIAM FLYNN HWY

GIBSONIA PA

15044

SH-P

T O

ACENCY COPY

**ALL STATE AGENCIES** AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

anatoriate I de la	11/14/2007		TERMS OF SALE  T 30		FEIN/SSN 1228073	FUND
SHIP.VIA BEST WAY		DE	F.O.B STINATION		PREPAID	MUL-MUL
INE	QUANTITY DELIVERY DATE	UOP CAT.NO:	VENDOR ITEM NO. ITEM NUMBER		UNIT PRIGE	AMOUNT
	THIS CONTRAC STATE, COUNT	T IS I: Y, MUN FOR QUO DATED	CIPALITIES,	IDE AND 09	SCHOOL BUSES TO A SCHOOL BOARDS PE 10/2007 AND	
01	12/01/2007 SCHOOL BUSES EXHIBIT 3	EΑ	065-17		0.0000	0
	DECEMBER 1, YEAR OR UNTI	2007 AI L SUCH	ND EXTENDS FO	R A	BECOMES EFFECTIVE PERIOD OF ONE (1 E" THEREAFTER AS OR RENEW THE	

BY\_

<del>304</del>-558-8802

PURCHASING DIVISION AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

JO ANN ADKINS

APPROVED AS TO FORM BY ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL

## GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS PURCHASE ORDER/CONTRACT

- 1. ACCEPTANCE: Seller shall be bound by this order and its terms and conditions upon receipt of this order.
- 2. APPLICABLE LAW: The laws of the State of West Virginia and the *Legislative Rules* of the Purchasing Division shall govern all rights and duties under the Contract, including without limitation the validity of this Purchase Order/Contract.
- 3. NON-FUNDING: All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Orders/
  Contracts are to be continued for the terms of the Purchase Order/Contract, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or goods, this Purchase Order/
  Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.
- 4. **COMPLIANCE:** Seller shall comply with all Federal, State and local laws, regulations and ordinances including, but not limited to, the prevailing wage rates of the WV Division of Labor.
- 5. MODIFICATIONS: This writing is the parties final expression of intent. No modification of this order shall be binding unless agreed to in writing by the Buyer.
- **6. ASSIGNMENT:** Neither this Order nor any monies due, or to become due hereunder may be assigned by the Seller without the Buyer's consent.
- 7. WARRANTY: The Seller expressly warrants that the goods and/or services covered by this order will: {a} conform to the specifications, drawings, samples or other description furnished or specified by the Buyer {b} be merchantable and fit for the purpose intended and/or {c} be free from defect in material and workmanship.
- 8. **CANCELLATION:** The Director or Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.
- 9. SHIPPING, BILLING & PRICES: Prices are those stated in this order. No price increase will be accepted without written authority from the Buyer. All goods or services shall be shipped on or before the date specified in this Order.
- 10. LATE PAYMENTS: Payments may only be made after the delivery of goods or services. Interest may be paid on late payments in accordance with the West Virginia Code.
- 11. TAXES: The State of West Virginia is exempt from Federal and State taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.
- **12. RENEWAL:** Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written agreement of the parties.
- **13. BANKRUPTCY:** In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, this Contract may be deemed null and void, and terminated without further order.
- 14. HIPAA Business Associate Addendum The West Viginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and available online at the Purchasing Division's web site (http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that, the Agency meets the definition of a Covered Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

S H P

T O



State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

SBUS08B

PAGE

2

.....

CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES, INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS. QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS PURCHASE ORDER SHOULD BE DIRECTED TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.

EHANGE ORDER

BLANKET RELEASE

00

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS

VEXDOR

- アソロー 〇田

Ö

\*507143237 724-898-2472 BLUE BIRD BUS SALES OF PITT IN 5374 WILLIAM FLYNN HWY

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

GIBSONIA PA

BY ORDER

**ALL STATE AGENCIES** 

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS

15044

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

11/14/2007 NET 30 251228073  SHEYN DESTINATION PREPAID MUL-MUL  NOT EXCEED TWELVE 12) MONTHS. DURING THE "PERIOD SHALL NOT EXCEED TWELVE 12) MONTHS. DURING THE "REASONABLE TIME" THE VENDOR MAY TERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR ANY REASON UPON GIVING WRITTEN NOTICE.  UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVISIONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE IN THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT, THE TERMS, CONDITIONS AND PRICING SET HEREIN ARE FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE CONTRACT.  RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR, SUBMITTED TO THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30) DAYS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFERM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN  FAPPROVALAS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE □				
BEST MAY  DESTINATION  PREPAID  MUL-MUL  QUANTITY  UPP  VENDORITEMNO  DELIVERY DATE  CATNO  TEMNUMBER  ORIGINAL CONTRACT.  NOT EXCEED TWELVE (12) MONTHS.  DURING THE "PERIOD SHALL  NOT EXCEED TWELVE (12) MONTHS.  REASON UPON GIVING  WRITTEN NOTICE.  UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVISIONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE IN THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT, THE TERMS, CONDITIONS AND PRICING SET HEREIN ARE FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE  CONTRACT.  RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR, SUBMITTED TO THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30) DAYS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION DATE.  BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE  (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.				FUND
DEST WAY DESTINATION PREPAID MUL-MUL  UNE DELIVERYDATE CAING. TEM NUMBER  ORIGINAL CONTRACT. THE "REASONABLE TIME" PERIOD SHALL NOT EXCEED TWELVE (12) MONTHS. DURING THIS "REASONABLE TIME" THE VENDOR MAY TERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR ANY REASON UPON GIVING THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 30 DAYS WRITTEN NOTICE.  UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVISIONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE IN THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT, THE TERMS, CONDITIONS AND PRICING SET HEREIN ARE FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE CONTRACT.  RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL WRITTED CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR, SUBMITTED TO THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30) DAYS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE  (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN	11/14/2007	1		
QUANTITY DELVERYDATE OATHO  DELVERYDATE OATHO  ORIGINAL CONTRACT. THE "REASONABLE TIME" PERIOD SHALL  NOT EXCEED TWELVE (12) MONTHS. DURING THIS "REASONABLE  TIME" THE VENDOR MAY TERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR ANY REASON UPON GIVING THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 30 DAYS WRITTEN NOTICE.  UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVISIONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE IN THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT, THE TERMS, CONDITIONS AND PRICING SET HEREIN ARE FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE CONTRACT.  RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR, SUBMITTED TO THE EXPIRATION DATE.  SUBMITTED TO THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.				
ORIGINAL CONTRACT. THE "REASONABLE TIME" PERIOD SHALL NOT EXCEED TWELVE (12) MONTHS. DURING THIS "REASONABLE TIME" THE VENDOR MAY TERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR ANY REASON UPON GIVING THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 30 DAYS WRITTEN NOTICE.  UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVISIONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE IN THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT, THE TERMS, CONDITIONS AND PRICING SET HEREIN ARE FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE CONTRACT.  RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR, SUBMITTED TO THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.		J	I	MUL-MUL
NOT EXCEED TWELVE (12) MONTHS. DURING THIS "REASONABLE TIME" THE VENDOR MAY TERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR ANY REASON UPON GIVING THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 30 DAYS WRITTEN NOTICE.  UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVISIONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE IN THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT, THE TERMS, CONDITIONS AND PRICING SET HEREIN ARE FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE CONTRACT.  RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR, SUBMITTED TO THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30) DAYS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.	The state of the s		UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
TIME" THE VENDOR MAY TERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR ANY REASON UPON GIVING THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 30 DAYS WRITTEN NOTICE.  UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVISIONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE IN THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT, THE TERMS, CONDITIONS AND PRICING SET HEREIN ARE FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE CONTRACT.  RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR, SUBMITTED TO THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30) DAYS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.	ORIGINAL CONTI	RACT. THE "REASON	ABLE TIME" PERIOD SHAI	LL
REASON UPON GIVING THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 30 DAYS WRITTEN NOTICE.  UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVISIONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE IN THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT, THE TERMS, CONDITIONS AND PRICING SET HEREIN ARE FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE CONTRACT.  RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR, SUBMITTED TO THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30) DAYS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.	NOT EXCEED TWI	ELVE (12) MONTHS.	DURING THIS "REASONAL	BLE
UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVISIONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE IN THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT, THE TERMS, CONDITIONS AND PRICING SET HEREIN ARE FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE CONTRACT.  RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR, SUBMITTED TO THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30) DAYS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN	TIME" THE VENI	DOR MÅY TERMINATE '	THI\$ CONTRACT FOR ANY	
UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVISIONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE IN THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT, THE TERMS, CONDITIONS AND PRICING SET HEREIN ARE FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE CONTRACT.  RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR, SUBMITTED TO THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30) DAYS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.			OF PURCHASING 30 DAYS	
IN THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT, THE TERMS, CONDITIONS AND PRICING SET HEREIN ARE FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE CONTRACT.  RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR, SUBMITTED TO THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30) DAYS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.	WRITTEN NOTICE	<b>-</b> •		
PRICING SET HEREIN ARE FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE CONTRACT.  RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR, SUBMITTED TO THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30) DAYS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.	1 1	i	•	
RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR, SUBMITTED TO THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30) DAYS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.	I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I		1 -	
RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR, SUBMITTED TO THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30) DAYS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.	1 1	EREIN ARE FIRM FOR	THE LIFE OF THE	·
WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR, SUBMITTED TO THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30) DAYS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.	CONTRACT.	. [		
WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR, SUBMITTED TO THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30) DAYS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.	RENEWAL: THIS	CONTRACT MAY BE R	   ENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL	
SUBMITTED TO THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30) DAYS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.		li di	i	7
DAYS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.	, , ,	•		
BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.	1 1	<b>1</b>	i i	LL
ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS.  CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.		l l	l l	
CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN	1 1 " " 1	•	1	
CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.	1 1	i		
RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.				
NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.	CANCELLATION:	THE DIRECTOR OF P	URCHASING RESERVES TH	
SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.	RIGHT TO CANCI	EL THIS CONTRACT I	MMEDIATELY UPON WRITTI	EN .
TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.	NOTICE TO THE	VENDOR IF THE COM	MODITIES AND/OR SERVI	ES
	SUPPLIED ARE	OF AN INFERIOR QUA	LITY OR DO NOT CONFOR!	h
IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE □	TO THE SPECIF	ICATIONS OF THE BI	D AND CONTRACT HEREIN	
IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE □				
IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE □				
IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE □				
IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE				
	IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQ	UIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL.	CHECK HERE	
TOTAL			<del></del>	TOTAL

JO ANN ADKINS

304-558-8802

BY\_

S

P

T



一口としては

Ö

VENDOR

State of West Virginia Department of Administration **Purchasing Division** 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

PURCHASE ORDER NO. SBUS08B

3

BLANKET RELEASE

00

CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES, INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS. QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS PURCHASE ORDER SHOULD BE DIRECTED TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.

\*\*\*CHANGE ORDER

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS

BY ORDER

**\*507143237** 724-898-2472 BLUE BIRD BUS SALES OF PITT IN 5374 WILLIAM FLYNN HWY

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS

GIBSONIA PA

ALL STATE AGENCIES

15044

ALL STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

انتنتننا				لنششش	
DATE PRINTED		TERMS OF SALE	25	FEIN/SSN	FUND
11/14/2007		NET 30		1228073	
BF	SHIP.VIA ST WAY	DESTINATION		PREPAID	MUL-MUL
300000000000000000000000000000000000000	QUANTITY	UOP VENDORIT	EM NO:		
LINE	DELIVERY DATE	CAT:NO: ITEM:NUM	/BER	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
	AUTHORIZE A S MARKET, WITHO ESTIMATE, ITE IMMEDIATE DEL CAUSES (INCLU PORTATION OR OF WORK.)  QUANTITIES: Q APPROXIMATION THE STATE SPE THAT THE CONT ORDERED FOR D WHETHER MORE  ORDERING PROC WRITTEN STATE THE VENDOR FO THE ORIGINAL VENDOR AS AUT MAILED TO THE	PENDING UNIT TO OUT THE FILING OF EMS SPECIFIED ON IVERY IN EMERGE DING BUT NOT LE AN UNANTICIPATE SONLY, BASED OF ENDING UNIT. IT FRACT SHALL COVE DELIVERY DURING OR LESS THAN THE EDURE: SPENDING CONTRACT ORDER OR COMMODITIES OF COPY OF THE WV-	D PURCH DF A RE N THIS ENCIES IMITED ED INCR ED IN T DN ESTI F IS UN ER THE TE HE QUAN COVERED SHIPME /ISION,	DUE TO UNFORESEE TO DELAYS IN TRA EASE IN THE VOLU HE REQUISITION A MATES SUPPLIED B DERSTOOD AND AGR QUANTITIES ACTUA RM OF THE CONTRA	RE Y CEED CLLY CT.
IF APPRO	OVAL AS TO FORM IS REC	QUIRED BY ATTORNEY GEN	ERAL, CHEC	K HERE	

JO ANN ADKINS

304-558-8802

TOTAL

BY\_

APPROVED AS TO FORM BY ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL

S H P

Т О



ガンO-CH

T

とこれの日の日

State of West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

SBUS08B

PAGE:

BLANKET RELEASE

00

CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES, INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS. QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS PURCHASE ORDER SHOULD BE DIRECTED TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.

CHANGE ORDER

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

ALL STATE AGENCIES

\*507143237 724-898-2472 BLUE BIRD BUS SALES OF PITT IN 5374 WILLIAM FLYNN HWY

GIBSONIA PA

15044

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

SHIP VIA  BEST WAY  DESTINATION  PREPAID  MUL—MUL  NE  GUANTITY  LOP  VENDORITEMNO DELIVERY DATE  CATAO  ITEMNUMBER  BANKRUPTCY:  IN THE EVENT THE VENDOR/CONTRACTOR FILES FOR BANKRUPTCY PROTECTION, THIS CONTRACT IS AUTOMATI- CALLY NULL AND VOID, AND IS TERMINATED WITHOUT FURTHER  ORDER.  THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS CONTAINED IN THIS CONTRACT SHALL SUPERSEDE ANY AND ALL SUBSEQUENT TERMS AND CONDITIONS WHICH MAY APPEAR ON ANY ATTACHED PRINTED DOCUMENTS SUCH AS PRICE LISTS, ORDER FORMS, SALES AGREEMENTS OR MAINTENANCE AGREEMENTS, INCLUDING ANY ELECTRONIC MEDIUM SUCH AS CD-ROM.  REV. 04/11/2001  FAPPROVALAS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE	DATE:PRINTED	TERMS OF SALE	FEIN/SSN	FIND
BEST WAY    DESTINATION			1.	FUND
DELIVERY DATE  OUANITY DELIVERY DATE  CAT NO  THE NUMBER  BANKRUPTCY: FOR BANKRUPTCY PROTECTION, THIS CONTRACT IS AUTOMATICALLY NULL AND VOID, AND IS TERMINATED WITHOUT FURTHER ORDER.  THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS CONTAINED IN THIS CONTRACT SHALL SUPERSEDE ANY AND ALL SUBSEQUENT TERMS AND CONDITIONS WHICH MAY APPEAR ON ANY ATTACHED PRINTED DOCUMENTS SHICH AS PRICE LISTS, ORDER FORMS, SALES AGREEMENTS OR MAINTENANCE AGREEMENTS, INCLUDING ANY ELECTRONIC MEDIUM SUCH AS CD-ROM.  REV. 04/11/2001  FAPPROVALAS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE	SHIP VIA	F,O,B	FREIGHTTERMS	ACCOUNT NUMBER
BANKRUPTCY: IN THE EVENT THE VENDOR/CONTRACTOR FILES FOR BANKRUPTCY PROTECTION, THIS CONTRACT IS AUTOMATI- CALLY NULL AND VOID, AND IS TERMINATED WITHOUT FURTHER ORDER.  THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS CONTAINED IN THIS CONTRACT SHALL SUPERSEDE ANY AND ALL SUBSEQUENT TERMS AND CONDITIONS WHICH MAY APPEAR ON ANY ATTACHED PRINTED DOCUMENTS SUCH AS PRICE LISTS, ORDER FORMS, SALES AGREEMENTS OR MAINTENANCE AGREEMENTS, INCLUDING ANY ELECTRONIC MEDIUM SUCH AS CD-ROM.  REV. 04/11/2001			PREPAID	MUL-MUL
FOR BANKRUPTCY PROTECTION, THIS CONTRACT IS AUTOMATICALLY NULL AND VOID, AND IS TERMINATED WITHOUT FURTHER ORDER.  THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS CONTAINED IN THIS CONTRACT SHALL SUPERSEDE ANY AND ALL SUBSEQUENT TERMS AND CONDITIONS WHICH MAY APPEAR ON ANY ATTACHED PRINTED DOCUMENTS SUCH AS PRICE LISTS, ORDER FORMS, SALES AGREEMENTS OR MAINTENANCE AGREEMENTS, INCLUDING ANY ELECTRONIC MEDIUM SUCH AS CD-ROM.  REV. 04/11/2001  FAPPROVALAS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE			UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
F APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE	FOR BANKRUPTCY CALLY NULL AND ORDER.  THE TERMS AND SHALL SUPERSED CONDITIONS WHO DOCUMENTS SUCH AGREEMENTS OR	Y PROTECTION, THIS D VOID, AND IS TERM CONDITIONS CONTAIN DE ANY AND ALL SUB- ICH MAY APPEAR ON A H AS PRICE LISTS, MAINTENANCE AGREEM	CONTRACT IS AUTOMATI- MINATED WITHOUT FURTHE  NED IN THIS CONTRACT SEQUENT TERMS AND ANY ATTACHED PRINTED ORDER FORMS, SALES MENTS, INCLUDING ANY	
	F APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQU	TOTAL		

JO ANN ADKINS

304-558-8802

BY\_

## SBUS08 Pricing Pages

## TRANSIT UNITS

## 71 Passenger

71 Passenger	
210HP, FE, Automatic Transmission 225HP, FE, Automatic Transmission 225HP, RE, Automatic Transmission Delivery to Charleston, WV	\$ 78,175.00 \$ 79,330.00 \$ 89,545.00 \$ 1,100.00
77 Passenger	
210HP, FE, Automatic Transmission 225HP, FE, Automatic Transmission 225HP, RE, Automatic Transmission Delivery to Charleston, WV	\$ 82,960.00 \$ 82,960.00 \$ 93,115.00 \$ 1,100.00
84 Passenger	
245HP, FE, Automatic Transmission 245HP, RE, Automatic Transmission	\$ <u>85,730.00</u> \$ <u>94,225.00</u>
89 Passenger	
245HP, FE, Automatic Transmission 245HP, RE, Automatic Transmission Delivery to Charleston, WV	\$ No Bid \$ No Bid \$
Transit Unit Vendor: Blue Bird Bus Sales of Pittsburgh,  Jeff Pschirer VP SBS  Print Name) (Signature)	<u>In</u> c. DBA Blue Bird Bus Sales of <sup>:</sup> West Virginia
Date October 22, 2007	
Phone_724-898-2472	
Toll Free Phone Number 866-521-2472	
Fax:_724-898-2660	
Email_jpschirer@bluebirdpqh.com	

## SBUS08 Pricing Pages

## CONVENTIONAL UNITS

## 24 Passenger

Type A1 – 130HP – Automatic Transmission Type B – 130HP – Automatic Transmission	\$ 46,550.00 \$ No Bid
30 Passenger	
Type A1 – 130HP – Automatic Transmission Type B – 130HP – Automatic Transmission	\$_49,470.00 \$_No_Bid
35 Passenger	
Regular - 175HP - Automatic Transmission Sp. Education - 175HP - Automatic Transmission Delivery To Charleston, WV	\$ No Bid \$ No Bid \$_
47 Passenger	
Regular - 190HP - Automatic Transmission Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission Sp. Education - 190HP - Automatic Transmission Delivery To Charleston, WV	\$_68,320.00 \$_68,680.00 \$_72,525.00 \$_1,100.00
53 Passenger	
Regular - 190HP - Automatic Transmission Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission	\$ 69,595.00 \$ 69,995.00 \$ 69,995.00
Delivery To Charleston, WV	\$ <u>1,100.00</u>
59 Passenger	
Regular - 190HP - Automatic Transmission Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission	\$_69,675.00 \$_69,765.00
Delivery To Charleston, WV	\$ <u>1,100.00</u>
65 Passenger	
Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission Regular - 225HP Automatic Transmission	\$ 71,360.00 \$ 72,340.00
Delivery To Charleston, WV	\$_1,100.00

# SBUS08 Pricing Pages CONVENTIONAL UNITS - Continued

71 Passenger	
Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission	\$ <u>71,790</u> .00
Delivery To Charleston, WV	\$ 1,100.00
77 Passenger	
Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission Regular - 225HP - Automatic Transmission	\$ <u>76,775.00</u> \$ <u>76,775.</u> 00
Delivery To Charleston, WV	<b>\$</b> 1,100.00
DELIVERY:	
Bidders must state number of days after receipt of order (A for delivery shall be no greater than 120 days. This does in	ARO) for bus delivery. Number of days
Buses will be delivered within 120 days	
Conventional Unit Vendor: Blue Bird Bus Sales of Pit Jeff Pschirer VP SBS (Signature)	ttsburgh,Inc. DBA Blue Bird Bus Sales of West Virginia
Date October 22, 2007	
Phone 724-898-2472	
Toll Free Phone Number 866-521-2472	
Fax: 724-898-2660	
Email_jpschirer@bluebirdpgh.com	

## **SBUS08 Pricing Pages**

## Special Needs - Conventional

	53 Passenger	
210 HP – Automatic Transmission		\$_73,220.00
	59 Passenger	
210 HP – Automatic Transmission		\$ 75,485.00
	65 Passenger	
225 HP – Automatic Transmission		\$ <u>78,900.00</u>
	71 Passenger	
225 HP – Automatic Transmission		\$ <u>78,975.00</u>
	77 Passenger	
225 HP – Automatic Transmission		\$ 81,460.00



NY0-0H

Ö

VENDOR

State of West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

PURCHASE ORDER NO. SBUS08B PAGE 5

BLANKET RELEASE 00

CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES, INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS. QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS PURCHASE ORDER SHOULD BE DIRECTED TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.

CHANGE ORDER

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR **TERMS AND CONDITIONS** 

BY ORDER

\*507143237 724-898-2472 BLUE BIRD BUS SALES OF PITT IN 5374 WILLIAM FLYNN HWY

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS

GIBSONIA PA 15044 15044

ALL STATE AGENCIES

P T ALL STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

rootes.		12522	
DATE PRINTED	TERMS OF SALE	FEIN/SSN	FUND
11/14/2007 SHIP VIA	NET 30	251228073	
BEST WAY	DESTINATION	PREPAID	ACCOUNT NUMBER  MUL - MUL
LINE QUANTITY	UOP VENDOR ITEM NO:	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
DELIVERY DATE	CAT:NO: ITEM NUMBER	UNITAGE	AWOUN1
LINE CATNO ITEM	RECEIPT TICKE	T FOR PURCHASE ORDER:  DESCRIPTION	SBUSO8B QTY DATE
0001 065-17	SCHOOL BUS	ES	
	SIGNATURE	DA	FE
IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS RE			
	TOTAL		

BY\_

304-558-8802

JO ANN ADKINS