«, | Department of Administration
% | Purchasing Division

I 2019 Washington Street East

¥ | Post Office Box 50130

Charieston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Master Agreement QUESTIONS CONCERNING TS

CORRECT ORDER NUMBER
MUST APPEAR CNALL PACKAGES,
INVOIC! D SHIPPING PAPERS.

ORDER SHOULD BE DIRECTED TQ
THE DEPARTMENT CONTACT.

Order Date: 2015-08-17

Order Number: CMA 0212 0212 SWCO0000000012

Procurement Folder: 62313

Document Name: MV15D-Statewide Confract for Model Year 2015 Vehicles

Reason for Modification:

Document Description: 8H£I\i\ilGE ORDER No 3-MV15D-Statewide Contract for Motor
ahlcle

Change Order 3 - 1o remove all 2015 GMC Savana
Vans, per atlached {etter from vendor.

Procurement Type: Cenlral Master Agreement

Buyer Name:

Telephone:

Email:

Shipping Method: Best Way

Effective Start Date: 2014-12-01

Free on Board: FOB D&S[, Freigh{ Prepaid

Effective End Date: 2015-11-30

Vendor Customer Code: 000000200051
MATHENY MOTOR TRUCK CO

PO BOX 1304
PARKERSBURG WV 261021304
us’

Vendor Contact Phone: (304) 485-4418 Extension:

Discount Percentage; 0.0000
Discount Days: 0

Requestor Name: Mike Sheets
Requestor Phone: (304) 558-0402
Requestor Email; willlam.m.sheets@wv.gov

ALL STATE AGENCIES

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999

us

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999

Us

Total Order Amount Open End |

PURGHASING DIVISION A /)suzyl A

SIGNED BY: - = """"";E!GNED Y.
DATE: : ¢~ |DATE:
ELECTRONIC SIGNATURE ON FILE ELEC

ATTORNEY GENERAL APPROVAL AS TO FORM | ENCUMBRANGE CERTIFICATION

SIGNED BY:
@5) \O/L DATE:
ATURE BN FILE™ *é'«@ v{f{w ELECTRONIC SIGNATUR ON FILE

Date Printed:  Aug 17,2015  Order Number: SWCODOOUOOO&"’J

;f% FOR@&&V_P%CMW 8/i4




Extended Dascription;
Change Order No 3 - to remove the 2015 GMG Savana Vans. Lines 1-13 on the page. Per vendor lelter aftached.

All provisfons of the original conlract and subsequent change orders not modified herein shalk remain in full force and effect.

Line Commeodity Code Manufacturer Model No Unit Unit Price
1 25100000 EA $0.000000
Service From Service To

Commaodity Line Description: 2015, OR LATEST MODEL YEAR MOTOR VEHICLES

Extended Dascription:
2015, OR LATEST MODEL YEAR MOTOR VEHICLES(VEHICLE DETAILS TO BE PROVIDED WITH CDO ON EACH RELEASE ORDER)

Date Printed:  Aug 17,2015  Otder Number; SWCO000000012 Page: 2 FORM ID : WV_PRC_CMA_001 8/14




MATHENY MOTOR TRUCK CO.
Qorporate Headquarters
Established, 1922
3rd & Ann Stireets ' PO, Box 1304
Parkershurg, WV 261021304
(P) 304,485.4418 * (F) 304.485,2577
www.mathenymotors,com

May 4, 2015

 "Ms, Laura E Hooper
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
P O Box 50130
Charleston WV 25305-0130

Subject: Master Agreement No.: CMA 0212 SWC0000000012
See Attachment for Orders That Will Not be Built

Dear Ms. Hooper:

Due to production constraints, Matheny Motor Truck Company will be unable to build and delivery
any of the 2015 GMC Savana Vans that are covered by the purchase orders listed in the attachment
or any additional purchase orders that may be generated prior to receipt of this letter,

The earllest any vans can be built would be August of 2015 and these vans wouid be 2016 model

. y'ear"vansr-. Also, we have been told by General Motors that it will be the middle of May before we
will know if we can price protect the vans covered by the above purchase order numbers. Or, said
another way, we will not know at what price we will be able to sell the 2016 vans until the middie
of May, 2015. There is a possibility of no price increase on the 2016 model year vans,

We realize the position this puts the West Virginla entities buying these vans and we do apologize
for this'inconvenience.

lf'you have any questions or need additional information, please contact me.

Very truly yours,

‘Mike Matheny

Cc. K‘e‘nny Yoakum, Steve Skinner

CEREIGHTLINER YT, mgggﬁl



MV15 Matheny Motor Truck Co

Class | Type Model ' Unit Price

Change order #3 i R r
2015 GMC Savana Vans removed l .

16 FiexFue! {GMC Sierra TC25903 $23,614.00
16A FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TK25803 $26,768.00
16B | FlexFuel [GMC Sierra TK256903 $26,356,00

17__| FlexFuel |GMC Slerra TC26753 $25,052.00
17A FlexFuel |GMC Slerra TK25753 $27,140.00
17B | FlexFuel |GMC Slerra TK25953 $28,560.00
17C FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TK25753 $28,386.00

18 FiexFuel GMC Sierra TC25743 $26,408.00
18A | FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TK25743 $28,600.00
188 | FiexFuel |GMC Sierra TK25843 $28,338.00
18C | FlexFuel [GMC Slerra TK25943 $20,820.00
18D | FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TK25743 $29,646.00
20 FlexFuel {GMC Sierra TC35903 $25,428.00
21 FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TC35853 $27,462.00
21 DNG/BiFuelGMC Slerra TC35953 $35,629.00
21A__| FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TK35953 $29,549.00
21A [NG/BiFue/GMC Sierra TK35953 $37,633.00
22 LNG/BiFugGMC Sierra TC35843 $38,859.00

22A FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TK35843 $30,8690.00




CLASS 16 - AUTOMOBILE

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck Co.
Manufacturer/Brand: GMC :
Model Name & Number: Sierra TC25903
Vehicle Requirements:
Classification: Large Pick Up Reg Cab
Drive: Rear Wheel

] 2 minimum (Including
Passenger seating: driver)
Doors: 2, minimum
Wheelbase: 133 in,, minimum

8,500 Ibs. min,

GVWR: 10,000 Ibs. max,
Engine: 8 cylinder minimum
Tow Package: Installed Hitch & Wiring

Addhtional Requirements:
The vehtcle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in sectioh 3.1.1.1 of the specification,

Vendor Bjd Response;

Vehicle fuel type Unit Price
(Gasoline t
Flex-fuel $23,614,00
Diegel ]
CNG/Blfuel
Hybrid No Bid

Options:
$70.00

FOB Deglership: (Deduct)
$1.89

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

*Note - The above dellvery "options” above are not evaluated as part of the award.



CLASS 16A - AUTOMOBILE

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck Co
Manufacturer/Brand: GMC
Model Name & Number: Sierra TK25903
Vehide Requirements:
Classification: Large Pick Up Reg Cab
Drive: 4 Wheel/All whee)

. Z minimum (including
Passenger seating: driver)
Doors: 2, minimum
Wheelbase; 133 in, minimum

8651 Ibs. min,

GVWR: 10,000 Ibs, max.
Engine: 8 cylinder minimum
Tow Package; Installed Hitch & Wiring

Additional Requirements:

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required In section 3.1.1.1 of the speclfleation.

Veundor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

. Unit Price

Flex-fuel

$25,798.00

Diesel

CNG/Bliue!

Hybrd

No Bid

Options:
FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charlsston - Per Mile

$79.00

$1.89

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.



CLASS 16B - AUTOMOBILE - (Divislon of Highways Specifications)

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck Co
Manufacturer/Brand: GMC
Model Name & Number: Sierra TK25903
Vehide Requirements:
Classification: Large Pick Up Reg Cab
Drive: 4 Wheel/Al whee!
. 2 minimum (Including
Passenger seating: driver)
Doors: 2, minimum
Wheelbase: 133in, minimum
CVWR: 8,650 lbs. min,
: 10,000 Jbs. max.
Engine: 8 cylinder minimum

Includes but not limited
to: Limited Slip rear,
axle tack lok
differential, heavy duty

Off Road Package: engine cooling, skid
plates, heavy duty
suspension with gas
shocks, tow hooks and
all terrain tires.

Bed: Long bed
Tow Package: Installed Hitch & Wiring

Snow plow prep package: Installed

Additional Requirements:
The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3,1.1.1 of the specification.

Vendor Bid Response:
VYehicle fuel type Unit Price .

Gasoline

Flex-fuel $26,358.00

Digsel ]

CNG/Bifue!

Hybrid ' No Bid

Options:
$79,00

FOB Dealership: (Deduct)
$1.89

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

*Note - The above delivery "options® above are not evaluated as part of the award.



CLASS 17 - AUTOMOBILE

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck Co
Manufacturer/Brand: GMC
Model Name & Number: Sierra TC25753
Vehlde Requirements:
Large Pick Up Extended
Classification: Cal:':g TR e
Drive: Rear Wheel
4 minimum (including
Passenger seating; driver)
Doors: 4, minimum
Wheelbase: : 141 in,, minimum
8,500 1bs, min,
GYWR: 10,000 Ibs. max
Engine: 8 cylinder minimum
Tow Package: Installed Hitch & Wiring

Additional Requirements:
The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements s required in section 3,1.1.1 of the specification,

Vendor Bid Response:
Vehicle fuel type Unit Price
Gasoling ]
Flex-fuel $25,052.00
Dlesel ‘ ]
CNG/Biuel
Hybiid No Bid

Options:;
$79.00

FOB Dsalership: {Deduct)
$1.89

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award,



CLASS 17A - AUTOMOBILE

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck Co
Manufacturer/Brand: GMC
Madel Name & Number: Sierra TK25753
Vehlcle Requlrements:
Large Pick Up Extended
Classification: Yge Fick p Extende
Cab
Drive: 4 Wheel/All wheel
j 4 minimum (including
Passenger seating: driver)
Daoors: 4, minimum
Wheelbaso: 141 in, minimum
8600 Ibs, min,
GVWR: 10,000 Jbs. max
Engine; 8 cylinder minimum
Tow Package: Installed Hitch & Wiring

Additional Requirements:
The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment reguirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the speclfication.

Vendor Bid Response;

Vehicle fuel iype Unit Price
Gasoline ‘
Flox-fusl $27,140.00
Diesel ]
CNG/BHuel .
Hybrid No Bid

Options:
$70.00

FOB Dealership: (Deduct)
$1.88

FOB Cther than Metro Charleston - Par Mile

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.



CLASS 17B - AUTOMOBILE - (Department of Enviromental Protection Specifications)

- \ [

Vendor Name; Matheny Motor Truck Co
Menufacturer/Brand: GMC
Model Name & Number; Sierra TK25953
Vehicle Requirements:
Pick Up Extended
Classlfication: é:ll;ge b ¢
i 4 Wheel/All wheel with
Drive: High/Low Range
, 4 minimum (Including
Passenger seating: driver)
Doors: 4, minimuim
Wheelbase: 158 in., minimum
9,500 7bs. min,
GVWR: 10,000 lbs. max
Engine: B eylinder
Includes but not iimited
to: Limited Slip rear, axle
tack lok differential, heavy
. duty engine cooling, skid
Off Road Package: plates, heavy duty
suspension with gas
shocks, front & rear tow
hooks and all terrain tires.
Tow Package: Installed Hitch & Wiring

Installed on driver and
Slush/All weather Mats  passenger front and

second row

Bed: Lm}g, with installed drop-
in liner,

SHding rear window: Installed

Additiona! Requirements:
The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1,1 of the specification,

Vendor Bid Response:
Vehicls fuel type Unit Price

Gesoline _ :

Flex-fusl $28,560.00 |

Dlese| -

CNG/Blfusl

Hybrid No Bid

Options:
$79.00

FOB Dealershlp: (Deduct)
$1.89

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.



CLASS 17C - AUTOMOBILE - {(Department of Enviromental Protection Specifications)

1 3
M '

Vendor Name: Mathenhy Motor Truck Co
Manufacturer/Brand: GMC
Model Name & Number: Sierra TK25753
Vehide Reguirements:

L Pick Up Extended
Classification: C:Ege ick Up Extende

. 4 Wheel/All wheel with
Drive: High/Low Range
] 4 minimum {including

Passenger seating: driver)
Doors: 4, minimum
Wheelbase: 141 In,, minimum

8600 1bs. min, 10,000
GVWR: 1bs. max
Engine; B cylinder

Includes but not mited

to: Limited Slip rear, axle

tack lok differential, heavy

. duty engine cooling, skid

Off Road Package: plates, heavy duty

sugpension with gas
shocks, front & rear tow
hooks and all terrain tres.

Tow Package: instalted Hitch & Wiring
Installed on driver and

Slush/All weather Mats  passenger front and
second row

Be d Shqrt, with Installed drop-

in liner,

Sliding rear window: Installed

Additlonal Reguirements:
The vehicle bld shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3,1,1,1 of the specification.

Vendor Bid Response:
Vehicle fuel type Unit Price
Gasoline
Flex-fuel + 528,386.00
Diessi —
CNG/Bifuel
Hybrid No Bid

Options:
$79.00

FOB Daalership: (Deduct)
$1.89

FGB Other than Metro Charaston - Per Mile

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.



CLASS 18- AUTOMOBILE

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck Co
Manufacturer/Brand: GMC
Model Name & Number: Slerra TC25743
Vehicle Requirements:
Classification: Large Pick Up Crew Cah
Drive: Rear Wheel

. 5 minimum (including
Passenger seating: driver)
Doors: 4 full doors, minimum
Wheelbase: 148 in,, minimum

8,750 lhs. min,

GVWR: 10,000 ths, max
Engine; 8 cylinder minimum
Tow Package: Installed Hitch & Wiring

Addltlonal Requirements:

The vehicle bld shall Include the standard equipment requirements a5 required in section 3,1.1.1 of the specification,

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fual type Unlt Price
Gasoline l
Flox-fusl 526,408.00
Diessl
CNG/Blfuel , T
Hybrid No Bid
Optlons:

FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

FOB Cther than Matto Charlegton - Per Mile

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

$79.00

$1.88




CLASS 18A - AUTOMOBILE

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck Co
Manufacturer/Brand; GMC
Mode! Name & Number: Slerra TK25743

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification: Large Pick Up Crew Cab
Drive: 4 Wheel/All Wheel

5 minimum {(Including
Passenger seating: driver)
Doors: 4 full doors, minimum
Wheelbase; 148 in,, minimum

8,800 lbs, min,
GVWR; 10,000, 1bs, max
Engine: 8 cylinder minimum
Tow Package: Installed Hitch & Wiring

Additional Requirements:
The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification,

Vendor Bld Response:
Vehicle fuel type Unit Price

Gasgoline

Flex-fuel $28,699.00

Diess]

CNG/Bifuel T

Hybrid No Bid

Options:
$76.00

FOB Dealership; (Deduct)
$1.88

FOB Cther than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

*Note - The above delivery "options” above are not evaluated as part of the award.



CLASS 18B - AUTOMOBILE - {Division of Highways Specifications)

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck Co
Manufacturer/Brand: GMC ‘
Model Name & Number: Slerra TK25943
Vehide Requirements:
Classlfication: Large Pick Up Crew Cab
Drive: 4 Wheel /All Wheel
5 minimum (Including
Passenger seating: driver)
Doors: 4 full doors, minimum
Wheelbase: 167 in, minfmum
8,800 Ibs. min,
GYWR: 10,000 Jbs. max
Engine: 8 cylinder minimum

Includes but not limited
to: Limited Slip rear,
axle tack lok
differentfal, heavy duty

Off Road Package: engine cooling, skid
plates, heavy duty
suspension with gas
shocks, tow haoks and
all terratn tires.

Bed: Long bed
Tow Package; Installed Hitch & Wiring

Snow plow prep package: Installed
The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required In sectlon 3,1.1.1 of the specification.

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type Unit Price
Gasoline
Flox-fuse) $29,338.00
Diessl _
CNG/Blfuel
Hybrid No Bid

Options:
$79.00

FOB Dealership: (Deduci)
$1.89

FOB Qther than Mefro Charlestan - Per Mile

*Note - The above delivery "options” above are not evaluated as part of the award.



CLASS 18C - AUTOMOBILE - (Department of Environmental Protection Specificatfons)

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck Co
Manufacturer/Brand: GMIC .
Model Name & Number: Sierra TK25943
Vehldle Requlrements:
Classification: Large Pick Up Crew Cab
, 4 Wheel/All Wheel with High
Drive: and Low Range
5 minimum {Including
Passenger seating: driver)
Doors: 4 full doors, minimum
Wheelbase: 167 inﬁjminimum
8,800 lbs, min, 10,000
GVWR: lbs. max
Engine: 8 cylinder
Includes but not limited to:
Limited Slp rear, axle tack
lok differential, heavy duty
Off Road Package: engine cooling, skid plates,
heavy duty suspension with
gas shocks, front & rear tow
hooks and all terrain tires,
Bed: Long bed, with instalied drop-
ed: X i
in bed liner
Taw Package: Installed Hitch & Wiring

Installed driver & passanger,

Sush/All-weather mats front and second row.

Sliding Rear Window: Installed

The vehicle bid shall include the standerd equipment requirements as required in section 3,1.1.1 of the specification.

Vendor Bid Response;
Vehicle fue! type Unit Price
Gasoline
Flex-fuel $29,820,00
Diesel

CNG/Bifuel
Hybrid No Bid

Options:
$78.00

FOB Deslership: (Daduct)
$1.80

FOB Other than Metro Charioston - Per Mile

*Note - The above delivery "options” above are not evaluated as part of the award.



CLASS 18D - AUTOMOBILE - (Department of Environmental Protection Specifications)

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck Co
Manufacturer/Brand: GMC
Model Name & Number: Slerra Tk25743
Vehicle Requirements:
Classification: Large Pick Up Crew Cab
. 4 Wheel/AIl Wheel with High
Drive: and Low Range
» minimum (Including
Passenger seating: driver)
Doors: 4 fuil doors, minimum
Wheelbase: 148 in, minimum
8,800 Tbs, min, 10,000
GVWR: Ibs. max
Engine: 8 cylinder
Includes but not Hmited to:
Limited SHp rear, axle tack
lok differential, heavy duty
Off Road Package! engine cooling, skid plates,
heavy duty suspenslon with
gas shocks, front & rear tow
hooks and al! terrain tires.
Bed: ?hort bz_ad, with installed drop-
in bed liner
Tow Package: Installed Hitch & Wiring
} ' Installed driver & passanger,
Slush/All-weather mats front and second row.

Sliding Rear Window: Instatled

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required In section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

Vendor Bid Response:
Vehicle fusl type Unit Price

Gasoling :

Flex-fuel $29,646.00

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid No Bid

Options:

FOB Deaiership: (Deduct)
FOB Other than Metro Chareston - Per Mile

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.



CLASS 20 - AUTOMOBILE

Vendor Name; Matheny Motor Truck Co
Manufacturer/Brand: GMC
Model Name & Number: Sierra TC35903
Vehlcle Requirements:
Large Pick Up, Dual
Classification: Rear wheels, Reg Cab
Drive; Rear Wheel
2 minimum {including
Passenger seating: . driver)
Doors: 2, minimum
Wheelbase: 133 in, minimum
GVWR: 13,300 Ibs. min,
Engine; 8 cylinder minimum
Differental: Limited Slip
Tow Package: Installed Hitch & Wiring

Additlonzl Requirements:
The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required In saction 3.1.1.1 of the specification,

Vendor Bid Response;
Vehicle fuel iype Unit Price
Gasoline —
Flex-fusl $25,428,00
Diesel ‘
CNG/Bifusl No Bid
Hybrid No Bid
Options:
$79.00

FOB Dealershlp: (Deduct)
$1.89

FOB Other than Metre Charleston - Per Mile

*Note - The above delivery "options” above are not evaluated as part of the award,



CLASS 21 - AUTOMOBILE

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Tuck Co
Manufacturer/Brand: GMC
Model Name & Number: Sierra TC35953
Vehicle Requirements:
Large Pick Up, Dual
Classification: Rearwheels, Extended
Cab
Drive: Rear Wheel
4 minimum (including
Passenger seating: driver)
Doors: 4, minimum
Wheelbase: 141 in, minimum
GVWR: 13,300 Ibs. min,
Engine: 8 cylinder minirnum
Tow Package: Installed Hitch & Wiring
Additional Reguirements:

The vehicle bid shall Inctude the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3,1.1,1 of the specification,

_|Vendor Bid Response:

Vehlcle fuel type Unit Price
Gasoline )
Flex-ivel $27,462,00
Diessl
CNG/Bifuel $35,629.00
Hybrid No Bid
Options:
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) $79.00
$1.89

FOB Other than Metro Charieston - Per Mite

*Note - The above dellvery “options” above are not evaluated as part of the award.



Vendor Name:
Manufacturer/Brand:
Model Name & Number:

Vehicle Requirements:

Classlfication:

CLASS 21A - AUTOMOBILE

Matheny Motor Truck Co

GMC

Sierra TK35953

Large Pick Up, Dual
Rear wheels, Extended

Cab
Drive; 4 Wheel/All Wheel

4 minimum (including
Passenger seating: driver)
Doors: 4, minimum
Wheelbase: 141 in,, minimum
GVWR: 13,300 1bs. min,
Engine: 8 cylinder minimom
Tow Package: installed Hitch & Wiring

Additional Regquirements:

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1,1.1 of the specification.

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type Unit Price
Gasollne
Flex-fus! $28,549,00
Diessl
CNGBifusl $37,633.00
Hybrid No Bid
Options:

FOB Dealershlp: (Deduct)

FOB Cther than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

*Note - The above delivery "optlons" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

$79.00

$1.88




CLASS 22 - AUTOMOBILE
Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck Co
Manufacturer/Brand: GMC '
Model Name & Number: Slerra TC35943
Vehlde Requirements:
Classification: Large Pick Up, Dual
Rear wheels, Crew Cab

Drive: Rear Wheel

. 5 minimum (fncluding
Passenger seating: driver)
Doors: 4 full doors, minimum
Wheelbase: 167 in, minimum
GVWR: 13,000 Ibs, min,
Engine: 8 cylinder minimum
Tow Package: Installed Hitch & Wiring

Additional Requirements:

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

Vendor Bid Response;

Vehicle fuel type

Unit Price

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

r—

Diese|

CNG/Bifuel

$36,859.00

Hybrid

No Bid

Cptions:
FOB Dealerehip: (Deduct)

FOB Cther than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

$78.00

$1.89




Vendor Name:
Manufacturer/Brand;

Model Name & Number:

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

CLASS 22A - AUTOMOBILE

Large Plck Up, Dual
Rear wheels, Crew Cab

Matheny Motor Truck Co

GMC

Slerrra TK35843

Drive:

4 Wheel/All Wheel

Passenger seating:

5 minimum (Including
driver)

Doors:

4 full doors, minimum

Wheelbase:

167 in., minimum

GVWR:

13,000 ¥bs, min,

Engine;

B cylinder minimum

Additlonal Requirements:

The vehicle bid shall Include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification,

Vendor Bld Response:

Vehlcle fus! type

Gasoline

_Unit Price

Flex-fuel

$30,869.00

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

No Bid

Optionhe:
FOB Deafership: (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

$78.00

$1.89

*Note - The above delivery "options” above are not evaluated as part of the award.



