Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia

Master Agreement

Order Date: 2015-01-09

CORRECT ORDER NUMBER

MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES,

INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS.

QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS
ORDER SHOULD BE DIRECTED TO

THE BUYER.

Order Number: CMA 0212

0212 SWC0000000012

Procurement Folder: 62313

Document Name: MV15D-Statewide Contract for

Model Year 2015 Vehicles

Reason for Modification:

Document Description:

CHANGE ORDER No 1-MV15D-Statewide Contract for Motor Vehicle

CHANGE ORDER No.1- To correct the awardlng of
vehicle classes for FlexFuel Class 15C and 1

Procurement Type: Central Master Agreement

No other changes.

Buyer Name:

Telephone:

Email:

Shipping Method: Best Way

Effective Start Date; 2014-12-01

Free on Board: FOB Dest, Freight Prepaid

Effective End Date: 2015-11-30

(304) 485-4418

Discount Percentage: 0.0000
Discount Days: 0

Vendor Contact Phone:

Extension:

VENDOR DEPARTMENT CONTACT
MATHENY MOTOR TRUCK CO Requestor Name: Mike Sheets
PO BOX 1304 Requestor Phone: (304) 558-0492
Requestor Email: william.m.sheets@wv.gov
PARKERSBURG WV 261021304
us

INVOICE TO

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES

No City

us

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

WV 99999

No City

us

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

WV 99999

F! 6

PURCHASING DIVISION AUTHORIZATION ATTORNEY GE E? FORM | ENCUMBRANCE CERTIFICATION
-
ED BY: SIGNED BY: SIGNED BY:

W { DATE: DATE: Daasendy T olens

ELECTRO! SIG N FILE [ELECTRONIC SIGNATURE ON FILE l B' ELECTRONIC SIG%ATURE ON FILE
E anam
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Extended Description:
CHANGE ORDER NO. 1

THIS CHANGE ORDER IS ISSUED TO MAKE THE FOLLOWING CHANGES TO THIS CONTRACT:;
1. CLASS 15C FLEX FUEL

REMOVED FROM : MV15A (SWC0000000009)

ADDED TO: MV15D (SWC0000000012)

2. CLASS 15D FLEX FUEL

REMOVED FROM : MV15A (SWC0000000009)

ADDED TO: MV15D (SWC0000000012)

EFFECTIVE DATE OF THIS CHANGE: 01/05/2015

LIST OF VEHICLES AWARDED HAS BEEN REVISED PER THE ATTACHED DOCUMENTATION.
NO OTHER CHANGES.

Line Commodity Code Manufacturer Model No Unit Unit Price

1 25100000 $0.000000

Description: Motor vehicles

Extended Description:
2015, OR LATEST MODEL YEAR MOTOR VEHICLES(VEHICLE DETAILS TO BE PROVIDED WITH CDO ON EACH RELEASE ORDER)

Total Order Amount Open End |

Date Printed:  Jan 09, 2015 Order Number:  SWC0000000012 Page: 2 FORM ID : WV_PRC_CMA_001 8/14



SWC0000000012

Document Phase
Pending

Document Description
CHANGE ORDER No 1-MV15D-Statew ide
Contract for Motor Vehicle

Page 3
of 3

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions




MV15D Matheny Motor Truck Co

Class Type Model Unit Price
9 Gas __|GMC Savana TG23406 $24.082.00
9 FlexFuel |GMC Savana TG23406 $24,079.00
9A Gas GMC Savana TG23406 $35,631.00
9A FlexFuel |GMC Savana TG23406 $36,476.00
9B Gas __ [GMC Savana TG23406 $24,099.00
9B FlexFuel |GMC Savana TG23406 $24,998.00
9C Gas __|GMC Savana TG23406 $35,849.00
9C FlexFuel |GMC Savana TG23406 $36,645.00
9E Gas GMC Savana TG33706 $27,031.00
9E FlexFuel {GMC Savana TG33706 $27.,029.00
9F Gas _ |GMC Savana TG33706 $38,581.00
9F FlexFuel |GMC Savana TG33706 $39,272.00
10 FlexFuel |GMC Savana TG23405 $21,938.00
15C FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TK15743 $29,189.00
15D FlexFuel [GMC Sierra TK15543 $28,913.00
16 FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TC25903 $23,614.00
16A FlexFuel |[GMC Sierra TK25903 $25,798.00
16B FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TK25903 $26,358.00
17 FlexFuel [GMC Sierra TC25753 $25,052.00
17A FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TK25753 $27,140.00
17B FlexFuel |{GMC Sierra TK25953 $28,560.00
17C FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TK25753 $28,386.00
18 FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TC25743 $26,408.00
18A FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TK25743 $28,699.00
18B FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TK25943 $29,338.00
18C FlexFuel [GMC Sierra TK25943 $29,820.00
18D FlexFuel |{GMC Sierra TK25743 $29,646.00
20 FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TC35903 $25,428.00
21 FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TC35953 $27,462.00
21 CNG/BiFue/GMC Sierra TC35953 $35,629.00
21A FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TK35953 $29,549.00
21A  CNG/BiFue/GMC Sierra TK35953 $37,633.00
22  CNG/BiFue|GMC Sierra TC35943 $36,859.00
22A FlexFuel |GMC Sierra TK35943 $30,869.00




CLASS 15C - AUTOMOBILE - (Department of Environmental Protection Specifications)

Matheny Motor Truck Co

Vendor Name:
Manufacturer/Brand: . GMC
Model Name & Number: Sierra TR15743
Vehicle Reguirements:
Classification: Standard Pick Up Crew
Cab
Drive: 4 Wheel/All Wheel with
& Low
4 minimum (including
Passenger seating: driver)
Do 4 full doors, minimum
Wheelbase: 149 ﬁ minimum
63 min,
GVWR: 7350 lbs. max.
L. 8 Cylinder
Includes but not Hmited to:
Limited SHp rear, axle tack
lok differential, heavy duty
slkid plates,
Off Road engine cooling,
Package: heavy duty suspension
with gas shocks,front &
rear tow hooks and all
terrain tires.
Tow Installed Hitch & Wirin,
Bed: Long bed with drop-in
bedliner
Slldln!RearWlndow: Installed
Additions] Requirements:
Thevebicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.
Vendor Bid Response:
EPA HIGHWAY MPG EPA CITY MPG
Veiicle fuel type Reting Rating UnitPrice | Total Life cycle Cast
Gasoling " :.n. | ) |
[Frenfuel 16__ B $54,577.00
Diasel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CNG/Bifue! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hybrid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Options:
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) $79.00
$1.89

FOB Other then Metro Charisston - Per Mie

*Note - The above delivery "options” above are not evaluated as part of the award.




CLASS 15D - AUTOMOBILE - {Department of Environmental Protection Specifications)

Matheny Motor Truck Co

BMC —
Sierra TK15543

Vendor Name:
Manufacturer/Brand:
Model Name & Number:
Vehide Requlrements:
Classification: g:::’dﬂd Pick Up Crew
4 Wheel/All Wheel with
Dt High & Low
4
Passenger seating: " m” um (including
Doors: 4 full doors, minimum
Wheelbase: 140 ;_lﬁ minimum
GVWR: 7350 Ibs, max.
Epgine: _8Cylinder
Includes but not limited to:
Limited SHip rear, axle tack
lok differential, heavy duty
ckage: engine cooling, skid plates,
Off Road Py heavy duty suspension
with gas shocks,front &
rear tow hools and all
terrain tires.
‘Tow Package: Installed Hitch & Wirin
Bed: Short bed with drop-in
bediiner

SlldEgRurWindow: Installed

Additional Requlrements;
The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification,
endor Bid Responge: N
EPA HIGHWAY MPG EPA CITY MPG
Vehicle fusl type Rating Rating Unit Price Total Life Cycle Cost
' T & T E— ] T ————
Gasoline _
[Flax-uel 16 12 28,913.00 |$54,301.00
|Diesel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CING/Blfuel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hybrid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Options:
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) $79.00
$ 1.89

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

*Note - The above delivery "options™ above are not evaluated as part of the award.



