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4DR-Gas Ford Fiesta 13,419.00$            Stephens Auto Center 29 38

 

1A- Auto Sub Compact (Hybrid)  

95" WB
Hybrid Toyota Prius V 1243 26,995.00$        Jim Robinson 44 40

Flex Fuel Buick Regal 4GR69 25,990.00$        Whiteside Chevrolet 25 36

       

 

Gas Ford Focus P3E 14,841.00$            Stephens Auto Center 28 38

 

 

 

Gas Jeep Patriot Sport FWD MKTE74 15,193.00$        Greenbrier Motor Company 23 27

 

 

 

 

Gas Ford Fusion POG 16,097.00$        Stephens Auto Center 23 33

  

 

Flex Fuel Malibu LS 1ZG69 16,710.00$        Bob Robinson 22 23

 

Gas Impala 1WF19 18,199.00$        Bob Robinson 18 30

 

Flex Fuel Impala 1WF19 18,199.00$        Bob Robinson 18 30

 

Gas  Charger RWD  LDDM48  $           21,633.00 Country Club Chrysler 19 31

 

Flex Fuel  Charger RWD LDDE48 21,633.00$        Country Club Chrysler 19 31

         

Flex Fuel Buick Regal 4GR69 25,990.00$        Whiteside Chevrolet 25 36

Hybrid Toyota Camry 2559 26,495.00$        Jim Robinson Inc. 43 39

Gas Jeep Patriot Sport 4WD MKJE74 16,177.00$        Country Club Chrysler 21 26

Flex Fuel Chevy Equinox LS AWD 1LG26 21,300.00$        Whiteside Cheverolet 20 29

GAS Jeep Grand Cherokee WKJH74 25,244.00$        Country Club Chrysler 16 23

Flex Fuel Jeep Grand Cherokee WKJH74 25,244.00$        Country Club Chrysler 16 23

 

4 - AUTO  4DR  (FWD)  110.0" WB

MODELCLASS

1 - AUTO  Sub Compact (FWD)   

95" WB 

2 - AUTO  4DR (FWD)  102.9" WB

5 - AUTO  4DR  (RWD) 110" WB   

2890 GVWR

3 - AUTO   4 DR (FWD)  107.4" 

WB

5A - AUTO  Compact 4 DR 

(Hybrid)

6 - AUTO  4DR  4WD / AWD  

103.0" WB   3800GVWR

6A - AUTO  4WD 109" WB  5700  

GVWR

VENDOR
HWY 

MPG

CITY 

MPG
 PRICE 

2A-WAGON  4DR  (FWD)  2700 

GVWR
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Gas Jeep Grand Cherokee WKJH74 24,548.00$        Country Club Chrysler 16 23

Flex Fuel Jeep Grand Cherokee WKJH74 24,548.00$        Country Club Chrysler 16 23

GAS Ford Expedition SSV 27,749.00$        Stephens Auto Center N/A N/A

Flex Fuel Ford Expedition SSV 27,749.00$        Stephens Auto Center N/A N/A

GAS GMC Yukon 1500 4WD 48,043.00$        Beckley Automall 20 23

GAS GMC Yukon 1500 2WD 45,467.00$        Beckley Auromall 20 23

       

GAS GMC Canyon 2WD  Reg Cab TS15403 14,799.00$        Beckley Automall 18 25

GAS GMC Canyon  2WD  EXT CAB TS15653 15,896.00$        Matheny Motor Truck 17 23

No Bids

No Bids

GAS GMC Canyon 2 WD SB 14,865.00$        Beckley Automall 17 23

GAS Ford F-150 F1C 14,720.88$        Thornhill Ford 17 23

Flex Fuel Ford F-150 F1C 14,720.88$        Thornhill Ford 17 23

Hybrid Cheverolet Silverado 1500   Crew Cab 33,432.00$        Whiteside Chevrolet 20 23

9 - TRUCK 4Cyl  2WD  3500    

GVWR

10 - TRUCK 6 cyl  2WD Ext. Cab  

4200    GVWR

10A - TRUCK 2WD AUTO

10A - TRUCK 2WD MANUAL

11 - TRUCK

12 - TRUCK  2 WD  6000 GVWR

8A - AUTO  4 DR  130.0" WB    

Utility  

7 - AUTO  4WD  6270  GVWR

8 - AUTO  4 DR  4WD  7400  

GVWR  Utility   (No MPG)
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12A  - Truck  2 WD  6000     

GVWR Gas GMC Sierra 1500 2WD 16,380.00$        Beckley Automall 20 23

Flex Fuel Cheverolet Silverado 16,208.00$        Whiteside Chevrolet 14 19

Hybrid GMC Sierra 1500 2WD 34,419.00$        Beckley Automall 20 23

Gas No-Bid's

Flex Fuel No-Bid's

Hybrid No-Bid's

Gas Dodge Ram 2500 DJ2J92 20,513.00$        Stephens Auto Mall N/A N/A

       

Flex Fuel Chevrolet Silverado 2500 17,978.00$        Whiteside Chevrolet N/A N/A

Gas GMC Sierra TC20943 17,989.00$        Matheny Motors N/A N/A

Flex Fuel GMC Sierra TC20943 17,989.00$        Matheny Motors N/A N/A

GAS GMC Canyon  4WD  RegCab TT15403 17,103.00$        Beckley Automall 17 23

Flex Fuel No- Bid

GAS GMC Canyon TT15653 19,069.00$        Matheny Motor Truck 17 23

Flex Fuel Chevrolet Colorado CT15653 18,560.00$        Whiteside Chevrolet 17 23

GAS GMC  Canyon TT15643 21,729.00$        Matheny Motor Truck 16 21

Flex Fuel No-Bid's

Gas Ford F-150 F1E 17,882.88$        Thornhill Ford 16 21

Flex Fuel Ford F-150 F1E 17,882.88$        Thornhill Ford 16 21

Hybrid Chevrolet Silverado CK10703 36,600.00$        Whiteside Chevrolet 13 18

GAS Chevrolet  Silverado 18,200.00$        Whiteside Chevrolet 13 18

18A - Truck  4 WD  5400 GVWR Flex Fuel Chevrolet  Silverado 18,670.00$        Whiteside Chevrolet 13 18

Hybrid GMC Sierra 1500 4WD 37,305.00$        Beckley Automall 20 23

18 - TRUCK   4WD  5400 GVWR

17A - TRUCK  4 WD, Crew Cab    

4850 GVWR

12 - TRUCK  2 WD  6000 GVWR

13 - TRUCK 

14 - TRUCK  2WD Crew Cab  8800 

GVWR

15 - TRUCK   2WD  8500 GVWR

16 - TRUCK  4WD  4500 GVWR

17 - TRUCK    4 WD  4700 GVWR
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Gas GMC Sierra TK20903 20,588.00$        Matheny Motor Truck N/A N/A

Diesel Ford F-250 F2B 27,028.00$        Stephens Auto Center N/A N/A

Flex Fuel GMC Sierra TK20903 20,588.00$        Matheny Motor Truck N/A N/A

Diesel Ford F-250 F2B 26,446.00$        Stephens Auto Center N/A N/A

Gas GMC Sierra TK20903 20,022.00$        Matheny Motor Truck N/A N/A

Diesel No-Bid's

Gas No-Bid's

Diesel Ford F350 F3H 29,583.00$        Stephens Auto Center N/A N/A

Gas Dodge Ram 3500 DD8L64 22,239.00$        Stephens Auto Center N/A N/A

Diesel GMC Sierra TK31003 29,638.00$        Matheny Motors N/A N/A

Gas Dodge Ram  3500 DD8L64 22,404.00$        Stephens Auto Center N/A N/A

Gas GMC Sierra TK30903 21,924.00$        Matheny Motors N/A N/A

Flex Fuel GMC Sierra TK30903 21,924.00$        Matheny Motors N/A N/A

Gas GMC Savana TG13405 16,242.00$        Matheny Motor Truck 15 20

Flex Fuel Ford E-150 E1E 16,597.00$        Stephens Auto Center 13 17

Gas GMC Savana TG23405 17,469.00$        Matheny Motor Truck N/A N/A

Diesel Chevrolet CG23405 28,210.00$        Whiteside Chevrolet N/A N/A

Flex Fuel GMC Savana TG23405 17,469.00$        Matheny Motor Truck N/A N/A

Gas Dodge Ram Cargo Van RTKE53 20,005.00$        Glen Dale Motors

Diesel Chevrolet CG23405 39,600.00$        Whiteside Chevrolet

Flex Fuel Dodge Ram Cargo Van RTKE53 20,005.00$        Glen Dale Motors

Gas GMC Savana TG23405 17,284.00$        Matheny Motor Truck

Diesel GMC Savana 27,887.00$        Matheny Motor Truck

Flex Fuel GMC Savana TG23405 17,279.00$        Matheny Motor Truck

GAS Dodge Grand Caravan  SE RTKH53 19,643.00$        Glen Dale Motors 17 25

Flex Fuel Dodge Grand Caravan  SE RTKH53 19,643.00$        Glen Dale Motors 17 25

Diesel GMC Savana TG13406 33,169.00$        Matheny Motor Truck N/A N/A

25 - VAN  125" Wb  8 Passenger

24 - VAN  110" WB  7 Passenger

19 - TRUCK  4WD 8500 GVWR

20 - CHASIS CAB FLATBED 137"           

9000 GVWR

20 - CHASIS CAB FLATBED 161"   

9000   GVWR

20A - CHASIS CAB 137"   4WD 

12000   GVWR

20A - CHASIS CAB 161"   4WD  

12000  GVWR

21 - TRUCK   4WD 10000  GVWR

22 - VAN CARGO   109" WB  6500 

GVWR

23 - VAN, CARGO  138"  WB   

8500  GVWR   (No  MPG)

23A - VAN FWD  135"  WB   8500 

GVWR   (No MPG)

23A - VAN  RWD          8500 

GVWR
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Gas GMC Savana 2500 12 Passenger 21,498.00$        Beckley Automall N/A N/A

Flex Fuel Ford E-350 E3B 21,679.00$        Stephens Auto Center N/A N/A

Diesel GMC Savana 2500 12 Passenger TG3406 33,486.00$        Matheny Motor Truck N/A N/A

2 WD Ford F-550 34,681.00$        Stephens Auto Center N/A N/A

4 WD Ford F-550 37,909.00$        Stephens Auto Center N/A N/A

2 WD Ford F-550  $34,851.00 Stephens Auto Center N/A N/A

4 WD Ford F-550  $38,078.00 Stephens Auto Center N/A N/A

33A - TRUCK 141"WB 60" C/A   

17500  GVWR 4 WD Ford F-550 F5H 65,314.00$        Stephens Auto Center N/A N/A

33A - TRUCK 165"WB 84" C/A    

17500  GVWR 4 WD No-Bid's

Gas Jeep Liberty 18,980.00$        Stephens Auto Center 15 21

Flex Fuel Chevrolet Tahoe CK10706 32,900.00$        Whiteside Chevrolet 15 21

Hybrid Chevrolet Tahoe   AWD CK10706 47,700.00$        Whiteside Chevrolet 20 23

Hybrid Buick Lacross 4GB69 26,430.00$        Whiteside Chevrolet 25 36

Electric Chevrolet Volt 1RC68 38,400.00$        Whiteside Chevrolet ? ?

No-Bid's

 Gas Ford Transit FWD  19,619.00$        Stephens Auto Center ? ?

Mini -Storage Van Diesel No-Bid's

 Flex Fuel No-Bid's

36 - ELECTRIC UTILITY VEHICLE  

FWD  2300  GVWR

34A - AUTO / HYBRID  4 DR  

FWD/AWD  4100  GVWR

34B - Auto  (HYBRID)  4 Dr  3450 

Curb Weight

35 - ELECTRIC CAR  FWD   1800  

GVWR

25 - VAN  125" Wb  8 Passenger

26 - VAN   125" WB  12 Pass

33 - TRUCK 141" WB 60" C/A  

17500  GVWR 

33 - TRUCK 165" WB 84" C/A   

17500  GVWR     

34 - AUTO  4 DR  4 WD 103.0"  

WB    4100 GVWR


