



State of West Virginia
 Department of Administration
 Purchasing Division
 2019 Washington Street East
 Post Office Box 50130
 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Purchase Order

PURCHASE ORDER NO.
MV12G

PAGE
1

BLANKET RELEASE
00

CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES, INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS. QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS PURCHASE ORDER SHOULD BE DIRECTED TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.

CHANGE ORDER

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS

INVOICE TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
 AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
 VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
 BY ORDER

AGENCY COPY

VENDOR

*709035314 304-485-4410
 MATHENY MOTOR TRUCK COMPANY
 PO BOX 1304
 PARKERSBURG WV 26102-1304

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
 AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
 VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
 BY ORDER

DATE PRINTED	TERMS OF SALE	FEIN/SSN	FUND		
01/27/2012	NET 30	550320770			
SHIP VIA	F.O.B	FREIGHT TERMS	ACCOUNT NUMBER		
BEST WAY	DESTINATION	PREPAID	MUL-MUL		
LINE	QUANTITY	UOP	VENDOR ITEM NO.	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
	DELIVERY DATE	CAT.NO.	ITEM NUMBER		
BLANKET OPEN-END STATEWIDE CONTRACT THIS CONTRACT IS TO SUPPLY 2012 MOTOR VEHICLES (OR CURRENT MODEL YEAR) TO ALL WEST VIRGINIA STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS, PER THE ATTACHED LIST OF VEHICLE CLASSES AWARDED THROUGH THIS CONTRACT. THIS AWARD IS PER THE FOLLOWING: 1. REQUEST FOR QUOTATION DATED 11/07/2011 AND ALL ADDENDA THERE TO. 2. ADDENDUM NO.1, DATED 11/22/2011. 3. VENDOR'S BID DATED 12/13/2011. ALL RELEASE ORDERS FOR STATE AGENCIES MUST BE DONE THROUGH THE PURCHASING DIVISION. AGENCY REQUESTS MUST BE SUBMITTED WITH A WV-35 AND ATTACH THE COMPLETED VEHICLE ORDER FORM FOR EACH DIFFERENT TYPE OF VEHICLE ORDERED. ***** AGENCIES MUST OBTAIN APPROPRIATE APPROVAL PRIOR TO SENDING TO THE PURCHASING DIVISION. ***** POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS SHOULD CONTACT THE VENDOR					
IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>					PURCHASING DIVISION CERTIFIED ENCUMBERED FEB 13 2012 <i>Beverly Toler</i>
					OPEN END TOTAL

Dave Wayfield APPROVED AS TO FORM BY ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL

APPROVED FOR ONE FISCAL YEAR

BY *Guy Nisbet* 11/30/12 304-558-8802

PURCHASING DIVISION AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE *02/06/12*

GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

1. Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginia.
2. The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.
3. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division and have paid the required \$125 fee.
4. All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Order/Contracts are to be continued for the term of the Purchase Order/Contracts, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or goods this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.
5. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.
6. Interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the *West Virginia Code*.
7. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the *West Virginia Code*.
8. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.
9. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.
10. The laws of the State of West Virginia and the *Legislative Rules* of the Purchasing Division shall govern the purchasing process.
11. Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written agreement of the parties.
12. **BANKRUPTCY:** In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, the State may deem this contract null and void, and terminate such contract without further order.
13. **HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM:** The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, is available online at www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.html and is hereby made part of the agreement provided that the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.
14. **CONFIDENTIALITY:** The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the agency's policies, procedures, and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and Information Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in <http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy/noticeConfidentiality.pdf>.
15. **LICENSING:** Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia Secretary of State's Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, and the West Virginia Insurance Commission. The vendor must provide all necessary releases to obtain information to enable the director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good standing with the above entities.
16. **ANTITRUST:** In submitting a bid to any agency for the State of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that if the bid is accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or transfer to the State of West Virginia all rights, title and interest in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and the State of West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the particular commodities or services purchased or acquired by the State of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders the initial payment to the bidder.

I certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm, limited liability company, partnership, or person or entity submitting a bid for the same material, supplies, equipment or services and is in all respects fair and without collusion or Fraud. I further certify that I am authorized to sign the certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid.

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division. Complete all sections of the quotation form.
2. Items offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the specifications must be clearly indicated by the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as **EQUAL** to the specifications must be clearly defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications and literature to the bid. The Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications.
3. Unit prices shall prevail in case of discrepancy. All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the quotation.
4. All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications: Department of Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Street East, P.O. Box 50130, Charleston, WV 25305-0130
5. Communication during the solicitation, bid, evaluation or award periods, except through the Purchasing Division, is strictly prohibited (W.Va. C.S.R. §148-1-6.6).



State of West Virginia
 Department of Administration
 Purchasing Division
 2019 Washington Street East
 Post Office Box 50130
 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Purchase Order

PURCHASE ORDER NO.
 MV12G

PAGE
 2

BLANKET RELEASE
 00

CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER
 MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES,
 INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS.
 QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS PUR-
 CHASE ORDER SHOULD BE DIRECTED
 TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.

CHANGE ORDER

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR
 TERMS AND CONDITIONS

INVOICE TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
 AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
 VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
 BY ORDER

VENDOR

*709035314 304-485-4410
 MATHENY MOTOR TRUCK COMPANY
 PO BOX 1304

 PARKERSBURG WV 26102-1304

SHIP TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
 AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
 VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
 BY ORDER

DATE PRINTED		TERMS OF SALE		FEIN/SSN		FUND	
01/27/2012		NET 30		550320770			
SHIP VIA		F.O.B		FREIGHT TERMS		ACCOUNT NUMBER	
BEST WAY		DESTINATION		PREPAID		MUL-MUL	
LINE	QUANTITY	UOP	VENDOR ITEM NO.		UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	
	DELIVERY DATE	CAT.NO.	ITEM NUMBER				
0001		EA			.00000		
DIRECTLY TO MAKE A PURCHASE THROUGH THIS CONTRACT. 02/15/2012 070-06-01-000 2012 (OR CURRENT MODEL YEAR) MOTOR VEHICLES EXHIBIT 3 LIFE OF CONTRACT: THIS CONTRACT BECOMES EFFECTIVE ON 02/15/2012 AND EXTENDS FOR A PERIOD OF ONE (1) YEAR OR UNTIL SUCH "REASONABLE TIME" THEREAFTER AS IS NECESSARY TO OBTAIN A NEW CONTRACT OR RENEW THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT. THE "REASONABLE TIME" PERIOD SHALL NOT EXCEED TWELVE (12) MONTHS. DURING THIS "REASONABLE TIME" THE VENDOR MAY TERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR ANY REASON UPON GIVING THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 30 DAYS WRITTEN NOTICE. UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVISIONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE IN THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT, THE TERMS, CONDITIONS AND PRICING SET HEREIN ARE FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE CONTRACT. CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES							
IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE <input type="checkbox"/>						TOTAL	

APPROVED AS TO FORM BY
 ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL

BY _____
 PURCHASING DIVISION AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE



State of West Virginia
 Department of Administration
 Purchasing Division
 2019 Washington Street East
 Post Office Box 50130
 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Purchase Order

PURCHASE ORDER NO.
MV12G

PAGE
3

BLANKET RELEASE
00

CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER
 MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES,
 INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS.
 QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS PUR-
 CHASE ORDER SHOULD BE DIRECTED
 TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.

CHANGE ORDER

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR
 TERMS AND CONDITIONS

INVOICE TO	ALL STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER
------------	--

VENDOR	*709035314 304-485-4410
	MATHENY MOTOR TRUCK COMPANY PO BOX 1304
	PARKERSBURG WV 26102-1304

SHIP TO	ALL STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER
---------	--

DATE PRINTED		TERMS OF SALE		FEIN/SSN		FUND	
01/27/2012		NET 30		550320770			
SHIP VIA		F.O.B		FREIGHT TERMS		ACCOUNT NUMBER	
BEST WAY		DESTINATION		PREPAID		MUL-MUL	
LINE	QUANTITY	UOP	VENDOR ITEM NO.		UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	
	DELIVERY DATE	CAT.NO.	ITEM NUMBER				
<p>SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.</p> <p>OPEN MARKET CLAUSE: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING MAY AUTHORIZE A SPENDING UNIT TO PURCHASE ON THE OPEN MARKET, WITHOUT THE FILING OF A REQUISITION OR COST ESTIMATE, ITEMS SPECIFIED ON THIS CONTRACT FOR IMMEDIATE DELIVERY IN EMERGENCIES DUE TO UNFORESEEN CAUSES (INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO DELAYS IN TRANSPORTATION OR AN UNANTICIPATED INCREASE IN THE VOLUME OF WORK.)</p> <p>QUANTITIES: QUANTITIES LISTED IN THE REQUISITION ARE APPROXIMATIONS ONLY, BASED ON ESTIMATES SUPPLIED BY THE STATE SPENDING UNIT. IT IS UNDERSTOOD AND AGREED THAT THE CONTRACT SHALL COVER THE QUANTITIES ACTUALLY ORDERED FOR DELIVERY DURING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT, WHETHER MORE OR LESS THAN THE QUANTITIES SHOWN.</p> <p>ORDERING PROCEDURE: SPENDING UNIT(S) SHALL ISSUE A WRITTEN EQUIPMENT CONTRACT ORDER (FORM NUMBER WV-35) FOR COMMODITIES COVERED BY THIS CONTRACT. THE ORIGINAL WV-35 MUST BE SENT TO THE PURCHASING DIVISION. AFTER APPROVAL AND ENCUMBRANCE, ONE COPY OF THE PURCHASE ORDER WILL BE RETURNED TO THE SPENDING UNIT AND ONE COPY FORWARDED TO THE VENDOR AS AUTHORIZATION FOR SHIPMENT. NO ORDER IS VALID UNLESS APPROVED AND ENCUMBERED BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION.</p>							
IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE <input type="checkbox"/>							TOTAL

APPROVED AS TO FORM BY
 ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL

BY _____
 PURCHASING DIVISION AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE



State of West Virginia
 Department of Administration
 Purchasing Division
 2019 Washington Street East
 Post Office Box 50130
 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Purchase Order

PURCHASE ORDER NO.
 MV12G

PAGE
 4

BLANKET RELEASE
 00

CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER
 MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES,
 INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS.
 QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS PUR-
 CHASE ORDER SHOULD BE DIRECTED
 TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.

CHANGE ORDER

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR
 TERMS AND CONDITIONS

I
N
V
O
I
C
E
T
O

ALL STATE AGENCIES
 AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
 VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
 BY ORDER

V
E
N
D
O
R

*709035314 304-485-4410
 MATHENY MOTOR TRUCK COMPANY
 PO BOX 1304
 PARKERSBURG WV 26102-1304

S
H
I
P
T
O

ALL STATE AGENCIES
 AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
 VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
 BY ORDER

DATE PRINTED		TERMS OF SALE		FEIN/SSN		FUND	
01/27/2012		NET 30		550320770			
SHIP VIA		F.O.B		FREIGHT TERMS		ACCOUNT NUMBER	
BEST WAY		DESTINATION		PREPAID		MUL-MUL	
LINE	QUANTITY	UOP	VENDOR ITEM NO.		UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	
	DELIVERY DATE	CAT.NO.	ITEM NUMBER				
<p>BANKRUPTCY: IN THE EVENT THE VENDOR/CONTRACTOR FILES FOR BANKRUPTCY PROTECTION, THIS CONTRACT IS AUTOMATICALLY NULL AND VOID, AND IS TERMINATED WITHOUT FURTHER ORDER.</p> <p>THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS CONTAINED IN THIS CONTRACT SHALL SUPERSEDE ANY AND ALL SUBSEQUENT TERMS AND CONDITIONS WHICH MAY APPEAR ON ANY ATTACHED PRINTED DOCUMENTS SUCH AS PRICE LISTS, ORDER FORMS, SALES AGREEMENTS OR MAINTENANCE AGREEMENTS, INCLUDING ANY ELECTRONIC MEDIUM SUCH AS CD-ROM.</p>							
IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE <input type="checkbox"/>							TOTAL

APPROVED AS TO FORM BY
 ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL

BY _____
 PURCHASING DIVISION AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

MV12	M.J. Matheny Motor Truck Co.	
CLASS	MODEL	PRICE
10 - Truck 6cyl. 2WD Ext. Cab 4200 GVWR	GAS - GMC Canyon 2WD Ext. Cab (TS15653)	\$ 15,896.00
15 - Truck 2 WD 8500 GVWR	GAS - GMC Sierra 2WD (TC20943)	\$ 17,989.00
15 - Truck 2 WD 8500 GVWR	FLEX FUEL - GMC Sierra 2WD (TC20943)	\$ 17,989.00
17 - Truck 4WD 4700 GVWR	GAS - GMC Canyon 4WD (TT15653)	\$ 19,069.00
17A - Truck 4WD Crew Cab 4700 GVWR	GAS - GMC Canyon 4WD Crew Cab (TT15643)	\$ 21,729.00
19 - Truck 4WD 8500 GVWR	GAS - GMC Sierra 4WD (TK20903)	\$ 20,588.00
19 - Truck 4WD 8500 GVWR	FLEX FUEL - GMC Sierra 4WD (TK20903)	\$ 20,588.00
20 - Chasis Cab 137" WB 9000 GVWR	GAS - GMC Sierra 137" WB (TK20903)	\$ 20,022.00
20A - Chasis Cab 137" WB 12,000 GVWR	DIESEL - GMC Sierra (TK31003)	\$ 29,638.00
21 - Truck 4WD 10,000 GVWR	GAS - GMC Sierra 4WD (TK30903)	\$ 21,924.00
21 - Truck 4WD 10,000 GVWR	FLEX FUEL - GMC Sierra 4WD (TK30903)	\$ 21,924.00
22 - Van Cargo 109" WB 6500 GVWR	GAS - GMC Savana Cargo Van 109" WB (TG13405)	\$ 16,242.00
23 - Van Cargo 138" WB 8500 GVWR	GAS - GMC Savana Cargo Van 138" WB (TG23405)	\$ 17,469.00
23 - Van Cargo 138" WB 8500 GVWR	FLEX FUEL - GMC Savana Cargo Van 138" WB (TG23405)	\$ 17,469.00
23A - Van FWD 8500 GVWR	GAS - GMC Savana RWD (TG23405)	\$ 17,284.00
23A - Van FWD 8500 GVWR	FLEX FUEL - GMC Savana RWD (TG23405)	\$ 17,279.00
23A - Van FWD 8500 GVWR	DIESEL - GMC Savana RWD ()	\$ 28,754.00
25 - Van 125" WB 8 Passenger	DIESEL - GMC Savana 125" WB 8 Passenger (TG13406)	\$ 33,169.00
25 - Van 125" WB 8 Passenger	GAS - GMC Savana 125" WB 12 Passenger (TG3406)	\$ 18,839.00
25 - Van 125" WB 8 Passenger	FLEX FUEL - GMC Savana 125" WB 12 Passenger (TG3406)	\$ 18,839.00
26 - Van 125" WB 12 Passenger	DIESEL - GMC Savana 125" WB 12 Passenger (TG3406)	\$ 33,486.00

CLASS 10 - TRUCK

070-48-10-001

Small Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive, Extended Cab, 6 Cylinder, 4200 GVWR, Short Bed
Includes but is not limited to: Ford Ranger, Toyota Tacoma, Mazda B2300 or equal.

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck

Manufacturer / Brand	GMC
Delivery	90 - 120 days
Model Name & Number	Canyon TS15653

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine	MIN: 200 HP 225 TORQUE
Transmission	Automatic
Steering	Power
Brakes	Power
Radio	AM/FM
Glass	All Tinted
Mirrors	Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts	Front & Rear
Cargo Box	Fleetside
Bumper	Rear Step Factory Installed
Tires	All Season
Spare Tire	Full Size w/ Jack
Air Conditioning	Installed
Front Seat	Standard seating
Standard Floor Covering	Installed
Front Air Bags	Installed

HP	TORQUE
242	242

Price Each Gasoline	15,896.00
Price Each Flex Fuel	No Bid

EPA HGWAY	EPA CITY
23	17

Options:

1 AM/FM w/ CD Player		\$	N/A
2 Limited Slip Rear End		\$	N/A
3 Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control		\$	Standard
4 Keyless Entry		\$	Re. Opt 7
5 Power Windows / Power Locks		\$	594.00
6 Exterior colors		\$	No Charge
7 Side Air Bags		\$	Standard
8 Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)		\$	109.00
9 Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)		\$	109.00
10 Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo)		\$	N/A
11 Slide Rear Window		\$	N/A
12 Front seat bench		\$	Standard
13 Bed Liner		\$	132.00
14 Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)	→	\$ -	N/A
15 Delete Cloth Seats (Deduct)	→	\$ -	N/A
16 Delete Carpet (Deduct)	→	\$ -	N/A
17 FOB Dealership: (Deduct)	→	\$ -	-69.00
18 FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile		\$	1.90

Additional Information:

CLASS 15 - TRUCK

070-48-15-000

Large Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive, 8500 GVWR, Long Bed
Includes but is not limited to: Ford F250, Dodge Ram 2500, Chevrolet 2500 or equal.

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck

Manufacturer / Brand	GMC
Delivery	90 - 120 days
Model Name & Number	Sierra TC20903

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine	MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE
Transmission	Automatic
Steering	Power
Brakes	Power
Radio	AM/FM
Glass	All Tinted
Mirrors	Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts	Front & Rear
Cargo Box	Fleetside
Bumper	Rear Step Factory Installed
Tires	All Season
Spare Tire	Full Size w/ Jack
Air Conditioning	Installed
Standard Floor Covering	Installed
Front Air Bags	Installed

HP	TORQUE
360	380

Price Each Gasoline	17,989.00
Price Each Flex Fuel	17,989.00

Options:

1	Extended Cab	\$ 2,091.50
2	Crew Cab	\$ 3,971.50
3	Limited Slip Rear End	\$ 286.00
4	AM/FM w/ CD Player	\$ 149.60
5	Till Wheel & Cruise Control	\$ Standard
6	Keyless Entry	\$ 391.60
7	Power Windows / Power Locks	\$ 879.12
8	Tow Package	\$ 686.40
9	Diesel Engine	\$ 7,378.60
10	V-8 Engine	\$ Standard
11	Side Air Bags	\$ 347.60
12	Exterior colors	\$ No Charge
13	Slide Rear Window	\$ N/A
14	Running Boards	\$ 399.00
15	Trailer Tow Mirrors	\$ 213.84
16	Bed Liner	\$ 189.00
17	Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)	\$ 129.00
18	Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)	\$ 129.00
19	Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo)	\$ N/A
20	Delete Truck Bed (Deduct)	\$ - 585.20
21	Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)	\$ - N/A
22	Delete Cloth Seats (Deduct)	\$ - 0.00
23	Delete Carpet (Deduct)	\$ - 0.00
24	FOB Dealership: (Deduct)	\$ - -69.00
25	FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile	\$ 1.95
26	Available Axle Ratios	\$ 88.00

Additional Information:

CLASS 17 - TRUCK
 Small Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive,
 Extended Cab, 4700 GVWR

070-48-17-000

Includes but is not limited to: GMC Canyon, Chevrolet Colorado or equal.

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck

Manufacturer / Brand	GMC
Delivery	90 - 120 days
Model Name & Number	Canyon TT15653

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine	MIN: 207 HP 225 TORQUE
Transmission	Automatic
Steering	Power
Brakes	Power/ABS
Radio	AM/FM
Glass	All Tinted
Mirrors	Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts	Front & Rear
Cargo Box	Fleetside
Bumper	Rear Step Factory Installed
Tires	All Season
Spare Tire	Full Size w/ Jack
Air Conditioning	Installed
Front Seat	Standard seating
Auto Locking Hubs	Installed
Standard Floor Covering	Installed
Front Air Bags	Installed

HP	TORQUE
242	242

Price Each Gasoline	19,069.00
Price Each Flex Fuel	N/A

EPA HGWY	EPA CITY
23	17

Options:

1 Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes:

Axle-trac-lok differential	Standard
Engine Cooling - heavy duty	Standard
Skid plate Group	Standard
Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks	Standard
All Terrain Tires	88
Tow Hooks	Standard

\$ 88

↑
 Enter total off road pkg above

- 2 AM/FM w/ CD Player
- 3 Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control
- 4 Keyless Entry
- 5 Power Windows / Power Locks
- 6 Limited Slip Rear End
- 7 Engine V8: Size _____
- 8 Tow Package
- 9 Side Air Bags
- 10 Bend front seat
- 11 Exterior colors
- 12 Slide Rear Window
- 13 Long Bed
- 14 Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)
- 15 Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)
- 16 Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo)
- 17 Front seat bench
- 18 Bed Liner
- 19 Carpet Interior
- 20 Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)
- 21 Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)
- 22 Delete Cloth Seats (Deduct)
- 23 Delete Carpet (Deduct)
- 24 Remove Console (Delete) (Console between seats)
- 25 FOB Dealership: (Deduct)
- 26 FOB Other Than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

	\$	N/A
	\$	Standard
	\$	Req. Opt 5
	\$	594.00
	\$	Standard
	\$	N/A
List items included in this group	\$	N/A
	\$	Standard
	\$	Standard
	\$	No Charge
	\$	N/A
	\$	N/A
	\$	109.00
	\$	109.00
	\$	N/A
	\$	Standard
	\$	132.00
	\$	Standard
	\$ -	N/A
	\$ -	N/A
	\$ -	N/A
	\$ -	N/A
	\$ -	N/A
	\$ -	-69.00
	\$	1.90

Additional Information:

CLASS 17A - TRUCK

070-48-17-010

Midsize Pickup, Front-Hinged, Full Size Doors,
4 Wheel Drive, 4 Door Crew Cab, 4850 GVWR
Includes but is not limited to: GMC Canyon, Chevrolet Colorado or equal.

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck

Manufacturer / Brand	GMC
Delivery	90 - 120 days
Model Name & Number	Canyon TT15643

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine	MIN: 210 HP 225 TORQUE
Transmission	Automatic
Steering	Power
Brakes	Power/ABS
Radio	AM/FM
Glass	All Tinted
Mirrors	Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts	Front & Rear
Cargo Box	Fleetside
Bumper	Rear Step Factory Installed
Tires	All Season
Spare Tire	Full Size w/ Jack
Air Conditioning	Installed
Front Seat	Standard Seating
Auto Locking Hubs	Installed
Standard Floor Covering	Installed
Front Air Bags	Installed

HP	TORQUE
242	242

Price Each Gasoline	\$ 21,729.00
Price Each Flex Fuel	No Bid

EPA HGWY	EPA CITY
21 #	

Options:

1 Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes:

Axle-trac-lok differential	Standard
Engine Cooling - heavy duty	Standard
Skid plate Group	Standard
Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks	Standard
All Terrain Tires	\$ 88.00
Tow Hooks	Standard

With ZA71 Off Road add \$853.60

Enter total off road pkg above

2 AM/FM w/ CD Player	Standard
3 Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control	Standard
4 Tow Package	List item included in this group
5 Side Air Bags	Standard
6 Exterior colors	Standard
7 Slide Rear Window	No Charge
8 Keyless Entry	N/A
9 Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors	Standard, Heated Mirrors N/A
10 Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)	109.00
11 Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)	109.00
12 Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo)	N/A
13 Bed Liner	132.00
14 Carpet Interior	Standard
15 Rear Jump Seat	Standard
16 Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)	N/A
17 Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)	N/A
18 Delete Cloth Seats (Deduct)	N/A
19 FOB Dealership (Deduct)	N/A
20 FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile	-69.00

Standard
Standard
Standard
Standard
No Charge
N/A
Standard, Heated Mirrors N/A
109.00
109.00
N/A
132.00
Standard
Standard
N/A
N/A
N/A
-69.00
1.90

Additional Information:

Z71 Off Road Package Includes: Chrome Clad Wheels, High Stance Suspension and 265/75/R17 On-

CLASS 19 - TRUCK

070-48-19-000

Large Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive, 8500 GVWR, Long Bed
Includes but is not limited to: Ford F250, Dodge Ram 2500, Chevrolet Sierra 2500 or equal.

Vendor Name: <u>Malheny Motor Truck</u>	
Manufacturer / Brand	<u>GMC</u>
Delivery	<u>60 - 120 days</u>
Model Name & Number	<u>Sierra TK20903</u>

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine	<u>MIN: 295 HP 335 TORQUE</u>
Transmission	<u>Automatic</u>
Steering	<u>Power</u>
Brakes	<u>Power/ABS</u>
Radio	<u>AM/FM</u>
Glass	<u>All Tinted</u>
Mirrors	<u>Left & Right Outside</u>
License Plate Mounts	<u>Front & Rear</u>
Cargo Box	<u>Fleetside</u>
Bumper	<u>Rear Step Factory Installed</u>
Tires	<u>All Season</u>
Spare Tire	<u>Full Size w/ Jack</u>
Air Conditioning	<u>Installed</u>
Front Seat	<u>Bench</u>
Auto Locking Hubs	<u>Installed</u>
Standard Floor Covering	<u>Installed</u>
Front Air Bags	<u>Installed</u>

HP	TORQUE
360	380

DIESEL	

Price Each Gasoline	<u>20,588.00</u>
Price Each Diesel	
Price Each Flex Fuel	<u>20,588.00</u>

EPA HGWY	EPA CITY
Not Rated	Not rated

Options:

1 Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes:		\$	594.00
Axle-trac-1ok differential	\$	286.00	} Enter total off road pkg above
Engine Cooling - heavy duty	Standard		
Skid plate Group	\$	132.00	
Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks	Standard		
All Terrain Tires	\$	176.00	
Tow Hooks	Standard		
2 AM/FM w/ CD Player		\$	194.60
3 Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control			Standard
4 Limited Slip Rear End		\$	286.00
5 Tow Package	List items included in this group	\$	686.40
6 Snow Plow Package	List items included in this group		Gas: \$250.80
7 Side Air Bags			Standard
8 Exterior colors			No Charge
9 Slide Rear Window			N/A
10 Keyless Entry		\$	391.60
11 Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors		\$	809.60
12 Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)		\$	129.00
13 Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)		\$	129.00
14 Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo)			N/A
15 Bed Liner		\$	189.00
16 Carpet Interior		\$	115.00
17 Cloth Seats			No Charge
18 Additional Tanks			N/A
19 Extended Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door		\$	2,162.88
20 Gas Engine 450 CID:			N/A
21 6 Cylinder (Deduct)	→		N/A
22 Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)	→		N/A
23 Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)	→	\$	-
24 Delete Cloth Seats (Deduct)	→	\$	-
25 FOB Dealership: (Deduct)	→	\$	(69.00)
26 FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile		\$	1.95
27 Available Axle Ratios	<u>4.10</u>	\$	88.00
	2		
	3		

Additional Information:

Snow Plow Package: HD Front Springs, Snow Plow Light Wiring, Skid Plates.
Trailer Towing Package: 2" receiver tube, Locking Differential, 7 pin wiring harness.

\$

CLASS 20 - TRUCK
 Chassis Cab, 4 Wheel Drive,
 9000 GVWR, Single Rear Wheels

070-48-20-001

Includes but is not limited to: Dodge Ram 2500, GMC Sierra 2500 or equal.

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck

Manufacturer / Brand	GMC
Delivery	60 - 120 days
Model Name & Number	Sierra TK20903

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine	MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE
Transmission	Automatic
Steering	Power
Brakes	Power/ABS
Radio	AM/FM
Glass	All Tinted
Mirrors	Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts	Front & Rear
Single Rear Wheels	Installed
Tires	All Season Load Range D
Fuel Tank	20 Gallons Minimum
Air Conditioning	Installed
Front Seat	Bench
Standard Floor Covering	Installed
Front Air Bags	Installed

HP	TORQUE
322	380

	DIESEL	GASOLINE
56" Cab to Axle	N/A	\$ 20,022.00

Options:

1	Full Size Spare tire		\$ 336.16
2	Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes:		\$ 594
	Axle-Irac-lok differential	286	{ Enter Total Off Rd Pkg Above
	Engine Cooling - heavy duty	Standard	
	Skid plate Group	132	
	Suspension - Heavy Duty w/Gas Shocks	Standard	
	All Terrain Tires	176	
	Engine Cooling Heavy Duty	Standard	
3	AM/FM w/ CD Player		\$ 149.60
4	Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control		\$ Standard
5	Keyless Entry		\$ 391.60
6	Power Windows / Power Locks		\$ 879.12
7	Back -Up Alarm		\$ 121.44
8	Tow Package	List items included in this group	\$ 686.40
9	Snow Plow Package	List items included in this group	\$ 435.60
10	Side Air Bags		\$ 347.60
11	Exterior colors		\$ No Charge
12	Slide Rear Window		\$ N/A
13	Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)		\$ 129.00
14	Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)		\$ 129.00
15	Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo)		\$ 129.00
16	Duel Gas Tanks		\$ N/A
17	Flatbed 8' Long (see attached specifications)		\$ 2552.00
18	Utility Bed 8' Long (see attached specifications)		\$ 5493.00
19	Crane (see attached specifications)		\$ 8655.00
20	Extended Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door		\$ 2091.50
21	Crew Cab - Front Hinged Doors		\$ 3971.50
22	Gasoline Engine: 8 Cyl, 7.0 (Deduct)	→	\$ - N/A
23	2 Wheel Drive (Deduct)	→	\$ - -2576.00
24	Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)	→	\$ - 0.00
25	Delete Cloth Seats (Deduct)	→	\$ - 0.00
26	Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)	→	\$ - N/A
27	FOB Dealership: (Deduct)	→	\$ - -69.00
28	FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile		\$ 1.95
29	Available Axle Ratios	4.10	\$ 88.00
	2.		
	3.		

Tow Package: Includes 2" receiver Tube and 7 pin Wiring.

CLASS 20A - TRUCK
 Chassis Cab, 4 Wheel Drive,
 12,000 GVWR, Dual Rear Wheels
 Includes but is not limited to: Dodge Ram 3500, Ford F350 or equal.

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck	
Manufacturer / Brand	GMC
Delivery	60 - 120 days
Model Name & Number	Sierra TK31003

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine	MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE
Transmission	Automatic
Steering	Power
Brakes	Power/ABS
Radio	AM/FM
Glass	All Tinted
Mirrors	Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts	Front & Rear
Dual Rear Wheels	Installed
Tires	All Season Load Range D
Fuel Tank	20 Gallons Minimum
Air Conditioning	Installed
Front Seat	Bench
Standard Floor Covering	Installed
Front Air Bags	Installed

HP	TORQUE
322	380

	DIESEL	GASOLINE
Price Each 137" WB 60" Cab to Axle		
Price Each 161" WB 84" Cab to Axle	29,638.00	

Options:

1 Full Size Spare tire		336.16
2 Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes:		594.00
Axle-trac-lok differential	286	
Engine Cooling - heavy duty	standard	
Skid plate Group	132	
Suspension - Heavy Duty w/Gas Shocks	standard	
All Terrain Tires	176	
Engine Cooling Heavy Duty	standard	
3 AM/FM w/ CD Player		\$ 149.60
4 Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control		\$ Standard
5 Keyless Entry		\$ 391.60
6 Power Windows / Power Locks		\$ 879.12
7 Back -Up Alarm		\$ 121.44
8 Tow Package	List items included in this group	\$ 686.40
9 Snow Plow Package	List items included in this group	\$ 435.60
10 Side Air Bags		\$ N/A
11 Exterior colors		\$ No Charge
12 Slide Rear Window		\$ N/A
13 Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)		\$ 129.00
14 Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)		\$ 129.00
15 Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo)		\$ N/A
16 Dual Gas Tanks		\$ 88.00
17 Flatbed 9' long f/ 60" CA (see attached specifications)		\$ 2,685.00
18 Flatbed 12' long f/ 84" CA (see attached specifications)		\$ 2,985.00
19 Dump Bed f/ 60" CA, 8.5' Long (see attached specifications)		\$ 7,175.00
20 Dump Bed f/ 84" CA, 10.5' long (see attached specifications)		\$ 8,075.00
21 Utility Bed f/ 60" CA, 9' long (see attached specifications)		\$ 6,575.00
22 Utility Bed f/ 84" CA, 11' long (see attached specifications)		\$ 8,175.00
23 Crane (see attached specifications)		\$ 10,800.00
24 Crane (see attached specifications)		\$ 10,800.00
25 Extended Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door		\$ N/A
26 Crew Cab - Front Hinged Doors		\$ 4,200.80
27 Gasoline Engine: 8 Cyl, 7.0 (Deduct)	→	\$ - N/A
28 2 Wheel Drive (Deduct)	→	\$ - 2,861.00
29 Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)	→	\$ - N/A
30 FOB Dealership: (Deduct)	→	\$ - -69.00
31 Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)	→	\$ - N/A
32 Delete Cloth Seats (Deduct)	→	\$ - N/A
33 FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile		\$ 1.95
34 Available Axle Ratios	4.10	\$ 88.00
	2.	
	3.	

↑
Enter Total Off Rd Pkg Above

CLASS 21 - TRUCK
 Large Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive,
 10000 GVWR, Long Bed
 Includes but is not limited to: GMC Sierra 3500, Dodge Ram 3500 or equal.

Vendor Name: Malheny Motor Truck

Manufacturer / Brand	GMC
Delivery	60 - 120 days
Model Name & Number	Sierra TK30903

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine	MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE
Transmission	Automatic
Steering	Power
Brakes	Power/ABS
Radio	AM/FM
Glass	All Tinted
Mirrors	Left & Right West Coast Type
License Plate Mounts	Front & Rear
Tires	All Season Load Range E
Spare Tire	Full Size w/ Jack
Cargo Box	Fleetside
Bumper	Rear Step / Factory Installed
Air Conditioning	Installed
Auto Locking Hubs	Installed
Standard Floor Covering	Installed
Front Air Bags	Installed

HP	TORQUE
322	380

Price Each Gasoline	21,924.00
Price Each Flex Fuel	21,924.00

Options:

1	Dual Rear Wheels		\$ 733.21
2	Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes:		\$ 594
	Axle-trac-loc differential	286	
	Engine Cooling - heavy duty	Standard	
	Skid plate Group	132	
	Suspension - Heavy Duty w/Gas Shocks	Standard	
	All Terrain Tires	176	
	Engine Cooling Heavy Duty	Standard	
3	AM/FM w/ CD Player		\$ 149.60
4	Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control		\$ Standard
5	Keyless Entry		\$ 391.60
6	Power Windows / Power Locks		\$ 809.60
7	Side Air Bags		\$ 347.60
8	Diesel Engine		\$ 7,387.60
9	Back-Up Alarm		\$ 121.44
10	Tow Package	List items included in this group	\$ 686.40
11	Snow Plow Package	List items included in this group	\$ 435.60
12	Exterior colors		\$ No Charge
13	Carpet Interior		\$ 115.00
14	Slide Rear Window		\$ N/A
15	Swing Out Mirror		\$ 213.84
16	Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)		\$ 129.00
17	Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)		\$ 129.00
18	Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo)		\$ N/A
19	Bed Liner		\$ 189.00
20	Duel Gas Tanks		\$ N/A
21	Extended Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door		\$ 2,890.50
22	2 Wheel Drive (Deduct)	→	\$ -2,589.00
23	Delete Truck Bed (Deduct)	→	\$ -585.00
24	Short Bed (Deduct)	→	\$ N/A
25	6 Cylinder (Deduct)	→	\$ N/A
26	Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)	→	\$ N/A
27	Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)	→	\$ N/A
28	Delete Cloth Seats (Deduct)	→	\$ 0.00
29	Remove Console (Delete) (Console between seats)	→	\$ 0.00
30	FOB Dealership: (Deduct)	→	\$ -69.00
31	FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile		\$ 1.95
32	Available Axle Ratios	4.10	\$ 88.00
		2	
		3	

Enter Total Off Rd Pkg. Above

Trailer Towing Package: Includes 2" Hitch Tube and 7 Pin wiring.
 Snow Plow Package: Plowing Light Wiring, Skid Plates, HD Front Springs.

CLASS 22 - VAN, CARGO
 6500 GVWR, 109" Wheelbase
 Includes but is not limited to: Express, GMC Savana or equal.

070-92-22-001

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck

Manufacturer / Brand	GMC
Delivery	60 - 120 days
Model Name & Number	Savana TG13405

Standard Equipment Requirements:		HP	TORQUE
Engine	MIN: 180 HP 210 TORQUE	195	260
Transmission	Automatic		
Steering	Power		
Brakes	Power/ABS		
Radio	AM/FM		
Glass	All Tinted		
Mirrors	Left & Right Outside		
License Plate Mounts	Front & Rear		
Standard Bumper	Installed		
Tires	All Season		
Spare Tire	Standard tire w/Jack		
Air Conditioning	Installed		
Seating Capacity 2	Passenger Seat		
Front Air Bags	Installed		

	RWD	EPA HGWAY	EPA CITY
Price Each Gasoline	16,242.00	20	15
Price Each Flex-Fuel			

Options:

1	AM/FM w/ CD Player	\$	312.00
2	Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control	\$	347.60
3	Limited Slip Rear End	\$	286.00
4	Tow Package: Transmission Cooler H. D. Engine Cooler	\$	290.40
5	Keyless Entry	\$	Standard
6	Power Windows / Power Locks	\$	Req. Option 6
7	Side Air Bags	\$	567.60
8	Glass All Around	\$	N/A
9	Rear Door Window/Glass	\$	277.60
10	Side Door Window/Glass	\$	52.80
11	Exterior Colors	\$	132.00
12	FOB Dealership: (Deduct)	\$	132.00
13	FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile	\$	-69.00
14	Rear Step Bumper	\$	1.95
		\$	Standard

Additional Information:

Metallic paint is a \$132.00 up Charge. Only Whire, Black, and Red are NO CHARGE Colors.

CLASS 23A - VAN, CARGO
8500 GVWR, 135" Wheelbase

070-92-23-002

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck

Manufacturer / Brand	GMC
Delivery	90 - 120 days
Model Name & Number	Savana TG23405

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine	Gasoline	MIN: 225 HP 286 TORQUE
Engine	Diesel	MIN: 154 HP 286 TORQUE
Transmission	Automatic	
Steering	Power	
Brakes	Power/ABS	
Radio	AM/FM	
Glass	All Tinted	
Mirrors	Left & Right Outside	
License Plate Mounts	Front & Rear	
Tires	All Season	
Spare Tire	Standard tire w/ Jack	
Air Conditioning	Installed	
Seating Capacity	2	
Front Air Bags	Installed	

HP	TORQUE
280	295

Price Each Gasoline
Price Each Diesel
Price Each Flex Fuel

FWD	RWD
No Bid	17,284.00
No Bid	27,887.00
No Bid	17,279.00

Options:

1	AM/FM w/ CD Player		312.00
2	Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control		347.60
3	Limited Slip Rear End		286.00
4	Tow Package: Transmission Cooler H. D. Engine Cooler		290.40
5	Keyless Entry		Standard
6	Power Windows / Power Locks		Req. Option 6
7	Glass All Around		567.00
8	Side Air Bags		277.20
9	Step Bumper		Standard
10	Telescopic Trailer Tow Mirrors		Standard
11	Rear Rubber Floor Matting		N/A
12	Exterior Colors		79.20
13	FOB Dealership: (Deduct)	\$	132.00
14	FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile		-69.00
			1.95

Additional Information:

Metallic paint is a addition of \$132.00 Up Charge, Only White, Black, and red are NO CHARGE Colors

CLASS 25 - VAN

070-93-25-000

Small Rear Wheel Drive,
125" Wheel Base, Eight Passenger

Includes but is not limited to: GMC Savanna, Chevrolet Express, Ford Econoline 150 or equal.

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck

Manufacturer / Brand	GMC
Delivery	90 - 120 days
Model Name & Number	Savana TG13406

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine	MIN: 225 HP 286 TORQUE
Transmission	Automatic
Steering	Power
Brakes	Power/ABS
Radio	AM/FM
Glass	All Tinted, Sides and Rear
Mirrors	Left & Right Outside - 5" x 8" Minimum
License Plate Mounts	Front & Rear
Seating	8 Passenger
Tires	All Season
Spare Tire	Standard tire w/Jack
Vinyl Flooring	Installed
Air Conditioning	Installed
Doors	Double Side & Rear
Front Air Bags	Installed
Interior	Full Length Head Liner w/Insulation Side & Quarter Panel
Rear Bumper	Installed

HP	TORQUE
310	334

Price Each Gasoline	18,839.00
Price Each Flex-Fuel	18,839.00
Price Each Diesel	33,169.00

EPA HWY	EPA CITY
13	17
13	17

Options:

1	AM/FM w/ CD Player	\$	180.40
2	Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control	\$	347.60
3	Limited Slip Rear End	\$	286.00
4	Keyless Entry	\$	* Requires Interior Upgrade* 369.60
5	Power Windows	\$	418.00
6	All Wheel Drive	\$	6,082.91
7	V-8 Gasoline Engine	\$	Standard
8	Carpet Interior	\$	316.80
9	Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)	\$	180.00
10	Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)	\$	180.00
11	Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo)	\$	235.00
12	Sunscreen Glass	\$	Standard
13	Sliding Side Door	\$	1,029.60
14	Swing Side Door (One Side)	\$	Standard
15	Swing Side Door (Both Sides)	\$	N/A
16	Side Air Bags	\$	Standard
17	Interior upgrade (carpet & insulation pkg)	\$	* Includes PWR Windows 316.00
18	Exterior colors	\$	132.00
19	Delete Center Row Seats (Deduct)	\$ -	N/A
20	Delete Third Row Seats (Deduct)	\$ -	N/A
21	FOB Dealership: (Deduct)	\$ -	-69.00
22	FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile	\$	1.95
23	Rear Step Bumper	\$	Standard

Additional Information:

Metallic Paint is a \$132.00 Up Charge, only White, Black and Red are a NO CHARGE Color

CLASS 26 - VAN
 12 Passenger Van, 125" Wheel Base
 Includes but is not limited to: GMC Savana, Dodge Sprinter or equal.

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck

Manufacturer / Brand	GMC
Delivery	90 - 120 days
Model Name & Number	Savana TG23406

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine	MIN: 255 HP 350 TORQUE
Transmission	Automatic
Steering	Power
Brakes	Power/ABS
Radio	AM/FM
Glass	All Tinted, Sides and Rear
Mirrors	Left & Right Outside - 5" x 8" Minimum
License Plate Mounts	Front & Rear
Seating	12 Passenger
Tires	Load Range E
Spare Tire	Standard tire w/Jack
Rubber Floor Covering	Installed
Front and Rear Air Conditioning	Installed
Front Air Bags	Installed
Doors	Double Side & Rear
Interior	Full Length Head Liner w/Insulation Side & Quarter Panel
Rear Bumper	Installed

HP	TORQUE
342	373

Price Each Gasoline	
Price Each Bi-Fuel	
Price Each Diesel	33,486.00

EPA HGWHY	EPA CITY
N/A	N/A

Options:

1	AM/FM w/ CD Player	\$	180
2	Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control	\$	347.60
3	Keyless Entry	\$	369.00
4	Power Windows / Power Locks	\$	418.00
5	Limited Slip Rear End	\$	286.00
6	Diesel Engine	\$	11664.00
7	Extended Length	\$	2532.00
8	Sliding Side Door	\$	132.00
9	Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)	\$	180.00
10	Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)	\$	180.00
11	Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo)	\$	235.00
12	Side Air Bags	\$	Standard
13	Exterior colors	\$	See Below
14	Delete Center Row Seats (Deduct)	\$ -	N/A
15	Delete Third Row Seats (Deduct)	\$ -	N/A
16	FOB Dealership: (Deduct)	\$ -	-69.00
17	FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile	\$	1.95
18	Rear Step Bumper	\$	Standard

Additional Information:

Metallic Paint is a \$132.00 Up Charge, Only White, Black and Red are a NO CHARGE color.

Diesel - 6.6L Turbo V* available in 3500 ONLY 9600GVWR

SPECIFICATION FOR FLAT BED AND DUMP BED AND UTILITY BODY ARE LISTED BELOW:

SPECS CLASS 20, 20A, 33

FLAT BED MODEL PVMX338 OR APPROVED EQUAL

CLASS 20

- *56" CA CAB AND CHASSIS SINGLE REAR WHEEL
- *8" LONG X 78" WIDE STEEL PLATFORM BODY WITH 2 X 6 TREATED PINE WOOD FLOOR
- *36" TALL TAPERED BULKHEAD WITH SCREEN WINDOW
- *ICC BUMPER, MARKER LIGHTS, REAR MUDFLAPS MEET FMVSS STDS.
- *MOUNTING TO PROPERLY FIT CHASSIS
- *PAINTED BLACK

FLAT BED MODEL PVMX33 OR APPROVED EQUAL

CLASS 20A & 33

- *60" CA CAB AND CHASSIS DUAL REAR WHEEL
- *9" LONG X 95" WIDE STEEL PLATFORM BODY WITH 2 X 6 TREATED PINE WOOD FLOOR
- *36" TALL TAPERED BULKHEAD WITH SCREEN WINDOW
- *ICC BUMPER, MARKER LIGHTS, REAR MUDFLAPS MEET FMVSS STDS.
- *MOUNTING TO PROPERLY FIT CHASSIS
- *PAINTED BLACK

FLAT BED MODEL PVMX123 OR APPROVED EQUAL CLASS 20A & 33

- *84" CA CAB AND CHASSIS DUAL REAR WHEEL
- *12" LONG X 95" WIDE STEEL PLATFORM BODY WITH 2 X 6 TREATED PINE WOOD FLOOR
- *36" TALL TAPERED BULKHEAD WITH SCREEN WINDOW
- *ICC BUMPER, MARKER LIGHTS, REAR MUDFLAPS MEET FMVSS STDS.
- *MOUNTING TO PROPERLY FIT CHASSIS
- *PAINTED BLACK

DUMP BODY MODEL 100U GALLON OR APPROVED EQUAL CLASS 20A & 33

- *60" CA CAB AND CHASSIS DUAL REAR WHEEL
- *8.5" LONG X 13" TALL SIDES X 22" TALL TAILGATE (ALL 10 GA. STEEL)
- *1/2 X 84 CAB SHIELD (23" LONG X 84" WIDE)
- *MARKER LIGHTS, ICC BUMPER, REAR MUD FLAPS MEET FMVSS STDS.
- *STEEL MUD GUARDS IN FRONT OF REAR WHEELS
- *PAINTED BLACK

*PF524DAE HOIST APPROX 8 TON CAPACITY

*12 DC VOLT ELECTRIC HYDRAULIC POWER UNIT WITH PUSH BUTTON CONTROLLER ON AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION CAB AND CHASSIS

NOTE: PTO, DIRECT MOUNT HYDRAULIC PUMP, DUMP VALVE(ELECTRIC OR CABLE SHIFT), AND RESERVOIR IF PTO APPLICATION IS AVAILABLE ON MANUAL TRANSMISSION

DUMP BODY MODEL 100U GALLON OR APPROVED EQUAL CLASS 20A & 33

- *84" CA CAB AND CHASSIS DUAL REAR WHEEL
- *10.5" LONG X 13" TALL SIDES X 22" TALL TAILGATE (ALL 10 GA. STEEL)
- *1/2 X 84 CAB SHIELD (23" LONG X 84" WIDE)
- *MARKER LIGHTS, ICC BUMPER, REAR MUDFLAPS MEET FMVSS STDS
- *STEEL MUD GUARDS IN FRONT OF REAR WHEELS
- *PAINTED BLACK

PF624DAE HOIST APPROX 11 TON CAPACITY

- *12 VOLT DC ELECTRIC HYDRAULIC POWER UNIT WITH PUSH BUTTON CONTROLLER ON AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION CAB AND CHASSIS
- NOTE: PTO, DIRECT MOUNT HYDRAULIC PUMP, DUMP VALVE (ELECTRIC OR CAB SHIFT), AND RESERVOIR IF PTO APPLICATION IS AVAILABLE ON MANUAL TRANSMISSION

FAN BELT DRIVEN UNDERHOOD HYDRAULIC PUMP WITH ELECTRIC CLUTCH IF PTO IS NOT AVAILABLE

UTILITY BODY 98ASW READING UTILITY BODY OR APPROVED EQUAL CLASS 20

- *56" CA CAB AND CHASSIS SINGLE REAR WHEEL
- *97" LONG X 76.5" WIDE X 40" VERTICAL COMPARTMENT HEIGHT X 48.5" WIDE FLOOR X 14" DEEP COMPARTMENTS
- *RECESSED TAIL LIGHTS, RUBBER GROMETS, OEM STYLE PLUG IN WIRING HARNESS
- *STD. BODY SHELVING PACKAGE WITH ADJUSTABLE SHELVES AND DIVIDERS
- *MARKER LIGHTS, REFLECTORS MEET FMVSS STDS.
- *8" REAR STEP BUMPER
- *PAINTED WHITE

UTILITY BODY 108ADW READING UTILITY BODY OR APPROVED EQUAL CLASS 20A & 33

- *60" CA CAB AND CHASSIS DUAL REAR WHEEL
- *107" LONG X 93" WIDE X 40" VERTICAL COMPARTMENT HEIGHT X 48.5" WIDE FLOOR X 20" DEEP COMPARTMENTS
- *RECESSED TAIL LIGHTS, RUBBER GROMETS, OEM STYLE PLUG IN WIRING HARNESS
- *STD. BODY SHELVING PACKAGE WITH ADJUSTABLE SHELVES AND DIVIDERS
- *MARKER LIGHTS, REFLECTORS, REAR MUD FLAPS MEET FMVSS STDS.
- *8" REAR STEP BUMPER
- *PAINTED WHITE

UTILITY BODY 132ADW READING UTILITY BODY OR APPROVED EQUAL CLASS 20A & 33

- *84" CA CAB AND CHASSIS DUAL REAR WHEEL
- *132" LONG X 93" WIDE X 40" VERTICAL COMPARTMENT HEIGHT X 48.5" WIDE FLOOR X 20" DEEP COMPARTMENTS
- *RECESSED TAIL LIGHTS, RUBBER GROMETS, OEM PLUG IN WIRING HARNESS
- *STD. BODY SHELVING PACKAGE WITH ADJUSTABLE SHELVES AND DIVIDERS
- *MARKER LIGHTS, REFLECTORS, REAR MUD FLAPS MEET FMVSS STDS.
- *8" REAR STEP BUMPER
- *PAINTED WHITE

OPTIONS:

CRANE 56" CA SINGLE REAR WHEEL 8800 GVWR CAB AND CHASSIS

CLASS 20 OPTION TELESCOPIC CRANE TO BE USED WITH UTILITY BODY

- *LIFTING CAPACITY OF 2000 LBS. @ 3' (6500 FT. LB. RATING), MANUAL BOOM EXTEND FROM 5.5' TO 9'.
- *12 VOLT DC ELECTRIC HYDRAULIC POWER ROTATION, POWER BOOM ELEVATION
- *12 VOLT DC ELECTRIC POWER HOIST WITH 35' X 1/4" CABLE
- *SWIVEL BLOCK, HOOK, LATCH
- *PENDANT CONTROLLER WITH 18' CORD

*OVERLOAD PROTECTION

*INSTALL IN RIGHT REAR OF UTILITY BODY LOAD SPACE FLOOR

*BODY TO BE REINFORCED FOR CRANE

*CRANE BOOM SUPPORT

*REMOVABLE JACKLEG TYPE OUTTRIGGER WITH SCREWBASE ON CRANE SIDE

*BUILD UP RIGHT REAR CHASSIS SUSPENSION SPRINGS LEVEL TO ACCOMMODATE ADDITIONAL CRANE WEIGHT

CRANE 60" CA & 84" CA 3203PRI15 AUTOCRANE OR APPROVED EQUAL CLASS 20A & 33 UTILITY BODY OPTION

*3200 LB @ 3' LIFTING CAPACITY, 15' MANUAL BOOM EXTEND, 12 VOLT ELECTRIC HYDRAULIC POWER ROTATION & BOOM ELEVATION, 12 VOLT POWER HOIST, OVERLOAD PROTECTION, PLUG IN PENDANT CONTROL, INSTALLED ON RIGHT REAR COMPARTMENT TOP, UTILITY BODY MANUFACTURES APPROVED COMPARTMENT REINFORCEMENT FOR 16,000 FT. LBS. (4000 LB CRANE), CRANE BOOM SUPPORT, REMOVAL MEDIUM DUTY JACKLEG TYPE OUTRIGGER WITH SCREW BASE ON CRANE SIDE, BUILD UP RIGHT REAR CHASSIS SUSPENSION SPRINGS LEVEL TO ACCOMMODATE ADDITIONAL CRANE WEIGHT

PAINT ALL BODIES COLORS OTHER THAN WHITE

LIGHT BAR HALOGEN CLASS 20, 20A, 33, 33A

PART # 776A PETERSON OR EQUAL
*4 HALOGEN ROTATORS & DIAMOND MIRRORS
*DRIP RAIL OR DOOR JAM TYPE MOUNTING (NO CENTER CAB ROOF MOUNTING)
*WIRING AND SWITCH SUFFICIENT FOR LIGHT BAR MODEL

DOH PACKAGE REQUIRED FOR CLASSES 13, 14, 15 & 19 TO INCLUDE THE FOLLOWING ITEMS

BED LINERS SHALL BE NON-SKID TYPE, OVER THE RAIL ALL STAR BRAND (OR EQUAL). BAR LIGHTS SHALL BE PSE CODE 3 EXCALIBER BRAND (OR EQUAL) DUAL LEVEL STROBE LIGHT, FULL SIZE LIGHT BAR WITH TWO (2) STROBE BULBS PER SIDE, VISIBLE FROM 360 DEGREES. BAR LIGHT MOUNTING SHALL BE GUTTER TYPE MOUNT ONLY, PSE MODEL NO. X47A (OR EQUAL). DRILLING OF TOP OF CAB IS UNACCEPTABLE. WORK LIGHT SHALL BE PSE NUMBER NO130H CODE 3 NIGHT PROBE (OR EQUAL) 300,000 CANDLE WATT MOUNTED TO CENTER OF LIGHT BAR. CONTROLS SHALL ALL BE MOUNTED PERMANENTLY IN CAB WITH EASY ACCESS FOR OPERATOR. RUNNING BOARDS SHALL BE TWO (2) PIECE ALUMINUM, PART #8093027 MFG. DZ (OR EQUAL). CREW CAB PART #8035012 MFG.DZ (OR EQUAL), CLASS II TRAILER HITCH 3" PINTLE AND 2" BALL COMBINATION RECEIVER.

PAINTINGS:

DETAIL / DECORATIVE STRIPES WITH LOGO:

WIDTH: SHALL BE 1" WITH TAPER AT FRONT OF HOOD

WVDOH LOGO (TO BE SUPPLIED BY WVDOH); (BLACK AND WHITE COPY) AND IS APPROXIMATELY 7" TALL BY 7" WIDE AREA BEHIND LOGO AND WITHIN 1/2" OF LOGO IS NOT TO BE STRIPED.

STRIPED SHOULD BE CUT TO FOLLOW CONTOUR OF LOGO, IN LIEU OF STRAIGHT CUT.

STRIPING MATERIAL SHALL MEET THE REQUIREMENTS OF ASTM D4956-91 TYPE V SHEETING, A SUPER HIGH-INTENSITY RETROFLECTIVE SHEETING CONSISTING OF MICRO PRISMATIC RETROFLECTIVE ELEMENTS. THE CONSPICUITY SHEETING MUST MEET THE REQUIREMENT OF NHSTA, DOT, 49CFR, PART, 571 FEDERAL MOTOR VEHICLE SAFETY STANDARDS FOR CONSPICUITY SHEETING AND BE "DOT APPROVED."

THE SHEETING FOR BOTH APPLICATIONS ABOVE SHALL NOT BE MORE THAN 0.008 INCH THICK HAVING APPROXIMATELY 47,000 MICRO PRISMS PER SQUARE INCH AND SHALL COME WITH AN AGGRESSIVE HIGH TACK PRESSURE SENSITIVE ADHESIVE, REFLECTIVE OR EQUIVALENT.

UPPER STRIPE COLOR: DARK BLUE

LOWER STRIPE COLOR: LIGHT GOLD

SUCCESSFUL VENDOR SHOULD CONSULT WITH AGENCY PERSONNEL ON PROPOSED STRIPPING BEFORE PLACING ORDER WITH MANUFACTURER.

IN ORDER TO TEST THE ADHESIVE QUALITY OF THE PAINT, THE DOH MAY AT ITS OPTION, REQUIRE THAT THE VENDOR MEASURE ADHESION BY THE CRITERIA SET FORTH I ASTM D3359-74 METHOD B. A RATING OF LESS THAN 4 ON THIS TEST WOULD BE DEEMED UNACCEPTABLE.

MANUFACTURER'S STANDARD PLANT PAINTING PROCEDURES FOR CLEANING, DE-GREASING, PREPARING, PRIMING AND PAINTING ARE SUFFICIENT TO MEET THE REQUIREMENTS FOR PAINTING OF CAB (WHITE) AND CHASSIS (BLACK). CAB WILL **NOT** BE PAINTED WHITE OVER TOP OF ANOTHER FINISH COLOR.

SPECIFICATIONS FOR A
304SS MULTI-PURPOSE ALL SEASON BODY

This specification shall describe a HENDERSON MUNIbody III - 30455™ REAR DISCHARGE ONLY combination dump/spreader body or equal. Bidders must submit with their bid complete specifications on the unit they propose to furnish.

YES EXCEPTIONS

DIMENSIONS:

86.5" inside width for maximum capacity

Capacity struck (9'), 2.3 cu. Yd.

Inside length of 108" for 60" CA. (9')

Side height of 25 inches

Head height of 53 inches

Tailgate height of 29 inches

SIDES & FRONT:

One piece sides and floor of 10 gauge, 304SS steel incorporates a side to floor radius. Floor slopes 22 degrees to conveyor to facilitate self cleaning of body without raising. **A body with any portion of the floor that is flat is NOT acceptable due to poor cleanout.**

10 ga. 304SS boxed top rail seamless

2" side board pockets

10 gauge 304SS rear corner posts are tied to rear apron. This joint is further reinforced with a 7 gauge plate which helps prevent flexing in this critical area and strengthens the latch assembly

12" Asphalt lip is an integral part of the rear apron and provides protection for the extended conveyor.

Integral fenders installed over wheels

Front trunnion mounted hoist cylinder - 10 5/8" x 11" doghouse

SPECIFICATIONS FOR A
304SS MULTI-PURPOSE ALL SEASON BODY

	<u>YES</u>	<u>EXCEPTIONS</u>
<u>CONVEYOR:</u>		
10 gauge 304SS formed inner sills, 12 gauge 304SS formed outer sills	_____	_____
3/16" AR400 conveyor floor	_____	_____
1 - 1/2" diameter drive and 1 - 1/2" idler shafts with 6 tooth cast iron sprockets	_____	_____
High-torque, direct drive motor. Drive at rear for RDO	_____	_____
24" wide main conveyor	_____	_____
Double conveyor cross bars (welded to every link)		
1/4" x 1 1/2" conveyor crossbars	_____	_____
Body integrated 12" beyond tailgate for complete discharge of material from conveyor before returning over truck chassis.	_____	_____
D667X pintle chain (21,000 lb. tensile/strand).	_____	_____
<u>SPINNER CHUTE ASSEMBLY:</u>		
Spinner assebly, must be adjustable left to right, front to back, and up and down to assure accurate placement of material on spinner disc to facilitate control of spread pattern.		
Front spinner baffle is adjustable for protection of chassis under carriage 10 Ga. 20" Diameter spinner disc to have replaceable machined hubs six (6) 10 Ga. 409 Stainless Steel bolt on replaceable spinner valves for counter clockwise rotation. Spinner has a bolt on removeable deflector assembly with 3 overlapping deflectors.	_____	_____

SPECIFICATIONS FOR A
304SS MULTI-PURPOSE ALL SEASON BODY

	<u>YES</u>	<u>EXCEPTIONS</u>
<u>TAILGATE:</u>		
10 GAUGE, 304SS tailgate sheet, with 12 gauge channels	_____	_____
Full perimeter boxing with all horizontal edges sloped outward	_____	_____
Tailgate must be double acting (NO EXCEPTIONS)	_____	_____
Shall have two (2) 12 ga sloped horizontal braces that are flush with perimeter boxing	_____	_____
Flush mount, 3/4" flame cut tailgate pivots	_____	_____
Heavy duty offset hinge plates, 3/8" flame cut	_____	_____
1/2" latch hooks with 3/8" latch plates	_____	_____
1" hot rolled upper and lower pins	_____	_____
7 gauge 9" x 18" rear feedgate operates perpendicular to floor	_____	_____
Lever operated feedgates are quickly adjustable in 1" increments	_____	_____
Double acting, manual release, tailgate	_____	_____

Hydraulic System Requirements

PUMP MOUNTING - Underhood Belt Down Drien Clutch Pump

PUMP TYPE - Gear Type

PUMP SIZE - MINIMUM - 15 GPM AT OPERATING RPM
RECOMMENDED - 20 GPM AT OPERATING RPM

PUMP PRESSURE - 2000 PSI

MINIMUM FLOW REQUIREMENTS	CONVEYOR - 7 GPM	
	SPINNER - 2 GPM	
	HOIST - 4 GPM	

CONTROL FUNCTIONS

- CONVEYOR - ON/OFF
- CONVEYOR - SPEED CONTROL, 0 TO 20 GPM VALVE
- SPINNER - ON/OFF
- SPINNER - SPEED CONTROL, 0 TO 5 GPM VALVE

SPECIFICATIONS FOR A
304SS MULTI-PURPOSE ALL SEASON BODY

CONTROL TYPE	MANUAL VALVE
FILTRATION	RETURN LINE FILTER, 10 MICRON RATING
RESERVOIR	20 GAL. WITH SITE GAGE
RELIEF VALVE	2000 PSI RELIEF IN SYSTEM AT PUMP OR CONTROL VALVE
HOSE	PRESSURE LINE 0.75 DIA. SAE 100R2 RETURN LINE 1.00 DIA. SAE 100R2 SUCTION LINE 1.50 DIA. SAE 100R4

A dual flow control valve shall be installed in the cab for control of the conveyor and spinner. The valve shall be rated at 15 gallons per minute flow for the conveyor and 7 gallons per minute for the spinner. A knob for each the conveyor and spinner with settings of 1 thru 11 shall be provided for operator control of the speed of the conveyor and spinner.

	YES	EXCEPTIONS
<u>HOIST:</u>		
Single cylinder, trunnion mount	_____	_____
N.T.E.A. class 20.	_____	_____
3 stage cylinder	_____	_____
Wear and corrosion resistant Nitrated cylinder tubes	_____	_____
Minimum 2 year cylinder warranty	_____	_____
5 degree oscillating cylinder collar	_____	_____
<u>BEAR HINGE ASSEMBLY:</u>		
6" x 4" x 3/8" structural angle rear hinge assembly with 1 1/2" 304SS. Connected through 1 1/2" greaseless composite bushings.	_____	_____
<u>LIGHT PACKAGE:</u>		
Rubber mounted, shock resistant stop/turn/tail light in each rear corner post. Highly visible, yet recessed for protection. Two red marker lights in the rear and two side mounted amber front reflectors. Includes a one piece sealed wiring harness.	_____	_____
Rubber mounted, shock resistant I.C.C. 3-light cluster, for mounting in a fabricated light bar.	_____	_____

SPECIFICATIONS FOR A
304SS MULTI-PURPOSE ALL SEASON BODY

304 Stainless Steel Cabshield 16" x 78" or 84"

SPECIFICATIONS FOR A 304SS

MULTI-PURPOSE ALL SEASON BODY (cont'd)

3/16" AR400 conveyor cover (shipped loose)

Top Grate Screens (Installed at factory)

OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT:

Sloped steel side boards

Polyurethane spinner disc

Full length fender with tool box

Pre-wet tanks

Rubber belt-over chain conveyor (rear discharge Only)

Air operated tailgate latch

Rear spinner assembly with chute and mount
(front/rear discharge only)

Cab shield

Conveyor chain oiling system

Rear mount asphalt patching pan

Rear 304 Stainless Steel Ladder

Extra light hole in each rear bolt

**SPECIFICATIONS FOR A 304SS
MULTI-PURPOSE ALL SEASON BODY (cont'd)**

-PAINTINGS:

DETAIL / DECORATIVE STRIPES WITH LOGO:

WIDTH: SHALL BE 1" WITH TAPER AT FRONT OF HOOD

WVDOH LOGO (TO BE SUPPLIED BY WVDOH); (BLACK AND WHITE COPY) AND IS APPROXIMATELY 7" TALL BY 7" WIDE AREA BEHIND LOGO AND WITHIN 1/2" OF LOGO IS NOT TO BE STRIPED.

STRIPED SHOULD BE CUT TO FOLLOW CONTOUR OF LOGO, IN LIEU OF STRAIGHT CUT.

STRIPING MATERIAL SHALL MEET THE REQUIREMENTS OF ASTM D4956-91 TYPE V SHEETING, A SUPER HIGH-INTENSITY RETROFLECTIVE SHEETING CONSISTING OF MICRO PRISMATIC RETROFLECTIVE ELEMENTS. THE CONSPICUITY SHEETING MUST MEET THE REQUIREMENT OF NHSTA, DOT, 49CFR, PART, 571 FEDERAL MOTOR VEHICLE SAFETY STANDARDS FOR CONSPICUITY SHEETING AND BE "DOT APPROVED."

THE SHEETING FOR BOTH APPLICATIONS ABOVE SHALL NOT BE MORE THAN 0.008 INCH THICK HAVING APPROXIMATELY 47,000 MICRO PRISMS PER SQUARE INCH AND SHALL COME WITH AN AGGRESSIVE HIGH TACK PRESSURE SENSITIVE ADHESIVE, REFLECTIVE **OR EQUIVALENT**.

UPPER STRIPE COLOR: DARK BLUE

LOWER STRIPE COLOR: LIGHT GOLD

SUCCESSFUL VENDOR SHOULD CONSULT WITH AGENCY PERSONNEL ON PROPOSED STRIPPING BEFORE PLACING ORDER WITH MANUFACTURER.

IN ORDER TO TEST THE ADHESIVE QUALITY OF THE PAINT, THE DOH MAY AT ITS OPTION, REQUIRE THAT THE VENDOR MEASURE ADHESION BY THE CRITERIA SET FORTH I ASTM D3359-74 METHOD B. A RATING OF LESS THAN 4 ON THIS TEST WOULD BE DEEMED UNACCEPTABLE.

MANUFACTURER'S STANDARD PLANT PAINTING PROCEDURES FOR CLEANING, DE-GREASING, PREPARING, PRIMING AND PAINTING ARE SUFFICIENT TO MEET THE REQUIREMENTS FOR PAINTING OF CAB (WHITE) AND CHASSIS (BLACK). CAB WILL **NOT** BE PAINTED WHITE OVER TOP OF ANOTHER FINISH COLOR.

THIS IS REQUIRED FOR CLASSES 20, 20A, 33, & 33A