## Purchase Order

S

P

T O



State of West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130 MV10A

PAGE 1

BLANKET:RELEASE

CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES, INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS. QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS PURCHASE ORDER SHOULD BE DIRECTED TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.

CHANGE OBDER

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS

AGENCY COPY

> E Z D

アンローの単

T

\*709035314 304-485-4410 MATHENY MOTOR TRUCK COMPANY PO BOX 1304

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

ALL STATE AGENCIES

BY ORDER

PARKERSBURG WV 26102-1304

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

	DATE PRINTED		TERMS OF SALE	FEIN/SSN		FUND:
	10/31/2009	NET	~ ~	550320770		
	SHIP VIA		FOB:			ACCOUNT NUMBER
BES	T WAY  QUANTITY	DEST	CINATION VENDORITEMNO	PREPAID	MU	IL-MUL
LINE	DELIVERY DATE	CATNO	ITEM NUMBER	UNIT PRICE		AMOUNT
00.1000.000.001		3200 (200 (200 (200 (200 (200 (200 (200				
				1	ļ	
					ĺ	
	***************************************	İ	CHANGE ORDE	R #01		
	3					
						:
	TO REMOVE 20	A FROM	THIS CONTRAC	T.		
	סבים יינום איייי	CHED P	EVISED LIST C	יי דיידאיכ די דיידאיכ		
	AVAILABLE U					
	21 71 311 112 112 112 112					
	*****	' NO A	ODITIONAL CHA	NGES ******	****	k * *
					{	PUPOU
				ne service de la constante de		CERTIFIED DIVISION
						PURCHASING DIVISION CERTIFIED ENCUMBERED
					·	NOV - 4.2000
		LINOVA PARILLE				NOV - 4 2009  Beverly Toler END
		***************************************				Deverly -
			PREVIOU	JS PO TOTAL==>	OPEN	END der
				CHANGE (+)==>		
				CHECK HERE 19/39	109	
IF APPR	OVAL AS TO FORM IS R	EQUIRED BY	ALIORNEY GENERAL,	CHECK HERE DATE 1709	,	OPEN END

BY\_

APPROVED AS TO FORM BY ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL

Jang I Washild

JO ANN ADKINS

304-558 8802

TOTAL

PURCHASING DIVISION AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

# GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS PURCHASE ORDER/CONTRACT

- 1. ACCEPTANCE: Seller shall be bound by this order and its terms and conditions upon receipt of this order.
- 2. APPLICABLE LAW: The laws of the State of West Virginia and the *Legislative Rules* of the Purchasing Division shall govern all rights and duties under the Contract, including without limitation the validity of this Purchase Order/Contract.
- 3. NON-FUNDING: All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Orders/Contracts are to be continued for the terms of the Purchase Order/Contract, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or goods, this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.
- 4. COMPLIANCE: Seller shall comply with all Federal, State and local laws, regulations and ordinances including, but not limited to, the prevailing wage rates of the WV Division of Labor.
- 5. MODIFICATIONS: This writing is the parties final expression of intent. No modification of this order shall be binding unless agreed to in writing by the Buyer.
- **6. ASSIGNMENT:** Neither this Order nor any monies due, or to become due hereunder may be assigned by the Seller without the Buyer's consent.
- 7. WARRANTY: The Seller expressly warrants that the goods and/or services covered by this order will: {a} conform to the specifications, drawings, samples or other description furnished or specified by the Buyer; {b} be merchantable and fit for the purpose intended; and/or {c} be free from defect in material and workmanship.
- 8. CANCELLATION: The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.
- 9. SHIPPING, BILLING & PRICES: Prices are those stated in this order. No price increase will be accepted without written authority from the Buyer. All goods or services shall be shipped on or before the date specified in this Order.
- 10. LATE PAYMENTS: Payments may only be made after the delivery of goods or services. Interest may be paid on late payments in accordance with the West Virginia Code.
- 11. TAXES: The State of West Virginia is exempt from Federal and State taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.
- 12. RENEWAL: Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written agreement of the parties.
- 13. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, the State may deem this contract null and void, and terminate such contract without further order.
- 14. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and available online at the Purchasing Division's web site (http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that, the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.
- 15. WEST VIRGINIA ALCOHOL & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT: If this Contract constitutes a public improvement construction contract as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code ("The West Virginia Alcohol and Drug-Free Workplace Act"), then the following language shall hereby become part of this Contract: "The contractor and its subcontractors shall implement and maintain a written drug-free workplace policy in compliance with the West Virginia Alcohol and Drug-Free Workplace Act, as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code. The contractor and its subcontractors shall provide a sworn statement in writing, under the penalties of perjury, that they maintain a valid drug-free work place policy in compliance with the West Virginia and Drug-Free Workplace Act. It is understood and agreed that this Contract shall be cancelled by the awarding authority if the Contractor: 1) Fails to implement its drug-free workplace policy; 2) Fails to provide information regarding implementation of the contractor's drug-free workplace policy at the request of the public authority; or 3) Provides to the public authority false information regarding the contractor's drug-free workplace policy."

MV10A	M.J. Matheny Motor Truck Co.					
CLASS	MODEL		PRICE			
12 - Truck	GMC Sierra TC10703 - Large Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive, 6000 GVWR, Short Bed, Gas.	\$	15,679.00			
16 - Truck	GMC Canyon TT15403 - Small Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive, 4500 GVWR, Short Bed, Gas	\$	16,723.00			
17 - Truck	GMC Canyon TT15653 - Small Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive, 4700 GVWR, Ext. Cab, Gas	\$	17,996.00			
17A - Truck	GMC Canyon TT15643 - Midsize Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive, 4850 GVWR, 4 Door Crew Cab, Gas	\$	19,859.00			
19 - Truck	GMC Sierra TK20903 - Large Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive, 8500 GVWR, Long Bed, Gas	\$	20,189.00			
20 - Truck	GMC Sierra TC10703- Large Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive, 6000 GVWR, Short Bed, Gas	\$	15,679.00			
22 - Van, Cargo	GMC Savana TG13405 - 6500 GVWR, 109" Wheelbase, Gas	\$	15,745.00			
23 - Van, Cargo	GMC TG23405 - Extended Body, 8500 GVWR, 138" Wheelbase, Gas	\$	18,525.00			
26 - Van	GMC Savana TG23406 - 12 Passenger, 125" Wheelbase, Gas	\$	20,440.00			
26 - Van	GMC Savana TG23406 - 12 Passenger, 125" Wheelbase, Bio-Fuel	\$	20,440.00			

## CLASS 12 TRUCK

Large Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive 6000 GVWR, Short Bed, Approx. 5'7" bed. Includes but is not limited to: Ford F150, Dodge 1500, Chevrolet 1500

Vendor Name:	Matheny Motor Truck Co.		
	GMC		
Manufacturer / Brand	60-120 Days	<del></del>	
Delivery	Sierra TC10703		
Model Name & Number	Glena 1 C 10. Co	HP	TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:			000
	MIN 195 HP 235 TORQUE	195	260
Engine	Automatic		
Transmission	Power		
Steering	Power		
Brakes	AM/FM		
Radio	All Tinted		
Glass	Left & Right Outside		
Mirrors	Front & Rear		
License Plate Mounts	Fleetside		
Cargo Box	Rear Step Factory Installed		
Bumper	All Season	_	
Tires	Full Size w/ Jack	·······	
Spare Tire	Installed	<del></del>	
Air Conditioning	Bench	EPA	EPA
Front Seat	Installed	HGWY	CITY
Rubber Floor Covering	Installed	·····-	
Front Air Bags	Bistanco		
Price Each Gasoline	\$15,679.00	20	15
Bed Size Quote		-	
Options:	,	\$149.60	
.AM/FM w/ CD Player		\$ N/A	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
Shop/Service Manual		\$ N/A	
CD Service Manual		\$220.00	
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control		\$286.00	
Limited Slip Rear End		\$211.20	Reg opt 7
Keyless Entry		\$879.12	7,09,00
Power Windows / Power Locks		\$44.00	······
Tow Hooks		\$372.95	
Long Bed			
O Exterior colors			
1 Slide Rear Window		\$ N/A \$ N/A	
2 Side Air Bags			
3 Engine Options	Option 1: 4.8	\$831.60	
4 Engine Options	Option 2: 5.3	\$1,535.60	
5 Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)		\$139.00	····
6 Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)		\$ N/A	·····
7 Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo)		\$ N/A	
		\$169.00	
8 Bed Liner		\$5,447.00	
9 Crew/Quad Cab		\$2,686.25	
0 Extended Cab 1 Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)		\$ N/A	
(3) Manual Hansinission Woverone (Dodge)		<u>\$0</u>	
22 Delete Cloth Seats (Deduct)		<u>\$0</u>	
23 Delete Carpet (Deduct)		> \$ N/A	
24 Delete Truck Bed (Deduct)		(\$35.00)	
25 FOB Dealership: (Deduct)	-	\$1.69	
26 FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile			
Additional Information:			

#### CLASS 16 TRUCK Small Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive, 4500 GWR, Short Bed

Includes but is not limited to: GMC Canyon, Chevrolet Colorado

V	endor Name:	Matheny Motor Truck Co.		
		GMC		
	anufacturer / Brand	60-120 Days	-	
	elivery	Canyon TT15403	-	
N	odel Name & Number		-	
			HP	TORQUE
s	tandard Equipment Requirements:	and manager	242	242
	ngine	MIN: 207 HP 238 TORQUE	_ 242	242
Ŧ	ransmission	Automatic	_ \	
S	teering	Power	<del>_</del>	
B	rakes	Power		
R	adio	AM/FM	<del>-</del>	
G	ilass	All Tinted		
N	firrors	Left & Right Outside		
ī	icense Plate Mounts	Front & Rear	<del></del>	
7	argo Box	Fleetside		
Ē	umper	Rear Step Factory Installed	<del>_</del>	
Ŧ	ires	All Season	<del></del>	
19	pare Tire	Full Size w/ Jack		
Ā	ir Conditioning	Installed	<del>-</del>	
F	ront Seat	Bench		
Æ	auto Locking Hubs	Installed		EPA
3	Standard Floor Covering	Installed	EPA	Cr A
F	ront Air Bags	Installed		CITY
			HGWY	<u> </u>
				47
F	Price Each Gasoline	\$16,723.00	23	17
	Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes: Axle-trac-lok differential Engine Cooling - heavy duty Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires	\$259.60 Std Std Std \$89.00	Enter total off ro	ad pkg above
	Tow Hooks	\$Std	\$312.40	
	AM/FM w/ CD Player		\$N/A	***************************************
	Shop/Service Manual		\$N/A	
	CD Service Manual		\$Std	
	Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control		\$N/C must order	PW/PL
6	Keyless Entry		\$595,00	
	Power Windows / Power Locks	List items included in this gorup	\$237.60	
_	Tow Package		\$N/A	
9	Long Bed		\$139.00	
10	Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)		\$N/A	
11	Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)		\$N/A	
	Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo)		\$169.00	
	Bed Liner		\$Std	
	Side Air Bags		*N/C	
	Exterior colors		\$154.00	
16	Slide Rear Window		(\$895.00)	
	Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)		\$0	
	Delete Cloth Seats (Deduct)		\$0	
	Delete Carpet (Deduct)		(\$35.00)	
20	FOB Dealership: (Deduct)		\$1.69	
21	FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile		**************************************	
	Additional Information: (8) Hitch & 7 Pin Wiring			

## CLASS 17 TRUCK Small Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive, Extended Cab, 4700 GVWR Includes but is not limited to: GMC Canyon, Chevrolet Colorado

Vendor Name:	Matheny Motor Truck Co.		
Manufacturer / Brand	GMC		
	60-120 Days	•	
Delivery Model Name & Number	Canyon TT15653	•	
Model Issue & Isombei			TABALIE
Standard Equipment Requirements:		HP .	TORQUE
Engine	MIN: 207 HP 225 TORQUE	242	242
Transmission	Automatic		
Steering	Power	•	
Brakes	Power/ABS		
Radio	AWFM	_	
Glass	All Tinted	-	
Mirrors	Left & Right Outside	_	
License Plate Mounts	Front & Rear	••	
Cargo Box	Fleetside		
Bumper	Rear Step Factory Installed	··	
Tires	All Season	_	
Spare Tire	Full Size w/ Jack	=	
Air Conditioning	Installed	-	
Front Seat	Standard seating	_	
Auto Locking Hubs	Installed	EPA	EPA
Standard Floor Covering	installed	HGWY	CITY
Front Air Bags	Installed	110441	
Price Each Gasoline	\$17,996.00	_ 23	17
- 4			
Options: Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes:		\$347.60	
Axie-trac-lok differential	\$259.60		
Engine Cooling - heavy duty	\$Std	- ) 1	
Skid plate Group	\$Std	-	
Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks	\$Std	Enter total off ro	ad pkg abive
All Terrain Tires	\$88.00	-	
Tow Hooks	\$Std	_ }	
AM/FM w/ CD Player		\$312.40	
Shop/Service Manual		\$N/A	
CD Service Manual		\$N/A	
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control		\$Std	
Keyless Entry		\$N/C must order I	PWPL Opt 7
Power Windows / Power Locks		\$594.00	
Limited Slip Rear End		\$259.60	<del></del>
Engine V8: Size		\$N/A	
Tow Package	List items included in this group	\$237.60	<u> </u>
Side Air Bags		\$Std	~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~
Bend front seat		\$Std	
Exterior colors		\$N/C	
Slide Rear Window		\$154.00	
Long Bed		5N/A	
Słush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)		\$139.00	
Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)		\$139.00 \$N/A	
Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo)		\$Std	
Front seat bench		\$	
) Bed Liner		\$Std	
Carpet Interior	_	\$N/A	
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)		\$0	
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)		\$0	
Delete Cloth Seats (Deduct)		\$0	
Delete Carpet (Deduct)		\$N/A	
Remove Console (Delete) (Console between seats)	».	(\$35.00)	
7 FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 3 FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile		\$1.69	
Additional Information: ( 10 ) Hitch & 7 Pin Wiring			

### CLASS 17A TRUCK

Midsize Pickup, Front-Hinged, Full Size Doors, 4 Wheel Drive, 4 Door Crew Cab, 4850 GVWR includes but is not limited to: GMC Canyon, Chevrolet Colorado

	Vendor Name	Matheny Motor Truck Co.	_	
	None of the street / Drond	GMC		
	Manufacturer / Brand	60-120 Days	<del>-</del>	
	Delivery	Canyon TT15643	-	
	Model Name & Number	<u> </u>	***	
			HP	TORQUE
	Standard Equipment Requirements:			
	Engine	MIN: 210 HP 225 TORQUE	245	242
·	Transmission	Automatic	_ L	
	Steering	Power	···	
`	Brakes	Power/ABS	1470	
	Radio	AM/FM	****	
Ì	Glass	All Tinted	<del></del>	
•	Mirrors	Left & Right Outside		
	License Plate Mounts	Front & Rear	_	
•	Cargo Box	Fleetside		
	Bumper	Rear Step Factory Installed	_	
•	Tires	All Season		
	Spare Tire	Full Size w/ Jack	****	
•	Air Conditioning	Installed		
	Front Seat	Standard Seating	<del></del>	
	Auto Locking Hubs	Installed	wan.	
	Standard Floor Covering	Installed	– EPA	EPA
	Front Air Bags	Installed	HGWY	CITY
•				
	Price Each Gasoline	\$19,859.00	_ 21	16
	Outions			<b>L</b>
4	Options: Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes:		\$1,989.00	
3	Axle-trac-lok differential	\$Inc W/1	41,000	<del></del>
		\$inc W/1	~ <b>`</b>	
	Engine Cooling - heavy duty	\$Inc W/1	-	
	Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks	\$Inc W/1	Enter total off ro	ad nka ahove
		\$Inc W/1	- Chier total on it	ad pag above
	All Terrain Tires	\$Inc W/1		
_	Tow Hooks	Dire An I	\$N/A	
	AM/FM w/ CD Player		\$N/A	
	Shop/Service Manual		\$N/A	<del></del>
	CD Service Manual		\$Std	
-	Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control	List item included in this group	\$237.60	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
	Tow Package	List item included in this group	\$Std	
	Side Air Bags		\$N/C	<del></del>
	Exterior colors		<del></del>	***************************************
9	Slide Rear Window		\$154.00	<del></del>
	Keyless Entry		\$Std	
	Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors		\$Std	
	Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)		\$139.00	
	Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)		\$139.00	
	Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo)		\$N/A	
	Bed Liner		\$169.00	
16	Carpet Interior		\$Std	
17	Rear Jump Seat		\$Std	<del></del>
18	Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)	<u> </u>	\$N/A	
19	Delete Fioor Mats (Deduct)	<del></del>	\$0	
20	Delete Cloth Seats (Deduct)		\$N/A	
21	FOB Dealership: (Deduct)	<del></del>	(\$35.00)	
22	FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile		\$1.69	
	Additional Information:			
	(6) Hitch & 7 Pin Wiring			
	1-1			

# CLASS 19 TRUCK

Large Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive, 8500 GVWR, Long Bed Includes but is not limited to: Ford F250, Dodge Ram 2500, Chevrolet Sierra 2500

	Matheny Motor Truck Co.		
Manufacturer / Brand	GMC	10 tv	
Delivery	60-180 Days		
Model Name & Number	Sierra TK20903		
		HP	TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements: Engine	MIN: 295 HP 335 TORQUE	360	380
Transmission	Automatic		
Steering	Power		
Brakes	Power/ABS		ESEL
Redio	AMFM All Tinted	No Bid	No Bid
Glass Mirrors	Left & Right Outside	<del></del>	
License Plate Mounts	Front & Rear	<del> </del>	J I
Cargo Box	Fleetside	<del></del>	
Bumper	Rear Step Factory Installed	NAMES OF THE PARTY	
Tires	All Season	_	
Spare Tire	Full Size w/ Jack		
Air Conditioning	installed Bench		
Front Seat	Installed		
Auto Locking Hubs Standard Floor Covering	Installed	<del>nore</del>	
Front Air Bags	Installed		
		EPA	EPA
		HGWY	CITY
Price Each Gasoline	\$20,189.00	Not Rated	Not Rated
		·	
Options:			
Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes:		\$500.72	
Axle-trac-lok differential	\$286.00	\	
Engine Cooling - heavy duly	\$Std	l	
Skid plate Group	\$132.00	— Enter total off r	oad aka ahawa
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks	\$132,00 Sid	Enter total off r	oad pkg above
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duly W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires	\$132.00 Std \$38.72	Enter total off r	oad pkg above
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duly W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks	\$132,00 Sid	Enter total off r	oad pkg above
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player	\$132.00 Std \$38.72		oad pkg above
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duly W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks	\$132.00 Std \$38.72	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A	oad pkg above
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AMFM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual	\$132.00 Std \$38.72	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00	oád pkg above
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00	oad pkg above
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Till Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00	oad pkg above
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package Snow Plow Package	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80	oad pkg above
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package Snow Plow Package Side Air Bags	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A	oád pkg above
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Stip Rear End Tow Package Snow Plow Package Side Air Bags Exterior colors	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A \$N/C	oad pkg above
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Titl Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package Snow Plow Package Side Air Bags Exterior colors Slide Rear Window	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A	
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Till Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package Snow Plow Package Side Air Bags Exterior colors Slide Rear Window Keyless Entry	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A \$N/C \$N/A	
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Till Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package Show Plow Package Show Plow Package Side Air Bags Exterior colors Slide Rear Window Keyless Entry Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A \$N/C \$N/A \$211.20 Req 13 \$679.12 \$139.00	
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package Show Plow Package Side Air Bags Exterior colors Slide Rear Window Keyless Entry Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A \$N/C \$N/A \$211.20 Req 13 \$679.12 \$139.00 \$139.00	
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package Snow Plow Package Side Air Bags Exterior colors Slide Rear Window Keyless Entry Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A \$N/C \$N/A \$211.20 Req 13 \$679.12 \$139.00 \$139.00 \$N/A	
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package Snow Plow Package Side Air Bags Exterior colors Slide Rear Window Keyless Entry Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) Bed Liner	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A \$N/C \$N/A \$211.20 Req 13 \$679.12 \$139.00 \$139.00 \$N/A \$169.00	
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package Snow Plow Package Side Air Bags Exterior colors Slide Rear Window Keyless Entry Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) Bed Liner Carpet Interior	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A \$N/C \$N/A \$211.20 Req 13 \$679.12 \$139.00 \$139.00 \$N/A \$169.00 \$N/A	
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package Snow Plow Package Side Air Bags Exterior colors Slide Rear Window Keyless Entry Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) Bed Liner Carpet Interior Cioth Seats	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A \$N/C \$N/A \$211.20 Req 13 \$679.12 \$139.00 \$139.00 \$139.00 \$109.00 \$N/A \$109.00 \$N/A	
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual CD Service Manual Till Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package Show Plow Package Show Plow Package Side Air Bags Exterior colors Slide Rear Window Keyless Entry Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) Bed Liner Carpet Interior Cloth Seats Additlonal Tanks	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A \$N/C \$N/A \$211.20 Req 13 \$679.12 \$139.00 \$139.00 \$N/A \$169.00 \$N/A	
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package Show Plow Package Show Plow Package Side Air Bags Exterior colors Slide Rear Window Keyless Entry Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) Bed Liner Carpet Interior Cloth Seats Additional Tanks Extended Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A \$N/C \$N/A \$211.20 Req 13 \$679.12 \$139.00 \$139.00 \$139.00 \$109.00 \$N/A \$109.00 \$N/A	
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duly W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package Show Plow Package Side Air Bags Exterior colors Slide Rear Window Keyless Entry Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) Bed Liner Carpet Interior Cloth Seats Additional Tanks Extended Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door Gas Engine 450 CID:	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A \$N/C \$N/A \$211.20 Req 13 \$679.12 \$139.00 \$139.00 \$N/A \$169.00 \$N/A \$169.00 \$N/A	
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package Snow Plow Package Side Air Bags Exterior colors Silde Rear Window Keyless Entry Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) Bed Liner Carpet Interior Cloth Seats Additional Tanks Extended Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door Gas Engine 450 CID: 6 Cylinder (Deduct)	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A \$N/C \$N/A \$211.20 Req 13 \$679.12 \$139.00 \$139.00 \$N/A \$169.00 \$N/A \$0 \$N/A	
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duly W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A \$N/C \$N/A \$211.20 Req 13 \$679.12 \$139.00 \$139.00 \$N/A \$169.00 \$N/A \$0 \$N/A \$0 \$N/A \$0 \$N/A	
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package Snow Plow Package Side Air Bags Exterior colors Slide Rear Window Keyless Entry Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) Bed Liner Carpet Interior Cloth Seats Additional Tanks Extended Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door Gas Engine 450 CID: 6 Cylinder (Deduct) Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A \$N/C \$N/A \$211.20 Req 13 \$679.12 \$139.00 \$139.00 \$N/A \$169.00 \$N/A \$0 \$N/A \$0 \$N/A \$0 \$N/A \$0 \$N/A	
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual CD Service Manual Till Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package Show Plow Package Show Plow Package Side Air Bags Exterior colors Slide Rear Window Keyless Entry Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) Bed Liner Carpet Interior Cloth Seats Additional Tanks Extended Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door Gas Engine 450 CID: 6 Cylinder (Deduct) Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) Delete Cloth Seats (Deduct) FOB Dealership: (Deduct)	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A \$N/C \$N/A \$211.20 Req 13 \$679.12 \$139.00 \$139.00 \$N/A \$169.00 \$N/A \$169.00 \$N/A \$0 \$N/A \$0 \$N/A	
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package Show Plow Package Side Air Bags Exterior colors Slide Rear Window Keyless Entry Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) Bed Liner Carpet Interior Cloth Seats Additional Tanks Extended Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door Gas Engine 450 ClD: 6 Cylinder (Deduct) Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) Delete Floor Mats (Deduct) FOB Dealership: (Deduct) FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group List items included in this group  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A \$N/C \$N/A \$211.20 Req 13 \$679.12 \$139.00 \$139.00 \$N/A \$169.00 \$N/A \$2,236.00 \$N/A \$N/A \$0 \$N/A	
Skid plate Group Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks All Terrain Tires Tow Hooks AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package Snow Plow Package Side Air Bags Exterior colors Slide Rear Window Keyless Entry Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) Bed Liner Carpet Interior Cloth Seats Additional Tanks Extended Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door Gas Engine 450 CID: 6 Cylinder (Deduct) Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)	\$132.00 Std \$38.72 \$44.00  List items included in this group	\$149.60 \$N/A \$N/A \$220.00 \$286.00 \$440.00 \$250.80 \$N/A \$N/C \$N/A \$211.20 Req 13 \$679.12 \$139.00 \$139.00 \$N/A \$169.00 \$N/A \$169.00 \$N/A \$0 \$N/A \$0 \$N/A	

CLASS 20 TRUCK
Chassis Cab, 4 Wheel Drive,
9000 GVWR, Single Rear Wheels
Includes but is not limited to: Dodge Ram 2500, GMC Sierra 2500

Vendor Name:	Matheny Motor Truck Co	
Manufacturer / Brand	GMC	
Delivery	60-120 Days	
Model Name & Number	Sierra TK20903 ZW9	
		HP TORQUE
A Lab Wardana and Constitution of the		
Standard Equipment Requirements:	MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE	312 373
Engine Transmission	Automatic	
Steering	Power	
Brakes	Power/ABS	
Radio	AM/FM	
Glass	All Tinted	
Mirrora	Left & Right Outside	
License Plate Mounts	Front & Rear Installed	
Single Rear Wheels	All Season Load Range D	
Tires	20 Gallons Minimum	
Fuel Tank Air Conditioning	Installed	
Front Seat	Bench	
Standard Floor Covering	Installed	•
Front Air Bags	Installed	•
hand the same of t	DIESEL	GASOLINE
		\$19,629.0D
56" Cab to Axle	\$ No Bid	φ13 <sub>1</sub> 023,00
Options: Full Size Spare tire		\$303.60
Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes:		\$456.72
Axle-trac-lok differential	\$286.00	- 🗎
Engine Cooling - heavy duty	\$Std	Enter Total Off Rd Pkg Above
Skid plate Group	\$132.00 \$Std	
Suspension - Heavy Duty w/Gas Shocks	\$38.72	•
All Terrain Tires Engine Cooling Heavy Duty	\$Std	<del>-</del> J
AM/FM w/ CD Player		\$149.60
Shop/Service Manual		\$N/A
CD Service Manual		\$N/A
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control		\$220,00
Keyless Entry		\$211,20 Reg 8
Power Windows / Power Locks		\$879.12 \$89.00
Back -Up Alarm	List items included in this group	\$440,00
Tow Package	List items included in this group	\$250,80
Snow Plow Package	First House dicemped in the Brook	\$N/A
Side Air Bags Exterior colors		\$N/C
Slide Rear Window		\$N/A
Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)		\$139.00
Slush/All Weather Mals (Second Row)		\$139.00
SlustvAll Weather Mats (Cargo)		\$N/A
Duel Gas Tanks		\$N/A
Flatbed 8' Long (see attached specifications)		\$2,165.00
Utility Bed 8' Long (see attached specifications)		\$5,280.00 \$8,964.00
Crane (see attached specifications)		\$2,236.00
Extended Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door Crew Cab - Front Hinged Doors		\$3,689.00
		\$N/A
Gasoline Engine: 8 Cyl, 7.0 (Deduct)  2 Wheel Drive (Deduct)		\$1,980.00
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)	<u> </u>	\$0
Pelete Cloth Seats (Deduct)		\$0
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)		\$N/A
FOB Dealership: (Deduct)	**************************************	(\$35.00)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile	4.440	\$1.69 \$88,00
Available Axle Ratios	1. 4.10 2	400/AA
	3	
		•••
(10) Hitch & 7 Pin Wiring with Plug		···

### CLASS 22 VAN, CARGO 6500 GVWR, 109" Wheelbase

Includes but is not limited to: Express, GMC Savanna

Vendor Name:	Matheny Motor Truck Co		
Manufacturer / Brand Delivery	GMC 60-120 Days		
Model Name & Number	Savana TG13405		
			TODOUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:		HP	TORQUE
Engine	MIN: 180 HP 210 TORQUE	_ 195	260
Transmission	Automatic		
Steering	Power		
Brakes	Power/ABS	••••	
Radio	AM/FM	······································	
Glass	All Tinted	··········	
Mirrors	Left & Right Outside	<del></del>	
License Plate Mounts	Front & Rear	_	
Step Bumper	Installed		
Tires	All Season		
Spare Tire	Standard tire w/Jack	<del></del>	
Air Conditioning	Installed		
Seating Capacity 2	Passenger Seat	<del></del>	
Front Air Bags	Installed	<del></del>	
	RWD	EPA HGWY	EPA CITY
Price Each Gasoline	\$15,745.00	_   20	15
Options:  AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tllt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Tow Package: Transmission Cooler H. D. Engine Cooler Keyless Entry Power Windows / Power Locks Side Air Bags Glass All Around Rear Door Window/Glass Side Door Window/Glass Exterior Colors FOB Dealership: (Deduct) FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile		\$312.40 \$N/A \$N/A \$377.60 \$286.00 \$233.20 \$Std. \$149.60 \$569.00 \$N/A \$277.20 \$58.20 \$114.40 \$132.00 (\$35.00) \$1.69	Req. Opt. 8  Met Colors
Additional Information:			

## CLASS 23 VAN, CARGO Extended Body, 8500 GVWR 138" Wheelbase Includes but is not limited to: GMC Savanna

		Matheny Motor Truck Co		
Manufacturer / Brand		GMC		
Delivery		60-120 Days		
Model Name & Number		TG23405	********	
Standard Equipment Requirements:			HP HP	TORQUE
Engine		MIN: 255 HP 285 TORQUE	280	295
Transmission		Automatic		
Steering		Power	1	- L
Brakes		Power/ABS		
Radio	***************************************	AM/FM		
Glass		All Tinted		
Mirrors	······································	Left & Right Outside	<del></del>	
License Plate Mounts		Front & Rear	**************************************	
Tires	······································	All Season	<del></del>	
Spare Tire		Standard tire w/Jack	<del></del>	
Rubber Floor Matting	<del></del>	Installed	*******	
Air Conditioning	······································	Installed		
Front Air Bags	······································	Installed	<del></del>	
Doors		Double Side & Rear		
		Loading Doors w/Glass	Whouse	
Seating Capacity 2	······	Passenger Seat		
Price Each Gasoline		\$18,525.00		
Options:		\$18,525.00	volum	
Options: AM/FM w/ CD Player		\$18,525.00	\$312.40	·
Options: AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual		\$18,525.00	\$N/A	
Options: AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual		\$18,525.00	\$N/A N/A	
Options: AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control		\$18,525.00	\$N/A N/A \$347.60	
Options: AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End			\$N/A N/A \$347.60 \$286.00	
Options: AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Engine Options:	Option 1:	6.0	\$N/A N/A \$347.60 \$286.00 \$840.00	
Options: AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Engine Options: Engine Options:			\$N/A N/A \$347.60 \$286.00 \$840.00 \$N/A	
Options: AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Engine Options: Engine Options: Drivers Side Cargo Door		6.0	\$N/A N/A \$347.60 \$286.00 \$840.00 \$N/A \$N/A	
Options: AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Engine Options: Engine Options: Drivers Side Cargo Door All Wheel Drive		6.0	\$N/A N/A \$347.60 \$286.00 \$840.00 \$N/A \$N/A	
Options: AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Engine Options: Engine Options: Drivers Side Cargo Door All Wheel Drive Keyless Entry		6.0	\$N/A N/A \$347.60 \$286.00 \$840.00 \$N/A \$N/A \$N/A \$149.60	Req. Opt 10
Options: AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Engine Options: Engine Options: Drivers Side Cargo Door All Wheel Drive Keyless Entry Power Windows / Power Locks		6.0	\$N/A N/A \$347.60 \$286.00 \$840.00 \$N/A \$N/A \$N/A \$149.60 \$418.00	Req. Opt 10
Options: AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Engine Options: Engine Options: Drivers Side Cargo Door All Wheel Drive Keyless Entry Power Windows / Power Locks Rear Door Window/Glass		6.0	\$N/A N/A \$347.60 \$286.00 \$840.00 \$N/A \$N/A \$N/A \$149.60 \$418.00 \$Included	Req. Opt 10
Options:  AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Engine Options: Engine Options: Drivers Side Cargo Door All Wheel Drive Keyless Entry Power Windows / Power Locks Rear Door Window/Glass Side Sliding Door w/Glass		6.0	\$N/A N/A \$347.60 \$286.00 \$840.00 \$N/A \$N/A \$N/A \$149.60 \$418.00 \$Included \$132.00	Req. Opt 10
Options:  AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Engine Options: Engine Options: Drivers Side Cargo Door All Wheel Drive Keyless Entry Power Windows / Power Locks Rear Door Window/Glass Side Sliding Door w/Glass Glass Sides		6.0	\$N/A N/A \$347.60 \$286.00 \$840.00 \$N/A \$N/A \$N/A \$149.60 \$418.00 \$Included \$132.00 \$277.20	Req. Opt 10
Options:  AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Engine Options: Engine Options: Drivers Side Cargo Door All Wheel Drive Keyless Entry Power Windows / Power Locks Rear Door Window/Glass Side Sliding Door w/Glass Glass Sides Telescopic Trailer Tow Mirrors		6.0	\$N/A N/A \$347.60 \$286.00 \$840.00 \$N/A \$N/A \$N/A \$149.60 \$418.00 \$Included \$132.00 \$277.20 \$N/A	Req. Opt 10
Options:  AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Engine Options: Engine Options: Drivers Side Cargo Door All Wheel Drive Keyless Entry Power Windows / Power Locks Rear Door Window/Glass Side Sliding Door w/Glass Glass Sides Telescopic Trailer Tow Mirrors Rear Rubber Floor Matting		6.0	\$N/A N/A \$347.60 \$286.00 \$840.00 \$N/A \$N/A \$N/A \$149.60 \$418.00 \$Included \$132.00 \$277.20 \$N/A \$79.20	
Options: AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Engine Options: Engine Options: Drivers Side Cargo Door All Wheel Drive Keyless Entry Power Windows / Power Locks Rear Door Window/Glass Side Sliding Door w/Glass Glass Sides Telescopic Trailer Tow Mirrors Rear Rubber Floor Matting Exterior colors		6.0	\$N/A N/A \$347.60 \$286.00 \$840.00 \$N/A \$N/A \$N/A \$149.60 \$418.00 \$Included \$132.00 \$277.20 \$N/A \$79.20 \$132.00	
Options:  AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Engine Options: Engine Options: Drivers Side Cargo Door All Wheel Drive Keyless Entry Power Windows / Power Locks Rear Door Window/Glass Side Sliding Door w/Glass Glass Sides Telescopic Trailer Tow Mirrors Rear Rubber Floor Matting Exterior colors FOB Dealership: (Deduct)		6.0	\$N/A N/A \$347.60 \$286.00 \$840.00 \$N/A \$N/A \$N/A \$149.60 \$418.00 \$Included \$132.00 \$277.20 \$N/A \$79.20 \$132.00 (\$35.00)	
Options: AM/FM w/ CD Player Shop/Service Manual CD Service Manual Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Limited Slip Rear End Engine Options: Engine Options: Drivers Side Cargo Door All Wheel Drive Keyless Entry Power Windows / Power Locks Rear Door Window/Glass Side Sliding Door w/Glass Glass Sides Telescopic Trailer Tow Mirrors Rear Rubber Floor Matting Exterior colors		6.0	\$N/A N/A \$347.60 \$286.00 \$840.00 \$N/A \$N/A \$N/A \$149.60 \$418.00 \$Included \$132.00 \$277.20 \$N/A \$79.20 \$132.00	Req. Opt 10 For Met. Paint

## CLASS 26 VAN 12 Passenger Van, 125" Wheel Base Includes but is not limited to: GMC Savanna, Dodge Sprinter

Vendor Name:	Matheny Motor Truck Co		
Manufacturer / Brand	GMC		
Delivery	60-120 Days		
Model Name & Number	Savana TG23406 (8,600 GVWR)		
Standard Equipment Requirements:		HP	TORQUE
Engine	MIN: 255 HP 350 TORQUE	323	373
Transmission	Automatic	320	0,0
Steering	Power		L
Brakes	Power/ABS		
Radio	AM/FM		
Glass	All Tinted, Sides and Rear		
Mirrors	Left & Right Outside - 5" x 8" Minimum		
License Plate Mounts	Front & Rear		•
Seating	12 Passenger		
Tires	Load Range E		
Spare Tire	Standard tire w/Jack		
Rubber Floor Covering	Installed		
Front and Rear Air Conditioning	Installed		
Front Air Bags	Installed		
Doors	Double Side & Rear		
	Full Length Head Liner w/Insulation Side &		
Interior	Quarter Panel		
Rear Step Bumper	Installed	EPA	EPA
		HGWY	CITY
Price Each Gasoline	\$20,440.00	Not Rated	Not Rated
Price Each Bi-Fuel	\$20,440.00	Not Rated	Not Rated
Price Each Diesel	\$No Bid		<u> </u>
Options:			
AM/FM w/ CD Player		\$180.40	
Shop/Service Manual		\$N/A	
CD Service Manual		\$N/A	
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control		\$377.60	
Keyless Entry		\$149.60	Req. Opt 6
Power Windows / Power Locks		\$418.00	
Limited Slip Rear End		\$269.00	
Diesel Engine		\$N/A	
Extended Length		\$2,989.00	
Sliding Side Door		\$132.00	
Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)		\$139.00	
Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)		\$139,00	
Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo)		\$139.00	
Side Air Bags		\$Std.	
Exterior colors		\$132.00	Met. Paint
Delete Center Row Seats (Deduct)	<u> </u>	(\$460.00)	Also Deletes
Delete Third Row Seats (Deduct)		\$ -See 16	
FOB Dealership: (Deduct)		(\$35.00)	
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile		\$1.69	
Additional Information:			

## **Purchase Order**

SI-P

T O



T

V B Z D O R

State of West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

PURCHASE ORDER NO. MV10A

BLANKET RELEASE

00

PAGE

CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES, INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS. QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS PURCHASE ORDER SHOULD BE DIRECTED TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.

CHANGE ORDER 1

> SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS

ALL STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED Ċ BY ORDER

\*709035314 304-485-4410 MATHENY MOTOR TRUCK COMPANY PO BOX 1304

PARKERSBURG WV 26102-1304 ALL STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

	DATE PRINTE	Designation		TERMS OF SAL		02/20/45	FEIN/SSN	nesculative especies (	Et NI	
	10/31/20 SHIP VIA	<del></del>	NET	30		2002/2000	320770			
				F.O.B			FREIGHTTERMS		ACCOUNTIN	IUMBER
BE:	T WAY QUANTIT	Y	UOP	TINATION VENDOR	I RITEMNO.		PREPAID		UL-MUL	
LING	DELIVERYD	ATE (	CAT.NO.		NUMBER		UNIT PRICE		NOMA	NT
		Ì	,							
				RECEIPT	T.T.CKE.	T, F.	OR PURCHASE	ORDER:	MV10A	
								-		
LINE	CATNO	ITEM	NUMBE	R		D	ESCRIPTION		QTY	DATE
		İ	Ì							
								***************************************		
0001	. 0	70-06-	01-00	0 2010	(OR C	URR	ENT MODEL YE	EAR) MO	TOR	***************************************
			SIGNA	TURE				DATE		
				***************************************					················	
			İ							
						Ī				
			***************************************							
			İ			Ì		Ì		
		-								was a second
			}			***************************************		ļ		
		-	-			İ		ļ		
F APPRO	VAL AS TO FO	RM IS REOL	JIRED BY	ATTORNEY G	ENERAL C	HECK	CHERE []			
11 <i>- 13 - 1</i> 1				VIIIAE I GI	- Hall trains V	i il. Of	\		TOTAL	
							•	Ĺ.	iV IAL	