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GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
PURCHASE ORDER/CONTRACT

{. ACCEPTANCE: Selier shall be bound by this order and its ferms and conditions upoh receipt of this order.

2. APPLICABLE LAW: The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing
Division shall govarn all rights- and duties under the Contract, including without limitation the validity of this

Purchase Order/Coniract

3. NON-FUNDING: Al services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Orders/Contracis are to be
confinued for the terms of the Purchase Order/Confract, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the

Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available
for these sarvices or goods, this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30,

4. COMPLIANCE: Selier’ shall comply with all Federal, State and local laws, regulations and ordinances including,
but not limited to, the prevailing wage rates of the WV Division of Labor.

5. MODIFICATIONS: This writing is the parties final expression of intent. No modification of this order shall be
binding unless agreed to in writing by the Buyer.

6. ASSIGNMENT: Neither this Order nor any monies due, or fo become due hereunder may be assigned by the
Seller without the Buyer's consent.

7. WARRANTY: The Seller expressly warrants that the goods andfor services covered by this order will:
la} conform to the specifications, drawings, samples or other description furnished or speciied by the
Buyer; (b} be merchantable and fit for the purpose intended; and/or {c} be free from defect in material

and workmanship.

8. CANCELLATION: The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Confract upon 30 days written
nofice to the seller.

9. SHIPPING, BILLING & PRICES: Prices are those stated in this order. No price increase will be accepied
without written authority from the Buyer. Al goods or setvices shall be shipped on or before the date
specified in this Order.

10. LATE PAYMENTS: Paymenis may ‘only be made after the delivery of goods or services. Interest may be
paid on late payments in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

11. TAXES: The State of West Virginia is exempt from Federal and State taxes and will not pay or reimburse
such taxes.

12. RENEWAL: Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon
mutual written agreement of the parties.

13. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendorfcontractor files for bankrupicy protection, this Contract may be
deemed null and void, and terminated without further order. .

14. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and available online af the Purchasing Division's web site
(http:ﬁwww.siate.wv.usladmin/purchase!vrcfhipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that,
the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Enfily (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health
irformation (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

15. WEST VIRGINIA ALCOHOL & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT: If this Coniract constituies a public improvement
construction contract as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code ("The West Virginia Alcohol
and Drug-Free Workplace Act’), then the following language shall hereby become part of this Confract: "The
contracior and its subcontractors shall implement and maintain a written drug-free workplace policy in compliance
with the West Virginia Alcohol and Drug-Free Workplace Act, as set forth in Arlicle 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code. The contracior and its subconfractors shall provide a swom statement in wriling, under the
penalties of perjury, that they maintaln a valid drug-free work place policy in compliance with the West Virginia
and Drug-Free Workplace Act. It is understood and agreed that this Contract shall be cancelled by the awarding
authority if the Confractor: 1) Fails to implement its drug-free workplace policy; 2) Fails fo provide information
regarding implementation of the confractor's drug-free workplace policy at the request of the public authotify; or
3) Provides to the public'authority false information regarding the contractor's drug-free workplace policy.”

Rev. 7/01/08
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MV10A M.J. Matheny Motor Truck Co.

CLASS MODEL PRICE
12 - Truck GMC Sierra TGC10703 - Large Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive, 5000 GVWR, Short Bed, Gas. % 15,679.00
16 - Truek GMC Canyon TT15403 - Small Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive, 4500 GVWR, Short Bed, Gas $ 16,723.00
17 - Truck GMC Canyon T3 15653 - Small Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive, 4700 GVWR, Ext, Cab, Gas g 17,896,060
17A - Truck GMC Canyon TT15643 - Midsize Pickup, 4 Whee! Drive, 4850 GVWR, 4 Door Crew Cab, Gas & 19,859,60
19 - Truck GMC Sierra TK20803 - Large Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive, 8500 GVWR, L.ong Bed, Gas [ 20,189.00
20 - Truck CIC Sierra TROOOE ZW8S - Chassis Cab, 4 Wheel Drive, 8000 GYWR, Single Rear Wheels, Gas $ 18,629.00
20A - Track GMC Siarra - Chassis Gab, 157° WB, 80" CA, 4 Wheel Drive, 12,000 GVWR, Dual Rear Wheels, Gas | § 21,639.00
22 - Van, Cargo GMC Savana 1613405 - 8500 GVWR, 108" Wheelbase, Gas B 15,748.00
23 - Van, Cargo GMC 16323405 - Extended Body, 8500 GVWR, 138" Wheelbase, Gas 5 18,625.00
25 - Van GMC Savana 123405 - 12 Passenger, 125" Wheelbase, Gas $ 20,440.00
28 - Van GMC Savana 123408 - 17 Passenger, 125" Wheelbase, Bio-Fuel 3 20,440.00

1of1




CLASS 12 TRUCK
Large Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive
8000 GVWR, Short Bed, Approx. 57" bed.
Inciudes but is not fimited to: Ford F150, Dodge 1500, Chevrolet 1500

070-48-12-001

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truek Co.
Manufacturer / Brand GMC
Defivery 60-120 Days

Model Name & Numbear

Sierra TC16703

HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN 185 HP 235 TORQUE 185 260
Transmission Automatic
Stearing Bower
Brakes Power
Radlic AMIFM
Glass Al Tinted
Milrrors L.eft & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fieetside
Bumper Rear Step Factory instalied
Tires All Season
Spare Tie Full Size wf Jack
Air Congitipning Installed
Front Seaf Bench EPA EPA
Rubber Floor Covering Instatied HEWY CITY
Front Alr Bags Instalied
Price Each Gasofine $15,679.00 20 15
Hybrid $No Bid
Flex Fuel $17,214.00
Bed Size Guofe
Qptions:
T ANMEM w/ CD Player $146.60
2 ShopfService Manual $  N/A
3 CD Service Manual $ WA
4 Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control $220.00
5 Limited Slip Rear End $288.00
& Keyless Entry $211.20 Regopt7
7 Power Windows / Power Lotks $879.12
8 Tow Hooks $44.00
9 LongBed $372.95
10 Exterior cofors 3  NIC
11 Slide Rear Window $  NIA
12 Side Air Bags 3 NA
13 Engine Opiions Option 1: 4.8 $831.60
14 Engine Options Option 2. 5.3 $1,535.60
45 Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) $138.00
16 ShshiAll Weather Mats (Second Row) 3 NiA
17 Stush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) 5 NIA
18 Bed Liner $169.00
19 Crew/Quad Cab $5,447.00
20 Extended Cab $2,666.25
21 Manual Transmission wiOverdrive (Deduct) - $  N/A
22 Detete Gioth Seats (Deduc)) . 30
23 Delete Carpetl (Deduct) - 50
24 Detete Truck Bed {Deduct) . $ N/A
25 FOB Dealership: (Deduch) & {$35.00)
26 FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile $1.69

Additional Information:




CLASS 168 TRUCK
Small Plckup, 4 Whesl Drive,
4500 GVWR, Short Bed
includes but is not fimited to: GMC Canyon, Chevrolet Colorado

070-48-16-000 7

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck Co.
Manufacturer / Brand GMC
Dedivery 50-120 Days
Model Name & Number Canyon TT15403
HpP TORQUE
Standard Egquipment Reguirements:
Engine MIN: 207 HP 238 TORQUE 242 242
Transmisstion Auipomatic
Sieering Power
Brakes Power
Radio AMIFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Cutside
lLicense Plaie Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetiside
Bumper Rear Step Factory Installed
Thes All Season
Spare Tire Full Size w/ Jack
Alr Conditioning instatled
Front Seat Bench
Auto Locking Hubs Installed
Standard Floor Covering installed EPA EFA
Front Air Bags inséalisd
HEWY GITY
Price Each Gasoline $18,723.00 23 17
Price Each Flex Fuel SN/A
Options:
Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, includes: $3485.60
Aode-trac-lok differential $259.60
Engine Cooling - heavy duty Sid T
Skid plate Group Sid
Suspenston - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks Std nter total off road pkg above
Al Tertrain Tires $89.00
Tow Hooks $Std
AMFM wi GD Player $312.40
Shop/Service Manual FN/A
D Service Manual SRA
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control $54d _
Keyless Entry SN/C must order PW/PL
Power Windows / Power Locks $595.00
Tow Package List items included in this gorup 523750
Long Bed SN/A
Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) $139.00
Slush/Al Weather Mats {Second Row) $N/A
Sjush/All Weather Mats {Cargo) SNIA
Bed Liner $168.00
Side Air Bags $Std
Eyderior colors SN/C
Slide Rear Window $154.00
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive {Deduct) . {3895.00)
Delete Cloih Seats {Daduct) —_ $0
Delete Carpet (Deduct) £ 30
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) B {$356.00)
FOB Other than Metro Charfeston - Per Mile $1.59

Additional Information:
{8 ) Hitch & 7 Pin Wiring




CLASS 17 TRUCK

Small Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive,
Extended Cab, 4700 GVWR

Inchides but is not Himited to; GMC Canyon, Chevrolei Colorade

070-48-17-000 8

Vendor Name: iatheny Motor Truck Co.
Manufacturer / Brand GMC
Delivery 80-120 Days
Mode! Name & Numbser Canyon TT156563
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Reguirements!
Enging MIN: 207 HP 225 TORQUE 242 242
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Powerf/ABS
Radio AMIEM
Glass All Tinted
Airrors Lefi & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Frani & Rear
Cargo Box Flestside
Bumpasr Rear Step Faclory instalted
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size wi Jack
Air Conditioning Instatied
Front Seat Standard sealing
Aulo Logking Hubs installed
Standard Floor Covering instalied EPA EFA
Front Air Bags ~ Installed HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline $17,896.00 23 17
Price Each Fiex Fuel SN/A
Options:
Off Road Package including Limited Slip Rear, Includes: $347.60
Axle-trac-lok differential $258.60
Fngine Cooling - heavy duty $Std T
Skid plate Group $Std
Suspension - Heavy Duty Wigas Shocks $3id Enter total off road pkg abive
All Terrain Ties $68.00
Tow Hooks $Std
AMIFM w/ CD Player $312.40
ShopiService Manual SN/A
CD Service Manua SN/A
Titt Whee! & Cruise Control $5id
Keyless Eniry $N/C must order PYW/PL Opt 7
Power Windows / Power Locks $594.00
Limited Stip Rear End $2689.60
Engine V8! Size SHA
Tow Package List items inciuded in this group $237.60
Side Air Bags $5td
Bend front seat $Std
Exterior colors SN/C
Slide Rear Window $154.00
Long Bed SN/A
SlusihVAll Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) $138.0C
StushiAl Weather Mats (Second Row) $138.00
Siush/All Weather Mats {Cargo} SN/A
Frost seat bench $51d
Bed Liner $
Carpet Interior $8id
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) - SNIA
Delete Floor Mats {Deduct) 2 $0
Delete Cloth Seats {Deduct) - 30
Delete Carpet (Deduct) B $0
Remove Console {Delete) (Console between seats) . SNIA
FOR Deatership: (Deduct) s ($35.00)
FOB Other than Metro Chareston - Per Mile $1.69

Additional Information:
(10} Hitch & 7 Pin Wiring




CLASS 17A TRUCK 070-48-17-010  §
Midsize Pickup, Front-Hinged, Full Size Doors,
4 Wheel! Drive, 4 Door Crew Cab, 4850 GVWR
includes but is not Frited to: GMC Canyon, Chevrolet Colorado

Vendor Name Mathany Motor Truck Co.
Manufacturer / Brand GHC
Delivery 50~120 Days
Modal Name & Number Canyon TT15643
P TORQUE
Stendard Equipment Reguirements:
Engine MIN: 210 HP 225 TORQUE 245 242
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AMIFM
Glass Ali Tinted
Mirrars | Left & Right Outside
lLicense Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Step Factory Installed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire : Full Size w/ Jack
Air Conditioning Installed
Front Seat Standard Sesting
Auto Locking Hubs installed
Standard Floor Covering installed EPA ERPA
Froni Air Bags Installed HGEWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline $19,859.00 21 16
Price Each Flex Fugl SNIA
Options:
1 Off Road Package Including Limited Siip Rear, Includes: $1,080.00
Axte-frac-lok differential Sinc Wi
Engine Cooling - heavy duty $inc Wit T
Skid plate Group $inc Wit
Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks $lnc Wi Enter total off road pkg above
All Terrain Thes $lne WH
Tow Hooks $inc Wit
2 ANUFM w/ CD Player SN/A
3 Shop/Service Manual SNIA
4 CD Service Manual SNIA
5 Tilt Wheel & Cruise Controi $5td
& Tow Package List ifem Included in this group $237.60
7 Side Air Bags $5td
8§ Exterior colors SNIC
9 Slide Rear Window $154.00
10 Keyless Entry $5id
11 Fower Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors $Std
12 Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) $139.00
13 Slush/All Weather Mats {Second Row) $139.00
14 Slush/al Weather Mats {Cargo) SN/A
15 Bed Liner $169.00
16 Carpet Interior §5td
17 Rear Jump Seat $3d
18 Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) B SHUA
19 Defete Floor Mats (Deduct) > $0
20 Delete Cloth Seats (Deducl) - FNIA
21 FOB Deatership: (Deduct) 2 {535.00)
22 FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile $1.69

Additional Information:
(6 ) Hilch & 7 Pin Witing




CLASS 10 TRUCK
Large Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive,
8500 GVWR, Long Bed
tnciudes but is not limited to: Ford F250, Dodge Ram 2500, Chevrolet Sierra 2500

o70-48-12-000 1 0

Vendor Name

WMatheny Motor Truck Co.

Manufacturer / Brand Gc
Delvery B80-18¢ Days
Modet Name & Number Slerra TK20903
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Reguirements:
Engine MIN: 295 HP 336 TORQUE 350 380
Transmi Auviomatic
Sieering Fawer
Srakes Power/ABS DIESEL
fadio AMFM No Bid No Bid
Glass All Tinted
Mirors |eft & Righi Oulside
License Plate Mounis Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumpes Rear $tep Faclory Instalied
Thes All Season
Spare Tire Full Size w/ Jack
Alr Conditioning inslalled
Front Seat Bench
Auto Looking Hubs installed
Standard Floor Covering installed
Front Alr Bags instafled
EPA EPA
HEWY CITY

Price Each Gasoline $20,189,00 Not Rated Not Rated
Price Each Diesel $Ne Bid
Price Each Flex Fuef $Np Bid
Options;
Off Read Package including Limdied Slip Rear, Inchxles: $500.72

Axie-trac-lok differential $286.00

Engine Cooling - heavy duly 5td T

Skitt plate Group $132.00

Buspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shooks Sid Enter totai off road pkg above

All Terrain Tires $38.72

Tow Hooks $44.00

AMFM w/ CD Player
Shop/Service Manual
CD Service Manual
TH Whes! & Cruise Contfrol
Limited Slip Rear End
Tow Package

Snow Piow Package
Side Air Bags
Exterior colors

Slide Rear Window
Keyless Enlsy

Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirfors
Slushias Weather Mats (Driver & Passengar)

Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)
Slush/All Weather Mals (Carge)

Bed Liner

Camet Interior

Cloth Seats

Additional Tanks

Extended Cab wi Third and Fourth Door
Gas Engine 450 CID:

& Cylinder {Deduct)

Manuatl Transmission wiQverdrive {Deduct)
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)

Delete Cloth Seals (Deduct)

FOB Dealership: (Oeduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mite
Available Axde Ratios

Adiitlonal Information:

Listiterns included in this group
List items included in this group

$149.60

SN/A

SNIA

$220.00

$286,00

$440.00

$260.80

SN/A

$NC

SNIA

$211.20 Reg 13

5879.12

$138,00

$139,00

/A

$169.00

SNIA

$0

ShA

$2,236,.00

Bh/A

SN/A

SN

$0

T YRy

50

WA =

(536.00)

$1.69

$B8.00

(7) Hilch & 7 Pin Wiring with Plug

(8) Heavy Duty Allemator, HD Front Springs, Skid Plates, & Plow Wiring ¥ with Switch
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CLASS 20 TRUCK
Chagsls Cab, 4 Wheel Drive,
8000 GVWR, Single Rear Wheels

Includes but s not limited to: Dodge Ram 2500, GMC Slerra 2500

Vendor Name:

aatheny Motor Truck Co

070-48-20-001 4 1§

Memuiacturer / Brand GG
Delivery 680-120 Days
fMiode! Name & Number Sierra TK20803 ZWS
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Enging MIN: 300 HP 360 TORGQUE 312 373
Transmission Aufomatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio ARIFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Lefl & Right Quiside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Single Rear Wheals installed
Tires All Season Load Range D
Frel Tank 20 Gallong Minfrum
Al Condittoning Instalied
Front Seat Bench
Standard Flogr Covering Installed
Froni Air Bags Insiailed
DIESEL GASOLIME
6" Cab to Axle $ Mo Bid $18,629.0D
Options:
Full Size Spare tire $303.60
Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, includes: $456.72
Axle-trac-iok differential $286.00
Engine Cooling - haavy duty $Sid ?
Skid plale Group $132.00 Enter Total Off Rd Pkg Above
Suspension - Heavy Duly wiGas Shocks $5td
All Terrain Tires $38.72
£ngine Cooling Heavy Duty $Sid
AM/FM wf CD Player $148.60
Shop/Service Manuai $N/A
CB Service Manual SN/A
Tik Wheel & Cruise Control $220.00
Keyiess Entry $211.20Reg 8
Power Windows / Power Locks 387912
Back -Up Alarm $84.00
Tow Package {ist iterss cluded in thig group $440.00
snow Plow Packape List iterns included in this group . $250.80
Side Air Bags $NIA
Exterior colors SNIC
Slide Rear Window SNIA
Slush/All Weather Mats {Driver & Passenger) $130.00
Siush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) $138.00
Slushiall Weather Mats (Cargo) SNJA
Bluel Gas Tanks SNIA
Fiatbed &' Long (see attached gpecifications) $2,165.00
Utility Bed 8' Long {see altached specifications) $5,280.00
Crane (see aftached specifications) $8,064.00
Extended Cab w/ Third and Fousth Door $2,236.,00
Crew Cab - Front Hinged Doors $3,669.00
Gasoding Engine: 8 Cyl, 7.0 (Daduct) o SM/A
2 Wheel Drive {Deduct) 5 $1,980.00
Delate Floor Mats {Deduct) 1 $0
Delete Cioth Seats (Deduct) o &G
Manuai Transmission wiQverdrive {Deduct) b SN/A
FOR Deatership: (Deduct) 2 ($38.00)
FOR Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile $1.69
Available Axle Ratios 4.10 $88,00

@

{10) Hitch & 7 Pin Wirlng with Plug
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CLASS 20A TRUCK
Chassis Cab, 4 Wheel Drive,
12,000 GVWR, Dual Rear Wheels
tncludes but is ot limited to: Dodge Ram 3500, Ford Fas0

Vendor Name:

Manufacturer / Brand
Detivery
Modet Name & Number

Mathany Motor Truck Co

GWMC

50-120 Days

Sierra TK31003 or TK31403

070-48-20-002 -I 2

HP TORQUE
Stagdard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE 312 373
‘Transmission Automatic
Steering Powet
Brakes - Power/ABS
Radlo AWM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors i.eft & Right Quiside
Licanse Plate Mounls Front & Rear
Dual Rear Wheels Instalied
Thes Al Season Load Range D
Fugf Tank 20 Gallons Minimum
Air Gongitioning Instafled
Fronl Seat Bench
Standard Fiper Covering Instaiied
Fropl Air Bags instalied
DIESEL GASOLINE

Price Each 137" WB 80" Cab to fude o Bid $21,638.00
Price Each 161" W 84" Cab to Axie $No Bid $21.,787.00
Options:
Fu¥ Size Spare tire $370.48
Off Road Package Inciuding Limited Slip Rear, includes: $496.00

Axle-trac-lok difierential $266.00

Engine Cooling - heavy duty T5td, ?

Skid plate Group $144.90 Enter Tolal Off Rd Pkg Above

Suspension - Heavy Duty wiGas Shocks $5id,

Al Temsn Tires $66.00

Engine Cooling Heavy Duty $Sid,
AMFN w! CD Player $142.60
Shop/Service Manual NIA
CD Service Manual NIA
Tilt Whee! & Cruise Gontrol $220.00
Keyless Entry $211.20
Power Windows / Power |.ocke $878.12
Back ~Lip Aarm $88.00
Tow Package List items included in this group $565.00
Snow Plow Package List tems included in this group $250.80
Side Alr Bags NIA
Exterior colors MIC
Sfide Rear Window NiA
SlushfAll Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) $139,00
Slush/Alt Weather Mats (Second Row) £130.00
Slush/All Weather Mats {Cargo) N/A
Duel Gas Tanks HIA
Fiatbed @ long f/ 80" CA {see sttached specifications) $2,265.00
Fiatbed 12"long 1/ 84" CA (see attached specifications) §2,514,00
Dump Bed §/ 60" CA, 8.5' Long {see altached specifications) $5.212.00
Dump Bed ff 84" CA, 10.5' long (see altached specifications) §$5,838.00
Utiity Bed i 60" CA, §' long {see aitached specifications) $5,766,00
Utility Bed # 84" CA, 11' long {see atlached specifications) $7,275.00
Crane (see attached specifications) $9,945.00
Crane (see attached specifications) 53,945.00
Extended Cab wi Third and Fourth Door NIA
Crew Cab - Front Hinged Doors N/A
Gascline Engine: 8 Cyl, 7.0 (Dedust) & NIA
2 Whael Drive {Deduct) 5 $2,460.75
Manual Transmwssion w/Cvertriva {Daduct) 2 NA
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) b (535.00)
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct) b 30.00
Dejete Cloth Seals (Daduct) > $0.00
FOB Other than Meire Cherlestos - Per Mite $1.69
Awatable Axle Retios 1 4.10 $88.00

2.
3.

(10) Hitch & 7 pin Wiring Hamess
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CLASBS 22 VAN, CARGC
8500 GVWR, 109" Wheelbase

Inchudes but is not limited to: Express, GMC Savanna

Q70-92-22-001 13

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck Co
Manufacturer / Brand GMC
Delivery 50-120 Days
Modsi Name & Number Savana TG13405
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 180 HP 210 TORQUE 185 260
Transmission Autornaiic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio ARNIFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounis Front & Rear
Step Bumper Instailed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Standard tire w/Jack
Air Conditioning installed
Seating Capacity 2 Passenger Seat
Front Alr Bags Installed
EPA EPA
RWD HEWY ciTYy

Price Each Gasoiine $15,745,00 20 15
Price Each Flesx-Fuel SN/A
Options:
AMIFM w/ CD Player $312.40
Shop/Service Manual SN/A
GB Service Manuai $N/A
Tht Wheet & Cruise Controt $377.60
Limited Slip Rear End $286.00
Tow Package: Transmission Cooler $233.20

H, D, Enging Cooler $Std.
Keyless Entry $149.60 Req.Opt. §
Power Windows / Power Locks $569.00
Side Alr Bags SN/A
Glass All Around $277.20
Rear Door Window/Glass $58.20
Side Door Window/Glass $114.40
Exterior Colors $132.00 Met Colors
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) ra ($35,00}
FOB Other than Metro Charleston ~ Per Mile $1.69

Additional Information:
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Vendor Name:

CLASS 23 VAN, CARGO
Exiended Body, 8500 GVWR 138" Wheeibase
Includes but is not imited to; GMC Savanna

Matheny Motor Truck Co

070-82-23-001 1 4

Manufacturer / Brand Ghc
Delivery 50-120 Days
Model Name & Number TG23405
HP TORQUE

Standard Equipment Reqguirements:
Engine MiIN: 255 HP 285 TORQUE 280 295
Transmission Autormatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio ANFM
Glags Ali Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Qutside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Spare: Tire Standard fire wilack
Rubber Floor Matting installed
Air Conditioning installed
Front Air Bags installed
Doors Double Side & Rear

Loading Doors w/Glass
Seating Capacity 2 Passenger Seat
Price Each Gasoling $18,525.00
Price Each Diesel SN/A
Price Each Flex-Fuel $19,365.00
Options:
AM/FM wf CD Player $312.40
Shop/Service Manual BN/A
CD Service Manual N/A
Tilt Whee! & Cruise Control $347.680
Limited Slip Rear End $286.00
Engine Options: Option & 8.0 $840.00
Engine Options: Option 2: __ BN/A
Drivers Side Cargo Door SN/A
All Wheel Drive SN/A
Keyless Entry $149.60 Req. Opt 10
Powear Windows / Power Locks $418.00
Rear Door Window/Glass $included
Side Sliding Door w/Glass $132.00
Glass Sides 8277.20
Telescopic Trailer Tow Mirrors BNJA
Rear Rubber Floor Matting $79.20
Exterior colors $132.00 For Met. Paint
FOR Dealership: {Deduct) B {$35.00
FOB Other than Metro Chardeston - Per Mile $1.69

Additional Information;
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Vendor Name:

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

CLASS 26 VAN

12 Passenger Van, 125" Wheel Base
Includes but is not limited to; GMC Savanna, Dadge Sprinter

Matheny Motor Truck Co

GMC

60-120 Days

Savana TG23408 (8,600 GYWR)

070-93-26-000 1 5

HP TORQUE
Standard Equipinent Requirements:
Engine MIN: 255 MP 350 TORQUE 323 373
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/EM
Glass All Tinted, Sides and Rear
Mirrors Left & Right Outside - 5" x 8" Minimum
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Seating 12 Passenger
Tires Load Range E
Spare Tire Standard tire widack
Rubber Fioor Covering tnstalied
Front and Rear Alr Conditioning Instatled
Front Air Bags instalied
Deors Double Side & Rear
Full Length Head Liner w/insulation Gide &
Interior Quarter Panel
Rear Step Bumper installed EPA EPA
HGWY CiTY
Price Each Gasoline $20,440.00 Not Rated Not Rated
Price £ach Bi-Fuel $20,440.00 Mot Rated Not Rated
Price Each Diesel $No Bid
Options:
AMIFM w/ CD Player $180.40
Shiop/Service Manual SN/A
CD Service Manual SN/A
Tilt Wheet & Cruise Gontrol §377.60
Keyless Entry $149.60 Req. Opt 6
Power Windows f Power | ocks $418.00
Limnited Siip Rear End $289.00
Diesel Engine FN/A
Extended Length $2,980.00
Sliding Side Door $132.00
Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) $139.00
Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) $139.00
Slush/All Weather Mats {Cargo) $139.00
Side Air Bags $Std.
Exterior colors $132.00 Met. Paint
Delete Center Row Seats (Deduct) . (3460.00) Also Deleies 1
Delete Third Row Seats (Deduct) o $ -See 18
FOB Dealership: {Deduct) - ($35.00)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mite $1.89

Additionat Information:




State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Purchase Order o

CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER
MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES,
INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS,

ALL STATE AGENCIES

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

BY ORDER

QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS PUR-
CHASE ORDER $HOULD BE DIRECTED
TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.

X¥709035314

306-485~6610

MATHENY MOTOR TRUCK COMPANY
PO BOX 1304

PARKERSBURG WV 26102

26102

ALL STATE AGENCI
AND POLITICAL S

BY ORDER

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR
TERMS AND CONDITIONS
ES
UBDIVISIONS

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

EREIGHT TERMS!

ACCOUNT NUMBER

PREPAID

MUL-MUL

LINE

0001

CATNO

070-06101-000

ITEM NUMBE

SIGNATURE

ECEIPT TICKET FOR PURCHASE ORDER:

DESCRIPTION

2010 (OR CURRENT MODEL YEAR) MOTOR

DATE

MV10A

QTY DATE

IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE []

APPROVED AS TO FORM BY
~ ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL

JO ANN ADKINS
BY.

T 306-558-880>

PURCHASING DIVISION AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE



