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GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
PURCHASE ORDER/CONTRACT

1. ACCEPTANCE: Seller shall be bound by this order and its terms and conditions upon receipt of this order.

2. APPLICABLE LAW: The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing
Division shall govern all rights and duties under the Contract, including without limitation the validity of this
Purchase Order/Contract.

3. NON-FUNDING: Al services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Orders/Contracts are to be
continued for the terms of the Purchase Order/Confract, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the
Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available
for these services or goods, this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.

4. COMPLIANCE: Seller shall comply with all Federal, State and local laws, regulations and ordinances including,
but not limited to, the prevailing wage rates of the WV Division of Labor.

5. MODIFICATIONS: This writing is the parties final expression of intent. No modification of this order shall be
binding unless agreed fo in writing by the Buyer.

6. ASSIGNMENT: Neither this Order nor any monies due, or to become due hereunder may be assigned by the
Selter without the Buyer's consent.

7. WARRANTY: The Seller expressly warrants that the goods and/or services covered by this order will:
{a} conform to the specifications, drawings, samples or other description furnished or specified by the
Buyer; {b} be merchantable and fit for the purpose intended; andfor {c} be free from defect in material
and workmanship.

8. CANCELLATION: The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written
notice fo the selier.

9. SHIPPING, BILLING & PRICES: Prices are those stated in this order. No price increase will be accepted
without written authority from the Buyer. Al goods or services shall be shipped on or before the date
specified in this Order.

10. LATE PAYMENTS: Payments may only be made after the delivery of goods or services. Interest may be
paid on late payments in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

11. TAXES: The State of West Virginia is exempt from Federal and State taxes and will not pay or reimburse
such taxes.

12. RENEWAL: Any reference to automafic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon
mutual written agreement of the parties.

13. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendot/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, this Contract may be
deemed null and void, and terminated without further order.

14. HIPAA BUSINESSE ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and avaflable online at the Purchasing Division's web site
(http:/fiwww . state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vre/hipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that,
the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health
Information {45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

15. WEST VIRGINIA ALCOHOL & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT: If this Confract consfitutes a public improvement
construction coniract as set forth in Aricle 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code ("The West Virginia Alcohol
and Drug-Fres Workglace Act’), then the following language shall hereby become part of this Coniract: "The
coniractor and its subconfraciors shall implement and maintain a written drug-free workplace poficy in compliance
with the West Virginia Alcohol and Drug-Free Workplace Act, as set forth in Adicle 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code.  The contractor and its subcontractors shall provide a swomn statement in writing, under the
penalties of perjury, that they maintain a valid drug-free work place policy in compliance with the West Virginia
and Drug-Free Workplace Act. It is understood and agreed that this Contract shall be cancelled by the awarding
authority if the Contractor: 1) Falls fo implement its drug-free workplace policy; 2) Fails to provide information
regarding implementation of the contractor's drug-free workplace policy at the request of the public authority; or
3) Provides to the public authority false information regarding the contractor’s drug-free workplace policy.”

Rev. 7/01/08
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Matheny Motor Truck Co.

VIBE, SMALL STATION WAGON, FWD,GAS, 4-DOOR,

CLASS 2A 25L26 14,641.00

CLASS 3 GB, MIDSIZE, 4-DOOR, FWD GAS, 2ZG6% 14,789.00
SIERRA, LARGE PICKUP, 2 WHEEL DRIVE, SHORT BED,

CLASS 12 GAS, TC10703 14,387.00
CANYON, SMALL PICKUP, 4 WHEEL DRIVE, SHORT

CLASS 16 BED, GAS, TT15403 16,759.00
CANYON, MIDSIZE PICKUP, FRONT-HINGED, FULL SIZE
DOORS, 4 WHEEL DRIVE, 4 DOOR CREW CAB, GAS,

CLASS 17 A |TT156643 $18,5690.00

SIERRA, LARGE PICKUP, 4 WHEEL DRIVE, SHORT BED,

CLASS 18 FLEX-FUEL, TK10703 $17,908.00
SIERRA, CHASSIS CAB, 4 WHEEL DRIVE, SINGLE REAR

CLASS 20 WHEELS, GAS, TK20903 $18,745.00
SAVANA 1500, VAN, CARGO, 135" WHEELBASE, GAS,

CLASS 22 TG13405 $16,128.00
SAVANA 2500, VAN, CARGO, EXTENDED BODY, 155"

CLASS 23 WHEELBASE, GAS, TG23705 $17,340.00
SAVANA 2500, VAN, CARGO, EXTENDED BODY, 155"

CLASS 23 WHEELBASE, DIESEL, TG23705 $23,585.00
SAVANA 2500, VAN, CARGO, 135' WHEEL BASE, RWD,

CLASS 23A  |GAS, TG23405 $15,5698.00

SAVANA, VAN, SMALL REAR WHEEL DRIVE, EIGHT

CLASS 25 PASSENGER, FLEX-FUEL, TG13406 $17,494.00
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CLASS 2A

SMALL STATION WAGON, FRONT 6
WHEEL DRIVE, 4 DOOR 2700 GVWR 070-06-02-010
inciudes but is not limited to: Pontiac Vibe, Toyola Matrix, VW Jefta Sportewagon
Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck Co
Manufacturer / Brand Pontiac Vibe
Delivery 90-120 Days
Mode! Name Vibe
Mode! Number: 28126
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 127 HP 133 TORQUE 132 133
Transmission Autornalic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM
Glass Al Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounis Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Included - widack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Front Seat Bucket
Air Conditioning installed
Fioor Mats installed
Front Air Bags Installed
EPA EPA
Price Each $14,641.00 HGWY CITY
Price Each Flex-Fuel $No Bid
31/ 26
/ 7
Options: .
AM/FM with CD Player $Std
Shop/Service Manual $139.00
Tilt Wheel & Cruise control $805.00
Keyiess Entry $Req Opt 3
Power Windows - Power Doors $Reg Opt 3
Side Air Bags $Std
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct) $0
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) {$49.00)
EOB Other than Meiro Charleston - Per Mile $1.30

Additional Information:




CLASS 3 AUTOMOBILE

Midsize, 4 Door, Front Wheeal Drive, Wheslbase 107.47
Includes but ts not fimited fo: Toyota Camry, Saturn Aura, Chevrole Malibu

Vendor Name:

Matheny Motor Truck Co

070-06-03-000

7

© 00~ T UL BN

NManutackurer / Brand Pontiac
Detivery &60-120 Days
Model Name & Number 6 27669
HP TOR
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 160 HP 156 TORQUE 164 158
Transmission . Automnatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ARS
Radio AMIFM
Glass Al Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plae Mounts Front & Rear
Fouef Tank Fatiory Standard
Power Windows and Locks Instalied
Thes All Season
Spare Tire Standard Tire wf Jack
Rear Window/Defogger Instalied
Front Seat Standard Seating
Air Condifioning Instalied
Floor Mals Instalied
Seating Capacity 5 '
Front Air Bags Instalied
EOA EQA
HEWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline $14,798.00 30 22
Price Each Flex Fuel % No Bid
Options:
AMIEM w/ CD Player $5id.
Shop/Service Manual $128.00
D Service Manual $Not Availabie
Tilt Wheet & Cruise Control $656.85
Keyless Entry $lnc. opt 4
Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors $5td wiout heated mirrors
6-way Power driver seat {fequires Power Windows & doors) $166.00
Side Air Bags : $5id,
Exterior colors $410.85 Basic Colors N
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct) % -Not Available

$ -Mot Available
$ -Not Available
{$65.00)
$1.39

Manua! Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)
Remove Console (Delete) (Console between saals)
FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charieston - Per Mile

Additional Information:
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CLASS 12 TRUCK
Large Pickup, 2 Whael Drive
5000 GVWR, Short Bed

Inchides but is not fimited to: Ford F150, Dodge 1500, Chavrolet 1500

Vendor Name:

Manufacturer / Brand
Dellvery
Model Name & Number

Mathany Motor Truck Co.

GMC

80-180 Days

Sierre TC10703

070-48-12-001

HP TOROUE

Standard Equipment Reguirements: 185 266
Engine MiN 185 HP 235 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power
Radio AMIFEM
Glzss All Tinted
Wirrors Left & Right Ouiside
License Plale Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fieeiside
Bumper Rear Step Factory installed
Tires Al Season
Spare Tire Full Size wiJack
Air Conditioning ingtelled
From Seat Bench EPA EPA
Rubber Floor Covering Instalied HEWY CiTY
Front Air Bags Instalied
Price Each Gasoline $14,387.00 20 15
Hybrid $No Bid
Flex Fuel $hio Bid
Options:
AMIEM wi GD Player $195.05
Shop/Service Manual $120.00
CD Service Manual INJA
Tt Whee! & Cruise Control $207.50
Limited Slip Rear End $268.75

$336.15

Keyless Entry
Power Windows / Power Locks

$829.17 Inc. Dpt 6

Tow Hooks $41.50
{Long Bed $389.00
Exterior colors FNIC
Siide Rear Window SN/A
Side Alr Bags ) SN/A
Engine Options Option 1: & $867.35
Engine Options Option 2: $1,365.35
SlushiAll Weather Mats {Driver & Passenger} $79.00
Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) §78.00
Slush/All Weather Mals {Cargo) EN/A
Bed Liner $185.00
Crew Cab $6,620.05
Extended Cab $3,683.92
Manua! Transmission wiOverdrive (Deduct) 3 -N/A
Delete Cloth Seats (Deduct) 30
Detote Carpel (Deduct) 30
Delate Truck Bed (Deduct) $0
FOB Dealership: {Deduct) {§35)
$1.39

EDB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Additional information:




CLASS 18 TRUCK
Small Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive,
4500 GVWR, Short Bed
includes but ke not firnited to: GMC Canyon, Chevrolet Colorado

076-48-16-000

Vendor Name: Matheny Motor Truck Co.
Marnufacturer / Brang GMC
Deitvery 50-120 Days
hodel Name & Number Canyon 1115403
HP TORQUE
Standard Equitpment Reguirements:
Engine MIN: 207 HP 238 TORQUE 242 242
Transmission Aulomatic
Steering Power
Brakes Powsr
Radlo AMIFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors fefl & Right Outside
Ucense Plate Mounis Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetzide
Bumper Rear Step Faciory Installed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size wiack
Air Conditioning Instalied
Front Seat Bench
Auto Locking Hubs Instalied
Standard Floor Covering installed EPA EPA
Front Air Bags Instalied
HEWY CITY
21 15
Price Each Gasoline $16,758.00
Price Each Fiex Fuel SNFA
Options:
$373.85

Off Road Package Inciuding Limited Slip Rear, Includes:

Axle-rac-lok differential
Engine Cooling ~ haavy duty
Skid plate Group
Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks
All Terrain Tires
Tow Hooks
AM/FM w/ CD Player
Shop/Service Manual

!

Enter total off road pkg above

$204.65

$128.00

CD Service Manual SN/A

Tilt Wheel & Gruise Control $514d.

Keyless Entry $Reguire Opt. 7
Power Windows [ Power Locks $415.00

Tow Package $224.10

Long Bed SN/A

Slush/All Weather Matz (Driver & Passenger)

$79.00

Shish/Al Weathes Mats {Second Row) $79,00
Stush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) SNIA
Bed Liner $182.00
Side Air Bags $327.85
Exterior colors " SNIC
Slide Rear Window S $145.25
Manual Transmission wiOverdrive (Deduct) $ -NA
belete Cloth Seats (Deduct) 30
Belete Carpet (Deduct) g0
FOB Dealership: {Deduct} {$60.00)
$1.38

FOB Other than Mefto Charleston - Per Mile

Addifional Information:




CLASS 17A TRUCK

Midsize Pickup, Froni-Hinged, Full Size Doors,
4 Wheel Drive, 4 Door Crew Cab, 4850 GVWR

inciudes but is not limited io: GMC Canyon, Chavratst Colorado

Vendor Name:

Matheny Moetor Truck Co.

070-48-17-010 10

Axie-trac-lok differential
Engine Cooling - heavy duty
Skid plate Group
Suspension - Heavy Duty Wigas Shocks
All Terrain Tires
Tow Hooks
AMFM w CD Player
ShopfService Manual
CD Service Manual
Tilt Wheet & Cruise Conirol
Tow Package
Side Air Bags
Exterior colors
Slide Rear Window
Kevyless Entry
power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors
Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)
Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)
Slush/All Weather Mats {Cargo)
Bed Liner
Carpet Interior
Rear Jump Seat
Manus! Transtnission w/Overdrive (Deduct)
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)
Delete Cioth Seats (Deduct)
£0OB. Dealership: {Deduct)
£0B Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Additional Information:

shanufacturer / Brand GMC

Delivery 60-120 Davys

wiotdel Name & Number Canyon 71156843

HP TORQUE

Standard Equipment Requirements:
Enging : MIN: 210 HP 225 TORQUE 242 242
Transmission Automatic

Steering FPower

Brakes PowearlABS

Radio AMIFM

Glass All Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Outside

License Plate Mounls Front & Rear

Cargo Box Fleetside

Bumper Rear Step Fagtory Inslalled

Tires All Season

Spare Tire Full Size widack

Alr Conditioning Installed

Front Seat Standard Seafing EPA EPA
Auts Locking Hubs Instalied HGWY CITY
Standard Floor Covering tnstalled

Fronl Air Bags installed 21 15
Price Each Gasoling $19,588.00

Price Each Flex Fuet FN/A

Options:

Off Road Package Incluging Limited Skip Rear, Includes: $373.85

t

Enter total off road pkg above

$788.50

$126.00

SN/A

$54d.

$224.10

$327.85

$N/C

$145.25

$Sid.

$51d.

$78.00

§78.00

SN/A

$182.00

$Sid.

$S4d.

5 -N/IA

"
R N

30

$ -NA

{§60.00)

$1.39
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CLASS 18 TRUCK
Large Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive,
5400 GVWR, Short Bed

070-48-18-000 11

includes but is not limited to: Toyola Tacoma, GMC 1500, Dodge Ram 1500, Ford Fi50

Vendor Name:

Matheny Motor Truck Ce.

Off Road Package including Limited S$iip Rear, includes:

Axle-rac-lok difierential
Enging Cooling - heavy duty
Skid plate Group
Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks
AR Terzain Tires
Tow Hooks
AMIEM w! CD Player
Shop/Service Manual
CD Service Manual
Titt Whes! & Crulse Control
Tow Package
Snow Plow Package
Exterior colors
Side Rear Window
Keyless Entry
Power Windows, Locks, Power Healed Mirrors
Side Alr Bags
Shssh/Al Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)
StushiAl Weather Mats {Second Row)
Slush/Al Weather Mats (Cargo}
Bed Liner
Carpet interior
Cloth Seats
l.ong Bed
Rear Jump Seat
Extended Cab wf Third and Fourth Roor
Engine Option Size: 5.3
& Cylinder (Deduct)
Manual Transmisston wiOverdrive {Deduct)
Delete Fioor Mats (Deduct}
Dalete Cioth Seats (Deduct)
FOB Deatership: {Deduct}
FOR Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Addifionai information:

Wanufacturer / Brand GG
Debvery S0-180 Days
hiotiel Name & Mumber Sierra TKAD703
. HP TORQUE
Standarg Equipment Reguttrements:
Engihe MK 231 HP 283 TORQUE 285 305
Transmission ALipmatic
Steering Power
Brakes PowerfABS
Radip AM/FM
Glass All Tinted
dirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts From & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Step Facipry nstallzd
Tires All Season
. Spare Tire Full Size widack
Air Conditioning Installed
Front Seat Bench
Ao Locking Hubs Ingtalled
Standard Floor Covering Instatied
Eront Al Bags nstalled EPA ERA
HGWY CITY

Price Each Gasolne 17, 548.00
Price Each Flex Fuel $17,808.00 18 15
Hybrid $No Bid

Flex Fuel 14 14
Cplions:

$O87.30 -4

$358.20

Fizap

)

Enter tofai u‘i’f road pkg above

$195.05

$128.00

ENIA

$207.80

$638.10

$336.15

SN/C

FNIA

$369.35

$828.,17

$NA

§$79.00

$78.00

SNIA

$182.00

FNIA

$0

$2B3.50

$Std. with opt. 21

$3.617.95

$1,.282.35

15756.00)

$ -NA

0

$0

{560.007

$1.39

¥

Tow Pka: Hitch, Wiring, H.D. Suspension, H.D. Ceoling

Snow Plow Prep: 160 Amp A, H.0. Cooling, Wiring kg, Skid Plate Pkg.




CLASS 20 TRUCK
Chassis Cab, 4 Wheel Drive,
S000 BVWR, Single Rear Wheels
inciudes but is ot krmited to) Dodos Ram 2500, GMC Slerra 2500

070-48-20-001 12

Vendor Name:

Manufaciurer / Brand
Delivery
WModel Narme & Number

hatheny Motor Truck Co.

GMC

G0-180 Days

Siarra TR20903

HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requiretnenis:
Engine WMIn: 300 HP 360 TORQUE 360 380
Transroission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes PowerfAES
Radio AWM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Lefi & Right Ouiside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Single Rear Wheels instalied
Tires All Season Load Range D
Fual Tank 20 Gallons Minimum
Air Conditioning instalied
Fronl Seat Benth
Standard Floor Covering Ins{alied
Front Air Bags Instelied
DIESEL GABOLINE
58" Cab to Axle $24,961.00 $18,745.00
Options:
$523.25

Of Road Package including Limited Skp Rear, includes:

Axie-frac-lok differentiat

Engine Covling - heavy duty

Skid plate Group

Suspension - Heavy Duty w/Gas Shocks
All Terrain Tires

Engine Cooling Heavy Duty

AMIFM wf CD Player $185.05
Shop/Service Manuai $129.00
CD Service Manual SN/A
Tit Wheel & Cruise Control $207.50
Keviess Entry $269.35
power Windows / Power Locks $828.17
Back ~Up Alarm $108.00
Tow Package $577.00
Snow Plow Package $236.55
Side Alr Bags SHIA
Exderior colors SNIC
Slide Rear Window $NIA
Siush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) $79.06
Siush/all Weather Mats (Second Row} $78.00
Siush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) SNA
Duel Gas Tanks SHA
Flatbed & 1.ong (see attached speciications) §2,448.00
Utifity Bed B' Long (see altached specifications) $5,758.00
Crane (see aftached specifications) $8,534.00
Extended Cab w Third and Fourth Door $3,711.32
Crew Cab - Front Hinged Doors £4,425.97
Gascline Enging: § Cyl, 7.0 (Deduct) & -N/A
2 Wheel Drive (Deducl) {$2,267.75)
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct} 0
Delete Cloth Seats {Deduct) $0
Manual Transmission w/Qverdrive {Deduct) § N/A
FOB Dealership: {Deduct) ($35.00)
FOB Other than Metro Charlesten - Per Mile 51,38
$83.00

Available Axie Ratios

Tow Pkg: Hifch, wiring, brake control

1

Enter Total Off Rd Pkg Above

Snow Plow: 160 Amp Alt, Skid Plates, Wiring Pkg.
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“Vendor Name:

CLASS 22 VAN, CARGO
B500 GVWR, 108" Wheelbase
includes but is not fimited fo: Express, GMC Savanna

Mathany Motor Truck Co.

13
070-92-22-001

Manufacturer / Brand GMC
Delivery 80-180 Days
Mode! Name & Number Savan TG13405
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Reguirements: :
Enging MIN: 180 HP 210 TORQUE 105 260
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AMIFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Quiside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Step Bumper installed
Tires Ali Season
Spare Tie Full Size widack
Air Conditioning Installed
Seating Capacity 2 Passenger Seat
Front Air Bags - Installed
EPA EPA
RWD HGWY CITY

Price Each Gasoline $16,128.00 20 15
Price Each Flax-Fuel $16,824.00

Flex-Fuel 18 14
(Options:
AMIFM w/ CD Player $294.65
Shop/Service Manual $129.00
CD Service Manual SN/A
Tit Whee! & Cruise Control $327.85
Lirrited Slip Rear End $260.75
Tow Package: Transmission Cooler $218.95

H. D. Engine Cooler
Keyless Entry
Power Windows / Power Locks
Side Air Bags
Glass Al Around
Rear Door Window/Glass
Side Door Window/Glass
Exterior Colors
FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

FOB Other than Melro Charleston - Per Mile

Additional Information:

Trim Panels Side & Rear Cargo Doors Add; §78.85

$Sid.

$141,10 Requires Opt 8

$394.25

$361.05

$261.45

$49.80

$107.20

$124.50

($60.00}

$1.38

Rear Cargo Mat: Add 74.70
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. Vendor Name:

CLASS 23 VAN, CARGO
Exiended Body, 8500 GVWR 138" Wheselbase
Inclugdes but is not fimited to: GMC Savanna

Matheny Motor Truck Co.

070-92-23-001 1 4

Manufacturer / Brand GMC
Deiivery _ 90-120 Days
Model Name & Number Savana TG23705
HP TORQUE

Standard Equipment Requiremments:
Engine MiN: 255 HP 285 TORQUE 279 284
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AMIEM
Glass All Tinted
Mitrrors Left & Right Outside
License Piale Mounis Front & Rear
Tires All Beason
Spare Tire Full Size w/Jack
Rubber Floor Matting Installed
Air Conditioning Installed
Front Air Bags Installed
Doors Double Side & Rear

) Loading Doors w/Glass
Seating Capacity 2 Passenger Seat
Price Each Gasoling $17,24€.00
Price Each Diesel $23,585.00
Price Each Flex-Fuel $No Bid
Options:
AMIFM w/ CD Player $204.65
Shop/Service Manual $128.00
CD Service Manual SN/A
Titt Wheel & Cruise Control $327.85
Limited Slip Rear End $269.75
Engine Options: Option 1 _ $825.85
Engine Options: Option 2: i SN/A
Drivers Side Cargo Door $586.10
All Wheel Drive SN/A
Keviess Entry $141.10 Requires Opt. 10
Power Windows / Power Locks $384.25
Rear Door Window/Glass $49.80
Side Sliding Door w/Glass $124.50
Glass Sides $261.45
Teiescopic Trailer Tow Mirrors SN/A
Rear Rubber Floor Maiting $74.70
Exterior colors $124.50
FOB Dealership; (Deduct) _ ($80.00) ‘
FOB Other than Metro Charieston - Per Mile s $1.39

Additional information:
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CLASS 23A VAN, CARGO
8500 GVWR, 135" Wheelbase

Matheny Motor Truck Co.

Manufacturer / Brand

Delivery »
Model Name & Number

GMC
90-180 Days
Savanaz TG23405

15
070-92-23-002

H# TORQUE
Standard Eqguipment Reqguirements:
Engine MIN: 225 HP 286 TORQU 279 294
Engine MIN: 154 HP 286 TORQU 250 460
Transmission Automatic
Steering Fower
Brakes Power/ABS
Radic AM/EM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Piate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size wiJack
Alr Conditioning Installed
Seafing Capacity 2 Passenger Seat
Front Air Bags instalied
FWD RWD
Price Each Gasoline $No Bid $15,508.00
Price Each Diesel $No Bid $21,829.00
Price Each Flex Fuel $No Bid $No Bid
Options:
AMFEM w/ CD Player SNo Bid $294.65
Shop/Service Manual $No Bid $129.00
CD Service Manual $No Bid SN/A
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control $No Bid '$327.85:
Limited Slip Rear End $No Bid $269.75
Tow Package: Transmission Cooler $No Bid $219.95
H. D. Engine Cooler $No Bid $78.85
Keyless Entry $No Bid $141.10 Requ
Power Windows / Power Locks $No Bid $394.25
Glass All Around $No Bid $261.45
Side Air Bags $No Bid $361.05
Step Bumper $No Bid $Std.
Telescopic Trailer Tow Mirrors $No Bid SN/A
Rear Rubber Floor Matting $No Bid $74.70
Exterior Colors $No Bid $124.50
FOR Dealership: (Deduct) $No Bid {$60.00)
FOR Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile $No Bid $1.39

Additional Information:
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CLASS 25 VAN

Small Rear Wheel Drive, 070-93-25-000 1 6
125" Wheel Base, Eight Passenger
Includes but is not imited to; GMC Savannha
Vendor Name: Matheny Motar Truck Co.
Manufacturer / Brand GMC
Delivery 80-180 Days
Wodel Name & Number Savana TG13400
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 2258 HP 286 TORQUE 301 325
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ARS
Radic AMIFM
Glass All Tinted, Sides and Rear .
Mirrors | Left & Right Ouside - 5" x 8" Minimurm
lLicense Plaie Mounts Front & Rear
Seating 8 Passenper
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size w/dack
Vinvl Flooring installed
Air Conditioning Instalied
Doors Double Side & Rear
Frort Air Bags Instafied
Fuli Length Head Liner w/lnsulation Side &
interior Quarter Panel
Rear Step Bumper instalied EPA EPA
HGWY CITY

Price Each Gasoline $17.484.00
Price Each Flex-Fuet $17,494.00 16 2
Price Each Diesel SN/A
Options:
AMFM wf CD Player $170.15
ShopiService Manual $225.00
CD Service Manual SN/A
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control $327.85
Limited Slip Rear End $Sid.
Keyless Entry $Requires Opt. 7
Power Windows $394.25
All Wheel Drive $8,056.38
V.8 Gasoline Engine $5id,
Carpet Interior $153.66
Siush/All Weather Maels (Driver & Passenger) $79.00
Stush/Al Weather Mats {Second Row) $79.00
Stush/All Weather Mats {Cargo) $149,00
Sunscreen Glass $Stid.
Sliding Side Door $124.50
Swing Side Door (One Side) $Sid.
Swing Side Door (Both Sides) SN/A
Side Air Bags $Std,
interior upgrade (carpet & insulation pkg) $302.95

$124.50

Exterior colors
Delete Center Row Seats (Deduct)

" Delete Third Row Seats (Deduct)

FOB Dealership: (Deduct) ‘
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Additional tnformation:

$ - Requipre Opt. 222

$ -711.31 Requires Opt. 21

{§60.00)

$1.3¢




SPECS CLASS 20, 204, 33

SPECIFICATIONS FOR FLAT BED, DUMP BED, AND UTILITY BODY ARE
ASLISTED

FLAT BED MODEL PVMXS838 OR APPROVED EQUAL

CLASS 20
56” CA CAB AND CHASSIS SINGLE REAR WHEEL

*8* LONG X 78” WIDE STEEL PLATFORM BODY WITH 2 X 6 TREATED PINE
WOOD FLOOR

*36” TALL TAPERED BULKHEAD WITH SCREEN WINDOW

*ICC BUMPER, MARKFER LIGHTS, REAR MUDFLAPS MEET FMVSS STDS.
*MOUNTING TO PROPERLY FIT CHASSIS

*PAINTED BLACK

FLAT BED MODEL PVMX93 OR APPROVED EQUAL

CLASS 20A & 33

60” CA CAB AND CHASSIS DUAL REAR WHEEL

*0’ LONG X 95” WIDE STEEL PLATFORM BODY WITH 2 X 6 TREATED PINE
WOOD FLOOR

*36” TALL TAPERED BULKHEAD WITH SCREEN WINDOW

*ICC BUMPER, MARKER LIGHTS, REAR MUDFLAPS MEET FMVSS STDS.
*MOUNTING TO PROPERLY FIT CHASSIS

*PAINTED BLACK

FLAT BED MODEL PVMX123 OR APPROVED EQUAL CLASS 20A & 33

84” CA CAB AND CHASSIS DUAL REAR WHEEL

#12° LONG X 95” WIDE STEEL PLATFORM BODY WITH 2 X 6 TREATED PINE
WOOD FLOOR

#36” TALL TAPERED BULKHEAD WITH SCREEN WINDOW

*ICC BUMPER, MARKER LIGHTS, REAR MUDFLAPS MEET FMVSS STDS.
*MOUNTING TO PROPERLY FIT CHASSIS |
*PAINTED BLACK

DUMP BODY MODEL 100U GALION OR APPROVED EQUAL CLASS 20A &
33

60" CA CAB AND CHASSIS DUAL REAR WHEEL

#8.5° LONG X 13” TALL SIDES X 22” TALL TAILGATE (ALL 10 GA.STEEL)

*14 X 84 CAB SHIELD (23” LONG X 84” WIDE)

*MARKER LIGHTS, ICC BUMPER, REAR MUD FLAPS MEET FMVSS STDS.
*STEEL MUD GUARDS IN FRONT OF REAR WHEELS

*PAINTED BLACK

*PES24DAE HOIST APPROX 8 TON CAPACITY

17



*12 DC VOLT ELECTRIC HYDRAULIC POWER UNIT WITH PUSH BUTTON
CONTROLER ON AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION CAB AND CHASSIS
NOTE: PTO, DIRECT MOUNT HYDRAULIC PUMP, DUMP
VALVE(ELECTRIC OR CABLE SHIFT),AND RESERVOIR 1F PTO
APPLICATION IS AVATLABLE ON MANUAL TRANSMISSION

DUMP BODY MODEL 100U GALION OR APPROVED EQUAL CLASS 20A &
33

84” CA CAB AND CHASSIS DUAL REAR WHEEL

*10.5° LONG X 13" TALL SIDES X 22” TALL TAILGATE (ALL 10 GA. STEEL)
*1/2 X 84 CAB SHIELD (23” LONG X 84” WIDE)

*MARKER LIGHTS, ICC BUMPER, REAR MUDFLAPS MEET FMVSS STDS.
*STEEL MUD GUARDS IN FRONT OF REAR WHEELS

*PAINTED BLACK .

*PF624DAE HOIST APPROX 11 TON CAPACITY ‘

*12 VOLT DC ELECTRIC HYDRAULIC POWER UNIT WITH PUSH BUTTON
CONTROLLER ON AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION CAB AND CHASSIS
NOTE:PTO, DIRECT MOUNT HYDRAULIC PUMP, DUMP
VALVE(ELECTRIC OR CAB SHIFT), AND RESERVOIR JF PTO
APPLICATION IS AVAILABLE ON MANUAL TRANSMISSION

FAN BELT DRIVEN UNDERHOOD HYDRAULIC PUMP WITH ELECTRIC
CLUTCH IF PTO IS NOT AVAILABLE

UTILITY BODY 98ASW READING UTILITY BODY OR APPROVED EQUAL

CLASS 20
56” CA CAB AND CHASSIS SINGLE REAR WHEEL
*97” LONG X 76.5” WIDE X 40" VERTICAL COMPARTMENT HEIGHT X 48.5”

WIDE FLOOR X 14” DEEP COMPARTMENTS

*RECESSED TAIL LIGHTS, RUBBER GROMETS, OEM STYLE PLUG IN WIRING

HARNESS
*STD. BODY SHELVING PACKAGE WITH ADJUSTABLE SHELVES AND

DIVIDERS

*MARKER LIGHTS, REFLECTORS MEET FMVSS STDS.
*8” REAR STEP BUMPER

*PAINTED WHITE

18



UTILITY BODY 108ADW READING UTILITY BODY OR APPROVED EQUAL

CIL.ASS 20A.& 33

60" CA CAB AND CHASSIS DUAL REAR WHEEL

£107" LONG X 93" WIDE X 40” VERTICAL COMPARTMENT HEIGHT X 48.5%
WIDE FLOOR X 20 DEEP COMPARTMENTS

*RECESSED TAIL LIGHTS, RUBBER GROMETS, OEM STYLE PLUG IN WIRING

HARNESS
*STD. BODY SHELVING PACKAGE WITH ADJUSTABLE SHELVES AND

DIVIDERS
*MARKER LIGHTS, REFLECTORS, REAR MUD FLAPS MEET FMVSS STDS,

*8” REAR STEP BUMPER
*PAINTED WHITE

UTILITY BODY 132ADW READING UTILITY BODY OR APPROVED EQUAL

CLASS 20A & 33

84” CA CAB AND CHASSIS DUAL REAR WHEEL

£132” LONG X 93” WIDE X 40” VERTICAL COMPARTMENT HEIGHT X 48.5”
WIDE FLOOR X 20” DEEP COMPARTMENTS

*RECESSED TAIL LIGHTS, RUBBER GROMETS, OEM PLUG IN WIRING

HARNESS
*$TD. BODY SHELVING PACKAGE WITH ADJUSTABLE SHELVES AND

DIVIDERS
*MARKER LIGHTS, REFLECTORS REAR MUD FLAPS MEET FMVSS STDS.

+8” REAR STEP BUMPER
*PAINTED WHITE

OPTIONS:

CRANE 56" CA SINGLE REAR WHEEL 8800 GVWR CAB AND CHASSIS
CLASS 20 OPTION TELESCOPIC CRANE TO BE USED WITH UTILITY BODY
*LIFTING CAPACITY OF 2000 LBS. @ 3' (6500 FT. LB. RATING),MANUAL
BOOM EXTEND FROM 5.5' TO 9/,

*12 VOLT DC ELECTRIC HYDRAULIC POWER ROTATION POWER BOOM
ELEVATION

*12 VOLT DC ELECTRIC POWER HOIST WITH 35' X 1/4" CABLE

*SWIVEL BLOCK, HOOK, LATCH

*PENDANT CONTROLLER WITH 18' CORD

*OVERLOAD PROTECTION
*INSTALL IN RIGHT REAR OF UTILITY BODY LOAD SPACE FLOOR

*BODY TO BE REINFORCED FOR CRANE
*CRANE BOOM SUPPORT

19
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*REMOVABLE TJACKLEG TYPE QUTRIGGER WITH SCREWBASE ON CRANE
SIDE

*BUILD UP-RIGHT REAR CHASSIS SUSPENSION SPRINGS LEVEL TO
ACCOMMODATE ADDITIONAL CRANE WEIGHT

CRANE 60” CA & 847 CA 3203PR15 AUTOCRANE OR APPROVED EQUAL
CLASS 20A & 33 UTILITY BODY OPTION

#3200 LB. @ 3° LIFTING CAPACITY, 15" MANUAL BOOM EXTEND, 12 VOLT
ELECTRIC HYDRAULIC POWER ROTATION & BOOM ELEVATION, 12VOLT
POWER HOIST, OVERLOAD PRTECTION, PLUG IN PENDANT CONTROL,
INSTALLED ON RIGHT REAR COMPARTMENT TOP, UTILITY BODY
MANUFACTURES APPROVED COMPARTMENT REIFORCEMENT FOR 16,000
FT. LBS.(4000 LB. CRANE), CRANE BOOM SUPPORT, REMOVAL MEDIUM
DUTY JACKLEG TYPE OUTRIGGER WITH SCREW BASE ON CRANE SIDE,
BUILD UP RIGHT REAR CHASSIS SUSPENSION SPRINGS LEVEL TO
ACCOMIDATE ADDITIONAL CRANE WEIGHT

PAINT ALL BODIES COLORS OTHER THAN WHITE

LIGHT BAR HALOGEN CLASS 20, 204, 33, 33A

PART # 776 A PETERSON OR EQUAL

*4 HATL OGEN ROTATORS & DIAMOND MIRRORS

*DRIP RAIL OR DOOR JAM TYPE MOUNTING (NO CENTER CAB ROOF

MOUNTING)
+*WIRING AND SWITCH SUFFICANT FOR LIGHT BAR MODEL




SPECS - CLASS 20, 20A 33

PAINTINGS:

DETAIL/DECORATIVE STRIPES WITH LOGO

WIDTH: SHALL BE 1 INCH WITH TAPER AT FRONT OF HOOD

WVDOH LOGO (TO BE SUPPLIED BY WVDOH (BLACK AND WHITE COPY) AND IS APPROXIMATELY 7"
TALL BY 7" WIDE AREA BEHIND LOGO AND WITHIN 1/2" OF LOGO IS NOT TC BE STRIPED. STRIPES
SHOULD BE CUT TO FOLLOW CONTOUR OF LOGO, IN LIEU OF STRAIGHT CUT.

STRIPING MATERIAL SHALL MEET THE REQUIREMENTS OF ASTM 04956—9‘1 TYPE V SHEETING, A
SUPER HIGH-INTENSITY RETROFLECTIVE SHEETING CONSISTING OF MICRO PRISMATIC
RETROFLECTIVE ELEMENTS. THE CONSPICUITY SHEETING MUST MEET THE REQUIREMENT OF
NHSTA, DODT, 49CFR, PART 571 FEDERAL MOTOR VEHICKLE SAFETY STANDARDS FOR
CONSPICUITY SHEETING AND BE "DOT APPROVED",

THE SHEETING FOR BOTH APPLICATIONS ABOVE SHALL NOT B MORE THAN 0.008 INCH THICK
HAVING APPROXIMATELY 47,000 MICRO PRISMS PER SQUARE INCH AND SHALL COME WITH AN
AGGRESSIVE HIGH TACK PRESSURE SENSITIVE ADHESIVE, REFLECTIVE OR EQUIVALENT,
UPPER STRIP COLOR: DARK BLUE

LOWER STRIPE COLOR: LIGHT GOLD

SUCCESSFUL VENDOR SHOULD CONSULT WITH AGENCY PERSONNEL ON PROPOSED STRIPING
BEFORE PLACING ORDER WITH MANUFACTURER.

IN ORDER TO TEST THE ADHESIVE QUALITY OF THE PAINT, THE DOH MAY AT ITS OPTION,

REQUIRE THAT THE VENDOR MEASURE ADHESION BY THE CRITERIA SET FORTH IN ASTM D3359-74,

METHOD B. A RATING OF LESS THAN 4 ON THIS TEST WOULD BE DEEMED UNACCEPTABLE.

MANUFACTURER'S STANDARD PLANT PAINTING PROCEDURES FOR CLEANING, DEGREASING,
PREPARING, PRIMING AND PAINTING ARE SUFFICIENT TO MEET THE REQUIREMENTS FOR

PAINTING OF CAB (WHITE) AND CHASSIS (BLACK). CAB WILL NOT BE PAINTED WHITE OVER TOP OF

ANOTHER FINISH COLOR.

THIS IS REQUIRED FOR CLASSES 20, 20A & 33
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DOH PACKAGE REQUIRED FOR CLASSES 13, 14, 15 & 19 TO INCLUDE THE FOLLOWING ITEMS

BED LINERS SHALL BE NON-SKID TYPE, OVER THE RAIL ALL STAR BRAND (OR EQUAL). BAR
LIGHTS SHALL BE PSE CODE 3 EXCALIBER BRAND (OR EQUAL) DUAL LEVEL STROBE LIGHT, FULL
SIZE LIGHT BAR WITH TWO (2) STROBE BULBS PER SIDE, VISIBLE FROM 360 DEGREES. BAR LIGHT
MOUNTING SHALL BE GUTTER TYPE MOUNT ONLY, PSE MODEL NO. X47A (OR EQUAL). DRILLING
OF TOP OF CAB IS UNACCEPTABLE. WORK LIGHT SHALL BE PSE NUMBER NO130H CODE 3 NIGHT
PROBE (OR EQUAL) 300,000 CANDLE WATT MOUNTED TO CENTER OF LIGHT BAR. CONTROLS
SHALL ALL BE MOUNTED PERMANENTLY IN CAB WiTH EASY ACCESS FOR OPERATOR. RUNNING
BOARDS SHALL BE TWO (2} PIECE ALUMINUM, PART #8093027 MFG. DZ {OR EQUAL). CREW CAB
PART #8035012 MFG.DZ (OR EQUAL), CLASS Il TRAILER HITCH 3" PINTLE AND 2" BALL
COMBINATION RECEIVER.

PAINTINGS:

DETAIL / DECORATIVE STRIPES WITH LOGO:

WIDTH: SHALL BE 1" WITH TAPER AT FRONT OF HOOD

WVDOH LOGO (TO BE SUPPLIED BY WVDOH); (BLACK AND WHITE COPY) AND IS APPROXIMATELY
7" TALL BY 7" WIDE AREA BEHIND LOGO AND WITHIN /2" OF LOGO IS NOT TO BE STRIPED.
STRIPED SHOULD BE CUT TO FOLLOW CONTOUR OF LOGO, IN LIEU OF STRAIGHT CUT.

STRIPING MATERIAL SHALL MEET THE REQUIREMENTS OF ASTM D4856-91 TYPE V SHEETING, A
SUPER HIGH-INTENSITY RETROFLECTIVE SHEETING CONSISTING OF MICRO PRISMATIC
RETROFLECTIVE ELEMENTS. THE CONSPICUITY SHEETING MUST MEET THE REQUIREMENT OF
NHSTA, DOT, 40CFR, PART, 571 FEDERAL MOTOR VEHICLE SAFETY STANDARDS FOR CONSPICUITY
SHEETING AND BE "DOT APPROVED."

THE SHEETING FOR BOTH APPLICATIONS ABOVE SHALL NOT BE MORE THAN 0.008 INCH THICK
HAVING APPROXIMATELY 47,000 MICRO PRISMS PER SQUARE INCH AND SHALL COME WITH AN
AGGRESSIVE HIGH TACK PRESSURE SENSITIVE ADHESIVE, REFLECTIVE OR EQUIVALENT.

UPPER STRIPE COLOR: DARK BLUE
LOWER STRIPE COLOR: LIGHT GOLD

SUCCESSFUL VENDOR SHOULD CONSULT WITH AGENCY PERSONNEL ON PROPOSED STRIPING
BEFORE PLACING ORDER WITH MANUFACTURER.

IN ORDER TO TEST THE ADHESIVE QUALITY OF THE PAINT, THE DOH MAY AT ITS OPTION,
REQUIRE THAT THE VENDOR MEASURE ADHESION BY THE CRITERIA SET FORTH | ASTM D3358-74
METHOD B. A RATIBNG OF LESS THAN 4 ON THIS TEST WOULD BE DEEMED UNACCEPTABLE.

MANUFACTURER'S STANDARD PLANT PAINTING PROCEDURES FOR CLEANING, DE-GREASING,
PREPARING, PRIMING AND PAINTING ARE SUFFICIENT TO MEET THE REQUIREMENTS FOR
PAINTING OF CAB (WHITE) AND CHASSIS (BLACK). CAB WILL NOT BE PAINTED WHITE OVER TOP
OF ANOTHER FINISH COLOR.



State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East

Post

Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Purchase Order _

ALL. STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIOHNS

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

BY ORDER

*705035314

MATHENY MOTOR TRUCK COMPANY

PO BOX 1304

304-485-4410

PARKERSBURG WV 26102-1304

BY ORDER

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER
MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES,
INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS.
QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS PUR-
CHASE ORDER SHOULD BE DIRECTED
TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR
TERMS AND CONDITIONS

FEIN/GS]

10/08/2008

550320770

L SHEVIA

EREIGH T TERMS:

LINE

0001

CATNO

ITH

070-0

M NUMBER
5-01-000 2009
SIGNATURE.

RECEIPT TICKET FPR PURCHASE ORDER:

DESCRIPTION

(OR CURRENT MODEL YEAR) MO

DATE

T'OR

MV0O9B

QTY DATE

IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE [

APPROVED AS TO FORM BY
ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL

BY.

PURCHASING DIVISION AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE



