Puirchase Order P—

State of West Virginia e PG
Department of Administration 1
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130 —
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 ' S EERIESE  CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER
; 00 MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES,
: INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS,
QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS PUR-
ALL STATE AGENCIES S5 e BUVER ASNOTED BELOW.
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
© VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR
e e TERMS AND CONDITIONS
AGENCY COPY
*709034823 . 304-369-2411
STEPHENS AUTO CENTER ALL STATE AGENCIES
PO BOX 278 ’ AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
DANVILLE WV 25053-0278 BY ORDER

SHEVAL FREIGHTIERVS
BEST WAY ION PREPAID
TR ENDORITEN

BILANKET QPEN-END STATEWIOE CONTRACT

THIS CONTRACT IS |TO SUPPLY 2008 MOTOR VEHICLES ( OK
CURRENT MQDEL YEAR) TO ALL WEST VIRGINIA STATE
AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIQNS, PER THE
ATTACHED IIIST OF |VEHICLE CLASSES |AWARDED THROUGH
THIS CONTRACT. o

THIS AWARI) IS PER THE FOLLOWING:
1. REQUEST FOR QUOTATION DATED 08§ /29/2007 AND ALL

ADDENDA THERETO. "
2. SPECIFI]CATIONY, FOUR PAGES, DATED 08/29/2007.
3. VENDOR’|S BID DATED 09/26/2007.

ALL RELEAYE ORDERS FOR STATE AGENCIES MUST BE

DONE THROUGH THE |PURCHASING DIVIYION. AGENCY PURCHASING DIVISIU:-
REQUESTS YHOULD HE SUBMITTED WITH A WV-35 AND CERTIFIED ENCUVBERED
ATTACH THE COMPLETED VEHICLE ORDHER FORM FOR EACH

DIFFERENT |TYPE OF VEHICLE ORDEREI. : OCT 2 22007
POLITICAL |SUBDIV]SIONS SHOULD CONTACT THE VENDOR %ﬁﬂ&w
DIRECTLY TO MAKE |A PURCHASE THROUGH THIS CONTRACT.

IF APPROVAL As jo FORM 6%%{1%%&%%%%%{?%"“ AL, CHECK HER /74 /W% OPEN END
2 e, F ool 304-558-8002
7 Wb BY NS

4
Asg;’;;}fg,ﬁef;ggﬁg;oggvggAL | PURCMASING DIVISION ADTHORIZED SIGNATURI




10.

1.

12.

13.

14.

GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
PURCHASE ORDER/CONTRACT

ACCEPTANCE: Selier shall be bound by this order and its terms and conditions upon receipt of
this order.

APPLICABLE LAW: The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the
Purchasing Division shall govern all rights and duties under the Contract, including without
limitation the validity of this Purchase Order/Contract.

NON-FUNDING: All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Orders/
Contracts are to be continued for the terms of the Purchase Order/Contract, contingent upon
funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise being made available. .In the event funds
are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or goods, this Purchase Ordet/
Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30. '

COMPLIANCE: Seller shall comply with all Federal, State and local laws, regulations and
ordinances including, but not limited to, the prevailing wage rates of the WV Division of Labor.

MODIFICATIONS: This writing is the parties final expression of intent. No modification of this -
order shall be binding unless agreed to in writing by the Buyer.

ASSIGNMENT: Neither this Order nor any monies due, or to become due hereunder may be
assigned by the Seller without the Buyer's consent.

WARRANTY: The Seller expressly warrants that the goods and/or services covered by this order
will: {a} conform to the specifications, drawings, samples or other description furnished or
specified by the Buyer {b} be merchantable and fit for the purpose intended and/or {c} be free from
defect in material and workmanship.

CANCELLATION: The Director or Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon
30 days written notice to the seller.

SHIPPING, BILLING & PRICES: Prices are those stated in this order. No price increase will be
accepted without written authority from the Buyer. All goods or services shall be shipped on or
before the date specified in this Order. ’

LATE PAYMENTS: Payments may only be made after the delivery of goods or services. Interest
may be paid on late payments in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

TAXES: The State of West Virginia is exempt from Federal and State taxes and will not pay or
reimburse such taxes.

RENEWAL: Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be
renewed only upon mutual written agreement of the parties.

BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection; this Contract
may be deemed null and void, and terminated without further order.

HIPAA Business Associate Addendum - The West Viginia State Government HIPAA Business

Associate Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and available online at the Purchasing

Division's web site (http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.htm) is hereby made
part of the agreement. Provided that, the Agency meets the definition of a Covered Entity

(45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

Rev. 9/24/07



State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS

VARIOUS LOCALES
BY ORDER

AS INDICATED

*709034823 30

4-369-2411

STEPHENS AUTO CENTER

PO BOX 278

DANVILLE WV 25053-0278

Purchase Order S

ALL STATE AGENCIES

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
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CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER
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TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR
TERMS AND CONDITIONS
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State

2019

of West Virginia

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

Washington Street East

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

ALL STATE

BY ORDER

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED -

AGENCIES

*709034823

304-369-2411

STEPHENS AUTO CENTER
PO BOX 278

DANVILLE WV 25053-0278
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BY ORDER
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AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
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SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR
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Purchase Order
State of West Virginia R TRCHASEGHT

Department of Administration S MVOSF
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Post Office Box 50130 —
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 e === CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER
00 MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES,
INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS,
O N NI TS PR,
ALIL STATE AGENCIES » TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.

AND POLITICAL, SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

BY ORDER SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR
TERMS AND CONDITIONS

¥709034823 304-369-2411

STEPHENS AUTO CENTER ALL STATE AGENCIES

PO BOX 278 AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

DANVILLE WV BY ORDER

25053-0278

550128010
i FREIGHTIERYS
BEST WAY DESTINATION PREPAID MUL~-MUL

QUAN

THE VENDOR FOR CUMMODITIES COVERED BY THIS CONTRACT.
THE ORIGINAL COPY OF THE WV-39 SHALL BE MAILED TO THE
VENDOR AS |AUTHORJZATION FOR SHIPMENT, A SECOND COPY
MAILED TO |THE PUHRCHASING DIVISION, AND A THIRD COPY
RETAINED HY THE HYPENDING UNIT.

BANKRUPTCY: 1IN THE EVENT THE VENDOR/CONTRACTOR FIIES
FOR BANKRUPTCY PHROTECTION, THIS (ONTRACT IS AUTOMATI-
CALLY NULL AND VQID, AND IS TERMINATED WITHOUT FURTHER
ORDER. '

THE TERMS [AND CONDITIONS CONTAINED IN THIS CONTRACT
SHALL SUPHRSEDE ANY AND ALL SUBSHQUENT TERMS AND
CONDITIONY WHICH |[MAY APPEAR ON ANY ATTACHED PRINTELD
DOCUMENTS |SUCH AY§ PRICE LISTS, ORDER FORMS, SALES
AGREEMENTY OR MAINTENANCE AGREEMENTS, INCLUDING ANY
ELECTRONIQ MEDIUM SUCH AS CD-ROM.

REV. 04/11/2001

IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE []

, BY.
Ao e e EraL PURCHASING DIVISION AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE



MVO8F Stephens Auto Center
CLASS MODEL PRICE

CLASS 1 FOCUS, 4 DOOR, FWD,GAS, P34 11,812.00

CLASS 2 FUSION, 4 DOOR, FWD, GAS, P06 13,760.00

CLASS 4 CHARGER, 4 DOOR, RWD,GAS, LXDH48 17,493.00
GRAND CHEROKEE, OFF-ROAD, 4WD, GAS,

CLASS 6A WKJH74 21,779.00

CLASS 7 DURANGO, 4WD, GAS, HBEM74 20,651.00

CLASS 9 RANGER, 2WD, SHORT BED, GAS, R10 10,549.00

CLASS 10 RANGER EXTENDED CAB, 2 SWD, GAS, R14 12,859.00

CLASS 11 RANGER, 2WD, SHORT BED, GAS, R10 10,889.00

CLASS 12 F150, 2WD, SHORT BED, GAS, F12 12,339.00

CLASS 13 F150, 2WD, LONG BED, GAS, F12 13,139.00

CLASS 13 F150, 2WD, LONG BED, FLEX-FUEL, F12 13,882.00

CLASS 15 F250, 2WD, LONG BED, GAS, F20 15,988.00

CLASS 18 F150, 4WD, SHORT BED, FLEX-FUEL, F14 17,286.00

CLASS 19 F250, 4WD, LONG BED, DIESEL, F21 24,290.00
F350, 4WD, DUALLY, DIESEL, CHASSIS CAB,

CLASS 20A 137" WB 60" C/A, F37 25,5688.00
F350, 4WD, DUALLY, DIESEL, CHASSIS CAB,

CLASS 20A 161" WB 84" C/A, F37 25,756.00
GRAND CARAVAN SE, 7 PASSENGER, FWD, )

CLASS 24 FLEX-FUEL, RTKH53 18,284.00
F550, 4WD, DUALLY, DIESEL, CHASSIS CAB,

CLASS 33 141" WB 60" C/A 33,614.00
F550, 4WD, DUALLY,DIESEL, CHASSIS CAB,

CLASS 33 165" WB 84" C/A 33,683.00
F550, 4WD, DIESEL, DUALLY, CHASSIS CAB,

CLASS 33A 141" WB 60" C/A , F57 59,839.00

CLASS 34 ESCAPE, 4WD, GAS, U93 18,389.00

CLASS 34A ESCAPE HYBRID, FWD, U49 23,917.00

CLASS 34A ESCAPE HYBRID, FWD, U598 25,474.00

1 0of1
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CLASS 1 AUTOMOBILE
Compact, 4 Door Sedan,
Front Wheel Drive, Wheelbase 95"

070-06-01-000

Vendor Name: Stephens Auto Center
Manufacturer / Brand . Ford
Delivery 60 - 120 days estimate
Mode! Name & Number Focus P34
HP TORQUE
Requirements:
Engine MIN: 125 HP 107 TORQUE 13il 136
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Spare Tire included - w/Jack
Rear Window/Defogger installed
Front Seat Bucket
Air Conditioning installed
Floor Mats Installed
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline - $11,812
Price Each Flex-Fuel NO BID
Options:
AM/FM w/Cassette NA
AM/FM wiCD Player std
Shop/Service Manual contact vendor
CD Service Manual contact vendor
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control tilt std - cruise NA
Keyless Entry NA
Power Windows /Power Locks NA
Global Positioning system NA
Side Air Bags std
Bodyside Mouldings NA
Interior Upgrade NA
Exterior colors no charge
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct) 26
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 10
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile 1.39

Additional information:
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CLASS 2 AUTOMOBILE 070-06-02-000
Midsize, 4 Door Sedan :
Front Wheel Drive, Wheelbase 104"
Vendor Name: Stephens Auto Center
Manufacturer / Brand Ford
Delivery 60 - 120 days estimate
Model Name & Number Fusion P06
HP "TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine : MIN: 153 HP 158 TORQUE 160 1566
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Included - wilack
Rear Window/Defogger installed
Front Seat Bucket
Air Conditioning _ Installed
Floor Mats ) Installed
EPA EPA
' HGWY cITY
Price Each $13,760
Price Each Flex-Fuel NO BID
Optlons:
AM/FM w/Cassette NA
AM/FM w/ CD Player std
Shop/Service Manual contact vendor
CD Service Manual contact vendor
Tit Wheel & Cruise Control std
Keyless Entry std
Power Windows / Power Locks std
Global Positioning System NA
Side Air Bags std
Exterior colars no charge
Rubber matting NA
Delete Floor Mats {(Deduct) NA
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) 761
Remove Console (Delete) (Console between seats) NA
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 10
EOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile 1.39

Additional Information:
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CLASS 4 AUTOMOBILE 070-06-04-001
Full Size, 4 Door, Rear Wheel Drive,
Wheelbase 109"
Vendor Name: Stephens Auto Center
Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery 60-120 days estimate
Model Name & Number Charger LXDH48
: HP TOR
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 210 HP 240 TORQUE 250 250
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Qutside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Fuel Tank . Factory Standard
Power Windows and Locks Installed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Standard Tire w/ Jack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Front Seat Standard Seating
Air Conditioning Installed
Floor Mats Installed
Seating Capacity 5
EOA EOA
HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline $17,493
Price Each Flex Fuel no bid
Options:
AM/FM w/Cassette NA
AM/FM w/ CD Player STD
Shop/Service Manual CONTACT VENDOR
CD Service Manual CONTACT VENDOR
Titt Wheel & Cruise Control STD
Keyless Entry STD
Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors STD - MIRROR NOT HEATED
6-way Power driver seat (requires Power Windows & doors) $350 - 8-WAY
Global Positioning System NA
Side Air Bags $543
Exterior colors SEE BELOW
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct) $28
Manuz! Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) NA
Remove Console (Delete) (Console between seats) NA
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) ($10)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile $1.59

Additional Information:
INFERNO RED AND TORRED $207 - LT. SANDSTONE $138




CLASS 6A AUTOMOBILE 070-06-06-002
Special Purpose, Off-Road, 4 Wheel Drive,
5700 GVWR, 109" Wheelbase
VENDOR NAME: STEPHENS AUTO CENTER
Manufacturer / Brand JEEP
Delivery 60-120 DAYS ESTIMATE
Model Name & Number GRAND CHEROKEE WKJH74
HP HEWY

Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 200HP 195 TORQUE 210 235
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AMIFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Tarrain
Spare Tire Full Size wiJack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Fuel Tank Standard
Front Seat Bucket
Rear Seat Bench
Air Conditioning Installed
Floor Mats installed
Running Ground Clearance At least 8.3 inches
Cargo Volume Rear Seat Up at least 35 cubic ft. EPA EPA
_Cargo Volume Rear Seat Down at least 67 cubic ft. HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline $21,779
Options:
Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear Includes: $

Axie-Trac-Lok Differential NA

Engine Cooling - Heavy Duty TOW PACKAGE - V8 ?

Skid plate Group List items included in this group $198 -VB ONLY

Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks NA Enter tota! off road pkg above

Front and Rear Tow hooks SEE SKID PLATE GROUP

Hi & Lo Gear 4WD or equivalent SEE BELOW

Off Road Tires $167

AM/FM w/Cassette

AM/FM w/ CD Player
Shop/Service Manual

CD Service Manual

Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control
Keyless Entry

Power Windows / Power Locks
Global Positioning System
Tow Package

Side Air Bags

Exterior colors

Third Row Seating

Interior Rubber Floor Matting
Spare Tire Carrier - External
Engine, 8 Cylinder, 4.7 Liter

Delete Running Boards and Luggage Racks (Deduct)

Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)

Remove Console (Delete) (Console between seats)

FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Additional Information:

Tow package $180 - Class li receiver, trailer sway damping, wiring hamess

List items included in this group

NA
STD
CONTACT VENDOR
CONTACT VENDOR
STD
STD
STD
NA
$180-246 SEE BELOW
STD
SEE BELOW
NA
NA
NA
$1,390

NA

(326)
NA
NA

$10)

$1.59

Tow package $246 - Class IV receiver, frailer sway damping, wiring hamess, HD engine cooling

Skid plate group - Front suspension, fuel tank, transfer case, includes tow hooks

High & low gear 4WD (Quadra Drive Ii) - $3,186 - includes package upgrade - contact vendor for details

Jeep Green and Mineral Gray $132, Red Rock $198



CLASS 7 AUTOMOBILE 070-06-07-001
Special Purpose, 4 Wheel Drive,
6270 GVWR
Vendor name: Stephens Auto Center
Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery ) 60-120 days estimate
Model Name & Number Durango HBSM74
: HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 235 HP 295 TORQUE 235 300
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires . All Season
Spare Tire Full Size w/Jack
Rear Window/Defogger installed
Fuel Tank Standard
Front Seat Bucket
Rear Seat Bench
Air Conditioning Installed
Floor Mats Installed EPA EPA
Auto Locking Hubs ) Installed HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline $20,651
Options:
1 Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear Includes: $ NA
Axde-trac-lok differential NA
Engine Cooling - heavy duty SEE TOW PACKAGE T
Skid plate Group List items included in thisgroup ~ $146 - SEE BELOW
Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks STD Enter total Off Road pkg above
Al Terrain Tires NA
Tow Hocks SEE SKID PLATES

2 AM/FM wiCasseite

3 AM/FMw/ CD Player

4 Shop/Service Manual

5 CD Service Manual

6 Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control
7 Keyless Entry

8 Power Windows / Power Locks
9 Global Positioning System
10 Tow Package

11 Side Air Bags

12 Exterior colors

13 Rear Air

14 Running Board

15 Third Row Seat

16 Low Range 4 Wheel Drive
17 Spare Tire Carrier - External
18 Roof-Top Luggage Rack
19 Rubber matting

20 e Cylinder (Deduct)

21 Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)
22 Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)

23 Remove Console (Delets) (Console between seats)
24 FOB Dealership: (Deduct)
25 FOB Other than Mefro Charleston - Per Mile

List items included in this group

Additional Information:
Trailer tow - 160 amp altermator, wiring hamess, 750 amp battery, transmission cooler,class IV receiver

NA
STD
CONTACT VENDCR
CONTACT VENDOR
STD
STD
STD
NA
$426 - SEE BELOW
STD
$194 INFERNO RED
SEE 26D PACKAGE
$348 REQUIRES 26D
SEE 26D PACKAGE
STD
NA
STD - UNDER VEHICLE
NA
NA

($26)
NA
NA

$10)

1.59

Skid plate group - fuel tank and transfercase skid plates and tow hooks

26D package - $1,380 - includes rear heat/air, 3rd row seat, more.

, p. steering cooler, HD engine cooling



Vendor Name:

CLASS 9 TRUCK
Small Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive,
3500 GVWR, Short Bed

Stephens Auto Center

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Mode! Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine

Ford

60 - 120 days estimate

Ranger R10

MIN: 143 HP 154 TORQUE

070-48-09-001

HP TORQUE

Transmission

Automatic

143

154

Steering

Power

Brakes

Power

Radio

AM/FM

Glass

All Tinted

Mirrors

Left & Right Outside

License Plate Mounts

Front & Rear

Cargo Box

Fleetside

Bumper

Rear Step Factory installed

Tires

All Season

Spare Tire

Included - wiJack

Air Conditioning

Installed

Front Seat

Bench

Standard Floor Covering

Installed

Price Each Gasoline

Options:

EPA
HGWY

CITY

1 Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear Includes:

Axle-trac-lok differential
Engine Cooling - heavy duty
Skid plate Group
Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks
All Terrain Tires
Tow Hooks

2 AM/FM w/Cassette

3 AM/FMw/ CD Player

4 Shop/Service Manual

5 CD Service Manual

6 Tilt Whee! & Cruise Control

7 Global Positioning System

8. Side Air Bags

9 Exterior Colors

10 Trailer Tow Package

11 Floor Mats

12 Power Windows, Locks

13 Sliding Rear Window

14 Privacy Glass

15 Bedliner

16 Bucket Seats Front

17 Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)

18 Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)

19 FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

20 FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Additional Information:

List items included in this group

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

295

contact vendor

contact vendor

320

NA

NA

no charge

NA

NA

NA

195 - incl. Privacy glass

9N

168

NA

NA

800

10

1.39




CLASS 10 TRUCK

Small Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive, Extended Cab,

4200 GVWR, Short Bed

070-48-10—001

Vendor Name; Stephens Auto Center
Manufacturer / Brand Ford
Delivery 60 - 120 days estimate
Model Name & Number _Ranger Super Cab R14
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements: '
Engine MIN: 200 HP 225 TORQUE 207 238
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power
“Radio AMIFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Step Factory Instailed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Included - widack
Air Conditioning Installed
Front Seat Bucket 80/40 split bench
Standard Floor Covering Installed
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline $12,859
Options:
1 AM/FM w/Cassette NA
2 AM/FM w/ CD Player 295
3 Shop/Service Manual contact vendor
4 CD Service Manual contact vendor
5 Limited Slip Rear End 249
6 Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control 320
7 Keyless Entry NA
8 Power Windows / Power Locks NA
9 Global Positioning System NA
10 Exterior colors no charge
11 Side Air Bags NA
12 Floor Mats NA
13 Slide Rear Window 195 incl. Privacy glass
14 Front seat bench std -
15 Bed Liner 168
16 Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) 800
17 FOB Dealership; (Deduct) 10
18 FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile 1.39

Additional Information:

Rear jump seats - 187




CLASS 11 TRUCK
Small Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive,
4200 GVWR, Short Bed

070-48-11-001

Vendor Name: Stephens Auto Center

Manufacturer / Brand Ford

Delivery 60 - 120 days estimate

Model Name & Number Ranger R10

HP TORQE

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN: 148 HP 180 TORQUE 148 180

Transmission Automatic

Steering Pawer

Brakes Power

Radio AM/FM

Glass All Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Outside

License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Cargo Box Fleetside

Bumper Rear Step Factory Installed

Tires All Season

Spare Tire Included - widack

Air Conditioning Installed

Front Seat Bench

Rubber Floor Covering Installed EPA EPA

HGWY CITY

Price Each Gasoline $10,889

Options:
1 AM/FM w/Cassette NA
2 AMIFM w/ CD Player 295
3 Shop/Service Manual contact vendor
4 CD Service Manual contact vendor
5 Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control 320
6 Limited Slip Rear End 3t
7 Keyless Entry NA
8 Power Windows / Power Locks NA
9 Clobal Positioning System NA
10 Exterior colors no charge
11 Slide Rear Window 195
12 Long Bed 1,181
13 Floor Mats NA
14 Bed Liner 168
15 Side Air Bag NA
16 Optional Engine NA
17 Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) 800
18 Remove Console (Delete) (Console between seats) NA
19 FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 10
20 FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile 1.39

Additional Information:




CLASS 12 TRUCK
Large Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive
6000 GVWR, Short Bed

070-48-12-001

Vendor Name: Stephens Auto Center
Manufacturer / Brand Ford
Delivery 60 - 120 days estimate
Mode! Name & Number F150 F12
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
_Engine MIN 195 HP 260 TORQUE 202 260
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power
Radio AM/FM
Glags All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Step Factory Installed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size whJack
Air Conditioning Installed
Front Seat Bench EPA EPA
Rubber Floor Covering Installed HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline $12,339
Hybrid NO BID
Options:
1 AM/FM w/Cassette NA
2 AM/FMw/ CD Player 241
3 Shop/Service Manual contact vendor
4 CD Service Manual contact vendor

5 Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control
6 Limited Slip Rear End

7 Keyless Entry

8 Power Windows / Power Laocks
9 Global Positioning System
10 Tow Hooks

11 Long Bed

12 Exterior colors

13 Slide Rear Window

14 Side Air Bags

15 Engine Options

16 Floor Mats

17 Bed Liner

18 Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)

-~ 19 Delete Truck Bed (Deduct)

20 FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

21 FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Additional Information;

Option 1:
Option 2:

187 cruise - tilt - std

249

660 incl. P. windows/locks

660 incl. Keyless entry

NA
NA
271
no charge
187
NA
3 -
$ -
NA
200
909
NA
10
159




070-48-13-001

CLASS 13 TRUCK
Large Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive
6000 GVWR, Long Bed
Vendor Name: Stephens Auto Center
Manufacturer / Brand Ford
Delivery 60 - 120 days estimate HP TORQUE
Mode!l Name & Number F150 F12
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN; 231 HP 293 TORQUE 248
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power
Radio AMFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
_Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Step Factory Installed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size wiJack
Air Conditioning Installed
Front Seat Bench
Standard Floor Covering Installed
EPA EPA
HEWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline $13,139
Price Each Flex Fuel $13,882 - 5.4L engine
Options:
Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes: NA
Axle-trac-lok differential 249
Engine Cooling - heavy duty NA ?
Skid plate Group 133 - 4x4 only
Suspension - Heavy Duty Wigas Shocks NA Enter total off road pkg above
All Terrain Tires std - 4x4
Tow Hooks NA
AM/FM w/Cassette NA
AM/FM w/ CD Player 241
Shop/Service Manual contact vendor
CD Service Manual contact vendor
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control 187 - cruise {ilt - std
Trailer Tow Package List items included in this group 291

Keyless Entry

Power Windows / Power Locks
Global Positioning System
Exterior colors

Slide Rear Window

Bed Liner

Optional Engine

Additional Tanks

4 Wheel Drive

Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)
FOB Dealership: (Deduct)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

54L-V8

Additional Information:

660 incl. P, windows/locks

660 incl. Keyless entry

NA
no charge

187
200
743

NA
3,639

NA
10
1.59

Tow Package - Class IV receiver, wiring hamess, upgraded radiator and trans. Oil cooler,
DOH package:

2" Pintle ball combo, mount , pin $107

Stripe Regular cab $170

Stripe Extended/Crew Cab $185

Running boards Regular cab $635

Running boards Extended/Regular Cab$771 -

2" Receiver hitch if not included from factory $242

Seven way trailer plug if not included from factory $65
Note: trailer tow included unless bed delete option selected.
Strobe light bar and spot light $1,433




CLASS 15 TRUCK 070-48-15-000
Large Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive,
8500 GVWR, Long Bed

Vendor Name: Stephens Auto Center

Manufacturer / Brand Ford

Delivery 90 - 150 days estimate

Model Name & Number F250 F20

HP TORQUE

Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE 300 365
Transmission Automatic

Steering Power '
Brakes Power

Radio AMIFM

Glass All Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Outside

License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Cargo Box Fleetside

Bumper Rear Step Factory Installed

Tires All Season

Spare Tire Full Size wiJack

Air Conditioning Installed

Standard Floor Covering Installed

Price Each Gasoline $15,988

Price Each Flex Fuel no bid

Options:

Extended Cab 2,218
Crew Cab 3,402
Limited Slip Rear End 249
AM/FM w/Cassette NA

AM/FM w/ CD Player 228
Shop/Service Manual contact vendor
CD Service Manual contact vendor
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control 320
Keyless Entry NA

Power Windows / Power Locks 440
Global Positioning System NA

Tow Package List items included in this group std - hitch and wiring
Diesel Engine 5,723

V-8 Engine std

Side Air Bags NA

Exterior colors no charge
Slide Rear Window 104
Running Boards 226 - cab steps
Trailer Tow Mirrors 104
Bed Liner 200
Delete Truck Bed (Deduct) 552
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) 1,237
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 10
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile 1.59
Available Axle Ratios 355  contact vendor

3.73

Additional Information:

4.10 and 4.30

DOH package:

2" Pintle ball combo, mount , pin $107
Stripe Regular cab $170

Stripe Extended/Crew Cab $185

Running boards Regular cab $635

Running boards Extended/Regular Cab$771

2" Receiver hitch if not included from factory $242
Seven way frailer plug if not included from factory $65

Note: trailer tow included unless bed delete option selected.

Strobe light bar and spot light $1,433
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CLASS 18 TRUCK 070-48-18-000
Large Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive,
5400 GVWR, Short Bed
Vendor Name: Stephens Auto Center
Manufacturer / Brand Ford
Delivery 60 - 120 days estimate
Model Name & Number F150 F14
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 231 HP 293 TORQUE 248 294
Transmission Automatic
Sleering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AMFM
Glass Al Tinted
Mimrors Lefl & Right Outside
Licensa Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Step Factory Installed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size w/dack
Air Conditioning Installed
Front Seat Bench
Auto Locking Hubs Installed
Standard Floor Covering Installed EPA EPA
HGWY CITY

Price Each Gasoline
Price Each Flex Fuel $17,286 5.4L only
Hybrid no bid
Options:
Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes: NA -4

Axle-trac-lok differential 249

Engine Cooling - heavy duty NA ?

Skid plate Group 133 ]

Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks < NA Enter total off road pkg above

Al Terrain Tires std

Tow Hooks NA
AMFM w/Cassette NA
AMFMw/ CD Player 241
Shop/Service Manual contact vendor
CD Service Manual contact vendor
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control 187 - cruise filt- std
Tow Package List items Included in this gorup 291
Snow Plow Package List items included in this gorup NA
Exterior colors no charge
Slide Rear Window 187
Keyless Entry 660 w/p. windows/locks/mirrors
Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Minors 660 w. keyless entry (mirror unheate
Global Positioning System NA
Side Air Bags NA
Rubber Floor Covering sid
Bed Liner 200
Carpet Interior 120
Cloth Seats no charge
Long Bed 272
Rear Jump Seat NA
Extended Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door 2,364
Engine Option Size: 5.4L V8 743
6 Cylinder (Deduct) NA
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) NA
Delete Ficor Mats (Deduct) NA
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 10
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile 1.59

$

Additional Information:

Tow package - Class IV receiver, wiring hamess, upgraded radiator and trans. Oil cooler.




CLASS 18 TRUCK
Large Pickup, 4 Wheel! Drive,
8500 GVWR, Long Bed

Vendor Name:

Stephens Auto Center

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine

Ford

90 - 150 days estimate
280 F21

HP

TORQUE

MIN: 295 HP 335 TORQUE 300

Transmission

Automatic

365

Steering

Power

Brakes

Power/ABS

Radio

AMIFM

Glass

All Tinted

Mirrors

Left & Right Outside

“Licenss Plats Mounts

Front & Rear

Cargo Box

Fleetside

Bumper

Rear Step Factory Installed

Tires

All Season

Spare Tire

Full Size wilack

Alr Conditioning

Instalied

Front Seat

Bench

Auto Locking Hubs

instailed

Standard Floor Covering

instalied

Price Each Gasoline
Price Each Diesel
Price Each Flex Fuel

Optlons:
Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes:
Ade-trac-lok differential
Engine Cooling ~ heavy duty
Skid plate Group
Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks
All Terrain Tires
‘Tow Hooks
AM/FM w/Cassetto
AM/FM w/ CD Player
Shop/Service Manual
CD Service Manual
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control
Limited Siip Rear End
Tow Package
Snow Plow Package
Side Alr Bags
Exterior colors
Slide Rear Window
Keyless Entry
Power Windows, Locks, Powsr Heated Mirrors
Global Positioning System
Rubber Floor Covering
Bed Liner
Carpet Interior
Cloth Seaty
Additional Tanks
Extended Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door
Gas Engine 450 CID: V-10 6.8L
Delete Truck Bed (Deduct)
Short Bed (Deduct)
6 Cylinder (Deduct)
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)
FOB Dealership: (Deduct)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile
Available Axle Ratios

EPA
HGWY

EPA
CiTY

$24,290

269.

187 t

104

al 9 |5

NA

Enter total off road pkg above

228

contact vendor

comtact vendor

320

249

List #ems included in this group std

List tams Included In this group 71

104

440

200

133

NA

2,218

438

§52

171.- et cab only

NA

1257

NA

i0

159

3.56  contactvendor

—————————————————————

3.73
4.10 and 4.30

Snow plow group - aux. Springs, 140 amp alternator, gpecial fan clutch widiesel engine.

DOH package:

2" Pintla ball combo, mount, pin $107

Stripe Regular cab $170

Stripe Extended/Crew Cab $185

Running boards Regular cab $635

Running boards Extended/Regular Cab$771

2* Recelver hitch if not included from factory $242
Seven way traifer plug if not included from factory $65

Note: traller tow Included unless bed delete option selected.

Strobe light bar and spot fight $1,433

070-48-18-000



CLASS 20A TRUCK 070-48-20-002
Chassis Cab, 4 Wheel Drive,
12,000 GVWR, Dual Rear Wheels
‘endor Name: Stephens Auto Center
lanufacturer / Brand Ford
‘elivery 90 - 180 days estimate
lodel Name & Number F350 F37
HP TORQUE
itandard Equipment Requirements:
ingine MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE 300 365
‘ransmission Automnatic
steering Power
drakes Power/ABS
Radio AMIFM
Slass All Tinted
virrors Left & Right Outside
.icense Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Jual Rear Wheels Installed
Tires All Season Load Range D
“uel Tank 20 Gallons Minimum
Ajr Conditioning _ Installed
Front Seat Bench
Standard Floor Covering Installed
DIESEL GASOLINE
Price Each 137" WB 60" Cab to Axle $25,588 SEPARATE BID FOR DODGE
Price Each 161" WB 84" Cab to Axle $25756  SEPARATE BID FOR DODGE
Options:
Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes: NA
Axle-frac-lok differential 249 ?
Engine Cooling - heavy duty std
Skid plate Group NA Enter Total Off Rd Pkg Above
Suspension - Heavy Duty w/Gas Shocks std
All Terrain Tires 104
Engine Cooling Heavy Duty std
AM/FM wiCassette : NA
AMIFM w/ CD Player 228
Shop/Service Manual contact vendor
CD Service Manual contact vendor
Tiit Wheel & Cruise Controi 320
Keyless Entry NA
Power Windows / Power Locks 440
Global Positioning System NA
Back -Up Alarm 90
Tow Package List items included in this group 129 - trailer brake wiring
Snow Plow Package List items included in this group 71
Side Air Bags NA
Exterior colors no charge
Slide Rear Window 104
Rubber Floor Covering std
Duel Gas Tanks 506
Flatbed 137" Each 2,371
Flatbed 161" Each 2,623




CLASS 20A TRUCK
Chassis Cab, 4 Wheel Drive,
12,000 GVWR, Dual Rear Wheels
Dump Bed 137" Each
Dump Bed 161" Each
Utility Bed 137" Each
Utility Bed 161" Each
Crane 137" Each
Crane 161" Each
Extended Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door
Crew Cab - Front Hinged Doors
Gasoline Engine: 8 Cyj, 7.0 (Deduct)
2 Wheel Drive (Deduct)
Manuel Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)
FOB Dealership: (Deduct)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile
Available Axle Ratios

s

070-48-20-002

5,832 automatic 6,852 manual

6,082 automatic 7,070 manual

5,845

7,130

7,991

7,991

2,284

2,988

NA

2,436

1,200

10

1.59

contact vendor

Spare tire and whee! $291

Snow plow prep - aux. Springs, extra HD alternator and special fan clutch w/diesel.
Engine block heater $29

High Capacity trailer tow $291 -trailer brake wiring and upgraded rear axle
2" Pintle Ball Combo, Mount, Pin - $107

2" Receiver Hitch - $249

X47A Strobe light bar with spot light - $1,433

Seven way trailer plug - $65

Body painted any color but white $275

Running boards - Regular Cab - $348

Running boards - Extended cab and crew cab - $458

Stripe regular cab - $122

Stripe extended cab and crew cab - $148

Note: Not all manual transmission have PTO applications for dump bodies
Halogen Rotator Light Bar - $748



Drivers Side Sliding Door

Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors
Global Positioning System

Side Air Bags

Stow N Go Seating

Exterior colors

Delete Center Row Seats (Deduct)

Delete Third Row Seats (Deduct)

FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Additional Information:

CLASS 24 VAN 070-93-24-00
7 Passenger, Front Wheel Drive,
110" Wheelbase
Vendor Name: Stephens Auto Center
Manufacturer / Brand Dodge
Delivery 60-120 DAYS ESTIMATE
Mode! Name & Number Grand Caravan SE_RTKHS3
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 175 HP 165 TORQUE 175 205
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radlo AM/FM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside - §" x 8" Minimum
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Seating 7 Passenger
Tires All Season
Spare Tire - Included - wiJack
Rear Window Wiper/Defogger Installed
Floor Mats Installed
Air Conditioning Installed
Doors Side & Rear sliding side doors
Loading Doors w/Glass rear liftgate EPA EPA
HGWY ciTY
Price Each Gasoline V-6
Price Each Gasoline V-8 no bid
Price Each Flex-Fuel $18,284 WITH 3.3L ENGINE ONLY
Options:
AM/FM w/Cassette NA
AM/FM w/ CD Player std
Shop/Service Manual $
CD Service Manual $
Tilt Whee! & Cruise Control tilt - std cruise - 220
Keyless Entry std .
Extended Wheel Base std
All Wheel Drive NA
Sunscreen Glass 396
Rear Heat and Alr 3,291 see 24H package

std

std - except mirrors - see power equip. ¢

NA

std

3,291 see 24H package

see below

N/C see cargo van group

N/C see cargo van group

10

1.59

Power equipment group - second row power windaws, power heated mirrors, power gtr. Vent

windows.

$1,540 - 24G package - 160 Amp alternator, rear hea/air,
24H - includes all 24G plus stow-n-go seating, 2nd row power windows,
remote start, trip computer, YES essentials seat fabric.

Cargo Van Group - call vendor for details.

t/air,cruise control, sunscreen glass
heated mimors,adjustable pedals,

Inferno Red $198, Lt. Sandstone and Sunburst Orange $132



070-93-33-000

Trailer Tow Package $128 - trailer brake wiring

Snow Plow Prep $71
Engine Block Heater $29

High Capactly trailer tow $291 -trailer brake wiring and upgraded rear axie

2" Pintle Ball Combo, Mount, Pin - $107

2" Receiver Hitch - $249

X47A Strobe light bar with spot fight - $1,433

Seven way trailer plug - $65
Body painted any color but white $275
Running boards - Regular Cab - $348

Running boards - Extended/Crew Cab - $458
Note: Not all manual transmission have PTO applications for dump bodies

CLASS 33 TRUCK
Chassis Cab, 4 Wheel Drive,
Diesel Engine, 17,500 GVWR, Dual Rear Wheels
Vendor Name: Stephens Auto Center
Manufacturer / Brand Ford 2WD 4WD
Delivery 90-180 days estimate
Mode! Name & Number F-550 F56 F57
HP TORQUE HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
ine MIN: 300 HP 520 TORQUE 350 650 350 650
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM
Class All Tinted
Mimors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Step Bumper installed - Not Applicable
Tires __All Season
Spare Tire Full Size wiJack
. Air Conditioning installed
Seating Capacity 2 Passenger Seat
WD 4WD
Price Each 141" WB (60" Cab-to-Axle) . $33,514
Price Each 165" WB 84" C/A $33,683
Options:
Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, includes: $ NA $ NA
Axie-trac-lok differential $299 $298
Engine Coaling - heavy duty STD f T
Skid plate Group NA
Suspension - Heavy Duty w/Gas Shocks STD Enter off road package totals above
All Temrain Tires NA $158 rear only
Engine Cooling Heavy Duty STD
AM/FM w/ Casselte NA NA
AM/FM w/ CD Player $228 $228
Shop/Service Manual Contact Vendor Contact Vendor
CD Service Manual Contact Vendor Contact Vendor
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control $320 $320
Back-Up Alarm $90 $90
HD Suspension - GVWR: 19,000 - Reg cab 84" CA $365 $365
Flat Bed 141" Each 2,371 ¢
Flat Bed 165" Each 2623 $
Dump Bed 141" Each 5,832 auto 6,852 manual 5,832 auto 6,852 manual
Dump Bed 165" Each 6,082 auto 7,070 manual 6,082 auto 7,070 manual
Global Positioning System NA NA
Side Air Bag NA . )
Amber Bar Light Halogen Rotator $748 $748
Cab Stripping $122 $122
Sliding Rear Window $104 $104
Exterior Colors No Charge No Charge
Gas Engine 6.8 Liter V-10 (Deduct) ($5,260) (35,260,
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) ($1,200) ($1,200
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) ($10) ($10
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile $1.59 $1.59
Available Axie Ratios 1., Contact Vendor Contact Vendor
2.
3.



CLASS 33A TRUCK
CHASSIS CAB, 43WD,
DIESEL, DUAL REAR WHEELS,

070-93-33-001

17,500 GVWR
Vendor Name; Stephens Auto Center
Manufacturer / Brand Ford
Delivery 90-180 days estimate
Model Name & Number F-550 F&67
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 300 HP_520 TORQUE 350 650
Transmisslon Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Powel/ABS
Radio AMIFM
Glass All Tinted
Mimors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Dual Rear Wheels Installed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size wilack
Alr Conditioning Installed
4AWD
Price Each 141" WB { 60* Cab-to-Axe) $59,838
Price Each 165" WB (84" Cab-to-Axle) No Bid
Options:
Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes: $ NA
Axie - Trac-Lok Differential $209
Englne Cooling - heavy duty STD f
Skid plate Group NA
Suspension - Heavy Duty wiGas Shocks STD Enter total off road pkg above
Ali Terrain Tires $158
Englne Coaling Heavy Duty STD
AM/FM w/ Cassette $ NA
AM/FM w/ CD Player $228
Shop/Service Manual contact vendor
CD Service Manual contact vendor
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control 320
Back-Up Alarim S0
HD Susp - GVWR: $ NA
Global Positioning System $ NA
Skie Air Bag $ A
Sliding Rear Window 104
Exterior Colors $ No Charge
Full Length Fenders w/Tool boxes $911
Rubber belt over Conveyor $437
Conveyor chain oiler $202
Running Boards 3348
Recelver Hitch wiball & pintle $349
Amber Bar Light $748
Cab Stipring $122
Rear patch pan $326
Rear ladder $302
Gas Engine 6.8 Liter V-10 (Deduct) $5,260
Manual Transmission w/Qverdrive (Deduct) ($1,200)
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) ($10)
FOB Other than Buckhannon, WV - Per Mile 1.59
Available Axle Ratios 1, S Contact Vendor
2
3.

Additienal Information:
Engine Block heater $29

Extra Heavy Duty Altemnator $62

Traller Tow Package $129 - trafler brake wiring

High Capacity traiter tow $291 - traller brake wiring and upgraded axle

Snowplow prep - $71

Vinyl Bucket Seats § 332

Backup alarm $86

2" Pintle Ball Combo, Mount, Pin - $107

2" Recelver Hitch - $249

XA7A Strobe light bar with spot light - $1,433
Seven way trailer piug - $65

Body painted any color but white $275
Running boards - Regular Cab - $348
Running boards - Extended/Crew Cab - $458

Note: Not all manual transmigsion have PTO appilications for dump bodies



CLASS 34 AUTOMOBILE 070-06-34-001
UTILITY, 4 WHEEL DRIVE, 4 DOOR
4100 GVWR
Vendor Name: Stephens Auto Center
Manufacturer / Brand Ford
Delivery 60 - 120 days estimate
Model Name & Number Escape U93
HP HGWY
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine 3.7IL MIN: 150 HP 165 TORQUE 200 30L 193
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM
Class All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Fuel Tank Standard
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Included - wiJack
Air Conditioning Installed
Front Seat Bucket
Floor Mats Instailed EPA EPA
Rear Window Defogger Installed HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline $18,389
Options:
1 Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes: NA
Axle-Trac-L.ok Differential NA
Engine Cooling - Heavy Duty NA T
Skid plate Group NA
Suspension - Heavy Duty W/Gas Shocks NA Enter total of off road pkg above
All Terrain Tires NA
Tow Hooks NA

2 AM/FM w/Cassette

3 AM/FM w/ CD Player

4 Shop/Service Manual

5 CD Service Manual

6 Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control

7 Global Positioning System

8 Side Air Bag

9 Tow Package

10 2 Passenger Seating

11 Exterior colors

12 Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)
13 Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)

14 FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

15 FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Additional Information:

List items included in this group

NA
std
contact vendor
contact vendor
std
NA
std
293
NA
ro charge
NA
NA
10
1.39

Tow package - hitch feceiver - Class ll, wiring harness.

7/20/2006
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CLASS 34A AUTOMOBILE
Utility, 4 Door, 4100 GVWWR
Vendor Name: Stephens Auto Center
Manufacturer / Brand Ford
Delivery 60 - 120 days estimate
Model Name & Number Escape Hybrid U48 and U59
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine Full Hybrid
Transmisslon Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/IFM
Class All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Fuel Tank Standard
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Included - w/Jack
Air Conditioning Installed
Front Seat Bucket
Floor Mats Installed
Rear Window Defegger Installed EPA EPA
HGWY CIEY
Hybrid Front Wheel Drive $23,817
Hybrid All Wheel Drive $25,474
Options:
Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes: NA
Axle-Trac-Lok Differential NA
Engine Cooling - Heavy Duty NA T
Skid plate Group NA
Suspension - Heavy Duty W/Gas Shocks NA Enter total off road pkg above
All Terrain Tires NA
Tow Hooks NA
AM/FM w/Cassette NA
AM/FM w/ CD Player std
Shop/Service Manual contact vendor
CD Service Manual contact vendor
Tilt Whee! & Cruise Control std
Global Positioning System NA
Side Air Bag std
Tow Package List items included in thjs group NA
2 Passenger Seating NA
Exterior colors no charge
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) NA
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct) NA
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) 10
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile 1.39

Additional Information:




State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Purchase Order -

ALLy STATE AGENCIES

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

RN e AR
MVO8FE
CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER
00 MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES,
INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS,
- QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS PUR-
CHASE ORDER SHOULD BE DIRECTED
TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.
SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR
TERMS AND CONDITIONS

*709034823 304-369-2411
STEPHENS ‘AUTO CENTER
PO BOX 278

DANVILLE WV 25053-0278

ALL STATE AGENCIES

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

1

RECEIPT TICKET [FOR PURCHASE ORDER: MVO8F
LINE CATNO  ITEM NUMHER DESCRIPTION QTY DATE
00G1 ' 070406-01-000 2008 (OR CURRENT MODEL YEAR) MOTOR
SIGNATURE DATE

IF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE []

APPROVED A8 TO FORM BY
ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL

BY.

PURCHASING DIVISION AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE



