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State of West Virgimia Contract
Contract No. CLRM 05
Elffective through March 15, 2006
Avatlable for all State Agencies and Political Subdivisions

10 all participants:

This contract guarantees the price on all items listed in this catalog through March 15, 2000.
The Prices herein are contract prices awarded to Tom Sexton & Associates by the state of West
Virginia. This contract was bid by the state in order to obtain the best pricing, value, and warranty

products in the marketplace. Pricing includes delivery charges on orders of $1,000.00 or more
per location. Orders less than $1,000.00 will be charged a small order fee which will be added to
your mvoice. 1The prices listed are for each manufacturer’s standard color options.

This contract shall cover the normal requirements for the use all state agencies, mstitutions,
public schools, and non-state agencies.

Valid from March 16, 2005 thru March 15, 2006.

Please mail or fax all orders directly to Tom Sexton & Associates at:
Tom Sexton and Associates
65 Cummings Drive
Walton, KY 41094
7oll free phone : 800-404-5032
Toll free fax : 800-404-8252 |
Web Site : www.tomsextonfurniture.com

Please contact us for immediate assistance.

1 erritory Manager Customer Service Rep.
Brian Hanes Tomilyn Anneken
T40-352-4246 (cel) 800-404-5032 (office, toll free)
740-778-1433 (office) 859-485-7065 (office)
740-778-1434 (fax) 800-404-8252 (fax)

bhanes@tomsextonfummniture.com fanneken@tomsextonlfurniture.com




West Virginia State Contract Pricing

. Unit Min | Non-Skid
Item Description . _
P Price | Order | Glides
Category I - Fixed-Height Chairs
12" Two-Piece "X-Frame™ Hard Plastic Stacking Chair
T |(Arico-Bel # X103) 3682 | 4 36.82
14” Two-Piece "X-Frame" Hard Plastic Stacking Chair
2 |(Artco-Bell # X103) 3582 | 4 36.82
16" Two-Piece "X-Frame” Hard Plastic Stacking Chair
3 |(Arico-Bell # X105) 3805 | 4 89.05
18” Two-Piece "X-Frame" Hard Plastic Stacking Chair
4 |(Anico-Bell # X107) 4062 | 4 4062
"A+" 18-1/2” "OverSize" Two-Piece "X-Frame”
4A |Hard Plastic Stacking Chair With 30% Larger 45.43 4 46.43
Seating Area (Artco-Bell # X108)
12” Two-Piece "H-Frame” Hard Plastic Stacking Chair
5 w/o Book Rack (Artco-Bell # H1X3) 3912 4 40.12
14” Two-Piece "H-Frame" Hard Plastic Stacking Chair
8 |wio BookRack (Artco-Bell # H1X3) 8992 1 4 4012
: 16” Two-Piece "H-Frame" Hard Plastic Stacking Chair
7 |Without BookRack (Artco-Bell # H1X5) 39.97 1 4 40.97
18” Two-Piece "H-Frame” Hard Plastic Stacking Chair
8 Without BookRack (Artco-Bell # H1X7) 42.56 4 43.56
8A | BookRack Option - ltems 5 Thru 8 5.00 per chair for bookrack
H Series Stack Chair (shown with bookrack)
9 | X-Brace Option for ltems 7 & 8 no bid
10” One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Stacking
10| Chair (Artco Bell # 7101) 1458 | 6 15.58 )
12" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Stacking
" IChair_(Artco-Bell # 7101) 1458 | 6 15.58
14” One-Piece Soft Piastic Seat & Back Stacking
2 |Chair (Artco-Bell # 7103} 1468 | 5 15.68
16” One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Stacking
13 Chair (Artco-Bell # 7105) 17.53 5 18.53
18” One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Stacking ‘
™ |Chair (Artco-Bell # 7107) 1939 |5 20.39
"A+" 18-1/2" "OverSize" One-Piece Soft Plastic
14A {Seat & Back Stacking Chair With 30% Larger 229 5 23.91
Seating Area (Artco-Bell # 7108) 7100 Series Stacking Chair
15 | Optional Bookrack for Itemn # 14 (Artco-Bell # 7157) 31.98 4 32.98
16 |Optional Ganging Device for ltem # 14 no bid | no min.
18" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Chair With
17 |Upholstered Seat & Back Pads and Casters (Artco- 454 5
Bell # 7167)
18" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Chair With
18 Upholstered Seat and Back Pads (Artco-Bell # 7107) 32.83 5 33"8?
18" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Chair With
19 | casters (Artco-Bell # 7167) 8348 | 5
Pneumatic Adjustable-Height One-Piece Soft Plastic
20 eat & Back Swivel Teacher's Chair, With Upholstered 7143 1
Seat & Back Pads and Molded 5-Pronged Pedestal '
Base (Artco-Bell # 7P90) Artco Bell 7P90
29 12" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Stacking 175 5
Chair With Sled Base (Artco-Bell # 7003) '
29 14” One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Stacking 175 5
Chair With Sled Base {Artco-Bell # 7003) ’
23 16” One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Stacking 1962 5
Chair With Sled Base (Arico-Bell # 7005) |
o4 18” One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Stacking 5183 5

Chair With Sled Base (ABC # 7007)

7000 Series Sled Base
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Item

Description

Unit
Price

Min
Order

Non-Skid
Glides

Category H - Fixed-Height Chair Desks

25

Chair Desk With Bookrack - Hard Plastic Seat, Back
and Tablet-Arm WorkTop (Artco-Bell # H257)

76.86

77.86

26

Chair Desk Without Bookrack - Hard Plastic Seat,
Back and Tablet-Arm WorkTop (Artco-Beli # H207)

72.18

73.18

27

Chair Desk With Bookrack - Hard Plastic Seat, Back ,
Laminate work surface (Artco Bell # H207)

66.05

67.05

28

Chair Desk With Bookrack - One-Piece Soft Plastic
Seat & Back With Laminate Tablet-Arm WorkTop
(Artco-Bell # 7257)

58.28

50.28

28A

"A+" "OverSize" Chair Desk With Bookrack - One-

Arm WorkTop and 30% Larger Seating Area ({Arico-
Bell # 7258)

Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back With Laminate Tablet{

65.06

65.06

29

Chair Desk Without Bookrack - One-Piece Soft Plastic
Seat & Back With Laminate Tablet-Arm WorkTop
(Arico-Bell #7207)

52.72

53.72

29A

"A+" "OverSize" Chair Desk Without Bookrack - One-
Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back With Laminate Tablet-
Arm WorkTop and 30% Larger Seating Area (Artco-
Bell #7208)

59.16

60.16

30

Chair Desk With Bookrack - One-Piece Soft Plastic
Seat & Back With Laminate Tablet-Arm WorkTop
(Artco-Bell #7257)

58.28

59.28

30A

"A+" "OverSize" Chair Desk With Bookrack - One-
Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back With Laminate Tablet-
Arm WorkTop and 30% Larger Seating Area (Artco-
Bell #7258)

65.06

66.06

31

Chair Desk Without Bookrack - One-Piece Soft Plastic
Seat & Back With Laminate Tablet-Arm WorkTop
(Arico-Bell #7207)

52.72

53.72

31A

"A+" "OverSize" Chair Desk Without Bookrack - One-

Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back With Laminate Tablet-

Arm WorkTop and 30% Larger Seating Area (Artco-
Bell #7208)

50.16

60.16

Category Il Fixed-Height Combination Study Unit Desks

H Series Combo Desk

32

Combination Desk With Bookrack - Hard Plastic Seat,
Back and WorkTop (Artco-Bell #H457)

91.49

92.49

32A

"A+" "OverSize" Combination Desk With Bookrack
Hard Plastic Seat, Back and WorkTop With 30%
Larger Seating Area (Artco-Bell #H458)

103.11

104.11

33

Combination Desk Without Bookrack - Hard Plastic
Seat, Back and WorkTop (Artco-Bell #H4407)

87.51

88.51

33A

"A+" "OverSize" Combination Desk Without Bookrack
- Hard Plastic Seat, Back and WorkTop With 30%
Larger Seating Area (Artco-Bell #4408)

91.42

92.42

34

Combination Desk With Bookrack - One-Piece Soft
Plastic Seat & Back With Laminate WorkTop (Artco-
Bell #7457)

56.58

57.58

34A

"A+" "OverSize" Combination Desk With Bookrack
One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back With Laminate
WorkTop and 30% Larger Seating Area (Artco-Bell
#7458)

63.62

64.62

35

Combination Desk Without Bookrack - One-Piece Soft
Plastic Seat & Back With Laminate WorkTop (Artco-
Bell #7407)

53.43

54.43

35A

"A+" "OverSize" Combination Desk Without
Bookrack - One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back
With Laminate WorkTop and 30% Larger Seating
Area (Artco-Bell #7408)

55.31

56.31

36

Combination Desk Without Bookrack - One-Piece Soft
Plastic Seat & Back With Laminate WorkTop ({Arico-
Bell #7407)

53.43

54.43

36A

"A+" "OverSize” Combination Desk Without
Bookrack - One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back
With Laminate WorkTop and 30% Larger Seating

Area {Artco-Bell #7408)

58.79

58.79

H Series Double Eniry
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s Unit Min | Non-Skid
ltem Description .
P Price | Order | Glides
"A+" *OverSize” Combination Desk With Bookrack
One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back With Hard Plastic
368 WorkTop and 30% Larger Seating Area (Artco-Bell 7779 2 78.79
#7458)
"A+" *OverSize” Combination Desk Without
Bookrack - One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back
36C With Hard Plastic WorkTop and 30% Larger 723 2 785
Seating Area (Artco-Bell #7408)
Combination Desk With Double Entry Sled Base and
37 |Bookrack - Hard Plastic Seat, Back and WorkTop 118.31 2
(Arico-Bell #H057)
Combination Desk With Double Entry Sled Base and
38 |Bookrack - One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back With 82.13 2 83.13

Laminate WorkTop (Arico-Bell #7857)

7000 Series Double Entry

Category IV - Fixed-Height Open-Front Combination Study Unit Desks

39

Bookbox Combination Desk - Hard Plastic Seat, Back
and WorkTop With Steel Bookbox (Scholar Craft
#780)

120.71

2

40

Bookbox Combination Desk - One-Piece Soft Plastic
Seat & Back With Hard Plastic WorkTop and Steel
Bookbox {Scholar Craft #720)

105.47

Scholar Craft 780

Category V - Fixed-Height Lift-Lid Combination Study Unit Desks

Lift-Lid Bookbox Combination Desk - Hard Plastic

2

41 |{Seat, Back and WorkTop With Steel Bookbox 139.83
(Scholar Craft #980)
Lift-Lid Bookbox Combination Desk - One-Piece Soft

42 |Plastic Seat & Back With Hard Plastic WorkTop and 120.01 2

Steel Bookbox (Scholar Craft #920)

Scholar Craft 920
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[ - Unit | Min | Non-Skid
ftem Description Price | Order | Glides
Category VI - Adjustable-Height Open-Front Book Box Desks
Pedestal "T-Leg" Bookbox Desk With 18" x 24" Hard
43 |Plastic WorkTop and Steel Bookbox (Artco-Bell 63.87 2
#9300)
Pedestal "T-Leg" Bookbox Desk With 20" x 26"
44 |Laminate WorkTop and Steel Bookbox 70.59 2
{Artco-Bell #9306)
Artco Bell 9300 Artco Bell 9500
45 Four-Leg Bookbox Desk With 18" x 24" Hard Plastic 49.64 5
WorkTop and Steel Bookbox (Arico-Bell #9500) '
46 Four-Leg Bookbox Desk With 18" x 24* Laminate 34.88 5
. WorkTop and Steel Bookbox {Artco-Bell #9500) '
Two-Student Pedestal "T-Leg" Bookbox Desk With
47 |Laminate WorkTop and Steel Bookboxes 116.95 1
(Artco-Bell #1911)
Four-Leg Student Desk With Steel Side Book
48 Compartment, Modesty Panel, and 18" x 34" Laminate 60.01 >
WorkTop (Artco-Bell #2111 Left-Hand or #2121 Right4 :
Hand) Arico Bell 1911 Artco Beli2121
Category VII - Adjustable-Height Lift-Lid Book Box Desks
Four-Leg Lift-Lid Bookbox Desk With 18" x 24" Hard
49 |Plastic WorkTop and Steel Bookbox (Artco-Bell 84.19 2
#9780)
Four-Leg Lift-Lid Bookbox Desk With 18" x 24"
50 |Laminate WorkTop and Steel Bookbox 70.04 2
(Artco-Bell #9780)
Pedestal "T-Leg" Lift-Lid Bookbox Desk With 18" x 24"
51 |Hard Plastic WorkTop and Steel Bookbox (Arico-Bell | 102.42 2
#9680)
Pedestal "T-Leg" Lift-Lid Bookbox Desk With 18" x 24"
52 |Laminate WorkTop and Steel Bookbox 88.27 2
(Artco-Bell #9680) Artco Bell 9680
Category VIlI - Adjustable-Height Student Study Desks
Four-Leg Student Study Desk With Open-View Book
53 |Compartment and 18" x 24" Hard Plastic WorkTop 59.79 2
(Artco-Bell #9800}
Four-Leg Student Study Desk With Open-View Book
54 |Compartment and 18" x 24" Laminate WorkTop 42.81 2
(Arico-Bell #9800)
Four-Leg Student Study Desk Without Book
55 |Compariment With 20" x 34" Hard Plastic WorkTop 63.03 2
(Artco-Bell #2800) .
Four-Leg "Flat Top" Student Study Desk With 18" x
56 [24" Hard Plastic WorkTop and Chrome 52,75 2
Frame (Arico-Bell #8100) . Artco Bell 9800 Artco Bell 2800
Category IX - Pneumatic Height-Adjustable Star
Base Swivel Computer Lab Chairs
57 |Hard Plastic Seat and Back (Artco-Bell #HP90) 72.65 1
"StandardSize" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back
%8 | (Arico-Bell #7P90) 6989 | 1
"OverSize" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back
%9 | (Artco-Bell #7P98) 77181
. Artco Bell HPG0 Artco Bell 7P98
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Item Description Unit Min | Non-Skid
Price | Order | Glides
Category X - Adjustable-Height Multi-Purpose Activity Tables
Four-Leg With 24" x 36" Laminate Top
80 | (Arico-Bell #1206) 5825 | 2
Four-Leg With 24" x 48" Laminate Top
61 | (Artco-Bell #1210) 56.84 2
Four-Leg With 24" x 60" Laminate Top .
52 |(Artco-Bell #1235) 7078 | 2
Four-Leg With 30" x 48" Laminate Top
63 | (Arico-Bell #1220) 6151 | 2
Four-Leg With 30" x 60" Laminate Top
64 | (AricoBell #1230) 75.04 1
Four-Leg With 30" x 72" Laminate Top
85 | (Artco-Bell #1250) gsm | 1
Four-Leg With 36" x 36" Laminate Top )
66 (Artco-Bell #1205) 6752 2
Four-Leg With 36" x 60" Laminate Top
67 (Arico-Bell #1240) 83.36 1
Four-Leg With 36" x 72" Laminate Top
68 (Arico-Bell #1260) 90.16 1
Four-Leg With 36" Dia. Round Laminate Top
69 | Artco-Bell #1282) 64.02 2
Four-Leg With 42" Dia. Round Laminate Top
70 | (Artco-Bell $1281) 7106 | 2 \ |
Four-Leg With 48" Dia. Round Laminate Top g | ]
71| (Artco-Bell #1280) 76.39 ! i
-5 |Fourleg With 60" Dia. Round Laminate Top 102.9 1 &
(Arico-Bell #1286) ’ Artco Bell 1200 Series Activity Table
Four-Leg With 48" x 72" Kidney-Shape Laminate Top
73 | Artco-Bell #1275) 127.47 1 1
Four-Leg With 60" x 66" Horseshoe-Shape Laminate y
74 Top (Artco-Bell #1277) 153.96 !
Four-Leg With 24" x 24" x 24" x 48" Trapezoid-Shape ‘
75 | Laminate Top (Arico-Bell #1291) 63.87 2
76 Four-Leg With 30" x 30" x 30" x 60" Trapezoid-Shape 76.93 2
Laminate Top (Artco-Bell #1290) i
Pedestal *T-Leg" With 24" x 48" Laminate Top
77 | (Arico-Bell #1910) 10273 | 1
Pedestal "T-Leg" With 24" x 48" Laminate Top
78 | (Artco-Bell #1910) 10273 1 1
79 Pedestal "T-Leg" With 30" x 60" Laminate Top 118 1
(Artco-Bell #1930) v
80 Pedestal "T-Leg" With 30" x 72" Laminate Top 123.2 1
(Artco-Bell #1950) ' Artco Bell 1900 Series Activity Table
Pedestal "T-Leg” With 36" x 72" Laminate Top
81 | (Artco-Bell #1960) 13015 1
82 |Pedestal "T-Leg" - UnKnown Size no bid
83 |Tote Tray 12”x 16” x 4” High no bid
Steel Bookbox 14-1/2” x 13-5/8” x 4 ¥2" High .
84 | Artco-Bell #0021) 10.48 | no min.
85 |9" x 21" Wire Management Panel (Artco-Bell #WMP3) 26.52 2
86 |9"x 33" Wire Management Panel (Artco-Bell #WMP4) |  28.49 2
87 |9" x 45" Wire Management Panel (Arico-Bell #WMP5)| 29.97 2
88 |9"x 57" Wire Management Panel (Artco-Bell #WMP6)| 32.42 2
Optional Castel id
89 pu sters no bi Artco Bell Wire Management
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i Unit Min | Non-Skid
m Description N N
it P Price | Order | Glides
Folding Table With 30" x 60" Laminate Top
0 | (Midwest Folding Products #3060F) °0.75 2
91 Folding Table With 30" x 72" Laminate Top 96.49 5
(Midwest Folding Products #3072F) :
9 Folding Table With 30" x 96" Laminate Top 111.52 1
(Midwest Folding Products #3096F) ’
03 Folding Table With 60" Dia. Round Laminate Top 14217 1
{Midwest Folding Products #R60F) ’
Midwest F Series
Category XI - Heavy Duty Folding Tables
04 Heavy-Duty Adjustable-Height Folding Table With no bid
20" x 26" Plywood Laminate Top
Heavy-Duty Adjustable-Height "T-Leg" Folding Table
95 [With 24" x 48" Plywood Laminate Top 183.26 1
(Midwest Folding Products #TLA245EF)
Heavy-Duty Adjustable-Height "T-Leg" Folding Table
96 |With 30" x 60" Plywood Laminate Top 182.68 1
(Midwest Folding Products #TLA305EF)
Heavy-Duty Adjustable-Height "T-Leg" Folding Table
97 |With 30" x 72" Plywood Laminate Top 194.1 1
{Midwest Folding Products #TLA306EF
Heavy-Duty Adjustable-Height "T-Leg" Folding Table .
98 |With 36" x 72" Plywood Laminate Top 213.22 1
(Midwest Folding Products #TLA 366EF) Midwest TLA Series Folding Table
Category Xll - Lightweight Folding Tables
18" x 72" Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top
99 | (Midwest Folding Products #618LW) 15414 2
18" x 96" Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top
100 | Vlidwest Folding Products #818LW) 18588 | 2
101 24" x 72" Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top 161.1 5
. - is # .
(Midwest Folding Products #624LW) Midwest LW Series Rectangular
24” x 96” Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top ;
192 | Midwest Folding Products #824LW) f7e1e ) 2
30" x 60” Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top
103 | (\lidwest Folding Products #530LW) 15662 | 2
30" x 72" Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top
104 | Migwest Folding Products #630LW) 172811 2
30" x 96” Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top
105 | Midwest Folding Products #830LW) 18484 1 2
36" x 72" Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top
106 | (\lidwest Folding Products #636LW) 206.97 | 2
36" x 96” Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top
107 | (\idwest Folding Products #836LW) 224.3 2
108 60" Dia. Round Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top 209.32 1
" | (Midwest Folding Products #R60LW) . Midwest LW Series Round
Category Xill - Banquet Folding Tables
30" x 72" Folding Table With Plywood Laminate Top
109 | \fidwest Folding Products #630EF) 12486 | 2
110 30" x 96" Folding Table With Plywood Laminate Top 141.79 5
(Midwest Folding Products #830EF) i
111 60" Dia. Round Folding Table With Plywood Laminate 174.6 i

Top (Midwest Folding Products #R60EF)

Midwest EF Series Folding
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ltem Description

Unit
Price

Min

Order

Non-Skid
Glides

Category X1V - Mobile Folding Cafeteria Tables

48" Dia. Round Table With Particleboard Laminate
112 |Top, "T-Mold" Vinyl Edge and Chrome Frame
(Midwest Folding Products #SRT48C)

355.81

60" Dia.Round Table With Particleboard Laminate
113 |Top, "T-Mold" Vinyl Edge and Chrome Frame
(Midwest Folding Products #SRT60C)

372.52

30” x 145” Table With Particleboard Laminate Top, "T-
114 [Molid" Vinyl Edge and Chrome Frame
(Midwest Folding Products #STU12C)

465.93

Midwest SRT Round

Midwest STU

30" x 145" Table With Particleboard Laminate Top,
*T-Mold" Vinyl Edge, Chrome Frame and 17" High
Attached Stool Seating (12 Seats)

(Midwest Folding Products #5SU1212C)

115

879.6

30" x 145" Table With Particleboard Laminate Top, T
Mold" Vinyl Edge, Chrome Frame and 15" High
Attached Stool Seating (12 Seats) (Midwest Folding
Products #8SU1212C)

116

879.6

30" x 145" Table With Particleboard Laminate Top, "T-
Mold" Vinyl Edge, Chrome Frame and 15" High
Attached Bench Seating (Midwest Folding Products
#SBU12C)

117

764.97

Midwest SSU with Stools

Midwest SBU with Benches

30" x 145" Table With Particleboard Laminate Top, T
Mold" Vinyl Edge, Chrome Frame and 17" High
Attached Bench Seating

(Midwest Folding Products #SBU12C)

118

764.97

60" Dia. Round Table With Particleboard Laminate
Top, "T-Mold" Vinyl Edge, Chrome Frame, and
Attached Stool Seating (8 Seats) (Midwest Folding
Products #SSUR608C)

118B

783.81

96" Long "Convertibie Bench” Table With
Particleboard Laminate Top, Plywood Laminate
118C |Bench, Vinyl "T-Mold" Edge, Powdercoat Painted
Frame With Chrome Plated Pedestal

(Midwest Folding Products #TB8)

387.85

Midwest SSUR608C

Midwest Convertible Bench Table

T

1T

Ll

Category XV - Desks (Teacher's and Study Carrel)

30" x 48” Single-Pedestal Steel Teacher's Desk
119 {(Artco-Bell #D4L0 Left Pedestal or #D4R0 Right
Pedestal)

231.41

30” x 60” Double-Pedestal Steel Teacher's Desk

120 (Artco-Bell #D500)

359.65

Artco Bell Teacher's Desk

24" x 36" Study Carrel Desk With Pedestal "T-Legs",
121 |Laminate Top, and Laminate Privacy Panel With Top
Shelf (Artco-Bell #1321)

134.93

24" x 36" Study Carrel Desk With Pedestal "T-Legs”,
122 {Laminate Top, and Laminate Privacy Panel With Top
Shelf (Artco-Bell #1321)

134.93

Optional Privacy Panel (Included in tems #121 &

123 |4122)

no bid

Category XVI - Miscellaneous Chairs

Upholstered Stack Chair With Chrome Frame

124 1 HoN #1081)

46.84

Stackable Upholstered Chair With Painted Frame and

125 Without Armrests (HON #1082)

46.84

Hon Stacking Chair

NPS 200 Series

126 |Steel Folding Chair (National Public Seating #200)

15.14

Steel Folding Chair With Vinyl Seat & Back Padding

127 | (National Public Seating #1200)

20.97

High-Density Poly Stacking Chair {Artco-Bell #0S17)

128 (Equal to VIRCO "Virtuoso” Chair)

49.99

Artco Bell CS17




. Unit Min | Non-Skid
Hem Description N !
P Price | Order | Glides
Category XVl - Storage Equipment
Table Caddy for 48" to 72" Round Folding Tables
129 | \idwest Folding Products #HRTC) s28.72 | 1
Table Caddy for 72* Long Rectangular Folding Tables i
130 | Midwest Folding Products #TC72) 157.99 | 1
131 Table Caddy for 96" Long Rectangular Folding Tables 163.32 1
(Midwest Folding Products #TC96) ) Midwest HRTC Midwest Table Caddy
Horizontal Chair Caddy for Folding Chairs ’
182 | Migwest Folding Products #CC84) 14929 | 1
Two-Tier Vertical Chair Caddy for Folding Chairs
133 | (\Vtidwest Folding Products #VCT72) 26929 | 1
Midwest VCT 72
Category XVl - Adjustable-Height Stools
With Poly Seat and Chrome Frame
134 | Arico-Bell #0801 (Adjusts 19” to 27-1/2") 40.46 4
With Poly Seat and Chrome Frame
138 | A rto-Bell #0802 (Adjusts 23" to 32°) “74 | 4
with Hard Plastic Seat and Chrome Frame
137 | Artco-Bell #0803 (Adjusts 19-1/2" to 28") 40.31 4
138 with Hard Plastic Seat and Chrome Frame 505 4
Arico-Bell #0804 (Adjusts 23-1/2" to 32-1/2°) ] Artco Bell Poly Seat __* Artco Bell Hard Plastic

Category XIX - inside Delivery Fee

Cost/
per

Additional 10% per item

Main

Mol

Vendor Representative:

Name: Brian Hanes Tom Sexton & Associates

Address: 112 Laurel Lick Road

South Webster, Ohio 45682
Office : 1-800-404-5032

L |Reps Office : (740) 778-1433

bile : (740) 352-4246

|| FAX : (740) 778-1434
E-mail : bhanes@tomsextonfurniture.com
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SEXT0 ORDER FORM

SO

rorulture and Bquipment) 65 Cummings Drive Telephone:(859) 485-7065
) U Walton, KY 41094 Fax:(859) 485-7085 Date:
SSocIA
Bill To: Ship To:
Attn: Atin:
Street: Street: ;
City: State: Zip: City: State: Zip:
Customer P.O. No. Ship Date: FO.B
Quantity | Unit Model & Description Unit Price Total Price

PAYMENT TERMS: CHECK, VISA, OR MASTERCARD.




Tom Sexton and Assoclates

proudly represents the following manufactures

1 the State of West Virginia

National Public Hﬂ"

Seating Corp. Office Furniture

We would like to thank you for your continued
patronage and look forward to serving your
furniture needs in the future.

Catalog 2005




