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GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS

PURCHASE ORDER/CONTRACT

1. ACCEPTANCE: Seller shall be kound by this order and its terms and conditions upon receipt of this order.

2 APPLICABLE LAW: The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing
Division shall govern all rights and duties under the Contract, including without limitation the validity of this
Purchase Order/Contract. '

3. NON-FUNDING: All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Orders/Contracts are to be
continued for the terms of the Purchase Order/Contract, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the
Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds are not approprated or otherwise available
for these services or goods, this Purchase Crder/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.

4, COMPLIANCE: Seller shall corhply with all federal, state and local laws, regulations and ordinances including,
but not limited to, the prevailing wage rates of the WV Division of Labor. .

5, MODIFICATIONS: This writing is the parties’ final expression of infent. No modification of this order shall be
binding unless agreed to in writing by the Buyer. ' ‘

6. ASSIGNMENT: Neither this Order nor any monies due, or to become due hereunder may be assigned by the
Selier without the Buyer's consent. ‘

7. WARRANTY: The Seller expressly warrants that the goods andfor services covered by this order will:
{a) conform to the specifications, drawings, samples or other description furnished or specified by the
Buyer; {b} be merchantable and fit for the purpose intended; and/or {c} be free from defect in material and
workmanship.

8. CANCELLATION: The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Confract upon 30 days written

" nofice to the seller,
9. SHIPPING, BILLING & PRICES: Prices are those stated in this order. No price increase will be accepted

without written authority from the Buyer. ANl goods or setvices shall be shipped on or before the date
specified in this Order. '

10. LATE PAYMENTS: Payments may only be made after the delivery of goods or services. [nterest may be paid
on late payments in accordance with the West Virginia Code. :

11. TAXES: The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse
stuich taxes.

12. RENEWAL: Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Cantract may be renewed only upon
mufual written agreement of the parties. . . :

13. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankrupicy protection, the State may deem this
contract null and void, and terminate such contract without further order. :

14. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attomey General, is available online at www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.htm -
and is hereby made part of the agreement provided that the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entity
(45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

15. CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such
personally identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the agency's
policies, procedures, and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and Information
Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in hitp/fwww.state. wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy/noticeConfidentiality pdf.

16. LICENSING: Vendors must be ficensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and
requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited o, the West Virginia Secretary
of State's Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission, or any other state agency

."or polifical subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary releases to obtain information to enable the

Direcior or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good standing with the above enfities.

17. ANTITRUST: In accepting this purchase order or signing this contract with any agency for the State of West Virginia,
the vendor agrees o convey, sell, assign, or transfer to the State of West Virginia all rights, fitle, and interest
in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and
the State of West Virginia for price fixing andfor unreasonable restraints of trade relating fo the particular
commodities or services purchased or acquired by the State of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made -
and become effective at the fime the purchasing agency tenders the initial payment to vendor. Vendor certifies
that this purchase order or. contract is accepted or entered into without any prior understanding, agreement, or
connection to any.other enfity that could be considered a violation of law. Vendor further certifies that this
purchase order or contract is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud.

Rev. B/0S/10
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CEREAL11 Pricing Pages

A_F. WENDLING, INC

Vendor's
stock Price Per
item # Description Packaged Number Carton
General Mills "or equal” - Bulk Cereal
1[Kix “or equal" 4/35 oz Glister 16493 $ 16.35
General Mills “or equal” - Large Size Cereal
2|French Toast Crunch "or equal” Na Bid
3|Cinnamon Toast Crunch "or equal” 4/35 oz Glister 16674 $ 17.76
4|Cheerios "or equal” 4/35 oz Glister 15247 $ 15.06
5|Cocoa Puffs "or equal 4/35 oz Glister 16673 $ 16.756
6{Count Dracuia "or equal” 4/48 oz Malt-O-Meal 15249 $ 27.45
7|Country Corn Flakes "or equal” 4/35 oz Glister 13394 $ 12.89%
8|Frosted Cheerios "or equal” 4135 oz General Mills 19117 $ 33.51
9|Golden Grahams "or equal" 6/32 oz Malit-O-Meal 15253 $ 36.10
10l Frosted Wheaties "or equal” No Bid
11iHoney Nut Cheerios "or equal” 435 oz Glister 13396 $ 16.45
12|Kix "or equal” 4/35 oz Glister 16493 $ 16.35
13]Lucky Charms "or equal" 4/42 oz Malt-O-Meal 15259 $ 25.87
14|Nature Valley 100% Nature Grancta "or equal” 4/50 oz General Mills 19118 $ 43.01
15|Low Fat Granola "or equal” 4/50 oz Malt-O-Meal 15262 $ 34.75
16|Rice Crunchies "or equal" 4/35 oz Glister 00528 $ 15.79
17| Total "or equal” 4/40.5 oz General Mills 19119 $ 45.06
18| Total Raisin Bran "or equal” 4135 oz Glister 13395 $ 16.32
19]Trix "or equal” 4/35 oz Glister 16494 $ 17.00
20|Wheaties "or equal” 4/43.5 oz General Mills 19138 $ 38.28
21|Rice Chex "or equal" 4/33 oz Generai Mills 15275 $ 33.38
22|Corn Chex "or equal” 4/33 oz General Mills 16278 $ 31.62
23{Wheat Chex "or equal” No Bid
24| Cookie Crisp "or equal” 4/35 oz General Mills 19120 $ 39.17
General Mills "or equal” - Individual Size
25|Apple Cinnamon Cheerios "or equal” No Bid
26{Cheerios "or equal” 70 ct General Mills 15287 $ 25.14
27|Country Corn Flakes "or equal” 70 ct General Mills 15288 $ 25.14
28| Golden Grahams "or equal” 70 ct General Mills 19121 $ 25.14
28|Honey Nut Cheerios "or equal” 70 ct General Mills 15291 $ 25.14
30|Lucky Charms "or equal” 70 ct General Mills 15293 $ 2514
31|Total "or equal” 70 ct General Mills 15294 $ 2514
32|Total Raisin Bran "or equal” 70 ct General Miils 15295 $ 25.14
33|Wheaties "or equal” 70 ct General Mills 15296 $ 25.14
34|Single Pak Favorites "or equal” 70 ct General Mills 19122 $ 30.48
35|Family Assorted Single Pak "or equal” 70 ct General Mills 15298 $ 30.48
36|Rice Chex "or equal” 70 ct General Mills 15299 $ 25.14
37|Corn Chex "or equal" No Bid
38|Wheat Chex "or equal” No Bid
39|Frosted Wheaties "or equal” No Bid
General Mills "or equal" - Self Service Bowls
40|Apple Cinnamon Cheerios "or equal® 96 ct Malt-C-Meal 15284 $ 17.85

~



Vendor's
stock Price Per
ltem # Description Packaged Number Carton
41|Berry Berry Kix "or equal” 96 ct Malt-O-Meal 15305 $ 17.85
42|Cheerios "or equal" 96 ct Malt-O-Meal 19123 $ 17.85
43|Cinnamon Toast Crunch "or equal” 96 ct Malt-O-Meal 15308 $ 17.85
44{Cocoa Puifs "or equal” 96 ct Malt-O-Meal 15309 $ 17.85
45:Country Corn Flakes "or equai" 96 ct Malt-O-Meal 15310 $ 17.85
46French Toast Crunch "or equal” 86 ¢t Malt-O-Meal 15308 $ 17.85
47|Frosted Cheerios "or equal” 96 ct General Mills 19124 $ 22.95
48]Frosted Corn Flakes "or equal” 96 ct Malt-O-Meal 15322 $ 17.85
General Mills "or equal" - Self Service Bowls (cont.)
49]Fruity Cheerioes "or equal” 96 ct General Mills 19125 $ 22.95
50|Golden Grahams "or equal” 96 ct Malt-O-Meal 15461 $ 17.85
51|Honey Nut Cheerios "or equal” 96 ct Mait-O-Meal 15463 $ 17.85
52|Honey Nut Chex "or equal” 96 ct General Mills 11820 $ 22.95
53|Kix "or equal" 96 ct Glister 19126 $ 20.25
54|Lucky Charms "or equal” 26 ct Malt-O-Meal 19127 $ 17.85
55|Multi-Grain Cheerios Plus "or equal” 96 ct General Mills 19128 $ 22.95
56iRice Chex "or equal” 96 ct General Mills 19128 $ 22.95
57{Rice Crunchigs "or equal” 96 ct Malt-O-Mea! 15326 $ 17.85
58{Team Cheerios "or equal” No Bid
59|Total "or equal" 96 ct -General Mills 19130 $ 22.96
60| Total Raisin Bran "or equal" 96 ct Malt-O-Meal 18708 $ 17.85
61|Trix "or equal” 96 ct Malt-O-Meal 19131 $ 17.85
62|Wheaties "or equal” 96 ct Glister 15303 $ 20.25
63[Wheaties Raisin Bran "or egual” 96 ¢t Malt-O-Meal 18708 $ 17.86
Kelloggs "or equal” - Large Size Cereals
64|Comn Flakes "or equal” 4/35 oz Glister 13394 $ 12.89
65|Rice Krispies "or equal" 4{35 oz Glister 00529 $ 15.79
66|Complete Wheat Bran Flakes "or equal” 4/35 oz Glister 19132 $ 14.34
67|Raisin Bran "or equal” 4/35 oz Glister 13395 $ 16.32
68|Corn Pops "or equal” 4/35 oz Kelloggs 19133 $ 36.00
69[{Cocoa Krispies "or equal” 4/35 oz Glister 16673 $ 16.76
70iSmacks "or egual” - No Bid
71lFrosted Flakes "or equal" 4/35 oz Glister 16671 $ 15.06
721Special K "or equal” 4/35 oz Kelloggs 15254 $ 37.50
73|Fruit Loops "or equal" 4/35 oz Glister 16494 $ 17.00
74|Cruncherpos "or equal” 4/35 oz Glister 19134 $ 15.06
75]Apple Jacks "or equal” 4/35 oz Glister 16487 $ 17.00
761Crispix "or equal” No Bid
77]Cracklin Oat Bran "or equal” No Bid
78|Frosted Mini Wheats Bite Size "or equal” 4/35 oz Glister 19135 $ 16.40
79|Low Fat Granola "or equal” 4/50 oz Malt-O-Meal 15262 $ 34.75
80]JHoney Crunch Corn Flakes "or equal” No Bid
81|Marshmaliow Blasted Fruit Loops "or equal” No Bid
82|Raisin Bran Crunch "or equal” No Bid
Kelloggs "or equal” - Individual Size
83|Corn Fiakes "or equal” 70 ct General Mills 15288 $ 25.14
84|Rice Krispies "aor equal” 70 ct General Miils 19137 $ 25.14
85|Complete Wheat Bran Flakes "or equal" 70 ct General Mills 15296 $ 25.14
86|Raisin Bran Crunch "or equal" No Bid
87|Corn Pops "or equal” 70 ct Kelloggs 19136 3 31.25

oo



Vendor's
stock Price Per
Item # Description Packaged Number Carton
88|Cocoa Krispies "or equal" No Bid
89|Smacks "or equal" No Bid
90{All Bran "or equal" 70 ct Kelloggs 15270 $ 32.00
91|Frosted Flakes "or equal" 70 ct Kelloggs 19139 $ 31.25
92|Frosted Mini-Wheats "or equal” 70 ct Kelloggs 19140 $ 34.00
93iSpecial K "or equal” 70 ct Kelloggs 00599 $ 32.00
94 iFruit Loops "or equal” 70 ct Kelloggs 19141 $ 31.25
95|Product 19 "or equal” No Bid
96|Puffed Wheat "or equal" No Bid
97|Puffed Rice "or equal” No Bid
98|Cruncheros "or equal" 70 ct General Milis 19142 $ 25.14
99|Shredded Wheat Minatures "or equal” No Bid
100|Apple Jacks "or equal” 70 ct Kelloggs 15286 $ 31.25
101|Assorted "or equal” 72 ct Kelloggs 00540 [§  37.25
102{Crispix "or equal" No Bid
Kelloggs "or equal” - Individual Size {cont.)
103]Frosted Mini Wheats Bite Size "or equal" 70 ct Kelloggs 19143 $ 34.00
1041Grancla with Raisins No Bid
105]Low Fat Granola with Raisins "or equal” No Bid
106{Honey Crunch Corn Flakes "or equal” No Bid
Kelloggs "or equal" - Cereal Bar
1071Apple Cinnamon Nutri-Grain "or equal” 120/1.3 oz Stauffers 11973 $ 27.38
108|Blueberry Nutri-Grain "or equal” 120/1.3 oz Stauffers 11975 $ 27.38
109|Raspberry Nuiri-Grain "or equal” 48/1.3 oz Kelloggs 00814 $ 18.68
110|Strawberry Nutii-Grain "or equal" 120/1.3 oz Stauffers 11974 $ 27.38
111|Cherry Nutri-Grain "or equal” No Bid
Kelloggs "or equal” - Self Serve Bowls
112|Corn Flakes "or equal” 96 ct Malt-O-Meal 15310 $ 17.85
113|Rice Krispies "or equal” 96 ct Malt-O-Meal 15326 $ 17.85
114|Complete Wheat Bran Flakes "or equal" 96 ct Glister 16488 $ 20.25
115{Raisin Bran Crunch "or equal” 96 ct Malt-O-Meal 18708 $ 17.85
116{Corn Pops "or equal” 96 cf Glister 19144 $ 20.25
117|Cocoa Krispies "or equal” 26 ct Malt-O-Meal 15308 $ 17.85
118|Smacks "or equal” No Bid
119|Frosted Flakes "or equal” 96 ct Malt-O-Meal 15322 $ 17.85
120]Special K "or equal” 96 ct Kelloggs 00639 $ 34.25
121|Fruit Loops "or equal” 96 ct Malt-O-Meal 19145 $ 17.86
122|Product 19 "or equal” No Bid
123]Cruncheros "or equal” 96 ¢t Malf-O-Meal 19146 $ 17.85
124|Apple Jacks "or equal” 96 ct Mait-O-Meal 15284 $ 17.85
125|Crispix "or equal” 96 ct Kelloggs 19147 $ 3425
126|Frosted Mini Wheats Bite Size "or equal" 96 ct Glister 17174 $ 20,25
127|Honey Crunch Corn Flakes "or equal” No Bid
Hot Cereal 12/28 oz.
128|Cream of Wheat (Quick) "or equal” 12/28 oz Glister 00797 $ 15.49
128|Cream of Rice (Quick} "or equal" 12/28 oz Homestate 19148 $ 33.30
130|Cocoa Wheat (Quick) "or equal" 12/28 oz Malt-O-Meal 00801 $ 34.99
131|Quick Qats "or equal 12/42 oz Malt-O-Meal 00807 $ 22.22
132|Quaker Baked Apple "or equal" 24/1.9 oz Quaker 19149 $ 22.59
133|Quaker Brown Sugar & Cinnamon "or equal” 96 ct Malt-O-Meal 19150 1§ 12.36
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Vendor's
stock Price Per
Iltem # Description Packaged Number Carton
134|Quaker Assorted Flavor Pouches "or equal” 96 ct Mait-O-Meal 19151 $ 12.36
MiSC
135|Hospitality Bran Flakes "or equal” 4/35 oz Gilster 16488 $ 14.34

Minimum Shipment accepted (Agency pay shipping)

Minimum Shipment for free delivery (Must be at least $300.00) $300.00

$100.00
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Purchase Order o

State of West Virginia TEPRGELS

Department of Administration

Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East

Post Office Box 50130 : O —

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 — CLANKETHELEASE . CORRECT PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER-
00 MUST APPEAR ON ALL PACKAGES,

INVOICES, AND SHIPPING PAPERS,
QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS PUR-
CHASE ORDER SHOULD BE DIRECTED

AL, STATE AGENCIES TO THE BUYER AS NOTED BELOW.
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS s GHANGE ORDER:
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

BY ORDER : ] SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR
TERMS AND CONDITIONS

*709040106 304-472-5500
A F WENDLING INC
PO BOX 661 176 WOOD ST

ALL STATE AGENCIES

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
..BY ORDER

BUCKHANNON WV 26201

550383249 '
EBEIGHETERMS

— DESTINATLON. —PREBATD

RECEIPT TICKET FOR PURCHASE ORDER:| CEREALILLB

LINHE CATNO ITEM NUMBHR DESCRIPTION QTY DATE

0001 393-36 VARIQOUS CEREALS FOR ALL STATE ArGENC

SIGNATURE DATE

iF APPROVAL AS TO FORM IS REQUIRED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL, CHECK HERE O

BY. -
AT AT e Y CNERAL o PURCHASING DIVISION AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE



