West Virginia

Purchasing Division

The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wvOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West Virginia’s
procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses
to this solicitation submitted to the Purchasing
Division in hard copy format.



https://WVPurchasing.gov
https://wvOASIS.gov

WSI S Jump to: PRCUID i $|@ @Hume é‘#PErsnnaiize @.Accessibiiity Eﬁup Help “T About Q

Budgeting

Welcome, Christopher W Seckman Procurament Accounis Receivabie Accounts Payable

‘Solicitation Respunsé{SR}| Dept: 0202 ID: ESROG032600000008426 WVer: 1 Function: New Phase: Final

e=L RN INE pEIT I Contact | Default Values | Discount | Document Information | Clarification Request

Procurement Folder: 1976520 50 Doc Code: CRFQ
Procurement Type: Central Master Agreement 50 Dept: 0303
Vendor ID: 000000193873 3| $0 Doc ID: DOT2600000100
Legal Name: SEABCARD ASPHALT PRODUCTS CO Published Date: 6/17/26
Alias/DBA: Close Date: 6/23/26
Total Bid: $11,176.62 Close Time: 13:30
Response Date: uﬁmaﬁugﬁ Status: Closed

Solicitation Description: ASPHALT CRACK SEALANT for
Response Time: 944

DISTRICT ONE e
Responded By User ID: | Asphai99 $| Total of Header Attachments: 3
: First Name: Shawn Total of All Attachments: 3

. Last Name: Camphell
Email: zales@szeaboardasphaltcol

Phone: 410-355-0330



https://11,176.62

W

,a{;m:?”f% Department of Administration State of West Virginia

Q . o
Purchasing Division S
2019 Washington Street East Solicitation Response

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

o

Proc Folder: 1976520
Solicitation Description: ASPHALT CRACK SEALANT for DISTRICT ONE

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement
Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
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VENDOR
000000193873

SEABOARD ASPHALT PRODUCTS CO

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2600000100
Total Bid: 11176.62000000000080035533756 Response Date:  2026-06-03
Comments:

Response Time: 09:44:22

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep

304-558-2566

john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X FEIN#

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc

1 FIBER ASPHALT SEALANT 540

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code

2250.000C LB

Manufacturer

31201700

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
FIBER ASPHALT SEALANT 540 Or Equal

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 FIBER ASPHALT SEALANT 540 (FULL 45000.00C LB
TRUCK LOAD)

Comm Code Manufacturer

31201700

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

FIBER ASPHALT SEALANT 540 (FULL TRUCK LOAD) Or Equal

Line Comm Ln Desc

3 Rent Machine to use Fiber ASPHALT

Qty Unit Issue
1.00000 EA

Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

SEALANT 540

Comm Code

Manufacturer
22101627

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

Rent Machine to use Fiber ASPHALT SEALANT 540 Or Equal

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue

4 HP CONCRETE COLD PATCH

Unit Price

56.00000 BAG

11.650000

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
652.40

Comm Code Manufacturer

30111500

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
HP CONCRETE COLD PATCH - Or Equal

Bidding BOND-X HIGH PERFORMANCE COLD MIX in 60# bags. Palletized with 49 bags per pallet

Line Comm Ln Desc Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 HP CONCRETE COLD PATCH (FULL 896.0000C BAG 11.650000 10438.40
TRUCK LOAD)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments:

bags per truckload

Date Printed:  Jun 23, 2026
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Extended Description:

HP CONCRETE COLD PATCH (FULL TRUCK LOAD) Or Equal

Line Comm Ln Desc

6 MATRIX 501 MASTIC

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

2400.000C LB

Comm Code

30121715

Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
MATRIX 501 MASTIC Or Equal

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

7 MATRIX 501 MASTIC (Full Truck Load)

45000.00C LB

Comm Code

30121715

Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
MATRIX 501 MASTIC (Full Truck Load) Or Equal

Line Comm Ln Desc

8

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Rent Machine to use MATRIX 501 MASTIC

1.00000 EA

Comm Code

22101627

Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

Rent Machine to use MATRIX 501 MASTIC Or Equal

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

9 TECHCRETE -R

2700.000C LB

Comm Code

Manufacturer
31201700

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
TECHCRETE - R - Or Equal

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

10 TECHCRETE - R (FULL TRUCK LOAD)

45000.00C LB

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

31201700

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Date Printed: ~ Jun 23, 2026
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Extended Description:

TECHCRETE - R (FULL TRUCK LOAD) Or Equal

Line

Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

11 Rent Machine to use TECHCRETE - R

1.00000 EA

Comm Code

Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

22101627

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

NO BID

Rent Machine to use TECHCRETE - R - Or Equal

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

12 TechCrete Primer 5 Gal. Bucket

1.00000 EA

Comm Code
31201700

Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

TechCrete Primer 5 Gal. Bucket Or Equal

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

13 Detack 5 Gallon Bucket

1.00000 EA 85.820000

85.82

Comm Code
31201700

Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
Detack 5 Gallon Bucket Or Equal

Bidding Emulsion Glenzoil 20

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

14 RoadSaver 515

2250.000C LB

Comm Code

Manufacturer
30111902

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
RoadSaver 515 Or Equal

NO BID

Line

Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue

Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

15 RoadSaver 515 (Full Truck Load)

45000.00C LB

Comm Code

Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

30111902

Commodity Line Comments:

Date Printed:
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Extended Description:
RoadSaver 515 (Full Truck Load) Or Equal

Line

Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

16 Rent Machine to use RoadSaver 515

1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

22101627

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

Rent Machine to use RoadSaver 515 Or Equal

Line

Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

17 Mastic One

2400.000C LB

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

31201700

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Mastic One Or Equal

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

18 Mastic One (Full Truck Load)

43200.00C LB

Comm Code
31201700

Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
Mastic One (Full Truck Load) Or Equal

NO BID

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 Rent Machine to use Mastic One 1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

22101627
Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Rent Machine to use Mastic One Or Equal
Date Printed:  Jun 23, 2026 Page: 5
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BOND-X
HIGH PERFORMANCE COLD MIX

Seaboard BOND-X High Performance Cold Patch is a high quality, pre-mixed, all
weather, permanent asphalt “cold patch” compound. Combining a carefully selected aggregate
with a special bitumen formula. Seaboard BOND-X High Performance Cold Patch is the
right choice for all types of pavement repair jobs. Seaboard BOND-X High Performance Cold
Patch repairs dangerous potholes, wide cracks, ruts, etc.; within minutes, regardless of the
weather outside. Suitable for use on both concrete and asphalt pavements. Seaboard BOND-X
High Performance Cold Patch is highly recommended for spot repairs to driveways and dry
pavement with no loss of bonding ability. The most important benefit to remember is the fact the
Seaboard BOND-X High Performance Cold Patch is the “Permanent Patch” and should
remain in the repaired area indefinitely. Money will be saved in labor cost because workers will
not be constantly repairing an area where a other types of “cold patch” asphalt mix was used.
Seaboard BOND-X High Performance Cold Patch is easy to apply with most repairs taking
only a few minutes to complete. As an added feature, Seaboard BOND-X High Performance
Cold Patch can be open to traffic immediately after it has been used.

PREPARATION: Simply sweep out the area to be repaired with a bristled brush or broom. It
is a good idea to remove any loose debris, dirt, ice, or standing water from the area to be repaired.
This action will promote good adhesion and bonding.

APPLICATION: No heating or mixing is required. Simply shovel into the pothole, crack, or
rut, straight from the container. If the fault is especially deep, i.e. over six inches, apply in two
inch layers, compacting each layer in succession. Shovel enough material into the fault to
slightly crown the “patch”. When completed compress the “patch” with the pneumatic tamper.
Area can be opened to traffic immediately.

COVERAGE: Depth and width of pothole, crack, utility cut etc. will greatly influence the
coverage rate achieved. As a rule however, forty pounds of Seaboard BOND-X High
Performance Cold Patch will fill a two inch deep hole, four square feet is size..

COLOR: Black

DRYING TIME: Immediate, following compacting of material.

CLEAN UP: All tools should be cleaned immediately after use with a solvent base cleaner such
as varsol, paint thinner or mineral spirits.

STORAGE: Always keep container tightly closed when not in use to prevent “hardening” over
long periods of storage. Bulk stockpile does not require special storage for up to one year.
Recommend to “turn” portion of pile prior to loading from stockpile and for extended storage life
it is recommended to cover stockpile.

PACKAGING: Seaboard BOND-X High Performance Cold Patch is available in five gallon
pails, 60# plastic bags, 50# plastic bags and bulk.

3601 FAIRFIELD ROAD
BALTIMORE, MARYLAND 21226
(410) 355-0330
(800) 536-0332
FACSIMILE (410) 355-5864



Seaboard Asphalt has been producing asphalt products
and developing solutions for our customers based on
our inherent strength in science and technology for
over 80 years. Our business approach and philosophy
is centered around Total Process Integration through
specially formulated chemistries. By supporting our
customers’ ever changing production demands, we
eliminate process limitations and meet the specific
requirements that allow them to succeed.

Seaboard Asphalt is focused on reducing chemical
exposures to employees in manufacturing industries
and the environment. We also are constantly looking
and moving towards high performance technologies.
Our BOND-X High Performance Cold Patch is an industry
leader in high performance all weather permanent
pavement repair.

Seaboard Asphalt employees include highly qualified
and experienced chemist & engineers. Our management
team is dedicated to innovation of new products and
new processes with more than 90 years of combined
experiences in the specialty chemistry and asphalt
industry. We believe that our technical capabilities as well
as our direct working knowledge of our customers’ needs
and our team are the keys to our success.

l

How much Bond-X will you need for your job?

|| 2saft | 4sqft | 6saft | 8sqft | 10sqft | 12sqft | 14 sqft

2" 0.8 bags 1.6 bags|2.4 bags 3.2 bags| 4bags |4.8 bags|5.6 bags

Seaboard Asphalt Products Company
3601 Fairfield Road, Baltimore, MD 21226
Phone: 410-355-0330 - Fax: 410-355-5864
Email: sales@seaboardasphalt.com
www.seaboardasphalt.com

Bond-X

COLD PATCH ASPHALT REPAIR

ALLWE/ .cR

HIG" €ERFORMANCE
-RMANENT
YEAR-ROUND APPLICATION

APPROVED BY DOT

www.seaboardasphalt.com
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Permanent Repair

Open to Traffic Immediately

Year Round Application

100% Recyclable Bags

Can Reduce Labor & Material Costs
Binder Available Separately
Available Everywhere

Introducing a High Performance Cold Patch
Asphalt Repair, Seaboard Bond-X. Bond-X meets
the needs of our future in safety and cost effective
quality. Using Bond-X as a cold repair asphalt is
simple and easy to do.

Bond-X is sold in 60-lb bags, 50-Ib bags, 5-gallon
pails, 55-gallon drums and bulk. We have multi-
ple distribution points throughout the United
States, Europe and other Foreign Countries and
Continents. If you are an asphalt plant interested
in manufacturing, purchasing and distributing
Bond-X please contact us at 410-355-0330.

Bond-X is approved by various states’ departments of
transportation and is currently being used by cities,
towns, villages, universities, utility companies, farms and
marinas across the United States and Europe. Finally a cost-
effective, high quality product is available as your new
Cold Patch solution.

Bond-X High Performance Cold Patch is a high quality,
pre-mixed, all weather, permanent asphalt “cold patch”
compound. Combining a carefully selected aggregate
with a specially formulated bitumen. Bond-X is the right
choice for all types of pavement repair jobs- it repairs
dangerous potholes, wide cracks, ruts, etc. within minutes,
regardless of the weather outside. Bond-X is suitable for
use on both concrete and asphalt pavements.

Bond-X is highly recommended for spot repairs to
driveways and dry pavement with no loss of bonding
ability. The most important benefit to remember is the
fact the Bond-X is the “Permanent Patch” and should
remain in the repaired area indefinitely. Money can be
saved in labor and material costs because workers will not
be constantly repairing an area where other types of “Cold
Patch” asphalt mix was used. Bond-X is easy to apply with
most repairs taking only a few minutes to complete. As an
added feature, it can be open to traffic immediately after
it has been used.

PREPARATION: Simply sweep out the area to be repaired
with a bristled brush or broom. It is a good idea to remove
any loose debiris, dirt, ice or standing water from the area
to be repaired. This action will promote good adhesion
and bonding.

APPLICATION: No heating or mixing is required. Simply
shovel into the pothole, crack, or rut, straight from the
container. If the fault is especially deep, i.e. over six
inches, apply in two inch layers, compacting each layer in
succession. Shovel enough material into the fault to slightly
crown the “patch”. When completed compress the “patch”
with the pneumatic tamper. Area can be opened to traffic
immediately.

COVERAGE: Depth and width of pothole, crack, utility cut
etc. will greatly influence the coverage rate achieved.
As a rule, however, forty pounds of Bond-X High
Performance Cold Patch will fill a two inch deep hole, four
square feet in size.

DRYING TIME: Pavement can be opened to trafficimmediately
after compaction.

AVAILABLE SIZES: Bond-X is available in bags, buckets,
drums and bulk.

Will I need to replace Bond-X?

No, you do not need to replace Bond-X. Once
applied, Bond-X will remain in its application
for as long as the surrounding pavement
stays stable. It is a permanent repair and not a
temporary product.

How is Bond-X applied?

Bond-X is applied in the same manner as the
conventional asphalt products. You merely
need to brush sweep out the area to be re-
paired. Since it is ready to use, you can eas-
ily apply Bond-X directly out of the bag or
via shovel-you connect the product and it’s
ready for traffic immediately.
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301 Ellicott Street
Buffalo, NY 14203-1680
‘ .= 800.724.7667
;/ CORPORATION 716.854.2889
www.emulso.com

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION

This crack sealant barrier material is a unique, biodegradable, non-toxic liquid that prevents tracking and
picking of freshly applied hot-melt sealants. It forms a temporary protective barrier that allows traffic
immediate access to the repaired pavement, yet it does not affect the sealant or asphalt. Glenzoil 20 Plus
requires only one person to apply, saving labor costs, and eliminates the mess and costs associated with
conventional blotting materials.

PRODUCT FEATURES

® All Natural
Biodegradable

Contains No Petroleum/Silicone

Non Flammable

Non Toxic

No Harmful Environmental Effects

PRODUCT BENEFITS

® C(Cost Effective

@® Requires one person to apply

® Eliminates using sand and associated costs

® (Completes the jobin less time

® Decreases job cost & increases production

® Eliminates need to set up long stretches of cones

® EasytoUse

® Apply with hand held sprayer directly to sealant
® Does not require specialized application equipment

® SafetoUse ltem No. Description

@® Non Toxic ) .
G7-5G  Glenzoil 20 Plus - 5 Gallon Pail

G7-4CS Glenzoil 20 Plus - 4 Gallon Case
G7-55 Glenzoil 20 Plus - 55 Gallon Drum
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«EMmulso oo
GLENZOIL 20 PLUS

GENERAL: EMULSO Glenzoil 20 Plus is a liquid specifically designed to prevent tracking of freshly applied hotmelt crack and joint sealants.
When properly applied to the surface of the sealant, Glenzoil 20 Plus will provide a barrier between the sealant and the vehicle tires
thereby eliminating picking and tracking of the sealant until it has set up.

PEFORMANCE SPECIFICATIONS: Glenzoil 20 Plus will prevent the picking of freshly applied hot-melt rubberized sealants with no effect on
the composition or performance of the sealant or surrounding asphalt. It will provide an effective barrier over the surface of the sealant
without excessive evaporation even when applied to the sealant at their recommended pour temperatures. Glenzoil 20 Plus will effectively
prevent picking of the sealant until such a time as the sealant cures. After approximately thirty to sixty minutes, Glenzoil 20 Plus will
dissipate leaving only a slight residue which will wash away with the first rainfall. Glenzoil 20 Plus contains no surfactants which have shown
to significantly reduce the slip resistance of the sealants surface. Friction testing has shown Glenzoil 20 Plus to have no more effect on the
slip resistance of the sealant than water. Glenzoil 20 Plus contains no hazardous ingredients and is not harmful to the user or the environ-
ment.

APPLICATION: Successful application is generally achieved with the use of a hand held pump up sprayer. Application rate will vary depend-
ing on the sealant temperature, ambient temperature, surface temperature, width and depth of the crack, distance and time of application
after the application of sealant, traffic volume, etc. On average, rate of application will be one gallon of Glenzoil 20 Plus to every 50 - 100
gallons of hot-melt rubberized sealant.

Spray Glenzoil 20 Plus directly onto the surface of the sealant. An adjustable tip on the spray wand is necessary to adjust the spray stream
to a width that will cover the sealant in one pass. The entire surface of the sealant must be wetted with Glenzoil 20 Plus to prevent picking

of the sealant. Although Glenzoil 20 Plus is effective when applied immediately following the application of the sealant, yield is better if the

sealant is allowed to seek its level and begin to cool, especially with wide or deep sealant reservoirs and wide or thick band-aid overlaps.

PACKAGING: Packaging of EMULSO Glenzoil 20 Plus consists of individual 5 U.S. gallon plastic pails each weighing 47 pounds. Standard
palletization consists of 36 pails weighing 1752 pounds. Pails contain a lid pour spout for easy transfer to spray equipment on the job site.

STORAGE: Pallets should not be stacked higher than two high. Pails may be stored outside. If frozen, thaw, shake well and use. Shelf life
is one year.

SAFETY PRECAUTIONS: Before using Glenzoil 20 Plus, all personnel involved with the use of Glenzoil 20 Plus should read and under-
stand the MATERIAL SAFETY DATA SHEET for EMULSO Glenzoil 20 Plus. Personnel should also read and understand the MATEIAL SAFETY
DATA for the hot-melt sealant being used in conjunction with Glenzoil 20 Plus before sealing is started. DO NOT test the effectiveness of
Glenzoil 20 Plus by touching the sealant with unprotected skin. It is important to note that the application of Glenzoil 20 Plus to the surface
of the hot-melt crack sealant will not significantly cool the sealant and skin contact with the hot sealant material will cause burns.

WARRANTY: EMULSO CORPORATION warrants that Glenzoil 20 Plus will perform as outlined in this product data sheet. EMULSO shall not
be responsible for improperly placed or misused material. Remedies against EMULSO CORPORATION, as agreed to by EMULSO, are limited
to replacing nonconforming product or refund (full or partial) of purchase price from EMULSO CORPORATION. All claims for breach of this
warranty must be made within thirty days of the date of use or six months frrom the date of delivery by EMULSO CORPORATION, which ever
is earlier. There shall be no other warrantiess expressed or implied.


www.emulso.com
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