West Virginia

Purchasing Division

The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wWvOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West Virginia’s
procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses
to this solicitation submitted to the Purchasing
Division in hard copy format.
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Response Date: uﬁgmugﬁ Status: Closed
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Responded By User ID: pburns3 QH Total of Header Attachments: 1

: First Name: Andy Total of All Attachments: 1
Last Name: Clevinger

Email: Andy Clevinger@AppAggW

Phone: 276-326-1145
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Purchasing Division S
2019 Washington Street East Solicitation Response

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

o

Proc Folder: 1981130
Solicitation Description: Stone & Aggregate Pick Up by Agency

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement
Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2026-06-24 13:30 SR 0803 ESR06242600000008999 1
VENDOR
000000100174

APPALACHIAN AGGREGATES LLC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2600000096
Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2026-06-24 Response Time:
Comments:

08:42:47

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep

304-558-2566

john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X FEIN# DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed: ~ Jun 25, 2026 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Class 1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
2 Class 1 Aggregate -LSGS

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

0.00000 TON 0.000000

0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Class 1 Aggregate -Slag 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Class 2 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

5 Class 2 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jun 25, 2026 Page: 2

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

6 Class 2 Aggregate -Slag 0.00000 TON

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Class 10 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000

0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jun 25, 2026 Page: 3

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000

0.00

Comm Code
11111600

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jun 25, 2026

Page: 4

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code
11111600

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000

0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jun 25, 2026 Page: 5

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jun 25, 2026

Page: 6 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 AASHTO #10 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Stone for Gabions -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 Stone for Gabions -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jun 25, 2026

Page: 7 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Trail Surface Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 Limestone Standard Abrasives -Limestone 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00
Only
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 Limestone Standard Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
35 Sandstone Standard Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed: ~ Jun 25, 2026 Page: 8 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 Steel Slag for SRIC 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives -Limestone 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00
Only
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
40 Cinders 0.00000 TON
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed: ~ Jun 25, 2026 Page: 9 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
41 Pea Gravel -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
42 #11 Limestone Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
43 Quarry Waste -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
44 Rip Rap -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
45 Shot Rock -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed: ~ Jun 25, 2026 Page: 10 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
46 Shot Rock -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
47 Imbricated Stone -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed: ~ Jun 25, 2026 Page: 11 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05



EePa]:fmf-‘"t gf Administration State of West Virginia
= urchasing Division . s
\ 2015 Washington Street East Cenfralized -Request for Quote
5/} [Post Office Box 50130 Highways
.w"“‘ Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Proc Folder: 1981130 Reason for Modification;
Doc Description: Stone & Aggregate Pick Up by Agency

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement
Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2026-05-29 2026-06-24 13:30 CRFQ 0803 DOT2600000096 1
BID RECEIVING LOCATION
BID CLERK

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON STE
CHARLESTON WV 25305

us

VENDOR

Vendor Cust;mer Code: OO0 | AdDIOO 174
Vendor Name : #qu/a CA;QN )43\3 rc‘j oJL-es

Address :
street: 2/0 7/ m;a{/ayo{ T{‘a.,f./ w

City : Z_,cw:.séurj

State : WV Country: U S Zip: 2490/
Principal Contact : ﬁ""’/}’ d/c’m‘NJ e / A oS C‘;J/eréu r'y
Vendor Contact Phone: oM~ 3azZ- $P7 Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep

304-558-2566

john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vend
Signature X d»c{/ CL_— FENE O/-(, Y0503 patE (2325
rd e

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed:  May 29, 2026 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05




ADDITIONAL INFORMATION .

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION :

The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids on behalf of the West Virginia Division of Transportation to establish an
open-end contract for various sizes and types of Stone, Aggregate, Cinders and Slag for Pick Up by Agency from Vendor's
designated storage sites, for use on WVDOT projects throughout the state of West Virginia. Per the Bid Reguirements,
Specifications, Terms and Conditions Attached 1o this solicitation.

VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY

LOCATIONS LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY CRDER

No City Wy Ne City Wy

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 Class 1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICETO . jsHPTO

VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY

LOCATIONS LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City wv No City WY

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 Class 1 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Extended Description:

' SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05

Date Printed:  May 29, 2026 Page: 2




REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Stone & Aggregate, Pick Up by Agency

8.1  No Substitutions: Vendor shall supply only Contract Items submitted in response
to the Solicitation unless a contract modification is approved in accordance with
the provisions contained in this Contract.

8.2  Vendor Supply: Vendor must carry sufficient inventory of the Contract Items
being offered to fulfill its obligations under this Contract. By signing its bid,
Vendor certifies that it can supply the Contract Items contained in its bid response.

8.3  Vendor Name Change: It is the Vendor’s responsibility to notify the WVDOH of
name changes or acquisition by another company during the term of the contract.
The WVDOH must be notified in writing of the change/acquisition and intention
for the contract’s ownership within 10 days of the change. Failure to do so may
result in payment delays.

84  Reports: Vendor shall provide the Agency with quarterly reports, annual
summaries, and/or monthly reports as requested by the Agency and/or the West
Virginia Purchasing Division showing quantities, total dollar value of the Contract
Items purchased, ordered, shipped & invoiced with dates in spreadsheet format as
defined by the Agency. Failure to supply such reports may be grounds for
cancellation of this Contract.

8.5 Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contract, Vendor must
designate and maintain a primary Contract Manager responsible for overseeing
Vendor’s responsibilities under this Contract. The Contract Manager must be
available during normal business hours to address any customer service or other
issues related to this Contract. Vendor should list its Contract Manager and his or
her contact information below.

Contract Manager: /J.M-x(y Cleviveer
Telephone Number: Joy - 292~ S¢ iz
Fax Number: _ 304- $92- § 52§ =

Email Address: Amelyeclev./mveer® B0 agawv, o o,

Vendor shall inform the Agency in writing of any changes to the information
provided above within 10 calendar days of such changes. Failure to comply may
be grounds for cancellation of this contract.

Form Revised 10/27/2014 ’ 18 Pick Up 6625C018




DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as
the Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matfers relating to this

Contract.

Andy Clevinger / Sales Manager

(Printed Name and Title)

21071 Midland Trail W. Eewisburg, WV 24901
{Address)

304-392-5872 / 304-392-5828

(Phene Number) / (Fax Number)

andy.clevinger@appaggwv.com
(E-mail address)

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that | understand
the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid,
offer or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the
product or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for
that product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and
conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that [ am submitting this
bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; ; that this bid or offer was made without prior
understanding, agreement, or connection with any entity submitting a bid or offer for the same
material, supplies, equipment or services; that this bid or offer is in ail respects fair and without
collusion or fraud; that this Contract is accepted or entered into without any prior understanding,
agreement, or connection to any other entity that could be considered a violation of law; that i am
authorized by the Vendor to execute and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents
related thereto on Vendor’s behalf’ that [ am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractuzl
relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, the Vendor has properly registered with any
State agency that may require registration.

By signing below. I further certify that | understand this Contract is subject to the

provisions of West Virginia Code § 34-3-62, which automatically voids certain confract

clauses that violate State law.

Appalachian Aggregates
(Company)

Anty 8, —

(Signatur! of Authdfized Representative)

~ Andy Clevinger / Sales Manager
{Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative)
06/23/26
(Date)
304-392-5872 / 304-392-5828

{Phone Number) (Fax Number)
Revised 8/24/2023




Stone Aggregate Pick Up by Agency
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address, Pick Up Storage Location Address,
and bid pricing for the Contract ltem listed below. Failure to provide Source Plant and Pick Up Storage Location
information will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. If Vendor needs additicnal space fe list their
plants, or storage locations, please use the Supplemental to ATT A. This is a multiple vendor award confract. Vendor
may bid any or all Contract Items. All qualifying vendors meeting the coniract specifications will be awarded with a
contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract
Specifications. No future use of this Contract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated quantities are not available.

VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates,LLC

Source Plant Names & Addresses:
(Please provide a negative {-) with the longitudes.)
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.

Name: _Appalachian Aggregates, LLC - Elkins quarry Latitude: 38.89669
Address: 5908 Chenoweth Creek Rd, Elkins, WV 2641 Longitude: -79.77177
Name; Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Pick Up Storage Location Names & Addresses (if different from above):
(Please provide a negative (-} with the longitudes.)

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
‘Contract | e _ - o B . R
5 ::Iiiéh'l’.—':' © R Des_c_r_nptwn AP . Con_lposmqn* Uplt of .Me__asure_ : Bld Prlcg :
1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $11.50
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $11.50 ¥
) Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons
B8 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons $11.50
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $16.70
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons
10 AASHTO #3 Aggregaie Limestone Only Tons $16.70
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.75
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.75
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $16.75
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons
20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $20.35
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Stone Aggregate Pick Up by Agency
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages
VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates,LLC
Source Plant Names & Addresses:
{Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Name:_Appalachian Aggregates, LLC - Elkins quarry Latitude: 38.89669
Address: 5908 Chenoweth Creek Rd, Elkins, WV 2641 Longitude: -79.77177
Name: L atitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Pick Up Storage Location Names & Addresses (if different from above):
(Please provide a negative (-} with the longitudes.)
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
“Contract | o Baceringi RETTWIPR IR -
Item o T .Dgsc:rlptlen Co_mpos_ltlon*f Unit of Mea_sure_ Bid Price. .
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Qnly Tons $19.50
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons
24  |AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $18.50
25  |AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons .
26 AASHTQ #39 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $18.50
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons
28 AASHTO #10 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $16.50
29 Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons $16.70
30 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons
31 Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) LSGS Tons
32 Trail Surface Aggregate LSGS Tons $14.75
33  [Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $18.50
34 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons
35 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons
36 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons
37 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $18.50
38 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons
39 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons
40 Cinders Cinders Tons
41 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons
42 #11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tohs
43 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons $13.00
44 Rip Rap LSGS Tons $21.50
45 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons $21.00
48 Shot Rock LSGS Tons $21.50
47 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons
*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand
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Stone Aggregate Pick Up by Agency
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address, Pick Up Storage Location Address,
and bid pricing for the Contract ltem listed below. Failure to provide Source Plant and Pick Up Storage Location
irformation will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. If Vendor needs additional space to list their
plants, or storage locations, please use the Supplemental to ATT A. This is a muitiple vendor award contract. Vendor
may bid any or all Contract [tems. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a
contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract
Specifications. No future use of this Coniract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated quantities are not available.

VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates,LLC

Source Plant Names & Addresses:
{Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.

Name:__ Appalachian Aggregates, LLC -Mill Point Latitude: 38.16257
Address: 400 Stamping Creek Rd, Hillshoro, WV 24946 Longitude: -80.18476
Name: L atitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:;
Name: Latitude;
Address: Longitude:

Pick Up Storage Location Names & Addresses (if different from above):
{Please provide a negative (-} with the longitudes.)

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name; Latitude: i
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
‘Contract | I ' S : IR [P et
T Yem BEIEEPI Description . ST : Composition* - 'Unit of Mea.sure . Bid Prlcg :
1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $15.45
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 3$15.45 =
5 Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons
8 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons $15.45
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $17.70
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons
10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $17.70
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons
12 AASHTO #4 Agaregate LSGS Tons $18.50
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons $18.50
14 |AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $18.50
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons
16 |AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $18.50
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons
18 IAASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons
20 _ |AASHTC #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $21.00
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Stone Aggregate Pick Up by Agency
Attachment A (ATT A} Pricing Pages
VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates,LLC
Source Plant Names & Addresses:
{Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Name:__ Appalachian Aggregates, LLC -Mill Point Latitude: 38.16257
Address: 400 Stamping Creek Rd, Hillsboro, WV 24946 Longitude: -80.18476
Name; Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Pick Up Storage Location Names & Addresses (if different from above):
{Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
: 1 t'e'm' S e - De_Scrlptlon S : Composnthn’_‘ . Umt_ of Measure .- Bld Price
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons
22 AASHTO #3 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $21.00
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tans $21.00
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $20.50
27 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $21.00
28 AASHTO #10 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $18.00
29 Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons $17.70
30 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons
31 Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) LSGS Tons
32 Trail Surface Aggregate LSGS Tons $156.45
33 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $21.00
34 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons
35 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons
36 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons
37 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $20.50
38 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons
39 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons
40 Cinders Cinders Tons
41 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons
42 #11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons
43 Quarry Waste 1 8GS Tons $15.00
44 Rip Rap LSGS Tons $25.00
45 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons $25.00
46 Shot Rock LSGS Tons
47 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons
*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand
Pick Up by Agency Page 2 of 2 6625C018




VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address, Pick Up Storage Location Address,
and bid pricing for the Contract ltem listed below. Failure to provide Source Plant and Pick Up Storage Location
information will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. If Vendor needs additional space fo list their
plants, or storage locations, please use the Supplemental to ATT A. This is a multiple vendor award contract. Vendor
may bid any or alt Contract ltems. All qualifying vendors meeting the confract specifications will be awarded with a
contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract
Specifications. No future use of this Contract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated quantities are not available.

Stone Aggregate Pick Up by Agency
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates,LLC
Source Plant Names & Addresses:
(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Name: __Appalachian Aggregates, LLC -Alta quarry Latitude: 37.87952
Address: 21071 Midland Trail W, Lewisburg, WV 24901 Longitude: -80.55719
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Pick Up Storage Location Names & Addresses (if different from above):
(Please provide a negative (- with the longitudes.)
Name: Latitude:
Address. Long_;itude:
Name: Latitude: i
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Ttem | o 'Des,c-?‘l’-t““_‘ L C_ompos:tlo.n’:*' : '-Um._t_o_f Measu:rg . ‘_Bld_ _Prlce
1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $11.15
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $11.15 N
5 Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons
8 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons $11.15
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $15.35
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons
10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $15.35
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons $15.35
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.00
14 AASHTOQ #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $17.00
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons
16 AASHTQ #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $17.00
17 AASHTO #6867 Agaregate LSGS Tons
18 [AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons
20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $17.50
Page 1 of 2 6625C018
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Stone Aggregate Pick Up by Agency
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates,LLC
Source Plant Names & Addresses:
(Please provide a negative {-) with the longitudes.}
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Name: __Appalachian Aggregates, LLC -Alta quarry Latitude: 37.87952
Address: 21071 Midland Trail W, Lewisburg, WV 24901 Longitude: -80.565719
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Pick Up Storage Location Names & Addresses (if different from above):
(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name:; Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
“Contract A : IS B N o
e L S Descrlptlon_ . Composition Unit of Measuare Bid Price
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $17.50
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $19.85
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $19.85
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons
28 AASHTO #10 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $18.00
29 Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons $14.85
30 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons $15.35
31 Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) LSGS Tons $21.00
32 Trail Surface Aggregate LSGS Tons $11.15
33 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $19.00 5
34 Limestcne Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons =
35 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons
36 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons
37 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $18.50
38 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons
39 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons
40 Cinders Cinders Tons
41 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons
42 #11 Limestone Abrasives L8GS Tons
43 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons $14.00
44 Rip Rap LSGS Tons $24.00
45 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons $24.00
46 Shot Rock LSGS Tons
47 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons
*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand
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Stone Aggregate Pick Up by Agency
Attachment A {(ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address, Pick Up Storage Location Address,
and bid pricing for the Contract ltem listed below. Failure to provide Source Plant and Pick Up Storage Location
information will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. If Vendor needs additional space to list their
plants, or storage locations, please use the Supplemental to ATT A. This is a multiple vendor award contract. Vendor
may bid any or all Contract ltems. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a
contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract
Specifications. No future use of this Contract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated quantities are not available.

VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates,LLC

Source Plant Names & Addresses:
(Please provide a negative (-} with the longitudes.)
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.

Name: Appalachian Aggregates, LLC -Beckley Latitude: 37.85859
Address: 1700 North Sandbranch Rd Mt.Hope, WV Longitude: -31.24846
Name: Latitude:
Address. LorLg_;itude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: - Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Pick Up Storage Location Names & Addresses (if different from above):
{Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

Name: Latitude:

Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:

Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:

Address: Longitude:

Comtract [ .o B P UNURGRNEIP N D

Cgtem | _Dgsc,np_tmn_ ST Compo_smo_l_t*- |- Unit of Measure |.  Bid Prlcg _

1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $22.00
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons .
5 Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons $21.50
6 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons $21.50
8 AASHTO #1 Agaregate Limestone Only Tons
9 AASHTO #1 Agaregate LSGS Tons
10 |AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons $23.50
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons
13 |AASHTO #467 Aggregate : LSGS Tons
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons $25.50
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
17 |AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons
20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Oniy Tons

Pick Up by Agency Page 1 of 2 6625C018




Stone Aggregate Pick Up by Agency
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates,LLC
Source Plant Names & Addresses:
{Please provide a negative (-) with the [ongitudes.)
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Name:___Appalachian Aggregates, LLC -Beckley Latitude: 37.85859
Address: 1700 North Sandbranch Rd Mt.Hope, WV Longitude: -81.24846
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Pick Up Storage Location Names & Addresses (if different from above):
{Please provide a negative {(-) with the longitudes.)
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name; Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
"Contract | S I . o i
Thtem - | - D_es_c_r_npﬁon .. Composition® - | Unit of Measure Bid Price
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons $27.00
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $27.00
24 AASHTO #0 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons $24.50
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons
28  |AASHTO #10 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
29 Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons
30 Sione for Gabions LSGS Tons $25.50
31 Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) LSGS Tons
32 Trail Surface Aggregate LSGS Tons
33 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons
34 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons
35 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons $25.50
36 |Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons
37 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons
38 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons
39 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons $25.50
40 Cinders Cinders Tons
41 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons
42 #11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons
43 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons $20.00
44 Rip Rap LSGS Tons $25.00
45 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons
48 Shot Rock LSGS Tons $25.00
47 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons
*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand
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Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations

Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address and bid pricing for the Contract ltem listed
below. Failure to provide Source Plant locations will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. If Vendor needs
additional space to list their plants, please use the Suppiemental to ATT A. This is a multiple vendor award contract.
Vendor may bid any or all Contract [tems. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with
a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract
Specifications. No future use of this Contract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated quantities are not available.

VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates, LLC
Source Plant Names & Addresses:
(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)
NQOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Name: Appalachian Aggregates - Mercer Quarry
Latitude: 37.303316
Address: 1111 Blake Hollow Rd. Princeton, WV 27740 Longitude: -81.066856
Name: Appalachian Aggregates - Bluefield Quarry
Latitude: 37.234346
Address: 171 St. Clairs Crossing Bluefield, VA 24605 Longitude: -81.320049
Name: Appalachian Aggregates -Pounding Mill Quarry
Latitude: 37.077528
L_Address: 121 Quarry Rd Pounding Mill , VA 24637 Longitude: -81.707447
e | Bgsc_nptmn - Composition* Unit of Measqre : B_ld Price
1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $12.50
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $12.50
5 Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons
6 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.50
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $17.50
98 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons
10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Oniy Tons $17.50
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.50
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $17.50
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $18.50
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons
20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $19.00
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $19.00
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $20.25
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons
26 AASHTO #38 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $20.25
27 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons
28 AASHTQ #10 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $17.50

Delivery to

Non-Established Locations

Page 1 of 2
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Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages
VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates, LLC
Source Plant Names & Addresses:
(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Name: Appalachian Aggregates - Mercer Quarry
Latitude: 37.303316
Address: 1111 Blake Hollow Rd. Princeton, WV 27740 Longitude: -81.066856
Name: Appalachian Aggregates - Bluefield Quarry
Latitude: 37.234346
Address: 171 St. Clairs Crossing Bluefield, VA 24605 Longitude: -81.320049
Name: Appalachian Aggregates -Pounding Mill Quarry
Latitude: 37077528
|_Address: 121 Quarry Rd Pounding Milf , VA 24637 Longitude: -81.707447
Contract - L PR . o : L
C ttem. | - 7 _ ~ Description : ~ Composition Unit of Measure Bid Price
29 Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons
30 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons $17.50
31 Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) LSGS Tons $25.00
32 Trail Surface Aggregate LSGS Tons $13.50
33 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $19.00
34 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons
35 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons
36 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons
37 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $20.25
38 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives L3GS Tons
39 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Teons
40 Cinders Cinders Tons
41 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons
42 #11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons
43 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons $13.00
44 Rip Rap LSGS Tons $17.50
45 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons $17.50
46 Shot Rock L5GS Tons
47 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons
48 Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating Tons $0.30 :
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-43) Mile $1.60
50 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract items 1-43) Mile $0.40
51 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract tems 44-47) Mile $2.25
52 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile {Contract ltems 44-47) Mile $0.50
*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand
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AcoR?

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANGCE

DATE {MMDRYYVY)
B/23/2024

T THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE GERTIFICATE HOLDER, THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES MOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW, THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A GONTRAGT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

[T IMPORTANT: If tha cartHicate holter [s an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(les) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions of be enforsed.
¥ SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, sublact to the torms and conditlens of the pelloy, corlain polisies may require an sndorsement. A sfatemsnt on

thia cortificate does not confar rights to the gertificate holdar in ligl of such sndorsament(s).
[¥e] =13

mlfi?;’;m Mutual insurance Co. National Insurance East ;m%____"alm —Ime
N FHO
500 N 3rd St, Suite 300 faic, 8 513-867-322 AL, ok
Wausau, W! 54403 ADDRESS: Oldeastle.certs@LbartyMutual.com
ERISURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE HAIC &
wwwdibartyMutuel.com tauRERA: Libarty Mutual Firs Insurante Compaiy 23035
INSURED [NSURERH ;
I?]lanzzhlsm A?gregates, LLC {226-CHI) Jo——
Chilhowie VA 24318 INSYRERD :
INSURERE «
JNSURBRF :

COVERAGES CERVIFICATE NUMBER: 81545284

THIS 18 TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERICD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONBITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES, LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID GLAIMS.

REVISION MUMBER:

fEL TYPE OF INSURANCE w ouCY HIMBER SR | (DO LT
A | 7 | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY 7 TB2-CB1-004005-114 91172024 |9M/2025 | EacH QCCURRENGE 42,000,000
icwms-mns GOCUR XCU Goverage Included PREMISES (Eneecumance) | $300.000
| | Primany/Non-Contributary g MED EXP {Any ona parson) | 350,000
| ¢ | Separation of Insurad PERSONAL 8 ADVINIURY | 2,000,600
Emassaeeareummes PER. GENERAL AGGREGATE £2,000,000
pouey v J3B% [ Jicc PRODUCTS - COMPIOP AGG | 2,000,000
OFHER: 5
A | AUTOMOBILELIASILITY ) AE2-CB1-004085-124 9172024 | 9/1/2025 WE,_,“,,E';,?‘NGEWT $2 000,000
/| v auto BODILY INRIRY (Far porson) | 5
A AS2-CB1-054502-524 9/112024 | 9172025 "
|| SN Ly SEpuLED Physical Damage only: BODILY (NJURY (Per actidont)| 5
HIRED ON.OWNED n g [ PROPERTY DAMAGE s
|| Autos AUTOS ONLY Comprehensive Dad $10,600 | {Par socldant)
] Collislon Dagd $10,000 . s
| |weRecanae | | geguR EACH OGCURRENCE -
EXCEBS LIAR CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE 3
oen | inﬂnﬂ_s . 3
WORKERS COMPENBATION o
msum.ommam viu Sthrume [ €8
omczmm&aexcwusn? 1A EL. EAGH 260 2
Mandstory oy I r&w E L. DISEASE - EA EMPL §
B e GRERATIGNS beigw L. DISEASE - FOLICY LIMIT l g
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LGGATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 104, Adeitlona) Remack titsy ba aftachad i more spaco Ia required)

RE: CRFQ DOT 24* 02 Stone Pick Up,

by wrilien contract.
30-day Motice of Cancaliation,

Cerlificate Holder is listed as additional insurad with regards to the genesal lisbility and automobile liability policies, where requirad

CERTIFICATE HOLOER CANCELLATION
SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE

WestVarglma Department of Administration THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
gg‘li%h‘?vsmg L Iglsmsntreei East ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIORS.

ashington as
Chaniosion WY 25305 AUTHORIZED REPRESERTATIVE .
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