
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
 



 

 



Date Printed: Jul 17, 2025 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1704671

Solicitation Description: Stone & Aggregate Pick Up by Agency

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2025-07-16 13:30 SR 0803 ESR07152500000000182 1

VENDOR

VS0000018523
ROCKY GAP QUARRY LLC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2500000075

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2025-07-15 Response Time: 11:18:54

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep
304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Class 1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Class 1 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Class 1 Aggregate -Slag 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Class 2 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Class 2 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Class 2 Aggregate -Slag 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Class 10 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 AASHTO #10 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Stone for Gabions -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 Stone for Gabions -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Trail Surface Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 Limestone Standard Abrasives -Limestone 

Only
0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 Limestone Standard Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
35 Sandstone Standard Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 Steel Slag for SRIC 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives -Limestone 

Only
0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
40 Cinders 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
41 Pea Gravel -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
42 #11 Limestone Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
43 Quarry Waste -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
44 Rip Rap -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
45 Shot Rock -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
46 Shot Rock -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
47 Imbricated Stone -LSGS 0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST



Stone Aggregate Pick Up by Agency
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR NAME:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Contract 
Item

Composition* Unit of Measure Bid Price

1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $18.50
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons no bid
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $18.50
5 Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
6 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons no bid
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $24.00
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $24.65
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $22.90

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS:  Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address, Pick Up Storage Location Address, 
and bid pricing for the Contract Item listed  below. Failure to provide Source Plant and Pick Up Storage Location 
information will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. If Vendor needs additional space to list their 
plants, or storage locations, please use the Supplemental to ATT A. This is a multiple vendor award contract. Vendor 
may bid any or all Contract Items. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a 
contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract 
Specifications. No future use of this Contract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated quantities are not available.

Rocky Gap Quarry, LLC

Source Plant Names & Addresses:
(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Rocky Gap Quarry, LLC

707 Quarry Rd, Rocky Gap, VA

Description

Pick Up Storage Location Names & Addresses (if different from above):
(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

Pick Up by Agency Page 1 of 3  6625C018



Stone Aggregate Pick Up by Agency
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR NAME:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Contract 
Item

Composition* Unit of Measure Bid Price

Rocky Gap Quarry, LLC

Source Plant Names & Addresses:
(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Rocky Gap Quarry, LLC

707 Quarry Rd, Rocky Gap, VA

Description

Pick Up Storage Location Names & Addresses (if different from above):
(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons no bid
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons no bid
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $29.70
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons no bid
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons no bid
28 AASHTO #10 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $20.55
29 Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons $22.90
30 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons no bid
31 Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) LSGS Tons no bid
32 Trail Surface Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
33 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons no bid
34 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
35 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
36 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons no bid
37 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons no bid
38 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
39 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
40 Cinders Cinders Tons no bid
41 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons no bid
42 #11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
43 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons $13.00
44 Rip Rap LSGS Tons $22.90
45 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons $16.00
46 Shot Rock LSGS Tons no bid
47 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons no bid

*LSGS:  Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand

Pick Up by Agency Page 2 of 3  6625C018



Supplemental to ATT A Pricing Pages

VENDOR NAME:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:

Source Plant Names & Addresses:
(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.

This is a supplemental form for use only when additional space is needed on the Pricing Page (ATT A) for 

Sources and Storage Locations is needed.

Pick Up Storage Location Names & Addresses (if different from above):
(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)


















	CoverSheet
	Doc1
	seckmanch2_1096314_SR_0803_ESR07152500000000182_1
	3fix
	4

