
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
 





Date Printed: Sep 25, 2025 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1787571

Solicitation Description: MV26 - 2026 OR LATEST MODEL VEHICLE

Proc Type: Statewide MA (Open End)

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2025-09-25 13:30 SR 0212 ESR09242500000002228 1

VENDOR

VC0000057321
MATHENY MOTOR TRUCK CO

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0212 SWC2600000001

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2025-09-24 Response Time: 17:12:53

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Mark A Atkins
(304) 558-2307
mark.a.atkins@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation



Date Printed: Sep 25, 2025 Page: 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Vendor shall use Exhibit_A Pricing Page(s) 

for bid pricing.
0.00000 EA 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25100000    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
MV26 - 2026 or latest model vehicle:
Note: Vendor shall use Exhibit_A Pricing Pages for bid pricing. 
If vendor is submitting a bid online, Vendor should enter $0.00 in the Oasis commodity line. 
Vendor shall enter pricing into the Exhibit_A Excel pages and must attach with bid.



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact:

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.:

Model Name & Number: Email: 

Vehicle Requirements:
Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

*Options:

-$                                     

-$                                     

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

-$                                     

4 cylinder minimum

Compact Sedan or Hatchback

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of 

the specification.

3,800 lbs. min,   4,000 lbs. max 

Class 1 - Automobile 

Compact Sedan or Hatchback

NO BID

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

UNIT PRICE

-$                                     

-$                                     

-$                                     

-$                                     

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

Front Wheel

5 (including driver)

4, minimum - 5 maximum 

104 in., minimum



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact:

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.:

Model Name & Number: Email: 

Vehicle Requirements:
Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

*Options:

-$                                   

-$                                   

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of 

the specification.

4,100 lbs. min,  4,650 lbs. max

Class 2 - Automobile 

Mid Size Sedan

NO BID

Front Wheel

4, minimum

107 in., minimum

4 cylinder minimum

5 (including driver)

Mid Size Sedan

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

UNIT PRICE

-$                                      

-$                                      

-$                                      

-$                                      

-$                                      



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact:

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.:

Model Name & Number: Email: 

Vehicle Requirements:
Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

*Options:

-$                                     

-$                                     

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Class 3 - Automobile 

Large Sedan

5 (including driver) 

4, minimum

111 in., minimum

4 cylinder minimum

NO BID

Front Wheel

Large Sedan

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of 

the specification.

4,900 lbs. min,   5,300 lbs. max

-$                                     

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

-$                                     

UNIT PRICE

-$                                     

-$                                     

-$                                     



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact:

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.:

Model Name & Number: Email: 

Vehicle Requirements:
Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

*Options:

-$                                     

-$                                     

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of 

the specification.

4,900 lbs. min,    5,300 lbs. max

Class 4 - Automobile 

Large Sedan

NO BID

Rear Wheel

5 (including driver) 

4, minimum

111 in., minimum

4 cylinder minimum

Large Sedan

-$                                     

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

UNIT PRICE

-$                                     

-$                                     

-$                                     

-$                                     



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact:

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.:

Model Name & Number: Email: 

Vehicle Requirements:
Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

*Options:

-$                                     

-$                                     

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of 

the specification.

4350 lbs. min,  5600 lbs. max.

Class 5 - Automobile 

Compact Utility

NO BID

4 Wheel/All Wheel

5 (including driver)

4, minimum

100 in., minimum

4 cylinder minimum

Compact Utility

UNIT PRICE

-$                                     

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

-$                                     

-$                                     

-$                                     

-$                                     

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: FLEET SALES

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: FLEETSALES@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:
Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: YZ WHITE

Wheelbase: G1 BLACK

GVWR: M7 GRAY

Engine:

Off Road Package:

Tow Package:

Slush/All-Weather Mats:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

*Options:

50.00$                               

1.00$                                 

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award

Installed: Driver, Passenger, Cargo Areas

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the 

specification.

Includes but not limited to: Limited Slip rear axle, traction lock 

differential, heavy duty engine cooling, skid plates, heavy duty 

suspension with gas shocks, tow hooks and all terrain tires.

4, minimum

102 in., minimum

4350 lbs. min,    5600 lbs. max.

4 cylinder minimum

Installed Hitch & Wiring

Class 6 - Automobile 

Compact Utility

MMTCO DBA MATHENY FORD

FORD

BRONCO SPORT BADLANDS

5 (including driver)

4 Wheel/All Wheel with High & Low Range

Compact Utility

 Unit Price 

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

36,978.00$                                   

-$                                               

-$                                               

-$                                               

-$                                               



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact:

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.:

Model Name & Number: Email: 

Vehicle Requirements:
Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Additional Requirements:

Tow Package: 

Slush/All-Weather Mats: 

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

*Options:

-$                                     

-$                                     

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Class 7 - Automobile 

Mid Size Utility

4, minimum

109 in., minimum

6 cylinder minimum

NO BID

4 Wheel/All Wheel

Mid Size Utility

5 minimum (including driver)

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

6100 lbs. min,  7300 lbs. max.

-$                                     

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

Installed: Driver, Passenger, Cargo area

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of 

the specification.

Installed Hitch and Wiring

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

UNIT PRICE

-$                                     

-$                                     

-$                                     

-$                                     



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact:

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.:

Model Name & Number: Email: 

Vehicle Requirements:
Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Off Road Package:

Tow Package:

Slush/All-Weather Mats:

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

*Options:

-$                                    

$

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Class 8 - Automobile 

Mid Size Utility

5 minimum (including driver)

4, minimum

109 in., minimum

6 cylinder, Minimum 

NO BID

6100 lbs. min,   7300 lbs. max.

4 Wheel/All Wheel with High and Low Range 

Mid Size Utility

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

-$                                             

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

 UNIT PRICE 

-$                                             

-$                                             

-$                                             

-$                                             

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the 

specification.

Includes but not limited to: Limited Slip rear, axle traction lock 

differential, heavy duty engine cooling, skid plates, gas shocks, 

and all terrain tires.

Installed Hitch & Wiring

Installed: Driver, Passenger, Cargo Areas



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact:

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.:

Model Name & Number: Email: 

Vehicle Requirements:
Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Passenger AC/Heat rear:

Side Air bags:

Slush/All-Weather Mats:

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

*Options:

$

$

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Class 9 - Automobile 

Mini Van 

7 minimum (including driver)

121 in., minimum

6 cylinder minimum

NO BID

Front Wheel 

4,300 lbs. min,    6,075 lbs. max.

Mini Van

Minimum: 1 driver front, 1 passenger front, 1 driver sliding rear, 

1 passenger sliding rear, 1 back

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

-$                                             

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

UNIT PRICE

-$                                             

-$                                             

-$                                             

-$                                             

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the 

specification.

Installed

Installed

Installed: Driver, Passenger, Cargo Areas



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact:

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.:

Model Name & Number: Email: 

Vehicle Requirements:
Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Off Road Package:

Tow Package:

Slush/All weather Mats

Bed:

Sliding rear window:

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

*Options:

$

$

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

4 Wheel/All wheel with Hi/Lo Range

Short, with installed spray-in liner.

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

5400 lbs. min,   6250 lbs. max.

Class 10 - Automobile 

Mid-Size Pick Up Extended Cab 

Mid-Size Pick Up Extended Cab

 UNIT PRICE 

4 minimum (including driver)

2, minimum

120in., minimum

Installed Hitch & Wiring

Not required. 

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the 

specification.

Includes but not limited to: Limited Slip rear axle, traction lock 

differential, heavy duty engine cooling, skid plates, heavy duty 

suspension with gas shocks, tow hooks and all terrain tires.

Minimum acceptable Engines:                                                              

Gas: Non-Turbo- 6 cylinder minimum                                                 

Gas: Turbo - 4 cylinder minimum                                                         

Diesel: 4 cylinder minimum   

Installed on driver and passenger front and second row, except 

where vinyl floor covering is present. 

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

-$                                             

-$                                             

-$                                             

-$                                             

-$                                             

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: FLEET DEPT

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: FLEETSALES@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:
Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: WHITE

Wheelbase: BLACK

GVWR: GRAY

Engine:

Off Road Package:

Tow Package:

Slush/ all-Weather mats

Bed (Short):

Sliding Rear Window: 

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

*Options:

50.00$                               

1.00$                                 

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

5400 lbs. min,   6250 lbs. max.

Includes but not limited to: Limited Slip rear axle, traction lock 

differential, heavy duty engine cooling, skid plates, heavy duty 

suspension with gas shocks, tow hooks and all terrain tires.

Class 11 - Automobile 

Mid-Size Pick Up Crew Cab 

MMTCO DBA MATHENY FORD

FORD

RANGER R4P

4 minimum (including driver)

4 full doors, minimum

120 in., minimum

Minimum acceptable Engines:                                                             

Gas: Non-Turbo- 6 cylinder minimum                                           

Gas: Turbo - 4 cylinder minimum                                                        

Diesel: 4 cylinder minimum   

Mid-Size Pick Up Crew Cab

4 Wheel/All Wheel with High & Low Range

-$                                               

-$                                               

-$                                               

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Installed on driver and passenger front and second row, except 

where vinyl floor covering is present. 

Bed: Length 60" minimum, 65" maximum,  with installed spray-

in bedliner

 UNIT PRICE 

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

Installed Hitch & Wiring

Not Required

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the 

specification.

34,297.00$                                   

-$                                               



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact:

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.:

Model Name & Number: Email: 

Vehicle Requirements:
Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Off Road Package:

Tow Package:

Slush/ all-Weather mats

Bed (Long):

Sliding Rear Window: 

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

*Options:

$

$

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Mid-Size Pick Up Crew Cab

4 Wheel/All Wheel with High & Low Range

Class 12 - Automobile 

Mid-Size Pick Up Crew Cab 

NO BID

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the 

specification.

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

4 minimum (including driver)

4 full doors, minimum

120 in., minimum

5400 lbs. min,   6250 lbs. max.

Minimum acceptable Engines:                                                              

Gas: Non-Turbo- 6 cylinder minimum                                           

Gas: Turbo - 4 cylinder minimum                                                         

Diesel: 4 cylinder minimum   

Bed:  Length 72" minimum,  with installed spray-in bedliner

Includes but not limited to: Limited Slip rear axle, traction lock 

differential, heavy duty engine cooling, skid plates, heavy duty 

suspension with gas shocks, tow hooks and all terrain tires.

Installed Hitch & Wiring

Installed on driver and passenger front and second row, except 

where vinyl floor covering is present. 

Not Required

 UNIT PRICE 

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

-$                                             

-$                                             

-$                                             

-$                                             

-$                                             



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: FLEET SALES

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: FLETTSALES@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:
Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: WHITE

Wheelbase: BLACK

GVWR: GRAY

Engine:

Tow Package:

Additional Requirements:

Installed Spray-in bedliner

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

*Options:

50.00$                                

1.00$                                  

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Class 13 - Automobile 

Standard Pick Up Reg Cab 

2, minimum

119 in., minimum

6 cylinder minimum

MMTCO DBA MATHENY FORD

FORD

F150 XL REG CAB F1K

Rear Wheel

Standard Pick Up Reg Cab

2 minimum (including driver)

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of 

the specification.

6000 lbs. min,  6650 lbs. max.

-$                                      

Factory Complete: Includes integrated electric trailer brake 

controller, hitch, and wiring

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, Cab Length

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

 UNIT PRICE 

33,769.00$                          

-$                                      

-$                                      

-$                                      



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: FLEET SALES

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: FLEETSALES@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:
Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: WHITE
Wheelbase: BLACK

GVWR: GRAY

Engine:

Tow Package:

Additional Requirements:

Installed Spray-in bedliner

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

*Options:

50.00$                                

1.00$                                  

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of 

the specification.

 UNIT PRICE 

38,476.00$                          

-$                                      

-$                                      

-$                                      

-$                                      

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, Cab Length

Class 14 - Automobile 

Standard Pick Up Reg Cab 

MMTCO DBA MATHENY FORD

FORD

F150 REG CAB 4X4 F1L

6 cylinder minimum

2 minimum (including driver)

2, minimum

119 in., minimum

6000 lbs. min,  6650 lbs. max.

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

Standard Pick Up Reg Cab

4 Wheel/All wheel with Hi/Lo Range

Factory Complete: Includes integrated electric trailer brake 

controller, hitch, and wiring



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: FLEET SALES

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: FLEETSALES@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:
Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: WHITE

Wheelbase: BLACK

GVWR: GRAY

Engine:

Off Road Package:

Tow Package:

Slush/All weather Mats

Bed:

Sliding rear window:

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

*Options:

50.00$                               

1.00$                                 

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

6275 lbs. min,   7350 lbs. max.

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the 

specification.

Includes but not limited to: Limited Slip rear axle, traction lock 

differential, heavy duty engine cooling, skid plates, heavy duty 

suspension with gas shocks, tow hooks and all terrain tires.

4 minimum (including driver)

4, minimum

140in., minimum

Factory Complete: Includes integrated electric trailer brake 

controller, hitch, and wiring
Installed on driver and passenger front and second row, except 

where vinyl floor covering is present. 

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, Cab Length

4 Wheel/All wheel with Hi/Lo Range

Minimum 8 Cylinder for gasoline  and Minimum 6 cylinder for 

diesel 

Short, with installed Spray-in liner.

Class 15 - Automobile 

Standard Pick Up Extended Cab 

MMTCO DBA MATHENY FORD

FORD

F150 SUPERCAB XL 4X4 X1L

Standard Pick Up Extended Cab

-$                                               

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Not required. 

 UNIT PRICE 

43,244.00$                                   

-$                                               

-$                                               

-$                                               



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: FLEET SALES

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: FLEETSALES@MATHENYMOTORS,OM

Vehicle Requirements:
Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: WHITE

Wheelbase: BLACK 

GVWR: GRAY

Engine:

Off Road Package:

Tow Package:

Slush/All weather Mats

Bed:

Sliding Rear Window: 

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

*Options:

50.00$                               

1.00$                                  

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

6800 lbs. min,   7350 lbs. max.

Includes but not limited to: Limited Slip rear axle, traction lock 

differential, heavy duty engine cooling, skid plates, heavy duty 

suspension with gas shocks, tow hooks and all terrain tires.

Not Required

Class 16 - Automobile 

Standard Pick Up Crew Cab 

4 full doors, minimum

149 in., minimum

Minimum 8 Cylinder for gasoline  

and Minimum 6 cylinder for diesel 

Factory Complete: Includes integrated electric trailer brake 

controller, hitch, and wiring

Installed on driver and passenger front and second row, except 

where vinyl floor covering is present. 

Standard Pick Up Crew Cab

Long bed with installed Spray-in bedliner

4 Wheel/All Wheel with High & Low Range

-$                                             

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

MMTCO DBA MATHENY FORD

 UNIT PRICE 

44,855.00$                                 

-$                                             

-$                                             

-$                                             

FORD

F150 CREWCAB XL 4X4

4 minimum (including driver)

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the 

specification.

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, Cab Length



M



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: FLEET SALES

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: FLEETSALES@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:
Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: BLACK

Wheelbase: WHITE

GVWR: GRAY

Engine:

Slush/ All-weather mats:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

*Options:

50.00$                             

1.00$                                

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Rear Passenger Climate Controls

4-Wheel/All Wheel Drive

Class 17 - Automobile 

Full Size Utility

MMTCO DBA MATHENY FORD

FORD

EXPEDITION U1J

Minimum Acceptable Engines:                                            

GAS: 6 cylinder turbo;                                                                 

GAS: 8 cylinder non-turbo;                                                         

Diesel: 6 cylinder turbo

Full Size Utility

Additional Requirements:

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
5 minimum (including 

driver)

4, minimum

116 in., minimum

7300 lbs. min,  7600 lbs. max.

-$                                    

-$                                    

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars

 UNIT PRICE 

61,480.00$                        

-$                                    

-$                                    

Limited Slip/ Tracktion Lock rear Axle

Installed: Driver, Passenger, Cargo area

Rear Defroster/Wiper

Heated - Power Driver and Passenger Mirrors

Factory Remote Start/Entry

Factory Rear Bumper Reverse Traffic Sensors

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of 

the specification.



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: FLEET SALES

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: FLEETSALES@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:
Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: WHITE

Wheelbase: BLACK

GVWR: GRAY

Engine:

Slush/ All-weather mats:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

*Options:

50.00$                             

1.00$                                

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Rear Passenger Climate Controls

4-Wheel/All Wheel Drive

Class 18 - Automobile 

Full Size Utility

MMTCO DBA MATHENY FORD

FORD

EXPEDITION MAX K1J

Minimum Acceptable Engines:                                            

GAS: 6 cylinder turbo;                                                                 

GAS: 8 cylinder non-turbo;                                                    

Diesel: 6 cylinder turbo

Full Size Utility

Additional Requirements:

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors
8 minimum (including 

driver)

4, minimum

130 in., minimum

7300 lbs. min,  7600 lbs. max.

-$                                    

-$                                    

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars

 UNIT PRICE 

64,273.00$                        

-$                                    

-$                                    

Limited Slip/ Tracktion Lock rear Axle

Installed: Driver, Passenger, Cargo area

Rear Defroster/Wiper

Heated - Power Driver and Passenger Mirrors

Factory Remote Start/Entry

Factory Rear Bumper Reverse Traffic Sensors

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of 

the specification.
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