West Virginia

Purchasing Division

The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wWVOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West Virginia’s
procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses
to this solicitation submitted to the Purchasing
Division in hard copy format.
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Welcome, Christopher W Seckman
Solicitation Response(SR) | Dept: 0803  ID: ESR01082500000004266 Ver.: 1 Function: New Phase: Final

Procurement

Budgefing | Accounts Receivable | Accounis Payable

Contam Default Values | Discount | Document Information | Clarification Reguest

Procurement Folder: 1557787 50 Doc Code: CRFQ
Procurement Type: Central Master Agreement 50 Dept: 0603
Vendor ID: 000000207543 & SO Doc ID: DOT2500000031
Legal Name: GEORGE L WILSON & GO OF WV ING. Published Date: 12/27/24
AliasiDBA: Close Date: 1/825
Total Bid: 50.00 Close Time: 13:30

Response Date: (1/08/2025 Status: Closed

. Solicitation Description: Repair Products for Bridges and Roads
Response Time: 15:23 6625C011 4
Responded By User ID: ghwuv1 ﬂ Total of Header Attachments:
First Name: Bryan Total of All Attachments: 0

Last Name: Cariin

engineering@georgetwilson.(

304-592-3217
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Proc Folder: 1557787
Solicitation Description: Repair Products for Bridges and Roads 6625C011

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement
Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2025-01-09 13:30 SR 0803 ESR01082500000004266 1
VENDOR

000000207543

GEORGE L WILSON & CO OF WV INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2500000031
Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2025-01-08
Comments:

Response Time: 15:23:47

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep

304-558-2566

john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X FEIN#

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Concrete Sealer /palil 0.00000 GL 29.980000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700

Commodity Line Comments: Advanced Chemical Tech
Sil-Act ATS-40
Condition: 180 Gallon Minimum

Extended Description:

Concrete Sealer, Purchased as individual pail
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Concrete Sealer /drum 0.00000 GL 20.720000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700

Commodity Line Comments: Advanced Chemical Tech
Sil-Act ATS-40
Condition: 220 Gal Minimum

Extended Description:

Concrete Sealer, Purchased as drum
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Concrete Sealer /tote 0.00000 GL 18.240000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700

Commodity Line Comments: Advanced Chemical Tech
Sil-Act ATS-40

Extended Description:

Concrete Sealer, Purchased as 275 gallon totes
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

4 Concrete Sealer /truck 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification

Model #

31201700

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Concrete Sealer, Purchased as bulk - delivered by metered truck
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete - Vertical 0.00000 LB

App /bag
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, Purchased as individual bags.
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete - Vertical 0.00000 LB 0.460000 0.00
App /pallet
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments: Euclid Euco Repair SCC Fast
Condition: 3200 lbs minimum

Extended Description:

Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications,
Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal  0.00000 LB
App /bag
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications,
Purchased as individual in bags

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal  0.00000 LB 0.460000 0.00
App /pallet
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments: Euclid Euco Repair SCC Fast
Condition: 3200 lbs minimum

Extended Description:

Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications,
Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Vertical App / 0.00000 LB
bag
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, Purchased as individual bags
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Vertical App / 0.00000 LB 0.440000 0.00
pallet
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments: Euclid Versaspeed 100
Condition: 3200 Ibs min

Extended Description:

Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal 0.00000 LB
App /bag
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications, Purchased as individual bags
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal 0.00000 LB 0.340000 0.00
App /pallet
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments: Quikrete Commercial Grade Fastset Concrete
Condition: 2940 lbs minimum

Extended Description:

Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing 0.00000 GL 6.740000 0.00
Compounds /palil
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments: WR Meadows 1600 White Cure
Condition: 180 gallon minimum
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Extended Description:

Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds,
Purchased as individual pail

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing 0.00000 GL 5.190000 0.00
Compounds /drum
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments: WR Meadows 1600 White Cure
Condition: 220 Gallon Minimum

Extended Description:

Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds,
Purchased as drums

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing 0.00000 GL 4.700000 0.00
Compounds /tote
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments: WR Meadows 1600 White Cure
275 Gallon Minimum

Extended Description:

Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds,
Purchased as tote

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing 0.00000 GL
Compounds /truck
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds
Purchased as bulk - delivered by metered truck
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. for 0.00000 LB
Concrete&Asphalt /box
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - Material Only, Purchased as boxes or meltable containers.
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. for 0.00000 LB 0.770000 0.00
Concrete&Asphalt /pallet
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700

Commodity Line Comments: WR Meadows 3405 Hot Pour Sealant
Condition: 2250 lbs minimum

Extended Description:

Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - Material Only, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. w/ heating 0.00000 LB
equip /box
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - Material and Heating Equipment, Purchased as boxes or meltable
containers.

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. w/ heating 0.00000 LB
equip /pallet
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements -
Material and Heating Equipment, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 Non-Shrink Grout /bag 0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Non-Shrink Grout, Purchased as individual bags
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

22 Non-Shrink Grout /pallet 0.00000 LB 0.260000 0.00
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification

Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: Euclid NS Grout
Extended Description:

Non-Shrink Grout, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 Soluble Salt Removers for Bridge Washing/ 0.00000 GL
gallon
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Soluble Salt Removers for Bridge Washing
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 Silicone Joint Seal. Typel LM NonSlag 0.00000 Oz 0.870000 0.00
Silicone /tube/cart.
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700

Commodity Line Comments: Sika Sikasil 728 NS
Condition: 12,528 Oz Minimum

Extended Description:

Silicone Joint Sealant, Type 1 - Low Modulus Non-Slag Silicone, Purchased as individual caulking tubes/cartridges

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 Silicone Joint Seal. Typel LM NonSlag 0.00000 GL 89.020000 0.00
Silicone /pall
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700

Commodity Line Comments: Sika Sikasil 728 NS
Condition: 108 Gallon minimum

Extended Description:

Silicone Joint Sealant, Type 1 - Low Modulus Non-Slag Silicone, Purchased as pails
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 Silicone Joint Seal. Typel LM NonSlag 0.00000 GL 74.900000 0.00
Silicone /drum

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700
Commodity Line Comments: Sika Sikasil 728 NS

Condition: 208 gallon minimum

Date Printed:  Jan 14, 2025 Page: 7

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Extended Description:

Silicone Joint Sealant, Type 1 - Low Modulus Non-Slag Silicone, Purchased in drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 Silicone Joint Seal. Type2 Very LM self level / 0.00000 OZ 0.870000 0.00
tube/cart
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700

Commodity Line Comments: Sika Sikasil 728 SL
Condition: 12,528 Oz minimum

Extended Description:

Silicone Joint Sealant - Type 2 - Very Low Modulus Self Leveling, Purchased as individual caulking tubes/cartridges
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 Silicone Joint Seal. Type2 Very LM self level / 0.00000 GL 89.020000 0.00
pail
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700

Commodity Line Comments: Sika Sikasil 728 SL
Condition:; 108 Gallon Minimum

Extended Description:

Silicone Joint Sealant - Type 2 - Very Low Modulus Self Leveling, Purchased as pails
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Silicone Joint Seal. Type2 Very LM self level / 0.00000 GL 74.900000 0.00
drum
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700

Commodity Line Comments: Sika Sikasil 728 SL
Condition: 208 gallon minimum

Extended Description:

Silicone Joint Sealant - Type 2 - Very Low Modulus Self Leveling, Purchased as drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 Two-Coat HB Acrylic System w/Org Zinc 0.00000 GL
Primer /gallon
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Two-Coat High Build Acrylic System using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Two-Coat HB Acrylic System w/Org Zinc 0.00000 GL
Primer /drum
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Two-Coat High Build Acrylic System using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Sys w/ Org 0.00000 GL
Zinc Primer /gal
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Sys w/ Org 0.00000 GL
Zinc Primer /drum
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 Moisture-Cured Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc 0.00000 GL
Primer /gallon
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Moisture - Cured Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
35 Moisture-Cured Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc 0.00000 GL
Primer /drum
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500
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Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Moisture - Cured Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 Polysiloxane Sys w/Org Zinc Primer /gallon ~ 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Polysiloxane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 Polysiloxane Sys w/Org Zinc Primer /drum 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Polysiloxane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc Primer /gallon 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500

Commodity Line Comments: no bid
Extended Description:

Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc Primer /drum 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums.
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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