
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1557787

Solicitation Description: Repair Products for Bridges and Roads 6625C011

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2025-01-09 13:30 SR 0803 ESR01072500000004260 1

VENDOR

000000229160
CRAFCO INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2500000031

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2025-01-07 Response Time: 18:16:55

Comments: ATTACHMENT A (ATT A) is INCLUDED with the attached Bid Documents.

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep
304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Concrete Sealer /pail 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Concrete Sealer, Purchased as individual pail
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Concrete Sealer /drum 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Concrete Sealer, Purchased as drum
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Concrete Sealer /tote 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Concrete Sealer, Purchased as 275 gallon totes
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Concrete Sealer /truck 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Concrete Sealer, Purchased as bulk - delivered by metered truck
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete - Vertical 

App /bag
0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    
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Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, Purchased as individual bags.
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete - Vertical 

App /pallet
0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, 
Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal 

App /bag
0.00000 LB 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: Crafco HP Concrete Cold Patch - Part #34969

Extended Description:
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications, 
Purchased as individual in bags
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal 

App /pallet
0.00000 LB 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: Crafco HP Concrete Cold Patch - Part #34969
*Per your Attachment A (ATT A) Line 8 reads "HORIZONTAL APPLICATION"

Extended Description:
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, 
Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Vertical App /

bag
0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, Purchased as individual bags
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Vertical App /

pallet
0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal 

App /bag
0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications, Purchased as individual bags
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal 

App /pallet
0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing 

Compounds /pail
0.00000 GL 6.550000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: White Water Wax 309 Standard - Part #87729W-05

Extended Description:
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds,
Purchased as individual pail
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing 

Compounds /drum
0.00000 GL 5.150000 0.00
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: White Water Wax 309 Standard - Part #87729W-55

Extended Description:
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds,
Purchased as drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing 

Compounds /tote
0.00000 GL 4.730000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: White Water Wax 309 Standard - Part #87729W-T

Extended Description:
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds,
Purchased as tote
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing 

Compounds /truck
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds
Purchased as bulk - delivered by metered truck
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. for 

Concrete&Asphalt /box
0.00000 LB 0.417500 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: Crafco RoadSaver 221 - Part #34221

Extended Description:
Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - Material Only, Purchased as boxes or meltable containers.
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. for 

Concrete&Asphalt /pallet
0.00000 LB 0.417500 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: Crafco RoadSaver 221 - Part #34221
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Extended Description:
Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - Material Only, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. w/ heating 

equip /box
0.00000 LB 0.592000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: Crafco RoadSaver 221 - Part #34221
*Price per pound includes the use of Crafco Super Shot 250DC

Extended Description:
Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - Material and Heating Equipment, Purchased as boxes or meltable 
containers.
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. w/ heating 

equip /pallet
0.00000 LB 0.592000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: Crafco RoadSaver 221 - Part #34221
*Price per pound includes the use of Crafco Super Shot 250DC

Extended Description:
Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - 
Material and Heating Equipment,  Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 Non-Shrink Grout /bag 0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Non-Shrink Grout,  Purchased as individual bags
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 Non-Shrink Grout /pallet 0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Non-Shrink Grout, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 Soluble Salt Removers for Bridge Washing /

gallon
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Soluble Salt Removers for Bridge Washing
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 Silicone Joint Seal. Type1 LM NonSlag 

Silicone /tube/cart.
0.00000 OZ 0.740000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: Crafco RoadSaver Silicone - Part #34902-QT

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant,  Type 1 - Low Modulus Non-Slag Silicone, Purchased as individual caulking tubes/cartridges
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 Silicone Joint Seal. Type1 LM NonSlag 

Silicone /pail
0.00000 GL 53.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: Crafco RoadSaver Silicone - Part #34902-05

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant,  Type 1 - Low Modulus Non-Slag Silicone, Purchased as pails
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 Silicone Joint Seal. Type1 LM NonSlag 

Silicone /drum
0.00000 GL 52.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: Crafco RoadSaver Silicone - Part #34902-45

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant,  Type 1 - Low Modulus Non-Slag Silicone, Purchased in drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 Silicone Joint Seal. Type2 Very LM self level /

tube/cart
0.00000 OZ 0.740000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    



Date Printed: Jan 14, 2025 Page: 8 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Commodity Line Comments: Crafco RoadSaver Silicone - Part #34903-QT

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant - Type 2 - Very Low Modulus Self Leveling, Purchased as individual caulking tubes/cartridges
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 Silicone Joint Seal. Type2 Very LM self level /

pail
0.00000 GL 53.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: Crafco RoadSaver Silicone - Part #34903-05

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant - Type 2 - Very Low Modulus Self Leveling, Purchased as pails
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Silicone Joint Seal. Type2 Very LM self level /

drum
0.00000 GL 52.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: Crafco RoadSaver Silicone - Part #34903-45

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant - Type 2 - Very Low Modulus Self Leveling, Purchased as drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 Two-Coat HB Acrylic System w/Org Zinc 

Primer /gallon
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Two-Coat High Build Acrylic System using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Two-Coat HB Acrylic System w/Org Zinc 

Primer /drum
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Two-Coat High Build Acrylic System using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Sys w/ Org 

Zinc Primer /gal
0.00000 GL   
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Sys w/ Org 

Zinc Primer /drum
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 Moisture-Cured Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc 

Primer /gallon
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Moisture - Cured Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
35 Moisture-Cured Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc 

Primer /drum
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Moisture - Cured Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 Polysiloxane Sys w/Org Zinc Primer /gallon 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Polysiloxane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 Polysiloxane Sys w/Org Zinc Primer /drum 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Polysiloxane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc Primer /gallon 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc Primer /drum 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums.
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST



6165 W. Detroit St. • Chandler AZ 85226 
1-800-528-8242 • (602) 276-0406 • FAX (480) 961-0513
www.crafco.com

PRODUCT DATA  & INSTALLATION INSTRUCTIONS 

HP CONCRETE COLD PATCH 
PART NO. 34969    

  May 2018

READ BEFORE USING THIS PRODUCT 

GENERAL     Crafco HP Concrete Cold Patch is a unique, gray color, cold applied, single component  patching material used for 
repairing  potholes, spalls, cracks and other  confined voids and distresses over 1 inch wide and greater than ½ inch deep, in Portland 
cement concrete and asphalt pavement, slab and deck surfaces.  It can be used to repair roads, highways, streets, airport pavements, 
parking lots, bridge and parking decks, sidewalks, walkways and floors.  HP Concrete Cold Patch is composed of a specially designed 
thermoplastic binder and a unique aggregate composition that produces an easy to use durable patching material that is a gray color like 
Portland cement concrete or oxidized asphalt pavement. HP Concrete Cold Patch can be used in most weather conditions and will adhere 
in cold and damp conditions.  Unlike most other concrete patching materials, no mixing, heating or special installation equipment is 
required.  HP Concrete Cold Patch is the easiest to use and has the fastest installation of all types of concrete patching materials.  To use, 
HP Concrete Cold Patch is simply removed from the bag, placed into the prepared area to be patched, leveled and then compacted.   The 
patch is then ready for traffic immediately after compaction. No additional curing time is needed.  

PROPERTIES    Properties of Crafco HP Concrete Cold Patch are as follows: 

Compacted In Place Unit Weight 125 pcf 
Compacted In Place Density  2.0 
Weight per Bag 50 lbs
Volume per Bag  0.40 cu ft 
Workability        30 to 100F 
Aggregate Size 100% passing 3/8 inch 
Aggregate Durability 40% maximum Loss 
Binder Coating Durability     95% minimum 

INSTALLATION   The repair area is to be swept clean of all loose debris and blown clean before applying patching material.  The 
repair area surfaces can be damp but should not have free moisture present during installation.  The HP Concrete Cold Patch is 
removed from the bag and placed into the prepared repair area.  For best performance, HP Concrete Cold Patch should be applied at least 
½ inch in thickness.   For repairs from ½ inch to 2 inches thick, apply product in a single layer and compact.  Repairs deeper than 2 
inches should be filled in layers, from 1 to 2 inches thick, with compaction of each layer.  The final layer should be placed approximately 
¼ to ½ inch above the surface, and then be compacted to surface level with a hand or mechanical tamper or multiple passes from a 
vehicle tire.  Compaction should be sufficient to produce firm material in the repair.  Following compaction, any excess patch material 
is then cleaned up and the repair area can be opened to traffic.  Just after installation and compaction, HP Concrete Cold Patch will be a 
malleable material that will not be dislodged by traffic. Over time the surface will harden. If needed at warm temperatures, initial surface 
tack can be reduced with a light sprinkle application of portland cement, calcium carbonate powder, or fine sand over the compacted 
surface. HP Concrete Cold Patch should be installed when pavement temperatures are between 30 and 100F. If applying when pavement 
temperatures are below 30F, the repair area can be warmed to at least 30F using a torch or heat lance. To improve workability 
when installing product at colder temperatures, product can be stored in a warmer area not exceeding 90F prior to use, and bags can be 
dropped on the ground to loosen the material, if needed.  

STORAGE   Pallets and bags of HP Concrete Cold Patch should be kept intact and stored under cover.   Shelf life of properly stored 
product in unopened pallets and bags is up to 1 year. To maintain workability, leftover HP Concrete Cold Patch from an opened bag should 
be placed in an airtight container such as a pail or bucket with a tight fitting lid.       

PACKAGING Packaging consists of individual 50 pound plastic bags which are stacked on standard 40 by 48 inch pallets.   Each 
pallet contains 56 bags, producing a pallet weight of 2800 lbs.    Palletized units are protected from the weather using a plastic pallet cover, 
and a minimum of two layers of six month u.v. protected stretch wrap.  Pallets are labeled with the product name, part number, lot number 
and net product weight.  

WARRANTY     CRAFCO, Inc. warrants that CRAFCO products meet applicable specifications at time of shipment.  Techniques used 
for the preparation of the areas to be repaired are beyond our control as are the use and application of the product; therefore, Crafco shall 
not be responsible for improperly applied or misused product.  Remedies against Crafco, Inc., as agreed to by Crafco, are limited to 
replacing nonconforming product or refund (full or partial) of purchase price from Crafco, Inc.  All claims for breach of this warranty must 
be made within three (3) months of the date of use or twelve (12) months from the date of delivery by Crafco, Inc. whichever is earlier. 
There shall be no other warranties expressed or implied.  For optimum performance, follow Crafco recommendations for product 
installation.  

©2018, Crafco, Inc., All Rights Reserved 
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PRODUCT DATA SHEET 

WHITE WATER WAX 309 STANDARD 
PART NUMBER 87729W 

                                                                                         DECEMBER 2021 

READ BEFORE USING THIS PRODUCT 
GENERAL 

White Water Wax 309 Standard is a water based, white curing compound that utilizes a refined petroleum wax base to form a 
membrane that optimizes water retention on concrete surfaces. The addition of fine grind white pigments to the wax film protects the curing slab 
from excess heat-buildup due to sunlight. The retention of water and the reduction of heat buildup reduces the crazing, cracking, or checking 
and increases the compressive strength of concrete slabs over non-treated concrete slabs. This environmentally friendly VOC compliant 
compound is designed to provide maximum curing to freshly laid interior/exterior concrete applications. Max VOC 350 g/L 

 
RECOMMENDED USES 

White Water Wax 309 Standard is suitable for use with a wide variety of concrete construction projects. It is also ideal for many sizes 
of interior/exterior concrete slab work, as well as other flatwork applications including roadways, airports, parking lots, curbs, and 
industrial/commercial flooring. 

 
SPECIFICATION CONFORMANCE  

White Water Wax 309 Standard complies with ASTM C309 Type 2 Class A 
    
  

 
 
 
 
*AASHTO M 148 has been withdrawn 
 
INSTALLATION INSTRUCTIONS 

New concrete must be set sufficiently to resist marring during application and the surface be free of bleed water. Application equipment 
must be clean and free of any previously used materials. For optimum results, light mixing is recommended (Excess mixing will cause foaming). 
White Water Wax 309 Standard may be applied with a standard handheld sprayer or power sprayer; a short-napped roller is recommended for 
brush application. Use a spray rate of approximately ½ gallon per minute, not exceeding 45 PSI pressure. Avoid puddling during application and 
restrict foot traffic for at least four hours after application. Additional coats may be applied after surface has completely dried. Cleanup is 
accomplished with warm soapy water. See Crafco Installation Instructions for water-based curing compounds for further instructions. Coverage 
rate is approximately 200 ft2/gal (5 m2/L) 

 
LIMITATIONS  

• Air temperature and pavement temperature must be 40 ˚F (4 °C) minimum. Use only when ambient temperature exceeds 40 ˚F (4 °C) 
for 24 hours. 

• Water based, incompatible with solvent based products. Do not mix or dilute with any other products 
• For surfaces that are later to be painted, tiled, hardened, sealed, or treated in any manner, sufficiently remove curing compound before 

applying. 
 
PACKAGING  

275 Gal. (1041 L) totes, 55 Gal. (208 L) drums, 5 Gal. (18.9 L) pails 
 
STORAGE 

• Keep from freezing. 
• Storage temperature range 40 ˚F (4 °C) minimum 
• Dispose of container in accordance with state and federal regulations. 

 
WARRANTY   

CRAFCO, Inc. warrants that CRAFCO products meet applicable ASTM, AASHTO, Federal or State specifications at time of shipment.  
Techniques used for the preparation of the pavement are beyond our control as are the use and application of the products; therefore, Crafco 
shall not be responsible for improperly applied or misused products.  Remedies against Crafco, Inc., as agreed to by Crafco, are limited to 
replacing nonconforming product or refund (full or partial) of purchase price from Crafco, Inc.  All claims for breach of this warranty must be 
made within three (3) months of the date of use or twelve (12) months from the date of delivery by Crafco, Inc. whichever is earlier.  There shall 
be no other warranties expressed or implied.  For optimum performance, follow Crafco recommendations for product installation. 

Property ASTM C309 Type 2 Class A Spec. Limits 
Water Loss Properties (ASTM C156) 0.55 kg/m2 maximum 
Reflectance Properties (ASTM D1347) 60% minimum 
Drying Time Requirement (ASTM C309) 4 h maximum 



©2022, Crafco, Inc. All Rights Reserved 
 

GENERAL 
Crafco RoadSaver 221 sealant is a hot-applied asphalt-based product used to seal and fill cracks and joints in asphalt or Portland cement 
concrete pavements in hot to cold climates. RoadSaver 221 is supplied in solid form which when melted and properly applied forms a resilient, 
adhesive, and flexible compound that resists cracking in the winter and is resistant to flow and pick-up at summer temperatures. RoadSaver 
221 is used in highways, streets, and airfield pavements and is applied to pavement cracks and joints using either pressure feed Melter 
applicators or pour pots. At application temperature RoadSaver 221 is a free flowing, self-leveling product. RoadSaver 221 is a widely used, 
excellent performing sealant that has been a quality Crafco product for over 30 years. VOC = 0 g/l. 

 
 

SPECIFICATION CONFORMANCE  
RoadSaver 221 meets all requirements of ASTM D6690 (AASHTO M324), Type II, “Joint and Crack Sealants, Hot-Applied, for Concrete and 
Asphalt Pavements”, (formerly ASTM D3405 and AASHTO M301). It also exceeds requirements of ASTM D6690 (AASHTO M324), Type I, 
(formerly ASTM D1190, AASHTO M173), and Federal Specification SS-S-164. 

 
ASTM D6690 (AASHTO M324) 

Test              Type II Spec. Limits  
Cone Penetration      90 max.    . 
Softening Point      176 °F (80 °C) min. 
Resilience      60% min.  
Bond, -20 °F (-29 °C), 50% ext.    Pass 3 cycles  
Asphalt Compatibility      Compatible  
Minimum Application Temperature   380 °F (193 °C)  
Maximum Heating Temperature  400 °F (204 °C)   

 
 

INSTALLATION      
The unit weight of Crafco RoadSaver 221 is 10.5 lbs. per gallon (1.26 kg/L) at 60 °F (15.5 °C). Prior to use, the user must read and follow 
Installation Instructions for Hot-Applied RoadSaver, PolyFlex, Parking Lot and Asphalt Rubber Products to verify proper product selection, 
heating methods, pavement preparation procedures, application geometry, usage precautions and safety procedures. These instructions are 
provided with each pallet of product. 
 
 

PACKAGING   
Product is supplied in either cardboard boxes, or in meltable boxless packaging. Both package types are labeled in accordance with OSHA, 
GHS, and specification requirements; are sold by net weight; are interlock stacked on 48 x 40 in. (122 x 102 cm) 4-way pallets; can be stored 
outside; and are covered with a weather resistant pallet cover and 2 layers of UV protected stretch wrap. 
o BOX packaging consists of cardboard boxes containing 30 lbs. (13.6 kg) of product with 75 boxes per pallet, weighing approximately 

2250 lbs. (1020 kg). Boxes contain a quick melting release film for easy removal and are taped closed, without any staples. 
o Meltable packaging consists of approximately 30 lbs. (13.6 kg) completely meltable packages that are interlocked stacked on pallets. To 

use, the pallet wrap is removed, and individual blocks are placed in the Melter. There are no individual cardboard boxes to open, empty, 
handle, or dispose of. Meltable packaging quickly melts into the product without affecting specification conformance. Meltable packaged 
sealant products are sold by the pallet only and individual packages are not intended for sale. For more details on meltable packaging go 
to https://crafco.com/materials-documentation/ 

 
 
WARRANTY  
CRAFCO, Inc. warrants that CRAFCO products meet applicable ASTM, AASHTO, Federal or State specifications at time of shipment. 
Techniques used for the preparation of the cracks and joints prior to sealing or filling are beyond our control as are the use and application of 
the products; therefore, Crafco shall not be responsible for improperly applied or misused products. Remedies against Crafco, Inc., as agreed 
to by Crafco, are limited to replacing nonconforming product or refund (full or partial) of purchase price from Crafco, Inc. All claims for breach 
of this warranty must be made within three (3) months of the date of use or twelve (12) months from the date of delivery by Crafco, Inc. 
whichever is earlier. There shall be no other warranties expressed or implied. For optimum performance, follow Crafco recommendations 
for product installation. 

 
  
 6165 W Detroit St. • Chandler AZ 85226 
 +1 (602) 276-0406 • +1 (800) 528-8242 • FAX +1 (480) 961-0513 
 www.crafco.com 
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uvtqpin{!vq!eqpetgvg!lqkpvu!ykvjqwv!vjg!wug!qh!c!rtkogt/!Etcheq!TqcfUcxgt!Uknkeqpg!UN!ecp!dg!wugf!kp!cnn!v{rkecn!eqpetgvg!lqkpv!crrnkecvkqpu!qp!jkijyc{!cpf!
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Crafco HP Concrete Cold Patch 34969



Crafco HP Concrete Cold Patch 34969





Crafco White Water Wax 309 Standard 87729W-05



Crafco White Water Wax 309 Standard 87729W-55

Crafco White Water Wax 309 Standard 87729W-T



Crafco RoadSaver 221 34221



Crafco RoadSaver 221 34221

Crafco RoadSaver 221 34221
--Price per lb. includes use of Super Shot 250DC--



Crafco RoadSaver 221 34221
--Price per lb. includes use of Super Shot 250DC--





Crafco RoadSaver Silicone 34902-QT

Crafco RoadSaver Silicone 34902-05



Crafco RoadSaver Silicone 34902-45

Crafco RoadSaver Silicone SL 34903-QT



Crafco RoadSaver Silicone SL 34903-45

Crafco RoadSaver Silicone SL 34903-05
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ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION: 

The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids on behalf of the West Virginia Division of Highways to establish an open-
end, multiple award contract for delivery of various rapid-setting mortar, concrete, asphalt, and bridge surface repair products, to 
include delivery, for use in the preventative maintenance of bridges and roadways throughout the state of West Virginia.  Per the 
Bid Requirements, Specifications, Terms and Conditions attached to this solicitation.

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 Concrete Sealer /pail 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Concrete Sealer, Purchased as individual pail

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 Concrete Sealer /drum 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Concrete Sealer, Purchased as drum

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
3 Concrete Sealer /tote 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Concrete Sealer, Purchased as 275 gallon totes

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
4 Concrete Sealer /truck 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Concrete Sealer, Purchased as bulk - delivered by metered truck

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
5 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete - Vertical App /

bag
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, Purchased as individual bags.

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
6 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete - Vertical App /

pallet
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, 
Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
7 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal 

App /bag
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications, 
Purchased as individual in bags

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
8 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal 

App /pallet
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, 
Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Crafco HP Concrete Cold Patch 34969

Crafco HP Concrete Cold Patch 34969
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
9 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Vertical App /

bag
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, Purchased as individual bags

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
10 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Vertical App /

pallet
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
11 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal 

App /bag
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications, Purchased as individual bags

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
12 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal 

App /pallet
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
13 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds /

pail
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds,
Purchased as individual pail

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
14 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds /

drum
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds,
Purchased as drums

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Crafco White Water Wax 309 Standard 87729W-05

Crafco White Water Wax 309 Standard 87729W-55
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
15 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds /

tote
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds,
Purchased as tote

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
16 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds /

truck
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds
Purchased as bulk - delivered by metered truck

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Crafco White Water Wax 309 Standard 87729W-T
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
17 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. for 

Concrete&Asphalt /box
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - Material Only, Purchased as boxes or meltable 
containers.

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
18 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. for 

Concrete&Asphalt /pallet
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - Material Only, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a 
pallet

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Crafco RoadSaver 221 34221

Crafco RoadSaver 221 34221
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
19 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. w/ heating 

equip /box
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - Material and Heating Equipment, Purchased as boxes 
or meltable containers.

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
20 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. w/ heating 

equip /pallet
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - 
Material and Heating Equipment,  Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Crafco RoadSaver 221 34221
--Price per lb. includes use of Super Shot 250DC--

Crafco RoadSaver 221 34221
--Price per lb. includes use of Super Shot 250DC--
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
21 Non-Shrink Grout /bag 0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Non-Shrink Grout,  Purchased as individual bags

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
22 Non-Shrink Grout /pallet 0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Non-Shrink Grout, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
23 Soluble Salt Removers for Bridge Washing /

gallon
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Soluble Salt Removers for Bridge Washing

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
24 Silicone Joint Seal. Type1 LM NonSlag 

Silicone /tube/cart.
0.00000 OZ

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant,  Type 1 - Low Modulus Non-Slag Silicone, Purchased as individual caulking tubes/cartridges

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Crafco RoadSaver Silicone 34902-QT
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
25 Silicone Joint Seal. Type1 LM NonSlag 

Silicone /pail
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant,  Type 1 - Low Modulus Non-Slag Silicone, Purchased as pails

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
26 Silicone Joint Seal. Type1 LM NonSlag 

Silicone /drum
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant,  Type 1 - Low Modulus Non-Slag Silicone, Purchased in drums

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Crafco RoadSaver Silicone 34902-05

Crafco RoadSaver Silicone 34902-45
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
27 Silicone Joint Seal. Type2 Very LM self level /

tube/cart
0.00000 OZ

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant - Type 2 - Very Low Modulus Self Leveling, Purchased as individual caulking tubes/cartridges

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
28 Silicone Joint Seal. Type2 Very LM self level /

pail
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant - Type 2 - Very Low Modulus Self Leveling, Purchased as pails

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Crafco RoadSaver Silicone SL 34903-QT

Crafco RoadSaver Silicone SL 34903-05
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
29 Silicone Joint Seal. Type2 Very LM self level /

drum
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant - Type 2 - Very Low Modulus Self Leveling, Purchased as drums

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
30 Two-Coat HB Acrylic System w/Org Zinc 

Primer /gallon
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Two-Coat High Build Acrylic System using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Crafco RoadSaver Silicone SL 34903-45
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
31 Two-Coat HB Acrylic System w/Org Zinc 

Primer /drum
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Two-Coat High Build Acrylic System using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
32 Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Sys w/ Org 

Zinc Primer /gal
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST



Date Printed: Dec 16, 2024 Page: 18 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
33 Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Sys w/ Org 

Zinc Primer /drum
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
34 Moisture-Cured Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc 

Primer /gallon
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Moisture - Cured Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
35 Moisture-Cured Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc 

Primer /drum
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Moisture - Cured Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
36 Polysiloxane Sys w/Org Zinc Primer /gallon 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Polysiloxane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
37 Polysiloxane Sys w/Org Zinc Primer /drum 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Polysiloxane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
38 Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc Primer /gallon 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
39 Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc Primer /drum 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums.

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS
Line Event Event Date
1 Tech Questions due by 10:00am 2024-12-27
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Debby Eddy, Sales Administrator
(602) 276-0406

(480) 961-0513
bids@crafco.com
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