
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Date Printed: Jan 14, 2025 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1557787

Solicitation Description: Repair Products for Bridges and Roads 6625C011

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2025-01-09 13:30 SR 0803 ESR01062500000004235 1

VENDOR

VS0000008524
PHOSCRETE CORPORATION

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2500000031

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2025-01-06 Response Time: 13:08:56

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep
304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Concrete Sealer /pail 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Concrete Sealer, Purchased as individual pail
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Concrete Sealer /drum 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Concrete Sealer, Purchased as drum
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Concrete Sealer /tote 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Concrete Sealer, Purchased as 275 gallon totes
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Concrete Sealer /truck 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Concrete Sealer, Purchased as bulk - delivered by metered truck
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete - Vertical 

App /bag
0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    
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Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, Purchased as individual bags.
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete - Vertical 

App /pallet
0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, 
Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal 

App /bag
0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications, 
Purchased as individual in bags
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal 

App /pallet
0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, 
Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Vertical App /

bag
0.00000 LB 140.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, Purchased as individual bags
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Vertical App /

pallet
0.00000 LB 5180.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal 

App /bag
0.00000 LB 140.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications, Purchased as individual bags
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal 

App /pallet
0.00000 LB 5180.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing 

Compounds /pail
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds,
Purchased as individual pail
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing 

Compounds /drum
0.00000 GL   
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds,
Purchased as drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing 

Compounds /tote
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds,
Purchased as tote
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing 

Compounds /truck
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds
Purchased as bulk - delivered by metered truck
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. for 

Concrete&Asphalt /box
0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - Material Only, Purchased as boxes or meltable containers.
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. for 

Concrete&Asphalt /pallet
0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
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Extended Description:
Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - Material Only, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. w/ heating 

equip /box
0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - Material and Heating Equipment, Purchased as boxes or meltable 
containers.
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. w/ heating 

equip /pallet
0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - 
Material and Heating Equipment,  Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 Non-Shrink Grout /bag 0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Non-Shrink Grout,  Purchased as individual bags
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 Non-Shrink Grout /pallet 0.00000 LB   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Non-Shrink Grout, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 Soluble Salt Removers for Bridge Washing /

gallon
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Soluble Salt Removers for Bridge Washing
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 Silicone Joint Seal. Type1 LM NonSlag 

Silicone /tube/cart.
0.00000 OZ   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant,  Type 1 - Low Modulus Non-Slag Silicone, Purchased as individual caulking tubes/cartridges
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 Silicone Joint Seal. Type1 LM NonSlag 

Silicone /pail
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant,  Type 1 - Low Modulus Non-Slag Silicone, Purchased as pails
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 Silicone Joint Seal. Type1 LM NonSlag 

Silicone /drum
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant,  Type 1 - Low Modulus Non-Slag Silicone, Purchased in drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 Silicone Joint Seal. Type2 Very LM self level /

tube/cart
0.00000 OZ   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    
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Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant - Type 2 - Very Low Modulus Self Leveling, Purchased as individual caulking tubes/cartridges
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 Silicone Joint Seal. Type2 Very LM self level /

pail
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant - Type 2 - Very Low Modulus Self Leveling, Purchased as pails
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Silicone Joint Seal. Type2 Very LM self level /

drum
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31201700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant - Type 2 - Very Low Modulus Self Leveling, Purchased as drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 Two-Coat HB Acrylic System w/Org Zinc 

Primer /gallon
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Two-Coat High Build Acrylic System using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Two-Coat HB Acrylic System w/Org Zinc 

Primer /drum
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Two-Coat High Build Acrylic System using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Sys w/ Org 

Zinc Primer /gal
0.00000 GL   



Date Printed: Jan 14, 2025 Page: 9 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Sys w/ Org 

Zinc Primer /drum
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 Moisture-Cured Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc 

Primer /gallon
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Moisture - Cured Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
35 Moisture-Cured Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc 

Primer /drum
0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Moisture - Cured Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 Polysiloxane Sys w/Org Zinc Primer /gallon 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Polysiloxane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 Polysiloxane Sys w/Org Zinc Primer /drum 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Polysiloxane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc Primer /gallon 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc Primer /drum 0.00000 GL   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
31211500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums.
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST



Repair Products for Bridges Raods

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Phoscrete Corporation

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

Description as it will be shown on vendor's actual 

invoice (Section 4.2.4)

Unit Of 

Measure Bid Price

1
Concrete Sealer,

Purchased as individual pail
GL $

2
Concrete Sealer,

Purchased as drum
GL $

3
Concrete Sealer, 

Purchased as 275 gallon totes
GL $

4
Concrete Sealer, 

Purchased as bulk - delivered by metered truck
GL $

5
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, 

Purchased as individual bags 
LB $

6
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, 

Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
LB $

7
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications, 

Purchased as individual in bags  
LB $

8
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications, 

Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
LB $

9
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, 

Purchased as individual bags 

PC-F1-HC-KIT-L - Phoscrete Formula 1-HC Kit 50# 

(Bag+Jug)
LB $140.00

10
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, 

Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet

PC-F1-HC-FP-KIT-L - Phoscrete Formula 1-HC Full 

Pallet (52 Kits)	
LB $5,180.00

11
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications, 

Purchased as individual bags 

PC-F1-HC-KIT-L - Phoscrete Formula 1-HC Kit 50# 

(Bag+Jug)
LB $140.00

12
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications, 

Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet

PC-F1-HC-FP-KIT-L - Phoscrete Formula 1-HC Full 

Pallet (52 Kits)	
LB $5,180.00

Please provide a price for all Contract Items listed below.  Vendor may bid on any or all Contract Items.  Only MCS&T Approved Product List (APL) or Qualifying Purchase Order 

Materials (QPOM) list products may be bid. This is a multiple vendor award contract.  Vendor shall include delivery cost to any WVDOH location statewide within their bid price 

per unit.  No separate delivery charge will be permitted.  The Contract Item Description includes intended purchase method to indicate individual or bulk purchases, but the 

actual bid price shoule should be broken down into the smallest unit of measure, as indicated in the Unit of measure column.  Estimated purchase quantities are not available.  

No future use of the Contract or any individual item is guaranteed or implied.  

Vendor Instructions:
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Vendor Name:

ATT A - Pricing Page Page 1 of 3 6625C011



Repair Products for Bridges Raods

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Phoscrete Corporation

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

Description as it will be shown on vendor's actual 

invoice (Section 4.2.4)

Unit Of 

Measure Bid Price
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13
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds,

Purchased as individual pail
GL $

14
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds,

Purchased as drums
GL $

15
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds,

Purchased as tote
GL $

16
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds

Purchased as bulk - delivered by metered truck
GL $

17

Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - 

Material Only, 

Purchased as boxes or meltable containers.

LB $

18

Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - 

Material Only, 

Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet

LB $

19

Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - 

Material and Heating Equipment, 

Purchased as boxes or meltable containers.

LB $

20

Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - 

Material and Heating Equipment,  

Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet

LB $

21
Non-Shrink Grout,  

Purchased as individual bags 
LB $

22
Non-Shrink Grout, 

Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet
LB $

23 Soluble Salt Removers for Bridge Washing GL $
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Repair Products for Bridges Raods

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Phoscrete Corporation

Contract 

Item # Contract Item Description

Description as it will be shown on vendor's actual 

invoice (Section 4.2.4)

Unit Of 

Measure Bid Price
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24
Silicone Joint Sealant,  Type 1 - Low Modulus Non-Slag Silicone,

Purchased as individual caulking tubes/cartridges
OZ $

25
Silicone Joint Sealant,  Type 1 - Low Modulus Non-Slag Silicone,

Purchased as pails
GL $

26
Silicone Joint Sealant,  Type 1 - Low Modulus Non-Slag Silicone, 

Purchased in drums
GL $

27
Silicone Joint Sealant - Type 2 - Very Low Modulus Self Leveling,

Purchased as individual caulking tubes/cartridges
OZ $

28
Silicone Joint Sealant - Type 2 - Very Low Modulus Self Leveling,

Purchased as pails
GL $

29
Silicone Joint Sealant - Type 2 - Very Low Modulus Self Leveling,

Purchased as drums
GL $

30
Two-Coat High Build Acrylic System using Organic Zinc Primer,

Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
GL $

31
Two-Coat High Build Acrylic System using Organic Zinc Primer,

Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums
GL $

32
Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer,

Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
GL $

33
Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer,

Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums
GL $

34
Moisture - Cured Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer,

Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
GL $

35
Moisture - Cured Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer,

Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums
GL $

36
Polysiloxane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer,

Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
GL $

37
Polysiloxane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer,

Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums
GL $

38
Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer,

Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon
GL $

39
Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer,

Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums
GL $
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Date Printed: Dec 27, 2024 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Centralized Request for Quote

Chemicals

Proc Folder: 1557787 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Repair Products for Bridges and Roads 6625C011 ADDENDUM NO_1 

Vendor Questions and Responses

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version

2024-12-27 2025-01-09     13:30 CRFQ     0803     DOT2500000031 2

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

BID CLERK
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON ST E

CHARLESTON          WV     25305

US

VENDOR

Country : US Zip : 33334

Vendor Customer Code:  West Virginia Division of Highways 

Vendor Name : Phoscrete Corporation 

Address : 

Street : 792 NE 40th Ct

City : Oakland Park

State : FL

Principal Contact : Erica Gerhart

Vendor Contact Phone: 561-420-0595 Extension: 1201

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep
304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X FEIN# 45-3933731 DATE 1/6/25

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
ADDENDUM NO_1 

Addendum No_1 issued to publish and distribute the attached information to the Vendor Community 

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION: 

The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids on behalf of the West Virginia Division of Highways to establish an open-
end, multiple award contract for delivery of various rapid-setting mortar, concrete, asphalt, and bridge surface repair products, to 
include delivery, for use in the preventative maintenance of bridges and roadways throughout the state of West Virginia.  Per the 
Bid Requirements, Specifications, Terms and Conditions attached to this solicitation.

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 Concrete Sealer /pail 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Concrete Sealer, Purchased as individual pail

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 Concrete Sealer /drum 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Concrete Sealer, Purchased as drum

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
3 Concrete Sealer /tote 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Concrete Sealer, Purchased as 275 gallon totes

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
4 Concrete Sealer /truck 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Concrete Sealer, Purchased as bulk - delivered by metered truck

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
5 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete - Vertical App /

bag
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, Purchased as individual bags.

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
6 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete - Vertical App /

pallet
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, 
Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
7 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal 

App /bag
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications, 
Purchased as individual in bags

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
8 Polymer-Mod. Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal 

App /pallet
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Polymer-Modified Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, 
Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
9 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Vertical App /

bag
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, Purchased as individual bags

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
10 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Vertical App /

pallet
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Vertical Applications, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
11 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal 

App /bag
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications, Purchased as individual bags

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
12 Cementitious Mat. for Concrete- Horizontal 

App /pallet
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Cementitious Materials for Concrete Repairs - Horizontal Applications, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
13 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds /

pail
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds,
Purchased as individual pail

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
14 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds /

drum
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds,
Purchased as drums

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
15 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds /

tote
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds,
Purchased as tote

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
16 Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds /

truck
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Type 2 Class A Concrete Curing Compounds
Purchased as bulk - delivered by metered truck

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
17 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. for 

Concrete&Asphalt /box
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - Material Only, Purchased as boxes or meltable 
containers.

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
18 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. for 

Concrete&Asphalt /pallet
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - Material Only, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a 
pallet

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
19 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. w/ heating 

equip /box
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - Material and Heating Equipment, Purchased as boxes 
or meltable containers.

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
20 Hot-Poured Joint & Crack Seal. w/ heating 

equip /pallet
0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Hot-Poured Joint And Crack Sealant For Concrete and Asphalt Pavements - 
Material and Heating Equipment,  Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
21 Non-Shrink Grout /bag 0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Non-Shrink Grout,  Purchased as individual bags

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
22 Non-Shrink Grout /pallet 0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Non-Shrink Grout, Purchased as bulk - Packaged as a pallet

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
23 Soluble Salt Removers for Bridge Washing /

gallon
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500    

Extended Description:
Soluble Salt Removers for Bridge Washing

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
24 Silicone Joint Seal. Type1 LM NonSlag 

Silicone /tube/cart.
0.00000 OZ

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant,  Type 1 - Low Modulus Non-Slag Silicone, Purchased as individual caulking tubes/cartridges

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
25 Silicone Joint Seal. Type1 LM NonSlag 

Silicone /pail
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant,  Type 1 - Low Modulus Non-Slag Silicone, Purchased as pails

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
26 Silicone Joint Seal. Type1 LM NonSlag 

Silicone /drum
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant,  Type 1 - Low Modulus Non-Slag Silicone, Purchased in drums

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
27 Silicone Joint Seal. Type2 Very LM self level /

tube/cart
0.00000 OZ

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant - Type 2 - Very Low Modulus Self Leveling, Purchased as individual caulking tubes/cartridges

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST



Date Printed: Dec 27, 2024 Page: 16 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
28 Silicone Joint Seal. Type2 Very LM self level /

pail
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant - Type 2 - Very Low Modulus Self Leveling, Purchased as pails

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
29 Silicone Joint Seal. Type2 Very LM self level /

drum
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31201700    

Extended Description:
Silicone Joint Sealant - Type 2 - Very Low Modulus Self Leveling, Purchased as drums

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
30 Two-Coat HB Acrylic System w/Org Zinc 

Primer /gallon
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Two-Coat High Build Acrylic System using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
31 Two-Coat HB Acrylic System w/Org Zinc 

Primer /drum
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Two-Coat High Build Acrylic System using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
32 Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Sys w/ Org 

Zinc Primer /gal
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
33 Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Sys w/ Org 

Zinc Primer /drum
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Fast Dry Polyaspartic Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
34 Moisture-Cured Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc 

Primer /gallon
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Moisture - Cured Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
35 Moisture-Cured Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc 

Primer /drum
0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Moisture - Cured Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
36 Polysiloxane Sys w/Org Zinc Primer /gallon 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Polysiloxane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
37 Polysiloxane Sys w/Org Zinc Primer /drum 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Polysiloxane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
38 Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc Primer /gallon 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased per gallon

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

VARIOUS AGENCY 
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

  

No City WV No City WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
39 Urethane Sys w/ Org Zinc Primer /drum 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

31211500    

Extended Description:
Urethane Systems using Organic Zinc Primer, Kit, including all components of system, Purchased in drums.

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS
Line Event Event Date
1 Tech Questions due by 10:00am 2024-12-27



Document Phase Document Description Page 

22

DOT2500000031 Final Repair Products for Bridges and 

Roads 6625C011





























Erica Gerhart - Operations Director

792 NE 40th Ct. Oakland Park, FL 33334

561-420-0595 / 561-420-0599

erica.gerhart@phoscrete.com

Phoscrete Corporation

Erica Gerhart - Operations Director  1/6/25

561-420-0595 / 561-420-0599

erica.gerhart@phoscrete.com



























Erica Gerhart
561-420-0595

561-420-0599
erica.gerhart@phoscrete.com
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