
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
 



 



Date Printed: Jul 9, 2024 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1437544

Solicitation Description: Sodium Chloride - Roadway Salt 6624C091

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2024-07-09 13:30 SR 0803 ESR07082400000000173 1

VENDOR

000000191163
COMPASS MINERALS AMERICA INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2400000103

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2024-07-08 Response Time: 14:54:25

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep
304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Roadway Salt - Sodium Chloride - DELIVERY 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161506    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
DELIVERY of sodium chloride by Vendor to WVDOH Agency delivery locations, as specified on the ATT A Pricing Pages and Delivery Site 
spreadsheet. 
VENDOR NOTE:  Bid evaluation will be based on the bid prices submitted on ATT A.  Bid Pricing or other notations made in the wvOASIS 
commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Roadway Salt - Sodium Chloride - PICK-UP 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161506    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
PICK-UP of sodium chloride by a WVDOH Agency from a Vendor's source site. 
VENDOR NOTE:  Bid evaluation will be based on the bid prices submitted on ATT A.  Bid Pricing or other notations made in the wvOASIS 
commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.



Vendor Name:

County Delivery Site Location

Estimated 

Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 

(cost per ton)

Clinton @ WV85 875

Rock Creek 1,200

Seth 875

2,950 $95.03

Widen Road & CR 11 2,000

Maysel 100

2,100 $108.56

Chelyan 1,750

Elkview 875

North Charleston 2,100

St. Albans 2,000

I-64 @ Rt. 119 and Penn. Avenue 1,750

I-77 @ Sissonville 1,400

I-79 @ Amma 1,400

Corridor G @ Alum Creek 1,400

12,675 $87.94

Glenwood 875

Pt. Pleasant @ Fairground Rd. 2,000

Pt. Pleasant @ Jackson Ave. 0

2,875 $89.32

Red House 500

Hurricane @ Rt. 34 1,400

I-64 @ Scary Creek 2,000

3,900 $90.35

24,500

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 

CRQM DOT24*86 Attachment A Pricing Pages

 District 1 - Delivery

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a price per ton for the delivery of roadway salt to any or all Counties listed.  Vendor shall NOT 

add, delete, or modify spreadsheet column and row headers, descriptions, units of measure, or estimated quantities.  Exhibit A - "WVDOH 

Delivery Site & Contact Listings" contains detailed location and contact information for delivery site locations listed below. 

Mason

Kanawha

Clay

Boone

Kanawha County Total Estimated 

Clay County Total Estimated 

Boone County Total Estimated 

Compass Minerals America Inc.

DISTRICT 1

Putnam

DISTRICT 1 TOTAL 

Putnam County Total Estimated 

Mason County Total Estimated 

District 1 - Delivery Page 1 of 11 6624C091 - ATT A



Vendor Name:

County Delivery Site Location

Estimated 

Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 

(cost per ton)

Barboursville / Cabell Co. HQ 2,950

Huntington I-64 Section 1 1,450

Huntington 31st Bridge 0

Huntington 17th St. Bridge 0

4,400 $87.74

West Hamlin 2,050

Yawkey 800

Harts 950

3,800 $89.16

Corridor G @ Chapmanville 1,700

Wilkinson Substation 1,250

Man Substation 400

Hickory Lane 1,000

4,350 $95.57

Corridor G @ Miller's Creek, Bldg #03011 600

Mingo Cty @Miller's Creek, Bldg #03025 1,150

Gilbert Substation 500

Mingo 119 South 0

2,250 $95.29

Pritchard Substation 2,000

Wayne County Headquarters 1,650

Crum Substation 650

Heartland Intermodal Gateway 0

4,300 $88.13

19,100

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a price per ton for the delivery of roadway salt to any or all Counties listed.  Vendor 

shall NOT add, delete, or modify spreadsheet column and row headers, descriptions, units of measure, or estimated quantities.  

Exhibit A - "WVDOH Delivery Site & Contact Listings" contains detailed location and contact information for delivery site 

locations listed below. 

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6624C091

CRQM DOT24*86  Attachment A Pricing Pages

 District 2 - Delivery

Compass Minerals America Inc.

DISTRICT 2

Cabell

DISTRICT 2 TOTAL 

Cabell County Total

Lincoln County Total

Logan County Total

Mingo County Total

Wayne County Total

Wayne

Mingo

Logan

Lincoln

District 2 - Delivery Page 2 of 11 6624C091 - ATT A



Vendor Name:

County Delivery Site Location

Estimated 

Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 

(cost per ton)

Calhoun Millstone 2,000

2,000 $95.42

Ripley / Jackson Co. HQ 1,700

I-77 @ Medina 1,050

2,750 $88.88

Pleasants Belmont 1,450

1,450 $84.39

APD Pennsboro 500

Ellenboro / Harrisville Substation 2,300

Corridor D @ Nutter Farm 350

Smithville Substation 300

3,450 $88.03

Lefthand @ WV 36 350

Ambler Ridge Substation @ US 119 250

Roane County HQ 1,150

1,750 $97.35

Wirt Elizabeth Substation 950

950 $90.92

Parkersburg @ Rt. 95S 2,650

I-77 @ Parkersburg 100

Corridor D @ Riverhill 100

2,850 $87.94

15,200

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a price per ton for the delivery of roadway salt to any or all Counties listed.  Vendor 

shall NOT add, delete, or modify spreadsheet column and row headers, descriptions, units of measure, or estimated quantities.  

Exhibit A - "WVDOH Delivery Site & Contact Listings" contains detailed location and contact information for delivery site 

locations listed below. 

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6624C091

CRQM DOT24*86  Attachment A Pricing Pages

 District 3 - Delivery

DISTRICT 3

Compass Minerals America Inc.

DISTRICT 3 TOTAL 

Calhoun County Total

Jackson County Total

Pleasants County Total

Ritchie County Total

Roane County Total

Wood

Roane

Ritchie

Jackson

Wirt County Total

Wood County Total

District 3 - Delivery Page 3 of 11 6624C091 - ATT A



Vendor Name:

County Delivery Site Location

Estimated 

Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 

(cost per ton)

Doddridge West Union 1,000

1,000 $88.41

Harrison Co. HQ 5,000

Saltwell 500

Lost Creek Substation 1,000

Tunnel Hill Substation 1,000

7,500 $93.73

Marion Co. HQ 1,500

Mannington Substation 1,000

2,500 $97.48

Goshen Rd. Substation 1,500

Monongalia Co. HQ 4,000

Pentress Substation 500

6,000 $93.73

Bruceton Mills Substation 2,000

Preston Co. HQ 1,000

Terra Alta Substation 1,000

Fellowsville Substation 1,000

Aurora Substation 1,000

Cooper's Rock Substation 1,500

7,500 $98.71

Taylor Taylor Co. HQ 1,200

1,200 $96.94

25,700

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6624C091

CRQM DOT24*86  Attachment A Pricing Pages

 District 4 - Delivery

Compass Minerals America Inc.

DISTRICT 4

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a price per ton for the delivery of roadway salt to any or all Counties 

listed.  Vendor shall NOT add, delete, or modify spreadsheet column and row headers, descriptions, units of 

measure, or estimated quantities.  Exhibit A - "WVDOH Delivery Site & Contact Listings" contains detailed 

location and contact information for delivery site locations listed below. 

DISTRICT 4 TOTAL

Doddridge County Total

Harrison County Total

Marion County Total

Monongalia County Total

Preston County Total

Taylor County Total

Preston

Monongalia

Marion

Harrison

District 4 - Delivery Page 4 of 11 6624C091 - ATT A



Vendor Name: Compass Minerals America Inc.

County Delivery Site Location

Estimated 

Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 

(cost per ton)

Martinsburg Headquarters - 0571 Storage Bldg 800

Tabler Station - 0502 Storage Bldg 500

Berkeley County Headquarters 800

2,100 No Bid

Grant Co. HQ 100

Mt. Storm Substation 800

Corridor H @ Knobley Road 800

1,700 No Bid

Hampshire Co. HQ 500

Capon Bridge Substation 400

Slanesville 300

1,200 No Bid

Hardy Co. HQ 600

Baker Substation 600

1,200 No Bid

Jefferson County Headquarters - 0519 Storage Bldg 900

9/340 Expressway Headquarters - 0564 Storage Bldg 900

1,800 No Bid

Mineral Co. HQ 500

Skyline Substation 400

Short Gap Substation 300

District 5 HQ 100

1,300 No Bid

Morgan Co. HQ 500

Largent Substation 200

700 No Bid

10,000

Jefferson  County Estimated Total

Mineral County Total

DISTRICT 5 TOTAL

Morgan

Mineral

Jefferson

Hardy

Morgan County Total

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a price per ton for the delivery of roadway salt to any or all Counties listed.  Vendor shall NOT add, 

delete, or modify spreadsheet column and row headers, descriptions, units of measure, or estimated quantities.  Exhibit A - "WVDOH Delivery Site 

& Contact Listings" contains detailed location and contact information for delivery site locations listed below. 

Hardy County Total

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6624C091

CRQM DOT24*86  Attachment A Pricing Pages

 District 5 - Delivery

DISTRICT 5

Hampshire

Grant

Berkeley

Berkeley County Total

Grant  County Total

Hampshire County Total

District 5 - Delivery Page 5 of 11 6624C091 - ATT A



Vendor Name:

County Delivery Site Location

Estimated 

Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 

(cost per ton)

Brooke County HQ 1,200

US 22 Substation 1,200

2,400 $100.07

Hancock Hancock County HQ 1,800

1,800 $101.36

Marshall Co. HQ 2,500

Lynn Camp Substation 600

Cameron Substation 1,200

Sand Hill Substation 600

4,900 $94.65

Ohio Co. HQ 1,800

I-70 Interstate HQ 3,000

4,800 $92.86

Tyler Co. HQ 1,000

Centerville Substation 750

1,750 $91.72

Wetzel Co. HQ 1,000

Pine Grove Substation 650

Hundred Substation 850

2,500 $92.34

18,150

Wetzel County Total

Ohio County Total

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a price per ton for the delivery of roadway salt to any or all Counties listed.  

Vendor shall NOT add, delete, or modify spreadsheet column and row headers, descriptions, units of measure, or 

estimated quantities.  Exhibit A - "WVDOH Delivery Site & Contact Listings" contains detailed location and contact 

information for delivery site locations listed below. 

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6624C091

CRQM DOT24*86  Attachment A Pricing Pages

 District 6 - Delivery

Compass Minerals America Inc.

DISTRICT 6

DISTRICT 6 TOTAL

Wetzel

Tyler

Ohio

Marshall

Brooke

Brooke County Total

Hancock County Total

Marshall County Total

Tyler County Total

District 6 - Delivery Page 6 of 11 6624C091 - ATT A



Vendor Name:

County Delivery Site Location

Estimated 

Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 

(cost per ton)

Barbour Co. HQ (000111) 0

Barbour Co HQ-Shaw Field 500

Belington Substation (000113) 500

1,000 $99.87

Braxton County HQ (000444) 700

Heaters Substation (000431) 500

Coon Knob Substation (000405) 1100

Burnsville Substation (000432) 1300

3,600 $98.71

Gilmer Gilmer County HQ (001110) 600

600 $97.11

Lewis County HQ (002108) 1100

APD (Weston Mudlick)  (002187) 800

1,900 $100.22

Clow Lot/Upshur County HQ (004912) 2300

Tennerton/Upshur County Sub HQ (004903) 100

Kanawha Head 500

2,900 $99.06

Cherry Falls 400

RT 20/Cowen Substation (005110)

Webster County HQ @ Bolair 500

Hacker Valley Substation (005120) 100

1,000 $105.40

11,000

Webster

Upshur

Lewis

Braxton

Barbour

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a price per ton for the delivery of roadway salt to any or all Counties listed.  Vendor shall NOT 

add, delete, or modify spreadsheet column and row headers, descriptions, units of measure, or estimated quantities.  Exhibit A - "WVDOH 

Delivery Site & Contact Listings" contains detailed location and contact information for delivery site locations listed below. 

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6624C091

CRQM DOT24*86  Attachment A Pricing Pages

 District 7 - Delivery

DISTRICT 7

DISTRICT 7 TOTAL

Barbour County Total

Braxton County Total

Gilmer County Total

Lewis County Total

Upshur County Total

Webster County Total

Compass Minerals America Inc.

District 7 - Delivery Page 7 of 11 6624C091 - ATT A



Vendor Name:

County Delivery Site Location

Estimated 

Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 

(cost per ton)

Franklin, 220 North 400

Judy Gap Substation 350

Brandywine Stockpile 200

Sugar Grove Substation 150

Onego Stockpile 300

Franklin Rt. 220 South Lot 200

1,600 No Bid

Pocahontas County HQ 700

Seebert Stockpile 500

Green Bank Substation 400

Bartow Lot 400

Snowshoe Stockpile 100

Slaty Fork Stockpile 350

2,450 No Bid

Randolph Co. HQ 600

Harman Substation 450

Coalton Substation 600

Alpena Saltshed 400

Valley Head Substation 550

Mill Creek Substation 500

Pickens Substation 250

Corridor H 1000

4,350 $113.10

Tucker Co. HQ 600

Thomas Substation 600

Corridor H - Thomas 1000

2,200 $112.01

10,600

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a price per ton for the delivery of roadway salt to any or all Counties 

listed.  Vendor shall NOT add, delete, or modify spreadsheet column and row headers, descriptions, units of measure, 

or estimated quantities.  Exhibit A - "WVDOH Delivery Site & Contact Listings" contains detailed location and 

contact information for delivery site locations listed below. 

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6624C091

CRQM DOT24*86  Attachment A Pricing Pages

 District 8 - Delivery

Compass Minerals America Inc.

DISTRICT 8

Pendleton

DISTRICT 8 TOTAL

Pendleton County Total

Pocahontas County Total

Randolph County Total

Tucker County Total

Tucker

Randolph

Pocahontas

District 8 - Delivery Page 8 of 11 6624C091 - ATT A



County Delivery Site Location

Estimated 

Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 

(cost per ton)

Oak Hill APD 5,600

Lookout Substation 0

Falls View Substation 600

6,200 $91.65

Greenbrier Co. HQ 1,800

Crawley Substation 3,500

Hart's Run Substation 700

6,000 $100.74

Monroe Co. HQ 1,000

Peterstown Substation 500

1,500 $108.95

Nicholas Co. HQ 2,000

Curtin Substation 900

Fenwick 900

Corridor L/Muddlety Substation 3,500

7,300 $96.25

Summers Summers Co. HQ 1,600

1,600 $105.45

22,600

Fayette

DISTRICT 9 TOTAL

Fayette County Estimated Total

Greenbrier County Estimated Total

Monroe County Estimated Total

Nicholas County Estimated Total

Summers County Estimated Total

Nicholas

Monroe

Greenbrier

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a price per ton for the delivery of roadway salt to any or all Counties listed.  Vendor 

shall NOT add, delete, or modify spreadsheet column and row headers, descriptions, units of measure, or estimated quantities.  

Exhibit A - "WVDOH Delivery Site & Contact Listings" contains detailed location and contact information for delivery site 

locations listed below. 

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6624C091

CRQM DOT24*86  Attachment A Pricing Pages

 District 9 - Delivery

Compass Minerals America Inc.Vendor Name:

DISTRICT 9

District 9 - Delivery Page 9 of 11 6624C091 - ATT A



Vendor Name:

County Delivery Site Location

Estimated 

Quantity

Vendor Bid Price 

(cost per ton)

McDowell County HQ 1,800

Yukon Substation 250

Johnny Cake Substation 450

Raysal 450

2,950 $127.08

Mercer County HQ 2,350

Flat Top Substation 250

I-77 near Princeton 2,350

4,950 $114.95

Raleigh County HQ 7,200

Bolt Substation 100

Bragg Substation 4,500

Coalfields Expressway 3,500

15,300 $95.48

Wyoming County HQ 2,700

Still Run Substation 900

Hanover Outpost 100

3,700 $111.16

26,900

Vendor shall complete ATT A by providing a price per ton for the delivery of roadway salt to any or all Counties listed.  

Vendor shall NOT add, delete, or modify spreadsheet column and row headers, descriptions, units of measure, or estimated 

quantities.  Exhibit A - "WVDOH Delivery Site Information" contains detailed location and contact information for delivery 

site locations listed below. 

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6624C091

CRQM DOT24*86  Attachment A Pricing Pages

District 10 - Delivery

Compass Minerals America Inc.

DISTRICT 10

McDowell

DISTRICT 10 TOTAL

McDowell County Estimated Total

Mercer County Estimated Total

Raleigh County Estimated Total

Wyoming County Estimated Total

Wyoming

Mercer

Raleigh

District 10 - Delivery Page 10 of 11 6624C091 - ATT A



Vendor Storage Site Locations
Vendor Bid Price 

(cost per ton)

Hugheston

Shamblin Stone Inc

2096 Stephen St

Hugheston, WV 25110

Portsmouth

Conley River Terminal

5150 Gallia Pike

Portsmouth, OH 45662

Willow Island

4x Industrial

8598 S. Pleasant Highway

St. Marys, WV 26170

West Elizabeth

RiverLift Industries  

1000 Madison Ave Rte 837

West Elizabeth, PA 15088

$85.00

ROADWAY SALT - SODIUM CHLORIDE 6624C091

CRQM DOT24*86  Attachment A Pricing Pages

Agency Pick-up

Vendor shall provide a physical 911 address and a price per ton for roadway salt to be 

available for pick-up by WVDOH Agencies.  Vendor pricing shall include Vendor loading 

Agency trucks.

$85.00

$82.00

$82.00

Agency Pick-up Page 11 of 11 6624C091 - ATT A

























































800-323-1641
913-338-7945

highwaygroup@compassminerals.com

Sean Lierz - Senior Manager Highway Sales



SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE

INSURER F :

INSURER E :

INSURER D :

INSURER C :

INSURER B :

INSURER A :

NAIC #

NAME:
CONTACT

(A/C, No):
FAX

E-MAIL
ADDRESS:

PRODUCER

(A/C, No, Ext):
PHONE

INSURED

REVISION NUMBER:CERTIFICATE NUMBER:COVERAGES

IMPORTANT:  If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement.  A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW.  THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

OTHER:

(Per accident)

(Ea accident)

$

$

N / A

SUBR
WVD

ADDL
INSD

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED.  NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

$

$

$

$PROPERTY DAMAGE

BODILY INJURY (Per accident)

BODILY INJURY (Per person)

COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT

AUTOS ONLY

AUTOSAUTOS ONLY
NON-OWNED

SCHEDULEDOWNED

ANY AUTO

AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY

Y / N

WORKERS COMPENSATION
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY

OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED?
(Mandatory in NH)

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below
If yes, describe under

ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE

$

$

$

E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT

E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE

E.L. EACH ACCIDENT

ER
OTH-

STATUTE
PER

LIMITS(MM/DD/YYYY)
POLICY EXP

(MM/DD/YYYY)
POLICY EFF

POLICY NUMBERTYPE OF INSURANCELTR
INSR

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES  (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

EXCESS LIAB

UMBRELLA LIAB $EACH OCCURRENCE

$AGGREGATE

$

OCCUR

CLAIMS-MADE

DED RETENTION $

$PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG

$GENERAL AGGREGATE

$PERSONAL & ADV INJURY

$MED EXP (Any one person)

$EACH OCCURRENCE
DAMAGE TO RENTED

$PREMISES (Ea occurrence)

COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY

CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR

GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER:

POLICY
PRO-
JECT LOC

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE
DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)

CANCELLATION

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

© 1988-2016 ACORD CORPORATION.  All rights reserved.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD

HIRED
AUTOS ONLY

2,000,000

11/01/2024

XSL G27632117

SCF C68932865 (OR)

SEA-003458212-18

1,000,000

SCF C68932877 (WI,PA)

X

N/A

N

X

SIR $500,000

11/01/2023

1

11/01/2024

SanFrancisco.Certs@marsh.com

ISA H08872119

A

4,000,000

2,000,000

20702
N/A

1,000,000

X

X

11/10/2023

11/01/2023

11/01/2023

Re: State of West Virginia Road Salt Contract #66130027


West Virginia Division of Highways is  included as additional insured (except workers’ compensation) where required by written contract. 

X

11/01/2023

     Charleston, WV  25305

     West Virginia Division of Highways


X

A

C

ACE Fire Underwriters Insurance Company

CN101916390-STND-GAWU-23-24

11/01/2024

1,000,000

A

4,000,000

22667

1,000,000

1,000,000

WLR C68932853 (AOS)

     15 West South Temple, Suite 700

     Marsh USA Risk & Insurance Services


     Salt Lake City, UT  84101

     and Subsidiaries

     Compass Minerals America Inc.


     Overland Park, KS  66210
     9900 W. 109th Street, Suite 100


11/01/2023

     1900 Kanawha Blvd.


A

Marsh Risk & Insurance Services

11/01/2024

11/01/2024

ACE American Insurance Company



























UNANIMOUS WRITTEN CONSENT 

OF THE SOLE MEMBER 

OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS 

OF 

COMPASS MINERALS AMERICA INC. 

June 27, 2024

The undersigned, being the sole member of the board of directors (the “Board”) of 

Compass Minerals America Inc., a Delaware corporation (the “Corporation”), hereby consents in 

writing pursuant to Section 141(f) of the Delaware General Corporation Law to the adoption of 

the following resolutions without a meeting and waive any notice required in connection therewith. 

Authorized Signatories 

WHEREAS, from time to time, it is desirable for individuals to sign documents on behalf 

of the Corporation in connection with sales transactions relating to the Corporation’s Highway 

Sales Department. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the following individuals (the 

“Authorized Signatories”) be, and each of them hereby is, authorized, subject to applicable 

limitations under the Corporation’s Delegation of Authority Policy, on behalf of the Corporation, 

to sign bids, performance bonds and contracts for the sale of sodium chloride and other deicing 

products, and to sign any other documents which, in his or her opinion, are necessary or desirable 

in order to effectuate and carry out the foregoing, and all other individuals who were so authorized 

prior to the date first written above are no longer so authorized: 

Edward C. Dowling, Jr. President and CEO 

Jeffrey Cathey Chief Financial Officer 

Mary L. Frontczak Chief Legal and Administrative Officer and Corporate Secretary 

Ben Nichols Chief Sales Officer 

Brent A. Collins Treasurer 

Jared M. Campbell Assistant Secretary 

Gary R. Gose Vice President, Tax and Assistant Secretary 

Jon Schnieders Vice President, Salt 

Bill Crooks Director, Customer Service 

Joel Gerdes Director, U.S. Highway Sales 

Ryan Royer Director of Sales – Chemical & MgCl2 

Sean Lierz Highway Sales Senior Manager 

Jason Fritz Highway Sales Manager 

Austin Hilbrands Highway Sales Manager 

Julio Lopez Highway Market Analyst 

Tess Virden Sales Manager 



General 

RESOLVED, that the officers of the Corporation are, and each of them is, hereby 

authorized, for and on behalf of the Corporation, to execute, deliver, file, acknowledge and record 

any and all such documents and instruments, and to take or cause to be done any and all such other 

things as they, or any of them, may deem necessary or desirable to effectuate and carry out the 

resolutions adopted hereby; and 

FURTHER RESOLVED, that any actions previously taken or caused to be taken by any 

officer of the Corporation or any Authorized Signatory in connection with the matters 

contemplated by these resolutions, or in carrying out the terms and intentions of the above 

resolutions, are hereby acknowledged to be duly authorized acts performed on behalf of the 

Corporation and are hereby ratified, confirmed and adopted as such. 

[Signature Page Follows] 



Signature page to UWC – CMA Hwy Sales Authorized Signatories June 2024 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the undersigned have caused this consent to be duly executed 

as of the date first written above. This consent may be executed via .pdf, facsimile or other 

electronic means and in two or more counterparts, each of which will be deemed an original, and 

all of which together will constitute one and the same instrument. 

_____________________________ _____________________________ 

Jeffrey Cathey  Jared M. Campbell 



February 2024 

CREDIT INFORMATION 

FIRM NAME: Compass Minerals America Inc. PHONE: (913) 344-9100

PRINCIPAL ADDRESS: 9900 W. 109th St., Suite 100 FEDERAL ID CODE:   48-1047632
Overland Park, Kansas  66210 

DATE INCORPORATED: 01/21/88 
MAILING ADDRESS: Same 

DATE STARTED: 1917 
OTHER LOCATIONS: Chicago, IL; Duluth, MN; 

Ogden, UT; Lyons, KS; TYPE OF BUSINESS: Manufacturing 
Cote Blanche, LA; Buffalo, NY 

OFFICERS: 
Edward C. Dowling, Jr. 
Lorin Crenshaw 
Jeffrey Cathey
Mary L. Frontczak 
Ben Nichols
James A. Vanderwel 
Gary R. Gose

President and CEO  
Chief Financial Officer  
Chief Accounting Officer 
Chief Legal and Administrative Officer and Corporate Secretary 
Chief Sales Officer
Treasurer 
Vice President, Tax and Assistant Secretary 

TRADE REFERENCES: 
Wheeler Machinery Co.  
4901 W 2100 S 
West Valley City, UT  84120 
account-coordinators@wheelercat.com 
801-978-1850 (fax)

H&E Equipment LLC 
7500 Pecue Lane 
Baton Rouge, LA 70809 
225-756-3602
225-756-3621 (fax) attn. Teresa
tlalonde@he-equipment.com

Prince Agri Products 
Contact: Kathy Irvin 
229 Radio Road 
Quincy, IL 62305 
(217) 592-1332
(217) 223-2808 (fax)

Salerno Packaging Inc.  
c/o Inteplast Credit  
9 Peach Tree Hill Road 
Livingston NJ 07039 
973-740-8205 (Fax)

BANK REFERENCES: Account No.: 581776991 
JP Morgan Chase Contact:  Credit Reference Group  
One Chase Plaza, 7th Floor Tel: (817) 399-7201
New York, NY 10005 Fax:  (817) 345-3794 or 3795

RESALE / EXEMPTION STATUS: 
Exemption certificates provided upon request for items which are incorporated as an ingredient or component part  
of other tangible personal property to be produced for ultimate sale at retail by manufacturing, processing  
or fabricating.  
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