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Proc Folder: 1482414 Reason for Modification:

Doc Description: Lab Testing Equipment and Supplies Addendum #2 is issued to publish
corrected excel spreadsheet.

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2024-09-18 2024-09-24 13:30 CRFQ 0313 DEP2500000005 3

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

BID CLERK

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION ~
2019 WASHINGTON STE ‘
CHARLESTON WV 25305

us

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code:

Vendor Name : Preiser Scientific Inc
Address : 94 Qliver Street

Street :

City : Saint Albans

State:  West Virginia Country : USA Zip: 25177

Principal Contact;  Don Meddings

Vendor Contact Phone:  304-727-2902 Extension: 240

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Joseph E Hager Il

(304) 558-2306

joseph.e.hagerii@wv.gov

Vendor oy

Signature X FEIN# 550257730 DATE 9/19/2024

All offers subject to all td’ns and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed: ~ Sep 18, 2024 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05




ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids on behalf of West Virginia Department of Environmental Protection to
establish a contract for Lab Testing Equipment and Supplies. The Contract awarded from this Solicitation shall cover Eligible Items
from Vendor's Catalog per the attached specifications and terms and conditions.

INVOICE TO SHIP TO J
VARIOUS AGENCY STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City wv
us

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS
INDICATED BY ORDER

No City ' oy,
US

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty

Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

1 Lab Testing Equipment and Supplies

0.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification Model #

41120000

Extended Description:

Please complete the attached Exhibit A Pricing Page.

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS

Line Event

Date Printed: ~ Sep 18, 2024

Page: 2

Event Date

FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05




SOLICITATION NUMBER: CRFQ 0313 DEP2500000005
Addendum Number: No.02

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as
(“Solicitation™) to reflect the change(s) identified and described below.

Applicable Addendum Category:

| ] Modify bid opening date and time

[ | Modify specifications of product or service being sought
[ | Attachment of vendor questions and responses
[ | Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet

[¢'| Correction of error

[ | Other

Description of Modification to Solicitation:

Addendum issued to publish and distribute the attached documentation to the vendor community.

1. To upload revised Excel Spreadsheet. The previous spreadsheet had cells contained within it
without functioning formulas. The formulas have been corrected and all cell should compute properly.

Additional Documentation: Documentation related to this Addendum (if any) has been
included herewith as Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference.

Terms and Conditions:

1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in
full force and effect.

2. Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by
completing an Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. The addendum
acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

Revised 6/8/2012



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: CRFQ DEP25%05

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[ 1 Addendum No. 1 [ ] Addendum No. 6
[ ] Addendum No.2 [ ] Addendum No. 7
[ ] Addendum No. 3 [ ] Addendum No. 8
[ ] Addendum No. 4 [ ] Addendum No.9
[ ] Addendum No.5 [ ] Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. I
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

Preiser Scientific, Inc.

Compan
_P 2 y

Authorized Signature

A
9/19/2024

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.
Revised 6/8/2012



MEDSUP12A- PRICING PAGE

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS FOR THE PRICING PAGE:
1. Bidders MUST praovide a standard percentage discount on the three categories.
2. Bidders will only then need to fill out the Catalogue Price Column

VENDORS SHOULD COMPLETE ALL COLUMNS
TR 7

SUPPLIES'

Pricing Page Eligible Item Description d Unit Price C WLE Total Ci i
All references to brand names are for ill i only and may bid the brand listed or an equal product.
| " " Unit {For ¢ by
Product C. Di L Di: d ] Estimated Discounted
ltem # Category Description Manufacturer Mig. # Size/Wt Frice Percentage Amount Unit Price Wﬂ”.”»“: Unit Qty Unit Price Item Total Cost

1 KIMWIPES 12X12 3PLY (INBERLY CLARK 4743 0 No Bid 0% #VALUE! #VALUE! PK 1 #VALUE! #VALUE!
2 ALGAL TOXIN TEST KITS HACH 2165700 1 $677.50 0% $0.00 $677.50 PK 1 $677.50 $677.50
3 SYRINGE FILTER 28MMX.45UM ALHSTROM 865686 $91.00 0% $0.00 $91.00 PK 1 $91.00 $1,001.00
4 LABMAT DISPOSABLE BENCH LINER 20"X50° et F24675.0000 $66.70 0% $0.00 $66.70 2K 1 $66.70 $66.70
5 PH PAPER TEST STRIPS, PH RANGE 0.0-14.0 PREISER 91-2571-02 $12.00 0% $0.00 $12.00 PK 1 §12.00 $12.00
6 MASTERFLEX, C-FLEX SPOOLED, LIS 25 TUBING MASTERFLEX 92-2343-25 $1,130.00 0% $0.00 $1,130.00 PK 8 $1,130.00 $9,040.00
7 GLASS VIEWING TUBE, 6/PK HACH 173006 $38.00 0% $0.00 $38.00 PK 5 $38.00 $190.00
8 NON-MASNETIC. NONSERRATED STAINLESS STEEL STRAIGHT | pERKINELMER 9908400 No bid 0% #VALUE! | #VALUE! EA 2 #VALUE! #VALUE
9 SYRINGE FILTERS & 50MM UNITS, STERILE ADVANTEC MFS 03CPO20AS $104.00 0% $0.00 $104.00 PK 30 $104.00 $3,120.00
EP SCIENTIFIC : , "
10 CHEMICAL PRESERVATIVE GLASS AMPOULES SeEBUCTS ACH-5-1 Na bid 0% #ALUE! #VALUE! cs 1 #VALUE! #VALUE!
}
1 DRAM SAMPLE VAILS J.G. FINNERAN 82020-1235 No bid 0% H#VALUE! #YALUE! cs 1 #YALUE! #VALUE!
READYREFRESH 7
12 PURE LIFE DISTILLED WATER, | GALLON BY BLUETRITON ARROWDIST $1320 0% $0.00 $13.20 cs 3 $13.20 $39.60
BRANDS
READYREFRESH
13 PURE LIFE DISTILLED WATER, 1 GALLON BY BLUETRITON ARROWDIST $2.30 0% $0.00 $2.30 EA €0 $2.30 $138.00
BRANDS
CHEMICALS 1 ] ) |
14 WIDE RANGE pH INDICATOR SOLUTION ‘100 mL MDB HACH 2329332 $34.60 0% $0.00 $34.60 EA 1 $34.60 $34.60
2527025
15 ARSENIC FREE FLOURIDE REAGENT ACCUVAV AMPULES SPADNS2 $64 15 0% $0.00 $64.15 PK 2 $64.15 $128.30
2218H& G 1
16 REAGENT - PH WIDE RANGE INDICATOR SOLUTION LAMOTTE $19.70 0% $0.00 $19.70 EA 1 $19.70 $19.70
17 ELECTRODE STORAGE SOLUTION; 500 mL OAKTON UX-00653-04 $21.00 0% $0.00 $21.00 PT 8 $21.00 $168.00
18 BUFFER SOLUTION, pH 10.01 OAKTON UX-05942-64 $24.60 0% $0.00 $24.60 EA 5 $24.60 $123.00

Page 1 of



MEDSUP12A- PRICING PAGE

19 BUFFER SOLUTION, pH 7.00 OAKTON UX-05942-14 $24.60 0% $0.00 $24.60 EA 6 $24.60 §147.60

20 BUFFER SOLUTION, pH 4.01 OAKTON UX-05942-24 $24.60 0% $0.00 $24.60 EA 6 $24.50 $147.60

21 IRON CHECKER REAGENTS (25 TESTS) HANNAH HI721-25 $14.99 0% $0.00 $14.99 PK 5 $14.99 $74.95

22 ALUMINIM REAGENT SET, ALUMINON HACH 2242000 $231.25 0% $0.00 $231.25 PK 2 $231.25 $462.50

t

23 BUFFER PACK; 500 mL OF EACH pH 4,01, 7.00 AND 10.01 OAKTON UX-05942-10 $24.00 0% $0.00 $24.00 PK 3 $24.00 $72.00

24 WIDE RANGE INDICATCR (PH REGENT 3) LAMOTTE 2218-H $11.00 0% $0.00 $11.00 EA 2 $11.00 $22.00

25 ALUMINUM PWDR PK RGT SET 10ML UN1328 TINTOMETER INC 535000 $176.90 0% $0.00 $176.90 EA 1 $17€.90 $176.90

26 IRON FERRO REAGENTS TINTOMETER INC 530560 $28.15 0% $0.00 $28.15 PK 9 $28.15 $253.35

g MANGANESE HR PWDR RGT SET 10ML PK100 UN1479 mﬂMMuﬂ...u_..“.mm_o 535100 $73.75 0% $0.00 $73.75 PK 2 $73.75 $147.50

RICCA o -

28 ELECTRODE STORAGE SOLUTION CHEMICALS 2795-32 $40.00 0% $0.00 $40.00 A 3 $40.00 $120.00
INORGANIC o

29 1000 PPM ARSENIC FOR ICP Pingdobi CGASI-125M. no bid 0% #VALUE! #VALUE! EA 1 #ALUE! #VALUE!

30 INORGANIC . . Y

1000 PPM BERYLLIUM FOR ICP ey CGBE1-125ML no bid 0% #ALUE! #VALUE! EA ! #VALUE! #ALUE!

INORGANIC o

31 1000 PPM CADMIUM FOR ICP VENTURES CGCD1-125ML no bid 0% #VALUE! #VALUE! EA 1 #VALUE! #/ALUE!
INORGANIC i

32 1000 PPM CHROMIUM+6 FOR ICP VENTURES CGCR(6)1-125ML na bid 0% #VALUE! #VALUE! EA 1 #VALUE! #VALUE!
INORGANIC . o X

33 1000 PPM MANGANESE FOR ICP VENTURES CGMN1-125ML no bid 0% #VALUE! VALUE? EA 1 #VALUE! #YALUE!
INORGANIC o -

34 1000 PPM NICKEL FOR ICP NUENTURES CGNIH-125ML no bid 0% #VALUE! #/ALUEY EA 1 #VALUE! #VALUE!
INORGANIC ;

35 1000 PPM LEAD FOR ICP Y ey CHM00A758 no bid 0% #/ALUE! #VALUEI EA 1 #VALUE! #/ALUE!

|

36 IRON TEST KIT, OCTA-SLIDE 2 0.5-10PPM LAMOTTE 334701 $110 40 0% $0.00 $110.40 EA 5 $110.40 $552.00

37 ALKALINITY TEST KIT LAMOTTE 3467-01 $79.00 0% $0.00 $79.00 EA 33 $79.00 $2,607.00

38 DPD CHLORINE - BROMINE - PH TEST KIT LAMOTTE 6896-01 | $278.70 0% $0.00 $278.70 EA 21 $278.70 $5,852.70

39 MANGANESE TEST KIT LAMOTTE 3588-02 $13070 0% $0.00 $130.70 2 $130.70 $261.40

40 PH 4 BUFFER SOLUTION RED (NOT-REGULATED) POLY PAC PREISER 21-2097-14 $64.00 0% $0.00 $64.00 PK 6 $64.00 $384.00

41 PH 7 BUFFER SOLUTION YELLOW (NOT-REGULATED) POLY PAC PREISER 21-209717 $64.00 0% $0.00 $64.00 PK 6 $64.00 $384.00

42 PH 10 BUFFER SOLUTION BLUE (NOT-REGULATED) POLY PAC PREISER 21-2097-20 | $64.00 0% $0.00 $64.00 PK 5 $64.00 $320.00
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MEDSUP12A- PRICING PAGTZ

POWER REAGENTSFOR 25 TESTS (IRON) HANNA HI721-25 $14 99 0% $0.00 $14.99 PK 5 $14.99 $74.95
INTERSTATE | INTERSOL 24/190
44 DENATURED ALCOHOL CHEMICAL GO PROOF $625.00 0% $0.00 $625.00 DR 2 $625.00 $1,250.00
45 PORMALDEHYDE, 37% 20LT SOL LABCHEM LC146505 $192.00 0% $0.00 $192.00 EA 2 $192.00 $384.00
KINGSCOTE
46 DYE, BRIGHT STANDARD BLUE WATER TRACER LIQUID, 1 GAL CHEMICALS 106002-01G $138.00 0% $0.00 $138.00 EA 2 $138.00 $276.00
DYE, BRIGHT WATER TRACER FLUORESCENT, YELLOWISH KINGSCOTE
47 GREEN. 1 GAL CHEMIGALS 106001-01G $135.00 0% $0.00 $135.00 EA 1 $135.00 $135.00
48 CONDUCTIVITY/TDS STANDARD, 1 GAL checa RIA-224141 $84.30 0% $0.00 $84.30 EA 2 $84.30 $168.60
HEMICALS
S
49 CONDUCTIVITY CALIBRATOR SOLUTION YSIING 8._8““_ M.oom_. $135.00 0% $0.00 $135.00 EA 2 $135.00 $270.00
50 PH BUFFER SOLUTIONS OAKTON 00854-00 $15.20 0% $0.00 $15.20 EA 5 $15.20 $76.00
51 TURBIDITY STANDARD Ysi CB36A95 no bid 0% #VALUE! #VALUE! EA 2 #VALUE! #VALUE!
52 DPD TOTAL CHLORINE REAGENT, 25ML POWER PACKS HACH 1406499 $37.05 0% $0.00 $37.05 PK 1 §37.05 $37.05
iz o N L A vire ]
LY. » S. . EGUIPMENTINSTRUMENTS. Tl |
5 fa * 5 5 : ) & A 1 .
53 SLUDGE JUDGE Il LARGE CAPACITY SAMPLER OVERALL NASCO BO1355WA $295.00 0% $0.00 $295.00 EA 1 $295.00 $295.00
LENGHT 15FT
TRACEABLE LOLUIPOP SHOCKAWATERPROOF THERMOMETER o
54 L el oy ptodn THOMAS 1235030 $32.00 0% $0.00 $32.00 EA 1 $32.00 $32.00
55 pH, mV, TEMPERATLRE METER AND PROBE OAKTON WD-35614-30 no bid 0% #VALUE! #VALUE! EA 1 #VALUE! #VALUE!
56 ALKALINITY TEST KIT LAMOTTE 346701 $79.00 0% $0.00 $79.00 EA 9 $79.00 $711.00
57 pH TESTR 30+ WATEPROOF POCKET TESTER OAKTON WD-35634-30 $116.00 0% $0.00 $116.00 EA 1 $116.00 $116.00
58 IRON COLORIMETER - CHECKER HC HANNAH HI721 $67.99 0% $0.00 $67.99 EA 5 $67.99 $339.95
59 DISSOLVED OXYGEN TEST KIT HACH $151.50 0% $0.00 $151.50 EA 2 $151.50 $303.00
146900 _
60 pH ELECTRODE AND TEMPERATURE SENSOR OAKTON UX-35808-88 $135.00 0% $0.00 $135.00 =A 2 $135.00 $270.00
61 PH/ECITDS/TEMPERATURE METER WITH CAL CHECK HANNAH HI9813-61 $279.09 0% $0.00 $279.99 EA 1 $279.99 $279.99
SAMPLING BO1310WA SWING SAMPLER, POLYETHYLENE &
B2 POLYURETHANE, 6 TO 12t dapth NASCO B01310 $270.00 0% $0.00 $270.00 EA 1 $270.00 $270.00
63 IRON AND pH COLOR DISC TEST KIT HACH 256200 $348.60 0% $0.00 $348.60 EA 1 $348.60 $348.60
B4 POCKET COLORIMETER, ALUMINUM, WITH BOX HACH LPV445.97.25110 $715.00 0% $0.00 $715.00 EA 1 $715.00 $715.00
65 FRESH WATER CONDUCTIVITY DATA LOGGER HOBO U24-004 no bid 0% #VALUE! #/ALUE! EA 1 #VALUE! #VALUE!
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86 30-FOOT WATER LEVEL DATA LOGGER HOBO U20-001-01 no bid , 0% #VALUE! #VALUE! EA 1 #VALUE! #VALUE!
67 TIDBIT V2 WATER TEMPERATURE DATA LOGGER HOBO UTBI001 no bid 0% BVALUE #VAL EA 1 #VALUE! #VALUE!
68 ALL-IN-ONE WATERPROOF SEMI-DOME PH ELECTRODE W/AUTON| OAKTON 35808-88 $138.60 0% $0.00 $138.80 EA 6 $138.60 $831.60
89 COLORIMETER FREE IRON CHECK HANNA HI721 $67.99 0% $0.00 $67.99 EA 5 $67.99 $339.95
70 PH/ECITDS MULTIPARAMETER PROBE WITH CAL CHECK HANNA HI1285-6 $144.99 0% $0.00 $144.99 EA 4 $144.99 $579.96
7 WATERPROOF PH 150 METER OAKTON 35614-30 no bid 0% #VALUE! #VALUE! EA 1 #VALUE! #VALUE!
72 TRACEABLE LOLLIPOP SHOCKMWATERPROOF THERMOMETER THOMAS 1235D30 $32.00 0% $0.00 $32.00 EA 5 $32,00 $160.00
73 PH/EC/TDS/TEMPERATURE METER, PORTABLE HANNA HI9813-6 $279.98 0% $0.00 $279.99 EA 3 $279.99 $839.97
MANDATORY INFORMATION: List of Discount Percentages:
= Category DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE |

| SUPPLIES 0%

Il CHEMICALS 0%

I EQUIPMENT / INSTRUMENTS 0%

Vendors should complste the contract coardinator Informatlon belaw:

VENDOR

NAME: Preiser Sclentlfic, Inc. PHONE: ___304-727-29{I
CONTRACT “

MANAGER: Doa A m\ﬁh‘wr e g FAX:

(Please print) =
EMAIL: __Don@preiser.com,

AUTHORIZED \\\\\N.\
REPRESENTATIVE: 9l
Amm—EmEqi )

ARGV,

. (Date)
AUTHORIZED /
REPRESENTATI(E; _ S eus
(Print)
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