
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1322263

Solicitation Description: WINTER GRADE ASPHALT PATCHING MIXTURE

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2024-01-04 13:30 SR 0803 ESR01032400000003140 1

VENDOR

000000203375
KELLY PAVING INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2400000055

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2024-01-03 Response Time: 12:50:50

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep
304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Bulk Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture 

(Cold Mix)
0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30121601    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE, ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Pre-Packaged Winter Grade Asphalt 

Patching Mixture (Cold Mix
0.00000 LB 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30121601    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE, ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST



















































































Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture

(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT ONE

Boone 0 Clinton @ WV85-108 Cow Creek Rd, Wharton TON No Bid

Boone 30 Rock Creek-203 DOH Garage Rd, Danville TON No Bid

Boone 20 Seth-9288 Coal River Rd, Seth TON No Bid

Clay 0 Clay Headquarters-4476 Triplett Ridge Rd, Clay TON No Bid

Clay 0 Maysel 2054-Procious Maysel Rd, Maysel TON No Bid

Kanawha 20 Chelyan-14987 MacCorkle Ave, Cabin Creek TON No Bid

Kanawha 0 Elkview-904 Old Frame Rd, Elkview TON No Bid

Kanawha 100 North Charleston-2800 West Washington St, Charleston TON No Bid

Kanawha 25 St. Albans-2334 MacCorkle Ave, St Albans TON No Bid

Kanawha 0 I-64 @ Rt. 119 and Penn. Ave-2266 Pennsylvania Ave, Charleston TON No Bid

Kanawha 0 I-77 @ Sissonville-36 Allen Fork Rd, Sissonville TON No Bid

Kanawha 20 I-79 @ Amma-3134 Amma Rd, Amma TON No Bid

Kanawha 20 Corridor G @ Alum Creek-401 Champion Dr, South Charleston TON No Bid

Mason 0 Glenwood 40940-Huntington Rd (WV2), Glenwood TON No Bid

Mason 0 Pt. Pleasant @ Fairground Rd-225 Fairground, Rd Point Pleasant TON No Bid

Mason 0 Pt. Pleasant @ Jackson Ave-2702 Jackson Ave, Point Pleasant TON No Bid

Putnam 0 Red House-11923 Charleston Rd, Red House TON No Bid

Putnam 0 Hurricane @ Rt. 34-3256 Teays Valley Rd, Hurricane TON No Bid

Putnam 0 Scary Creek-704 Winfield Rd, St. Albans TON No Bid

Putnam 50 US 35 @ Fraziers Bottom-2702 Jackson Ave, Point Pleasant TON No Bid

County Cold Mix per Location Including Delivery
Unit of 

Measure
Est. Quant. Unit Cost

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall complete the Pricing Page (ATT A) by providing a bid price for each Contract Item listed.  Vendor shall factor into their bid prices all equipment, 

materials, delivery, and labor required.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract. Qualified responsible vendors shall be awarded a 

contract for the item bid meeting the required specifications with the lowest bid price per unit of measure, per delivery/storage location.  

ATT A - Pricing Page Page 1 of 10 6624C027



Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture

(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT TWO

Cabell Unknown Barboursville-6200 Rt 60 East, Barboursville TON No Bid

Cabell Unknown I-64 @ Huntington-3100 16th Street Rd, Huntington TON No Bid

Lincoln Unknown West Hamlin-7338 State Rt 10, West Hamlin TON No Bid

Lincoln Unknown Yawkey-4962 Midway Rd, Yawkey TON No Bid

Lincoln Unknown Harts-1313 McClellan Hwy, South Harts TON No Bid

Logan Unknown Corridor G @ Chapmanville-8100 Old Logan Rd, Chapmanville TON No Bid

Logan Unknown Wilkinson-127 Springfield Rd, Wilkinson TON No Bid

Logan Unknown Man-4801 Buffalo Creek Rd, Amherstdale TON No Bid

Mingo Unknown Mingo County @Miller's Creek-1 Highway Garage Rd, Williamson TON No Bid

Mingo Unknown Gilbert-2200 RT 52, Gilbert TON No Bid

Wayne Unknown Crum 20351-Tolsia Hwy, Crum TON No Bid

Wayne Unknown Pritchard-1249 Prichard Rd, Prichard TON No Bid

Wayne Unknown Wayne-326 Third St, Wayne TON No Bid

County Cold Mix per Location Including Delivery
Unit of 

Measure
Unit CostEst. Quant.

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall complete the Pricing Page (ATT A) by providing a bid price for each Contract Item listed.  Vendor shall factor into their bid prices all equipment, 

materials, delivery, and labor required.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract. Qualified responsible vendors shall be awarded a 

contract for the item bid meeting the required specifications with the lowest bid price per unit of measure, per delivery/storage location.  
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Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture

(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT THREE

Calhoun Unknown Millstone-7619 S. Calhoun Hwy, Millstone TON No Bid

Jackson Unknown Ripley-946 Claylick Rd, Ripley TON No Bid

Jackson Unknown I-77 @ Medina-2600 Medina Rd, Ravenswood TON No Bid

Pleasants Unknown Belmont-401 Second St, Belmont TON No Bid

Pleasants Unknown St. Mary's (Colin-Anderson Lot)-245 Landingfield Dr, St Marys TON No Bid

Ritchie Unknown APD Pennsboro 41 Ritchie Industrial Park Rd, Pennsboro TON No Bid

Ritchie Unknown Ellenboro 731 Ellenboro Rd, Harrisville TON No Bid

Ritchie Unknown Corridor D @ Nutter Farm-171 Slocum Ln, Petroleum TON No Bid

Ritchie Unknown Smithville-18 Main St, Smithville TON No Bid

Roane Unknown Lefthand-9734 Clay Rd, Left Hand TON No Bid

Roane Unknown Ambler Hill-8818 Charelston Rd, Walton TON No Bid

Roane Unknown Spencer-269 Charleston Rd, Spencer TON No Bid

Wirt Unknown Elizabeth-56 Schoolview St, Elizabeth TON No Bid

Wood Unknown Parkersburg-905 Lubeck Ave, Parkersburg TON No Bid

Wood Unknown Corridor D-253 River Hill Rd, Washington TON No Bid

Wood Unknown I-77-1758 Mill Run Rd, Parkersburg TON No Bid

County Cold Mix per Location Including Delivery
Unit of 

Measure
Unit CostEst. Quant.

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall complete the Pricing Page (ATT A) by providing a bid price for each Contract Item listed.  Vendor shall factor into their bid prices all 

equipment, materials, delivery, and labor required.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract. Qualified responsible 

vendors shall be awarded a contract for the item bid meeting the required specifications with the lowest bid price per unit of measure, per delivery/storage location.  
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Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture

(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT FOUR

Doddridge 10 West Union-1993 Smithton Rd, West Union TON No Bid

Harrison 50 Gore-119 Rail Cross Rd, Clarksburg TON No Bid

Harrison 10 I-79 @ Lost Creek-851 N. Streetcar Way, Lost Creek TON No Bid

Harrison 10 APD 50 @ Tunnel Hill-281 Tunnel Hill Rd, Salem TON No Bid

Marion 25 Fairmont-916 Country Club Rd, Fairmont TON No Bid

Marion 25 Mannington-1396 E Main St, Mannington TON No Bid

Monongalia 10 I-79 @ Goshen Road-95 Goshen Rd, Morgantown TON No Bid

Monongalia 100 Ridgedale 1510-Grafton Rd, Morgantown TON No Bid

Monongalia 15 Pentress-5861 Mason Dixon Hwy, Bruceton Mills TON No Bid

Preston 50 Albright-216 St. Joe Rd, Albright TON No Bid

Preston 15 Bruceton-14115 N Preston Hwy, Bruceton Mills TON No Bid

Preston 10 Terra Alta-32353 Veterans Memorial Hwy, Terra Alta TON No Bid

Preston 10 Fellowsville-5213 George Washington Hwy, Tunnelton TON No Bid

Preston 25 Aurora-23236 George Washington Hwy, Aurora TON No Bid

Preston 10 I-68 @ Copper's Rock-360 Rt. 73/73, Bruceton Mills TON No Bid

Taylor 100 Fetterman/Prunytown-1340 Trap Spring Rd, Grafton TON No Bid

County Cold Mix per Location Including Delivery
Unit of 

Measure
Unit CostEst. Quant.

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall complete the Pricing Page (ATT A) by providing a bid price for each Contract Item listed.  Vendor shall factor into their bid prices all 

equipment, materials, delivery, and labor required.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract. Qualified responsible 

vendors shall be awarded a contract for the item bid meeting the required specifications with the lowest bid price per unit of measure, per delivery/storage location.  
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Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture

(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT FIVE

Berkeley Unknown I-81 @ Martinsburg-1867 Rock Cliff Dr, Martinsburg TON No Bid

Berkeley Unknown I-81 @ Exit 8 Exit 8 off of I-81 TON No Bid

Grant Unknown Petersburg-930 Lunice Creek Highway, Petersburg TON No Bid

Grant Unknown Mt. Storm-8551 Union Hwy, Mt. Store TON No Bid

Grant Unknown Corridor H @ Knobley Rd. TON No Bid

Hampshire Unknown Romney 56-DOH Dr, Romney TON No Bid

Hampshire Unknown Capon Bridge-34 State Hill, Capon Bridge TON No Bid

Hampshire Unknown Slanesville-8051 Bloomery Pike, Slanesville TON No Bid

Hardy Unknown Moorefield-2104 SR55, Moorefield TON No Bid

Hardy Unknown Baker-386 Sperrys Run Rd, Baker TON No Bid

Jefferson Unknown Charles Town-1301 Old Leetown Pike, Kearneysville TON No Bid

Mineral Unknown New Creek-10800 Northwestern Turnpike, New Creek TON No Bid

Mineral Unknown Sky Line-4947 Elk Garden Hwy, Elk Garden TON No Bid

Mineral Unknown Short Gap-6385 Frantfort Hwy, Ridgeley TON No Bid

Mineral Unknown District Headquarters-2120 Northwestern Turnpike, Burlington TON No Bid

Morgan Unknown Berkeley Springs 166 DOH Ln, Berkeley Springs TON No Bid

Morgan Unknown Largent-16964 Cacapon Rd, Great Cacapon TON No Bid

County Cold Mix per Location Including Delivery
Unit of 

Measure
Est. Quant. Unit Cost

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall complete the Pricing Page (ATT A) by providing a bid price for each Contract Item listed.  Vendor shall factor into their bid prices all 

equipment, materials, delivery, and labor required.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract. Qualified responsible vendors 

shall be awarded a contract for the item bid meeting the required specifications with the lowest bid price per unit of measure, per delivery/storage location.  
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Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture

(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT SIX

Brooke 100 Wellsburg-615 Commerce St, Wellsburg TON $148.00

Brooke 0 Weirton-1225 Rice Rd, Weirton TON $148.00

Hancock 200 New Manchester-1936 Veterans Blvd, New Cumberland TON $148.00

Marshall 0 Glen Dale-100 Wheeling Ave, Glen Dale TON $158.00

Marshall 0 Cameron-33 Courtright Ln, Cameron TON $181.00

Ohio 100 Triadelphia-3870 National Rd, Triadelphia TON $165.00

Ohio 25 I-70 @ Triadelphia-566 Woodland Acres Rd, Wheeling TON $165.00

Tyler 0 Centerville-9919 Middle Island Rd, Centerville TON $184.00

Tyler 100 Sistersville-2566 Tyler Hwy, Sistersville TON $186.00

Tyler 0 Sistersville Old Headquarters TON $186.00

Wetzel 0 Hundred-2622 Hornet Hwy, Hundred TON $194.00

Wetzel 100 New Martinsville-45 Paducah Dr, New Martinsville TON $184.00

Wetzel 0 Pine Grove-12566 Shortline Hwy, Pine Grove TON $186.00

County
Cold Mix per Location Including Delivery

Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall complete the Pricing Page (ATT A) by providing a bid price for each Contract Item listed.  Vendor shall factor into their bid 

prices all equipment, materials, delivery, and labor required.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract. Qualified 

responsible vendors shall be awarded a contract for the item bid meeting the required specifications with the lowest bid price per unit of measure, per 

delivery/storage location.  

Est. Quant.
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Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture

(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT EIGHT

Pendleton 0 Franklin 251-Maple Ave, Franklin TON No Bid

Pocahontas 0 Marlinton-25 Brush Country Rd, Marlinton TON No Bid

Randolph 0 Corridor H-Elkins 489 Leading Creek Rd, Montrose TON No Bid

Randolph 25 Elkins-76 Country Club Rd, Elkins TON No Bid

Tucker 0 Corridor H-Thomas 15933 Appalachian Hwy, Thomas TON No Bid

Tucker 0 Parsons-9209 Seneca Trail, Parsons TON No Bid

County Cold Mix per Location Including Delivery
Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall complete the Pricing Page (ATT A) by providing a bid price for each Contract Item listed.  Vendor shall factor into their bid prices 

all equipment, materials, delivery, and labor required.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract. Qualified responsible 

vendors shall be awarded a contract for the item bid meeting the required specifications with the lowest bid price per unit of measure, per delivery/storage location.  

Est. Quant.
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Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture

(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT NINE

Fayette 150 Oak Hill 3121-East Main St, Oak Hill TON No Bid

Fayette 50 Corridor L @ Oak Hill TON No Bid

Fayette 100 Lookout-4064 Clifftop Rd, Lookout TON No Bid

Fayette 25 Glen Ferris-5727 Midland Trail, Charlton Heights TON No Bid

Greenbrier 100 Lewisburg-2820 N. Jefferson St, Lewisburg TON No Bid

Greenbrier 100 Crawley-157 Midland Trail, Crawley TON No Bid

Greenbrier 25 I-64 @ Hart's Run TON No Bid

Monroe 100 Union-875 Sweet Springs Valley Rd, Union TON No Bid

Monroe 50 Peterstown-511 Ballard-Red Sulphur Pkwy, Peterstown TON No Bid

Nicholas 50 Summersville-777 Turnpike Rd, Summersville TON No Bid

Nicholas 50 Curtin-5498 Richwood Rd, Richwood TON No Bid

Nicholas 25 Corridor L @ Muddlety-50 State Garage Rd, Summersville TON No Bid

Summers 50 Summers County Headquarters-20414 State Route 12, Hinton TON No Bid

County Cold Mix per Location Including Delivery
Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall complete the Pricing Page (ATT A) by providing a bid price for each Contract Item listed.  Vendor shall factor into their bid prices all 

equipment, materials, delivery, and labor required.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract. Qualified responsible 

vendors shall be awarded a contract for the item bid meeting the required specifications with the lowest bid price per unit of measure, per delivery/storage location.  

Est. Quant.
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Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture

(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT TEN

McDowell 25 County Headquarters-100 Headquarters Ln, Havaco TON No Bid

Mercer 0 County Headquarters-82 New Hope Rd, Princeton TON No Bid

Raleigh 25 County Headquarters-379 Market Rd, Beckley TON No Bid

Wyoming 0 County Headquarters-1409 Bearhold Rd, Pineville TON No Bid

County Cold Mix per Location Including Delivery
Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost 

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall complete the Pricing Page (ATT A) by providing a bid price for each Contract Item listed.  Vendor shall factor into their bid 

prices all equipment, materials, delivery, and labor required.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract. Qualified 

responsible vendors shall be awarded a contract for the item bid meeting the required specifications with the lowest bid price per unit of measure, per 

delivery/storage location.  

Est. Quant.
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Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture

(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A-PRICING PAGE

Vendor Name :

No Bid

Pre-Packaged Winter Grade Asphalt Patching Mixture (Cold Mix)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

pounds per pail No Bid

pounds per pail

pounds per pallet

High Performance Cold Mix-UPM Cold Mix or 

Equal

pounds per bag

pounds per pallet

Kelly Paving, Inc.

Vendor Instructions: Please provide a bid price, including delivery, of Pre-Packaged Winter Grade Asphalt 

Patching Mixture (Cold Mix) Material per pound for various WVDOH storage sites statewide.  Separate delivery 

charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract.  Qualified responsible vendors shall be 

awarded a contract that provides the Contract Items meeting the required specifications and the lowest bid price 

per distribution size for pre-packaged Cold Mix.

Cost per 

Pound

No Bid

Package Sizes/Quantities
Enter amounts per Unit of Measure 

(unless already noted) for item bid. 

Contract Item

pounds per bag
Pre-Packaged for Short-Term Single Season 

Use
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