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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1274273

Solicitation Description: ADDENDUM NO.1   Repair Products for Roads and Bridges

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2023-09-07 13:30 SR 0803 ESR09072300000001254 1

VENDOR

000000159743
TOM BROWN INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2400000014

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2023-09-07 Response Time: 11:46:05

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep
304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 CRAFCO Patcher I, Patcher II, or Equal 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101600    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
CRAFCO Patcher I or Patcher II or Equal.  Bid per daily, weekly, and monthly rental periods.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 CRAFCO Super Shot 125 Gal. Dbl. Drum 

Diesel Melter or Equal
0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101600    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
CRAFCO Super Shot 125 Gal. Double Drum Diesel Melter or Equal.  Bid per daily, weekly, and monthly rental periods.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 AQUAFIN-IC ADMIX or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 145.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
AQUAFIN-IC ADMIX or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 AQUAFIN Pavemend DOTline Rapid Repair 

Concrete or Equal
0.00000 UNIT 48.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
AQUAFIN Pavemend DOTline Rapid Repair Concrete or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 AQUAFIN PAVEMEND SL or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 54.600000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
AQUAFIN PAVEMEND SL or Equal, per contract specifications.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 AQUAFIN PAVEMEND SLQ or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 90.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
AQUAFIN PAVEMEND SLQ or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 AQUAFIN PAVEMEND VR or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 55.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
AQUAFIN PAVEMEND VR or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 CHEM-CRETE PAVIX  CCC100 or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 389.400000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
CHEM-CRETE PAVIX  CCC100 or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 CHEM-CRETE SOFIX CCC100 or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 348.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
CHEM-CRETE SOFIX CCC100 or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 CHEM-CRETE YUFIX CCC 1000 or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 340.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
CHEM-CRETE YUFIX CCC 1000 or Equal, per contract specifications.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 CHLOR*RID or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 372.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
CHLOR*RID or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 CRAFCO HP Asphalt Cold Patch  - Grade L 

or Equal
0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
CRAFCO HP Asphalt Cold Patch  - Grade L or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 CRAFCO HP Asphalt Cold Patch  - Grade M 

or Equal
0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
CRAFCO HP Asphalt Cold Patch  - Grade M or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 CRAFCO HP Concrete Cold Patch or Equal 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
CRAFCO HP Concrete Cold Patch or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 CRAFCO Mastic One or Equal 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
CRAFCO Mastic One or Equal, per contract specifications.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 CRAFCO Matrix 501 Asphaltic Plug Bridge 

Joint Syst. or Equal
0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
CRAFCO Matrix 501 Asphaltic Plug Bridge Joint System or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 CRAFCO Matrix 501 Mastic or Equal 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
CRAFCO Matrix 501 Mastic or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 CRAFCO Matrix 501 Adhesive  or Equal 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
CRAFCO Matrix 501 Adhesive or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 CRAFCO Matrix 501 Adhesive  or Equal 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
CRAFCO Matrix 501 Adhesive or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 CRAFCO TechCrete-R ("TC-R") or Equal 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
CRAFCO TechCrete-R ("TC-R") or Equal, per contract specifications.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 CRAFCO TechCrete-TBR or Equal 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
CRAFCO TechCrete-TBR or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 DOWSIL 888 Silicone Joint Sealant or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 336.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
DOWSIL 888 Silicone Joint Sealant or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 DOWSIL 890-SL Silicone Joint Sealant or 

Equal
0.00000 UNIT 336.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
DOWSIL 890-SL Silicone Joint Sealant or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 IMCO D-TECK 470 Sealer or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 129.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
IMCO D-TECK 470 Sealer or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 IMCO MG-KRETE FLEX Regular or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 89.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
IMCO MG-KRETE FLEX Regular or Equal, per contract specifications.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 IMCO High Temperature Retarder or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 154.080000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
IMCO High Temperature Retarder or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 IMCO Low Temperature Accelerator or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 154.080000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
IMCO Low Temperature Accelerator or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 IMCO MG-KRETE NO ODOR Regular or 

Equal
0.00000 UNIT 93.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
IMCO MG-KRETE NO ODOR Regular or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 IMCO MG-KRETE NO ODOR Fine or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 93.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
IMCO MG-KRETE NO ODOR Fine or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 IMCO MG-KRETE Regular Equal 0.00000 UNIT 83.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
IMCO MG-KRETE Regular Equal, per contract specifications.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 IMCO MG-KRETE Regular or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 83.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
IMCO MG-KRETE Regular or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 MASTER BUILDERS MasterEmaco T 1060 

Rapid Mortar or Equal
0.00000 UNIT 28.500000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
MASTER BUILDERS MasterEmaco T 1060 Rapid Mortar (formerly 10-60 Rapid Mortar) or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 MASTER BUILDERS MasterFlow 100 or 

Equal
0.00000 UNIT 15.600000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
MASTER BUILDERS MasterFlow 100 (formerly Construction Grout) or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 Perma-Patch or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 22.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
Perma-Patch or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
35 PHOSCRETE Fast-Set Admix or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 95.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
PHOSCRETE Fast-Set Admix or Equal, per contract specifications.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 PHOSCRETE HC or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 65.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
PHOSCRETE HC or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 PHOSCRETE SG (Dry-Mix Shotcrete/Gunite) 

or Equal
0.00000 UNIT 4450.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
PHOSCRETE SG (Dry-Mix Shotcrete/Gunite) or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 PHOSCRETE VO (Vertical/Overhead) or 

Equal
0.00000 UNIT 52.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
PHOSCRETE VO (Vertical/Overhead) or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 SKUNK RUST SR-17 or Equal 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
SKUNK RUST SR-17 or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
40 SOPREMA ALSAN Flashing or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 157.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
SOPREMA ALSAN Flashing or Equal, per contract specifications.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
41 SOPREMA ALSAN PolyFleece or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 24.500000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
SOPREMA ALSAN PolyFleece or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
42 SOPREMA Elastocol 500 Primer or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 261.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
SOPREMA Elastocol 500 Primer or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
43 SOPREMA Sopralene Flam 180 or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 181.800000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
SOPREMA Sopralene Flam 180 or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
44 SOPREMA Sopralene Flam Antirock or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 260.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
SOPREMA Sopralene Flam Antirock or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
45 SSI DECK SEAL Polymer Deck Sealant or 

Equal
0.00000 UNIT 284.200000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
SSI DECK SEAL Polymer Deck Sealant or Equal, per contract specifications.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
46 SSI RE-DECK Skid-Resistant Overlay or 

Equal
0.00000 UNIT 184.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
SSI RE-DECK Skid-Resistant Overlay or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
47 SSI SILSPEC Flexpatch Polymer Patching 

Mortar or Equal
0.00000 UNIT 261.610000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
SSI SILSPEC Flexpatch Polymer Patching Mortar or Equal, per contract specifications.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
48 CSL Si-COAT 529AG Sil. Paint Anti-Corros./

Graffiti or Equal
0.00000 UNIT 189.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
CSL Si-COAT 529AG Silicone Paint Anti-Corrosive/Graffiti or Equal.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
49 SEALTIGHT 3405 Hot Applied Polymeric 

Joint Sealant or Equal
0.00000 UNIT 62.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
SEALTIGHT 3405 Hot Applied Polymeric Joint Sealant or Equal.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
50 Sikdaur - 31 Hi-Mod Gel or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 182.500000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
Sikdaur - 31 Hi-Mod Gel or Equal.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
51 SIKADUR Crack Repair Kit or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 254.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
SIKADUR Crack Repair Kit or Equal

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
52 SIKADUR Crack Fix or Equal 0.00000 UNIT 356.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
SIKADUR Crack Fix or Equal

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
53 SSI 900 PNS Nosing Expansion Opening 

Repair Mater. or Equal
0.00000 UNIT 296.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30000000    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE "EXHIBIT A"

Extended Description:
SSI 900 PNS Nosing Expansion Opening Repair Material or Equal







x x

x x

x x

x x

x x

VENDOR NAME: Tom Brown Inc.

Contract 

Item 

No.

Contract Item UOM 
Cost per 

UOM

Proposed Equivalent

Suggested Use / Application Method

(per Manufacturer Recommendation)

Daily Rate

Weekly Rate

Monthly Rate

Daily Rate

Weekly Rate

Monthly Rate

Pail 5 gals. per pail $145.00

Pallet 36 pails per pallet $4,586.40

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $72,576.00

Bag 53.5 lbs per bag $48.00

Pallet 42 pails per pallet $1,764.00

Truckload 18 pallets per truckload $28,728.00

Pail 51.8 lbs per pail $54.60

Pallet 36 pails per pallet $1,620.00

Truckload 18 pallets per truckload $27,216.00

Pail 46 lbs per pail $90.00

Pallet 36 bags per pallet $2,844.00

Truckload 18 pallets per truckload $49,248.00

Pail 17 lbs per pail $55.00

Pallet 80 pails per pallet $3,276.00

Truckload 20 pallets per truckload $60,800.00

Additional Bulk/Tier 

 Pricing Options

`

INSTRUCTIONS TO VENDORS:   Vendor shall complete ATT A providing its name, service 

area selection, and Contract Item information below. Vendor shall select the District(s) it will 

provide Contract Items bid for the selected service areas.  If pricing will differ among Districts, 

Vendor shall complete a separate ATT A for each service area selection(s) and its 

corresponding pricing.  If additional space is needed, provide a separate document and 

reference the corresponding Contract Item with your information. No future use of the Contract 

or any individual item is guaranteed throughout the life of this contract. 

REPAIR PRODUCTS FOR ROADS AND BRIDGES

ATTACHMENT A (ATT A) PRICING PAGES

For Proposed Equivalent Equipment: Provide manufacturer, make, and model information.  Must also provide equipment specifications/information with bid.

For Proposed Equivalent Material: Enter brand/product name, part no., APL, or material certification information & provide technical data sheet w/bid.

District 1: Boone, Clay, Kanawha, Mason & Putnam cos.

District 2: Cabell, Lincoln, Logan, Mingo & Wayne cos.

District 5: Berkeley, Grant, Hampshire, Hardy, Jefferson, Mineral & Morgan cos.

District 4: Doddridge, Harrison, Marion, Monongalia, Preston & Taylor cos.

District 3: Calhoun, Jackson, Pleasants, Ritchie, Roane, Wirt & Wood cos.

District 10:  McDowell, Mercer, Raleigh and Wyoming cos.

District 9:  Fayette, Greenbrier, Monroe, Nicholas & Summers cos.

District 8:  Pendleton, Pocahontas, Randolph & Tucker cos.

District 7:  Barbour, Braxton, Gilmer, Lewis, Upshur & Webster cos.

District 6:  Brooke, Hancock, Marshall, Ohio, Tyler & Wetzel cos.

Quantity per UOM Price

Enter amounts per UOM (unless 

already noted) for item pricing. 

Proposed Equivalent

Equipment / Material

Service Area Selection

1
CRAFCO Patcher I or Patcher II 

or Equal

5
AQUAFIN PAVEMEND SL or 

Equal

AQUAFIN-IC 

ADMIX or Equal 
3

7
AQUAFIN PAVEMEND VR or 

Equal

2

CRAFCO Super Shot 125 Gal. 

Double Drum Diesel Melter or 

Equal

4
AQUAFIN Pavemend DOTline 

Rapid Repair Concrete or Equal 

AQUAFIN PAVEMEND SLQ or 

Equal 
6

Repair Products for Roads and Bridges Page 1 of 7

6624C006

ATT A Pricing Pages



Contract 

Item 

No.

Contract Item UOM 
Cost per 

UOM

Proposed Equivalent

Suggested Use / Application Method

(per Manufacturer Recommendation)

Additional Bulk/Tier 

 Pricing Options

Quantity per UOM Price

Enter amounts per UOM (unless 

already noted) for item pricing. 

Proposed Equivalent

Equipment / Material

Pail 5 gals. per pail $389.40

Pallet 36 pails per pallet $13,140.00

Truckload 22 pallets per truckload $278,784.00

Drum 55 gals. per drum $3,900.00

Pallet 4 drums per pallet $15,364.00

Truckload 22 pallets per truckload $327,800.00

Pail 5 gals. per pail $348.00

Pallet 36 pails per pallet $12,312.00

Truckload 22 pallets per truckload $265,320.00

Drum 55 gals. per drum $3,560.00

Pallet 4 drums per pallet $14,200.00

Truckload 22 pallets per truckload $295,680.00

Pail 5 gals. per pail $340.00

Pallett 36 pails per pallet $11,592.00

Truckload 22 pallets per truckload $248,688.00

Drum 55 gals. per drum $3,236.00

Pallet 4 drums per pallet $12,680.00

Truckload 22 pallets per truckload $271,832.00

Gallon 1 gallon $96.00

Pallet 80 gals. per pallet $7,200.00

Pail 5 gals. per pail $372.00

Pallet 32 pails per pallet $10,944.00

Truckload 22 pallets per truckload $236,544.00

Drum 55 gals. per drum $4,092.00

Pallet 4 drums per pallet $16,208.00

Truckload 22 pallets per truckload $353,936.00

Bag lbs per bag

Pallet pails per pallet

Truckload palletspertruckload

Bag lbs per bag

Pallet pails per pallet

Truckload pallets per truckload

Bag lbs per bag

Pallet pails per pallet

Truckload pallets per truckload

Box lbs per box

CHEM-CRETE SOFIX CCC100 

or Equal
9

13
CRAFCO HP Asphalt Cold Patch  

- Grade M or Equal 

11 CHLOR*RID or Equal 

8
CHEM-CRETE PAVIX  CCC100 

or Equal 

CHEM-CRETE YUFIX CCC 

1000 or Equal
10

14
CRAFCO HP Concrete Cold 

Patch or Equal

12
CRAFCO HP Asphalt Cold Patch  

- Grade L or Equal 

Repair Products for Roads and Bridges Page 2 of 7

6624C006

ATT A Pricing Pages



Contract 

Item 

No.

Contract Item UOM 
Cost per 

UOM

Proposed Equivalent

Suggested Use / Application Method

(per Manufacturer Recommendation)

Additional Bulk/Tier 

 Pricing Options

Quantity per UOM Price

Enter amounts per UOM (unless 

already noted) for item pricing. 

Proposed Equivalent

Equipment / Material

Pallet boxes per pallet

Truckload pallets per truckload

Plexi-Melt block lbs per block

Pallet blocks per pallet

Truckload pallet per truckload

Box lbs per box

Pallet boxes per pallet

Truckload pallets per truckload

Box lbs per box

Pallet boxes per pallet

Truckload pallets per truckload

Box lbs per box

Pallet boxes per pallet

Truckload pallets per truckload

Bag lbs per bag

Pallet boxes per pallet

Truckload pallets per truckload

Bag lbs per bag

Pallet boxes per pallet

Truckload pallets per truckload

Bag lbs per bag

Pallet boxes per pallet

Truckload pallets per truckload

21

CRAFCO TechCrete-TBR or 

Equal
(Requires heating equipment)

16

CRAFCO Matrix 501 Asphaltic 

Plug Bridge Joint System or Equal
(Requires heating equipment)

17
CRAFCO Matrix 501 Mastic or 

Equal 

18

20

CRAFCO TechCrete-R 

(“TC-R”) or Equal
(Requires heating equipment)

19

CRAFCO TechCrete Fibre Mastic 

or Equal 
(Requires heating equipment)

CRAFCO Matrix 501 Adhesive  

or Equal 

15
CRAFCO Mastic One or Equal
(Requires heating equipment)
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Contract 

Item 

No.

Contract Item UOM 
Cost per 

UOM

Proposed Equivalent

Suggested Use / Application Method

(per Manufacturer Recommendation)

Additional Bulk/Tier 

 Pricing Options

Quantity per UOM Price

Enter amounts per UOM (unless 

already noted) for item pricing. 

Proposed Equivalent

Equipment / Material

Unit (sausages) 16 sausages per unit $336.00

Pail 4.5 gals. per pail $420.00

Pallet 36 pails per pallet $12,960.00

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $203,904.00

Drum 618 lbs per drum $2,478.00

Pallet 4 drums per pallet $8,957.00

Truckload 16 pallet per truckload $141,376.00

Unit (sausages) 16 sausages per unit $336.00

Pail 4.5 lbs per pail $420.00

Pallet 36 pails per pallet $12,960.00

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $203,904.00

Drum 543 lbs per drum $2,478.00

Pallet 4 drums per pallet $8,957.00

Truckload 16 pallet per truckload $141,376.00

Pail 5 gals. per pail $129.00

Pallet 36 pails per pallet $3,522.96

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $43,891.20

Drum 54 gals. per drum $815.00

Pallet 4 drums per pallet $2,660.00

Truckload 16 pallet per truckload $41,088.00

Unit 1 Part A & B $89.00

Pallet 36 units per pallet $2,448.00

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $37,370.88

Bag 5 gals. per pail $154.08

Pallet 36 pails per pallet $5,546.88

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $88,750.08

Bag 5 gals. per pail $154.08

Pallet 36 pails per pallet $5,546.88

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $88,750.08

Unit 1 Part A & B $93.00

Pallet 36 units per pallet $2,574.00

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $38,592.00

28
IMCO MG-KRETE NO ODOR 

Regular or Equal 

26
IMCO High Temperature Retarder 

or Equal 

27
IMCO Low Temperature 

Accelerator or Equal

22
DOWSIL 888 Silicone Joint 

Sealant or Equal 

DOWSIL 890-SL Silicone Joint 

Sealant or Equal
23

IMCO D-TECK 470 Sealer or 

Equal 
24

25
IMCO MG-KRETE FLEX 

Regular or Equal 
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Contract 

Item 

No.

Contract Item UOM 
Cost per 

UOM

Proposed Equivalent

Suggested Use / Application Method

(per Manufacturer Recommendation)

Additional Bulk/Tier 

 Pricing Options

Quantity per UOM Price

Enter amounts per UOM (unless 

already noted) for item pricing. 

Proposed Equivalent

Equipment / Material

Unit 1 Part A & B $93.00

Pallet 36 units per pallet $2,574.00

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $38,592.00

Unit 1 Part A & B $83.00

Pallet 36 units per pallet $2,361.60

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $35,712.00

Unit 1 Part A & B $83.00

Pallet 36 units per pallet $2,361.60

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $35,712.00

Bag 50 lbs per bag $28.50

Pallet 60 bags per pallet $1,410.00

Truckload 8 pallets per truckload $10,340.00

Bag 50 lbs per bag $15.60

Pallet 60 bags per pallet $750.00

Truckload 8 pallets per truckload $5,040.00

Bag 60 lbs per bag $22.00

Pallet 50 pails per pallet $830.00

Truckload 15 palletspertruckload $10,200.00

Pail 50 lbs per pail $35.00

Pallet 36 pails per pallet $1,162.80

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $17,856.00

Bulk Bag 2000 lbs per bulk bag $467.00

Pallet 1 bulk bags per pallet $467.00

Truckload 20 pallet per truckload $8,740.00

Pail - Small 8 lbs per pail $95.00

Pallet 80 pails per pallet $7,600.00

Truckload 12 pallet per truckload $91,200.00

Pail - Large 24 lbs per pail $265.00

Pallet 36 pails per pallet $9,540.00

Truckload 12 pallets per truckload $114,480.00

Pail (sm. bag + jar) 13.4 lbs per bag $65.00

Pallet 64 pails per pallet $4,160.00

Truckload 12 pallets per truckload $49,920.00

Full Kit (lg. bag + jug) 65.5 lbs per bag $110.00

Pallet 48 kits per pallet $5,280.00

Truckload 12 pallets per truckload $63,360.00

Perma-Patch or Equal34

PHOSCRETE Fast-Set Admix or 

Equal 
35

PHOSCRETE HC or Equal 36

29
IMCO MG-KRETE NO ODOR 

Fine or Equal 

33

MASTER BUILDERS 

MasterFlow 100 (formerly 

Construction Grout) or Equal

31
IMCO MG-KRETE Regular or 

Equal

32

MASTER BUILDERS 

MasterEmaco T 1060 Rapid 

Mortar (formerly 10-60 Rapid 

Mortar) or Equal

30
IMCO MG-KRETE Regular  

Equal
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Contract 

Item 

No.

Contract Item UOM 
Cost per 

UOM

Proposed Equivalent

Suggested Use / Application Method

(per Manufacturer Recommendation)

Additional Bulk/Tier 

 Pricing Options

Quantity per UOM Price

Enter amounts per UOM (unless 

already noted) for item pricing. 

Proposed Equivalent

Equipment / Material

2568 lbs per bag

560 lbs per drum

Truckload 12 kits per pallet $53,400.00

Tub (sm bag + jar) 8 lbs per bag $52.00

Pallet 108 tubs per pallet $5,616.00

Pail (sm. bag + jar) 13.4 lbs per bag $70.50

Pallet 64 pails per pallet $4,512.00

Truckload 12 pallets per truckload $54,166.00

Full Kit (bags + jug) 72.4 lbs per bag $128.00

Pallet 36 bags per pallet $4,608.00

Truckload 12 pallets per truckload $55,296.00

Case 1 12 - 32ou bottles

Pallet cases per pallet

Gallon 1 gallon

Pallet gals. per pallet

Pail gals. per pail

Pallet pails per pallet

Truckload pallets per truckload

Gallon 1 gallon $157.00

Pallet 64 gal per pallet $7,040.00

Pail 5 gals. per pail $485.00

Pallet 36 pails per pallet $15,912.00

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $251,136.00

Roll 1 4 in. wide roll $24.50

Pallet 256 rolls per pallet $5,248.00

Roll 1 6 in. wide roll $38.50

Pallet 256 rolls per pallet $8,320.00

Roll 1 8 in. wide roll $48.00

Pallet 128 rolls per pallet $5,312.00

Roll 1 39 in. wide roll $187.00

Pallet 100 rolls per pallet $16,000.00

Pail 5 gals. per pail $261.00

Pallet 36 pails per pallet $8,316.00

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $129,600.00

Roll  1 33 ft x 39 in roll $181.80
Pallet 30 rolls per pallet $4,254.00

Roll 1 33 ft x 39 in roll $260.00
Pallet 20 rolls per pallet $4,400.00

SOPREMA ALSAN PolyFleece 

or Equal 
41

44
SOPREMA Sopralene Flam 

Antirock or Equal 

42
SOPREMA Elastocol 500 Primer 

or Equal

43
SOPREMA Sopralene Flam 180 

or Equal 

SOPREMA ALSAN Flashing or 

Equal 
40

SKUNK RUST SR-17 or Equal39

$4,450.00

Full Kit Pallet

(bags + drum)

PHOSCRETE VO 

(VerticalperOverhead) or Equal 
38

37
PHOSCRETE SG (Dry-Mix 

Shotcrete/Gunite) or Equal 
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Contract 

Item 

No.

Contract Item UOM 
Cost per 

UOM

Proposed Equivalent

Suggested Use / Application Method

(per Manufacturer Recommendation)

Additional Bulk/Tier 

 Pricing Options

Quantity per UOM Price

Enter amounts per UOM (unless 

already noted) for item pricing. 

Proposed Equivalent

Equipment / Material

Gallon 2 gallon $284.20

Pallet 30 gals. per pallet $7,620.00

Pail 10 gals. per pail $988.00

Pallet 18 pails per pallet $15,327.00

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $244,224.00

Drum 110 gals. per drum $5,545.00

Pallet 2 drums per pallet $10,890.00

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $171,920.00

Kit - Small 1 2- 1 gal pails (1 unit) $184.00

Pallet 30 kits per pallet $4,920.00

Pail Kit 1 2- 5 gal. pails (1 unit) $768.00

Pallet 18 pails per pallet $12,933.00

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $201,024.00

Drum Kit 1 2- 55 gal drums (1 unit) $5,980.00

Pallet 1 kits per pallet $5,980.00

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $95,680.00

Kit 1 1 bag + 1 gal (1 unit) $261.61

Pallet 28 kits per pallet $6,496.00

Truckload 12 pallets per truckload $75,600.00

Gallon 1 gallon $189.00

Pallet 48 gals. per pallet $8,736.00

Pail 5 gals. per pail $717.70

Pallet 36 pails per pallet $20,592.00

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $327,744.00

Carton 2 blocks per carton $62.00

Pallet 36 cartons per pallet $1,728.00

Truckload 16 pallets per truckload $25,344.00

Gallon 1 gallon $182.50

Pallet 90 gal per pallet $11,520.00

Kit 1 3 gallons (1 unit) $384.00

Pallet 50 kits per pallet $16,600.00

Truckload 14 pallets per truckload $230,300.00

Kit 1 multi-component (1 unit) $254.00

Pallet 80 kits per pallet $16,320.00

Carton 1 12 cartridges (1 unit) $356.00

Pallet 90 cartons per pallet $28,350.00

Kit 1 cf per kit $296.00

Pallet 28 kits per pallet $7,644.00

49
SEALTIGHT 3405 Hot Applied 

Polymeric Joint Sealant or Equal

53
SSI 900 PNS Nosing Expansion 

Opening Repair Material or Equal

48

CSL Si-COAT 529AG Silicone 

Paint Anti-Corrosive/Graffiti or 

Equal

52 SIKADUR Crack Fix or Equal

50 Sikdaur - 31 Hi-Mod Gel or Equal

51
SIKADUR Crack Repair Kit or 

Equal

SSI DECK SEAL Polymer Deck 

Sealant or Equal 
45

46
SSI RE-DECK Skid-Resistant 

Overlay or Equal

47
SSI SILSPEC Flexpatch Polymer 

Patching Mortar or Equal
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