
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
 





Date Printed: Jul 27, 2023 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1251511

Solicitation Description: ADDENDUM NO_1 Stone & Agg. Materials & Delivery to Est. Loc.

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2023-07-27 13:30 SR 0803 ESR07272300000000331 1

VENDOR

000000201143
RBS INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2400000003

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2023-07-27 Response Time: 10:33:26

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep
304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Stone and Agg. Materials & Delivery to 

Establish Locations
0.00000 TON   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
PLEASE COMPLETE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A & B













Stone Aggregate, Delivery to Established Locations 6624C002
Pricing Page, ATT A, District 8

ATT A, District 8 Page 1 of 8 6624C002 Revised

VENDOR NAME:

County and Delivery Locations Bid
Pendleton Pendleton Pendleton Pendleton Pendleton Pocahontas Pocahontas Pocahontas Pocahontas Pocahontas Pocahontas Randolph Randolph Randolph Randolph Randolph

Brandy-
wine

Franklin 
US-220 N

Franklin 
US-220 S Judy Gap Onego Green Bank Hillsboro Marlinton Seebert Slatyfork Thornwood Coalton Elkins Harman Mill Creek Pickens

Contract 
Item Description Composition*

Unit of 
Measure

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 28.00$       14.45$       16.95$       15.50$       23.45$       
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons 28.00$       14.45$       16.95$       15.50$       23.45$       
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 28.00$       14.45$       16.95$       15.50$       23.45$       
5 Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons 28.00$											 14.45$											 16.95$											 15.50$											 23.45$											
6 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons 28.00$       14.45$       16.95$       15.50$       23.45$       
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 31.00$       17.20$       19.67$       18.25$       26.15$       
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons 31.00$       17.70$       19.67$       18.25$       26.15$       

10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 31.00$       17.20$       19.67$       18.25$       26.15$       
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons 31.00$       17.20$       19.67$       18.25$       26.15$       
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons 31.00$       17.20$       19.67$       18.25$       26.15$       
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons 31.00$       17.20$       19.67$       18.25$       26.15$       
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 33.00$       18.50$       20.88$       19.75$       28.00$       
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons 33.00$       18.50$       20.88$       19.75$       28.00$       
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 33.00$       18.50$       20.88$       19.75$       28.00$       
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons 33.00$       18.50$       20.88$       19.75$       28.00$       
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 39.00$       21.00$       24.00$       22.10$       31.00$       
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons 39.00$       21.00$       24.00$       22.10$       31.00$       
20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 30.00$       17.25$       19.67$       18.30$       26.15$       
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons 30.00$       17.25$       19.67$       18.30$       26.15$       
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons 30.00$       17.25$       19.67$       18.30$       26.15$       
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons 30.00$       17.25$       19.67$       18.30$       26.15$       
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 32.00$       18.00$       21.44$       19.00$       26.90$       
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons 32.00$       18.00$       21.44$       19.00$       26.90$       
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons 32.00$       18.00$       21.44$       19.00$       26.90$       
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons 32.00$       18.00$       21.44$       19.00$       26.90$       
28 Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons 31.00$       16.88$       21.44$       17.90$       26.90$       
29 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons 31.00$       16.88$       20.88$       17.90$       26.90$       
30 Fine Aggregate LSGS Tons 28.00$       14.25$       16.45$       15.40$       21.99$       
31 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons 31.00$       17.25$       19.67$       18.30$       25.90$       
32 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons 31.00$       17.25$       19.67$       18.30$       25.90$       
33 Sandstone	Standard	Abrasives LSGS Tons 31.00$											 NO	BID NO	BID NO	BID NO	BID
34 Steel	Slag	for	SRIC	 Slag Tons
35 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons 31.00$       17.25$       19.77$       18.30$       25.90$       
36 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons 31.00$       17.25$       19.77$       18.30$       25.90$       
37 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
38 Cinders Cinders Tons  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
39 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
40 #11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons 31.00$       18.00$       20.10$       19.00$       26.00$       
41 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons 28.00$       14.25$       16.95$       15.30$       22.46$       
42 Rip Rap LSGS Tons 33.00$       20.25$       22.44$       22.00$       28.00$       
43 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons 33.00$       20.25$       22.44$       22.00$       28.00$       
44 Shot Rock LSGS Tons 33.00$       20.25$       22.44$       22.00$       28.00$       
45 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

R B S Inc., Greystone Quarry .

LSGS:  Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand

R B S Inc., Greystone Quarry



Stone Aggregate, Delivery to Established Locations 6624C002
Pricing Page, ATT A, District 9

ATT A, District 9 Page 3 of 8 6624C002  Revised

VENDOR NAME:

County and Delivery Locations Bid
Fayette Fayette Fayette Fayette Greenbrier Greenbrier Greenbrier Monroe Monroe Nicholas Nicholas Nicholas Summers

Oak Hill Falls 
View

Glen 
Ferris Lookout Crawley Hart's Run 

I64 Lewisburg Peters-
town Union Curtin Muddlety 

Lot

Summers-
ville WV 

RT-39
Hinton

Contract 
Item Description Composition*

Unit of 
Measure

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $18.90 $20.88 $20.28 $16.08 $12.68 $12.68 $12.25 $22.40 $15.43 $20.28 $20.28 $19.44 $15.10
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $18.90 $20.88 $20.28 $16.08 $12.68 $12.68 $12.25 $22.40 $15.43 $20.28 $20.28 $19.44 $15.10
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $18.90 $20.88 $20.28 $16.08 $12.68 $12.68 $12.25 $22.40 $15.43 $20.28 $20.28 $19.44 $15.10
5 Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons $18.90 $20.88 $20.28 $16.08 $12.68 $12.68 $12.25 $22.40 $15.43 $20.28 $20.28 $19.44 $15.10
6 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons $18.90 $20.88 $20.28 $16.08 $12.68 $12.68 $12.25 $22.40 $15.43 $20.28 $20.28 $19.44 $15.10
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $21.48 $24.09 $23.79 $20.38 $15.33 $15.33 $14.88 $24.10 $18.25 $23.79 $23.79 $21.50 $17.10
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $21.48 $24.09 $23.79 $20.38 $15.33 $15.33 $14.88 $24.10 $18.25 $23.79 $23.79 $21.50 $17.10

10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $21.48 $24.09 $23.79 $20.38 $15.33 $15.33 $14.88 $24.10 $18.25 $23.79 $23.79 $21.50 $17.10
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons $21.48 $24.09 $23.79 $20.38 $15.33 $15.33 $14.88 $24.10 $18.25 $23.79 $23.79 $21.50 $17.10
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons $21.48 $24.09 $23.79 $20.38 $15.33 $15.33 $14.88 $24.10 $18.25 $23.79 $23.79 $21.50 $17.10
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons $27.99 $30.09 $29.59 $25.59 $19.55 $19.55 $17.99 $26.89 $19.40 $29.59 $29.59 $22.40 $17.10
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $22.77 $25.15 $24.75 $22.55 $16.99 $16.99 $16.25 $26.55 $19.40 $24.75 $24.75 $23.92 $18.85
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons $22.77 $25.15 $24.75 $22.55 $16.99 $16.99 $16.25 $26.55 $19.40 $24.75 $24.75 $23.92 $18.85
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $23.78 $26.20 $25.90 $23.70 $16.99 $16.99 $16.25 $26.55 $19.40 $25.90 $25.90 $23.92 $18.85
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons $23.78 $26.20 $25.90 $23.70 $16.99 $16.99 $16.25 $26.55 $19.40 $25.90 $25.90 $23.92 $18.85
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $28.44 $30.99 $30.99 $28.99 $22.00 $22.00 $19.00 $28.80 $20.98 $30.99 $30.99 $26.25 $22.00
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons $28.44 $30.99 $30.99 $28.99 $22.00 $22.00 $19.00 $28.80 $20.98 $30.99 $30.99 $26.25 $22.00
20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $21.40 $24.97 $24.65 $19.44 $17.50 $17.50 $16.77 $22.40 $18.65 $24.65 $24.65 $20.70 $18.45
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons $21.40 $24.97 $24.65 $19.44 $17.50 $17.50 $16.77 $22.40 $18.65 $24.65 $24.65 $20.70 $18.45
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $21.40 $24.97 $24.65 $19.44 $17.50 $17.50 $16.77 $22.40 $18.65 $24.65 $24.65 $20.70 $18.45
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $21.40 $24.97 $24.65 $19.44 $17.50 $17.50 $16.77 $22.40 $18.65 $24.65 $24.65 $20.70 $18.45
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $22.50 $25.55 $25.25 $21.64 $18.50 $18.50 $17.59 $23.40 $19.33 $25.25 $25.25 $22.41 $18.83
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons $22.50 $25.55 $25.25 $21.64 $18.50 $18.50 $17.59 $23.40 $19.33 $25.25 $25.25 $22.41 $18.83
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $22.50 $25.55 $25.25 $21.64 $18.50 $18.50 $17.59 $23.40 $19.33 $25.25 $25.25 $22.41 $18.83
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $22.50 $25.55 $25.25 $21.64 $18.50 $18.50 $17.59 $23.40 $19.33 $25.25 $25.25 $22.41 $18.83
28 Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons $21.65 $24.15 $23.80 $21.80 $15.33 $15.33 $14.88 $28.00 $17.88 $23.80 $23.80 $21.50 $17.35
29 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons $21.65 $24.15 $23.80 $21.80 $15.33 $15.33 $14.88 $28.00 $17.88 $23.80 $23.80 $21.50 $17.35
30 Fine Aggregate LSGS Tons $18.90 $24.88 $24.65 $19.44 $15.33 $15.33 $14.88 $22.40 $15.65 $24.65 $24.65 $19.44 $15.10
31 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $21.40 $24.97 $24.65 $22.55 $17.50 $17.50 $16.77 $22.40 $18.65 $24.65 $24.65 $20.70 $18.45
32 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons $21.40 $24.97 $24.65 $22.55 $17.50 $17.50 $16.77 $22.40 $18.65 $24.65 $24.65 $20.70 $18.45
33 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
34 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
35 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $21.40 $24.65 $24.65 $22.55 $17.50 $17.50 $16.77 $22.55 $19.00 $24.65 $24.65 $20.88 $18.45
36 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons $21.40 $24.65 $24.65 $22.55 $17.50 $17.50 $16.77 $22.55 $19.00 $24.65 $24.65 $20.88 $18.45
37 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
38 Cinders Cinders Tons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
39 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
40 #11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons $21.40 $25.75 $25.55 $23.35 $18.50 $18.50 $17.89 $22.55 $19.00 $25.55 $25.55 $23.20 $18.83
41 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons $18.90 $21.65 $21.50 $19.44 $15.33 $15.33 $12.55 $22.40 $15.25 $21.50 $21.50 $19.44 $15.10
42 Rip Rap LSGS Tons $23.80 $27.55 $27.25 $26.99 $21.49 $21.49 $20.99 $28.00 $21.40 $27.25 $27.25 $24.00 $20.44
43 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons $23.80 $27.55 $27.25 $26.99 $21.49 $21.49 $20.99 $28.00 $21.40 $27.25 $27.25 $24.00 $20.44
44 Shot Rock LSGS Tons $23.80 $27.55 $27.25 $26.99 $21.49 $21.49 $20.99 $28.00 $21.40 $27.25 $27.25 $24.00 $20.44
45 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

LSGS:  Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand

R B S Inc., Greystone Quarry



Stone Aggregate, Delivery to Established Locations 6624C002
Pricing Page, ATT A, District 10

ATT A, District 10 Page 4 of 8 6624C002   Revised

VENDOR NAME:

County and Delivery Locations Bid
McDowell McDowell McDowell McDowell Mercer Mercer Mercer Raleigh Raleigh Raleigh Raleigh Wyoming Wyoming

Havaco Johnny-
cake Mtn. Raysal Yukon Flat Top Princeton I-

77
Princeton 
WV-20 Bolt Bragg 

I-64 Skelton Coalfields Hanover Still Run

Contract 
Item Description Composition*

Unit of 
Measure

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

Bid
Price

1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $22.50 $22.50 $17.74 $20.74
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $22.50 $22.50 $17.74 $20.74
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons $22.50 $22.50  NO BID $20.74
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $22.50 $22.50 17.74$     $20.74
5 Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons $22.50 $22.50 17.74$     $20.74
6 Class	2	Aggregate Slag Tons
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons $22.50 $22.50 $17.74 $20.74
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $25.10 $25.10 $20.58 $23.58
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $25.10 $25.10 $20.58 $23.58

10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $25.10 $25.10 $20.58 $23.58
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons $25.10 $25.10 $20.58 $23.58
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons $25.10 $25.10 $20.58 $23.58
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons $25.10 $25.10 $20.58 $23.58
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $25.10 $25.10 $22.00 $23.58
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons $26.70 $26.70 $22.00 $25.00
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $26.70 $26.70 $22.00 $25.00
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons $26.70 $26.70 $22.00 $25.00
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $31.00 $31.00 $27.00 $25.00
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons $31.00 $31.00 $27.00 $25.00
20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $25.10 $25.10 $20.49 $23.49
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons $25.10 $25.10 $20.49 $23.49
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $25.10 $25.10 $20.49 $23.49
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $25.10 $25.10 $20.49 $23.49
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $25.10 $25.10 $22.60 $25.60
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons $26.00 $26.00 $22.60 $25.60
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $26.00 $26.00 $22.60 $25.60
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $26.00 $26.00 $22.60 $25.60
28 Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons $26.22 $26.22 $21.09 $24.09
29 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons $26.22 $26.22 $21.09 $24.09
30 Fine Aggregate LSGS Tons $22.50 $22.50 $17.95 $20.95
31 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $25.10 $25.10 $20.49 $23.49
32 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons $25.10 $25.10 $20.49 $23.49
33 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons   NO BID    NO BID   NO BID $22.50
34 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons   NO BID    NO BID   NO BID $22.50
35 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $26.00 $26.00 $21.00 $24.00
36 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons $26.00 $26.00 $21.00 $24.00
37 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons   NO BID    NO BID   NO BID $22.50
38 Cinders Cinders Tons   NO BID    NO BID   NO BID $22.50
39 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons   NO BID    NO BID   NO BID $22.50
40 #11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons $26.00 $26.00 $21.00 $24.00
41 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons $22.50 $22.50 $17.75 $20.75
42 Rip Rap LSGS Tons $30.80 $30.80 $26.00 $29.00
43 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons $30.80 $30.80 $26.00 $29.00
44 Shot Rock LSGS Tons $30.80 $30.80 $26.00 $29.00
45 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons   NO BID    NO BID   NO BID $22.50

RBS Inc., Greystone Quarry

LSGS:  Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand

R B S Inc. Greystone Quarry



Stone Aggregate, Delivery to Established Locations 6624C002
Pricing Page, ATT A, WV Adjutant General’s Office/WV Army Reserve National Guard

Page 5 of 8

VENDOR 
NAME:

BERKELEY BERKELEY BOONE BRAXTON CABELL FAYETTE FAYETTE

Contract 
Item Description Composition*

Morgan Morgan NG Armory
2096 Kelly Island Road
Martinsburg, WV  25401

WV Air National Guard 
Base/Martinsburg
222 Sabre Jet Boulevard
Martinsburg, WV  25405

WVNG/Rock Creek
5394 Shaffer Road
Danville, WV  25033

Braxton County Armory
62 John O. Frame Drive
Gassaway, WV  26624

Huntington Barbour Armory
800 Virginia Avenue
Huntington, WV  25704

AFRC Glen Jean & FMS #3
409 Wood Mountain Road
Glen Jean, WV  25846

Summit Bechtel National Scout 
Reserve
2550 Jack Furst Drive
Glen Jean, WV  25846

2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS $28.00
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag $28.00
5 Class 2 Aggregate LSGS $28.00
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS $31.00
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS $31.00
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS $33.00
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS $28.00
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS $28.00
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS $33.00
29 Stone for Gabions LSGS $35.00
30 Fine Aggregate LSGS $28.00
32 Limestone Std Abr. LSGS $28.00
33 Sandstone Std Abr. LSGS NO BID
34 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag NO BID
36 Limestone Mod Abr. LSGS $28.00
37 Sandstone Mod Abr. LSGS NO BID
41 Quarry Waste LSGS $28.00
42 Rip Rap LSGS $33.00
43 Shot Rock LSGS $33.00

GREENBRIER HARDY HARRISON HARRISON HARRISON JACKSON KANAWHA

Contract 
Item Description Composition*

Lewisburg Readiness Center
635 Industrial Park Road
Maxwelton, WV  24957

Moorefield Readiness 
Center
157 Freedom Way
Moorefield, WV  26836

General Nathan J. Goff 
Armory
5 Armory Road
Clarksburg, WV  26301

Underwood Armory
2265 West Main Street
Salem, WV  26424

FWAATS
1000 Fixed Wing Drive
Bridgeport, WV  26330

Jackson County AFRC
8832 Pt. Pleasant Road
Millwood, WV  25262

Charleston Headquarters 
Building
1703 Coonskin Drive
Charleston, WV  25311

2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS $13.10
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag $13.10
5 Class 2 Aggregate LSGS $13.10
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS $14.88
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS $14.88
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS $16.20
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS $14.88
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS $14.88
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS $16.21
29 Stone for Gabions LSGS $16.20
30 Fine Aggregate LSGS $14.88
32 Limestone Std Abr. LSGS $14.88
33 Sandstone Std Abr. LSGS NO BID
34 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag NO	BID
36 Limestone Mod Abr. LSGS $14.88
37 Sandstone Mod Abr. LSGS NO BID
41 Quarry Waste LSGS $13.10
42 Rip Rap LSGS $18.88
43 Shot Rock LSGS $18.88

R B S Inc., Greystone Quarry

COUNTY/DELIVERY LOCATION:

COUNTY/DELIVERY LOCATION:
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VENDOR 
NAME: R B S Inc., Greystone Quarry

MASON MASON MASON McDOWELL MERCER MONONGALIA NICHOLAS

Contract 
Item Description Composition*

Pt. Pleasant Armory
4194 Ohio River Road
Pt. Pleasant, WV  25550

RSMS (Pt. Pleasant)
Route 1, North, Box 333B
Pt. Pleasant, WV  25550

BII - 157th Motor Pool
729 Fairgrounds Road
Pt. Pleasant, WV  25550

Welch Armory
600 Stewart Street
Welch, WV  24801

Brushfork/Bluefield Armory
2915 Old Bramwell Road
Bluefield, WV  24701

Morgantown Readiness 
Center
90 Army Band Road
Morgantown, WV  26505

Summersville Readiness 
Center & FMS #1
3 Armory Way
Summersville, WV  26651

2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag
5 Class 2 Aggregate LSGS
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS
29 Stone for Gabions LSGS
30 Fine Aggregate LSGS
32 Limestone Std Abr. LSGS
33 Sandstone Std Abr. LSGS
34 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag
36 Limestone Mod Abr. LSGS
37 Sandstone Mod Abr. LSGS
41 Quarry Waste LSGS
42 Rip Rap LSGS
43 Shot Rock LSGS

NICHOLAS NICHOLAS PRESTON PRESTON PRESTON PUTNAM PUTNAM

Contract 
Item Description Composition*

WVNG Apple Project   
(Orchard/Bee Yard)
750 Tower Road
Summersville, WV  26651

WVNG Apple Project 
(Property Access Gate)
4900 Scenic Highway
Summersville, WV  26651

Wheeling Armory & AASF 
#2
538 Girtys Point Road
Wheeling, WV  26003

Kingwood AFRC
Route 72
Kingwood, WV  26537

FMS #4
240 Army Road, Camp 
Dawson
Kingwood, WV  26537

Camp Dawson Combined 
Training Center
1001 Army Road, Camp 
Dawson
Kingwood, WV  26537

Joint Forces/AFRC
111 Army/Navy Drive
Red House, WV  25168

2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS $28.00 $28.00
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag $28.00 $28.00
5 Class 2 Aggregate LSGS $28.00 $28.00
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS $31.00 $31.00
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS $31.00 $31.00
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS $33.00 $33.00
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS $28.00 $28.00
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS $28.00 $28.00
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS $33.00 $33.00
29 Stone for Gabions LSGS $35.00 $35.00
30 Fine Aggregate LSGS $28.00 $28.00
32 Limestone Std Abr. LSGS $28.00 $28.00
33 Sandstone Std Abr. LSGS NO BID NO BID
34 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag NO BID NO BID
36 Limestone Mod Abr. LSGS $28.00 $28.00
37 Sandstone Mod Abr. LSGS NO BID NO BID
41 Quarry Waste LSGS $28.00 $28.00
42 Rip Rap LSGS $33.00 $33.00
43 Shot Rock LSGS $33.00 $33.00

COUNTY/DELIVERY LOCATION:

COUNTY/DELIVERY LOCATION:
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