West Virginia

Purchasing Division

The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wWVOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West Virginia’s
procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses
to this solicitation submitted to the Purchasing
Division in hard copy format.
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Weilcome, Robert M Ross Procurement
Solicitation Reaponse{SR}| Dept: 0803 1D: ESROTO72200000000106 Wer.: 1 Function: Mew Phase: Final

Budgeting Accounts Receivable Accounts Payable

e SR OL NI Contact | Default Values | Discount | Document Information || Clarificafion Request

Procurement Folder: 1066632 50 Doc Code: CRFQ
Procurement Type: Ceniral Master Agreement S0 Dept: 0303
Vendor ID: 000000117961 $| S0 Doc ID: DOT2300000004
Legal Name: THOMAS SCIENTIFIC HOLDINGS LLC Publighed Date: 7/5/22
Alias/DBA: Cloze Date: 7/21/22
Total Bid: 50.00 Cloge Time: 13:30

Response Date: 07/07/2022 Status: Closed

Solicitation Description: Liguid Asphalt MaterialEmulsicns  #

Responze Time: 12:08 - Statewide 6622C058 L'
Responded By User ID: ApnG $| Total of Header Attachments: 0
First Name: Quotes Total of All Attachments: 0

Last Name: Team

Email: quotes@ThomasSci.com

Phone: 356-832-3143
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Proc Folder: 1066632
Solicitation Description: Liquid Asphalt Material/Emulsions - Statewide 6622C058

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement
Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2022-07-21 13:30 SR 0803 ESR07072200000000106 1
VENDOR
000000117961

THOMAS SCIENTIFIC HOLDINGS LLC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2300000004
Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2022-07-07
Comments:

Response Time: 12:08:20

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep

304-558-2566

john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X FEIN#

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 HFMS-2 (3,000-4,000 gal) 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Anionic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 HFMS-2 (4,001-5,000 gal) 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Anionic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 HFMS-2 (5,001 gal or greater) 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Anionic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 RS-2 (3,000-4,000 gal) 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

Anionic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue
5 RS-2 (4,001-5,000 gal) 0.00000 GL

Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Anionic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 RS-2 (5,001 gal or greater) 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Anionic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Polymer Modified RS-2P  (3,000-4,000 gal) 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Anionic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Polymer Modified RS-2P  (4,001-5,000 gal) 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Anionic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Polymer Modified RS-2P (5,001 gal or 0.00000 GL
greater)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12161804
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Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Anionic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 SS-1h Diluted (3,000-4,000 gal) 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Anionic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 SS-1h Diluted (4,001-5,000 gal) 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Anionic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 SS-1h Diluted (5,001 gal or greater) 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Anionic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 Polymer Modified CRS-2P (3,000-4,000 gal) 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Cationic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 Polymer Modified CRS-2P (4,001-5,000 gal) 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Cationic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 Polymer Modified CRS-2P (5,001 gal or 0.00000 GL
greater)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Cationic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 AEP, E1-Prime, IE-1, or equivalent 0.00000 GL
(3,000-4,000 gal)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Cationic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 AEP, E1-Prime, IE-1, or equivalent 0.00000 GL
(4,001-5,000 gal)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Cationic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

18 AEP, E1-Prime, IE-1, or equivalent (5,001 0.00000 GL
gal or greater)
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

Cationic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 Winter Grade RS or MS (3,000-4,000 gal) 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Cationic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 Winter Grade RS or MS (4,001-5,000 gal) 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

Cationic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 Winter Grade RS or MS (5,001 gal or 0.00000 GL
greater)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

Cationic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 CQS-1hp Diluted (3,000-4,000 gal) 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12161804
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Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Cationic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 CQS-1hp Diluted (4,001-5,000 gal) 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Cationic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 CQS-1hp Diluted (5,001 gal or greater) 0.00000 GL

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12161804

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Cationic Liquid Asphaltic Emulsion:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.
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