
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1002826

Solicitation Description: Various Light Fixtures and Supplies

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2022-03-01 13:30 SR 0403 ESR03012200000005196 1

VENDOR

000000159872
SCOTT ELECTRIC CO

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0403 DBS2200000005

Total Bid: 19297.6500000000014551915228366851806640625Response Date: 2022-03-01 Response Time: 12:09:13

Comments: See attached quote for additional T&Cs

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Joseph E Hager III
(304) 558-2306
joseph.e.hageriii@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Lithonia light fixture, 2GTL-4-72L-EZ1-LP835 

LensedLED
100.00000 EA 127.750000 12775.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
39110000    

Commodity Line Comments: Mfg: Colu
Part: LJT24-35VLG-FSA12-ED1U
See attached quote for additional T&Cs

Extended Description:

Lithonia light fixture, 2GTL-4-72L-EZ1-LP835 Lensed LED, or equal
Note: Quantity listed is estimated and for evaluation purposes only.  Order quantities could be more or less. There is no guarantee of future use 
for this item.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Lithonia light fixture, 2GTL-4-72L-EZ1-EL14L-

LP835
10.00000 EA 266.750000 2667.50

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
39110000    

Commodity Line Comments: Mfg: Colu
Part: LJT24-35VLG-FSA12-ED1U-ELL14
See attached quote for additional T&Cs

Extended Description:

Lithonia light fixture, 2GTL-4-72L-EZ1-EL14L-LP835, or equal
Note: Quantity listed is estimated and for evaluation purposes only.  Order quantities could be more or less. There is no guarantee of future use 
for this item.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Lithonia light fixture, 2GTL-2-48L-EZ1-LP835, 

or equal
10.00000 EA 122.250000 1222.50

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
39110000    

Commodity Line Comments: Mfg: Colu
Part: LJT22-35VLG-FSA12-ED1U
See attached quote for additional T&Cs

Extended Description:

Lithonia light fixture, 2GTL-2-48L-EZ1-LP835, or equal
Note: Quantity listed is estimated and for evaluation purposes only.  Order quantities could be more or less. There is no guarantee of future use 
for this item.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Lithonia light fixture, 2GTL-2-48L-EZ1-E14L-

LP835,
5.00000 EA 262.000000 1310.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
39110000    

Commodity Line Comments: Mfg: Colu
Part: LJT22-35VLG-FSA12-ED1U-ELL14
See attached quote for additional T&Cs

Extended Description:

Lithonia light fixture, 2GTL-2-48L-EZ1-E14L-LP835, or equal
Note: Quantity listed is estimated and for evaluation purposes only.  Order quantities could be more or less. There is no guarantee of future use 
for this item.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Wire, 14ga THHN, Gray 2.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
39110000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

Wire, 14ga THHN, Gray
Note: Quantity listed is estimated and for evaluation purposes only.  Order quantities could be more or less. There is no guarantee of future use 
for this item.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Wire, 14ga THHN, Purple 2.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
39110000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

Wire, 14ga THHN, Purple
Note: Quantity listed is estimated and for evaluation purposes only.  Order quantities could be more or less. There is no guarantee of future use 
for this item.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Ground wire pigtails with ground screws 1.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
39110000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

Ground wire pigtails with ground screws
Note: Quantity listed is estimated and for evaluation purposes only.  Order quantities could be more or less. There is no guarantee of future use 
for this item.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Lutron, DBSTV-IV, Diva 8AMP, Dimmer, or 

equal
10.00000 EA 53.000000 530.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
39110000    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached quote for additional T&Cs

Extended Description:

Lutron, DBSTV-IV, Diva 8AMP, Dimmer, or equal
Note: Quantity listed is estimated and for evaluation purposes only.  Order quantities could be more or less. There is no guarantee of future use 
for this item.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Lutron Maestro Wireless RF Switch,

120/277V, MRF2S-8S
2.00000 EA 108.500000 217.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
39110000    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached quote for additional T&Cs

Extended Description:

Lutron Maestro Wireless RF Switch,120/277V, MRF2S-8S-DV-IV, or equal
Note: Quantity listed is estimated and for evaluation purposes only.  Order quantities could be more or less. There is no guarantee of future use 
for this item.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 Lutron Radio Powr Savr Wireless Occupancy 

Sensor, LRF
2.00000 EA 50.250000 100.50

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
39110000    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached quote for additional T&Cs

Extended Description:

Lutron Radio Powr Savr Wireless Occupancy Sensor, LRF2-OCR2B-P-WH, or equal
Note: Quantity listed is estimated and for evaluation purposes only.  Order quantities could be more or less. There is no guarantee of future use 
for this item.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 Recess mounting bracket, L-CRMK-WH, or 

equal
2.00000 EA 11.950000 23.90

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
39110000    

Commodity Line Comments: See attached quote for additional T&Cs

Extended Description:

Recess mounting bracket, L-CRMK-WH, or equal
Note: Quantity listed is estimated and for evaluation purposes only.  Order quantities could be more or less. There is no guarantee of future use 
for this item.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 Atlas exterior light fixture, WLM43LED, or 

equal
5.00000 EA 90.250000 451.25

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
39110000    

Commodity Line Comments: Mfg:  Maxlite
Part: WPOP40U-CSBCR
See attached quote for additional T&Cs

Extended Description:

Atlas exterior light fixture, WLM43LED, or equal
Note: Quantity listed is estimated and for evaluation purposes only.  Order quantities could be more or less. There is no guarantee of future use 
for this item.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 Ideal 74B Wire Nuts, 100 Pack, Yellow 

Connectors,  or equal
2.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
39110000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

Ideal 74B Wire Nuts, 100 Pack, Yellow Connectors,  or equal
Note: Quantity listed is estimated and for evaluation purposes only.  Order quantities could be more or less. There is no guarantee of future use 
for this item.



Date: Mar 1, 2022

Quote   
Page 1/1

Project WEST VIRGINIA SCHOOL FOR THE 
DEAF & BLIND - New Phase

Location
Quote PW22-298965-2

Bid Date Mar 1, 2022

Expires Mar 31, 2022

QTY Type Part Price UQ ExtPrice

100 $127.75 $12,775.00
10 $266.75 $2,667.50
10 $122.25 $1,222.50
5 $262.00 $1,310.00
10 $53.00 $530.00
2 $108.50 $217.00
2 $50.25 $100.50
2

MFG
COLU
COLU
COLU
COLU
LUTR
LUTR
LUTR
LUTR

LJT24-35VLG-FSA12-ED1U
LJT24-35VLG-FSA12-ED1U-ELL14
LJT22-35VLG-FSA12-ED1U
LJT22-35VLG-FSA12-ED1U-ELL14
DVSTV-IV
MRF2S-8S-DV-IV
LRF2-OCR2B-P-WH
L-CRMK-WH $11.95 $23.90

5 MAXLITE WPOP40U-CSBCR $90.25 $451.25
Total: $19,297.65

Terms and conditions of sale:
1. Subject to manufacturer's published terms and conditions of sale.
2. Quotation is void if changed.  Complete quote must be used.
3. Quote is valid for 30 days from date of quotation.
4. Quotation does not include lamps, stems, hooks, chains, special colors or warranties, spare parts, hanger
bars, wallplates or any other equipment unless indicated.
5. Quotation is based on one release only unless otherwise noted.
6. Upon release, verify all voltages, colors, stem lengths and forward one copy of approved submittals.
7. Factory supplied anchor bolts and templates must be used on all pole orders.
8. Quotation does not meet Buy American requirements unless specifically noted.
9. Lighting Control System cable not included unless otherwise listed in project bill of material.
10. One Source recommends the use of Vibration Dampers on all poles.  These are typcially not standard and are
not included unless noted.  Approximate adder of $110 each will apply when ordered.

Minimum
OrderMfg Terms:

HUBB Hubbell Lighting

Freight
Allowance

Freight Allowed $55.00

LUTR Lutron Plus Freight $110.00
Lutron Fixtures are all Plus Freight.
Commercial System quotes issued after July 19, 2021 will be 
charged a Shipping and Handling fee.

MAXLIT MaxLite, Inc. Plus Freight
Minimum order requirement of $220.

cld14
Sticky Note
None set by cld14



TERMS AND CONDITIONS: 
1. THE QUANTITIES / BOM ARE NOT GUARANTEED.  THIS BOM IS SUBJECT TO APPROVAL. (1) ELECTRONIC COPY
OF SUBMITTALS WILL BE PROVIDED AND REQUIRE 5-7 BUSINESS TO PRODUCE.  WHEN O&M’S ARE REQUIRED, (1) 
ELECTRONIC COPY WILL BE PROVIDED UPON REQUEST. NO HARD COPIES INCLUDED.
2. LAMPS ARE NOT INCLUDED, UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTED.
3. SPARE PARTS ARE NOT INCLUDED, UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTED.
4. MANUFACTURERS STD FINISH QUOTED UNLESS OTHERWISE SPECIFIED. ALL BALLAST QUOTED 120 VOLT
UNLESS OTHERWISE SPECIFIED.
5. LAMP/BALLAST COMPATIBILITY TO BE VERIFIED BY OTHERS.
6. UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPLICITLY STATED, THERE ARE NO LIGHTING CONTROLS INCLUDED IN THIS
QUOTATION NOR ARE THERE ANY LIGHTING CONTROL STARTUPS INCLUDED. IF YOU WOULD LIKE TO HAVE A QUOTE 
FOR CONTROLS, PLEASE PROVIDE DRAWINGS AND WRITTEN SPECIFICATIONS OR A DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF WHAT 
IS REQUIRED.
7. THERE ARE NO MOUNTING ACCESSORIES OF ANY KIND INCLUDED UNLESS NOTED ON THIS QUOTE OR
SUPPLIED AS A STANDARD ACCESSORY BY THE MANUFACTURER. IF MOUNTING ACCESSORIES ARE NEEDED, PLEASE 
PROVIDE WRITTEN SPECIFICATIONS AND QUOTE CAN BE REVISED.
8. SALES TAX NOT INCLUDED.
9. NO MINORITY PARTICIPATION INCLUDED.
10. NET 30 TERMS AND CONDITIONS SUPERCEDE ANY OMISSIONS. FOB FACTORY. PLUS FREIGHT FOR
PRE-SHIPMENT OF ANCHOR BOLTS/TEMPLATES, OR ANY MISC COMPONENTS.
11. QUOTATION INCLUDES FIXTURE TYPES AND QUANTITIES SHOWN ABOVE.  ANY REVISIONS TO THE
QUANTITIES OR BILL OF MATERIAL WOULD RESULT IN THE NEED FOR A REVISED QUOTATION. THE QUANTITIES/BOM 
ARE NOT GUARANTEED. 
12. UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPLICITLY STATED, SCOTT ELECTRIC DOES NOT GUARANTEE THE PRODUCTS
CONTAINED IN THIS QUOTE COMPLY WITH THE BUY AMERICAN PROVISION OF THE AMERICAN RECOVERY AND 
REINVESTMENT ACT (ARRA) OR THE PENNSYLVANIA STEEL PROCUREMENT ACT (PA STEEL CERTS). 
13. LIQUIDATED DAMAGES ARE NOT THE RESPONSIBILITY OF SCOTT ELECTRIC.
14. LABOR CHARGES ARE NOT THE RESPONSIBILITY OF SCOTT ELECTRIC. IF LABOR CHARGES ARE INCURRED, THE
CONTRACTOR MUST PROVIDE ESTIMATE AND SUBMIT FOR PRIOR APPROVAL BEFORE ANY WORK IS DONE.
15. FREIGHT ALLOWANCE IS BASED ON (1) SHIPMENT ONLY.
16. ANY LEADTIMES REQUESTED PRIOR TO ORDERS PLACED ARE ESTIMATED ONLY AND SUBJECT TO CHANGE
WITHOUT NOTICE.

LOCATIONS: 
HEADQUARTERS:
GREENSURG PA 15601 BLOOMSBURG PA 17815  
800-442-8045    888-784-2916  

CAMP HILL PA 17011 
877-731-3737  

DUNCANSVILLE PA 16635
800-252-3530

ERIE PA 16511 
877-844-0777 

HAGERSTOWN MD 21740 
888-333-7850  

PITTSBURGH PA 15201 
800-388-2232  

WARREN PA 16365
888-232-1016 

NEW YORK LOCATIONS / SCOTT ELECTRIC SUPPLY: 
DEPEW, NY 14043 FREDONIA NY 14063
716-684-0063  716-672-5168

NOTICE:    THIS PROPOSAL IS CONTINGENT ON A LACK OF IMPACT BY THE CORONAVIRUS NATIONAL 
EMERGENCY.  A FORCE MAJEURE CLAUSE MUST BE INCLUDED IN ANY P.O.

CUYAHOGA HEIGHTS, OH 44105
800-444-4545

cld14
Sticky Note
None set by cld14
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