
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Proc Folder :

Solicitation Description :

Proc Type :

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

Solicitation Response

Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Charleston, WV 25305-0130
Post Office Box 50130

State of West Virginia

742421

State Fire Commission Uniform Contract

Central Master Agreement

2020-08-04

13:30:00

SR 0619 ESR08042000000000653 1

 VENDOR

VS0000021952

DANA SAFETY SUPPLY INC

Comments:

Total Bid : Response Date: Response Time:Total Bid : 

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0619 FIC2100000001

$0.00 2020-08-04 13:18:48

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001

Tara Lyle

(304) 558-2544
tara.l.lyle@wv.gov
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

1 Uniforms 1.00000 LS $0.000000 $0.00

53102700

See attached Pricing Page, Exhibit A.

IF BIDDING ONLINE - ENTER THE PRICE OF  $0.00 ON THE COMMODITY LINE IN WVOASIS. THE WV OASIS
COMMODITY LINE WILL NOT BE EVALUATED AS PART OF THE BID.





















































































































































Please see Section 4.3 in the specifications for more information regarding the pricing pages.

Item No.

Manufacturer 

Product No.
Description Category

 Catalog 

Price 

Units 

Provided 

for Catalog 

Price

 Unit 

Price  

Discount 

Percentage

 Discounted 

Unit Price 

Unit (For 

Calculation 

Purposes)

Annual 

Estimated 

Unit Qty

 Discounted

 Unit Price 
 Item Total Cost 

3.1.1

3.1.1.1

5.11 Tactical 

Taclite TDU Shirt 

or Equal

5.11 Tactical Taclite 

TDU Shirt or Equal Tactical Uniforms

Sizes: TruSpec Ultralite

Small Field Shirt 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

Large L/S - 1103 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

2XL S/S - 1093 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

3.1.1.2

5.11 Tactical TDU 

Shirt or Equal

5.11 Tactical TDU Shirt 

or Equal Tactical Uniforms

Sizes: TruSped Ultralite

Small Uniform Shirt 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

Large L/S - 1058 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

2XL 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

3.1.1.3

5.11 Tactical 

Taclite Pro shirt or 

Equal

5.11 Tactical Taclite Pro 

shirt or Equal Tactical Uniforms

Sizes: TruSpec Ultralite

Small Field Shirt 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

Large L/S - 1103 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

2XL S/S - 1093 68.95$       
1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each

100
41.99$                 $4,199.06

3.1.1.4

5.11 Tactical 

Taclite Pro Pants 

or Equal

5.11 Tactical Taclite Pro 

Pants or Equal Tactical Uniforms

Sizes: TruSpec Original 

28 Tactical Pants 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

32 Mens 1061 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

38 Womens 1097 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

40 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

42 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

50 75.95$       1 75.95$     39.10% 46.25$           Each 100 46.25$                 $4,625.36

54 75.95$       1 75.95$     39.10% 46.25$           Each 100 46.25$                 $4,625.36

3.1.1.5

5.11 Tactical Utility 

Polo or Equal

5.11 Tactical Utility Polo 

or Equal
Tactical Uniforms

Sizes: Tru-Spec Original

Small Polo Shirt 48.95$       1 48.95$     39.10% 29.81$           Each 100 29.81$                 $2,981.06

Large M L/S 4358, SS 4331 48.95$       1 48.95$     39.10% 29.81$           Each 100 29.81$                 $2,981.06

2XL W L/S 4371, S/S 4395 53.95$       1 53.95$     39.10% 32.86$           Each 100 32.86$                 $3,285.56

Notes

CRFQ FIC21*1 - Pricing Page - Exhibit A

Bid Total Calculation

Pricing listed is for the Long Sleeve 

Shirts. The MSRP for the Short 

Sleeve is $60.95 up to XL and $66.95 

for 2X and above.

Pricing listed is for the Long Sleeve 

Shirts. The MSRP for the Short Sleeve is 

$42.95 up to XL and $46.95 for 2X and 

above.

Pricing listed is for the Long Sleeve 

Shirts. The MSRP for the Short 

Sleeve is $60.95 up to XL and $66.95 

for 2X and above.

Tactical Items and Clothing 

Pricing page Eligible Item Description  -   All references to brand 

names are for illustration purposes only and vendors may be the 

brand listed or an equal product.

Discounted Unit Price Calculation

Tactical Uniforms



3.1.1.6

Tactical 1/4 Zip 

Job Shirt or Equal

Tactical 1/4 Zip Job 

Shirt or Equal
Tactical Uniforms

Sizes:

Small -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Large -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

2XL -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.1.7

Tactical ripstop 

TDU Pants or 

Equal

Tactical Ripstop TDU 

Pants or Equal
Tactical Uniforms

Sizes:

Small -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Large -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

2XL -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

WM 2 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

10 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

14 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

20 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.2

3.1.2.1

Flying Cross Dress 

Trousers or Equal

Flying Cross Dress 

Trousers or Equal

Tactical Field 

Uniform Dress

28 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

32 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

38 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

40 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

42 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

50 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

54 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

WM 2 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

10 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

14 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

20 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

24 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.2.2

Flying Cross White 

Shirt or Equal

Flying Cross White 

Shirt or Equal

Tactical Field 

Uniform Dress

14.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

16L -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

17 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

17.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

17L -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

18 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

18L -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

20 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

20L -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

22 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

WM 28 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

32 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

36 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

38 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

42 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Tactical Field Uniform Dress



3.1.2.3

Flying Cross 

Trousers w/Flew 

Waistband or 

Equal

Flying Cross Trousers 

w/Flex Waistband or 

Equal

Tactical Field 

Uniform Dress

28 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

32S -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

32 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

38 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

40 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

42 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

50 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

54 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.2.4

Flying Cross Visa 

System 3 Polyester 

Trousers or Equal

Flying Cross Visa 

System 3 Polyester 

Trousers or Equal

Tactical Field 

Uniform Dress

28 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

32 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

34 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

36L -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

37 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

38S -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

38 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

38L -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

40S -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

40 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

42 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

44 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

50 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

WM 4 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

12 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

16 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

20 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

24 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.2.5

Flying Cross 

Polyester Wool 

Trousers w/Flex 

Waistband or 

Equal

Flying Cross Polyester 

Wool Trousers w/Flex 

Waistband or Equal

Tactical Field 

Uniform Dress

28 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

32 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

38 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

40 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

42 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

50 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

WM 2 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

12 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

14 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

20 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

24 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.3
  Tactical Field Uniform Casual Clothing



3.1.3.1

Tru-Spec 24-7 

Performance Polo 

or Equal

Tru-Spec 24-7 

Performance Polo or 

Equal

Tactical Field 

Uniform Casual 

Clothing

Sizes: M L/S 4557, S/S 4336

Small W L/S 4564, S/S 4375 55.95$       1 55.95$     39.10% 34.07$           Each 100 34.07$                 $3,407.36

Large 55.95$       1 55.95$     39.10% 34.07$           Each 100 34.07$                 $3,407.36

2XL 60.95$       1 60.95$     39.10% 37.12$           Each 100 37.12$                 $3,711.86

3.1.3.2

Tru-Spec 24-7 

Classic Pants or 

Equal

Tru-Spec 24-7 Classic 

Pants or Equal

Tactical Field 

Uniforms Casual 

Clothing

28 TruSpec Classic 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

32 24-7 Pants 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

38 M 1189 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

40 W 1194 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

42 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

54 75.95$       1 75.95$     39.10% 46.25$           Each 100 46.25$                 $4,625.36

WM 0 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

2 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

10 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

14 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

18 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

20 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

24 68.95$       1 68.95$     39.10% 41.99$           Each 100 41.99$                 $4,199.06

3.1.3.3

Port Authority 

Ladies Silk Touch 

Short Sleeve Sport 

Shirt or Equal

Port Authority Ladies 

Silk Touch Short Sleeve 

Sport Shirt or Equal

Tactical Field 

Uniform Casual 

Clothing

Sizes:

Small -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Large -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

2XL -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.3.4

Broadcloth Shirt or 

Equal

Broadcloth Shirt or 

Equal

Tactical Field 

Uniform Casual 

Clothing

Sizes:

Small -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Large -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

2XL -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.3.5

Champion Exo 

Fleece Double Dry 

Crew Sweatshirt or 

Equal

Champion Exo Fleece 

Double Dry Crew 

Sweatshirt or Equal

Tactical Field 

Uniform Casual 

Clothing

Sizes:

Small -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Large -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

2XL -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.4

Pricing listed is for the Long Sleeve 

Shirts. The MSRP for the Short 

Sleeve is $48.95 up to XL and $53.95 

for 2X and above.

Mens pants over size 46" Waist 

arrive unhemmed. All women's pants 

arrive unhemmed. 

Tactical Field Uniform Duty Gear



3.1.4.1

Lawpro 1 1/2" 

Premium Leather 

Uniform Belt or 

Equal

Lawpro 1 1/2" Premium 

Leather Uniform Belt or 

Equal

Tactical Field 

Uniform Duty Gear

Sizes: Dutyman 1521

30 29.00$       1 29.00$     32.00% 19.72$           Each 100 19.72$                 $1,972.00

36 29.00$       1 29.00$     32.00% 19.72$           Each 100 19.72$                 $1,972.00

3.1.4.2

Boston Leather 1 

1/2" Garrison Belt 

or Equal

Boston Leather 1 1/2" 

Garrison Belt or Equal

Tactical Field 

Uniform Duty Gear

Sizes: Dutyman 1511

28 28.25$       1 28.25$     32.00% 19.21$           Each 100 19.21$                 $1,921.00

32 28.25$       1 28.25$     32.00% 19.21$           Each 100 19.21$                 $1,921.00

38 28.25$       1 28.25$     32.00% 19.21$           Each 100 19.21$                 $1,921.00

40 28.25$       1 28.25$     32.00% 19.21$           Each 100 19.21$                 $1,921.00

42 28.25$       1 28.25$     32.00% 19.21$           Each 100 19.21$                 $1,921.00

50 33.50$       1 33.50$     32.00% 22.78$           Each 100 22.78$                 $2,278.00

54 35.75$       1 35.75$     32.00% 24.31$           Each 100 24.31$                 $2,431.00

60 35.75$       1 35.75$     32.00% 24.31$           Each 100 24.31$                 $2,431.00

3.1.4.3

Tactical Operator 

1.75 Belt or Equal

Tactical Operator 1.75 

or Equal

Tactical Field 

Uniform Duty Gear

Sizes: TruSpec 4091

Small Range Belt 30.95$       1 30.95$     35.00% 20.12$           Each 100 20.12$                 $2,011.75

Large 30.95$       1 30.95$     35.00% 20.12$           Each 100 20.12$                 $2,011.75

2XL 30.95$       1 30.95$     35.00% 20.12$           Each 100 20.12$                 $2,011.75

3.1.4.4

Tactical 1.5 TDU 

Belt or Equal

Tactical 1.5 TDU Belt or 

Equal

Tactical Field 

Uniform Duty Gear

Sizes: Propper F5603

Small Tactical Duty Belt 9.99$         1 9.99$       32.00% 6.79$             Each 100 6.79$                   $679.32

Large 9.99$         1 9.99$       32.00% 6.79$             Each 100 6.79$                   $679.32

2XL 9.99$         1 9.99$       32.00% 6.79$             Each 100 6.79$                   $679.32

3.1.4.5

Accumold Elite 

Duty Belt or Equal

Accumold Elite Duty 

Belt or Equal

Tactical Field 

Uniform Duty Gear

Sizes:

Small -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Large -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

2XL -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.5

3.1.5.1

Bates High Gloss 

Leather Sole 

Oxford or Equal

Bates High Gloss 

Leather Sole Oxford or 

Equal Footwear

Sizes:

7 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

7.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

9 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

9.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

12 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Footwear



14 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

15 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.5.2

Bates GX-8 Gore 

Tex Side Zip 

Insulted Boot or 

Equal 

Bates GX-8 Gore Tex 

Side Zip Insulted Boot 

or Equal Footwear

Sizes:

7 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

7.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

9 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

9.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

12 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

14 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

15 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.5.3

5.11 Tactical ATAC 

2.06 Quarter Boot 

or Equal

5.11 Tactical ATAC 2.06 

Quarter Boot or Equal Footwear

Sizes:

6 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

7 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

7.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

12 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

13 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

15 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.5.4

Thorogood Classic 

Leather Academy 

Oxford or Equal 

Thorogood Classic 

Leather Academy 

Oxford or Equal Footwear

Sizes:

7 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

7.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

9 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

9.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

12 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

13 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.5.5

Bates Lites Leather 

Dress Shoes or 

Equal 

Bates Lites Leather 

Dress Shoes or Equal Footwear

Sizes:

7 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

7.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

12 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

14 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

15 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.5.6

Danner 6" Kinetic 

Side Zip 

Waterproof Boot or 

Equal 

Danner 6" Kinetic Side 

Zip Waterproof Boot or 

Equal Footwear

Sizes:

7 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

7.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid



12 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

14 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

15 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.5.7

Rocky Slipstop 

Oxford or Equal 

Rocky Slipstop Oxford 

or Equal Footwear

Sizes:

7 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

7.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

12 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

14 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

WM 5.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.5.8

Rocky TMX Oxford 

or Equal

Rocky TMX Oxford or 

Equal Footwear

Sizes:

7 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

7.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

12 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

13 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

WM 5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

5.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

7 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

7.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

9 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

9.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.5.9

Bates 4" GX-4 Non 

Metallic 

Waterproof Boot or 

Equal 

Bates 4" GX-4 Non 

Metallic Waterproof 

Boot or Equal Footwear

Sizes:

7 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

12 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

14 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

15 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

WM 5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

7 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

7.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

9 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

9.5 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.5.10 Fireboots Fireboots Footwear

Fireboots -$           
1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each

100
No Bid No Bid

3.1.6

3.1.6.1

Galls Active 

Shooter Armor Kit 

or Equal

Galls Active Shooter 

Armor Kit or Eaual

Ballistic Body 

Armor

Active Shooter 

Armor Kit Slate Active Shooter Kit 724.00$      
1 724.00$   35.00% 470.60$         Each

100
470.60$               $47,060.00

Slate Solutions Active Shooter Kit 

Includes Modular Operator Plate Carrier, 

Front Pocket, Id Patches, Drag Handle, 

and (2) Level IV Plates.

Ballistic Body Armor All armor being bid in this section is from 

Slate Solutions Armor. 



3.1.6.2

Survival Armor 

Performance 611 

Concealable Vest 

or Equal

Survival Armor 

Performance 611 

Concealable Vest or 

Equal

Ballistic Body 

Armor

Concealable Vest

Slate SLSIIIA Armor 

w/Conceal Carrier/STP 724.00$      
1 724.00$   35.00% 470.60$         Each

100
470.60$               $47,060.00

3.1.6.3

Carrier for Survival 

Armor 

Performance 611 

Vest or Equal

Carrier for Survival 

Armor Performance 611 

Vest or Equal

Ballistic Body 

Armor

Carrier for Vest 724.00$      
1 724.00$   35.00% 470.60$         Each

100
470.60$               $47,060.00

3.1.7

3.1.7.1

Smith and Wesson 

Model 100 or Equal

Smith and Wesson 

Model 100 or Equal

Uniform 

Handcuffs/Restrain

ts

Handcuffs Peerless 700C 37.70$       
1 37.70$     28.00% 27.14$           Each

100
27.14$                 $2,714.40

3.1.7.2

Leg Irons Smith 

and Wesson Model 

1900 or Equal

Leg Irons Smith and 

Wesson Model 1900 or 

Equal

Uniform 

Handcuffs/Restrain

ts

Leg Irons Peerless 703C 62.60$       
1 62.60$     28.00% 45.07$           Each

100
45.07$                 $4,507.20

3.1.8

3.1.8.1

ASP Airweight 

Expandable Baton 

21 Inch or Equal

ASP Airweight 

Expandable Baton 21 

Inch or Equal Baton

Baton ASP 52412 133.22$      
1 133.22$   29.00% 94.59$           Each

100
94.59$                 $9,458.62

3.1.8.2

ASP Airweight 

Expandable Baton 

26 inch or Equal

ASP Airweight 

Expandable Baton 26 

inch or Equal Baton

Baton ASP 52612 138.57$      1 138.57$   29.00% 98.38$           Each 100 98.38$                 $9,838.47

3.1.9

3.1.9.1

Safariland Double 

Magazine Pouch or 

Equal

Savariland Double 

Magazine Pouch or 

Equal Tactical Equipment

Double Magazine 

Pouch -$           
1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each

100
No Bid No Bid

Slate Solutions Concealable Armor 

Package includes Level 3A Ballistic 

Panels, one concealable carrier in 

either black, or navy, and one 

STP(soft trauma plate). 

Slate Solutions additional 

concealable carrier for use with 

concealable armor panels in section 

3.1.6.2 and available in navy or white. 

Tactical Field Uniform Handcuffs/Restraints

Tactical Field Uniform Batons

Tactical Field Uniform Tactical Equipment



3.1.9.2

Safariland 

Handcuff Case 

with snap or equap

Safariland Handcuff 

Case with snap or 

equap Tactical Equipment

Handcuff case -$           
1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each

100
No Bid No Bid

3.1.10

3.1.10.1

Sabre Mark 9 

Defense Spray 

Canister or Equal

Sabre Mark 9 Defense 

Spray Canister or Equal Less Lethal

Defense Spray 

Canister Sabre 92H2O60 47.50$       
1 47.50$     32.00% 32.30$           Each

100
32.30$                 $3,230.00

3.1.10.2

Safariland Tactical 

SLS OC/Mace 

Pouch MK-9 or 

Equal

Safariland Tactical SLS 

OC/Mace Pouch MK-9 

or Equal Less Lethal

Pouch -$           
1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each

100
No Bid No Bid

3.1.11

3.1.11.1

Safariland ALS 

Gun Holster or 

Equal

Safariland ALS Gun 

Holster or Equal

Weapon 

Accessories

Gun Holster -$           
1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each

100
No Bid No Bid

3.1.12

3.1.12.1 Clip on Tie Clip on Tie Tie

Clip on Tie -$           
1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each

100
No Bid $0.00

3.1.12.2 Break Away Tie Break Away Tie Tie

Break Away Tie -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.13

3.1.13.1

Flexfit 

performance or 

Equal

5.11 Tactical Taclite 

TDU Shirt or Equal Hats/Caps

Sizes: -$           1 0.00% No Bid No Bid

X-Small -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Small -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Medium -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Large -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

X-Large -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.13.2

Flexfit Ball Wooly 

combed Twill Hat 

or Equal

Flexfit Ball Wooly 

combed Twill Hat or 

Equal Hats/Caps

Small -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Large -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

2XL -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Tactical Field Uniform Less Lethal

Tactical Field Uniform Weapon Accessories

Ties

Hats/Caps



3.1.13.3

Tactical Taclite Hat 

or Equal

Tactical Taclite Hat or 

Equal Hats/Caps

One Size Fits All -$           
1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each

100
No Bid No Bid

3.1.13.4

Tactical Fleece 

Watch Cap or 

Equal

Tactical Fleece Watch 

Cap or Equal Hats/Caps

Sizes:

X-Small -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Medium -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Large -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

X-Large -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.13.5

Midway 

convertible Bell 

crown Dress Cap 

or Equal

Midway convertible Bell 

crown Dress Cap or 

Equal Hats/Caps

7 1/8 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

7 1/2 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

7 5/8 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

7 3/4 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.14

3.1.14.1

Tactical Response 

Jacket or Equal

Tactical Response 

Jacket or Equal Jackets

Sizes:

Small -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Large -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

2XL -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.14.2

Tactical 5 in 1 

Jacket or Equal

Tactical 5 in 1 Jacket or 

Equal Jackets

Sizes:

Small -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Large -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

2XL -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.14.3

Tactical Sabre 

Jacket or Equal

Tactical Sabre Jacket or 

Equal Jackets

Sizes:

Small -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Large -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

2XL -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.14.4

Dickies Fleece 

Lined Hooded 

Nylon Jacket or 

Equal

Tactical Sabre Jacket or 

Equal Jackets

Sizes:

Small -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Large -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

2XL -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Jackets



3.1.14.5

Columbia Fleece 

Jacket or Equal

Columbia Fleece Jacket 

or Equal Jackets

Sizes:

Small -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

Large -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

2XL -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.14.6

Single Breasted 

Poly/Wool Linied 

Coat with 4 Pocket 

Flaps

Single Breasted 

Poly/Wool Linied Coat 

with 4 Pocket Flaps Jackets

Sizes:

36 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

38 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

40 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

40L -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

44 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

48L -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

48 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

50 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

50S -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

54 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

60 -$           1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each 100 No Bid No Bid

3.1.15.1

3.1.15.1 Embroidery Embroidery

Embroidery/Badge

s/Collar 

Insignia/Patches/ 

Nametags

Full Color -$           
1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each

100
No Bid No Bid

3.1.15.2

Badge VH 

Blackinton Style 

BH1980 or Equal

Badge VH Blackinton 

Style BH1980 or Equal

Embroidery/Badge

s/Collar 

Insignia/Patches 

/Nametags

Rhodium VHB BH1980 61.18$       
1 61.18$     38.00% 37.93$           Each

100
37.93$                 $3,793.16

Gold VHB BH1980 67.00$       
1 67.00$     38.00% 41.54$           Each

100
41.54$                 $4,154.00

Military Black VHB BH1980 53.50$       
1 53.50$     38.00% 33.17$           Each

100
33.17$                 $3,317.00

3.1.15.3

Collar Insignia VH 

Blackinton Style 

A3953-EE

Collar Insignia VH 

Blackinton Style A3953-

EE

Embroidery/Badge

s/Collar 

Insignia/Patches/ 

Nametags

Rhodium VHB A3953-EE 30.50$       
1 30.50$     38.00% 18.91$           Each

100
18.91$                 $1,891.00

Gold VHB A3953-EE 33.80$       
1 33.80$     38.00% 20.96$           Each

100
20.96$                 $2,095.60

3.1.15.4

Hat Badge VH 

Blackinton Style 

A4067 or Equal

Hat Badge VH 

Blackinton Style A4067 

or Equal

Embroidery/Badge

s/Collar 

Insignia/Patches/ 

Nametags

Embroidery/Badges/collar Insignia/Patches/Nametags



Rhodium VHB A4067 61.70$       
1 61.70$     38.00% 38.25$           Each

100
38.25$                 $3,825.40

Gold VHB A4067 61.50$       
1 61.50$     38.00% 38.13$           Each

100
38.13$                 $3,813.00

3.1.15.5

Breast Badge VH 

Blackinton Style 

B30 or Equal

Breast Badge VH 

Blackinton Style B30 or 

Equal

Embroidery/Badge

s/Collar 

Insignia/Patches/ 

Nametags

Rhodium VHB B30 79.55$       
1 79.55$     38.00% 49.32$           Each

100
49.32$                 $4,932.10

Gold VHB B30 87.50$       
1 87.50$     38.00% 54.25$           Each

100
54.25$                 $5,425.00

3.1.15.6

Breast Badge VH 

Blackinton Style 

B3538 or Equal

Breast Badge VH 

Blackinton Style B3538 

or Equal

Embroidery/Badge

s/Collar 

Insignia/Patches/N

ametags

Gold VHB B538 83.00$       
1 83.00$     38.00% 51.46$           Each

100
51.46$                 $5,146.00

3.1.15.7

West Virginia State 

Fire Marshal Patch

West Virginia State Fire 

Marshal Patch

Embroidery/Badge

s/Collar 

Insignia/Patches/ 

Nametags

Full Color
1 -$        38.00% No Bid Each

100
No Bid No Bid

3.1.15.8

Blackinton 

Nametags or Equal

Blackinton Nametags or 

Equal

Embroidery/Badge

s/Collar 

Insignia/Patches/ 

Nametags

2 1/2" X 1/2" VHB A2450 22.00$       
1 22.00$     38.00% 13.64$           Each

100
13.64$                 $1,364.00

3.1.16

3.1.16.1

Strong Clip on 

Recessed Badge 

Holder

Strong Clip on 

Recessed Badge Holder Miscellaneous

Strong Clip  Strong 807X0 27.50$       
1 27.50$     35.00% 17.88$           Each

100
17.88$                 $1,787.50

3.1.16.2 Flashlights Flashlights Miscellaneous

Flashlights Streamlight 88087 68.00$       
1 68.00$     44.00% 38.08$           Each

100
38.08$                 $3,808.00

3.1.16.3

Safety/Shooting 

Glasses

Safety/Shooting 

Glasses Miscellaneous

Glasses -$           

1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each

100

No Bid No Bid

3.1.16.4 Ear Protection Ear Protection Miscellaneous

Miscellaneous



Ear Protection -$           
1 -$        0.00% No Bid Each

100
No Bid No Bid

3.1.16.5 First Aid Kits First Aid Kits Miscellaneous

Trauma Kits

North American Rescue 

80-0542 209.99$      
1 209.99$   20.00% 167.99$         Each

100
167.99$               $16,799.20

Personal Kits

North American Rescue 

80-0890 88.99$       
1 88.99$     20.00% 71.19$           Each

100
71.19$                 $7,119.20

-$                                 

3.1.1

3.1.2

3.1.3

3.1.4 Tact Squad, 

3.1.5

3.1.6 Slate Solutions, Armor Express

3.1.7

3.1.8

3.1.9 Damascus, High Speed Gear

3.1.10

3.1.11 Streamlight, Nightstick, Aimpoint, others

3.1.12

3.1.13

3.1.14

3.1.15 VHB Blackinton products only. No Emboidery. No Patches. 

3.1.16

Name:
Address:

Phone No:
Fax No:
Email 

Address:
Authorized 

Signature:

jsizemore@danasafetysupply.com

Bidder/Vendor Information:

Dana Safety Supply, Inc

7335 Lockport PL

Lorton, VA 22079

703-569-4400

N/A

Jackets 0.00%

Embroidery/Badges/Collar 

Insignia/Patches/Nametags 38.00%

Miscellaneous 20.00%

Weapon Accessories 20.00%

Ties 0.00%

Hats/caps 0.00%

Batons 29.00%

Tactical Equipment 20.00%

Less Lethal 32.00%

Footwear 0.00%

Ballistic Body Armor 35.00%

Handcuffs/Restrainst 38.00%

Duty Gear

39.10%

0.00%

39.10%

32.00%

Tactical Uniforms DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE

Tactical Field Uniform

Dress Uniform

Casual Clothing

Overall Total Cost:

Failure to use this form may result in disqualification

List of Discount Percentages:

(Use additional sheets if needed for number of discount percentages being offered.)


