
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
 



 



Date Printed: Mar 23, 2021 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 843608

Solicitation Description: Addendum No. 2
Propane & Diesel

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2021-03-23 13:30 SR 0606 ESR03222100000006469 1

VENDOR

000000186698
FERRELLGAS LP

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0606 HSE2100000003

Total Bid: 2.5 Response Date: 2021-03-22 Response Time: 17:55:15

Comments: Please see attached Exceptions Sheet

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
David H Pauline
304-558-0067
david.h.pauline@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Propane 1.00000 EA 2.500000 2.50

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
15100000    

Commodity Line Comments: Please see attached Exceptions Sheet

Extended Description:

Propane

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Diesel 1.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
15100000    

Commodity Line Comments: Ferrellgas does not supply diesel.

Extended Description:

Diesel



Ferrellgas Exceptions To Solicitation  

CRFQ-0606-HSE2100000003-2 

 

- Addendum 2 Q2. A2  

o Ferrellgas will not provide a bulldozer, snowplow, tow vehicle, 4x4 

vehicle, or any other specialized equipment for filling. If there is 
extreme weather conditions and we are not able to safely access a 

site, we will not be able to fill until weather conditions improve and 

our driver can safely drive the route. We will not be penalized for 
delayed deliveries due to weather conditions.  

 

o We offer smart fill tank monitors for remote location tanks to ensure 

we monitor their level and don’t allow them to drop below 35%. This 

can be requested on a site by site basis. The cost of a smart fill 
monitor will be: 

 

 Install Fee: $99.99/per monitor install 

 Monthly Fee: $9.99/month/per monitor 

 
- Addendum 2 Q4. A4 

o Because we were not able to obtain a list of tanks at each site 

noting which ones are government owned and which ones would 

need to be supplied our price per gallon is based off all tanks being 

supplied by WVSIRN. If tanks need to be supplied then we will quote 
that on a case by case basis.  

o All tanks must be brought down to a safe filling location by WV SIRN 

Employees if the tank is located atop a hill or other spot that we 
cannot safely reach. Because we were not given a specific site list 

with addresses, we cannot say at this time which sites this will apply 

to, it would be determined on a case by case basis.  

 

 

 

 

Continued on next page 

 



- Pricing 

o Ferrellgas’ pricing offer is based on delivering to Customer Owned 

Tanks. If the tanks are not owned by SIRN then a letter by the tank 

owner must be sent to Ferrellgas authorizing us to fill the tank.  

 

o If tanks need to be supplied, the installation and cost of tank will be 

determined on a case by case basis.  

 

 

 

- Additional Fees 

o Each delivery with have the following fees in addition to the price 
per gallon: 

 Hazmat $15.99/delivery 

 Fuel Surcharge $6.99/delivery 

 

o Same Day Fill Fee in addition to price per gallon 
 $200.00/delivery 

 

- No Bid Sites 

o Per Page 24, Specification, Item 1 – “Vendors may bid on any or all 

site locations”. Ferrellgas will not be bidding on the following 
propane sites/district: 

 All of District 1 

 All of District 2 

 All of District 3 

 District 4 Sites:  

• Cadell, Harmony Grove, Laurel Mountain, Sand Springs 

 District 5 Sites: 

• Berkley Springs, Blue Ridge, Buck Knob, Cacapon, North 

Mountain 2, Purslane, Romney, East River 

 All of District 6 

 District 10 Sites: 

• Kopperston, Panther 

o Ferrellgas does not provide Diesel 



Date Printed: Mar 15, 2021 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020/05

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Centralized Request for Quote

Fuels

Proc Folder: 843608 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Addendum No. 2

Propane & Diesel
Addendum No. 2

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version

2021-03-15 2021-03-23     13:30 CRFQ     0606     HSE2100000003 4

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

BID CLERK
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON ST E

CHARLESTON          WV     25305

US

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code:

Vendor Name :

Address :

Street :

City :

State : Country : Zip :

Principal Contact :

Vendor Contact Phone: Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
David H Pauline
304-558-0067
david.h.pauline@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X FEIN# DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

00000186698
Ferrellgas, LP

7500 College Blvd

Suite 1000

Overland Park

KS USA 66210

Bailee Matthews

913-661-1540

43-1698481 3/22/2021
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ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
Addendum No. 2

1. To respond vendor questions that are attached.

2. Bid opening remains on 3/23/2021 at 1:30pm EST.

No other changes.

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT
BLDG 1 RM EB80
1900 KANAWHA BLVD E
CHARLESTON WV     25305-0360
US

DIVISION OF EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT
2403 FAIRLAWN AVENUE

DUNBAR WV     25064
US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 Propane 1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

15100000

Extended Description:
Propane

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT
BLDG 1 RM EB80
1900 KANAWHA BLVD E
CHARLESTON WV     25305-0360
US

DIVISION OF EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT
2403 FAIRLAWN AVENUE

DUNBAR WV     25064
US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 Diesel 1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

15100000

Extended Description:
Diesel

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS
Line Event Event Date
1 Technical Questions due 2 pm 2021-03-15



Document Phase Document Description Page 
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HSE2100000003 Final Addendum No. 2

Propane & Diesel



00000186698
Ferrellgas, LP

7500 College Blvd
Suite 1000

Overland Park
KS USA 66210

Bailee Matthews
913-661-1540

43-1698481 3/22/2021













































Bailee Matthews, Government Bid Analyst

Bailee Matthews, Government Bid Analyst

7500 College Blvd Suite 1000 Overland Park KS 66210

913-661-1540 - No fax

governmentbids@ferrellgas.com

Ferrellgas, LP

Bailee Matthews, Government Bid Analyst

3/22/2021

913-661-1540 - No fax

















Bailee Matthews
913-661-1540

N/A
governmentbids@ferrellgas.com



Please see attached pricing excel file with com
pleted details. 











Ferrellgas, LP

3/22/2021

Kansas

Johnson

22 March 21
6-30 24



00000186698

Ferrellgas, LP

7500 College Blvd

Suite 1000

Overland Park

KS USA 66210
Bailee Matthews

913-661-1540

43-1698481 3/22/2021









X

Ferrellgas, LP

3/22/2021





Ferrellgas, LP
7500 College Blvd 

Overland Park

KS USA 66210

Bailee Matthews 

913-661-1540

Suite 1000

00000186698

43-1698481 3/22/2021











X

Ferrellgas, LP

3/22/2021





DISTRICT ITEM
FUEL 

TYPE

TERMINAL LOCATION 

FUEL IS TO BE PULLED 

FROM

Unit of 

Measure
Quantity

 OPIS Pricing For 

Week Of  

3/1/2021  

Fixed Firm Markup 

Per  Gallon From 

OPIS 

Total Pricing Per 

Gallon
Extended Total Price

1 3.1.1 Propane
No Bid

Gallon 18,000 -$                           -$                                  -$                           
-$                                

3.1.2
Diesel 

Fuel No Bid
Gallon 5,000 -$                           -$                                  -$                           

-$                                

2 3.1.1 Propane
No Bid

Gallon 18,000 -$                           -$                                  -$                           
-$                                

3.1.2
Diesel 

Fuel No Bid
Gallon 5,000 -$                           -$                                  -$                           

-$                                

3 3.1.1 Propane
No Bid

Gallon 18,000 -$                           -$                                  -$                           
-$                                

3.1.2
Diesel 

Fuel No Bid
Gallon 5,000 -$                           -$                                  -$                           

-$                                

4 3.1.1 Propane
Partial Bid - Greensburg

Gallon 18,000
1.25678

2.50$                                3.76$                         
67,622.04$                   

3.1.2
Diesel 

Fuel No Bid
Gallon 5,000 -$                           -$                                  -$                           

-$                                

5 3.1.1 Propane
Partial Bid - Greensburg

Gallon 18,000
1.25678

2.50$                                3.76$                         
67,622.04$                   

3.1.2
Diesel 

Fuel No Bid
Gallon 5,000 -$                           -$                                  -$                           

-$                                

6 3.1.1 Propane
No Bid

Gallon 18,000 -$                           -$                                  -$                           
-$                                

3.1.2
Diesel 

Fuel No Bid
Gallon 5,000 -$                           -$                                  -$                           

-$                                

7 3.1.1 Propane
Greensburg

Gallon 18,000
1.25678

2.50$                                3.76$                         
67,622.04$                   

3.1.2
Diesel 

Fuel No Bid
Gallon 5,000 -$                           -$                                  -$                           

-$                                

8 3.1.1 Propane
Greensburg

Gallon 18,000
1.25678

2.50$                                3.76$                         
67,622.04$                   

CRFQ HSE21*3 - EXHIBIT A - Propane and Diesel Fuel



3.1.2
Diesel 

Fuel No Bid
Gallon 5,000 -$                           -$                                  -$                           

-$                                

9 3.1.1 Propane
Greensburg

Gallon 18,000
1.25678

2.50$                                3.76$                         
67,622.04$                   

3.1.2
Diesel 

Fuel No Bid
Gallon 5,000 -$                           -$                                  -$                           

-$                                

10 3.1.1 Propane
Partial Bid - Greensburg

Gallon 18,000
1.25678

2.50$                                3.76$                         
67,622.04$                   

3.1.2
Diesel 

Fuel No Bid
Gallon 5,000 -$                           -$                                  -$                           

-$                                

405,732.24$                 

OPIS pricing for week of 3-1-2021 is for bidding purposes only! Weekly OPIS pricing will vary!

Total for District(s) Bid

Vendor Name: Ferrellgas, LP

Phone Number: 913-661-1540

Signature: Bailee Matthews SEE EXCEPTIONS FORM

Email Address: governmentbids@Ferrellgas.com

Vendor Address: 7500 College Blvd Suite 1000 Overland Park KS 66210

Fax Number: N/A
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