
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 802451

Solicitation Description: Addendum No. 1 -Cellebrite Software for WV Fusion Ctr.

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2020-12-23 13:30 SR 0601 ESR12232000000004527 1

VENDOR

VS0000020628
AXELLIANT LLC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0601 MAP2100000002

Total Bid: 37836.800000000002910383045673370361328125Response Date: 2020-12-23 Response Time: 13:19:12

Comments: Please note that the acceptable mode of payment is Net 30.

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
David H Pauline
304-558-0067
david.h.pauline@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Contract Item #1: Cellebrite Training Course, 

or Equal.
1.00000 EA 3368.960000 3368.96

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43232600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:

3.1.1 Contract Item #1: Cellebrite Certified Operator and Cellebrite Certified Physical Analyst Training Course, or Equal.
3.1.1.1	The Vendor must provide an estimated quantity of one (1) Cellebrite Certified Operator and Cellebrite Certified Physical Analyst Training, 
Product Code: OLT-OD CCO+CCPA, or Equal.
See attached documentation for further details.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Opt Renew Y2 Contract Item #1: Cellebrite 

Training Course
1.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43232600    

Commodity Line Comments: Unfortunately, Cellebrite is not able to offer option year pricing for these products at this time.

Extended Description:

3.1.1 Contract Item #1: Cellebrite Certified Operator and Cellebrite Certified Physical Analyst Training Course, or Equal.
3.1.1.1 The Vendor must provide an estimated quantity of one (1) Cellebrite Certified Operator and Cellebrite Certified Physical Analyst Training, 
Product Code: OLT-OD CCO+CCPA, or Equal.
See attached documentation for further details.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Opt Renew Y3 Contract Item #1: Cellebrite 

Training Course
1.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43232600    

Commodity Line Comments: Unfortunately, Cellebrite is not able to offer option year pricing for these products at this time.

Extended Description:

3.1.1 Contract Item #1: Cellebrite Certified Operator and Cellebrite Certified Physical Analyst Training Course, or Equal.
3.1.1.1 The Vendor must provide an estimated quantity of one (1) Cellebrite Certified Operator and Cellebrite Certified Physical Analyst Training, 
Product Code: OLT-OD CCO+CCPA, or Equal.
See attached documentation for further details.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Opt Renew Y4 Contract Item #1: Cellebrite 

Training Course
1.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43232600    

Commodity Line Comments: Unfortunately, Cellebrite is not able to offer option year pricing for these products at this time.

Extended Description:

3.1.1 Contract Item #1: Cellebrite Certified Operator and Cellebrite Certified Physical Analyst Training Course, or Equal.
3.1.1.1 The Vendor must provide an estimated quantity of one (1) Cellebrite Certified Operator and Cellebrite Certified Physical Analyst Training, 
Product Code: OLT-OD CCO+CCPA, or Equal.
See attached documentation for further details.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Contract Item #2: UFED 4PC Pro Series CLX 1.00000 EA 19261.440000 19261.44

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43232600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:

3.1.2 Contract Item #2: UFED 4PC Pro Series CLX, or Equal.
3.1.2.1 The Vendor must provide an estimated quantity of one (1) UFED 4PC Pro Series CLX, Product Code: B-TRD-03-028, or Equal.
See attached documentation for further details.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Opt Renew Y2 Contract Item #2: UFED 4PC 

Pro Series CLX
1.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43232600    

Commodity Line Comments: Unfortunately, Cellebrite is not able to offer option year pricing for these products at this time.

Extended Description:

3.1.2 Contract Item #2: UFED 4PC Pro Series CLX, or Equal.
3.1.2.1 The Vendor must provide an estimated quantity of one (1) UFED 4PC Pro Series CLX, Product Code: B-TRD-03-028, or Equal.
See attached documentation for further details.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Opt Renew Y3 Contract Item #2: UFED 4PC 

Pro Series CLX
1.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43232600    

Commodity Line Comments: Unfortunately, Cellebrite is not able to offer option year pricing for these products at this time.

Extended Description:

3.1.2 Contract Item #2: UFED 4PC Pro Series CLX, or Equal.
3.1.2.1 The Vendor must provide an estimated quantity of one (1) UFED 4PC Pro Series CLX, Product Code: B-TRD-03-028, or Equal.
See attached documentation for further details.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Opt Renew Y4 Contract Item #2: UFED 4PC 

Pro Series CLX
1.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43232600    

Commodity Line Comments: Unfortunately, Cellebrite is not able to offer option year pricing for these products at this time.

Extended Description:

3.1.2 Contract Item #2: UFED 4PC Pro Series CLX, or Equal.
3.1.2.1 The Vendor must provide an estimated quantity of one (1) UFED 4PC Pro Series CLX, Product Code: B-TRD-03-028, or Equal.
See attached documentation for further details.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Contract Item #3: Cellebrite Annual License, 

or Equal.
1.00000 YR 15206.400000 15206.40

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43232600    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:

3.1.3 Contract Item #3: Cellebrite Advanced Services (CAS) Unlock Annual Subscription 2 Concurrent Licenses, or Equal.
3.1.3.1 The Vendor must provide an estimated quantity of one (1) Cellebrite Advanced Services (CAS) Unlock Annual Subscription 2 Concurrent 
Licenses: Product Code B-AIS-02-061, or Equal, for one (1) year from the date of award.
See attached documentation for further details.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 Optional Renewal Year 2 of Contract Item #3 1.00000 YR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43232600    

Commodity Line Comments: Unfortunately, Cellebrite is not able to offer option year pricing for these products at this time.

Extended Description:

3.1.3 Contract Item #3: Cellebrite Advanced Services (CAS) Unlock Annual Subscription 2 Concurrent Licenses, or Equal.
3.1.3.1 The Vendor must provide an estimated quantity of one (1) Cellebrite Advanced Services (CAS) Unlock Annual Subscription 2 Concurrent 
Licenses: Product Code B-AIS-02-061, or Equal, for one (1) year from the date of award.
See attached documentation for further details.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 Optional Renewal Year 3 of Contract Item #3 1.00000 YR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43232600    

Commodity Line Comments: Unfortunately, Cellebrite is not able to offer option year pricing for these products at this time.

Extended Description:

3.1.3 Contract Item #3: Cellebrite Advanced Services (CAS) Unlock Annual Subscription 2 Concurrent Licenses, or Equal.
3.1.3.1 The Vendor must provide an estimated quantity of one (1) Cellebrite Advanced Services (CAS) Unlock Annual Subscription 2 Concurrent 
Licenses: Product Code B-AIS-02-061, or Equal, for one (1) year from the date of award.
See attached documentation for further details.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 Optional Renewal Year 4 of Contract Item #3 1.00000 YR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
43232600    

Commodity Line Comments: Unfortunately, Cellebrite is not able to offer option year pricing for these products at this time.

Extended Description:

3.1.3 Contract Item #3: Cellebrite Advanced Services (CAS) Unlock Annual Subscription 2 Concurrent Licenses, or Equal.
3.1.3.1 The Vendor must provide an estimated quantity of one (1) Cellebrite Advanced Services (CAS) Unlock Annual Subscription 2 Concurrent 
Licenses: Product Code B-AIS-02-061, or Equal, for one (1) year from the date of award.
See attached documentation for further details.



VS0000020628

Axelliant LLC

21250 Hawthorne BLVD, Suite 500

Torrance

CA US 90503

Shahzad Munawwar

424 535-1018

84-2165924 12/22/2020



Cellebrite As Specified B-TRN-03-004

$3,368.96 $3,368.96

No Bid           No Bid



No Bid             No Bid

No Bid           No Bid



Cellebrite As Specified B-TRD-03-028

No Bid           No Bid

$19,261.44 $19,261.44



No Bid           No Bid

No Bid           No Bid



Cellebrite As Specified B-AIS-02-061

No Bid           No Bid

$15,206.40 $15,206.40



No Bid           No Bid

No Bid           No Bid











































Axelliant LLC

Manager Public Sector Sales

21250 Hawthorne BLVD, Suite 500, Torrance, CA, 90503

424 535-1018/ 310-375-8493

bidteam@axelliant.com

Axelliant LLC

Shahzad Munawwar - Chief Operating Officer

12/22/2020

Phone: 310-920-1120, Fax: 310-375-8493













Ali Abrar

424 535-1018

bidteam@axelliant.com

310-375-8493



Axelliant LLC
21250 Hawthorne BLVD, Suite 500 
Torrance, CA, 90503, 
424 535-1018
bidteam@axelliant.com

12/22/2020

$3,368.96

$19,261.44
$15,206.40

$37,836.80



Axelliant LLC

12/22/2020

CA

Los Angeles

22 December 20

Please note that we are unable to get it notarized due to 
Covid, we request you to waive this requirement





VS0000020628

Axelliant LLC

21250 Hawthorne BLVD, Suite 500

Torrance

CA US 90503

Shahzad Munawwar

424 535-1018

84-2165924 12/23/2020



Cellebrite CCO + CCPA Training Course 
Cellebrite Inc. - B-TRN-03-004 B-TRN-03-004

$3,368.96 $3,368.96



No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid



Cellebrite
UFED 4PC Pro Series CLX 
Cellebrite Inc. - B-TRD-03-028 B-TRD-03-028

No Bid No Bid

$19,261.44 $19,261.44



No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid



Cellebrite B-AIS-02-061

No Bid No Bid

CAS Unlock Annual Subscription - 2 Concurrent 
Licenses, Cellebrite Inc. - B-AIS-02-061

$15,206.40 $15,206.40



No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid



No Bid No Bid







Axelliant LLC

12/23/2020



Section Description Manufacturer and Model if Bidding "or Equal" products Unit of Measure Estimated Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost

3.1.1 Contract Item #1: Cellebrite Certified Operator and Cellebrite 
Certified Physical Analyst Training Course, or Equal. EA 1

3.1.2 Contract Item #2: UFED 4PC Pro Series CLX, or Equal. EA 1

3.1.3 Contract Item #3: Cellebrite Advanced Services (CAS) Unlock 
Annual Subscription 2 Concurrent Licenses, or Equal. EA 1

3.1.1
Optional Renewal Year 2 of Contract Item #1: Cellebrite 
Certified Operator and Cellebrite Certified Physical Analyst 
Training Course, or Equal.

EA 1 0.00

3.1.2 Optional Renewal Year 2 of Contract Item #2: UFED 4PC 
Pro Series CLX, or Equal. EA 1 0.00

3.1.3
Optional Renewal Year 2 of Contract Item #3: Cellebrite 
Advanced Services (CAS) Unlock Annual Subscription 2 
Concurrent Licenses, or Equal.

EA 1 0.00

3.1.1
Optional Renewal Year 3 of Contract Item #1: Cellebrite 
Certified Operator and Cellebrite Certified Physical Analyst 
Training Course, or Equal.

EA 1 0.00

3.1.2 Optional Renewal Year 3 of Contract Item #2: UFED 4PC 
Pro Series CLX, or Equal. EA 1 0.00

3.1.3
Optional Renewal Year 3 of Contract Item #3: Cellebrite 
Advanced Services (CAS) Unlock Annual Subscription 2 
Concurrent Licenses, or Equal.

EA 1 0.00

3.1.1
Optional Renewal Year 4 of Contract Item #1: Cellebrite 
Certified Operator and Cellebrite Certified Physical Analyst 
Training Course, or Equal.

EA 1 0.00

3.1.2 Optional Renewal Year 4 of Contract Item #2: UFED 4PC 
Pro Series CLX, or Equal. EA 1 0.00

3.1.3
Optional Renewal Year 4 of Contract Item #3: Cellebrite 
Advanced Services (CAS) Unlock Annual Subscription 2 
Concurrent Licenses, or Equal.

EA 1 0.00

Vendor Name:

Address:

City, St. Zip:

Phone No.:

Email Address:

Date:Vendor Signature:

EXHIBIT A – Pricing Page - CRFQ MAP21*2
Digital Data Extraction and Analyzers

Overall Total Cost -$                                        

Please note: This information is being captured for auditing purposes.
Contract will be evaluated on all lines but only awarded on first year. Renewal options for years 2, 3, and 4 will be initiated by the Agency, agreed to by the Vendor and processed by the WV Purchasing Division as 
Change Orders for subsequent years.
Any product or service not on the Agency provided Cost Sheet will not be allowable. The state cannot accept alternate pricing pages, failure to use Exhibit A Cost Sheet could lead to disqualification of vendors bid. 

Vendor should type or electronically enter the information into the Pricing Page to prevent errors in the evaluation.

BIDDER /VENDOR INFORMATION:

Year 1 Pricing

Optional Renewal Year 2 Pricing

Optional Renewal Year 3 Pricing

Optional Renewal Year 4 Pricing

Quantities listed herein are for bid evaluation purposes; no guarantee of any actual order quantities should be implied.

Axelliant LLC

21250 Hawthorne BLVD, Suite 500 

Torrance, CA, 90503, 

bidteam@axelliant.com

424 535-1018

12/22/2020

B-TRN-03-004

B-TRD-03-028

B-AIS-02-061

$3,368.96

$19,261.44

$15,206.40 $15,206.40

$19,261.44

$3,368.96

Unfortunately, Cellebrite is not able to offer option year 
pricing for these products at this time. 

Unfortunately, Cellebrite is not able to offer option year 
pricing for these products at this time. 

Unfortunately, Cellebrite is not able to offer option year 
pricing for these products at this time. 

$37,836.80
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