
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Proc Folder :

Solicitation Description :

Proc Type :

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

Solicitation Response

Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Charleston, WV 25305-0130
Post Office Box 50130

State of West Virginia

677076

ADDENDUM 2 ASPHALT - MAT. AND PICKUP BY WVDOH  (6620C037)

Central Master Agreement

2020-01-30

13:30:00

SR 0803 ESR01292000000004449 1

 VENDOR

000000197898

W L CONSTRUCTION & PAVING INC

Comments:

Total Bid : Response Date: Response Time:Total Bid : 

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2000000108

$0.00 2020-01-29 12:06:18

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001

Crystal G Hustead

(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.hustead@wv.gov
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

1 ASPHAT MATERIALS AND PICKUP
BY WVDOH

0.00000 EA $0.000000 $0.00

30121601

ASPHALT - MATERIALS AND PICKUP BY WVDOH PER THE ATTACHED PRICING PAGES/E-CATALOG
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1-A Clearbrook Plant 311 1-A Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5
1-B Clearbrook Plant 311 1-B Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
1-C Clearbrook Plant 311 1-C Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5
1-D Clearbrook Plant 311 1-D Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5
1-E Clearbrook Plant 311 1-E Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
1-F Clearbrook Plant 311 1-F Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
1-G Clearbrook Plant 311 1-G Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
1-H Clearbrook Plant 311 1-H Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5
1-I Clearbrook Plant 311 1-I Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
1-J Clearbrook Plant 311 1-J Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
1-K Clearbrook Plant 311 1-K Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
1-L Clearbrook Plant 311 1-L Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
1-M Clearbrook Plant 311 1-M Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
1-N Clearbrook Plant 311 1-N Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
1-O Clearbrook Plant 311 1-O Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
1-OA Clearbrook Plant 311 1-OA Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
1-OB Clearbrook Plant 311 1-OB Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
1-P Clearbrook Plant 311 1-P Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
1-Q Clearbrook Plant 311 1-Q Asphalt District 1 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5

1-R Clearbrook Plant 311 1-R Asphalt District 1 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5
1-AQ1 Clearbrook Plant 311 1-AQ1 Asphalt District 1 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5
1-AQ2 Clearbrook Plant 311 1-AQ2 Asphalt District 1 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
2-A Clearbrook Plant 311 2-A Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5
2-B Clearbrook Plant 311 2-B Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
2-C Clearbrook Plant 311 2-C Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5
2-D Clearbrook Plant 311 2-D Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5
2-E Clearbrook Plant 311 2-E Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
2-F Clearbrook Plant 311 2-F Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
2-G Clearbrook Plant 311 2-G Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
2-H Clearbrook Plant 311 2-H Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5
2-I Clearbrook Plant 311 2-I Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
2-J Clearbrook Plant 311 2-J Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
2-K Clearbrook Plant 311 2-K Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
2-L Clearbrook Plant 311 2-L Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
2-M Clearbrook Plant 311 2-M Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
2-N Clearbrook Plant 311 2-N Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
2-O Clearbrook Plant 311 2-O Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
2-OA Clearbrook Plant 311 2-OA Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
2-OB Clearbrook Plant 311 2-OB Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
2-P Clearbrook Plant 311 2-P Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
2-Q Clearbrook Plant 311 2-Q Asphalt District 2 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5
2-R Clearbrook Plant 311 2-R Asphalt District 2 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5
2-AQ1 Clearbrook Plant 311 2-AQ1 Asphalt District 2 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5
2-AQ2 Clearbrook Plant 311 2-AQ2 Asphalt District 2 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
3-A Clearbrook Plant 311 3-A Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5

REVISED 1/24/2020
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3-B Clearbrook Plant 311 3-B Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
3-C Clearbrook Plant 311 3-C Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5
3-D Clearbrook Plant 311 3-D Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5
3-E Clearbrook Plant 311 3-E Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
3-F Clearbrook Plant 311 3-F Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
3-G Clearbrook Plant 311 3-G Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
3-H Clearbrook Plant 311 3-H Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5
3-I Clearbrook Plant 311 3-I Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
3-J Clearbrook Plant 311 3-J Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
3-K Clearbrook Plant 311 3-K Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
3-L Clearbrook Plant 311 3-L Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
3-M Clearbrook Plant 311 3-M Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
3-N Clearbrook Plant 311 3-N Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
3-O Clearbrook Plant 311 3-O Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
3-OA Clearbrook Plant 311 3-OA Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
3-OB Clearbrook Plant 311 3-OB Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
3-P Clearbrook Plant 311 3-P Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
3-Q Clearbrook Plant 311 3-Q Asphalt District 3 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5
3-R Clearbrook Plant 311 3-R Asphalt District 3 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5
3-AQ1 Clearbrook Plant 311 3-AQ1 Asphalt District 3 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5
3-AQ2 Clearbrook Plant 311 3-AQ2 Asphalt District 3 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
4-A Clearbrook Plant 311 4-A Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5
4-B Clearbrook Plant 311 4-B Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
4-C Clearbrook Plant 311 4-C Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5
4-D Clearbrook Plant 311 4-D Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5
4-E Clearbrook Plant 311 4-E Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
4-F Clearbrook Plant 311 4-F Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
4-G Clearbrook Plant 311 4-G Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
4-H Clearbrook Plant 311 4-H Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5
4-I Clearbrook Plant 311 4-I Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
4-J Clearbrook Plant 311 4-J Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
4-K Clearbrook Plant 311 4-K Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
4-L Clearbrook Plant 311 4-L Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
4-M Clearbrook Plant 311 4-M Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
4-N Clearbrook Plant 311 4-N Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
4-O Clearbrook Plant 311 4-O Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
4-OA Clearbrook Plant 311 4-OA Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
4-OB Clearbrook Plant 311 4-OB Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
4-P Clearbrook Plant 311 4-P Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
4-Q Clearbrook Plant 311 4-Q Asphalt District 4 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5
4-R Clearbrook Plant 311 4-R Asphalt District 4 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5
4-AQ1 Clearbrook Plant 311 4-AQ1 Asphalt District 4 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5
4-AQ2 Clearbrook Plant 311 4-AQ2 Asphalt District 4 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
5-A Clearbrook Plant 311 5-A Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON 48.58 5
5-B Clearbrook Plant 311 5-B Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON 57.86 5
5-C Clearbrook Plant 311 5-C Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON 54.17 5
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5-D Clearbrook Plant 311 5-D Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON 54.17 5
5-E Clearbrook Plant 311 5-E Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON 54.17 5
5-F Clearbrook Plant 311 5-F Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON 56.96 5
5-G Clearbrook Plant 311 5-G Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON 60.30 5
5-H Clearbrook Plant 311 5-H Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON 61.89 5
5-I Clearbrook Plant 311 5-I Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON 69.10 5
5-J Clearbrook Plant 311 5-J Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON 61.89 5
5-K Clearbrook Plant 311 5-K Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON 66.30 5
5-L Clearbrook Plant 311 5-L Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
5-M Clearbrook Plant 311 5-M Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
5-N Clearbrook Plant 311 5-N Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
5-O Clearbrook Plant 311 5-O Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
5-OA Clearbrook Plant 311 5-OA Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON 68.28 5
5-OB Clearbrook Plant 311 5-OB Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON 79.31 5
5-P Clearbrook Plant 311 5-P Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Plant Run TON 61.89 5
5-Q Clearbrook Plant 311 5-Q Asphalt District 5 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON 5.00 5
5-R Clearbrook Plant 311 5-R Asphalt District 5 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON 10.00 5
5-AQ1 Clearbrook Plant 311 5-AQ1 Asphalt District 5 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY 4500.00 5
5-AQ2 Clearbrook Plant 311 5-AQ2 Asphalt District 5 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY 1000.00 5
6-A Clearbrook Plant 311 6-A Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5
6-B Clearbrook Plant 311 6-B Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
6-C Clearbrook Plant 311 6-C Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5
6-D Clearbrook Plant 311 6-D Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5
6-E Clearbrook Plant 311 6-E Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
6-F Clearbrook Plant 311 6-F Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
6-G Clearbrook Plant 311 6-G Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
6-H Clearbrook Plant 311 6-H Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5
6-I Clearbrook Plant 311 6-I Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
6-J Clearbrook Plant 311 6-J Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
6-K Clearbrook Plant 311 6-K Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
6-L Clearbrook Plant 311 6-L Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
6-M Clearbrook Plant 311 6-M Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
6-N Clearbrook Plant 311 6-N Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
6-O Clearbrook Plant 311 6-O Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
6-OA Clearbrook Plant 311 6-OA Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
6-OB Clearbrook Plant 311 6-OB Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
6-P Clearbrook Plant 311 6-P Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
6-Q Clearbrook Plant 311 6-Q Asphalt District 6 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5
6-R Clearbrook Plant 311 6-R Asphalt District 6 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5
6-AQ1 Clearbrook Plant 311 6-AQ1 Asphalt District 6 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5
6-AQ2 Clearbrook Plant 311 6-AQ2 Asphalt District 6 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
7-A Clearbrook Plant 311 7-A Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5
7-B Clearbrook Plant 311 7-B Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
7-C Clearbrook Plant 311 7-C Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5
7-D Clearbrook Plant 311 7-D Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5
7-E Clearbrook Plant 311 7-E Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
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7-F Clearbrook Plant 311 7-F Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
7-G Clearbrook Plant 311 7-G Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
7-H Clearbrook Plant 311 7-H Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5
7-I Clearbrook Plant 311 7-I Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
7-J Clearbrook Plant 311 7-J Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
7-K Clearbrook Plant 311 7-K Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
7-L Clearbrook Plant 311 7-L Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
7-M Clearbrook Plant 311 7-M Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
7-N Clearbrook Plant 311 7-N Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
7-O Clearbrook Plant 311 7-O Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
7-OA Clearbrook Plant 311 7-OA Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
7-OB Clearbrook Plant 311 7-OB Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
7-P Clearbrook Plant 311 7-P Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
7-Q Clearbrook Plant 311 7-Q Asphalt District 7 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5
7-R Clearbrook Plant 311 7-R Asphalt District 7 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5
7-AQ1 Clearbrook Plant 311 7-AQ1 Asphalt District 7 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5
7-AQ2 Clearbrook Plant 311 7-AQ2 Asphalt District 7 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
8-A Clearbrook Plant 311 8-A Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5
8-B Clearbrook Plant 311 8-B Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
8-C Clearbrook Plant 311 8-C Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5
8-D Clearbrook Plant 311 8-D Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5
8-E Clearbrook Plant 311 8-E Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
8-F Clearbrook Plant 311 8-F Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
8-G Clearbrook Plant 311 8-G Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
8-H Clearbrook Plant 311 8-H Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5
8-I Clearbrook Plant 311 8-I Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
8-J Clearbrook Plant 311 8-J Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
8-K Clearbrook Plant 311 8-K Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
8-L Clearbrook Plant 311 8-L Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
8-M Clearbrook Plant 311 8-M Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
8-N Clearbrook Plant 311 8-N Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
8-O Clearbrook Plant 311 8-O Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
8-OA Clearbrook Plant 311 8-OA Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
8-OB Clearbrook Plant 311 8-OB Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
8-P Clearbrook Plant 311 8-P Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
8-Q Clearbrook Plant 311 8-Q Asphalt District 8 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5
8-R Clearbrook Plant 311 8-R Asphalt District 8 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5
8-AQ1 Clearbrook Plant 311 8-AQ1 Asphalt District 8 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5
8-AQ2 Clearbrook Plant 311 8-AQ2 Asphalt District 8 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
9-A Clearbrook Plant 311 9-A Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5
9-B Clearbrook Plant 311 9-B Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
9-C Clearbrook Plant 311 9-C Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5
9-D Clearbrook Plant 311 9-D Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5
9-E Clearbrook Plant 311 9-E Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
9-F Clearbrook Plant 311 9-F Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
9-G Clearbrook Plant 311 9-G Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
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9-H Clearbrook Plant 311 9-H Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5
9-I Clearbrook Plant 311 9-I Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
9-J Clearbrook Plant 311 9-J Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
9-K Clearbrook Plant 311 9-K Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
9-L Clearbrook Plant 311 9-L Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
9-M Clearbrook Plant 311 9-M Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
9-N Clearbrook Plant 311 9-N Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
9-O Clearbrook Plant 311 9-O Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
9-OA Clearbrook Plant 311 9-OA Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
9-OB Clearbrook Plant 311 9-OB Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
9-P Clearbrook Plant 311 9-P Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
9-Q Clearbrook Plant 311 9-Q Asphalt District 9 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5
9-R Clearbrook Plant 311 9-R Asphalt District 9 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5
9-AQ1 Clearbrook Plant 311 9-AQ1 Asphalt District 9 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5
9-AQ2 Clearbrook Plant 311 9-AQ2 Asphalt District 9 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
10-A Clearbrook Plant 311 10-A Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5
10-B Clearbrook Plant 311 10-B Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
10-C Clearbrook Plant 311 10-C Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5
10-D Clearbrook Plant 311 10-D Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5
10-E Clearbrook Plant 311 10-E Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
10-F Clearbrook Plant 311 10-F Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
10-G Clearbrook Plant 311 10-G Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
10-H Clearbrook Plant 311 10-H Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5
10-I Clearbrook Plant 311 10-I Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
10-J Clearbrook Plant 311 10-J Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
10-K Clearbrook Plant 311 10-K Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
10-L Clearbrook Plant 311 10-L Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
10-M Clearbrook Plant 311 10-M Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
10-N Clearbrook Plant 311 10-N Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
10-O Clearbrook Plant 311 10-O Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
10-OA Clearbrook Plant 311 10-OA Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
10-OB Clearbrook Plant 311 10-OB Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
10-P Clearbrook Plant 311 10-P Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
10-Q Clearbrook Plant 311 10-Q Asphalt District 10 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5
10-R Clearbrook Plant 311 10-R Asphalt District 10 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5
10-AQ1 Clearbrook Plant 311 10-AQ1 Asphalt District 10 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5
10-AQ2 Clearbrook Plant 311 10-AQ2 Asphalt District 10 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
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1-A Strasburg Plant 312 1-A Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5
1-B Strasburg Plant 312 1-B Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
1-C Strasburg Plant 312 1-C Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5
1-D Strasburg Plant 312 1-D Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5
1-E Strasburg Plant 312 1-E Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
1-F Strasburg Plant 312 1-F Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
1-G Strasburg Plant 312 1-G Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
1-H Strasburg Plant 312 1-H Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5
1-I Strasburg Plant 312 1-I Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
1-J Strasburg Plant 312 1-J Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
1-K Strasburg Plant 312 1-K Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
1-L Strasburg Plant 312 1-L Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
1-M Strasburg Plant 312 1-M Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
1-N Strasburg Plant 312 1-N Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
1-O Strasburg Plant 312 1-O Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
1-OA Strasburg Plant 312 1-OA Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
1-OB Strasburg Plant 312 1-OB Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
1-P Strasburg Plant 312 1-P Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
1-Q Strasburg Plant 312 1-Q Asphalt District 1 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5

1-R Strasburg Plant 312 1-R Asphalt District 1 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5
1-AQ1 Strasburg Plant 312 1-AQ1 Asphalt District 1 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5
1-AQ2 Strasburg Plant 312 1-AQ2 Asphalt District 1 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
2-A Strasburg Plant 312 2-A Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5
2-B Strasburg Plant 312 2-B Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
2-C Strasburg Plant 312 2-C Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5
2-D Strasburg Plant 312 2-D Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5
2-E Strasburg Plant 312 2-E Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
2-F Strasburg Plant 312 2-F Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
2-G Strasburg Plant 312 2-G Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
2-H Strasburg Plant 312 2-H Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5
2-I Strasburg Plant 312 2-I Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
2-J Strasburg Plant 312 2-J Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
2-K Strasburg Plant 312 2-K Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
2-L Strasburg Plant 312 2-L Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
2-M Strasburg Plant 312 2-M Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
2-N Strasburg Plant 312 2-N Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
2-O Strasburg Plant 312 2-O Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
2-OA Strasburg Plant 312 2-OA Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
2-OB Strasburg Plant 312 2-OB Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
2-P Strasburg Plant 312 2-P Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
2-Q Strasburg Plant 312 2-Q Asphalt District 2 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5
2-R Strasburg Plant 312 2-R Asphalt District 2 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5
2-AQ1 Strasburg Plant 312 2-AQ1 Asphalt District 2 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5
2-AQ2 Strasburg Plant 312 2-AQ2 Asphalt District 2 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
3-A Strasburg Plant 312 3-A Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5
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3-B Strasburg Plant 312 3-B Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
3-C Strasburg Plant 312 3-C Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5
3-D Strasburg Plant 312 3-D Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5
3-E Strasburg Plant 312 3-E Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
3-F Strasburg Plant 312 3-F Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
3-G Strasburg Plant 312 3-G Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
3-H Strasburg Plant 312 3-H Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5
3-I Strasburg Plant 312 3-I Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
3-J Strasburg Plant 312 3-J Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
3-K Strasburg Plant 312 3-K Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
3-L Strasburg Plant 312 3-L Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
3-M Strasburg Plant 312 3-M Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
3-N Strasburg Plant 312 3-N Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
3-O Strasburg Plant 312 3-O Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
3-OA Strasburg Plant 312 3-OA Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
3-OB Strasburg Plant 312 3-OB Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
3-P Strasburg Plant 312 3-P Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
3-Q Strasburg Plant 312 3-Q Asphalt District 3 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5
3-R Strasburg Plant 312 3-R Asphalt District 3 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5
3-AQ1 Strasburg Plant 312 3-AQ1 Asphalt District 3 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5
3-AQ2 Strasburg Plant 312 3-AQ2 Asphalt District 3 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
4-A Strasburg Plant 312 4-A Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5
4-B Strasburg Plant 312 4-B Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
4-C Strasburg Plant 312 4-C Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5
4-D Strasburg Plant 312 4-D Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5
4-E Strasburg Plant 312 4-E Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
4-F Strasburg Plant 312 4-F Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
4-G Strasburg Plant 312 4-G Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
4-H Strasburg Plant 312 4-H Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5
4-I Strasburg Plant 312 4-I Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
4-J Strasburg Plant 312 4-J Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
4-K Strasburg Plant 312 4-K Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
4-L Strasburg Plant 312 4-L Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
4-M Strasburg Plant 312 4-M Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
4-N Strasburg Plant 312 4-N Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
4-O Strasburg Plant 312 4-O Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
4-OA Strasburg Plant 312 4-OA Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
4-OB Strasburg Plant 312 4-OB Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
4-P Strasburg Plant 312 4-P Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
4-Q Strasburg Plant 312 4-Q Asphalt District 4 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5
4-R Strasburg Plant 312 4-R Asphalt District 4 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5
4-AQ1 Strasburg Plant 312 4-AQ1 Asphalt District 4 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5
4-AQ2 Strasburg Plant 312 4-AQ2 Asphalt District 4 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
5-A Strasburg Plant 312 5-A Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON 48.58 5
5-B Strasburg Plant 312 5-B Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON 57.86 5
5-C Strasburg Plant 312 5-C Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON 54.17 5
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5-D Strasburg Plant 312 5-D Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON 54.17 5
5-E Strasburg Plant 312 5-E Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON 54.17 5
5-F Strasburg Plant 312 5-F Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON 56.96 5
5-G Strasburg Plant 312 5-G Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON 60.30 5
5-H Strasburg Plant 312 5-H Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON 61.89 5
5-I Strasburg Plant 312 5-I Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON 69.10 5
5-J Strasburg Plant 312 5-J Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON 61.89 5
5-K Strasburg Plant 312 5-K Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON 66.30 5
5-L Strasburg Plant 312 5-L Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
5-M Strasburg Plant 312 5-M Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
5-N Strasburg Plant 312 5-N Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
5-O Strasburg Plant 312 5-O Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
5-OA Strasburg Plant 312 5-OA Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON 68.28 5
5-OB Strasburg Plant 312 5-OB Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON 79.31 5
5-P Strasburg Plant 312 5-P Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Plant Run TON 61.89 5
5-Q Strasburg Plant 312 5-Q Asphalt District 5 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON 5.00 5
5-R Strasburg Plant 312 5-R Asphalt District 5 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON 10.00 5
5-AQ1 Strasburg Plant 312 5-AQ1 Asphalt District 5 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY 4500.00 5
5-AQ2 Strasburg Plant 312 5-AQ2 Asphalt District 5 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY 1000.00 5
6-A Strasburg Plant 312 6-A Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5
6-B Strasburg Plant 312 6-B Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
6-C Strasburg Plant 312 6-C Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5
6-D Strasburg Plant 312 6-D Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5
6-E Strasburg Plant 312 6-E Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
6-F Strasburg Plant 312 6-F Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
6-G Strasburg Plant 312 6-G Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
6-H Strasburg Plant 312 6-H Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5
6-I Strasburg Plant 312 6-I Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
6-J Strasburg Plant 312 6-J Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
6-K Strasburg Plant 312 6-K Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
6-L Strasburg Plant 312 6-L Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
6-M Strasburg Plant 312 6-M Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
6-N Strasburg Plant 312 6-N Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
6-O Strasburg Plant 312 6-O Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
6-OA Strasburg Plant 312 6-OA Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
6-OB Strasburg Plant 312 6-OB Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
6-P Strasburg Plant 312 6-P Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
6-Q Strasburg Plant 312 6-Q Asphalt District 6 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5
6-R Strasburg Plant 312 6-R Asphalt District 6 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5
6-AQ1 Strasburg Plant 312 6-AQ1 Asphalt District 6 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5
6-AQ2 Strasburg Plant 312 6-AQ2 Asphalt District 6 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
7-A Strasburg Plant 312 7-A Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5
7-B Strasburg Plant 312 7-B Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
7-C Strasburg Plant 312 7-C Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5
7-D Strasburg Plant 312 7-D Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5
7-E Strasburg Plant 312 7-E Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
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7-F Strasburg Plant 312 7-F Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
7-G Strasburg Plant 312 7-G Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
7-H Strasburg Plant 312 7-H Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5
7-I Strasburg Plant 312 7-I Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
7-J Strasburg Plant 312 7-J Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
7-K Strasburg Plant 312 7-K Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
7-L Strasburg Plant 312 7-L Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
7-M Strasburg Plant 312 7-M Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
7-N Strasburg Plant 312 7-N Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
7-O Strasburg Plant 312 7-O Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
7-OA Strasburg Plant 312 7-OA Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
7-OB Strasburg Plant 312 7-OB Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
7-P Strasburg Plant 312 7-P Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
7-Q Strasburg Plant 312 7-Q Asphalt District 7 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5
7-R Strasburg Plant 312 7-R Asphalt District 7 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5
7-AQ1 Strasburg Plant 312 7-AQ1 Asphalt District 7 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5
7-AQ2 Strasburg Plant 312 7-AQ2 Asphalt District 7 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
8-A Strasburg Plant 312 8-A Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5
8-B Strasburg Plant 312 8-B Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
8-C Strasburg Plant 312 8-C Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5
8-D Strasburg Plant 312 8-D Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5
8-E Strasburg Plant 312 8-E Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
8-F Strasburg Plant 312 8-F Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
8-G Strasburg Plant 312 8-G Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
8-H Strasburg Plant 312 8-H Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5
8-I Strasburg Plant 312 8-I Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
8-J Strasburg Plant 312 8-J Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
8-K Strasburg Plant 312 8-K Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
8-L Strasburg Plant 312 8-L Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
8-M Strasburg Plant 312 8-M Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
8-N Strasburg Plant 312 8-N Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
8-O Strasburg Plant 312 8-O Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
8-OA Strasburg Plant 312 8-OA Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
8-OB Strasburg Plant 312 8-OB Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
8-P Strasburg Plant 312 8-P Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
8-Q Strasburg Plant 312 8-Q Asphalt District 8 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5
8-R Strasburg Plant 312 8-R Asphalt District 8 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5
8-AQ1 Strasburg Plant 312 8-AQ1 Asphalt District 8 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5
8-AQ2 Strasburg Plant 312 8-AQ2 Asphalt District 8 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
9-A Strasburg Plant 312 9-A Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5
9-B Strasburg Plant 312 9-B Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
9-C Strasburg Plant 312 9-C Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5
9-D Strasburg Plant 312 9-D Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5
9-E Strasburg Plant 312 9-E Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
9-F Strasburg Plant 312 9-F Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
9-G Strasburg Plant 312 9-G Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
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9-H Strasburg Plant 312 9-H Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5
9-I Strasburg Plant 312 9-I Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
9-J Strasburg Plant 312 9-J Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
9-K Strasburg Plant 312 9-K Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
9-L Strasburg Plant 312 9-L Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
9-M Strasburg Plant 312 9-M Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
9-N Strasburg Plant 312 9-N Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
9-O Strasburg Plant 312 9-O Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
9-OA Strasburg Plant 312 9-OA Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
9-OB Strasburg Plant 312 9-OB Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
9-P Strasburg Plant 312 9-P Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
9-Q Strasburg Plant 312 9-Q Asphalt District 9 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5
9-R Strasburg Plant 312 9-R Asphalt District 9 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5
9-AQ1 Strasburg Plant 312 9-AQ1 Asphalt District 9 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5
9-AQ2 Strasburg Plant 312 9-AQ2 Asphalt District 9 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
10-A Strasburg Plant 312 10-A Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5
10-B Strasburg Plant 312 10-B Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
10-C Strasburg Plant 312 10-C Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5
10-D Strasburg Plant 312 10-D Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5
10-E Strasburg Plant 312 10-E Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
10-F Strasburg Plant 312 10-F Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5
10-G Strasburg Plant 312 10-G Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
10-H Strasburg Plant 312 10-H Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5
10-I Strasburg Plant 312 10-I Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
10-J Strasburg Plant 312 10-J Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
10-K Strasburg Plant 312 10-K Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5
10-L Strasburg Plant 312 10-L Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
10-M Strasburg Plant 312 10-M Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
10-N Strasburg Plant 312 10-N Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
10-O Strasburg Plant 312 10-O Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5
10-OA Strasburg Plant 312 10-OA Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
10-OB Strasburg Plant 312 10-OB Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
10-P Strasburg Plant 312 10-P Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
10-Q Strasburg Plant 312 10-Q Asphalt District 10 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5
10-R Strasburg Plant 312 10-R Asphalt District 10 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5
10-AQ1 Strasburg Plant 312 10-AQ1 Asphalt District 10 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5
10-AQ2 Strasburg Plant 312 10-AQ2 Asphalt District 10 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
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INSURER B :

INSURER A :

NAIC #

NAME:
CONTACT

(A/C, No):
FAX

E-MAIL
ADDRESS:

PRODUCER

(A/C, No, Ext):
PHONE

INSURED

REVISION NUMBER:CERTIFICATE NUMBER:COVERAGES

IMPORTANT:  If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement.  A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW.  THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

OTHER:

(Per accident)

(Ea accident)

$

$

N / A

SUBR
WVD

ADDL
INSD

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED.  NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

$

$

$

$PROPERTY DAMAGE

BODILY INJURY (Per accident)

BODILY INJURY (Per person)

COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT

AUTOS ONLY

AUTOSAUTOS ONLY
NON-OWNED

SCHEDULEDOWNED

ANY AUTO

AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY

Y / N

WORKERS COMPENSATION
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY

OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED?
(Mandatory in NH)

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below
If yes, describe under

ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE

$

$

$

E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT

E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE

E.L. EACH ACCIDENT

ER
OTH-

STATUTE
PER

LIMITS(MM/DD/YYYY)
POLICY EXP

(MM/DD/YYYY)
POLICY EFF

POLICY NUMBERTYPE OF INSURANCELTR
INSR

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES  (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

EXCESS LIAB

UMBRELLA LIAB $EACH OCCURRENCE

$AGGREGATE

$

OCCUR

CLAIMS-MADE

DED RETENTION $

$PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG

$GENERAL AGGREGATE

$PERSONAL & ADV INJURY

$MED EXP (Any one person)

$EACH OCCURRENCE
DAMAGE TO RENTED

$PREMISES (Ea occurrence)

COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY

CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR

GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER:

POLICY
PRO-
JECT LOC

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE
DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)

CANCELLATION

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION.  All rights reserved.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD

HIRED
AUTOS ONLY

8/21/2019

Liberty Mutual Insurance Co. National Insurance East
2000 Westwood Dr.
Wausau, WI 54401 513-867-3822

www.LibertyMutual.com

Valerie Reece

Valerie Reece

Oldcastle.certs@LibertyMutual.com

W-L Construction & Paving, Inc. (223-STE)
2786 Martinsburg Pike
PO Box 339
Stephenson VA  22656

50692230

✓

✓

State of West Virginia is listed as additional insured with regards to the general liability and automobile liability policies, where required by

State of West Virginia
Purchasing Division
Division of Highways
Charleston WV  25305

RE:  2019 Purchase Orders

written contract.

2,000,000

250,000

50,000

2,000,000
2,000,000

2,000,000

2,000,000

A TB2-C81-004095-119 9/1/2019 9/1/2020✓

XCU Coverage Included
✓

✓ Primary/Non-Contributory

✓ Separation of Insured

✓

A AS2-C81-004095-129 9/1/2019 9/1/2020

✓
AS2-C81-054502-529 9/1/2019 9/1/2020A
Physical Damage only:
Comprehensive Ded $10,000
Collision Ded $10,000

N

Liberty Mutual Fire Insurance Company 23035

50692230 | LM_44 | 9/19-9/20 - Standard - GL 2/2, AL 2 only, Excess | Donna Smitala | 8/21/2019 12:03:10 PM (CDT) | Page 1 of 1





VENDOR NAME ______________________________________________________W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

If a Vendor will be supplying materials from multiple Plant Locations and ALL pricing is the same, ALL Plant

Locations can be listed on one Information Attachment Form and one bid submission is acceptable.

If a Vendor will be supplying materials from multiple Plant Locations, at varying prices, additional , separate

bid submissions must be submitted for each Plant Location bid.  Multple Plant Locations with varying prices,

Vendor's Plant Location:

Vendor's Plant Location:

Vendor's Plant Location:

Vendor's Plant Location:

866 Oranda Road

Strasburg, VA 22657

660 Quarry Lane

Clearbrook, VA 22624

Strasburg Plant 312

INFORMATION ATTACHMENT FORM

Vendor’s Storage Sites

Asphalt - Materials and Pickup by WVDOH Forces, ONLY

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.

shall be submitted on separate bid submissions.

Clearbrook Plant 311












