

Purchasing Divison 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia Request for Quotation 36 - Vehicles

Proc Folder: 644716

Doc Description: ADDENDUM_1: SBUS20 - VARIOUS SCHOOL BUSES -FY2020

Proc Type: Statewide MA (Open End)

Version Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No 2 2019-10-31 2019-11-18 CRFQ 0212 SWC2000000003 13:30:00

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

BID CLERK

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON ST E

CHARLESTON

wv

25305

WV FUNCTIONING DIVISION

2019 NOV 18 AM 10: 34

VENDOR

US

Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number:

Blue Bird Bus Sales of Pittsburgh, Inc. dba Blue Bird Bus Sales of West Virginia 5374 William Flynn Highway Gibsonia, PA 15044

724-898-2472

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Mark A Atkins (304) 558-2307

Signature X

mark.a.atkins@wv.gov

Jeffrey J. Pschirer

Vice President

School Bus Sales

FEIN# 25-1228073

DATE November 18, 2019

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Page: 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-001

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION:

ADDENDUM_1: Is issued for the following:
1. To move the bid opening date from 11/13/2019 to 11/18/2019 at 1:30pm EST.
2. To publish the Agency's response to the questions submitted by Vendors during the Technical Questioning period.

No other changes made.

The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids on behalf of the West Virginia Department of Education to establish an open-end contract for School Buses. The Contract may be utilized by West Virginia State agencies and all political subdivisions of the State in all 55 counties per

INVOJCE TO		SHIP TO	
ALL STATE AGENCIE VARIOUS LOCATION	ES IS AS INDICATED BY ORDER	STATE OF WEST VIE VARIOUS LOCATION	RGINIA NS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City	WV99999	No City	WV 99999
us		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
1	VARIOUS BUS UNITS	0.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
25101500				

Extended Description:

VARIOUS BUS UNITS

PLEASE SEE EXHIBIT B - PRICING PAGES ATTACHED:

Vendor shall enter pricing into the Exhibit_B Pricing Pages and must attach with bid. See section 18 of Instructions to Bidders for additional information.

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	A STATE OF THE STA
ALL STATE AGENCIE VARIOUS LOCATION	S AS INDICATED BY ORDER	STATE OF WEST VIR	GINIA S AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City	WV 99999	No City	WV 99999
us		us	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
2	DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV	0.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
78121603				
·				

Extended Description:

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV FOR EACH BUS UNITS

PLEASE SEE EXHIBIT B - PRICING PAGES ATTACHED

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS

Line **Event Date** 1 Technical Questions due by 10:00am EDT: 2019-10-29

Page: 2

SOLICITATION NUMBER: CRFQ 0212 SWC200000003 Addendum Number: 1

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as CRFQ 0212 SWC2000000003 ("Solicitation") to reflect the change(s) identified and described below.

Applicable Addendum Category:

[X]	Modify bid opening date and time
[]	Modify specifications of product or service being sough
[X]	Attachment of vendor questions and responses
[]	Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet
[]	Correction of error
[]	Other

Description of Modification to Solicitation:

1. To move the bid opening date from 11/13/2019 to 11/18/2019 at 1:30pm EST.

2. To publish the Agency's response to the questions submitted by Vendors during the Technical Questioning period.

No other changes made.

Additional Documentation: Documentation related to this Addendum (if any) has been included herewith as Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference.

Terms and Conditions:

- 1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in full force and effect.
- 2. Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by completing an Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. The addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

Technical Questions & Responses

	*
Q1.	Specification 3.1.4.2.2. Storage Compartment, we request that two (2) required storage compartments can be located on the same side of the bus in addition to one on each side. We have consistently requested this every year and it has always been accepted.
R1.	The two (2) required storage compartments can be located on the same side or either side of the bus, as long as the number of compartments and minimum requirements are met.
Q2.	Specification 3.1.4.2.5. Type A – Chain Box. Would it be correct to assume that "storage compartment" described in 3.1.4.2.2 and "chain box" are one in the same?
R2.	Yes
Q3.	Specification 3.1.4.2.10. Service Door. The service door emergency release on our Type "A" buses is located above the entrance door and can't be relocated. We are asking for an exception to this new requirement for Type "A".
R3.	The service door emergency release on Type "A" buses can be located below the windshield or above the entrance door.
Q4.	Specification West Virginia Minimum Requirements, page 13, Tow Hooks. We are asking that Type "A" buses are exempt from being required to have FRONT tow hooks. Both Ford and General Motors do not offer this item as an OEM buildable production option or as an accessory on the cutaway van chassis which we use to have our body's mounted on. Adding this as an after-market would void any warranty to OEM frame. National Standards (NCST) gives an exemption for this item.
R4.	Type "A" buses are exempt from having front tow hooks, only if it will void OEM warranty on bus frame.
Q5.	We would ask that the bid deadline be extended one week due to the NAPT conference this weekend.
R5.	Bid date has been moved to Monday, November 18, 2019 at 1:30 pm.

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM SOLICITATION NO.: CRFQ 0212 SWC2000000003

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received: (Check the box next to each addendum received)

[3	[]	Addendum No. 1	[]	Addendum No. 6
[]	Addendum No. 2	[]	Addendum No. 7
[]	Addendum No. 3	[]	Addendum No. 8
[]	Addendum No. 4	[]	Addendum No. 9
[]	Addendum No. 5	[]	Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. I further understand that that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral discussion held between Vendor's representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

Blue Bird Bus Sales of Pittsburgh, Inc.
dba Blue Bird Bus Sales of West Virginia

Company

Jeffrey J. Pschirer

Vice President School Bus Sales

Authorized Signature

November 18, 2019

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION CRFQ 0212 SWC2000000003 SWCSBUS20 FOR SCHOOL BUSES

7. MISCELLANEIOUS:

- 7.1 No Substitutions: Vendor shall supply only Desired Items submitted in response to the RFQ. Vendor shall not supply substitute items without Purchasing Division approval.
- 7.2 Vendor Supply: Vendor must carry sufficient inventory of the Desired Items being offered to fulfill its obligations under this Contract. By signing its bid, Vendor certifies that it can supply the Desired Items contained in its bid response.
- 7.3 Reports: Vendor shall provide quarterly reports and annual summaries to the Agency showing the Agency's items purchased, quantities of items purchased, and total dollar value of the items purchased. Vendor shall also provide reports, upon request, showing the items purchased during the term of this Contract, the quantity purchased for each of those items, and the total value of purchases for each of those items. Failure to supply such reports may be grounds for cancellation of this Contract.
- 7.4 Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contract, Vendor must designate and maintain a primary contract manager responsible for overseeing Vendor's responsibilities under this Contract. The Contract manager must be available during normal business hours to address any customer service or other issues related to this Contract.

Contract Manager: Jeffrey J. Pschirer

Vendor's Name: Blue Bird Bus Sales of Pittsburgh, Inc. dba Blue Bird Bus Sales of West Vendor's FEIN: 25-1228073 Virginia

Vendor's Address: 5374 William Flynn Highway
Gibsonia, PA 15044

Telephone Number: 724-898-2472
Fax Number: 724-898-2660
Email Address: jpschirer@bluebirdpgh.com

DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as the Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this Contract.

a -	Vice President School Bus Sales		
(Name, Title)			
(A)	Jeffrey J. Pschirer Vice President School Bus S	ales	
(Printed Name and	Title)		
	5374 William Flynn Highway, Gibsonia, PA 15	044	
(Address)			
` ,	724-898-2472 / 724-898-2660		
(Phone Number) / (Fax Number)		
	jpschirer@bluebirdpgh.com		
(email address)			

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation through wvOASIS, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid, offer or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the product or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for that product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that I am submitting this bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; that I am authorized by the vendor to execute and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor's behalf; that I am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, the vendor has properly registered with any State agency that may require registration.

Blue Bird Bus Sales of Pittsburgh, Inc. dba Blue Bird Bus Sales of West Virginia (Company)

	Jeffrey J. Pschirer, Vice President School Bus Sales
(Authorized Signature) (Representative Name, Title)
Jeffrey J. Pschirer,	Vice President School Bus Sales
(Printed Name and Tit	le of Authorized Representative)
November 18, 2019	
(Date)	
724-898-2472 / 724	-898-2660
(Phone Number) (Fax	Number)

CRFQ 0212 SWC2000000003 SWCSBUS20

1. TRANSIT UNITS (Diesel Engines):

71 Passenger:

230HP, FE	\$ 93,317.00
230HP, RE	\$ 102,491.00
Delivery to Charleston, WV	\$ 1,200.00

77 Passenger:

230HP, FE	\$ 97,515.00
230HP, RE	\$ 109,033.00
Delivery to Charleston, WV	\$ 1,200.00

84 Passenger:

245HP, FE	\$ 98,935.00
245HP, RE	\$ 109,294.00
Delivery to Charleston	\$ 1,200.00

89 Passenger:

245HP, FE	\$ 100,469.00
245HP, RE	\$ No Bid
Delivery to Charleston, WV	\$ 1,200.00

CRFQ 0212 SWC2000000003 SWCSBUS20

2. CONVENTIONAL UNITS:

24 Passenger:

Type A – 130HP / Diesel	\$ 67,117.00
Type A – LPG fueled	\$ No Bid
Type A – Gasoline	\$ 56,813.00
Type B – 130HP	\$ No Bid
Delivery to Charleston, WV	\$ 1,400.00

30 Passenger:

Type A – 130HP / Diesel	\$ No Bid
Type A – LPG fueled	\$ No Bid
Type A – Gasoline	\$ 59,016.00
Type B – 130HP	\$ No Bid
Delivery to Charleston, WV	\$ 1,400.00

35 Passenger:

Regular - 200HP / Diesel	\$ 80,484.00
Regular - LPG fueled	\$ 89,946.00
Regular – Gasoline	\$ No Bid
Delivery to Charleston, WV	\$1,200.00 / 1,550.00

47 Passenger:

Regular - 200HP / Diesel	\$ 81,728	8.00
Regular – LPG fueled	\$ 89,070	0.00
Regular – Gasoline	\$ 77,843	3.00
Regular - 210HP / Diesel	\$ 81,728	
Regular – Gasoline	\$ 77,843	3.00
Delivery to Charleston, WV - F/47 Passenger, Conv. Unit Diesel	\$ 1,200.	
Delivery to Charleston, WV - F/47 Passenger, Conv. Unit Propane	\$ 1,550.	00
Delivery to Charleston, WV - F/47 Passenger, Conv. Unit Gasoline	\$ 1.200.	00

53 Passenger:

Regular - 200HP / Diesel	\$ 82,833.00
Regular – LPG fueled	\$ 90,156.00
Regular – Gasoline	\$ 78,946.00
Regular - 210HP / Diesel	\$ 82,833.00
Regular - Gasoline	\$ 78,946.00
Delivery to Charleston, WV - F/53 Passenger, Conv. Unit Diesel	\$ _1,200.00
Delivery to Charleston, WV - F/53 Passenger, Conv. Unit Propane	\$ 1,550.00
Delivery to Charleston, WV - F/53 Passenger, Conv. Unit Gasoline	\$ _1,200.00

CRFQ 0212 SWC2000000003 SWCSBUS20

2. CONVENTIONAL UNITS continued:

59 Passenger:

Regular - 220HP / Diesel	\$ 83,088.00
Regular – LPG fueled	\$ 91,074.00
Regular – Gasoline	\$ 79,279.00
Delivery to Charleston, WV - F/59 Passenger, Conv. Unit Diesel	\$ 1,200.00
Delivery to Charleston, WV - F/59 Passenger, Conv. Unit Propane	\$ 1,550.00
Delivery to Charleston, WV - F/59 Passenger, Conv. Unit Gasoline	\$ 1,200.00

65 Passenger:

Regular - 230HP / Diesel	\$_	84,003.00
Regular – LPG fueled	\$	91,325.00
Regular – Gasoline	\$	79,509.00
Delivery to Charleston, WV - F/65 Passenger, Conv. Unit Diesel	\$	1,200.00
Delivery to Charleston, WV - F/65 Passenger, Conv. Unit Propane	\$	1,550.00
Delivery to Charleston, WV - F/65 Passenger, Conv. Unit Gasoline	\$_	1,200.00

71 Passenger:

Regular - 230HP / Diesel	\$ 83,904.00
Regular – LPG fueled	\$ 92,592.00
Regular – Gasoline	\$ 79,386.00
Delivery to Charleston, WV - F/71 Passenger, Conv. Unit Diesel	\$ 1,200.00
Delivery to Charleston, WV - F/71 Passenger, Conv. Unit Propane	\$ 1,550.00
Delivery to Charleston, WV - F/71 Passenger, Conv. Unit Gasoline	\$ 1,200.00

77 Passenger:

Regular - 230HP / Diesel	\$_	88,707.00
Regular – LPG fueled	\$	94,359.00
Regular – Gasoline	\$	79,491.00
Delivery to Charleston, WV - F/77 Passenger, Conv. Unit Diesel	\$	1,200,00
Delivery to Charleston, WV - F/77 Passenger, Conv. Unit Propane	\$	1,550.00
Delivery to Charleston, WV - F/77 Passenger, Conv. Unit Gasoline	\$	1,200.00

CRFQ 0212 SWC2000000003 SWCSBUS20

3. SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL:

35 Passenger: 200HP / Diesel LPG fueled Gasoline Delivery to Charleston, WV – F/35 Passenger, Conv. Unit	\$ 85,836.00 \$ 95,179.00 \$ No Bid \$ 1,200.00 / 1,550.00
47 Passenger: 220HP / Diesel LPG fueled Gasoline Delivery to Charleston, WV – F/47 Passenger, Conv. Unit	\$ 85,758.00 \$ 92,667.00 \$ 81,606.00 \$ 1,200.00 / 1,550.00
53 Passenger: 220 HP / Diesel LPG fueled Gasoline Delivery to Charleston, WV – F/53 Passenger, Conv. Unit	\$\begin{align*} \$87,030.00 \\ \$93,986.00 \\ \$82,852.00 \\ \$1,200.00 / 1,550.00
59 Passenger: 220 HP / Diesel LPG fueled Gasoline Delivery to Charleston, WV – F/59 Passenger, Conv. Unit	\$ 87,140.00 \$ 94,691.00 \$ 83,103.00 \$ 1,200.00 / 1,550.00
65 Passenger: 230 HP / Diesel LPG fueled Gasoline Delivery to Charleston, WV – F/65 Passenger, Conv. Unit	\$ 88,146.00 \$ 94,843.00 \$ 83,316.00 \$ 1,200.00 / 1,550.00
71 Passenger: 230 HP / Diesel LPG fueled Gasoline Delivery to Charleston, WV – F/71 Passenger, Conv. Unit	\$ 89,106.00 \$ 97,087.00 \$ 84,255.00 \$ 1,200.00 / 1,550.00

CRFQ 0212 SWC2000000003 SWCSBUS20

3. SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL (continued):

77 Passenger:

 230 HP / Diesel
 \$ 93,969.00

 LPG fueled
 \$ 100,348.00

 Gasoline
 \$ 85,751.00

 Delivery to Charleston, WV – F/77 Passenger, Conv. Unit
 \$ 1,200.00 / 1,550.00

CRFQ 0212 SWC200000003 SWCSBUS20

DELIVERY:	:				
			eceipt of order (ARO) for lys. This does include "		
Buses will b	e delivered within _	120	days ARO.		
Vendor Nam	e:Blue Bird Bus Sales	of Pittsbur	gh, Inc. dba Blue Bird Bus	s Sales of West	Virginia
Address:	5374 William Flynr	Highway		 :	
:	Gibsonia, PA 1504	4			
Phone:	724-898-2472			_	
Toll Free Ph	one Number: 866-5	21-2472			
Fax:	724-898-2660				
Email:	jpschirer@bluebirdp	ogh.com			
	presentative: nirer, Vice President S	chool Bus S	Sales		
(Print Name)		CHOO! Bus E	, and a second		
(Signature)					
November 18					
(Date)	, =				

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code § 5-22-1(i), the contracting public entity shall not award a construction contract to any bidder that is known to be in default on any monetary obligation owed to the state or a political subdivision of the state, including, but not limited to, obligations related to payroll taxes, property taxes, sales and use taxes, fire service fees, or other fines or fees.

ALL CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate; or (2) the debtor is in employer default.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to chapter eleven of the W. Va. Code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

DEFINITIONS:

"Debt" means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers' compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

"Employer default" means having an outstanding balance or liability to the old fund or to the uninsured employers' fund or being in policy default, as defined in W. Va. Code § 23-2c-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers' compensation coverage, or failure to fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An employer is not in employer default if it has entered into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Commissioner and remains in compliance with the obligations under the repayment agreement.

"Related party" means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total contract amount.

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor's authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penalty of law for false swearing (*W. Va. Code* §61-5-3) that: (1) for construction contracts, the vendor is not in default on any monetary obligation owed to the state or a political subdivision of the state, and (2) for all other contracts, that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined above and that neither vendor nor any related party are in employer default as defined above, unless the debt or employer default is permitted under the exception above.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:

Commission number 1196334

Member, Pennsylvania Association of Notaries

Vendor's Name: Blue Bird Bus Sales of Pittsburg	h, Inc. dba Blue Bird Bu	s Sales o	of West Virginia
Authorized Signature:	Jeffrey J. Pschirer	_Date: _	November 15, 2019
State of Pennsylvania			
County of Allegheny , to-wit:			
Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this 15	day of Novembu		, 20 <u>/ 9</u> .
My Commission expires January 23	, 20 <u>223</u> .	10	
AFFIX SEAL HERE Robin R. Saxion, Notary Public	NOTARY PUBLIC	Cos	in Relation
Allegheny County My commission expires depugate 23, 2022		P	urchasing Affidavit (Revised 01/19/2018

West Virginia Ethics Commission



Disclosure of Interested Parties to Contracts

Pursuant to W. Va. Code § 6D-1-2, a state agency may not enter into a contract, or a series of related contracts, that has/have an actual or estimated value of \$1 million or more until the business entity submits to the contracting state agency a Disclosure of Interested Parties to the applicable contract. In addition, the business entity awarded a contract is obligated to submit a supplemental Disclosure of Interested Parties reflecting any new or differing interested parties to the contract within 30 days following the completion or termination of the applicable contract.

For purposes of complying with these requirements, the following definitions apply:

"Business entity" means any entity recognized by law through which business is conducted, including a sole proprietorship, partnership or corporation, but does not include publicly traded companies listed on a national or international stock exchange.

"Interested party" or "Interested parties" means:

(1) A business entity performing work or service pursuant to, or in furtherance of, the applicable contract, including specifically sub-contractors;

(2) the person(s) who have an ownership interest equal to or greater than 25% in the business entity performing work or service pursuant to, or in furtherance of, the applicable contract. (This subdivision does not apply to a publicly traded company); and

(3) the person or business entity, if any, that served as a compensated broker or intermediary to actively facilitate the applicable contract or negotiated the terms of the applicable contract with the state agency. (This subdivision does not apply to persons or business entities performing legal services related to the negotiation or drafting of the applicable contract.)

"State agency" means a board, commission, office, department or other agency in the executive, judicial or legislative branch of state government, including publicly funded institutions of higher education: Provided, that for purposes of W. Va. Code § 6D-1-2, the West Virginia Investment Management Board shall not be deemed a state agency nor subject to the requirements of that provision.

The contracting business entity must complete this form and submit it to the contracting state agency prior to contract award and to complete another form within 30 days of contract completion or termination.

This form was created by the State of West Virginia Ethics Commission, 210 Brooks Street, Suite 300, Charleston, WV 25301-1804. Telephone: (304)558-0664; fax: (304)558-2169; e-mail: ethics@wv.gov; website: www.ethics.wv.gov.

West Virginia Ethics Commission Disclosure of Interested Parties to Contracts

(Required by W. Va. Code § 6D-1-2)

Blue Bird Bus Sales of Pitt Name of Contracting Business Entity:dba Blue Bird Bus Sa		5374 William Flynn Highway
of West Virginia	Address.	
		Gibsonia, PA 15044
Name of Authorized Agent:	Address:	5374 William Flynn Highway Gibsonia, PA 15044
	ontract Descrip	tion: School Buses
Sovernmental agency awarding contract: WV Purchasing	Division	
☐ Check here if this is a Supplemental Disclosure		
ist the Names of Interested Parties to the contract which are kentity for each category below (attach additional pages if necessity)		ably anticipated by the contracting busines
l. Subcontractors or other entities performing work or se	ervice under th	e Contract
图 Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual name	s below.	
2. Any person or entity who owns 25% or more of contra	cting entity (no	t applicable to publicly traded entities
☐ Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual name	s below.	
Mark D. Schmitt, President, Blue Bird Bus Sales of Pittsl	ourgh, Inc. dba F	Blue Bird Bus Sales of West Virginia
3. Any person or entity that facilitated, or negotiated to services related to the negotiation or drafting of the ap		
☑ Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual name	s below.	
Jeffrey J. Pschirer Vice President Signature: School Bus Sales	Date Signe	d:
Notary Verification		
State of Pennoulusnia, Count	hy of A 10	ahanes
state of Innibation , odding	2	-
entity listed above, being duly sworn, acknowledge that the D		uthorized agent of the contracting busines is being made under oath and under the
penalty of perjury.		
Taken, sworn to and subscribed before me this	day of	vember 2019
Robin	Relate	lic's Signature
To be completed by State Agency:	rectary Pub	Commonwealth of Pennsylvania - Notary Seal
Date Received by State Agency:		Robin R. Saxion, Notary Public Allegheny County
Date submitted to Ethics Commission:		My commission expires January 23, 2023

3overnmental agency submitting Disclosure:

Commission number 1196334

Member, Pennsylvani Reseisabil of at Bolhrid 7.



CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY) 10/28/2019

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

ti	his certificate does not confer rights	to the	cerl	tificate holder in lieu of si	uch en	dorsement(s)).	require an endorsemen	i. A 3i	atement on
PRC	DDUCER				CONTA NAME:					
	st National Insurance Agency LLC					o, Ext); 814-724		FAX (A/C, No):	814-72	4-3200
	4 Bessemer St., Suite 101 eadville PA 16335					ss: info@fnb-		[700] 110].	VII	1.0200
171-	sauvine i A 10000				ADDIL		7	RDING COVERAGE		NAIC#
					INSURE	RA: Travelers				25674
	JRED			BLUEB-1		RB: Phoenix				25623
	ue Bird Bus Sales of WV			P		Rc: Travelers				25666
	ıalimark Fleet Service System Inc. 03 Herold Road			1	INSURE		niuomini, c	Allicitod		20000
	utton WV 26601			1	INSURE					
				İ	INSURE					
CO	VERAGES CEF	TIFIC	CATE	E NUMBER: 644467367	INSURE	Kr:		REVISION NUMBER:		
T IN C E	HIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES NDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY R ERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY XCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH	S OF I EQUIR PERT POLIC	INSUF REMEI AIN, CIES.	RANCE LISTED BELOW HAV NT, TERM OR CONDITION THE INSURANCE AFFORDE LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE	OF AN'	Y CONTRACT THE POLICIES REDUCED BY F	THE INSURE OR OTHER S DESCRIBE PAID CLAIMS POLICY EXP	ED NAMED ABOVE FOR TO DOCUMENT WITH RESPE D HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO	O ALL T	WHICH THIS
LTR A	TYPE OF INSURANCE X COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY	INSD	WVD	POLICY NUMBER 630-9K65521A-TIL		(MM/DD/YYYY) 5/10/2019	(MM/DD/YYYY) 5/10/2020	LIMIT		
^				630-9K0002TA-TIL		5/10/2018	5/10/2020	DAMAGE TO RENTED	\$1,000	
	CLAIMS-MADE X OCCUR							PREMISES (Ea occurrence)	\$ 100,0	
	H							MED EXP (Any one person)	\$ 5,000	
								PERSONAL & ADV INJURY	\$ 1,000	
	GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER:							GENERAL AGGREGATE	\$3,000	
	POLICY PRO-							PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG	\$3,000	,000
В	OTHER: AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY	+		AD9K670666-PHX		5/10/2019	5/10/2020	COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT	\$ 1,000	nnn
-	X ANY AUTO			ADSV010000-LUV		5/10/2019	5/10/2020	(Ea accident) . BOD!LY INJURY (Per person)	\$ 1,000,	,000
	OWNED AUTOS ONLY AUTOS							BODILY INJURY (Per person)		
	✓ HIRED ✓ NON-OWNED			5				PROPERTY DAMAGE (Per accident)	\$	
	AUTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY							(Per accident)	S	
Α	Y was not a second		-	CUP9K668959-TIL	-	5/10/2019	5/10/2020	E CH OCCUPATION		000
•	- COOK			OUT andougues in E		0/10/2010	0/10/2020	EACH OCCURRENCE	\$6,000,	
	CLAIMO-WADE	1 1					1	AGGREGATE	\$6,000,	000
С	WORKERS COMPENSATION	\vdash		UB9K668959-TIA	-	5/10/2019	5/10/2020	X PER OTH-	\$	
-	AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY			0001000000-1171		0,10,2010	Or TOILUE		* 1 000	000
	ANYPROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? (Mandatory in NH)	N/A				1		E.L. EACH ACCIDENT	\$1,000,	
	If yes, describe under							E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE	•	
A	DÉSCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below Equipment			630-9K65521A-TIL		5/10/2019	5/10/2020	Leased/Rented Equip	\$ 1,000, 150,00	
·				000000002171 712		0,10,23.3	or rorzozo	Deductible	1,000	
	CRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHIC	LES (A	CORD	101, Additional Remarks Schedule	e, may be	attached if more	space is require	ed)		
630 The	/3 Herold Road, Sutton, WV 26601 ∙ State of WV is named as additional ins	ured :	as rec	quired by written contract						
1110	Otate of VVV is harried as additional ind	uicu e	25 100	quired by writter contract.						
CEF	RTIFICATE HOLDER				CANC	ELLATION				
	*				THE	EXPIRATION	DATE THE	ESCRIBED POLICIES BE CA REOF, NOTICE WILL B Y PROVISIONS.		

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

State of WV

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE



Purchasing Divison 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130 State of West Virginia Request for Quotation 36 — Vehicles

Proc Folder: 644716

Doc Description: SBUS20 - VARIOUS SCHOOL BUSES FY2020

Proc Type: Statewide MA (Open End)

Date Issued	Solicitation Closes	es Solicitation No Version		Version
2019-10-23	2019-11-13 13:30:00	CRFQ	0212 SWC2000000003	1

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

BID CLERK

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON ST E

CHARLESTON

WV

25305

VENDOR

US

Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Mark A Atkins (304) 558-2307 mark.a.atkins@wv.gov

Signature X

Jeffrey J. Pschirer

Vice President

School Bus Sales FEIN# 25-1228073

DATE November 18, 2019

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Page: 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-001

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION:

The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids on behalf of the West Virginia Department of Education to establish an open-end contract or School Buses. The Contract may be utilized by West Virginia State agencies and all political subdivisions of the State in all 55 counties per attached documents.

INVOICE TO			SHIP TO			
ALL STATE AGEN VARIOUS LOCATI	CIES ONS AS INDICATED I	BY ORDER	STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER			
No City	W	/99999	No City	WV	99999	
US			US			
Line Comn	Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price	

1	VARIOUS BUS UNITS	0.00000	EA		
Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specifica	tion	Model#	
25101500					

Extended Description:

/ARIOUS BUS UNITS

PLEASE SEE EXHIBIT B - PRICING PAGES ATTACHED:

/endor shall enter pricing into the Exhibit_B Pricing Pages and must attach with bid. See section 18 of Instructions to Bidders for additional information.

NVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
ALL STATE AGENCIE VARIOUS LOCATION	S S AS INDICATED BY ORDER	STATE OF WEST VIR VARIOUS LOCATIONS	GINIA S AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City	WV99999	No City	WV 99999
US		us	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
2	DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV	0.00000	EA		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	`
-----------	--------------	---------------	---------	---

Extended Description:

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV FOR EACH BUS UNITS

PLEASE SEE EXHIBIT B - PRICING PAGES ATTACHED

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS

<u>Line</u> **Event Event Date** Technical Questions due by 10:00am EDT: 2019-10-29 1

	Document Phase	Document Description	Page 3
SWC200000003	Final	SBUS20 - VARIOUS SCHOOL BUSES	of 3
		FY2020	

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions