West Virginia

Purchasing Division

The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wWVOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West Virginia’s
procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses
to this solicitation submitted to the Purchasing
Division in hard copy format.
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Purchasing Division State of West Virginia

2019 Washington Street East Solicitation Response
Post Office Box 50130 P

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Proc Folder : 582519
Solicitation Description : ADDENDUM 1 SODIUM CHLORIDE - ROADWAY SALT (6619C056)

Proc Type : Central Master Agreement

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2019-06-27 SR 0803 ESR06251900000006021 1
13:30:00

LVENDOR

000000167452

MORTON SALT INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT1900000127

Total Bid :

Comments:

$0.00 Response Date: 2019-06-25 Response Time: 13:01:18

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Crystal G Hustead

(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.hustead@wv.gov

Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Page: 1 FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 SODIUM CHLORIDE - ROADWAY 0.00000 TON $0.000000 $0.00
SALT
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161506
SODIUM CHLORIDE - ROADWAY SALT - PER THE ATTACHED PRICING PAGES

Extended Description :

Page: 2



Pricing  Exhibit A Sodium Chloride
Page
All County delivery/storage location sites shall be bid at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all delivery/storage location sites.
Vendor may bid any or all Counties.
Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Total Estimated Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".
Delivery: F.O0.B. WV Division of Highways Delivery/Storage Location Site
DISTRICT 1 DO NOT TYPE IN GRAY HIGHLIGHTED AREAS.
WVDOH Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Location Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost
Boone Clinton @ WV85 850
Boone Rock Creek 1,300
Boone Seth 850
Boone Total Estimated Quantity for County 3,000 NO BID NO BID
Clay Widen Road & CR 11 1,350
Clay Maysel 100
Clay Total Estimated Quantity for County 1,450 NO BID NO BID
Kanawha |Chelyan 1,000
Kanawha |[Elkview 1,000
Kanawha |North Charleston 1,000
Kanawha [St. Albans 1,000
Kanawha |1-64 @ Rt. 119 and Penn. Avenue 1,700
Kanawha |I-77 @ Sissonville 1,350
Kanawha |I-79 @ Amma 1,700
Kanawha |Corridor G @ Alum Creek 1,700
Kanawha |Total Estimated Quantity for County 10,450 NO BID NO BID
Mason Glenwood
Mason Pt. Pleasant 1,000
Mason Total Estimated Quantity for County 1,000 NO BID NO BID
Putnam  |Red House 1,000
Putham  |Hurricane @ Rt. 34 1,000
Putham  |I-64 @ Scary Creek 1,000
Putnam  |US 35 @ Frazier's Bottom 1,000
Putnam  |Total Estimated Quantity for County 4,000 NO BID NO BID
Estimated Total per District 19,900 NO BID

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.
Itis understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,
whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120% maximum according
to Section 6.2 of the contract specifications.




Pricing  Exhibit A Sodium Chloride

Page
All County delivery/storage location sites shall be bid at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all delivery/storage location sites.
Vendor may bid any or all Counties.
Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Total Estimated Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".
Delivery: F.O0.B. WV Division of Highways Delivery/Storage Location Site
DISTRICT 2 DO NOT TYPE IN GRAY HIGHLIGHTED AREAS.
WVDOH Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Location Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost
Cabell Barboursville 4,500
Cabell I-64 @ Huntington 1,800
Cabell Total Estimated Quantity for County 6,300 NO BID NO BID
Lincoln West Hamlin 1,300
Lincoln Yawkey 1,000
Lincoln Harts 1,000
Lincoln Total Estimated Quantity for County 3,300 NO BID NO BID
Logan Corridor G @ Chapmanville 2,000
Logan Wilkinson 1,900
Logan Man 1,000
Logan Total Estimated Quantity for County 4,500 NO BID NO BID
Mingo Corridor G @ Miller's Creek, Bldg #03011 1,300
Mingo Mingo Cty @Miller's Creek, Bldg #03025 1,500
Mingo Gilbert 500
Mingo Total Estimated Quantity for County 3,300 NO BID NO BID
Wayne Pritchard 1,600
Wayne Wayne 1,900
Wayne Crum 1,000
Wayne Total Estimated Quantity for County 4,100 NO BID NO BID
Estimated Total per District 21,500 NO BID

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.
It is understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,
whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120% maximum according

to Section 6.2 of the contract specifications.




Pricing  Exhibit A Sodium Chloride

Page
All County delivery/storage location sites shall be bid at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all delivery/storage location sites.
Vendor may bid any or all Counties.
Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Total Estimated Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".
Delivery: F.O0.B. WV Division of Highways Delivery/Storage Location Site
DISTRICT 3 DO NOT TYPE IN GRAY HIGHLIGHTED AREAS.
WVDOH Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Location Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost
Calhoun  [Millstone 4,200
Calhoun |[Total Estimated Quantity for County 4,200 NO BID NO BID
Jackson |[Ripley 2,200
Jackson  [I-77 @ Medina 1,200
Jackson |Total Estimated Quantity for County 3,400 NO BID NO BID
Pleasants [Belmont 1,300
Pleasants |Total Estimated Quantity for County 1,300 NO BID NO BID
Ritchie APD Pennsboro 1,900
Ritchie Ellenboro 2,400
Ritchie Corridor D @ Nutter Farm 400
Ritchie Smithville 400
Ritchie Total Estimated Quantity for County 5,100 NO BID NO BID
Roane Lefthand @ WV 36 100
Roane Ambler Ridge @ US 119 100
Roane Spencer 1,400
Roane Total Estimated Quantity for County 1,600 NO BID NO BID
Wirt Elizabeth 1,600
Wirt Total Estimated Quantity for County 1,600 NO BID NO BID
Wood Parkersburg @ Rt. 95S 4,500
Wood l-77 @ Parkersburg 1,000
Wood Corridor D @ Riverhill 700
Wood Total Estimated Quantity for County 6,200 NO BID NO BID
Estimated Total per District 23,400 NO BID

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.
It is understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,
whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120% maximum according

to Section 6.2 of the contract specifications.




Pricing Exhibit A Sodium Chloride
Page
All County delivery/storage location sites shall be bid at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all delivery/storage location sites.
Vendor may bid any or all Counties.
Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Total Estimated Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".
Delivery: F.O0.B. WV Division of Highways Delivery/Storage Location Site
DISTRICT 4 DO NOT TYPE IN GRAY HIGHLIGHTED AREAS.
WVDOH Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Location Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost
Doddridge  |Smithburg 1,500
Doddridge |Total Estimated Quantity for County 1,500 NO BID NO BID
Harrison Gore 4,500
Harrison  |Saltwell 600
Harrison I-79 @ Lost Creek 1,800
Harrison APD 50 @ Tunnel Hill 2,000
Harrison  [Total Estimated Quantity for County 8,900 NO BID NO BID
Marion Fairmont 1,200
Marion Mannington 750
Marion Total Estimated Quantity for County 1,950 NO BID NO BID
Monongalia |I-79 @ Goshen Road 2,500
Monongalia |Ridgedale 4,500
Monongalia |Pentress 900
Monongalia |Total Estimated Quantity for County 7,900 NO BID NO BID
Preston Bruceton Mills 3,500
Preston Albright 1,800
Preston Terra Alta 1,000
Preston Fellowsville 1,000
Preston Aurora 1,000
Preston I-68 @ Cooper's Rock 2,500
Preston Total Estimated Quantity for County 10,800 NO BID NO BID
Taylor Fetterman/Prunytown 1,750
Taylor Total Estimated Quantity for County 1,750 NO BID NO BID
Estimated Total per District 32,800 NO BID

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.
Itis understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,
whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120% maximum according

to Section 6.2 of the contract specifications.




Pricing  Exhibit A Sodium Chloride
Page
All County delivery/storage location sites shall be bid at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all delivery/storage location sites.
Vendor may bid any or all Counties.
Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Total Estimated Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".
Delivery: F.O0.B. WV Division of Highways Delivery/Storage Location Site
DISTRICT 5 DO NOT TYPE IN GRAY HIGHLIGHTED AREAS.
WVDOH Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Location Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost
Berkeley |I-81 @ Martinsburg (0571) 1,300
Berkeley |1867 Rock Cliff Drive (0502) 2,500
Berkeley |[I-81 @ Exit 8 (0571) 2,500
Berkeley |Total Estimated Quantity for County 6,300 NO BID NO BID
Grant Petersburg 1,200
Grant Mt. Storm 1,500
Grant Corridor H @ Knobley Road (0582) 3,000
Grant Total Estimated Quantity for County 5,700 NO BID NO BID
Hampshire |Romney 800
Hampshire |Capon Bridge 500
Hampshire |Slanesville 500
Hampshire | Total Estimated Quantity for County 1,800 NO BID NO BID
Hardy Moorefield 1,500
Hardy Baker 2,000
Hardy Total Estimated Quantity for County 3,500 NO BID NO BID
Jefferson [Charles Town (0519) 4,500
Jefferson |Charles Town - New Shed (0564) 4,500
Jefferson |Total Estimated Quantity for County 9,000 NO BID NO BID
Mineral New Creek 1,500
Mineral  [Sky Line (Elk Garden) 1,000
Mineral Short Gap 1,000
Mineral  |District Headquarters (Burlington) 0
Mineral  |Total Estimated Quantity for County 3,500 NO BID NO BID
Morgan  [Berkeley Springs 1,100
Morgan  |Largent 300
Morgan  |Total Estimated Quantity for County 1,400 NO BID NO BID
Estimated Total per District 31,200 NO BID

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.
It is understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,
whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120% maximum according
to Section 6.2 of the contract specifications.




Pricing  Exhibit A Sodium Chloride

Page
All County delivery/storage location sites shall be bid at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all delivery/storage location sites.
Vendor may bid any or all Counties.
Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Total Estimated Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".
Delivery: F.O0.B. WV Division of Highways Delivery/Storage Location Site
DISTRICT 6 DO NOT TYPE IN GRAY HIGHLIGHTED AREAS.
WVDOH Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Location Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost
Brooke Wellsburg 2,000
Brooke Weirton 2,000
Brooke Total Estimated Quantity for County 4,000 NO BID NO BID
Hancock [New Manchester 3,100
Hancock |Total Estimated Quantity for County 3,100 NO BID NO BID
Marshall  |Glen Dale 3,100
Marshall  |Lynn Camp 800
Marshall  |Cameron 1,700
Marshall  |Sand Hill 700
Marshall  |Total Estimated Quantity for County 6,300 NO BID NO BID
Ohio Triadelphia 4,400
Ohio I-70 @ Triadelphia 4,000
Ohio Total Estimated Quantity for County 8,400 NO BID NO BID
Tyler Sistersville 1,300
Tyler Centerville 900
Tyler Total Estimated Quantity for County 2,200 NO BID NO BID
Wetzel New Martinsville 1,200
Wetzel Pine Grove 800
Wetzel Hundred 1,000
Wetzel Total Estimated Quantity for County 3,000 NO BID NO BID
Estimated Total per District 27,000 NO BID

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.

Itis understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,
whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120% maximum according
to Section 6.2 of the contract specifications.



Pricing  Exhibit A Sodium Chloride
Page
All County delivery/storage location sites shall be bid at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all delivery/storage location sites.
Vendor may bid any or all Counties.
Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Total Estimated Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".
Delivery: F.O0.B. WV Division of Highways Delivery/Storage Location Site
DISTRICT 7 DO NOT TYPE IN GRAY HIGHLIGHTED AREAS.
WVDOH Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Location Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost
Barbour  [Phillipi 2,200
Barbour  |Belington 1,700
Barbour  |Total Estimated Quantity for County 3,900 NO BID NO BID
Braxton  |Gassaway 1,200
Braxton  |Heaters 800
Braxton  |I-79 @ Coon Knob 1,600
Braxton  |I-79 @ Burnsville 1,800
Braxton  |Total Estimated Quantity for County 5,400 NO BID NO BID
Gilmer Glenville 1,300
Gilmer Total Estimated Quantity for County 1,300 NO BID NO BID
Lewis Weston (Ben Dale) 2,000
Lewis Corridor H @ Mudlick 1,500
Lewis Total Estimated Quantity for County 3,500 NO BID NO BID
Upshur  |Clow Lot @ Buckhannon 2,900
Upshur Tennerton 200
Upshur Kanawha Head 1,000
Upshur  |Total Estimated Quantity for County 4,100 NO BID NO BID
Webster [Cherry Falls 600
Webster [Cowen 600
Webster  [Hacker Valley 600
Webster  |Total Estimated Quantity for County 1,800 NO BID NO BID
Estimated Total per District 20,000 NO BID

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.
It is understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,
whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120% maximum according

to Section 6.2 of the contract specifications.




Pricing Exhibit A Sodium Chloride
Page
All County delivery/storage location sites shall be bid at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all delivery/storage location sites.
Vendor may bid any or all Counties.
Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Total Estimated Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Delivery/Storage Location Site
DISTRICT 8 DO NOT TYPE IN GRAY HIGHLIGHTED AREAS.
WVDOH Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Location Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost
Pendleton |Franklin, 220 North 500
Pendleton |Judy Gap 450
Pendleton |Brandywine 400
Pendleton |Onego 250
Pendleton |Franklin, 220 South 250
Pendleton |Total Estimated Quantity for County 1,850 $132.65 $245,402.50
Pocahontas |Marlinton 800
Pocahontas |Seebert 600
Pocahontas |Greenbank 500
Pocahontas |Bartow (Thornwood) 500
Pocahontas |Snowshoe 100
Pocahontas |Slaty Fork 600
Pocahontas |Total Estimated Quantity for County 3,100 $130.95 $405,945.00
Randolph  |Elkins 800
Randolph  |Harman 750
Randolph  |Coalton 600
Randolph |Valley Head 600
Randolph  |Mill Creek 800
Randolph  |Pickens 350
Randolph  |Corridor H Lot @ Elkins 1,200
Randolph  |Total Estimated Quantity for County 5,100 NO BID NO BID
Tucker Parsons 800
Tucker Thomas 1800
Tucker Total Estimated Quantity for County 2600 NO BID NO BID
Estimated Total per District 12,650 $651,347.50

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.
Itis understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,
whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120% maximum according
to Section 6.2 of the contract specifications.




Pricing Exhibit A Sodium Chloride
Page
All County delivery/storage location sites shall be bid at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all delivery/storage location sites.
Vendor may bid any or all Counties.
Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Total Estimated Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".
Delivery: F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Delivery/Storage Location Site
DISTRICT 9 DO NOT TYPE IN GRAY HIGHLIGHTED AREAS.
WVDOH Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Location Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost
Fayette Oak Hill 2,300
Fayette Lookout 1,200
Fayette Falls View 0
Fayette Total Estimated Quantity for County 3,500 $132.45 $463,575.00
Greenbrier [Lewisburg 1,000
Greenbrier [Crawley 2,100
Greenbrier [I-64 @ Hart's Run 1,000
Greenbrier |Total Estimated Quantity for County 4,100 $121.33 $497,453.00
Monroe Union 300
Monroe Peterstown 700
Monroe Total Estimated Quantity for County 1,000 $127.98 $127,980.00
Nicholas  [Summersville 1,700
Nicholas  [Curtin 1,300
Nicholas  [Corridor L @ Muddlety 1,500
Nicholas  |Total Estimated Quantity for County 4,500 $136.00 $612,000.00
Summers  [Hinton 1,000
Summers |Total Estimated Quantity for County 1,000 $129.37 $129,370.00
Estimated Total per District 14,100 $1,830,378.00

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.
It is understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,
whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120% maximum according
to Section 6.2 of the contract specifications.




Pricing  Exhibit A Sodium Chloride
Page
All County delivery/storage location sites shall be bid at one unit price per County.
Unit of Measure shall be PER TON for all delivery/storage location sites.
Vendor may bid any or all Counties.
Extended Cost is calculated by multiplying "Total Estimated Quantity for County"
by the "Unit Cost Per Ton".
Delivery: F.O0.B. WV Division of Highways Delivery/Storage Location Site
DISTRICT 10 DO NOT TYPE IN GRAY HIGHLIGHTED AREAS.
WVDOH Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Location Site Number Tons Per Ton Cost
McDowell [Havaco 2,000
McDowell |Yukon 500
McDowell |Johnnycake Mountain 400
McDowell |Raysel 250
McDowell |Total Estimated Quantity for County 3,150 NO BID NO BID
Mercer Princeton @ WV 20 3,500
Mercer Flat Top 1,000
Mercer I-77 @ Princeton 3,500
Mercer Total Estimated Quantity for County 8,000 $134.07 $1,072,560.00
Raleigh  |Skelton 5,000
Raleigh  |Bolt 250
Raleigh  |I-64 @ Bragg 5,000
Raleigh  |Total Estimated Quantity for County 10,250 NO BID NO BID
Wyoming [Pineville 2,500
Wyoming [Still Run 1,000
Wyoming [Hanover 1,000
Wyoming |Total Estimated Quantity for County 4,500 NO BID NO BID
Estimated Total per District 25,900 $1,072,560.00

Quantities listed in this solicitation are estimated quantities.
Itis understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract,
whether more or less than the quantities listed in the schedule, while meeting the 80% minimum or the 120% maximum according

to Section 6.2 of the contract specifications.




;’;;;fﬁsinhg DiViSOSn . State of West Virginia
ashington Street East =
ARl g Request for Quotation

CHlirleston, WV 25305-0130 18 — Highways

Proc Folder: 582519
Doc Description: ADDENDUM 1 SODIUM CHLORIDE - ROADWAY SALT (6619C056)

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement
Date Issued Solicitation Closes | Solicitation No Version
2019-06-19 2018-06-27 CRFQ 0803 DOT1900000127 2
13:30:00

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

BID CLERK

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON 8T E

CHARLESTON wv 25305
us

| VENDOR

Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number:

Morton Salt, Inc.

444 West Lake Street, Suite 3000
Chicago, IL 60606

For Ordering: 855-665-4540

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Crystal G Hustead
(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.hustead@wv.gov

Signature X 'Mk W/// FEIN # 27-3146174 DATE 6/24/19

All offers subject to all tgfms and conditions contained in this solicitation
Anthony T. Pagggh, Director, U.S. Gov't Bulk DeicingPSales & Marketing
1

age . FORM ID : WV-PRC-CRFQ-001



|ADDITIONAL INFORMATION:

THE STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA PURCHASING DIVISION FOR THE AGENCY, WEST VIRGINIA DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS, IS SOLICITING
BIDS TO ESTABLISH AN OPEN-END CONTRACT FOR SODIUM CHLORIDE (ROADWAY SALT) PER THE ATTACHED DOCUMENTS.

INVOICE TO

SHIPTO _

VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS
AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City Wv99889 No City WV 99099
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 SODIUM CHLORIDE - ROADWAY 0.00000 TON
SALT
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

46161506

Extended Description :
SODIUM CHLORIDE - ROADWAY SALT - PER THE ATTACHED PRICING PAGES

[SCHEDULE OF EVENTS

Line

1

Event

VENDOR QUESTION DEADLINE

Event Date

2019-06-17

Page: 2




SOLICITATION NUMBER : CRFQ DOT1900000127
Addendum Number: 1

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as
(“Solicitation”) to reflect the change(s) identified and described below.

Applicable Addendum Category:
[ ] Modify bid opening date and time
[ | Modify specifications of product or service being sought

[¢/] Attachment of vendor questions and responses

[ | Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet
[ ] Correction of error
[ ]| Other

Description of Modification to Seolicitation:

1. To provide answers to vendor questions
No other changes at this time

Bid opening remains June 27, 2019 at 1:30 PM EST

Additional Documentation: Documentation related to this Addendum (if any) has been
included herewith as Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference.

Terms and Conditions:

1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in
full force and effect.

2. Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by
completing an Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. The addendum
acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

Revised 6/8/2012




ATTACHMENT A

Revised 6/8/2012-




CRFQ DOT1900000127 Addepdum 1

Sodium Chloride — Roadway Salt

To answer vendor posed questions.

Question #1:

Response #1:

Question #2:

Response #2:

Question #3:

Response #3:

To confirm award is on a county basis not on a district basis?

Refer to Section 4.1 of the solicitation specifications which states “A contract
shall be awarded to the Vendor(s) that provide Sodium Chloride meeting the
required specifications for those counties for which their bid is low per Pricing
Pages, Exhibit A.”

Will the Bid be made public with being submitted electronically?

Yes. All bids are posted to the WV Purchasing Divisions website and can be
found at www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/Bids. Typically bids are posted by the
close of business on the date of bid opening, or the following morning

What is the award time frame?

Refer to section 1, under Purpose and Scope. “This contract shall become
effective upon award and extends until June 30, 2020”. The original term of the
contract will be less than one year. There is an option for two successive one-year
renewals.




ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: DOT1900000127

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[ X Addendum No. 1 [ 1 Addendum No. 6
[ ] Addendum No.2 [ ] Addendum No.7
[ 1 Addendum No.3 [ ] Addendum No. 8
[ ] Addendum No. 4 [ ] Addendum No.9
[ ] Addendum No.5 [ ] Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. I
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

Morton Salt, Inc

; Authorized Signature
Anthony T. P4tgdn, Director, U.S. Gov’t Bulk Deicing Sales & Marketing
6/24/19

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.
Revised 6/8/2012




Purchasing Divison State of West Virginia

2019 Washington Street East s
Post Office Bax 50130 Request for Quotation

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 18 — Highways

Proc Folder: 582518
Doc Description: SODIUM CHLORIDE - RCADWAY SALT (6618C056)
Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2013 WASHINGTON ST E

CHARLESTON wv 25305
us

Date Issued Solicitation Closes | Solicitation No Version

20490-06-11 2019-06-27 CRFQ 0803 DOT1900000127 1
13:30:00

BIO RECEIVING LOCATION i

BID CLERK

VENDOR

Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number:

Morton Salt, Inc.

Chicago, IL 60606

444 West Lake Street, Suite 3000

For Ordering: 855-665-4540

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Crystal G Hustead
(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.hustead@wv.gov

Slgnature X M f% FEIN # 27-3146174

pate 6/24/19

All offers subject to all s and conditions contained in this solicitation
A{lthony T.P o - Pingez: 4
Director, U.S/Gov’t Bulk Deicing Sales & Marketing

FORM ID : WV-PRC-CRFQ-001




DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as the
Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this Contract.

Bid Analyst
(Name, Title)
Meredith Kerr, Bid Analyst
(Printed Name and Title)
444 West Lake Street, Suite 3000, Chicago, IL 60606
(Address
(P)312-807-2723 (F) 312-896-9208

(Phone Number) / (Fax Number)
mkerr@mortonsalt.com
(email address)

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety: that I understand
the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid, offer
or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that carnot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the product
or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for that
product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and
conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that I am submitting this
bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; that I am authorized by the vendor to execute
and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendot’s behalf: that

I am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of my
knowledge, the vendor has properly registered with any State agency that may require
registration.

Morton Salt, Inc.
(Company)

— -
// /4 /” / /.~ Director, U.S. Gov’t Bulk Deicing Sales & Marketing

(Auth% Signature) (Representative Name, Title)
Anthony T. Patton, Director, U.S. Gov't Bulk Deicing Sales & Marketing

(Prijted N 'E{leffAuthorized Representative)
| - 1 " ey V.P., Bulk Deicing Sales & Marketing

(Auttorized Signature) (Reptesentative Name, Title)

Daniel P. Thompson, V.P., Bulk Deicing Sales & Marketing
(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative)
6/24/19

(Date)

For Ordering; 855-665-4540, Fax: 630-214-0725 Attn: Road Salt Department
(Phone Number) (Fax Number)

Revised 01/24/2019



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: CRFQ DOT1300000127

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[] Addendum No. 1 [] Addendum No. 6
[] Addendum No. 2 [] Addendum No. 7
[] Addendum No. 3 [] Addendum No. 8
[] Addendum No. 4 [] Addendum No. 9
[] Addendum No. 5 [] Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid.
I further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only
the information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is
binding.

Morton Salt, Inc.
Company

A Tl

Authorized Sjgnature Anthony T. Patton, Director, U.S. Gov’'t Bulk Deicing Sales & Marketing

[

6/24/19
Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite
document processing.

Revised 01/24/2019



West Virginia Ethics Commission
Disclosure of Interested Parties to Confracts
(Required by W. Va. Code § 60-1-2)

Name of Contracting Business Entity: _Morton Salt, Inc.  Address: _ 444 West Lake Street, Suite 3000

Anthony T. Patton Chicago, IL 60606
Director, U.S. Gov’t Bulk Deicing 444 West Lake Street, Suite 3000, Chicago,
Name of Authorized Agent: _Sales & Marketing Address: [T enens

Contract Number;: CRFQ D803 DOT1900000127 Contract Description: _ Sodium Chloride -Roadway Salt

Governmental agency awarding contract: ___¢partment of Highways

O Check here if this is 2 Supplemental Disclosure

List the Names of Interested Parties to the contract which are known or reasonably anticipated by the contracting business
entity for each category below (aitach additional pages if necessary).

1. Subcontractors or other entities performing work or service under the Contract
X Check here if none, otherwise list entityfindividual names below.

2. Any person or entity who owns 25% or more of contracting entity (not applicable to publicly traded entities)
Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

3. Any person or entity that facilitated, or negotiated the terms of, the applicable contract (excluding legal
services related to the negotiation or drafting of the applicable contract)

[} Check here if none, otherwise list entityfindividual names below.

= o
Signature: /M A % Date Signed: 6/24/19

Anthony T. Paﬁ%{birector, U.S. Gov’t Bulk Deicing Sales & Marketing

Noftary Verifi
State of [llinois , County of Cook
I, _Anthonv T. Patton , the authorized agent of the contracting business

entity listed above, being duly swomn, acknowledge that the Disclosure herein is being made under oath and under the
penalty of perjury.

24th day of June 2019

/’] PP

[ Natary Public’ s Signature

OFFICIAL SEAL
ANDREW LORENZINI
NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINOIS
MY COMMISSION EXPIRES.02104123

VISe!

Taken, swom to and subscribed kefare me this

To ba completed by Stata Agency:
Date Received by State Agency:
Date submitted to Ethics Commission:

Governmental agency submitting Disclosure:

2018

ARSI TP
Y, P



STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIBAVIT

CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code § 5-22-1(i), the contracting public entity shall not award a
construction contract to any bidder that is known to be in default on any monetary obligation owed fo the state or a
political subdivision of the state, including, but not limited to, obligations related to payroll taxes, property taxes, sales and
use taxes, fira senvice fees, or other fines or fees.

ALL CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state
or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospeclive vendor or a relsted
party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debt owed Is an amount greater than one thousand
doliars in the aggregate; or (2) the debtor is in employer default.

EXCEPTION: The prohibiticn listed abave does not apply where a vendor has confested any tax administered pursuant to chapter
eleven of the W. Va. Code, workers' compensatlon premium, parmit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the matter has
not become final or whera the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the
provisions of such plan or agreement.

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money cwed to the state or any of its political
subdivisions becausa of a jJudgment, fine, permit violation, license assassment, defaulted workers' compensation premium, penalty
or other assessment presently delinquent or dua and required to be paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including
eny interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

“Employer default” means having an outstanding balance or liability to the old fund or to the uninsured employers' fund or being
in policy default, as defined in W, Va. Code § 23-2¢-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers' compensation coverage, or failure to
fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An employer Is not in employer default If It has entered
into a repayment agresmant with the Insurance Commissioner and remains in compliance with the obligations under the
repayment agreement.

"Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, asscciation, limited liability company or a2ny other
form or business association or other entity whatscever, related to any vendor by blood, mamiage, ownership or contract through
which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect recelve or
control @ portian of the benefit, profit or other consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an
amount that meets or excaed five percent of the total contract amount.

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor's authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penalty of
law for false swearing (W, Va. Code §61-5-3) that: (1) for construction contracts, the vendor Is not in default on
any monetary obligation owed to the stete or z polltical subdivision of the state, and (2) for all other contracts,
that nelther vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined above and that neither vendor nor any related
party are in employer default as defined above, unlezs the debt or employer default iz permitted under the
exception above.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:
Morton Salt, Inc.
= /

Vendor's Name:

Authorized Signature: ate: 6/24/19

= Date:
Anthof(y . Patton, Director, U.S. Gov t Bulk Deicinig Sales & Marketing

State of Illinois

County of ___Cook , to-wit:

Taken, subscribed, and swom to before me this _zflf}aay of JUNE ,2019 .

/! 997, A
My Commission expires ? /£ // -LC/ 2'* 7'7____ 20
v

NOTARY PUBLIC (?// ~ 52\ v d /W\_

Purchasin vit (Revised 01/18/2018)

AFFIX SEAL HERE

OFFICIAL SEAL
ANDREW LORENZINI
NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINOIS
MY COMMISS'ON EXPIRES:02/04/23
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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

Page 1 of 2

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)
12/24/2018

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER
Willis of Illinois,

c/o 26 Century Blvd
P.0O. Box 305191

Inc.

CONTACT
NAME:

ONE 1-877-945-7378 (A5, No): 1-888-467-2378

PH

(AIC, No, Ext):

E-MAIL s e - .
ADDRESS: certificates@willis.com

Nashville, TN 372305191 Usa INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
INSURERA : HDI Global Insurance Company 41343
INSURED INSURER B: American Guarantee and Liability Insurance 26247
Morton Salt, Inc.
444 West Lake Street, Suite 3000 INSURER C :
Chicago, IL 606060090 INSURERD :
INSURERE :
INSURERF :

COVERAGES

CERTIFICATE NUMBER: W9612239

REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

INSR ADDL|SUBR] POLICY EFF | POLICY EXP
LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE INSD | WVD POLICY NUMBER (MM/DD/YYYY) | (MM/DD/YYYY) LIMITS
X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE $ 1,000,000
DAMAGE TO RENTED
CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR PREMISES (Ea occurrence) | $ 500,000
A MED EXP (Any one person) $ 10,000
GLD11429-09 01/01/2019|01/01/2020 PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $ 1,000,000
EN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $ 2,000,000
X | poLicy |:| FRO: Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | § 2,000,000
OTHER: $
COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY L moodent) $
ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
OWNED SCHEDULED ’
oS ONLY Sones BODILY INJURY (Per accident)| $
HIRED NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE $
AUTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY (Per accident)
$
UMBRELLA LIAB OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE $
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $
DED ‘ ‘ RETENTION § $
WORKERS COMPENSATION X | PER OTH-
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY YIN STATUTE ‘ ER
B | ANYPROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE E.L. EACH ACCIDENT $ 1,000,000
OFFICER/MEMBEREXCLUDED? m N/A WC 6221212 05 01/01/2019|01/01/2020
(Mandatory in NH) E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE| $ 1,000,000
If yes, describe under 1,000,000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | § ' '
B |Workers Compensation WC 6221213 05 01/01/2019|01/01/2020 |E.L. Each Accident $1,000,000
& Employers Liability E.L. Disease-EA EMPL | $1,000,000
Per Statue E.L. Disease-Pol Lmt |$1,000,000

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

SEE ATTACHED

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

West Virginia DOT

2019 Washington St. E

Charleston, WV 25305

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

D&

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

© 1988-2016 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD

SR ID: 17279145

BATCH: 1000238



AGENCY CUSTOMER ID:

LOC #:
— o
ACORD ADDITIONAL REMARKS SCHEDULE Page 2 of 2

Morton Salt, Inc.

Willis of Illinois, Inc.
444 West Lake Street, Suite 3000

POLICY NUMBER Chicago, IL 606060090
See Page 1

CARRIER NAIC CODE

See Page 1 See Page 1| EFFECTIVE DATE: See Page 1

ADDITIONAL REMARKS

THIS ADDITIONAL REMARKS FORM IS A SCHEDULE TO ACORD FORM,

FORM NUMBER: 25 FORM TITLE: Certificate of Liability Insurance

INSURER AFFORDING COVERAGE: American Guarantee and Liability Insurance Company NAIC#: 26247
POLICY NUMBER: EWS 6221214 05 EFF DATE: 01/01/2019 EXP DATE: 01/01/2020

TYPE OF INSURANCE: LIMIT DESCRIPTION: LIMIT AMOUNT:

Workers Compensation E.L. Each Accident $1,000,000

& Employers Liability E.L. Disease-EA EMPL $1,000,000

Per Statue E.L. Disease-Pol Lmt $1,000,000

ACORD 101 (2008/01) © 2008 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD
SR ID: 17279145 BATCH: 1000238 CERT: W9612239




