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Proc Folder :
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Solicitation Response

Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Charleston, WV 25305-0130
Post Office Box 50130

State of West Virginia

509401

ADDENDUM 1 6619C038-HERBICIDE, ADJUVANT AND MISC.PRODUCTS

Central Master Agreement

2019-03-14

13:30:00

SR 0803 ESR03141900000004198 1

 VENDOR

000000180460

SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY HOLDING LLC

Comments:
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Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT1900000074

$0.00 2019-03-14 11:47:08

0% Net 30 Days

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001
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Exhibit A Pricing Page

the Product Trade Name and EPA Registration number for each product that the Vendor is bidding whether the Vendor

is bidding the Product Trade Name requested or an "or equal" product.

If the Vendor fails to provide the required information, the Vendor's bid will be disqualified for that Contract Item.

HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per

Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost
DOH-1H Water Soluble Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing:

    Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate   

    Phosphate Ester Surfactant 50.20%

Product Trade Name:  Roundup Pro Concentrate or equal - Roundup Pro Concentrate_____________

EPA Registration Number: 524-529_________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 6000 gallon 21.54 129240.00

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 6000 gallon

C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 6000 gallon 21.69 130140.00
D) Supplied in 265 gallon returnable/refillable shuttle. 500 gallon 20.09 10045.00

DOH-2H Dispersible Granules Containing:  Sulfometuron Methyl 75%

Product Trade Name:  Oust XP or equal - Oust XP_______________________________

EPA Registration Number: _352-601________________________________

A) Supplied in 3 pound containers in lots of 24 pounds (8 - 31 lbs ctn) 100 pound

B) Supplied in 3 pound containers 100 pound 60.09 6009.00

DOH-3H Aqueous Solution Containing:  Imazapyr 2 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Arsenal Powerline or equal ______________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: _________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 150 gallon

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 150 gallon

DOH-4H Aqueous Carrier Containing:  Pendimethalin 3.8 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Pendulum AquaCap or equal -_Lesco Pre-M Aquacap_________________

EPA Registration Number: _241-MO-001______________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 600 gallon 39.14 23484.00

DOH-5H Water Soluble Concentrate Containing:  Triciopyr 3 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name: Garlon 3A or equal -_Garlon 3A_______________________

EPA Registration Number: _62719-37________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 500 gallon 75.85 37925.00

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 500 gallon

C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 450 gallon

DOH-6H Water Soluble Concentrate Containing:  Triciopyr 4 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Garlon 4 Ultra or equal - Triclopyr 4 Ester________________________

EPA Registration Number: 10404-119_________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 250 gallon 65.84 16460.00

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 270 gallon

C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 240 gallon

DOH-7H Water Soluble Liquid Containing:  4 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Vastlan™ or equal _____________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: _________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 250 gallon

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 270 gallon

C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 240 gallon

DOH-8H Water Soluble Dispersible Granule Containing:  Diuron 80.00%

Product Trade Name:  Karmex DF or equal _____________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: _________________________________

A) Supplied in 5 pound bags in lots of 10 bags 1000 pound

B) Supplied in 25 pound bags 2000 pound

DOH-09H Water Soluble Liquid Containing:  Dimethylamine Salt of 2, 4-D acid 3.8 lbs/gallon/56.3%

Product Trade Name:  Freelexx or equal - Amine 400 2,4-D________________________________

EPA Registration Number: 2217-2

Vendors may bid any or all Contract Items.  Per Section 3.2.2 of the contract specifications, the Vendor SHALL provide 
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HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per

Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 15.98 1598.00

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 100 gallon

C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 100 gallon

DOH-10H Water Soluble Liquid Containing Ammonium Salt of Imazapic 23.60%

Product Trade Name:  Plateau or equal _______________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: _________________________________

A) Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons 50 gallon

DOH-11H Dispersible Liquid Containing:  Hexazinone 2 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Velpar L or equal _______________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: _________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallon

DOH-12H Dry Flowable Containing:  Metsulfuron Methyl 60%

Product Trade Name:  Escort XP or equal _________________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: ____________________________________

A) Supplied in 16 ounce containers in lots of 8 pounds (8-16 oz ctn) 2400 ounce

B) Supplied in 16 ounce containers 2400 ounce

C) Supplied in 64 ounce returnable/refillable containers 2400 ounce

DOH-13H Dry Flowable Containing:  Chlorsulfuron 75%

Product Trade Name:  Telar XP or equal ________________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: __________________________________

A) Supplied in 16 ounce containers in lots of 8 pounds (8-16 oz ctn) 160 ounce

DOH-14H Liquid Solution Containing:

    2, 4-D, 2- ethylhexyl ester                              32.45%

    2, 4-DP-p, 2-ethylhexyl ester 15.90%

    Dicamba            5.38%

Product Trade Name:  BK-800 or equal ________________________________ NO BID

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon

B) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 100 gallon

DOH-15H Dry Flowable Containing:  Tebuthiuron 20%

Product Trade Name:  Spike 20 P or equal _________________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: ____________________________________

A) Supplied in 4 pound containers in lots of 48 pounds (12 4 lbs ctn) 48 pound

B) Supplied in 25 pound bags 50 pound

DOH-16H Water Soluble Emulsfiable Concentrate Containing:  Clopyralid 3 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Transline or equal __________________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: _____________________________________

A) Supplied in .5 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons 25 gallon

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 25 gallon

DOH-17H Aqueous Solution Containing:

    Isopropylamine Salt of Imazapyr                                                    27.60%

Product Trade Name:  Polaris SP or equal ____________________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: _____________________________________

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallon

DOH-18H Aqueous Solution Containing:

    Diglycolamine Salt of 3, 6-Dichloro-0-Anisic Acid                       4 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Vanquish or equal __________________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: _____________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 300 gallon

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 300 gallon

DOH-19H Aqueous Solution Containing:  Triciopyr .75 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Pathfinder II or equal - Pathfinder II_______________________________

EPA Registration Number: 62719-176_____________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 71.37 7137.00

DOH-20H Water Soluble Emulsfiable Concentrate Containing:

    Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate                                                    53.80%

Product Trade Name:  Rodeo or equal - Aquaneat____________________________________

EPA Registration Number: 228-365_____________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 21.46 2146.00

B) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 100 gallon

DOH-21H Liquid Containing:  Aminopyralid 40.60%



HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per

Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost

Product Trade Name:  Milestone VM or equal ______________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: _____________________________________

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 12 quarts 200 quarts

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallon

DOH-22H Water Dispersible Granular Material Containing:  Prodiamine 65%

Product Trade Name:  Endurance or equal - Stonewall 65WDG_________________________________

EPA Registration Number: _60063-26-1044____________________________________

A) Supplied in 5 pound bags in lots of 50 pounds 100 pound

B) Supplied in 10 pound bags in lots of 50 pounds 100 pound 11.39 1139.00

DOH-23H Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing:  Fluazifop-P-butyl 6.75%

Product Trade Name:  Ornamec or equal - Ornamec Over The Top_______________________________

EPA Registration Number: _2217-728___________________________________

A) Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons 16 gallon 224.00 3584.00

DOH-24H Dispersible Granule Containing:

    Imazapyr                                                                                           7.78%

    Diuron                                                                                             62.22%

Product Trade Name:  Imazuron or equal __________________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: ____________________________________

A) Supplied in 10 pound bags in lots of 40 pounds 50 pound

DOH-25H Water Soluble Dry Granule Containing:  Sulfosulfuron 75%

Product Trade Name:  Outrider or equal _____________________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: _____________________________________

A) Supplied in 20 ounce bottles in lots of 200 ounces (10 - 20 oz ctn) 400 ounce

DOH-26H Liquid Containing:  Diuron 40%

Product Trade Name:  Diuron 4L or equal ___________________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: ____________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallon

DOH-27H Liquid Containing:  Fluroxypyr 45.52%

Product Trade Name:  Vista XRT or equal ___________________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: ____________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon

DOH-28H Wettable Granule Formulation Containing:

    Sodium Salt of Diflufenzopy:  2-(1-[([3,5-Difluorophenylamino] 

    Carbonyl)-Hydrazono]ethyl)-3-Pyridinecarboxylic Acid, Sodium Salt                        21.30%

    Sodium Salt of Dicamba:  3,6-dichloro-o-anisic Acid                                          55.00%

Product Trade Name:  Overdrive or equal _________________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: ____________________________________

A) Supplied in 7.5 pound containers in lots of 30 pounds (4 - 7.5 lbs ctn) 100 pound

DOH-29H Dispersible Granules Containing:

    Sulfometuron Methyl                                                                      56.25%

    Chlorsulfuron                                                                                 18.75%

Product Trade Name:  Landmark XP or equal ________________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: ____________________________________

A) Supplied in 4 pound containers in lots of 32 pounds (8 - 4 lbs ctn) 100 pound

B) Supplied in 64 ounce returnable/refillable containers 1600 ounce

DOH-30H Dispersible Granules Containing:

    Sulfometuron Methyl                                                                      56.25%

    Metsulfuron Methyl                                                                       15.00%

Product Trade Name:  Oust Extra or equal ___________________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: _____________________________________

A) Supplied in 4 pound containers in lots of 32 pounds (8 - 4 lbs ctn) 400 pound

B) Supplied in 64 ounce returnable/refillable containers 6400 ounce

C) Supplied in 12 pound containers 400 pound

DOH-31H Dry Flowable Granule Containing:

    Bromacil                                                                                           40%

    Diuron                                                                                              40%

Product Trade Name:  Krovar I DF or equal __________________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: _____________________________________

A) Supplied in 6 pound containers in lots of 48 pounds (8 - 6 lbs ctn) 50 pound

DOH-32H Liquid Containing:



HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per

Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost

    Dimethylamine Salt of 2,4-Dichlovophenoxyacetic Acid                      24.58%

    Dimethylamine Salt of Dicamba (3,6-Dichloro-o-Anisic Acid)               12.82%

Product Trade Name:  Veteran 720 or equal ______________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: ___________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon

B) Supplied in 30 gallon drums 100 gallon

DOH-33H Water Soluble Dispersible Extruded Paste Granule Containing:

    Imazapyr 31.60%

    Aminocyclopyrachlor 22.80%

    Metsulfuron methyl 7.30%

Product Trade Name:  Viewpoint™ or equal _____________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: _________________________________

A) Supplied in 5 pound containers in lots of 40 pounds (8 - 5 lbs ctn) 100 pounds

B) Supplied in 5 pound containers 100 pounds

DOH-34H Non-Selective Control of Emerged and Pre-Emerged Broadleaf

and Grass Weeds Containing:

    Indaziflam 0.089%

    Diquat Dibromide 0.890%

    Glypghosat Isopropylamine Salt 20.460%

Product Trade Name:  Esplanade EZ or equal _________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: ______________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons

DOH-35H Liquid Containing:

    Indaziflam                                               (1.67 pounds per gallon) 19.05%

Product Trade Name:  Esplanade 200SC or equal ______________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: ______________________________

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 1 gallon quart

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons gallons

DOH-36H A pre-emergence and early post-emergence product to control 

broadleaf weeds and annual grasses Containing:

    Penoxsulam: 2-(2,2-difluoroethoxy)-N-(5,8-dimethoxy[1,2,4]

       triazolo[1,5c]pyrimidin-2-yl)-6-(trifluoromethyl)benzenesulfonamide

    Oxyfluorfen: 2-chloro-1-(3-ethoxyl-4-nitrophenoxy)-4-(trifluoromethyl)

        benzene

Product Trade Name:  Cleantraxx™ or equal _________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: ______________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons

DOH-37H Plant Growth Regulator Containing:

    Mefluidide, diethanolamine salt 21.45%

    Imazethapyr, ammonium salt 4.09%

    Imazapyr, ammonium salt 0.15%

Product Trade Name:  Stronghold or equal _____________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: _________________________________

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 1 gallon 50 gallons

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons

DOH-38H Turf and Ornamental Growth Regulator Containing:

    Flauzifop-P-Butyl 24.50%

Product Trade Name:  Fusilade II or equal - Fusilade II_________________

EPA Registration Number: _100-1084_____________________________

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 1 gallons 50 gallons 333.47 16673.50

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons

DOH-39H Soluble Liquid for Non-Crop Use Containing:

    Potassium salt of aminocyclopyrachlor - Potassium salt of 6-amino-5-

        chloro-2-cyclopropyl-4-pyrimidinecarboxylic acid

Product Trade Name:  Method® 240SL or equal _____________________________ NO BID

EPA Registration Number: _________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons

0.850%

40.310%

25%



Exhibit B Pricing Page

Vendors may bid any or all Contract Items.  Per Section 3.2.2 of the contract specifications, the Vendor SHALL provide 

the Product Trade Name and EPA Registration number for each product that the Vendor is bidding whether the Vendor

is bidding the Product Trade Name requested or an "or equal" product.

If the Vendor fails to provide the required information, the Vendor's bid will be disqualified for that Contract Item.

ADJUVANTS Cost Per

Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description Quantity Measure Measure Cost
DOH-1A Water Soluble Blue Liquid Spray Pattern Indicator

Product Trade Name:    Bullseye or equal - Lesco Tracker____________________
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon 35.42 3542.00

DOH-2A Diluent with Emulsifiers

Product Trade Name: Hygrade EC or Arborchem Basal Oil or Bark Oil EC  

          or Penevator or equal - Pentra-Bark__________________________

A) Supplied in        32 oz.     containers in lots of       384 oz. 100 gallon 398.92 39892.00

DOH-3A Non-Ionic Surfactant -90% 

Product Trade Name: Lesco 90/10_____________________________________
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon 26.70 2670.00

DOH-4A Non-Ionic, Low Foam Penetrating Surfactant with Lecithin

    Drift Control Agent NO BID
Product Trade Name:  Liberate® or equal ___________________________   

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon

DOH-5A Concentrate Spray Adjuvant with Lecitech®

    Methylated Seed Oil

Product Trade Name:  MSO® Concetrate or equal ___________________________   NO BID
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon

DOH-6A Liquid Drift Control Agent

Product Trade Name: _____________________________________ NO BID

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 12 quarts. 400 quart

DOH-7A Granular/Flake Drift Control Agent

Product Trade Name: _____________________________________ NO BID

A) Supplied in 32 ounce containers in lots of 12 containers. 48 container

DOH-8A Aquatic Surfactant

Product Trade Name: _____________________________________ NO BID

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon

DOH-9A Water Soluble Liquid Spray Pattern Indicator

Product Trade Name:  Blueprint Plus or equal ___________________________   NO BID
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon  containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon

DOH-10A Non-Ionic Sticker Spreader

Product Trade Name:  Nu-Film-IR or equal ______________________________ NO BID
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon  containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon

DOH-11A Ready-to-Use Formula Containing Paraffinic Oil Emulsifiers

Product Trade Name:  Thinvert RTU or equal ____________________________ NO BID

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon
B) Supplied in 15 gallon drum. 100 gallon

DOH-12A Miscible-Dispersible Liquid Defoamer (10% Active Ingredient)

Product Trade Name: Brandt Defoamer_______________________

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 12 quarts per ctn 120 quarts 6.76 811.20

CRFQ DOT1900000074



Exhibit C Pricing Page

the Product Trade Name and EPA Registration number for each product that the Vendor is bidding whether the Vendor

is bidding the Product Trade Name requested or an "or equal" product.

If the Vendor fails to provide the required information, the Vendor's bid will be disqualified for that Contract Item.

MISCELLANEOUS Cost Per

Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description Quantity Measure Measure Cost
DOH-1M Pressure Rinser

Product Trade Name:  Easy Rinse or equal _______________________________ NO BID

A) Supplied per each. 25 each

DOH-2M Biostimulant Containing

    Soluble Potash                                            1.00%

    Iron                                                              0.36%

    Manure Extract                                            79.30%

    Humic and Fulvic Acid Extract                       9.00%

    Kelp Extract                                                 1.20%

    Organo-Modified Silaxane Surfactant           0.36%

Product Trade Name:  Launch or equal - Launch__________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 10 gallon 28.38 283.80

DOH-3M 5-gallon Backpack Sprayer

Product Trade Name:  Birchmeier or equal _______________________________ NO BID

A) Supplied per sprayer 10 each

B) Supplied per each gasket set for Sprayer Pump 10 set

C) Supplied per each Valve and Wand Repair Kit 10 kit

DOH-4M 2-Quart Handheld Pressure Sprayer

Product Trade Name:  Tolco or equal ____________________________________ NO BID

A) Supplied per each sprayer 10 each

DOH-5M Closed System Backpack Sprayer

Product Trade Name:  Birchmeier BCS or equal _____________________________ NO BID

A) Supplied per each sprayer 10 each

B) Supplied per each gasket Set for Sprayer Pump 10 set

C) Supplied per each Valve and Wand Repair Kit 10 kit

DOH-6M 32 ounce Eye Wash Bottle

Product Trade Name: _____________________________________ NO BID

A) Supplied per each. 25 bottle

Vendors may bid any or all Contract Items.  Per Section 3.2.2 of the contract specifications, the Vendor SHALL provide 
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