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SECTION 1: PRODUCT AND COMPANY IDENTIFICATION

PRODUCT NAME: ELITE PREMIER RED

DISTRIBUTOR: Red River Specialties, Inc.
ADDRESS: 1324 N. Hearne Ave., Ste 120, Shreveport, LA 71107

EMERGENCY CHEMTREC PHONE: US: 1-800-424-9300 International: 1-202-483-7616

CHEMICAL NAME: Petroleum Distillate & Emulsifier
CHEMICAL FAMILY: Petroleum Hydrocarbon Oil
CHEMICAL FORMULA: Mixture

PRODUCT USE: Basal Oil

SECTION 1 NOTES: None

SECTION 2: HAZARDOUS INGREDIENTS

GHS RATINGS:

TOXICITY CATEGORIES
Acute toxicity (Inhalation) Category 3

 SIGNAL WORD: DANGER

GHS HAZARDS: H303 May be harmful if swallowed.
 H317 May cause an allergic skin reaction.
 H331 Toxic if inhaled.

GHS PRECAUTIONS: P102 Keep out of reach of children.
 P234 Keep only in original container.
 P260 Do not breathe dust/fume/gas/mist/vapors/spray.
 P264 Wash hands thoroughly after handling.
 P270 Do not eat, drink or smoke when using this product.
 P271 Use only outdoors or in a well-ventilated area.
 P280 Wear protective gloves/protective clothing/eye protection/face protection.
 P301+312 IF SWALLOWED: Call a POISON CENTER or doctor/physician if you feel unwell.
 P302+352 IF ON SKIN: Wash with plenty of soap and water.
 P304+340 IF INHALED: Remove victim to fresh air and keep at rest in a position comfortable for breathing.
 P311 Call a POISON CENTER or doctor/physician.
 P305+351+338 IF IN EYES:  Rinse cautiously with water for several minutes. Remove contact lenses if present and easy to do then continue rinsing 

cautiously.
 P403+233 Store in a well ventilated place. Keep container tightly closed.
 P405 Store locked up.
 P501 Dispose of contents in container to an approved waste disposal facility in accordance with all local /regional/national/international regulations.
SECTION 2 NOTES: None

SECTION 3: HAZARDS IDENTIFICATION

INGREDIENT CAS NO. % WT
Aliphatic oil  64742-46-7 90 – 100%
Proprietary  Proprietary 1 – 5%
Distillates, petroleum, hydrotreated light 64742-53-6 1 -5%

NOTE: Product does NOT contain any pesticides or pest control agents

SECTION 3 NOTES: These specific chemical identity and/or exact percentage (concentration) of composition has been withheld as a trade secret.

CARCINOGENICITY
OSHA: No ACGIH: No NTP: No IARC: No OTHER: No

SECTION 4: FIRST AID MEASURES

EYE CONTACT- IF IN EYES: Rinse cautiously with water for several minutes. Remove contact lenses if present and easy to do then continue rinsing. Have the product con-
tainer with you when calling a poison control center or doctor, or going for treatment.

SKIN CONTACT - IF ON SKIN OR CLOTHING: Take off contaminated clothing and wash it before reuse. Wash with plenty of soap and water for several minutes. Call a poison 
center, doctor, chemical manufacturer, importer, or distributor to specify the appropriate source of emergency medical advice.

INGESTION - IF SWALLOWED: Unless advised otherwise by a poison control center or doctor, have person rinse mouth with water, if able. Do not give anything by mouth to 
an unconscious person. Call a poison center, doctor, chemical manufacturer, importer, or distributor to specify the appropriate source of emergency medical advice if you feel 
unwell.

INHALATION - IF INHALED: Remove victim to fresh air and keep at rest in a position comfortable for breathing. If person is not breathing, call 911 or an ambulance, and then 
give artificial respiration, preferably mouth to mouth if possible.

NOTES TO PHYSICIANS OR FIRST AID PROVIDERS:

SECTION 4 NOTES: None
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SECTION 5: FIRE FIGHTING MEASURES

NFPA HAZARD CLASSIFICATION
HEALTH: 1  FLAMMABILITY: 1  REACTIVITY: 0  OTHER: -

IN CASE OF FIRE: Carbon dioxide, dry chemical, and chemical foam or water fog.

SPECIAL FIRE FIGHTING PROCEDURES: Wear self-contained breathing apparatus when fire fighting in confined space.

UNUSUAL FIRE AND EXPLOSION HAZARDS: Can be made to burn (Flash point greater than 200° F).

HAZARDOUS DECOMPOSITION PRODUCTS: Combustion may produce carbon monoxide and asphyxiates.

SECTION 5 NOTES: None

SECTION 6: ACCIDENTAL RELEASE MEASURES

ACCIDENTAL RELEASE MEASURES: Surround and absorb all spills. Material should be collected and disposed in proper manner. Dike the area to prevent spill from spread-
ing. Soak up spill with a suitable absorbent such as clay, sawdust or kitty litter. Sweep up absorbed material and place in a chemical waste container for disposal. Wear 
suitable protective equipment.

SECTION 6 NOTES: None

SECTION 7: HANDLING AND STORAGE

HANDLING: Keep out of reach of children. Read label before use. Do not eat, drink or smoke when using this product. Do not breathe dust/fume/gas/mist/vapors/spray. Use 
only outdoors or in a well-ventilated area. Wash hands thoroughly after handling. Wear protective gloves/protective clothing/eye protection/face protection.

STORAGE: Store locked up. Store in a cool well-ventilated place. Keep in original container tightly closed. Do not reuse empty container. Do not store with food, feed, or other 
material to be used or consumed by humans or animals. Do not contaminate water supplies. For optimal storage, store between 40° and 90° F.

SECTION 7 NOTES: None

SECTION 8: EXPOSURE CONTROLS / PERSONAL PROTECTION

CONTAINS NO SUBSTANCES WITH OCCUPATIONAL EXPOSURE LIMIT VALUES

VENTILATION: Use only outdoors or in a well ventilated area.

RESPIRATORY PROTECTION: Not necessary unless ventilation is inadequate. Then use OSHA or NIOSH approved respirator, as appropriate.

EYE PROTECTION: Chemical goggles

SKIN PROTECTION: Chemical gloves, long-sleeved shirts and pants and protective gear if prolonged contact is unavoidable.

OTHER PROTECTIVE CLOTHING OR EQUIPMENT: Eye wash and safety shower should be easily accessible.

WORK HYGIENIC PRACTICES: Wash thoroughly with soap and water after handling product and before eating, drinking, or using tobacco products. Clean affected clothing, 
shoes, and protective equipment before reuse.

EXPOSURE GUIDELINES: If exposed, see section 4 for acute exposure first aid.

SECTION 8 NOTES: None

SECTION 9: PHYSICAL AND CHEMICAL PROPERTIES

APPEARANCE: Red, clear

ODOR: Mild
ORDER THRESHOLD: Not known

PHYSICAL STATE: Liquid

PH AS SUPPLIED: Not applicable
PH (OTHER):

INITIAL BOILING POINT:  F: Unknown C: Unknown

BOILING POINT RANGE:  F: Unknown C: Unknown

MELTING POINT:   F: Unknown C: Unknown

FREEZING POINT:   F: Unknown C: Unknown

FLASH POINT:   F: >200  C: >93

METHOD USED: PMCC

FLAMMABILITY (solid, gas):

FLAMMABLE LIMITS IN AIR, UPPER: Unknown LOWER: Unknown
 (% BY VOLUME)

VAPOR PRESSURE (mmHg): @ F: Unknown C: Unknown

VAPOR DENSITY (AIR = 1): @ F: Unknown C: Unknown

RELATIVE DENSITY: 0.850 to 0.868

EVAPORATION RATE: Unknown
BASIS (butyl acetate=1):

SOLUBILITY IN WATER: Dispersible

PARTITION COEFFICIENT: n-octanol/water): Unknown

AUTO-IGNITION TEPERATURE: Unknown

DECOMPOSITION TEMPERATURE: Unknown

VISCOSITY: @ Not determined F: Unknown C: Unknown

SECTION 9 NOTES: Values are not product specifications.

Note: These physical data are typical values based on material tested but may vary from sample to sample. Typical values should not be construed as a guaranteed analysis 
of any specific lot or as specification items.

SECTION 10: STABILITY AND REACTIVITY

STABILITY: Stable

CONDITIONS TO AVOID (STABILITY): Excessive heat.

INCOMPATIBILITY (MATERIAL TO AVOID): Strong oxidizing agents.

HAZARDOUS DECOMPOSITION OR BY-PRODUCTS: Combustion may produce carbon monoxide and asphyxiates.

HAZARDOUS POLYMERIZATION: Will not occur

CONDITIONS TO AVOID (POLYMERIZATION): None known

SECTION 10 NOTES: None
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SECTION 11: TOXICOLOGICAL INFORMATION

TOXICOLOGICAL INFORMATION: None

MIXTURE TOXICITY:   Inhalation Toxicity: 5.08mg/L

COMPONENT TOXICITY: Not available

SECTION 11 NOTES: None

SECTION 12: ECOLOGICAL INFORMATION

ECOLOGICAL INFORMATION: None

ECOTOXICITY: Not available

BIOACCUMULATIVE POTENTIAL: Not available

MOBILITY IN SOIL: Not available

OTHER ADVERSE EFFECTS: Not available

SECTION 12 NOTES: None

SECTION 13: DISPOSAL CONSIDERATIONS

WASTE DISPOSAL METHOD: Do not contaminate water, food or feed by storage or disposal. Dispose of contents in container to an approved waste disposal facility in ac-
cordance with all local/regional/national/international regulations.

CONTAINER DISPOSAL: Triple rinse (or equivalent) adding rinse water to application tank. Offer container for recycling or dispose of in a sanitary landfill or by other proce-
dures approved by local regulations.

RCRA HAZARD CLASS: None

SECTION 13 NOTES: None

SECTION 14: TRANSPORTATION INFORMATION

U.S. DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DOT SHIPPING DESCRIPTION: Not Regulated

U.S. SURFACE FREIGHT CLASSIFICATION: ADHESIVES, ADJUVANTS, SPREADERS OR STICKERS (NMFC 4610; CLASS: 60)
Consult appropriate ICAO/IATA and IMDG regulations for shipment requirements in the Air and Maritime shipping modes.

OTHER AGENCIES: None

SECTION 14 NOTES: None

SECTION 15: REGULATORY INFORMATION

U.S. FEDERAL REGULATIONS

TSCA (TOXIC SUBSTANCE CONTROL ACT): Mixture not listed

CERCLA (COMPREHENSIVE RESPONSE COMPENSATION, AND LIABILITY ACT): Not Regulated

SARA TITLE III (SUPERFUND AMENDMENTS AND REAUTHORIZATION ACT): Not Regulated

311/312 HAZARD CATEGORIES: None

313 REPORTABLE INGREDIENTS: None

INTERNATIONAL REGULATIONS: None

SECTION 15 NOTES: None

SECTION 16: OTHER INFORMATION

OTHER INFORMATION: None

PREPARATION INFORMATION: Prepared on 02/07/15

DISCLAIMER: The recommendation for safe handling and protection procedures is believed to be generally suitable for the standard uses of this compound. However, 
each user should identify his intended uses of this material and determine whether they are appropriate. All data included in this document is released as typical values 
and should not be utilized to determine the suitability of this material for a particular use or purpose. No warranty, either expressed or implied, is hereby made, nor do we 
give permission, inducement, or recommendations to practice any patented invention without a license. All data is offered for consideration, investigation and verification 
purposes only.

Red River Specialties, Inc.
1324 N. Hearne Ave., Ste 120
Shreveport, LA 71107



































































































































































































































Exhibit A Pricing Page

the Product Trade Name and EPA Registration number for each product that the Vendor is bidding whether the Vendor

is bidding the Product Trade Name requested or an "or equal" product.

If the Vendor fails to provide the required information, the Vendor's bid will be disqualified for that Contract Item.

HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per

Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost
DOH-1H Water Soluble Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing:

    Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate   

    Phosphate Ester Surfactant 50.20%

Product Trade Name:  Roundup Pro Concentrate or equal Roundup Pro

EPA Registration Number:  524-529

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 6000 gallon 17.72 106320.00

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 6000 gallon No Bid No Bid

C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 6000 gallon 16.75 100500.00
D) Supplied in 265 gallon returnable/refillable shuttle. 500 gallon 16.10 8050.00

DOH-2H Dispersible Granules Containing:  Sulfometuron Methyl 75%

Product Trade Name:  Oust XP or equal Oust XP

EPA Registration Number:  432-1552

A) Supplied in 3 pound containers in lots of 24 pounds (8 - 31 lbs ctn) 100 pound 28.19 2819.00

B) Supplied in 3 pound containers 100 pound 28.19 2819.00

DOH-3H Aqueous Solution Containing:  Imazapyr 2 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Arsenal Powerline or equal Arsenal Powerline

EPA Registration Number: ___241-431___________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 150 gallon 55.95 8392.50

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 150 gallon 51.05 7657.50

DOH-4H Aqueous Carrier Containing:  Pendimethalin 3.8 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Pendulum AquaCap or equal Pendulum AquaCap

EPA Registration Number: _____241-416_______

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 600 gallon 60.14 36084.00

DOH-5H Water Soluble Concentrate Containing:  Triciopyr 3 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name: Garlon 3A or equal Garlon 3/A

EPA Registration Number: ____62719-37__________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 500 gallon 45.12 22560.00

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 500 gallon

C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 450 gallon 45.12 20304.00

DOH-6H Water Soluble Concentrate Containing:  Triciopyr 4 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Garlon 4 Ultra or equal Garlon 4

EPA Registration Number: ______62719-527_______

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 250 gallon 63.95 15987.50

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 270 gallon

C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 240 gallon 63.95 15348.00

DOH-7H Water Soluble Liquid Containing:  Triciopyr 4 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Vastlan™ or equal Vastlan

EPA Registration Number: _______62719-687___

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 250 gallon 72.20 18050.00

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 270 gallon

C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 240 gallon 72.20 17328.00

DOH-8H Water Soluble Dispersible Granule Containing:  Diuron 80.00%

Product Trade Name:  Karmex DF or equal Karmex DF

EPA Registration Number: ________66222-51_____________

A) Supplied in 5 pound bags in lots of 10 bags 1000 pound 3.84 3840.00

B) Supplied in 25 pound bags 2000 pound 3.76 7520.00

DOH-09H Water Soluble Liquid Containing:  Dimethylamine Salt of 2, 4-D acid 3.8 lbs/gallon/56.3%

Product Trade Name:  Freelexx or equal Freelexx

EPA Registration Number: 62719-634

Vendors may bid any or all Contract Items.  Per Section 3.2.2 of the contract specifications, the Vendor SHALL provide 

CRFQ DOT1900000074



HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per

Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 21.95 2195.00

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 100 gallon

C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 100 gallon 21.90 2190.00

DOH-10H Water Soluble Liquid Containing Ammonium Salt of Imazapic 23.60%

Product Trade Name:  Plateau or equal Plateau

EPA Registration Number: 241-365

A) Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons 50 gallon 109.19 5459.50

DOH-11H Dispersible Liquid Containing:  Hexazinone 2 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Velpar L or equal Velpar L VU

EPA Registration Number: 432-1573

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallon 86.10 4305.00

DOH-12H Dry Flowable Containing:  Metsulfuron Methyl 60%

Product Trade Name:  Escort XP or equal Escort XP

EPA Registration Number: 432-1549

A) Supplied in 16 ounce containers in lots of 8 pounds (8-16 oz ctn) 2400 ounce 2.95 7080.00

B) Supplied in 16 ounce containers 2400 ounce 2.95 7080.00

C) Supplied in 64 ounce returnable/refillable containers 2400 ounce 2.90 6960.00

DOH-13H Dry Flowable Containing:  Chlorsulfuron 75%

Product Trade Name:  Telar XP or equal Telar XP

EPA Registration Number: 432-1561

A) Supplied in 16 ounce containers in lots of 8 pounds (8-16 oz ctn) 160 ounce 13.00 2080.00

DOH-14H Liquid Solution Containing:

    2, 4-D, 2- ethylhexyl ester                              32.45%

    2, 4-DP-p, 2-ethylhexyl ester 15.90%

    Dicamba            5.38%

Product Trade Name:  BK-800 or equal No Bid

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon

B) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 100 gallon

DOH-15H Dry Flowable Containing:  Tebuthiuron 20%

Product Trade Name:  Spike 20 P or equal Spike 20 P

EPA Registration Number: 62719-121

A) Supplied in 4 pound containers in lots of 48 pounds (12 4 lbs ctn) 5 lb. containers 48 pound 14.10 705.00

B) Supplied in 25 pound bags 50 pound 10.15 507.50

DOH-16H Water Soluble Emulsfiable Concentrate Containing:  Clopyralid 3 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Transline or equal Transline

EPA Registration Number: 62719-259

A) Supplied in .5 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons 25 gallon 150.86 3771.50

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 25 gallon 150.86 3771.50

DOH-17H Aqueous Solution Containing:

    Isopropylamine Salt of Imazapyr                                                    27.60%

Product Trade Name:  Polaris SP or equal Polaris SP

EPA Registration Number: 228-536

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallon 54.19 2709.50

DOH-18H Aqueous Solution Containing:

    Diglycolamine Salt of 3, 6-Dichloro-0-Anisic Acid                       4 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Vanquish or equal Vanquish

EPA Registration Number: 228-397

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 300 gallon 45.15 13545.00

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 300 gallon 44.42 13326.00

DOH-19H Aqueous Solution Containing:  Triciopyr .75 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name:  Pathfinder II or equal Pathfinder II

EPA Registration Number: 62719-176

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 40.89 4089.00

DOH-20H Water Soluble Emulsfiable Concentrate Containing:

    Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate                                                    53.80%

Product Trade Name:  Rodeo or equal Aquaneat

EPA Registration Number: 228-365

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 16.79 1679.00

B) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 100 gallon 16.25 1625.00

DOH-21H Liquid Containing:  Aminopyralid 40.60%



HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per

Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost
Product Trade Name:  Milestone VM or equal Milestone

EPA Registration Number: 62719-519

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 12 quarts 200 quarts 75.00 15000.00

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallon 300.00 15000.00

DOH-22H Water Dispersible Granular Material Containing:  Prodiamine 65%

Product Trade Name:  Endurance or equal Prodiamine 65 WDG

EPA Registration Number: 66222-89

A) Supplied in 5 pound bags in lots of 50 pounds 100 pound 11.91 1191.00

B) Supplied in 10 pound bags in lots of 50 pounds 100 pound

DOH-23H Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing:  Fluazifop-P-butyl 6.75%

Product Trade Name:  Ornamec or equal No Bid

EPA Registration Number: ____________________________________

A) Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons 16 gallon

DOH-24H Dispersible Granule Containing:

    Imazapyr                                                                                           7.78%

    Diuron                                                                                             62.22%

Product Trade Name:  Imazuron or equal Imazuron

EPA Registration Number: 228-654

A) Supplied in 10 pound bags in lots of 40 pounds 50 pound 9.00 450.00

DOH-25H Water Soluble Dry Granule Containing:  Sulfosulfuron 75%

Product Trade Name:  Outrider or equal Outrider

EPA Registration Number: 59639-223

A) Supplied in 20 ounce bottles in lots of 200 ounces (10 - 20 oz ctn) 400 ounce 15.32 6128.00

DOH-26H Liquid Containing:  Diuron 40%

Product Trade Name:  Diuron 4L or equal No Bid

EPA Registration Number: ____________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallon

DOH-27H Liquid Containing:  Fluroxypyr 45.52%

Product Trade Name:  Vista XRT or equal Vista XRT

EPA Registration Number: 62719-586

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 178.49 17849.00

DOH-28H Wettable Granule Formulation Containing:

    Sodium Salt of Diflufenzopy:  2-(1-[([3,5-Difluorophenylamino] 

    Carbonyl)-Hydrazono]ethyl)-3-Pyridinecarboxylic Acid, Sodium Salt                        21.30%

    Sodium Salt of Dicamba:  3,6-dichloro-o-anisic Acid                                          55.00%

Product Trade Name:  Overdrive or equal Overdrive

EPA Registration Number: 7969-150

A) Supplied in 7.5 pound containers in lots of 30 pounds (4 - 7.5 lbs ctn) 100 pound 37.17 3717.00

DOH-29H Dispersible Granules Containing:

    Sulfometuron Methyl                                                                      56.25%

    Chlorsulfuron                                                                                 18.75%

Product Trade Name:  Landmark XP or equal Landmark XP

EPA Registration Number: 432-1560

A) Supplied in 4 pound containers in lots of 32 pounds (8 - 4 lbs ctn) 100 pound 115.10 11510.00

B) Supplied in 64 ounce returnable/refillable containers 1600 ounce

DOH-30H Dispersible Granules Containing:

    Sulfometuron Methyl                                                                      56.25%

    Metsulfuron Methyl                                                                       15.00%

Product Trade Name:  Oust Extra or equal Oust Extra

EPA Registration Number: 432-1557

A) Supplied in 4 pound containers in lots of 32 pounds (8 - 4 lbs ctn) 400 pound 28.19 11276.00

B) Supplied in 64 ounce returnable/refillable containers 6400 ounce

C) Supplied in 12 pound containers 400 pound 28.19 11276.00

DOH-31H Dry Flowable Granule Containing:

    Bromacil                                                                                           40%

    Diuron                                                                                              40%

Product Trade Name:  Krovar I DF or equal Krovar IDF

EPA Registration Number: 432-1551

A) Supplied in 6 pound containers in lots of 48 pounds (8 - 6 lbs ctn) 50 pound 9.14 457.00

DOH-32H Liquid Containing:



HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per

Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost

    Dimethylamine Salt of 2,4-Dichlovophenoxyacetic Acid                      24.58%

    Dimethylamine Salt of Dicamba (3,6-Dichloro-o-Anisic Acid)               12.82%

Product Trade Name:  Veteran 720 or equal Veteran 720

EPA Registration Number: 228-295

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 25.00 2500.00

B) Supplied in 30 gallon drums 100 gallon

DOH-33H Water Soluble Dispersible Extruded Paste Granule Containing:

    Imazapyr 31.60%

    Aminocyclopyrachlor 22.80%

    Metsulfuron methyl 7.30%

Product Trade Name:  Viewpoint™ or equal Viewpoint

EPA Registration Number: 432-1580

A) Supplied in 5 pound containers in lots of 40 pounds (8 - 5 lbs ctn) 100 pounds 69.12 6912.00

B) Supplied in 5 pound containers 100 pounds 69.12 6912.00

DOH-34H Non-Selective Control of Emerged and Pre-Emerged Broadleaf

and Grass Weeds Containing:

    Indaziflam 0.089%

    Diquat Dibromide 0.890%

    Glypghosat Isopropylamine Salt 20.460%

Product Trade Name:  Esplanade EZ or equal Esplanade EZ

EPA Registration Number: 432-1528

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons 52.50 2625.00

DOH-35H Liquid Containing:

    Indaziflam                                               (1.67 pounds per gallon) 19.05%

Product Trade Name:  Esplanade 200SC or equal Esplanade 200SC

EPA Registration Number: 432-1528

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 1 gallon quart 325.25

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons gallons 1169.92

DOH-36H A pre-emergence and early post-emergence product to control 

broadleaf weeds and annual grasses Containing:

    Penoxsulam: 2-(2,2-difluoroethoxy)-N-(5,8-dimethoxy[1,2,4]

       triazolo[1,5c]pyrimidin-2-yl)-6-(trifluoromethyl)benzenesulfonamide

    Oxyfluorfen: 2-chloro-1-(3-ethoxyl-4-nitrophenoxy)-4-(trifluoromethyl)

        benzene

Product Trade Name:  Cleantraxx™ or equal Cleantraxx

EPA Registration Number: 62719-702

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons 130.00 6500.00

DOH-37H Plant Growth Regulator Containing:

    Mefluidide, diethanolamine salt 21.45%

    Imazethapyr, ammonium salt 4.09%

    Imazapyr, ammonium salt 0.15%

Product Trade Name:  Stronghold or equal No bid

EPA Registration Number: _________________________________

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 1 gallon 50 gallons

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons

DOH-38H Turf and Ornamental Growth Regulator Containing:

    Flauzifop-P-Butyl 24.50%

Product Trade Name:  Fusilade II or equal No Bid

EPA Registration Number: ______________________________

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 1 gallons 50 gallons

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons

DOH-39H Soluble Liquid for Non-Crop Use Containing:

    Potassium salt of aminocyclopyrachlor - Potassium salt of 6-amino-5-

        chloro-2-cyclopropyl-4-pyrimidinecarboxylic acid

Product Trade Name:  Method® 240SL or equal Method 240SL

EPA Registration Number: 432-1565

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons 318.72 15936.00

0.850%

40.310%

25%
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Vendors may bid any or all Contract Items.  Per Section 3.2.2 of the contract specifications, the Vendor SHALL provide 

the Product Trade Name and EPA Registration number for each product that the Vendor is bidding whether the Vendor

is bidding the Product Trade Name requested or an "or equal" product.

If the Vendor fails to provide the required information, the Vendor's bid will be disqualified for that Contract Item.

ADJUVANTS Cost Per

Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description Quantity Measure Measure Cost
DOH-1A Water Soluble Blue Liquid Spray Pattern Indicator

Product Trade Name:    Bullseye or equal RRSI IVM Marking Dye
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon 18.10 1810.00

DOH-2A Diluent with Emulsifiers

Product Trade Name: Hygrade EC or Arborchem Basal Oil or Bark Oil EC  

          or Penevator or equal Elite Premier

A) Supplied in          2.5ga.            containers in lots of    5ga.        100 gallon 13.10 1310.00

DOH-3A Non-Ionic Surfactant -90% 

Product Trade Name: Red River 90
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon 10.10 1010.00

DOH-4A Non-Ionic, Low Foam Penetrating Surfactant with Lecithin

    Drift Control Agent
Product Trade Name:  Liberate® or equal No Bid 

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon

DOH-5A Concentrate Spray Adjuvant with Lecitech®

    Methylated Seed Oil

Product Trade Name:  MSO® Concetrate or equal Sunset MSO 

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon 9.25 925.00

DOH-6A Liquid Drift Control Agent

Product Trade Name: Elite Secure

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 12 quarts. 400 quart 9.10 3640.00

DOH-7A Granular/Flake Drift Control Agent

Product Trade Name: No Bid

A) Supplied in 32 ounce containers in lots of 12 containers. 48 container

DOH-8A Aquatic Surfactant

Product Trade Name: Red River 90

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon 10.10 1010.00

DOH-9A Water Soluble Liquid Spray Pattern Indicator

Product Trade Name:  Blueprint Plus or equal RRSI IVM Marking Dye 

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon  containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon 18.10 1810.00

DOH-10A Non-Ionic Sticker Spreader

Product Trade Name:  Nu-Film-IR or equal Nu-Film IR

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon  containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon 39.25 3925.00

DOH-11A Ready-to-Use Formula Containing Paraffinic Oil Emulsifiers

Product Trade Name:  Thinvert RTU or equal RRSI Pacer

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon 13.21 1321.00
B) Supplied in 15 gallon drum. 100 gallon

DOH-12A Miscible-Dispersible Liquid Defoamer (10% Active Ingredient)

Product Trade Name: RRSI Defoamer

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 12 quarts per ctn 120 quarts 8.95 1074.00

CRFQ DOT1900000074
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the Product Trade Name and EPA Registration number for each product that the Vendor is bidding whether the Vendor

is bidding the Product Trade Name requested or an "or equal" product.

If the Vendor fails to provide the required information, the Vendor's bid will be disqualified for that Contract Item.

MISCELLANEOUS Cost Per

Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description Quantity Measure Measure Cost
DOH-1M Pressure Rinser

Product Trade Name:  Easy Rinse or equal No Bid

A) Supplied per each. 25 each

DOH-2M Biostimulant Containing

    Soluble Potash                                            1.00%

    Iron                                                              0.36%

    Manure Extract                                            79.30%

    Humic and Fulvic Acid Extract                       9.00%

    Kelp Extract                                                 1.20%

    Organo-Modified Silaxane Surfactant           0.36%

Product Trade Name:  Launch or equal No Bid

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 10 gallon

DOH-3M 5-gallon Backpack Sprayer

Product Trade Name:  Birchmeier or equal No Bid

A) Supplied per sprayer 10 each

B) Supplied per each gasket set for Sprayer Pump 10 set

C) Supplied per each Valve and Wand Repair Kit 10 kit

DOH-4M 2-Quart Handheld Pressure Sprayer

Product Trade Name:  Tolco or equal No Bid

A) Supplied per each sprayer 10 each

DOH-5M Closed System Backpack Sprayer

Product Trade Name:  Birchmeier BCS or equal No Bid

A) Supplied per each sprayer 10 each

B) Supplied per each gasket Set for Sprayer Pump 10 set

C) Supplied per each Valve and Wand Repair Kit 10 kit

DOH-6M 32 ounce Eye Wash Bottle

Product Trade Name: No Bid

A) Supplied per each. 25 bottle

Vendors may bid any or all Contract Items.  Per Section 3.2.2 of the contract specifications, the Vendor SHALL provide 
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