West Virginia

Purchasing Division

The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wWVOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West Virginia’s
procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses
to this solicitation submitted to the Purchasing
Division in hard copy format.
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Purchasing Division State of West Virginia

2019 Washington Street East Solicitation Response
Post Office Box 50130 P

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Proc Folder : 517239
Solicitation Description : ADDENDUM 1 ASPHALT - MATERIALS AND PICKUP BY WVDOH

Proc Type : Central Master Agreement

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2018-12-19 SR 0803 ESR12181800000002880 1
13:30:00

LVENDOR

000000176284

GREER INDUSTRIES INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT1900000052

Total Bid :

Comments:

$0.00 Response Date: 2018-12-18 Response Time: 15:40:36

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Crystal Rink

(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.rink@wv.gov

Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Page: 1 FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 ASPHAT MATERIALS AND PICKUP 0.00000 EA $0.000000 $0.00
BY WVDOH
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30121601
ASPHALT - MATERIALS AND PICKUP BY WVDOH PER THE ATTACHED PRICING PAGES/E-CATALOG

Extended Description :

Page: 2



Purchasing Divison State of West Virginia

2019 Washington Street East :
B0t Office Box 50130 Request for Quotation

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 19 — Highways

Proc Folder: 517239
Dac Description: ADDENDUM 1 ASPHALT - MATERIALS AND PICKUP BY WVDOH
Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2018-12-04 2018-12-19 CRFQ 0803 DOT1900000052 2
13:30:00

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON ST E

CHARLESTON Wy 25305
us

Vendor Name, Address and Telephune"Numbur:
CLARKSBURG ASPHALT COMPANY
PO BOX 1900

MORGANTOWN, WV 26507
304-594-1768

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Crystal Rink
(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.rink@wv.gov
i
Signature OBERT A. HENN FeIN # 34—0737241 pate 12/1 8/2018

All offers subjgct to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Page: 1 FORM ID : WV-PRC-CRFQ-001



THE STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA PURCHASING DIVISION FOR THE AGENCY, WEST VIRGINIA DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS (WVDOH), IS
ggg&g&grgms TO ESTABLISH AND OPEN-END CONTRACT FOR ASPHALT MATERIALS PICKUP BY WVDOH PER THE ATTACHED

T T T T T T T R T T T

e ]

|

VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
AS INDICATED BY ORDER JOBSITE - SEE SPECIFICATIONS
No City WV 89999 No City WV 98999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 ASPHAT MATERIALS AND PICKUP ~ 0.00000 EA
BY WVDOH
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30121601
Extended Description :

ASPHALT - MATERIALS AND PICKUP BY WVDOH PER THE ATTACHED PRICING PAGES/E-CATALOG

Line Event

QUESTION DEADLINE 2018-12-07

Event Date

Page: 2



SOLICITATION NUMBER : CRFQ DOT1900000052
Addendum Number: 1

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as
(“Solicitation™) to reflect the change(s) identified and described below.

Applicable Addendum Category:
| 1 Modify bid opening date and time
[ | Modify specifications of product or service being sought
. Aftachment of vendor questions and responses
[ | Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet
[¢'] Correction of error

| | Other

Description of Modification to Solicitation:

1. To update Section 3 of the General Terms and Conditions, renewal options have been removed as
the contract will expire on December 31, 2019

No other changes at this time

Bid opening remains December 19, 2018 at 1:30 PM EST

Additional Documentation: Documentation related to this Addendum (if any) has been
included herewith as Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference.

Terms and Conditions:

1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in
full force and effect.

2. Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by
completing an Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. The addendum
acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

Revised 6/8/2012



ATTACHMENT A

Revised 6/8/2012



3. CONTRACT TERM; RENEWAL; EXTENSION: The term of this Contract shall be
determined in accordance with the category that has been identified as applicable to this
Contract below:

Term Contract

Initial Contract Term: Initial Contract Term: This Contract becomes effective on
award and extends for a period of December 31, 2019

Renewal Term: This Contract may be renewed upon the mutual written consent of the Agency,
and the Vendor, with approval of the Purchasing Division and the Attorney General’s office
(Attorney General approval is as to form only). Any request for renewal should be delivered to
the Agency and then submitted to the Purchasing Division thirty (30) days prior to the expiration
date of the initial contract term or appropriate renewal term. A Contract renewal shall be in
accordance with the terms and conditions of the original contract. Unless otherwise specified
below, renewal of this Contract is limitedto _ ma successive one (1) year
periods or multiple renewal periods of less than one year, provided that the multiple renewal
periods do not exceed the total number of months available in all renewal years combined.
Automatic renewal of this Contract is prohibited. Renewals must be approved by the Vendor,
Agency, Purchasing Division and Attorney General’s office (Attorney General approval is as to
form only)

[] Alternate Renewal Term — This contract may be renewed for
successive year periods or shorter periods provided that they do not exceed
the total number of months contained in all available renewals. Automatic renewal of this
Contract is prohibited. Renewals must be approved by the Vendor, Agency, Purchasing
Division and Attorney General’s office (Attorney General approval is as to form only)

Delivery Order Limitations: In the event that this contract permits delivery orders, a delivery
order may only be issued during the time this Contract is in effect. Any delivery order issued
within one year of the expiration of this Contract shall be effective for one year from the date the
delivery order is issued. No delivery order may be extended beyond one year after this Contract
has expired.

[] Fixed Period Contract: This Contract becomes effective upon Vendor’s receipt of the notice
to proceed and must be completed within days.

[] Fixed Period Contract with Renewals: This Contract becomes effective upon Vendor’s
receipt of the notice to proceed and part of the Contract more fully described in the attached

specifications must be completed within days. Upon completion of the
work covered by the preceding sentence, the vendor agrees that maintenance, monitoring, or
warranty services will be provided for year(s) thereafter.

[[] One Time Purchase: The term of this Contract shall run from the issuance of the Award
Document until all of the goods contracted for have been delivered, but in no event will this
Contract extend for more than one fiscal year.

[[] Other: See attached.

Revised 06/08/2018



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: DOT1800000052

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[v/] Addendum No. | [ ] Addendum No. 6
[ 1 Addendum No.2 [ 1 Addendum No. 7
[ ] Addendum No.3 [ ] Addendum No. 8
[ ] Addendum No. 4 [ 1 Addendum No.9
[ 1 Addendum No.5 [ 1 Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. |
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

CLARKSBURG ASPHALT COMPANY
Company

ROBERT A. HENN
Authorized Signature

12/18/2018
Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.
Revised 6/8/2012



DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as the
Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this Contract.

M e SALES MANAGER
(Name, [Title) (&%
MARC A. MAGRO, SALES MANAGER
(Printed Name and Title)
PO BOX 1900 MORGANTOWN, WV 26507
{Address)

304-296-2549 / 304-864-2235

(Phone Number) / (Fax Number)
mmagro@greerindustries.com
(email address)

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand
the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid, offer
or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the product
or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for that
product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and
conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that I am submitting this
bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; that I am authorized by the vendor to execute
and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor’s behalf: that

I am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of my
knowledge, the vendor has properly registered with any State agency that may require
registration.

CLARKSBURG ASPHALT COMPANY
=5 Pl

C
MROBERT A. HENN, VICE PRESIDENT

{Authorized Signature) (Representative Name, Titie)

ROBERT A. HENN, VICE PRESIDENT
(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative)

12/18/2018
{Date)

304-296-1751 / 304-594-3467
(Phone Number) (Fax Number)

Revised 06/08/2018



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
CRFQ DOT1900000052
Asphalt Materials and Pickup by Agency

10.2.3 Any other remedies available in law or equity.

11. MISCELLENOUS:

11.1  No Substitutions: The Vendor shall supply only Contract Items submitted in
response to this Solicitation unless a contract modification is approved in
accordance with the provisions contained in this Contract.

1.2 Vendor Supply: The Vendor must carry sufficient inventory of the Contract
Items being offered to fulfill its obligations under this Contract. By signing its
bid, the Vendor certifies that it can supply the Contract ltems contained in its bid
response.

113 Reports: The Vendor shall provide quarterly reports and annual summaries to
the Agency showing the Contract Items purchased, quantities of Contract Items
purchased and the total dollar value of the Contract Items purchased. The Vendor
shall also provide reports, upon request, showing the Contract Items purchased
during the term of this Contract, the quantity purchased for each of those Contract
Items and the total value of purchases for each of those Contract Items. Failure to
supply such reports may be grounds for cancellation of this Contract.

114  Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contract, the Vendor must
designate and maintain a primary contract manager responsible for overseeing the
Vendor’s responsibilities under this Contract. The Contract manager must be
available during normal business hours to address any customer service or other
issues reiated to this Contract. The Vendor should list its Contract manager and
his or her contact information below.

Contract Manager: _ MARC A. MAGRO

Telephone Number: 304-296-2549
Fax Number: 304-864-2235 _
Email Address: mmagro@greerindustries.com

Revised 10/27/2014



INFORMATION ATTACHMENT FORM
Vendor's Storage Sites
Asphalt - Materials and Pickup by WVDOH Forces, ONLY

VENDOR NAME CLARKSBURG ASPHALT COMPANY

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.

If a Vendor wili be supplying materials from multiple Plant Locations and ALL pricing is the same, ALL Plant

Locations can be listed on one Information Attachment Form and one bid submission is acceptable.

If a Vendor will be supplying materials from multicle Plant Locations, at varylng prices, additicnal , separate

bid submissions must be submitted for each Plant Location bid. Multple Plant Locations with varying prices,
shall be submitted on separate bid submissions.

Vendor's Plant Location:

CLARKSBURG ASPHALT COMPANY
2399 BENEDUM DRIVE

BRIDGEPORT, WV 26330

Vendor's Plant Location:

Vendor's Plant Location:

Vendor's Plant Location:




VENDOR CUSTOMER CODE SUPPLIER PART NUMBER  [SUPPLIER NAME MANUFACTURER NAME  |MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER Icomonm CODE [ITEM DESCRIPTION |EXTENDED DESCRIFTION UNIT OF MEASURE  [LIST PRICE | DELIVERY DAYS
1A A 1-A {xszmm Asthalt District 1 - Sectian 401 - Base | TON NO BID 5
18 NIA 1-8 20121601 Asphat District 1- Asphall Section 401 - 37 Smm Superpave TON NOBID 5
18 ];m 1c 30121801 | Asphalt Disirict 1- Asphalt Section 401 - Base Ii TON NO BID 5
1D iR 10 30121601  Asohall District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Palch and Level TON NO BID 5
TE 17 1.E 3012160 Asphal District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON NO BID 5
1F iR 1-F 30121601 | Asphall District 1 - Asphalt Sectian 402 - Wearing IV TON NO BID 5
16 NiA 16 30121801 | Aschalt District 1 - Asphall Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON NO BID 5
iH NA 1H 130121601 | Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Seratch Course TON NO BID S
S HIA AE] 30121601 Asghal District 1 - Asphakt Section 402~ 3 Smim Superpave TON NO BID 5
1 Ik 1 30121601 Asphait District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wessring 1 TON. NO BID 5
1K A 1K 30121601 Asghalt District 1 - Asghall Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON NO BID 5
LS NrA L 30121601 | Asphatr District 1 - Asphatt Section 401 - 4 TSmm Superpave TON NO BID 5
1M A 1-M 30121601 Asphatt Oistrict 1 - Asphatt Section 402 - 4 7Smm Superpave TON NG BID 5
1N A 1N 30121601 Ashat Disinet 1 - Asghah Section 407 - Weanng lit TON NO BID 5
19 NIA 1.0 30121601 | Asphialt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing Il TON NO BID 5
P NIA 1P |20121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asghalt Plant Run TON NG BID 5
1a NIA 12 30121601 Aschalt District 1 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NO 810 5
R |hra 1R 30121601 Asghalt District 1 - Surchaige for PG Blnder - 76 inus 22 - erdared in 400 ton incramenis TON NO BID s
-AQt [NrA 1401 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Oay DAY, NG BID 5
1-AQ2 WA 1402 20121601 Asghal District 1 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY NO BID 5
2 NiA 24 130121601 Aschalt District 2 - Asphalt Seclion 401 - Base | TON NG 810 5
28 A 2.8 30121601 Asphalt Disinct 2 - Asphall Section 401 - 37 Smm Superpave TON NOBID 5
2C NiA 26 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base Il TON NO BI0 5
20 niA 2.0 30121601 Disitict 2 - Asphiak Section 401 - Patch and Level TON NO BID 5
2E NIA 2E 130121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphall Section 401 - Wearing IV TON NO BID 5
2F WA 2.F 30121601 District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON NO BID s
26 N |26 30121601 Asghalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpava TON HO BID 5
2H HA 2H 30121601 Asghalt Dislrict 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON hOBIO 5
24 NiA 24 30121601 sl Dishrict 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9 Smm Superpave TON NO BIO 5
24 Hin 2~ 130121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Weating 1 TON HO BID 5
2K A 2.k 30121601 Asghalt Distnet 2 - Asphall Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON HO BID 5
ZL NIA 21 30121601 Asphalt Disirict 2 - Asphalt Ssction 401 - 4 7Smm Superpave TON NO BID 5
M A 2M 30121601 Aschalt District 2- Section 402 - 4 75mm § TON NO BID 5
2N NiA 2N 30121501 Asghalt District 2 - Asphal Section 401 - Wearing il TON HO BI0 ]
2.0 WA 2.0 30121601 Asghalt District 2 - Asphall Setion 402 - Wearing I TON NO BID k]
2P WA 2.p 30121601 District 2- Asphalt Plant Run TON NO BID 5
20 NiA 2.0 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NO BID 5
2R ';A 28 30121601 Asphalt Distict 2- Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ardered in 400 ton increments. TON MO BID 5
2401 i 2.AQ1 30121601 Asphalt Disirict 2 - Off-Season Piant Opening - First Day DAY NO BIO s
2.A02 NiA 2-402 30121601 Asphalt District 2- Off-Season Plant Openirg - Each Additional Day DAY NO BID 5
000000176281 A CLARKSHURG ASPHALT GO [NiA £ 30121801 Asphalt Disirict 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON 5600 5
000000176281 38 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.| NIA ) 30121601 Asghalt Disirict 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37 Smm Superpave TON 5600 5
0000001 76261 3c CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.|NIA 3c 30121601 Asphalt Disirict 3 - Asphalt Secticin 401 - Base Il TON 5700 5
000000176281 30 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.| WA 30 30121601 Asghalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Paich ard Level TON 57.00 5
000000176281 3E CLARKSBURG ASPHALT GO | /A 3E 30121601 Asghalt Desinct - Asphatl Section 401 - Weanng IV TON 57.00 5
000000176281 3F CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.| WA 3F 30121601 Disirict 3 - Asphalt Sectien 402 - Wearing IV ToN 6350 5
000000175281 36 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT €O (A 3G 30121601 it District 3- Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Supsrpave TON 58.00 s
000000175281 3H CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO [N/A 3H 90121601 Asphalt District 3- Asghalt Section 401 - Seratch Course. TON 8350 5
000000176281 34 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.[hia 3 30121601 Asphait District 3 Asghalt Section 402 - 8 Smm Superpave TON 88.00 5
000000175281 34 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.|N/A 34 20121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON 6350 5
000000176281 3K CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.|N/A 3K 30121601 Asgran District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON 5800 5
0000001 76281 3L CLARKSBURG ASPHALT €0 |NIA 3L 30121601 Asphait District 3 - Asghalt Sestion 401 - 4 T5mm Superpave TON 8500 ]
000000176261 3w CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO. |NiA M 30121601 Asphalt Disirict 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4 75mm Supespave TON 8900 5
000000176281 ko CLARKSBURG ASPHALT GO. |NiA 3N 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphall Section 401 - Weafing Il TON 700 5
0000001 76281 30 CLs ASPHALT CO |NiA 30 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asghalt Section 402 - Wearing Il TON 7900 5
0000001 76281 3P CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.|NIA 3P 30121601 Aspran Distnar 3 - Asphalt Plant Run TON 6350 5
000000175281 3a CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO:|NIA 3.0 30121601 Asphat Disirict 3 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON 455 5




VENDOR CUSTOMER CODE SUPPLIER PART NUMBER  |SUFPLIER NAME MANUFACTURER NAME  [MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER COMMODITY CODE | ITEM DESCRIPTION | EXTENDED DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE  [LIST PRICE  |DELIVERY DAYS
000000176281 3R CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO | WA 3R 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordisred in 400 ton incraments: TOM 935 s
000000176281 IAGT CLARKSBURG ASFHALT CO.|nA A0 30121601 Asphah District 3 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY 4300,00/ 5
quoomnsm 3.A02 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.[/A 3402 30121601 Asphal Distnct 3 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY 1000.00 5
000000176281 +A CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.[WA 4A 30121601 Asphatt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | ToN 5600 5
000000176281 48 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.[NA 48 30121801 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37 Smim Superpave TON 56.00 5
000000176281 4C CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.[Nia 4c 30121601 Asphal Disirict 4 - Asghaft Section 407 - Base 1| TON 57.00 5
000000 176281 40 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT G |N/A 4D 30121601 Asphall District 4 - Asghalt Section 401 - Palch snd Level TON 57.00 5
000000176281 4+E CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.[NiA 4-E 30121601 Asphall Distiict 4 - Asphah Section 401 - Weating IV TON 57.00 5
0000001 75281 4F CLARKSBURG ASPHALT GO |NiA 4F 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphall Seation 402 - Wearing IV TON 6350 5
0000001 76281 4G CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO. [NiA 4G 30121801 Asphalt District 4 - Asphatt Section 401 - 18mm Superpave TON 5800/ 5
4H CLARKSBURG ASPHALT GO |NIA 4H 30121501 Asphalt Distnet 4 - Asphall Seation 401 - Seraich Course TON 63.50 5
4 CLARKSHURG ASPHALT CQ |N/A a1 3121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9 5mm Superpave TON 8800 5
4 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO [N/A 4.4 30121601 Asphal Distrct 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 Ton 55 5
4K CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO. |NIA 4K 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphatl Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON 5800 5
4L CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO. | NIA 4L 30121601 Asphat Disirict 4 - Asphait Section 401 - £ T5mim Superpave TON 8500 5
000000176281 4M CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.|NA a.M 30121601 Asphal Disirict 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4 75mm Superpave TON B9.00 5
000000176281 4N CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.|H/A N 30121601 Asphatt District 4 - Asphat Section 401 - Wearing lll TON 77.00 5
000000176281 40 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.[N/A 40 30121601 Asphall Disirict 4 - Asphall Section 402 - Wearing i TON 7800 5
000000175281 4P CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.|N/A 4P 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphat Plant Run TON B8 5
000000176281 40 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.[N/A 40 30121601 Asphatt District 4 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON 455 5
000000176281 4R CLARKSBLRG ASPHALT CO.|N/A 4R 3121601 Asphalt District 4 - Syrcharge for PG Bnder - 76 minus 22 - oidered in 400 ton increments TON 535 5
000000176281 4401 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT GO |NiA 4-AQ1 30121601 Asphak District 4 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY 400000 5
000000176281 4-AQ2 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO |NiA 4402 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY 1000.00 5
S-A NiA |54 30121601 Asphatt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON INO BID 5
58 NiA 58 |301216801 Asohalt Distiict 5 - Asphalt Sction 401 - 37 Smm Superpave TON NO BID 5
_|sc NIA sc 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphah Section 401 - Base I TON NO BID 5
5D HIA 50 30121601 Asphalt Disinct 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Paich and Level TON NO BID 5
SE NIA SE 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphatt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON NO BID 5
3F hA SF 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Sectian 402 - Wearing IV TON NO BID 5
56 A 56 30121601 Asphalt Disinct 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON NO BID 5
5H NiA 5H 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON NO BID 5
54 NIA 51 21601 Asphalt District 5 - Asghal Section 40Z - 9 Smm Superpave TON NO BID 5
2 HIA ] 30121601 Asphal Disirict 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing | TON |noBID 5
= 5-K /A 3 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asghalt Sectian 402 - Wearing 1 TON NO BID 5
EX8 A 5L 30121601 Asphalt Disirict 5 - Sestion 401 - 4 75mm Sy TON NO BID 5
SM ’N_ﬂ\ M 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Aschalt Section 402 - 4 7Smm Superpave TON NO BID 5
5N NiA 5N 30121601 Asohalt Disirict 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing I Tan NO BID 5
50 NiA 5.0 30121601 Asphalt Distriet 5 - Asphalt Section 407 - Wearing IIl TON NQ BID 5
5P A 5P 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asghal Plant Run TON NO BID 5
50 HiA 5.0 30121601 Asphalt Disirict 5 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON NO BID 5
SR NiA 5R 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Surcharge for PG Bindes - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton TON NO BID &
5401 A s.AQ1 30121801 Asphait Diatrict 5 - Off-Seison Plant Opahing - Fitat Day DAY NO BiD 5
5-AQ2 WA 5-A02 30121601 | Asphalt District 5 - Off-Season Plunt Opening - Each Additional Day DAY NO BID S
000000176281 A CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO | WA A 30121601 Asphait Dietrict & - Asghall Section 401 - Basa | TON s600| 5
000000176281 58 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO [n/A &8 30121601 | Asphait District § - Asghalt Section 401 - 37 Smm TON 5600 5
000000176281 5C CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.|NiA 5-C 30121601 Asphalt Disirict 6 - Asghall Section 401 - Base Ii Ton 57.00 5
0000001 76281 50 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO (WA 60 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphatt Section 401 - Paich and Level TON 57.00 5
0000001 76261 GE CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.|N/A E 30121601 | Asphatt Disict 6 - Asghat Section 401 - Wearing IV TON 57.00| 5
Iuooomﬂsm &F CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO |N/A 6-F 30121801 Asphalt District 5 - Asphall Section 402 - Wearing IV ToN 8350 5
0000001 76281 66 CLARKSBRG ASPHALT CO. |nis 66 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asghall Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON 58.00 5
D000 76281 5H GLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO |NIA 6-H 30121601 Asphant Diisirict & - Asphalt Section 401 - Scraich Course TON 6350 5
000000175281 & CLARKSBURG ASPHALT C0.|NIA 61 30121801 Asphalt Disirict 6 - Asphall Section 402 - 8.5mm Superpave TON ;‘ 5
000000176281 6 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT €0 |Nia 6.4 30121601 Asphalt Disirict & - Asphall Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON 6350 5
000000176281 6K CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO |NiA &K 30121601 Asphalt District & - Asphah Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON 68.00 5
000000176281 &L CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO |NIA 6L 30121601 Asphal Disinict 6 - Asphal Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 8500 5
000000176281 5-M CLA ASPHALT CO.{N/A &M 30121601 Asphall District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4 75mm Superpave TON 8300 5
000000175281 5N CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO [NiA &N 30121801 Asphall Disinct & - Asphalt Saction 401 - Weating Il TON nﬂ 5




VENDOR CUSTOMER CODE SUPPLIER PART NUMBER SUPPLIER NAME MANUFACTURER NAME MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER ICOMMODIW CODE |ITEM DESCRIPTION |EXTENDED DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE  [LIST PRICE DELIVERY DAYS
000000176281 6.0 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO, |M/A -0 |!!2|$J1  Asphalt Dhstrict 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing Il TON 79.00] 5.
0000001 TE281 6P CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO/|N/A [ 30121601 | Asphatl Dustrict & - Asphah Plant Run TON 63 501 5
&Q CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.[W/A 60 30121601 | Asphalt District 6 - Sumharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON 455 5
&R CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.[N/A &R 30121601 | Asphalt Disirict 6 - Surcharge for PG Bindér - 76 minius 22 - ordared in 400 ten incremants. TON 835 5
&AQY CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.{NiA 5-AQ1 30121601 | Asphalt District & - Off-Seasaon Plant Opening - First Day DAY 4000 00, 5
68-AQ2 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO [NiA B-AQ2 3012160 | Asphail Dustnct B - Off-Sesson Plant Opening - Esch Additonal Day DAY 1000 00| 5
A CLARKSBURG ASPHALT GO [N 74 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON 56.00 5
8 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO [NiA 7.8 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphah Sectior 401 - 37 Sinm Superpave TON 56.00 5
ic CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CC. |N/A 7€ 30121601 Asphalt (Drstnct 7 - Asphiah Section 401 - Base Il TON S57.00] ]
70 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO [N/A 7-0 30121801 Aspha District 7 - Asphah Section 401 - Paich ard Level TON 57,00 5
7E CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO [N/A 7-E 30121601 District 7 - Asphal Section 401 - Wearing IV TON 57.00] £l
[k CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO |N/A 7 30121601 Asphalt Drsirict 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON B350 5
TG CLARKSHURG ASPHALT CO |N/A 7-G 30121601 Azphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave ToN 58.00] 5
7H CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.[N/A 7-H 30121601 Asphalt Disdrict 7 - Asphall Section 401 - Scralch Course TON 6350 5
7 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT COL|N/A 7l 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphall Section 402 - 8.51im Superpave TON 68.00] 5
7-d CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.|W/A 7-d 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Sechon 401 - Wearing 1 TON 63.50 5
7K CLARKSEURG ASPHALT CO.|NiA T-K 30121601 | Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON B58.00 5
7L CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.[NiA 7L 30121601 Asphat Disirict 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4 75mm Superpave TON 8500 L]
M CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO. |NiA 7-M 30121601 Asphall District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4 7Smm Superpave TON 89.00! 5
7N CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO [Nia 7N 30121601 Asphiait District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Weanng Il TON 77.ﬂ 5
7o CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO |N/A 7-0 30121601 Asphall District 7 - Asphalt Seation 402 - Wearing lll ToN 79.00/ 5
7P CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.[NIA 7P 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Plant Run TOoM 63.50 El
7-Q CLAJ ASPHALT CO. [NiA 7-0 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Surcharge for PG Birider - 70 minus 22 TON 455 5
7R CL/ ASPHALT CO. |N/A R 30121601 Azphalt Distnat 7 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordesed in 400 ten TON 8.25 5
7-AQ1 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.|N/A 7-AQH 30121601 Asghall Dishrict 7 - Off-Seasan Plant Opening - First Day DAY 4000 00 5
7-AQ2 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.|NiA 7-AQ2 30121601 Asphall District 7 - Off-Seasan Plant Opéning - Each Additional Day DAY 1000.00 5
B-A CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.|N/A B-A 30121600 Asphalt District B - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON NO BID 5
88 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.|NA 8.8 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37 Smm Superpave TON NO BID 5
8-c CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO. (WA B8-C 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base Il TON NO BID 5
8-0 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO [NiA B0 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphatt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON NO BID 5
8-E CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.[NA BE 30121601 it District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON NO BID 5
8-F CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO m.& 8-F 30121601 E District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON NO BID 5
8G CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO |NIA BG 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphaht Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON NO BID 5
B8-H CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO, |N/A 8H 30121601 | Asphalt Distnict 8 - Asphatt Section 401 - Scraich Coursa TON NO BID )
&1 CLS ASPHALT CO.[N/A Bl 30121601 Asphall District 8 - Asghalt Section 402 - 9.6mm Supsipave TON MO BID 5
8- CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO [N/A 8 3021601 Asphalt Disirict 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 5
8K CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO. | N/A &K 30121601 Asphalt Dislrict B - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 5
8L CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO [NA 8L 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphall Section 401 - 4 7Smim Superpave 5
8M CLARKSBURS ASPHALT CO [ra 8-M 0121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphal Section 402 - 4 TSmm Supermave: ]
8N CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.|NA BN 30121601 Asphaht Dstrict 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing Il 5
80 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO [NiA 8.0 30121601 Asphalt District B - Asphalt Section 407 - Wearing 1l 5
8.p CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.[NiA 8-p 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Piant Run s
80 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO.|NIA BQ 30121801 Asphalt District B - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 5
&R CL# ASPHALT CO.|NIA B8R 30121601 Asphatt District B - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus. 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments: 5
B.AQ1 CLARKSBURG ASPHALT CO |NiA 8-AQ1 0121601 Asghelt District & - O -Season Plant Opening - First Day 5
B-AG2 CL/ ABPHALT CO.|N/A 8-AQ2 301216 District 8 - OR-Seasan Plant Opening - Each Additional Day 5
A A 94 20121601 Asohall District 8 - Asghal Section 401 - Base | 5
__le8 NIA Xl 30121601 Asphalt District 9- Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave 5
SC A SC 30121601 Asphall District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base Il 5
2.0 NIA 90 30121601 Asphalt Distnct 9 - Asphalt Secticn 401 - Patch and Level s
SE A SE 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphatt Section 401 - Wearing IV s
it [L13 9F 30121601 Asghalt District 8- Asghall Section 402 - Wessing V. 5
86 A a6 30121601 Asghat District - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave 5
l_S-H NIA S-H 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - it Section 401 - Scratch Course 5
Eil NIA 94 30121501 Asphalt Distnet 9 - Asphall Section 402 - 8 Smim Superpave 5
e L 9.4 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 5
———= K NIA 13K 30121601 Asghalt District 8 - Asphali Sextion 407 - Wearing 1 5




VENDOR CUSTOMER CODE

SUPPLIER PART NUMBER  [SUPPLIER NAME MANUFACTURER NAME  [MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER COMMODITY CODE [ITEM DESCRIPTION |EXTENDED DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE |LISTPRICE | DELIVERY DAYS.
9L NiA oL 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4 73mm Superpave 5
8-M A oM 30121601 Asghatt Disdrict 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4 75mm Supsipave 5
kdy] NA aN 30121601 | Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing Il 5
20 A 90 30121601 Aschat Disirict 9 - Asphalt Seclion 402 - 1 $
9P NA 9-p 30121601 Asghat Diistrict 9 - Asphalt Plant Run 5
9.0 [ £ 30121601 | Aschalt Disinet 9 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 ninus 22 5
28 A 9R 20121801 | Asphar FEMMDWWMW H
S-AT1T NIA 2:4Q1 30121601 Asohalt District 9 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Fitst Day 5
9-AQ2 Nia 9.A02 30121601 Asphalt Distnct 3 - Off-Sewson Plant Opening - Each Additional Day 5
10-A A 104 30121601 Asghal District 10 - Aspha Section 401 - Base | 5
108 NIA 108 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37 Smm Superpave 5
1-c HIA 10C 30121601 | Asghatt Disttict 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base Il s
100 A 100 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Palch and Level 5
10-E A 10E 30121601 Asphialt District 10 - Asphatt Section 401 - Weanng v 5
10:F A 10-F 30121601 Asphat District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV 5
126 A 10-G 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphait Section 401 - 19mm Superpave 5
10H NiA 10+ 30121601 Asptial District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course 5
18- NIA 104 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9 5mim Superpave 8
104 ’M\ 104 30121601 Asphall District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 5
10K NiA 10K |a0121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 5
104 IR 104 30121601 Asphat District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4 75min Superpave 5
10-M Ni& 10-M 30121601 Asphalt Distct 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4 75mm Superpave 5
10N A 10N 30121601 | Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing i1l 5
10-0 A 10:0 30121601 Asphisht District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing Il 5
1P NiA 10.P 321601 Asohalt District 10 - Asphalt Plant Run 5
10-0 A 10-2 30121601 | Asohatt Disttict 10 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 5
10-R nis 10-R 30121601 | Aspiratt District 10 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton incremants TON NO BID 5
10-A01 NiA 10-AQ1 30121601 Asohalt District 10 - Off-Searson Plant Opening - First Day DAY NOBID 5
10-AT2 NiA 10402 30121601 Asphatt District 10 - Off-Setrson Plant Opening - Each Additiral Day DAY NO BID 5




STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code § 5-22-1(i), the contracting public entity shall not award a
construction contract to any bidder that is known to be in defauit on any monetary obligation owed lo the state or a
political subdivision of the state, including, but not limited to, obligations related to payroll taxes, property taxes, sales and
use taxes, fire sarvice fees, or other fines or fees.

ALL CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state
or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related
party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand
dollars in the aggregate; or (2) the debtor is in employer default,

EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above doss not apply where a vendor has coniesiad any tax administerad pursuant to chapter
eleven of the W. Va. Cade, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the matter has
not become final or where the vendor has entered intc a payment pian or agreement and the vendor is not in defait of any of the
provisions of such plan or agreement.

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penaity, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its political
subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers' compensation premium, penalty
ar other assessment presently deiinquent or due and requirad to be paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, Including
any interest or addifional penalties acerued therean,

“Employer defzult” means having an outsianding balance or liability to the old fund or to the uninsured employers’ fund or being
in policy defautt, as defined in W, Va, Code § 23-2c-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers' compensation coverage, or failure to
fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An empioyer is not in employer defsult if it has entered
into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Commissioner and remains in compliance with the obligations under the
repayment agreement.

“Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, parinership, assoclation, limited liabifity company or any other
form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through
which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect recsive or
contro! @ portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an
amount that mests or excead five parcent of the total contract amount.

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor’s authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penaity of
law for false swearing (W. Va. Code §61-5-3) that: (1) for construction contracts, the vendor is not in default on
any monetary obligation owed to the state or 2 political subdivision of the state, and (2) for all other coniracis,
that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined above and that neither vendor nor any related
party are in employer default as defined above, unless the debt or employer defauit is permitted under the
exception above.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:
Vendor's Name: CLARKSBYRG/ASPHALT COMPANY

Authorized Signature: M’%% ROBERT A. HENN Date:  12/18/2018
i

stateof VWEST VIRGINIA

County of MONONGALIA g—

Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this _l_gc%of M . 20_1__%'
=y

MNOTARY PUBLIC
TA EST VIRGINI
S e by Purchasing Affidavit 9r2015)
1092 Snake Hill Rd,

=" My Commission Expires Segtember 09, 2020

My Commission explmg}gﬁ q s 2@;9 %LO
AFFULORRNL HERE e NOTARY PUBLIC ‘ | bb\_CQ’ \




West Virginia Ethics Commission
Disclosure of Interested Parties to Contracts
(Required by W. Va. Code § 8D-1-2)

Name of Contracting Business Entity: GREER IND., INC. Address: 570 CANYON ROAD
MORGANTOWN, WV 26508

Name of Authorized Agent: ROBERT A. HENN, VP Address: 570 CANYON ROAD

Contract Number: DOT1900000052 Contract Description; ASPHALT MATERIALS PICKUP

Governmental agency awarding contract: STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

O Check here If this is a Supplemental Disclosure

List the Names of Interested Parties to the contract which are knawn or reasonably anticipated by the contracting business
entity for each category below (attach additional pages if necessary):

1. Subcontractors or other entities performing work or service under the Contract
& Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

2. Any person or entity who owns 25% or more of contracting entity (not applicable to publicly traded entities)
O Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

JOHN R. RAESE & DAVID A. RAESE

3. Any person or entity that facilitated, or negotiated the terms of, the applicable contract (excluding legal
services related to the negotiation or drafting of the applicable contract)

O Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

Notary Verification
State of ___WEST VIRGINIA , County of ___ MONONGALIA
I, ROBERT A. HENN , the authorized agent of the contracting business

entity listed above, being duly swom, acknowledge that the Disclosure herein is being made under oath and under the
penalty of perjury.

O and subseribed teforg me this ,—[— gﬁ' day of. D&c—-«-—&_u,- ; [g .

j 1033 Srake Hil Re. Notary Public’s-Signature

Date submitted to Ethics Commission;
Governmental agency submitting Disclosure:

Revised June 8, 2018



WV-10 State of West Virginia

Approved / Revised

06108/18 VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Vendor Preference, if applicable.

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia, or bidder is a partnership, association
or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West
Virginia, for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

I:I.-‘

Bidder is a resident vendor partnership, association, or corporation with at least eighty percent of ownership interest
of bidder held by another entity that meets the applicable four year residency requirement: or,

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

U [

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

N
<J*

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor that employs a minimum of one hundred state residents, or a nonresident vendor which
has an affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia and
employs a minimum of one hundred state residents, and for purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or
completing the project which is the subject of the bidder's bid and continuously over the entire term of the project, on
average at least seventy-five percent of the bidder's employees or the bidder's affiliate's or subsidiary's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years and the
vendor’s bid; or,

D.w

Application is made for 5% vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked: .

Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

I:I.“‘ I:"
<

Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard,_ if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor’s bid and
continuausly over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

Application is made for preference as a non-resident small, women- and minority-owned business, in accor-
dance with West Virginia Code §5A-3-59 and West Virginia Code of State Rules.

[1 Bidder has been or expects to be approved prior to contract award by the Purchasing Division as a certified small, women-
and minority-owned business.

8. Application is made for reciprocal preference. , _
Bidder is a West Virginia resident and is requesting reciprocal preference to the extent that it applies.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) rescind the contract or purchase order;
or (b) assess a penalty against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to
the contracting agency or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order,

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder

Ds»

o

and if anything contained within this certificate changes during th e contract, Bidder will notify the Purchas-
ing Division in writing immediately.

Bidder: CLARKSBURG ASPHALT COMPANY Signed: - OBERT A. HENN

Date: 11/20/2018 Title: VICE PRESIDENT

*Check any combination of preference consideration(s) indicated above, which you are entitled to receive.
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CONTRACTOR LICENSE

Authorized by the

West Virginia Contractor Licensing Board

Number: WV003348
Classification:
ASPHALT
SPECIALTY
GREER INDUSTRIES INC
DBA GREER INDUSTRIES INC
570 CANYON ROAD
MORGANTOWN, WV 26508
Date Issued Expiration Date
SEPTEMBER 05, 2018 SEPTEMBER 05, 2019
A A
— A 4 / =
Oletarsns 0T aga- ve/cle .5 //MZ/

{Authorized Companygignalm'c Chair, West Virginia Contractor
Licensing Board
m ARD This license, or a copy thereof, must be posted in a conspicuous place at every construction site where work is being

performed. This license number must appear in all advertisements, on all bid submissions and on all fully executed
and binding contracts. This license cannot be assigned or transferred by licensee, Issued under provisions of West

PAAAAAAAAY Virginia Code, Chapter 21, Article 11.
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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)
11115/2018

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AM

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE-HOLDER. THIS
END,
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUT

EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
E A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of t
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of

such endorsement(s).

policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
he policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on

Morgantown, WV 26507-1300

PRODUCER CONTACT

Marsh USA Inc. e AX

Six PPG Place, Suite 300 _(A/C, No, Ext): | (AT, Noj:

Pittsburgh, PA 15222 E-MAIL N

Attn: Joshua Zunic 412-552-5066 -ADDRESS: : -

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #

CN101576982--MNG-18-19 | INSURER A : Charter Oak Fire Insurance Company 25615
gy INSURER B : The Standard Fire Insurance Company 19070

P.0. Box 1800 INSURER C : BrickStreet Mulual Insurance Co. 12372

INSURER D : N/A N/A
INSURERE : N/A . NfA o
INSURERF :

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER:

CLE-005736508-10 REVISION NUMBER: 3

INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD

CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS

INSR

[ADDL[SUBR [ POLICY EFF | POLICY EXP
LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE {INSD | wyvD POLICY NUMBER L {MM/DD/YYYY) | (MM/DD/YYYY) LTS
A T X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY Y-630-20100622-COF-18 010172018 [OUO12019 | gachocCURRENCE |5 1,000,000
| I'x-l ‘ [ DAMAGE TORENTED | 300,000
| CLAMS-MADE | * | OCCUR | | PREMISES (Ea cccurrence} | § ~300,000]
X | Prop Damage/Cccur Ded: $10,000 | MED EXP (Any one persan) | § 10.000
| ) s "IN s | | PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | § 1,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: | | GENERAL AGGREGATE $ 2,000,000
| GE ZGAT] “PLIE
| poLicY e | x| iee ‘ ‘ PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | § 2,000,000
OTHER. = ‘ SINGLE LT :
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY | [ : FEOMAED s
ANY AUTO I ‘ BODILY INJURY (Per person) | §
~ | owNED ~ | SCHEDULED 8 INJURY (Per accident)|
AUTOS ONLY AUTOS | BODILY {Per ac en): $
HIRED | NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE s
AUTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY [ (Per accident) |
|'s
| umBrELLALIAE | OCCUR EACH OCCURRENGE 5
| EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE | AGGREGATE $
| DED || RETENTIONS = : $
B WORKERS COMPENSATION YC-UB-2010063-4-18 [01/0772018  [0701/2019 X[EER e | B0
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY Vi
ANYPROPRIETORPARTNEREXECUTIVE ‘NM (CT, IL, IN, MD, MI, NC, PA) ELEACHACCIDENT | 1,000,000
|
C | oty o | WCB1011617 (WV) o1/012018  |O10V2019 | ) pisease - EAEMPLOYEE, § 1,000,000
If yes, describe under 1,000,000
DESCRIPT.ON OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | §
|

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)
State of WV is included as Additional Insured where required by written contract with respect to Gereral Liability.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

State of WV
1900 Kanawha Bivd E, Bldg 5
Charleston, WV 25305

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
of Marsh USA Inc.

Manashi Mukherjee
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