
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Proc Folder :

Solicitation Description :

Proc Type :

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

Solicitation Response

Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Charleston, WV 25305-0130
Post Office Box 50130

State of West Virginia

517239

ADDENDUM 1 ASPHALT - MATERIALS AND PICKUP BY WVDOH

Central Master Agreement

2018-12-19

13:30:00

SR 0803 ESR12181800000002872 1

 VENDOR

000000201645

JEFFERSON ASPHALT PRODUCTS CO INC

Comments:

Total Bid : Response Date: Response Time:Total Bid : 

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT1900000052

$0.00 2018-12-18 14:27:09

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001

Crystal Rink

(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.rink@wv.gov
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

1 ASPHAT MATERIALS AND PICKUP
BY WVDOH

0.00000 EA $0.000000 $0.00

30121601

ASPHALT - MATERIALS AND PICKUP BY WVDOH PER THE ATTACHED PRICING PAGES/E-CATALOG

Comments: Inwood Plant Catalog



Vendor's Plant Location: 

1.21Auvo 	Pi +- 

(A/v 	Lt  

Vendor's Plant Location: 

Vendor's Plant Location: 

Vendor's Plant Location: 

VENDOR NAME 

INFORMATION ATTACHMENT FORM 
Vendor's Storage Sites 

Asphalt - Materials and Pickup by WVDOH Forces, ONLY 

•j-c 1-1,-crfa,4  R orAvc, , s (o kroony 

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission. 

If a Vendor will be supplying materials from multiple Plant Locations and ALL pricing is the same, ALL Plant  
Locations can be listed on one Information Attachment Form and one bid submission is acceptable.  
If a Vendor will be supplying materials from multiple Plant Locations, at varying prices, additional, separate  

bid submissions must be submitted for each Plant Location bid. Multple Plant Locations with varying prices, 

shall be submitted on separate bid submissions.  



Signature: 

penalty of perjury. 

Taken, sworn to and subscribed before me this 	7 n4  

To be completed by State Agency:  
Date Received by State Agency:   
Date submitted to Ethics Commission: 
Governmental agency submitting Disclosure:  

111111111111111111111 111111111111111111111M111111111111/11111= 
OFFICIAL SEAL 

NOTARY PURIM 
§TENAIWAriey  NIA i 

315  Porter Avenue 	-- 

West Virginia Ethics Commission 

Disclosure of Interested Parties to Contracts 
(Required by W. Va. Code § BD-1-2) 

iO A PS /ei\A It 

Name of Contracting Business Entity: ?r- oi,LJ:15  LO N/4 r)  Address:  175 oiv, 5.11•10,,y‘ 	Uiit' 

Ckkrit 5  )0  n Vik Z5-(-  

..."-tA 0 ,/vx=", 5  Address:  75" )011 0  -7-- TA  0415  Name of Authorized Agent: 'Jae/US  

Contract Number: CR F-Q 08,-)3 Do  r/ i000 too s2 Contract Description:  ykji . 	b_,--/4 ec.iclo ,j14,00/-i 

Governmental agency awarding contract:  u.\,/ vo 014  

❑ Check here If this is a Supplemental Disclosure 

List the Names of Interested Parties to the contract which are known or reasonably anticipated by the contracting business 
entity for each category below (attach additional pages if necessary): 

1. Subcontractors or other entities performing work or service under the Contract 

tit Check here if none. otherwise list entity/individual names below. 

2. Any person or entity who owns 25% or more of contracting entity (not applicable to publicly traded entities) 

Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below. 

JOkn J 1joM 4 .1 

rn e 
3. Any person or entity that facilitated, or negotiated the terms of, the applicable contract (excluding legal 

services related to the negotiation or drafting of the applicable contract) 

❑ Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below. 

srk 

Not 	rification 

Date Signed:  le-4?/zo /  

state of \EST v 1 ~C,101 	, County of 	 

1, 	PoKE5 	• -rikolv\Ks 	, the authorized agent of the contracting business 
entity listed above, being duly sworn, acknowledge that the Disclosure herein is being made under oath and under the 

— Martinsburg, WV 25401 
— — 	 My Commission Expires June 26, 2023 = 
'21111111111111Milliflitisio lllll • lllllllllll toiliiimit= 



DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as the 
Contract ministrator and the init .  l point of contact fo matters relating to this Contract. 

ame, Title) 
J61 ,44 ,5  /4/. 71) 

(Printed Name and Title) 

e5• (c
e,r) 

 

,,  014rle 5 Tc;4<//i  w'V Z5Vete  
(A dress) 
30 c./-7Z S Z f 3 9 	 e<Y6  

(Phone Number) / ax Number) 	 tt 1‘&11  r  	. of f' 
(email address 

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation 
through wvOASIS, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand 
the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid, offer 
or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the product 
or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for that 
product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and 
conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that I am submitting this 
bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; that I am authorized by the vendor to execute 
and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor's behalf; that 
I am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of my 
knowledge, the vendor has properly registered with any State agency that may require 
registration. 

, 	, 
jegefocciel /9 5/0A.411 rockicfs  

(Comp y) 

)47 	Pre>/ tolef4  
orized Signature) (Representative Name, Title' 

4rrieS P2' 71)0/41 	1re5I deir-t9  
(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative) 

/2 47/z0/  
(Date) 

3D ,1-7zc- Z5'39 	30V- 728- 8s--(7/‘ 
(Phone Number) (Fax Number) 

Revised 06/08/2018 



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION 
CRFQ DOT1900000052 

Asphalt Materials and Pickup by Agency 

10.2.3 Any other remedies available in law or equity. 

11. MISCELLENOUS: 

No Substitutions: The Vendor shall supply only Contract Items submitted in 
response to this Solicitation unless a contract modification is approved in 
accordance with the provisions contained in this Contract. 

11.2 Vendor Supply: The Vendor must carry sufficient inventory of the Contract 
Items being offered to fulfill its obligations under this Contract. By signing its 
bid, the Vendor certifies that it can supply the Contract Items contained in its bid 
response. 

11.3 Reports: The Vendor shall provide quarterly reports and annual summaries to 
the Agency showing the Contract Items purchased, quantities of Contract Items 
purchased and the total dollar value of the Contract Items purchased. The Vendor 
shall also provide reports, upon request, showing the Contract Items purchased 
during the term of this Contract, the quantity purchased for each of those Contract 
Items and the total value of purchases for each of those Contract Items. Failure to 
supply such reports may be grounds for cancellation of this Contract. 

11.4 Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contract, the Vendor must 
designate and maintain a primary contract manager responsible for overseeing the 
Vendor's responsibilities under this Contract. The Contract manager must be 
available during normal business hours to address any customer service or other 
issues related to this Contract. The Vendor should list its Contract manager and 
his or her contact information below, 

Contract Manager: 
Telephone Number: 
Fax Number: 
Email Address: 

..5-a /1') e S /44  I  

30Y- 77-—Z3  

349 ,1-728—P—  
ho 	g;)  C 

Revised 10/27/2014 



STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA 
Purchasing Division 

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT 
CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code § 5-22-1(i), the contracting public entity shall not award a 
construction contract to any bidder that is known to be in default on any monetary obligation owed to the state or a 
political subdivision of the state, including, but not limited to, obligations related to payroll taxes, property taxes, sales and 
use taxes, fire service fees, or other fines or fees. 

ALL CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state 
or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related 
party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand 
dollars in the aggregate; or (2) the debtor is In employer default. 

EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to chapter 
eleven of the W. Va Code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the matter has 
not become final or where the vendor has entered Into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the 
provisions of such plan or agreement 

DEFINITIONS: 

"Debt' means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its political 
subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers' compensation premium, penalty 
or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state or any of Its political subdivisions, Including 
any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon. 

"Employer default" means having an outstanding balance or liability to the old fund or to the uninsured employers' fund or being 
in policy default, as defined in W. Va. Code § 23-2c-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers' compensation coverage, or failure to 
fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An employer Is not in employer default If it has entered 
into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Commissioner and remains in compliance with the obligations under the 
repayment agreement. 

"Related party" means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other 
form of business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through 
which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive or 
control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an 
amount that meets or excasd five percent of the total contract amount. 

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendors authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penalty of 
law for false swearing (W. Va. Code §61-5-3) that: (1) for construction contracts, the vendor is not in default on 
any monetary obligation owed to the state or c political subdivision of the state, and (2) for all other comracis, 
that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined above and that neither vendor nor any related 
party are in employer default as defined above, unless the debt or employer default Is permitted under the 
exception above. 

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE: 

Vendor's Name: 

Authorized Signature: 

State of \4ES1' y fecN.look.  

County  of  .3EcPEs_so,k 	to-wit: 

Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this rriciav of 

24.  My Commission expires 	Or.)t E.  

• 

CIP1(4 	)1  

Date: 	 — 7-Z-9/8  

.ECE'iNk8F1?.  - 

, 20 23 

,20 le . 

NOTARY PUBLIC AFFIX SEAL HERE 

romiummuumumummosommusunsumus 
OFFICIAL SEAL 

NOTARY PIN= 
STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA F. 

David 5 McCauley 
315 Porter Avenue 

Martinsburg, WV 25401 
My Commission Expires June 26, 2023 — 

=usimistimiliniumensitsminumisiemitims= 

••• 
•  

011191/1018) 



VENDOR - — 
Vendor Name, Address and Telephbne Number 

e  er5  0 	A5pho 1 F P rucevc;fc 	t4, vi,y 

( 	„yrs-  	(Aovvl c  

( 	te s 	 vs.A/ 

..2 C- f 3 

51U0 RECEIVING LOCATION 

BID CLERK 

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION 

PURCHASING DIVISION 

2019 WASHINGTON ST E 

CHARLESTON 	 WV 	25305 

US 

Purchasing Divlson 
2019 Washington Street East 
Post Office Box 50130 
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 

State of West Virginia 
Request for Quotation 

19 — Highways 

Proc Folder: 517239 

Doe Description: ASPHALT - MATERIALS AND PICKUP BY VVVDOH 

Proc Type: Central Master,greement  
Solicitation Closes 	Solicitation No Version 

2018-11-28 2018-12-19 

13:30:00 

Date Issued 

CRFQ 	0803 DOT1900000052 

7)7f  	  FEIN  5c..-0 Cf Z2Ct7 
to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation 

Signature 

All offe 

DATE (; 7//  

Page 1 	 FORM ID: VW-PRC-CRFQ-001 

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER 

Crystal Rink 

(304) 558-2402 
crystal.g.rink@wv.gov  



Page : 1 FORM ID WV-PRC-CRFQ-001 

All off rs subj= t to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation 

Purchasing Divison 
2019 Washington Street East 
Pest Office Box 50130 
C iarleston, WV 25305 -0130 

State of West Virginia 
Request for Quotation 

19 — Highways 

Proc Folder: 517239 

Doc Description: ADDENDUM 1 ASPHALT - MATERIALS AND PICKUP BY VVVDOH 

Proc Type: Central Maste Agreement 
Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version 

2018-12-04 2018-12-19 CRFQ 	0803 DOT1900000052 2 

13.30 . 00 

BID CLERK 

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION 

PURCHASING DIVISION 

2019 WASHINGTON ST E 

CHARLESTON 

US 

WV 	25305 

VENDOR 

Vendor Nae, Address an 

° A 

115—  Sohn 

Telephone Number: ,  

50‘1,4.0-  rr-akict5 
-rho 	Li4AA  

lA6,  

COlvif n. l) 

304-1-7z- zr3 

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER 

Crystal Rink 

(304) 558-2402 
crystal.g.rink@wv.gov  



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM 
SOLICITATION NO.: CRFQ DOTi 900000052 

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by 
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum 
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. 

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the 
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc. 

Addendum Numbers Received: 
(Check the box next to each addendum received) 

[3 Addendum No. 1 
❑ Addendum No. 2 
❑ Addendum No. 3 
❑ Addendum No. 4 
❑ Addendum No. 5 

1=1 Addendum No. 6 
Addendum No. 7 

❑ Addendum No. 8 
❑ Addendum No. 9 
❑ Addendum No. 10 

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. 
I fixther understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral 
discussion held between Vendor's representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only 
the information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is 
binding. 

7--  
5 on Aer-t4, rrodtic.,44 	"C)/11/06  t• 

C mpan 

ed Signature 

h7 A 0 /6 

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite 
document processing. 

ate 

Revised 06/08/2018 
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SECTION 1:' DRUG AND ALCOHOL FREE WOR PLACE: 

AFFIDAVIT 

DRUG & ALCOHOL FREE WORKPLACE 

e$1.1(ion 116po- Roduds C
911YA 	

("Contractor"), a 

\A/ G4 fir)itev iA 	corporation (state of incorporation), by 

(Y) 	(officer 	or 	agent 	signing), 

?rC); hit')  (title), does swear or affirm that the Contractor has a written plan for a 

drug-free workplace policy and maintains a valid drug-free workplace policy in compliance with Chapter 21, Article 

ID of the West Virginia Code, 1931, as amended. 

The Drug and Alcohol Free Workplace representative is ?r oc.e, C 

 
 

A.5pL Pro4,,-6 
--€4-fte 5trin  

(Cdntractor) 

/ 1 '  

Pr., ;`114-y-0-1 

Date  /2-'1  7-z069 

STATE OF N\I  

COUNTY OF'-- tccze)Met/N 
Taken, subscribed and sworn before me this 

20 XV by trt0•3NNO,21/06,)6CAk  

	day of 	sts  ?`/NNINe'r 

 

 

hauktocgoax5ck 

My Commission expires 01 \ iic\  

  

Notary Public 

 

    

Notary Seal is required 
I 

.........46+-116+-........ ...dr  
NOTARY PUBLIC OFFK 

DEANNA TALBOTT 	I 
State of West Virginia 	I 

, 	 Commission Empires 
;'7:'..;,,v 	September 18, 2022 	

I 

:4;9404;$4.4„Nr.wiririrrCourt tASItinsbuil.W 2540" 



Date Issued 
	

Expiration Date 

AUGUST 06, 2018 	 AUGUST 06, 2019 

uthorized Company Signature 	 Chair, West Virginia ontractor 
Licensing Board 

• • • • • • • • • • • • V • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • IF If • • • 

ia5-1/SiViGINIA 
CONTRACTOR 

LICENSING 
BOARD 

■A • • • • • • AA 

CONTRACTOR LICENSE 
Authorized by the 

West Virginia Contractor Licensing Board 

Number: 	WV000499 

Classification: 

DEMOLITION 
ASPHALT 
EXCAVATION 

JEFFERSON ASPHALT PRODUCTS COMPANY 
DBA JEFFERSON ASPHALT PRODUCTS COMPANY 
175 JOHN J THOMAS WAY 
CHARLES TOWN, WV 25414-0131 

This license, or a copy thereof, must be posted in a conspicuous place at every construction site where work is being 
performed. This license number must appear in all advertisements, on all bid submissions and on all fully executed 
and binding contracts. This license cannot be assigned or transferred by licensee. Issued under provisions of West 
Virginia Code. Chapter 21, Article 11. 



VENDOR CUSTOMER CODE SUPPLIER PART 

NUMBER

SUPPLIER NAME MANUFACTURER 

NAME

MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

COMMODITY CODE ITEM DESCRIPTION EXTENDED DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE LIST PRICE DELIVERY DAYS

000000201645 1-A Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-A 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5

000000201645 1-B Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-B 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 1-C Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-C 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5

000000201645 1-D Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-D 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5

000000201645 1-E Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-E 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5

000000201645 1-F Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-F 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5

000000201645 1-G Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-G 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 1-H Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-H 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5

000000201645 1-I Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-I 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 1-J Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-J 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 1-K Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-K 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 1-L Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-L 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 1-M Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-M 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 1-N Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-N 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5

000000201645 1-O Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-O 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5

000000201645 1-P Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-P 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5

000000201645 1-Q Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 1-R Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-R 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5

000000201645 1-AQ1 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5

000000201645 1-AQ2 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 1-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5

000000201645 2-A Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-A 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5

000000201645 2-B Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-B 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 2-C Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-C 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5

000000201645 2-D Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-D 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5

000000201645 2-E Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-E 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5

000000201645 2-F Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-F 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5

000000201645 2-G Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-G 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 2-H Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-H 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5

000000201645 2-I Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-I 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 2-J Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-J 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 2-K Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-K 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 2-L Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-L 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 2-M Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-M 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 2-N Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-N 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5

000000201645 2-O Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-O 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5

000000201645 2-P Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-P 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5

000000201645 2-Q Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 2-R Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-R 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5

000000201645 2-AQ1 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5

000000201645 2-AQ2 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 2-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5

000000201645 3-A Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-A 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5

000000201645 3-B Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-B 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 3-C Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-C 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5

000000201645 3-D Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-D 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5

000000201645 3-E Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-E 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5

000000201645 3-F Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-F 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5

000000201645 3-G Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-G 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 3-H Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-H 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5

000000201645 3-I Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-I 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5



VENDOR CUSTOMER CODE SUPPLIER PART 

NUMBER

SUPPLIER NAME MANUFACTURER 

NAME

MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

COMMODITY CODE ITEM DESCRIPTION EXTENDED DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE LIST PRICE DELIVERY DAYS

000000201645 3-J Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-J 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 3-K Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-K 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 3-L Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-L 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 3-M Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-M 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 3-N Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-N 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5

000000201645 3-O Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-O 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5

000000201645 3-P Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-P 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5

000000201645 3-Q Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 3-R Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-R 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5

000000201645 3-AQ1 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5

000000201645 3-AQ2 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 3-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5

000000201645 4-A Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-A 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5

000000201645 4-B Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-B 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 4-C Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-C 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5

000000201645 4-D Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-D 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5

000000201645 4-E Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-E 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5

000000201645 4-F Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-F 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5

000000201645 4-G Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-G 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 4-H Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-H 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5

000000201645 4-I Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-I 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 4-J Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-J 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 4-K Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-K 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 4-L Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-L 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 4-M Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-M 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 4-N Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-N 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5

000000201645 4-O Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-O 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5

000000201645 4-P Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-P 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5

000000201645 4-Q Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 4-R Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-R 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5

000000201645 4-AQ1 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5

000000201645 4-AQ2 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 4-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5

000000201645 5-A Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-A 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON $49.00 5

000000201645 5-B Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-B 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON $49.75 5

000000201645 5-C Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-C 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON $55.50 5

000000201645 5-D Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-D 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON $55.50 5

000000201645 5-E Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-E 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON $55.50 5

000000201645 5-F Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-F 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON $60.75 5

000000201645 5-G Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-G 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON $56.50 5

000000201645 5-H Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-H 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON $62.50 5

000000201645 5-I Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-I 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON $68.50 5

000000201645 5-J Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-J 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON $62.50 5

000000201645 5-K Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-K 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON $68.25 5

000000201645 5-L Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-L 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON $92.00 5

000000201645 5-M Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-M 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON $103.00 5

000000201645 5-N Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-N 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON $92.00 5

000000201645 5-O Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-O 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON $103.00 5

000000201645 5-P Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-P 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Plant Run TON $62.50 5

000000201645 5-Q Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON $3.00 5

000000201645 5-R Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-R 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON $9.00 5
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000000201645 5-AQ1 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY $3,000.00 5

000000201645 5-AQ2 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 5-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY $1,000.00 5

000000201645 6-A Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-A 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5

000000201645 6-B Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-B 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 6-C Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-C 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5

000000201645 6-D Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-D 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5

000000201645 6-E Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-E 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5

000000201645 6-F Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-F 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5

000000201645 6-G Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-G 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 6-H Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-H 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5

000000201645 6-I Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-I 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 6-J Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-J 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 6-K Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-K 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 6-L Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-L 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 6-M Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-M 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 6-N Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-N 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5

000000201645 6-O Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-O 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5

000000201645 6-P Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-P 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5

000000201645 6-Q Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 6-R Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-R 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5

000000201645 6-AQ1 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5

000000201645 6-AQ2 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 6-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5

000000201645 7-A Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-A 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5

000000201645 7-B Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-B 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 7-C Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-C 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5

000000201645 7-D Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-D 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5

000000201645 7-E Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-E 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5

000000201645 7-F Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-F 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5

000000201645 7-G Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-G 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 7-H Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-H 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5

000000201645 7-I Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-I 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 7-J Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-J 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 7-K Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-K 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 7-L Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-L 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 7-M Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-M 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 7-N Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-N 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5

000000201645 7-O Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-O 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5

000000201645 7-P Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-P 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5

000000201645 7-Q Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 7-R Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-R 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5

000000201645 7-AQ1 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5

000000201645 7-AQ2 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 7-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5

000000201645 8-A Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-A 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5

000000201645 8-B Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-B 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 8-C Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-C 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5

000000201645 8-D Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-D 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5

000000201645 8-E Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-E 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5

000000201645 8-F Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-F 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5

000000201645 8-G Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-G 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5
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000000201645 8-H Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-H 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5

000000201645 8-I Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-I 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 8-J Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-J 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 8-K Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-K 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 8-L Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-L 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 8-M Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-M 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 8-N Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-N 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5

000000201645 8-O Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-O 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5

000000201645 8-P Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-P 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5

000000201645 8-Q Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 8-R Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-R 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5

000000201645 8-AQ1 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5

000000201645 8-AQ2 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 8-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5

000000201645 9-A Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-A 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5

000000201645 9-B Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-B 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 9-C Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-C 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5

000000201645 9-D Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-D 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5

000000201645 9-E Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-E 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5

000000201645 9-F Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-F 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5

000000201645 9-G Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-G 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 9-H Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-H 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5

000000201645 9-I Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-I 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 9-J Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-J 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 9-K Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-K 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 9-L Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-L 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 9-M Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-M 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 9-N Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-N 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5

000000201645 9-O Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-O 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5

000000201645 9-P Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-P 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5

000000201645 9-Q Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 9-R Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-R 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5

000000201645 9-AQ1 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5

000000201645 9-AQ2 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 9-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5

000000201645 10-A Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-A 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON No Bid 5

000000201645 10-B Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-B 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 10-C Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-C 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON No Bid 5

000000201645 10-D Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-D 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON No Bid 5

000000201645 10-E Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-E 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5

000000201645 10-F Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-F 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON No Bid 5

000000201645 10-G Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-G 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 10-H Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-H 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON No Bid 5

000000201645 10-I Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-I 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 10-J Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-J 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 10-K Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-K 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 10-L Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-L 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 10-M Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-M 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON No Bid 5

000000201645 10-N Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-N 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5

000000201645 10-O Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-O 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III TON No Bid 5

000000201645 10-P Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-P 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Plant Run TON No Bid 5
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000000201645 10-Q Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON No Bid 5

000000201645 10-R Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-R 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON No Bid 5

000000201645 10-AQ1 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY No Bid 5

000000201645 10-AQ2 Jefferson Asphalt - Inwood Plant N/A 10-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY No Bid 5
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