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Proc Folder :

Solicitation Description :

Proc Type :

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

Solicitation Response

Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Charleston, WV 25305-0130
Post Office Box 50130

State of West Virginia

356002

STONE AGGREGATE CINDERS 2018 MATERIAL & PICKUP BY WVDOH

Central Master Agreement

2017-09-19

13:30:00

SR 0803 ESR09151700000001035 1

 VENDOR

000000207612

SOUTHERN WV ASPHALT INC

Comments:

Total Bid : Response Date: Response Time:Total Bid : 

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT1800000019

$0.00 2017-09-15 08:31:17

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001

Mark A Atkins

(304) 558-2307
mark.a.atkins@wv.gov
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

1 Vendor shall use Exhibit_A Pricing
Page for bid pricing

0.00000 EA $0.000000 $0.00

11111600

STONE AGGREGATE CINDERS 2018 MATERIAL & PICKUP BY WVDOH:
If bidding online vendor should enter $0.00 in the Oasis commodity line.
Vendor must attach the Exhibit_A pricing page and the Exhibit_B information attachment to their bid.
See Section 18 of Instructions to Bidders for additional information.





















Pricing Page, Exhibit A

Material and pick up by WVDOH forces from the Vendor's Storage Site, ONLY.

Limestone,
Contract Sandstone, Blast Furnace

Item Description of Material Gravel, Sand Slag Steel Slag
A Class 1 Aggregate 10.30$              -$                  -$                  
B Class 2 Aggregate 10.30$              -$                  -$                  
C Class 10 Aggregate 10.30$              -$                  -$                  
D AASHTO #1 Aggregate 13.60$              -$                  -$                  
E AASHTO #3 Aggregate 13.60$              -$                  -$                  
F AASHTO #4 Aggregate 14.20$              -$                  -$                  
G AASHTO #467 Aggregate 14.20$              -$                  -$                  
H AASHTO #57 Aggregate 14.20$              -$                  -$                  
I AASHTO #67 Aggregate NO BID -$                  -$                  
J AASHTO #7 Aggregate NO BID -$                  -$                  
K AASHTO #8 Aggregate 16.15$              -$                  -$                  
L AASHTO #9 Aggregate 16.15$              -$                  -$                  
M Stone for Gabions 13.60$              -$                  -$                  
N Fine Aggregate NO BID -$                  -$                  

OA Limestone Standard Abrasives 14.25$              -$                  -$                  
OB Sandstone Standard Abrasives NO BID -$                  -$                  
PA Limestone Modified Abrasives NO BID -$                  -$                  
PB Sandstone Modified Abrasives NO BID -$                  -$                  
Q Rip Rap 19.00$              -$                  -$                  
R Shot Rock 15.00$              -$                  -$                  
S AASHTO #8 Modified NO BID -$                  -$                  
T AASHTO #9 Modified NO BID -$                  -$                  
U Pea Gravel NO BID -$                  -$                  
V #11 Limestone Abrasives NO BID -$                  -$                  
W Quarry Waste 6.75$                -$                  -$                  

AA Cinders NO BID

Bid Price per Ton Items A-W and AA
F.O.B. Vendor's Storage Site

Southern West Virginia Asphalt, IncVendor Name:



VENDOR NAME ___ Southern West Virginia Asphalt, Inc.

A Vendor may submit more than one Vendor’s Storage Sites information on one Information Attachment Form
ONLY if bid pricing is the SAME for all Storage Sites.  A separate bid submission and Information Attachment
Form MUST be submitted when bid price varies between Vendor's Storage Sites.

a)  SOURCE OF MATERIAL (all sources for which bid prices apply (e.g., Quarry location if Sandstone 
     or Limestone; dredging or pit location if Gravel; production plant name and location if Slag)

b)  EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S):  A separate bid schedule 
     must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.

c)  SOURCE OF MATERIAL:  Name and Location of plant which produces Cinder material.

d)  EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S)  A separate bid schedule
      must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.

No Bid

No Bid

Kelly Mountain Quarry
Route 33 Kelly Mountain Road

Cinders

Route 33 Kelly Mountain Road
Elkins, WV  26241

Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel, Sand, Blast Furnance Slag and Steel Slag

Elkins, WV  26241

INFORMATION ATTACHMENT FORMExhibit_B
Vendor’s Storage Sites --  REQUIRED TO BE SUBMITTED WITH BID
2018 Stone and Aggregate - Material and Pickup by WVDOH ONLY

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.

Kelly Mountain Quarry



This certificate is executed by LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE GROUP as respects such insurance as is afforded by those Companies

LDI COI 268896 02 11

NM 772  07-10

Personal & Advertising Injury

GENERAL LIABILITY

 CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPNFORMATION ONLY  AND
  DOES NOT AMEND, EXTINSURANCE  POLICY AND

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISS

This is to Certify that

NAME AND
ADDRESS
OF INSURED

is, at the issue date of this certificate, insured by the Company under the policy(ies) listed below.  The insurance afforded by the listed policy(ies) is subject to all their terms, exclusions and 
Conditions and is not altered by any requirement, term or condition of any contract or other document with respect to which this certificate may be issued. 

OFFICE PHONE DATE ISSUED

TYPE OF POLICY

EXP DATE
CONTINUOUS

EXTENDED

POLICY TERM

POLICY NUMBER LIMIT OF LIABILITY

WORKERS
COMPENSATION

RETRO DATE

OCCURRENCE

CLAIMS MADE

AUTOMOBILE 
LIABILITY

OWNED

NON-OWNED

HIRED

OTHER

ADDITIONAL COMMENTS

* If the certificate expiration date is continuous or extended term, you will be notified if coverage is terminated or reduced before the certificate expiration date.

NOTICE OF CANCELLATION: (NOT APPLICABLE UNLESS A NUMBER OF DAYS IS ENTERED BELOW.) 
BEFORE   THE  STATED  EXPIRATION  DATE  THE  COMPANY  WILL  NOT  CANCEL  OR  REDUCE  THE
INSURANCE  AFFORDED  UNDER  THE ABOVE POLICIES UNTIL AT LEAST                      DAYS  NOTICE
OF SUCH CANCELLATION HAS BEEN MAILED TO:

COVERAGE AFFORDED UNDER WC
LAW OF THE FOLLOWING STATES:

EMPLOYERS LIABILITY

Bodily Injury by Accident

Bodily Injury By Disease

Bodily Injury By Disease
Policy Limit

Each Person

Each Accident

Each Accident—Single Limit

Products / Completed Operations Aggregate

Other Other

Each Person

Each Accident or Occurrence

Each Accident or Occurrence

UED AS A MATTER OF I ON YOU THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS CERTIFICATE IS NOT AN 
END, OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES LISTED BELOW.

Certificate of Insurance

General Aggregate

Per Person / Organization

B.I. And P.D. Combined

C
er

ti
fi

ca
te

H
ol

de
r

Liberty Mutual 
Insurance Group

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

POLICY LIMITS ARE NO LESS THAN THOSE 
LISTED, ALTHOUGH POLICIES MAY INCLUDE ADDITIONAL SUBLIMIT/LIMITS NOT LISTED BELOW.

COMMERCIAL

Each Occurrence

LDI COI 123456-7 89 10

✓

Mark A. Truelove

8/22/2017

Teays Valley, WV
112 Brent Way
Hurricane WV 25526 800-222-8890

West Virginia Paving, Inc.
PO Box 544
2950 Charles Ave.
Dunbar WV  25064

 30

TB2-C81-004095-1179/1/2018
$2,000,000

-Per Project Aggregate included.✓
$2,000,000

$2,000,000

$2,000,000

Damage to Premises Rented to
You: $250,000

Medical Exp: $50,000

9/1/2018 AS2-C81-004095-127 $2,000,000

✓

✓

✓

WA7-C8D-004095-0279/1/2018
WV Employers Liability Coverage
Only $1,000,000

$1,000,000

$1,000,000

Physical Damage only
-$10,000 Comp
-$10,000 Coll

Automobile policy
9/1/2017 - 9/1/2018 AS2-C81-054502-527
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