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The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wvOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West
Virginia’s procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor
responses to this solicitation submitted to the
Purchasing Division in hard copy format.
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Welcome, Lu Anne Cottrill

Solielttuonnuponu(sn][ Dept: 0203 ID: ESR01241700000003394 Ver.: 1 Function: New

[CCOEEININGIFILII Contact | Default Values | Discount | Document Information

Procurement Folder: 251921 SO Doc Code: CRFQ
Procurement Type: Central Master Agreement SO Dept: 0803
Vendor ID: 000000160318 2 SO Doc ID: DOT1700000045
Legal Name: P&W EXCAVATING INC Published Date: 1/20/17
Alias/DBA: Close Date: 125/17
Total Bid: 50.00 Close Time: 13:30
Response Date: 01/24/2017 Status: Closed

Solicitation Description: Addendum No. 4 - ASPHALT -

Response Time: 11:13
MATERIAL AND PICKUP BY

<>

Total of Header Attachments: &

Total of All Attachments: &




Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder : 281921

Solicitation Description : Addendum No. 4 - ASPHALT - MATERIAL AND PICKUP BY WVDOH

Proc Type : Central Master Agreement

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2017-01-25 SR 0803 ESR01241700000003394 1
13:30:00
LVENDOR
000000160318
P&W EXCAVATING INC
Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT1700000045
Total Bid : $0.00 Response Date: 2017-01-24 Response Time: 11:13:50
Comments:
FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Mark A Atkins
(304) 558-2307
mark.a.atkins@wv.gov
Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 ASPHALT - MATERIAL AND
PICKUP BY WVDOH
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30121601
ASPHALT - MATERIAL AND PICKUP BY WVDOH PER THE PRICING PAGES/E-CATALOG

Extended Description :
Vendor shall use Exhibit A Pricing Page for bid pricing. If bidding online vendor must attach the pricing page and
information attachment to their bid. See Section 18 of Instructions to Bidders for additional information.

Page: 2



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NOQ.: DOT1700000045

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[x ] Addendum No. | [ ] Addendum No. 6
[Xx ] Addendum No. 2 [ 1 Addendum No.7
[x ] Addendum No. 3 [ ] Addendum No. 8
[¥] Addendum No. 4 [ 1 Addendum No.9
[ ] AddendumNo.S5 [ 1 Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. I
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

P & W EXCAVATING, INC.
Company

e '-“;L. r e - q., i 4
L 220222 \ 7@1 007,028
Authorized Signature

1/24/17

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.
Revised 6/8/2012



VENDOR CUSTOMER SUPPLIE|SUPPLIER NAME MAN [MANUFA |COMMODITY |ITEM DESCRIPTION |EXTENDED DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE LIST DELI [PRO |MOD |DRA |PIEC |SERI |SPEC|SIZE |COL |PICT

CODE R PART UFAC|CTURER |CODE PRICE VERY|DUC |[EL WIN |E AL IFIC OR |URE
NUMBE TURE|PART DAY |T/CA G NUM |ATIO FILE
R R NUMBER S TEG BER [N NAM

NAM ORY E
E

1-A N/A |1-A 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
1-B N/A |1-B 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/JA [N/AIN/A [N/A
1-C N/A |1-C 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AIN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
1-D N/A |1-D 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/JA [N/AIN/A [N/A
1-E N/A |1-E 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AIN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
1-F N/A |1-F 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
1-G N/A |1-G 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
1-H N/A |1-H 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
1l N/A |1-1 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
1-J N/A |13 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AN/A [N/A
1-K N/A |1-K 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
1-L N/A |1-L 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
1-M N/A |1-M 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
1-N N/A |1-N 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IlI TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
1-0 N/A |1-0 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing || TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
1-P N/A |1-P 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Asphalt Plant Run TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/JA [N/AIN/A [N/A
1-Q N/A |1-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
1-R N/A [1-R 30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
1-AQ1 N/A |1-AQ1  [30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
1-AQ2 N/A |1-AQ2 [30121601 Asphalt District 1 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY 5 |IN/ATN/A IN/A IN/A ITN/A INJA TN/A TN/A
2-A N/A [2-A 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON 5 |N/AIN/A [N/AN/AIN/A IN/A [N/A [N/A
2-B N/A |2-B 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
2-C N/A [2-C 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base Il TON 5 |N/AIN/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A [N/A [N/A
2-D N/A |2-D 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
2-E N/A |2-E 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
2-F N/A |2-F 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
2-G N/A |2-G 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
2-H N/A |2-H 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
2-1 N/A |2-1 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON 5 |N/A [N/A|NJAIN/A [N/JA IN/A [N/A IN/A
23 N/A |23 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
2-K N/A |2-K 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON 5 |N/A [N/A|NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
2L N/A |2-L 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
2-M N/A |2-M 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
2-N N/A |2-N 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IlI TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
2-0 N/A |2-O0 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing || TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
2-P N/A |2-P 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Asphalt Plant Run TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
2-Q N/A |2-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
2R N/A [2-R 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
2-AQ1 N/A |2-AQ1 30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
2-AQ2 N/A [2-AQ2 [30121601 Asphalt District 2 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY 5 |IN/ATN/A IN/A IN/A ITN/A INJA TN/A TN/A
3-A N/A |3-A 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
3B N/A |3-B 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
3-C N/A |3-C 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
3D N/A |3-D 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
3-E N/A |3-E 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
3F N/A |3-F 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A




VENDOR CUSTOMER SUPPLIE|SUPPLIER NAME MAN [MANUFA |COMMODITY |ITEM DESCRIPTION |EXTENDED DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE LIST DELI [PRO |MOD |DRA |PIEC |SERI |SPEC|SIZE |COL |PICT
CODE R PART UFAC|CTURER |CODE PRICE VERY|DUC |[EL WIN |E AL IFIC OR |URE
NUMBE TURE|PART DAY |T/CA G NUM |ATIO FILE
R R NUMBER S TEG BER [N NAM
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E
3-G N/A [3-G 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/JA [N/AIN/A [N/A
3-H N/A |3-H 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON 5 |N/AIN/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A [N/A [N/A
3 N/A |3 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/JA [N/AIN/A [N/A
3-J N/A |3-3 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AIN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
3K N/A |3-K 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/JA [N/AIN/A [N/A
3-L N/A |[3-L 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
3-M N/A |3-M 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
3-N N/A |3-N 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing || TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
3-0 N/A |3-0 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IlI TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
3-P N/A |3-P 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Asphalt Plant Run TON 5 |N/AN/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A [N/A [N/A
3-Q N/A |3-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AN/A [N/A
3R N/A |3-R 30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
3-AQ1 N/A |3-AQ1  [30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
3-AQ2 N/A [3-AQ2  [30121601 Asphalt District 3 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY 5 |N/A[N/A IN/A [N/A [N/A [N/A [N/A IN/A
4-A N/A |4-A 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
4-B N/A |4-B 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
4-C N/A [4-C 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base II TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
4-D N/A |4-D 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON 5 |N/AN/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A [N/A [N/A
4-E N/A |4-E 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
4-F N/A |4-F 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON 5 |N/A [N/A|NJAIN/A [N/JA IN/A [N/A IN/A
4-G N/A [4-G 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
4-H N/A |4-H 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON 5 |N/AIN/A [N/AN/AIN/A IN/A [N/A [N/A
4-1 N/A |41 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
4-3 N/A |4-3 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON 5 |N/A [N/A|NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
4K N/A 4K 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
4-L N/A |4-L 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
4-M N/A |4-M 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
4-N N/A |4-N 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1| TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
4-0 N/A |4-0 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IlI TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
4-p N/A |4-P 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Asphalt Plant Run TON 5 |N/AIN/A [N/AN/AIN/A IN/A [N/A [N/A
4-Q N/A |4-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/A |N/A [N/A |N/A
4-R N/A [4-R 30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/AN/A [N/JA [N/AIN/A [N/A
4-AQ1 N/A |4-AQ1 [30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/A |N/A [N/A |N/A
4-AQ2 N/A [4-AQ2  [30121601 Asphalt District 4 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY 5 [NJATN/A [N/A [N/A [N/A [NZA [N/A [N/A
000000160318 5-A P & W Excavating Warfordsburg [N/A [5-A 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON 42.97] 5 [N/A[N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AN/AN/A
5-B N/A [5-B 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON no bid 5 [NJATN/A [N/A [N/A [N/A [NZA [N/A [N/A
000000160318 5-C P & W Excavating Warfordsburg |[N/A |5-C 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base Il TON 44,77\ 5 |NJATN/A [N/AIN/A [N/A [NJAN/A N/A
000000160318 5-D P & W Excavating Warfordsburg [N/A |5-D 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON 49.09] 5 [N/A[N/AIN/A|IN/AIN/A|N/A[N/A [N/A
5-E N/A |5-E 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON no bid 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
5-F N/A |5-F 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON no bid 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
5-G N/A |5-G 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON no bid 5 [NJATN/A [N/A [N/A [N/A [NZA N/A [N/A
000000160318 5-H P & W Excavating Warfordsburg [N/A |5-H 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON 49.09] 5 [N/A[N/AIN/A|IN/AIN/A|N/A[N/A [N/A
5-1 N/A |51 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON no bid 5 [NJATN/A [N/A [N/A [N/A [NZA N/A [N/A
000000160318 5-J P & W Excavating Warfordsburg [N/A |5-J 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON 49.09( 5 |N/A|N/A[N/A|N/A [N/A|N/AN/A [N/A
5-K N/A |5-K 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON no bid 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
5-L N/A |5-L 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON no bid 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A




VENDOR CUSTOMER SUPPLIE|SUPPLIER NAME MAN [MANUFA |COMMODITY |ITEM DESCRIPTION |EXTENDED DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE LIST DELI [PRO |MOD |DRA |PIEC |SERI |SPEC|SIZE |COL |PICT
CODE R PART UFAC|CTURER |CODE PRICE VERY|DUC |[EL WIN |E AL IFIC OR |URE
NUMBE TURE|PART DAY |T/CA G NUM |ATIO FILE
R R NUMBER S TEG BER [N NAM
NAM ORY E
E
5-M N/A |5-M 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON no bid 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
5-N N/A |5-N 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing Il TON no bid 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
5-0 N/A |5-0 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IlI TON no bid 5 |IN/ATN/A IN/A IN/A ITN/A INJA TN/A TN/A
000000160318 5-P P & W Excavating Warfordsburg |N/A [5-P 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Asphalt Plant Run TON 48.37] 5 |[N/A[N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A[N/AN/AN/A
5-Q N/A |5-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON no bid 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
5-R N/A [5-R 30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON no bid 5 [NJATN/A [N/A [N/A [N/A [NZA [N/A [N/A
000000160318 5-AQ1 |P & W Excavating Warfordsburg [N/A [5-AQ1 [30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY 9000.00] 5 |N/ATN/AIN/A|IN/AIN/A [N/ATN/ATN/A
000000160318 5-AQ2 |P & W Excavating Warfordsburg |[N/A [5-AQ2  [30121601 Asphalt District 5 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY 5000.00] 5 |N/AIN/A|N/A|N/AN/A|N/AIN/AIN/A
6-A N/A |6-A 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
6-B N/A |6-B 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
6-C N/A [6-C 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base Il TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AN/A [N/A
6-D N/A |6-D 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
6-E N/A |6-E 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
6-F N/A |6-F 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
6-G N/A [6-G 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
6-H N/A |6-H 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
6-I N/A |61 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
6-J N/A |6-3 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
6-K N/A |6-K 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
6-L N/A [6-L 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
6-M N/A |6-M 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
6-N N/A |6-N 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing || TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
6-0 N/A |6-0 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IlI TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
6-P N/A |6-P 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Asphalt Plant Run TON 5 |N/AIN/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A [N/A [N/A
6-Q N/A |6-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
6-R N/A |6-R 30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
6-AQ1 N/A |6-AQ1  [30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
6-AQ2 N/A [6-AQ2 [30121601 Asphalt District 6 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY 5 |N/A[N/A IN/A [N/A [N/A [N/A [N/A IN/A
7-A N/A |7-A 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
7-B N/A |7-B 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON 5 |N/A [N/A|NJAIN/A [N/JA IN/A [N/A IN/A
7-C N/A |7-C 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base Il TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
7-D N/A |7-D 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON 5 |N/AIN/A [N/AN/AIN/A IN/A [N/A [N/A
7-E N/A |7-E 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
7-F N/A |7-F 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
7-G N/A |7-G 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
7-H N/A |7-H 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON 5 |N/AN/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A [N/A [N/A
7l N/A |71 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
7-J N/A |7-3 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON 5 |N/A [N/A|NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
7-K N/A |7-K 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
7-L N/A |7-L 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 5 |N/A [N/A|NJAIN/A [N/JA IN/A [N/A IN/A
7-M N/IA |7-M 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
7-N N/A |7-N 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1| TON 5 |N/A [N/A|NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
7-0 N/A |7-0 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing Il TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
7-P N/A |7-P 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Asphalt Plant Run TON 5 IN/AIN/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A [N/A [N/A
7-Q N/A |7-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/A |N/A [N/A |N/A
7-R N/A |7-R 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/AN/A [N/JA [N/AIN/A [N/A
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7-AQ1 N/A |7-AQ1  [30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
7-AQ2 N/A [7-AQ2 30121601 Asphalt District 7 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY 5 [NJATN/A [N/A [N/A [N/A [NZA [N/A [N/A
8-A N/A |8-A 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/JA [N/AIN/A [N/A
8-B N/A |8-B 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON 5 |N/A [N/A|NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
8-C N/A [8-C 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base Il TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/JA [N/AIN/A [N/A
8-D N/A |8-D 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON 5 |N/AN/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A [N/A [N/A
8-E N/A |8-E 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
8-F N/A |8-F 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON 5 |N/A [N/A|NJAIN/A [N/JA IN/A [N/A IN/A
8-G N/A [8-G 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
8-H N/A |8-H 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON 5 |N/AN/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A [N/A [N/A
8- N/A |81 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AN/A [N/A
8-J N/A |8-3 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
8-K N/A |8-K 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
8-L N/A |8-L 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
8-M N/A |8-M 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
8-N N/A |8-N 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing I| TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
8-0 N/A |8-0 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IlI TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
8-P N/A |8-P 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Asphalt Plant Run TON 5 |N/AN/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A [N/A [N/A
8-Q N/A |8-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
8-R N/A |8-R 30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON 5 |N/A [N/A|NJAIN/A [N/JA IN/A [N/A IN/A
8-AQ1 N/A |8-AQ1 [30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
8-AQ2 N/A [8-AQ2 [30121601 Asphalt District 8 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY 5 |N/A[N/A IN/A [N/A [N/A [N/A [N/A TN/A
9-A N/A |9-A 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
9-B N/A |9-B 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON 5 |N/A [N/A|NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
9-C N/A |9-C 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base Il TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
9-D N/A |9-D 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON 5 |N/AN/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A [N/A [N/A
9-E N/A |9-E 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
9-F N/A |9-F 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
9-G N/A [9-G 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
9-H N/A |9-H 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON 5 |N/AIN/A [N/AN/AIN/A IN/A [N/A [N/A
9ol N/A |91 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
9-J N/A ]9-J 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON 5 |N/A [N/A|NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
9-K N/A |9-K 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
9-L N/A |9-L 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
9-M N/A |9-M 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
9-N N/A |9-N 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1| TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
9-0 N/A |9-0 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IlI TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
9-P N/A |9-P 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Asphalt Plant Run TON 5 |N/AN/A [N/AN/AIN/AIN/A [N/A [N/A
9-Q N/A |9-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/A |N/A [N/A |N/A
9-R N/A |9-R 30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/AN/A [N/JA [N/AIN/A [N/A
9-AQ1 N/A |9-AQ1 [30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/A |N/A [N/A |N/A
9-AQ2 N/A [9-AQ2  [30121601 Asphalt District 9 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY 5 |N/A[N/A IN/A [N/A [N/A [N/A [N/A TN/A
10-A N/A [10-A 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
10-B N/A |10-B 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 37.5mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
10-C N/A |10-C 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Base || TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
10-D N/A |10-D 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
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10-E N/A |10-E 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/JA [N/AIN/A [N/A
10-F N/A |10-F 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON 5 [N/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A |N/A [N/A [N/A
10-G N/A |10-G 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/JA [N/AIN/A [N/A
10-H N/A [10-H 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON 5 |N/AIN/A [N/AN/AN/A IN/A [N/A [N/A
10-1 N/A |10-1 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/JA [N/AIN/A [N/A
10-J N/A [10-J 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
10-K N/A [10-K 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
10-L N/A |10-L 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 5 |N/A [N/A|NJAIN/A [N/JA IN/A [N/A IN/A
10-M N/A |10-M 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AIN/A [N/A
10-N N/A |10-N 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing |1l TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
10-0 N/A |10-0 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing Il TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/A|N/A [N/A [N/AN/A [N/A
10-P N/A |10-P 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Asphalt Plant Run TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/JAIN/A [N/A IN/A
10-Q N/A |10-Q 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22 TON 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/A |N/A [N/A |N/A
10-R N/A |10-R 30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Surcharge for PG Binder - 76 minus 22 - ordered in 400 ton increments TON 5 [N/A [N/AIN/AN/A [N/JA [N/AIN/A [N/A
10-AQ1 N/A |10-AQ1 [30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY 5 |N/A [N/A |NJAIN/A [N/A |N/A [N/A |N/A
10-AQ2 N/A [10-AQ2 [30121601 Asphalt District 10 - Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY 5 |N/A[N/A IN/A [N/A [N/A [N/A [N/A TN/A




INFORMATION ATTACHMENT FORM
Vendor’s Storage Sites
Asphalt - Materials and Pickup by WVDOH Forces, ONLY

VENDOR NAME __ P & W Excavating, Inc.
Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.

If a Vendor will be supplying materials from multiple Plant Locations and ALL pricing is the same, ALL Plant

Locations can be listed on one Information Attachment Form and one bid submission is acceptable.
If a Vendor will be supplying materials from multiple Plant Locations, at varying prices, additional , separate

bid submissions must be submitted for each Plant Location bid. Multple Plant Locations with varying prices,
shall be submitted on separate bid submissions.

Vendor's Plant Location:

P & W Excavating, Inc. 882 Piegon Cove Road, Warfordshurg PA 17267

Vendor's Plant Location:

Vendor's Plant Location:

Vendor's Plant Location:
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CONTRACTOR LICENSE

Authorized by the

West Virginia Contractor Licensing Board

. Number: WV001044
E
| Classification:
E
| GENERAL ENGINEERING
| SPECIALTY
[} EXCAVATION
[ ASPHALT
b
P & W EXCAVATING INC
DBA P & W EXCAVATING INC
PO BOX 712
MC CONNELLSBURG, PA 17233-0712
Date Issued Expiration Date

OCTOBER 18, 2016 OCTOBER 18, 2017

LY
CH 222 g’ LY 2 7P 4"‘( : 7
Authorized Company Signatur o/ Chair, West Virginia Contractor
Licensing Board

H)ARD This license, or a copy thereof, must be posted in a conspicuous place at every construction site where work is being
performed. This license number must appear in all advertisements, on all bid submissions and on all fully executed
and binding contracts. This license cannot be assigned or transferred by licensee. Issued under provisions of West

P A AAAAAAAS] Virginia Code, Chapter 21, Article 11.




STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

MANDATE: Under W. Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any
of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party
to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in
the aggregate; or (2) the debtor is in employer default.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to
chapter eleven of the W. Va. Code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and
the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not
in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penally, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its
political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers’
compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state
or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

“Employer default” means having an outstanding balance or liability to the old fund or to the uninsured employers'
fund or being in policy default, as defined in W. Va. Code § 23-2c-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers'
compensation coverage, or failure to fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An
employer is not in employer default if it has entered into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Commissioner
and remains in compliance with the obligations under the repayment agreement.

“Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company
or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage,
ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that
the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from
performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total
contract amount.

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor’s authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penalty of
law for false swearing (W. Va. Code §61-5-3) that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined
above and that neither vendor nor any related party are in employer default as defined above, uniess the debt or
employer default is permitted under the exception above.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:

Vendor's Name: P & W EXCAVATING, INC.
=] to i )
Authorized Signature: ¥ 22240 \ A0 sz r 4 Date: 1/24/17

[’

State of  PENNSYLVANIA

County of FULTON , fo-wit:

Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this24 _day of JANUARY , 2017 .

My Commission expires /'/.’/ L5 . 20/7.

AFFIX SEAL HERE NOTARY PUBLIC _77 25 2 100) /000 [ A

Purchasing ﬁﬂ.fdav%orfsec‘ 08/G1/2015)
COMMONWEALTH OF PENNSYLVANIA
Notarial Seal
Marian L. Wertz, Notary Public
McConnellsburg Boro, Fulton County
My Commission Expires Oct. 3, 2017
MEMBER, PENNSTLVANIA ASSOCIATION OF NOTARIES




:W-m P State of West Virqinia
zneis . VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1 Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification;

Bidder is a resident vendor partnership, association, or corporation with at least eighty percent of ownership interest
of bidder held by another entity that meets the applicable four year residency requirement; or,

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

000

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the projectbeing bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor that employs a minimum of ane hundred state residents, or a nonresident vendor which
has an affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia and
employs a minimum of one hundred state residents, and for purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or
completing the project which is the subject of the bidder's bid and continuously over the entire term of the project, on
average at least seventy-five percent of the bidder's employees or the bidder's affiliate's or subsidiary's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years and the
vendor's bid; or,

Application is made for 5% vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:
Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is

submitted; or,

Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commeodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

s Application is made for preference as a non-resident small, women- and minority-owned business, in accor-
dance with West Virginia Code §5A-3-59 and West Virginia Code of State Rules.

D Bidder has been or expects to be approved prior to contract award by the Purchasing Division as a certified small, women-
and minority-owned business.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the

requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) rescind the contract or purchase order;

or (b) assess a penalty against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to

the contracting agency or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract Is issued to Bidder
and if anything contained within this certificate changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchas-
ing Division in writing immediately. -

Bidder: P & W EXCAVATING, INC. signeds_— 3 25/% {a,,,/ﬂ
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Date: 1/24/17 Title: PRESIDENT

*Check any combination of preference consideralion(s) indicated above, which you are enlitled (o receive.






