
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.   As  part  of  the  State  of  West 
Virginia’s procurement process, and to maintain the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted online  is publicly posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov  with  any  other  vendor 
responses  to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the 
Purchasing Division in hard copy format. 
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VersionSolicitation NoSolicitation ClosesDate issued

Proc Folder :

Solicitation Description :

Proc Type :

Solicitation Response

Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Charleston, WV 25305-0130
Post Office Box 50130

State of West Virginia

139819

Addendum 1 HERBICIDE , ADJUVANTS AND MISC PRODUCTS

Central Master Agreement

2015-11-25

13:30:00

SR 0803 ESR11201500000002358 1

 VENDOR

000000120160

ARBORCHEM PRODUCTS

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Signature X FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001

Misty Delong

(304) 558-8802
misty.m.delong@wv.gov



Page : 2

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

1 HERBICIDE PRODUCTS,
ADJUVANT PRODUCTS AND MISC.

1.00000 EA $65.850000 $65.85

10171700

HERBICIDE PRODUCTS, ADJUVANT PRODUCTS AND MISC. PRODUCTS

If vendor is submitting bid online, enter the unit cost of the first line item bid. Pricing must be entered into the attached
exhibits for each item being bid. The Oasis commodity line will not be evaluated.















































































Exhibit A Pricing Page ARBORCHEM PRODUCTS (DIVISION OF ASPLUNDH TREE EXPERT CO.)

the Product Trade Name and EPA Registration number for each product that the Vendor is bidding whether the Vendor
is bidding the Product Trade Name requested or an "or equal to" product.
If the Vendor fails to provide the required information, the Vendor's bid will be disqualified for that Contract Item.

HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost
DOH-1H Water Soluble Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing:

    Ammonium Salt of Fosamine with Surfactant 4 lbs/gallon
Product Trade Name:  Krenite S 
EPA Registration Number: 42750-247
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 3000 gallon 65.85$        197,550.00$   
B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 3000 gallon 56.75$        170,250.00$   

DOH-2H Water Soluble Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing:
    Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate   
    Phosphate Ester Surfactant 50.20%
Product Trade Name:  Roundup Pro Concentrate 
EPA Registration Number: 524-529
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 6000 gallon 18.20$        109,200.00$   
B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 6000 gallon 19.95$        119,700.00$   
C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 6000 gallon 18.10$        108,600.00$   
D) Supplied in 265 gallon returnable/refillable shuttle. 500 gallon 17.99$        8,995.00$       

DOH-3H Dispersible Granules Containing:  Sulfometuron Methyl 75%
Product Trade Name:  Oust XP 

EPA Registration Number: 432-1552
A) Supplied in 3 pound containers in lots of 24 pounds (8 - 31 lbs ctn) 100 pound 39.90$        3,990.00$       
B) Supplied in 3 pound containers 100 pound 39.90$        3,990.00$       

DOH-4H Water Soluble Aqueous Suspension Containing:  Oryzalin 4 lbs/gallon
Product Trade Name:  Surflan AS or equal   Bidding: ORYZALIN 4 PRO
EPA Registration Number: 72167-15-74477
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 250 gallon 43.50$        10,875.00$     

DOH-5H Aqueous Solution Containing:  Imazapyr 2 lbs/gallon

Vendors may bid any or all Contract Items.  Per Section 3.2.2 of the contract specifications, the Vendor SHALL provide 



HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost
Product Trade Name:  Arsenal Powerline or equal   Bidding: POLARIS
EPA Registration Number: 228-534
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 150 gallon 75.45$        11,317.50$     
B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 150 gallon 78.90$        11,835.00$     

DOH-6H Aqueous Carrier Containing:  Pendimethalin 3.8 lbs/gallon
Product Trade Name:  Pendulum AquaCap
EPA Registration Number: 241-416
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 600 gallon 58.34$        35,004.00$     

DOH-7H Water Soluble Concentrate Containing:  Triclopyr 3 lbs/gallon
Product Trade Name: Garlon 3A 
EPA Registration Number: 62719-37
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 500 gallon 43.40$        21,700.00$     
B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 500 gallon 49.41$        24,705.00$     
C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 450 gallon 42.45$        19,102.50$     

DOH-8H Water Soluble Concentrate Containing:  Triclopyr 4 lbs/gallon
Product Trade Name:  Garlon 4 Ultra 
EPA Registration Number: 62719-527
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 250 gallon 46.45$        11,612.50$     
B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 270 gallon 53.41$        14,420.70$     
C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 240 gallon 46.45$        11,148.00$     

DOH-9H Water Soluble Dispersible Granule Containing:  Diuron 80.00%
Product Trade Name:  Karmex DF or equal _____________________________

EPA Registration Number: _________________________________
A) Supplied in 5 pound bags in lots of 10 bags 1000 pound NO BID -$                
B) Supplied in 25 pound bags 2000 pound NO BID -$                

DOH-10H Water Soluble Liquid Containing:  Dimethylamine Salt of 2, 4-D acid 3.8 lbs/gallon
Product Trade Name:  DMA 4 
EPA Registration Number: 62719-3
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 14.10$        1,410.00$       
B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 100 gallon 16.50$        1,650.00$       



HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost
C) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 100 gallon 14.05$        1,405.00$       

DOH-11H Water Soluble Liquid Containing Ammonium Salt of Imazapic 23.60%
Product Trade Name:  Plateau 
EPA Registration Number: 241-365
A) Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons 50 gallon 128.65$      6,432.50$       

DOH-12H Dispersible Liquid Containing:  Hexazinone 2 lbs/gallon
Product Trade Name:  Velpar L 
EPA Registration Number: 352-392
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallon 75.90$        3,795.00$       

DOH-13H Dry Flowable Containing:  Metsulfuron Methyl 60%
Product Trade Name:  Escort XP 
EPA Registration Number: 432-1549
A) Supplied in 16 ounce containers in lots of 8 pounds (8-16 oz ctn) 2400 ounce 4.15$          9,960.00$       
B) Supplied in 16 ounce containers 2400 ounce 4.50$          10,800.00$     
C) Supplied in 64 ounce returnable/refillable containers 2400 ounce N/A -$                

DOH-14H Dry Flowable Containing:  Chlorsulfuron 75%
Product Trade Name:  Telar XP 
EPA Registration Number: 352-654
A) Supplied in 16 ounce containers in lots of 8 pounds (8-16 oz ctn) 160 ounce 16.70$        2,672.00$       

DOH-15H Liquid Solution Containing:
    2, 4-D, 2- ethylhexyl ester                              32.45%
    2, 4-DP-p, 2-ethylhexyl ester 15.90%
    Dicamba            5.38%
Product Trade Name:  BK-800 or equal ________________________________
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon NO BID -$                
B) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 100 gallon NO BID -$                

DOH-16H Dry Flowable Containing:  Tebuthiuron 20%
Product Trade Name:  Spike 20 P 
EPA Registration Number: 62729-121
A) Supplied in 4 pound containers in lots of 48 pounds (12 4 lbs ctn) 48 pound 8.90$          427.20$          
B) Supplied in 25 pound bags 50 pound 8.75$          437.50$          

DOH-17H Water Soluble Emulsfiable Concentrate Containing:  Clopyralid 3 lbs/gallon



HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost
Product Trade Name:  Transline 
EPA Registration Number: 62719-259
A) Supplied in .5 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons 25 gallon 150.50$      3,762.50$       
B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 25 gallon 149.50$      3,737.50$       

DOH-18H Aqueous Solution Containing:
    Isopropylamine Salt of Imazapyr                                                    27.60%
Product Trade Name:  Polaris SP or equal   Bidding: POLARIS

EPA Registration Number: 228-534
B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallon 75.45$        3,772.50$       

DOH-19H Aqueous Solution Containing:
    Diglycolamine Salt of 3, 6-Dichloro-0-Anisic Acid                       4 lbs/gallon
Product Trade Name:  Vanquish 
EPA Registration Number: 228-397
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 300 gallon 64.35$        19,305.00$     
B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in lots of 9 per pallet 300 gallon 67.50$        20,250.00$     

DOH-20H Aqueous Solution Containing:  Triciopyr .75 lbs/gallon
Product Trade Name:  Pathfinder II 
EPA Registration Number: 62719-176
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 37.25$        3,725.00$       

DOH-21H Water Soluble Emulsfiable Concentrate Containing:
    Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate                                                    53.80%
Product Trade Name:  Rodeo 
EPA Registration Number: 62719-324
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 19.50$        1,950.00$       
B) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 100 gallon 19.25$        1,925.00$       

DOH-22H Liquid Containing:  Aminopyralid 40.60%
Product Trade Name:  Milestone VM or equal   Bidding: MILESTONE
EPA Registration Number: 62719-519
A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 12 quarts 200 quarts 79.38$        15,876.00$     
B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallon 312.50$      15,625.00$     

DOH-23H Water Dispersible Granular Material Containing:  Prodiamine 65%



HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost
Product Trade Name:  Endurance or equal   Bidding: PROCLIPSE 65WDG

EPA Registration Number: 228-434
A) Supplied in 5 pound bags in lots of 50 pounds 100 pound 16.50$        1,650.00$       
B) Supplied in 10 pound bags in lots of 50 pounds 100 pound 16.50$        1,650.00$       

DOH-24H Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing:  Quizalofop P-Ethyl .88 lbs/gallon
Product Trade Name:  Assure II 
EPA Registration Number: 
A) Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons 16 gallon NO BID -$                

DOH-25H Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing:  Fluazifop-P-butyl 6.75%
Product Trade Name:  Ornamec or equal __________________________________
EPA Registration Number: ____________________________________
A) Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons 16 gallon NO BID -$                

DOH-26H Dispersible Granule Containing:
    Imazapyr                                                                                           7.78%
    Diuron                                                                                             62.22%
Product Trade Name:  Sahara DG 
EPA Registration Number: 241-372
A) Supplied in 10 pound bags in lots of 40 pounds 50 pound 16.50$        825.00$          

DOH-27H Water Soluble Dry Granule Containing:  Sulfosulfuron 75%
Product Trade Name:  Outrider 
EPA Registration Number: 524-500
A) Supplied in 20 ounce bottles in lots of 200 ounces (10 - 20 oz ctn) 400 ounce 15.90$        6,360.00$       

DOH-28H Liquid Containing:  Diuron 40%
Product Trade Name:  Diuron 4L or equal ___________________________________
EPA Registration Number: ____________________________________
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallon NO BID -$                

DOH-29H Liquid Containing:  Fluroxypyr 45.52%
Product Trade Name:  Vista XRT 
EPA Registration Number: 62719-596
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 164.90$      16,490.00$     

DOH-30H Wettable Granule Formulation Containing:



HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost
    Sodium Salt of Diflufenzopy:  2-(1-[([3,5-Difluorophenylamino] 
    Carbonyl)-Hydrazono]ethyl)-3-Pyridinecarboxylic Acid, Sodium Salt                        21.30%
    Sodium Salt of Dicamba:  3,6-dichloro-o-anisic Acid                                          55.00%
Product Trade Name:  Overdrive 
EPA Registration Number: 7969-150
A) Supplied in 7.5 pound containers in lots of 30 pounds (4 - 7.5 lbs ctn) 100 pound 36.50$        3,650.00$       

DOH-31H Dispersible Granules Containing:
    Sulfometuron Methyl                                                                      56.25%
    Chlorsulfuron                                                                                 18.75%
Product Trade Name:  Landmark XP 
EPA Registration Number: 352-645
A) Supplied in 4 pound containers in lots of 32 pounds (8 - 4 lbs ctn) 100 pound 119.50$      11,950.00$     
B) Supplied in 64 ounce returnable/refillable containers 1600 ounce N/A -$                

DOH-32H Dispersible Granules Containing:
    Sulfometuron Methyl                                                                      56.25%
    Metsulfuron Methyl                                                                       15.00%
Product Trade Name:  Oust Extra 
EPA Registration Number: 432-1557
A) Supplied in 4 pound containers in lots of 32 pounds (8 - 4 lbs ctn) 400 pound 37.90$        15,160.00$     
B) Supplied in 64 ounce returnable/refillable containers 6400 ounce N/A -$                
C) Supplied in 12 pound containers 400 pound 37.90$        15,160.00$     

DOH-33H Dry Flowable Granule Containing:
    Bromacil                                                                                           40%
    Diuron                                                                                              40%
Product Trade Name:  Krovar I DF 
EPA Registration Number: 352-505
A) Supplied in 6 pound containers in lots of 48 pounds (8 - 6 lbs ctn) 50 pound 14.50$        725.00$          

DOH-34H Liquid Containing:
    Dimethylamine Salt of 2,4-Dichlovophenoxyacetic Acid                      24.58%
    Dimethylamine Salt of Dicamba (3,6-Dichloro-o-Anisic Acid)               12.82%
Product Trade Name:  Veteran 720 



HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost
EPA Registration Number: 228-295
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 36.85$        3,685.00$       
B) Supplied in 30 gallon drums 100 gallon 36.50$        3,650.00$       

DOH-35H Water Soluble Dispersible Extruded Paste Granule Containing:
    Aminocyclopyrachlor 39.50%
    Chlorsulfuron 15.80%
Product Trade Name:  Perspective™ 
EPA Registration Number: 432-1569
A) Supplied in 20 ounce containers in lots of 240 ounces (12 - 20 oz ctn) 240 ounces 5.13$          1,231.20$       
B) Supplied in 5 pound containers in lots of 40 pounds (8 - 5 lbs ctn) 40 ounces 5.13$          205.20$          
C) Supplied in 5 pound jugs 80 pounds 82.08$        6,566.40$       
D) Supplied in 20 pound containers 20  pounds 82.08$        1,641.60$       

DOH-36H Water Soluble Dispersible Extruded Paste Granule Containing:
    Aminocyclopyrachlor 39.50%
    Metsulfuron methyl 12.60%
Product Trade Name:  Streamline™ 
EPA Registration Number: 432-1570
A) Supplied in 3 pound containers in lots of 24 pounds (8 - 3 lbs ctn) 96 pounds 91.68$        8,801.28$       
B) Supplied in 3 pound containers 96 pounds 91.68$        8,801.28$       

DOH-37H Water Soluble Dispersible Extruded Paste Granule Containing:
    Imazapyr 31.60%
    Aminocyclopyrachlor 22.80%
    Metsulfuron methyl 7.30%
Product Trade Name:  Viewpoint™ 
EPA Registration Number: 352-847
A) Supplied in 5 pound containers in lots of 40 pounds (8 - 5 lbs ctn) 100 pounds 65.28$        6,528.00$       
B) Supplied in 5 pound containers 100 pounds 65.28$        6,528.00$       

DOH-38H Liquid Containing:
    Indaziflam                                               (1.67 pounds per gallon) 19.05%
Product Trade Name:  Esplanade 200SC 
EPA Registration Number: 432-1516
A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 1 gallon 50 gallons 1,181.44$   59,072.00$     
B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons 1,064.96$   53,248.00$     



HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure Cost
DOH-39H Plant Growth Regulator Containing:

    Mefluidide, diethanolamine salt 21.45%
    Imazethapyr, ammonium salt 4.09%
    Imazapyr, ammonium salt 0.15%
Product Trade Name:  Stronghold 
EPA Registration Number: 
A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 1 gallon 50 gallons NO BID -$                
B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons NO BID -$                

DOH-40H Turf and Ornamental Growth Regulator Containing:
    Diethanolamine Salt of Mefluidide 3.20%
Product Trade Name:  Embark 
EPA Registration Number: ______________________________
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons NO BID -$                

DOH-41H Turf and Ornamental Growth Regulator Containing:
    Flauzifop-P-Butyl 24.50%
Product Trade Name:  Fusilade II 
EPA Registration Number: ______________________________
A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 1 gallons 50 gallons NO BID -$                

DOH-42H Non-Selective Control of Emerged and Pre-Emerged Broadleaf
and Grass Weeds Containing:
    Indaziflam 0.089%
    Diquat Dibromide 0.890%
    Glypghosat Isopropylamine Salt 20.460%
Product Trade Name:  Esplanade EZ 
EPA Registration Number: 432-1528
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons 41.50$        2,075.00$       



Exhibit B Pricing Page Arborchem Products (Division of Asplundh Tree Expert Co.)

Vendors may bid any or all Contract Items.  Per Section 3.2.2 of the contract specifications, the Vendor SHALL provide 
the Product Trade Name and EPA Registration number for each product that the Vendor is bidding whether the Vendor
is bidding the Product Trade Name requested or an "or equal to" product.
If the Vendor fails to provide the required information, the Vendor's bid will be disqualified for that Contract Item.

ADJUVANTS Cost Per
Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description Quantity Measure Measure Cost
DOH-1A Water Soluble Blue Liquid Spray Pattern Indicator

Product Trade Name:    Bullseye or equal ____________________
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon No Bid

DOH-2A Diluent with Emulsifiers
Product Trade Name: Arborchem Basal Oil
          
A) Supplied in     2.5 gal. containers in lots of       5 gallons       . 100 gallon 9.45$          945.00$             

DOH-3A Non-Ionic Surfactant -90% 
Product Trade Name: __Chemsurf 90 from Chemorse
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon 10.95$        1,095.00$          

DOH-4A Liquid Drift Control Agent
Product Trade Name: Control from Garrco  1-3 oz per 100 gallons of water
A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 12 quarts. 400 quart 28.45$        11,380.00$        

DOH-5A Granular/Flake Drift Control Agent
Product Trade Name: San Ag 41A
A) Supplied in 32 ounce containers in lots of 12 containers. 48 container 15.01$        720.48$             

DOH-6A Aquatic Surfactant
Product Trade Name: Chemsurf 90 from Chemorse
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon 10.95$        1,095.00$          

DOH-7A Water Soluble Liquid Spray Pattern Indicator
Product Trade Name:  Blueprint Plus or equal ___Bidding: Hilight Blue from BASF 
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon  containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon 43.50$        4,350.00$          

DOH-8A Non-Ionic Sticker Spreader
Product Trade Name:  Nu-Film-IR 



ADJUVANTS Cost Per
Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description Quantity Measure Measure Cost
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon  containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon No Bid -$                   

DOH-9A Ready-to-Use Formula Containing Paraffinic Oil Emulsifiers
Product Trade Name:  Thinvert RTU 
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 gallon 15.00$        1,500.00$          
B) Supplied in 15 gallon drum. 100 gallon 15.00$        1,500.00$          

DOH-10A Miscible-Dispersible Liquid Defoamer (10% Active Ingredient)
Product Trade Name: Liquid Defoamer Arborchem
A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 12 quarts per ctn 120 quarts 8.50$          1,020.00$          

-$                   



Exhibit C Pricing Page Arborchem Products (Division of Asplundh Tree Expert Co.)

the Product Trade Name and EPA Registration number for each product that the Vendor is bidding whether the Vendor
is bidding the Product Trade Name requested or an "or equal to" product.
If the Vendor fails to provide the required information, the Vendor's bid will be disqualified for that Contract Item.

MISCELLANEOUS Cost Per
Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description Quantity Measure Measure Cost
DOH-1M Pressure Rinser

Product Trade Name:  Easy Rinse 
A) Supplied per each. 25 each 20.00$          500.00$          

DOH-2M Biostimulant Containing
    Soluble Potash                                            1.00%
    Iron                                                              0.36%
    Manure Extract                                            79.30%
    Humic and Fulvic Acid Extract                       9.00%
    Kelp Extract                                                 1.20%
    Organo-Modified Silaxane Surfactant           0.36%
Product Trade Name:  Launch or equal __________________________________

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 10 gallon No Bid #VALUE!
DOH-3M 5-gallon Backpack Sprayer

Product Trade Name:  Birchmeier Senior

A) Supplied per sprayer 10 each 240.00$        2,400.00$       
B) Supplied per each gasket set for Sprayer Pump 10 set 20.00$          200.00$          
C) Supplied per each Valve and Wand Repair Kit 10 kit 20.00$          200.00$          

DOH-4M 2-Quart Handheld Pressure Sprayer
Product Trade Name:  Tolco 

A) Supplied per each sprayer 10 each 18.50$          185.00$          
DOH-5M Closed System Backpack Sprayer

Product Trade Name:  Birchmeier BCS 

A) Supplied per each sprayer 10 each 265.00$        2,650.00$       
B) Supplied per each gasket Set for Sprayer Pump 10 set 20.00$          200.00$          

Vendors may bid any or all Contract Items.  Per Section 3.2.2 of the contract specifications, the Vendor SHALL provide 



MISCELLANEOUS Cost Per
Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended

Item # Description Quantity Measure Measure Cost
C) Supplied per each Valve and Wand Repair Kit 10 kit 20.00$          200.00$          

DOH-6M 32 ounce Eye Wash Bottle
Product Trade Name: _____________________________________
A) Supplied per each. 25 bottle 20.00$          500.00$          



Exhibit A Pricing Page ADDENDUM #1 Arborchem Products (Div      

the Product Trade Name and EPA Registration number for each product that the Vendor is bidding whether the V
is bidding the Product Trade Name requested or an "or equal to" product.
If the Vendor fails to provide the required information, the Vendor's bid will be disqualified for that Contract Item

TO ADD DOH-41H Item B  --  All other specifications and dates remain the same.

HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon Estimated Unit of Unit of

Item # Description of Active Ingredients Quantity Measure Measure
DOH-41H Turf and Ornamental Growth Regulator Containing:

    Flauzifop-P-Butyl 24.50%
Product Trade Name:  Fusilade II or equal _________________
EPA Registration Number: ______________________________
A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 1 gallons 50 gallons No Bid
B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons No Bid

Vendors may bid any or all Contract Items.  Per Section 3.2.2 of the contract specifications, the Vendor SHALL p  



  vision of Asplundh Tree Expert Co.)

                  Vendor

                  m.

Extended
Cost

                   provide 



CRFQ DOT1600000045 Herbicide Bid 

Bidder: Arborchem Products (Division of Asplundh Tree Expert Co.) 

Alternate Products links to label & SDS’s. 

 

Oryzalin 4 Label…. http://www.cdms.net/ldat/ldBU7000.pdf 

Oryzalin 4 SDS…. http://www.cdms.net/ldat/mpBU7002.pdf 

Polaris Label…. http://www.cdms.net/ldat/ld8KR002.pdf 

Polaris SDS…. http://www.cdms.net/ldat/mp8KR001.pdf 

Milestone Label.. http://www.cdms.net/ldat/ld77N015.pdf 

Milestone SDS… http://www.cdms.net/ldat/mp77N002.pdf 

Proclipse 65 WDG label… http://www.cdms.net/ldat/ld6TO010.pdf 

Proclipse 65 WDG SDS…. http://www.cdms.net/ldat/mp6TO000.pdf 

Chemsurf 90 Label…. http://arborchem.com/images/products/Chemsurf%2090%20Label%20Text.pdf 

Chemsurf 90 SDS….. http://arborchem.com/images/products/Chemsurf%2090%20SDS.pdf 

Control Label…. http://www.garrco.com/assets/control-lbl.pdf 

Control SDS…. http://www.garrco.com/assets/garrco-control.pdf 

Hilight Blue Label/MSDS… http://bettervm.basf.us/products/label-and-msds/hi-light-blue-liquid-
msds.pdf 

Liquid Defoamer Label… http://arborchem.com/images/products/arb_defoamer.gif 

Liquid Defoamer SDS… http://arborchem.com/images/products/FOAM%20CONTROL%20SDS.pdf 
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http://arborchem.com/images/products/Chemsurf%2090%20SDS.pdf
http://www.garrco.com/assets/control-lbl.pdf
http://www.garrco.com/assets/garrco-control.pdf
http://bettervm.basf.us/products/label-and-msds/hi-light-blue-liquid-msds.pdf
http://bettervm.basf.us/products/label-and-msds/hi-light-blue-liquid-msds.pdf
http://arborchem.com/images/products/arb_defoamer.gif
http://arborchem.com/images/products/FOAM%20CONTROL%20SDS.pdf
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