[ f”IB/EO‘lE‘ 2:05PM  FAX 30425740832 MARTINSBURG [dooo1/0020

;;;;l;:sn:'g D!:s'!rms-r‘r N State of West Virginia
ashington Street Eps
| Post Office Box 50130 Request for Quotation

§| Charleston, WV 25305.0130 34 — Service - Prof

Proc Folder: 211609
Doe Description: STATEWIDE CONTRACT -TEMPORARY STAFFING SERVICES
Proc Type: Statewide MA {Opsn End)

Date Issged Soficitation Closes | Sollcitation No Version
2016.04-22 2016-05-19 CRFQ 0212 SWC1600000009 1
13:30:00

BID CLERK

| DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2013 WASHINGTON ST E

CHARLESTON wy 25305
Uus

endor Name, ddress d Tlephone umber:
101 N PN BV
l 18 Pkens Ce,dvec, Sac 20
YNoeinsoo (‘5 y W DSYD Y
304-367-499Y

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Mark A Atkins
(304} 558-2307
mark a_atkins@wv.gov

Signature X X@i;jg g-\('\(kwv\ FEIN # I,’,QDP,)S'IDID_ DATE 5")4:“/(:

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Page: 1

RECEIVED TIME MAY. 16, 2: 04PN

FORM ID : WV-FRC-CRFQ-001




Aooo2/0020
05/16/2016 2:06PHM FAX 3042674032 MARTINSBURG

The West Virghia Purchasin Division is soliciting bids to establish a statewide open-end conl*

. ct for 18 specific temporary job classifications
commonly required by Slate encies, per the attached doocuments,

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No Cily wvagago No City WV 93999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 TEMPORARY EMPLOYEE 0.00000 JOB
SERVICES
Cuimm Code Manufacturer Specificatlon Model #
80111600

Extended Description :
TEMPORARY EMPLOYEE SERVICES

Event Date
1 Technical Questions due by 4:00 pm EST  2016-05-05

Pega: 2

RECEIVED TIME MAY. 16.  2:04PM




05/18/2018 2:0BPM FAX 3042674032

M4&RTINSBURG

@0003/0020

SWC1600600009

Documnent Phase
Final

Document Desecription

STATEWIDE CONTRAGT ~-TEMPORARY
STAFFING SERVICES

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions

RECEIVED TIME MAY. 16.

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

7:04PM

Page 3
of3



REGION 3: REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

EXHIBIT A
NOTE: if you do not cover entire region, CRRQ SWC1600000009
& crcla eountles where you do su pply TEMP16
3 temporaries. Temporary Staffing Services
.
<r — r—
b4 Lewls | Upshur | Randaiph Jpendefion] Hardy §  Grant ampshire} Mineral | Morgan WBerkeley] sefferson | Tucker JBackour] Tayior JPreston]
o
(i) ——
Classification Waorker Pay Rate Withholding Rate Overhead Rate Total Rate*
—-_-_AEalmt.[;E-T;-cEmc-la_n.2-.._.- _.-l-is-ﬂh-ﬂ-- ---.-1-.1_5--._. ---._3.-1-I-l- -I—ITBTZ_S--I-
Administrative Servicas Asststant 1 12 0.92 248 154
e —
Admlnistrative Services Assistant 2 15 1.15 31 18,25
== S . ——
Cook No Bid
e ===
Custodian 11 0.84 2.67 1451
Data Entry Operator2 12 0.92 243 . 154
_ Executive Secretary —15 115 e 1525
Groundskesner 11 0.84 3.02r 14.86
Fealth Service Worker No Bid
Laboratroy Assistant 3 No Bid
= —
- Laborer 11 0.84 2.67 14.51 -
= Mazil funner 10 0.77 207 12.84
= —t——
73 Office Assistant 2 12 0.92 2.48 15.4
o Office Assistarit 3 14 1.07 2.9 17.97
= Painter Mo Bid ‘
== Paralegal 15 1,15 3.1 15,25
Parking Attendant No Bid %
Word Processar 12 0.92 2.48 15.4 =
L |
* Vendor should add thelr Worker Rate + Withholding Rate + Overhead Rate and enter that namber into the Total Rate box. =
3 —
= o
=t <L
= =
plu]
Y| -._l--‘_--l—ll_l-.-l-'l—--._I--_I—I_I—I_l_l---I-I-I-I-I-I—l— l-.---.---.--—- -l—-----*-—.-!—---l
= . =
» sndor Name; AN v Tne =
y Cantact Person; __ ive TR wlengona —_
= Phone ___A0Y4- 2é67- Y999 =
Fax #; ADY - DL~ HOYN i,
= [
(v L
o o
ik -
™ Date: é - !é) - g é
0
-
~
3
.‘-.
o)
o

REGION 3

Please type or write Leglbly



00606/0020
05/168/2016 2:06PM FAX 3042674032 HARTINSBURG &

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
CRFQ 0212 SWC1600000009
TEMPORARY STAFFING SERVICES

10.2. The following remedies shall he available to Agency y

10.1.4. Failure to remedy deficient performance upon request.
[;on default.

10.2.1. Immediate cancellation of the Contract.

10.2.2. Immediate canceilation of one or more releasc orders issucd under this
Contract,

10.2.3. Any other remedies available in law or equfty.

11. MISCELLANEOQUS:

11.1. Contract Manager: During its performance of [this Contract, Vendor must
designate and maintain a primary contract manager responsible for overseeing
Vendor’s responsibilities under this Contract. The| Contract mapager musi be
available during normal business hours to address any customer service or other

issues rclated to this Contract. Vendor shonld list its|Contract manager and his or
her contact information below.

Contract Manager: ‘me%m
Telephone Number: _ ooM- 26799
Fax Number: — S04~ 267-YoBg

Email Address: & L = CEan

Revised 10/27/2014

RECEIVED TIME MAY. 16,  2:04PM



f10006/002C
05/16/2016 2:0BPM FAX 3042874032 MARTINSBURG

CERTIFICATIONAND SIGNATURE PAGE

By signing below, or submitting documentation through wvOASIS| 1 certify that T have reviewed
this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand the requirements, terms and conditions, and
other information contained herein; that this bid, offer or proposal constitutes an offer to the
State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the product or service proposed meets the
mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for that produlct or service, unless
otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and condEions contained n the

Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that I am submitting this bid, offer or proposal for
review and consideration ; that I am authorized by the vendor to exeCute and submit this bid,
offer, or proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor’s beltlf; that I am authorized to
bind the vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of y kmowledge, the vendor
has properly registercd with any State agency that may require regigtration,

J&_\)%aa-en‘\‘uﬁ\‘ah .’»qr\g\
{Compan
: efire” N losod y Do of Rosiness

(Authorized Signature) (Represe;xtative Namg, Title) ’Eeaddopmfjt

2 ILTYPY | 86N A47- 403D 516- 16
(Phone Number) (Fax Number) (Date)

Revised 10/27/2015

RECEIVED TIME MAY. 16.  2:04PM



05/1B/2016 2:06PM FaX 230426874032 MARTINSBURG [dooo7/0020

é,f 2%, | Purchasing Divison State of West Virginia

C, A | 2019 Washington Street Eact :
T4 Ao ?Af Post Office Box 50130 Request for Quotation
§| Charleston, WV 25305-0130 34 — Service - Prof

Proc Foldar; 211809
Doc Description: ADDENDUM 1:
Proc Type: Statewide MA {Open End)

Dato lssned Solicltation Cloges Salicitation No Varsion
2016-05-11 2016-05-19 CRFQ 0212 SWC1800000009 2
13:30-00

ﬁwgméﬁfﬁ" .:mj'am “ — =5 o el D WE%W*__; i T .;.3.!’.'-":2“@??:%? ':??H;*cgl?fﬁi'%gﬁr%t?vrn”
BiD CLERK

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINJST, RATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON ST E

CHARLESTON wv 25305
us

Vendor Neme, Address and Talephone Nimber:
Proapnerted mm , Tne
LIS Makens Cevber, Sotte 26
WS naoo e, Lov dSYoy
A0M-367. 499y

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Mark A Atking

{(304) 558-2307

mark.a atkins@wv.gov

Signature X sd A M ENe &Q 0Q5101 9 DATE 5—-”3-%

All offers sublact to all terms ang canditlons contdined in this soliciation

Page: 1 FORM ID : WV-PRC-CRFQ-001

RECEIVED TIME MAY. 16.  2:04PM
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ADDENDUM_1: is issued 1o publish the vendor qusstions with responses,
NO OTHER CHANGES

..... e
ALL STATE AGENGIES STATE OF WEST VIRBINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City Wveggsy No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Gty Unit Issue Unll Price Total Price
1 TEMPORARY EMPLOYEE 0.00000 JOB
SERVICES .
Comm Cade Manufacturer Specification Madel #
80111600
Extended Description :
TEMPORARY EMPLOYEE SERVICES
Event Date
1 Technical Qusstions due by 4:00 pm EST  2016-05-05
Page: 2
RECEIVED TIME MAY. 16,  2:04PM




05/18/201€ 2:07PM FAX 3042674032 MARTINSBURG @ooo9/0020

Document Phase Document Description Page 3
SWC1600000009 Finaf ADDENDUM_1: SWC-TEIMPORARY of3
STAFFING SERVICES

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions

RECEIVED TIME MAY. 16.  2:04PM
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ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.:

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the hox next to cach addendum
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may resplt in bid disqualification.

Acknowlcdgment: T hercby acknowlcdge receipt of the following dddenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Receijved:
(Check the box next to each addendury received)

¥ Addendum No. | (1 Addendum No. 6
[0 Addendum No. 2 (] Addendum No. 7
[] Addendum No. 3 [1 Addendum No. 8
[ Addendum No. 4 [] Addendum No, 9
[] Addendum No. 5 [] Addendum No. 10

Tunderstand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda ma be causc for rejection of this bid.
. ¥ ¢ Ca

to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s Topresentatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only
the information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum i
binding.

¢:¥L}Ckva:84&f¥téjﬁiCfr\ e
Company-
Vol Dlleson

Authorized Signature
5-1b-1¢4
Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expeditc
document processing.

Revised 10/27/2015

RECEIVED TIME MAY. 16, 2:04PM




05/16/2016 2:07PM FAX 3042574032

V88 VENDOR RECISTRATION SUMMARY

MARTINSBURG @oo11/0020

PLEASE
SAVE
FoRM
RECORD

VSS Vendor Registration Summary application must be faxed along with the w-9 for validation

rl’art I: Vapdor Information

1. Vendor Code:
VS0600004720

2. Legal Business Naghe:
Augmentation, Inc

3. Headquarters Account :
Yes

4. Headquaricrs Accoynt Code :
VS§0000004720

5. Headquartcrs Account Legal Name -
Augmentation, Inc

6. Headquartcrs Web Address
www_augmentation.c

7.CatalogDUNS:
072661572

=y

8_Taxpayer ID Number :
520851012

RECEIVED TIME MAY. 16,

7:04PM




@0012/0020

05/16/2016 2:0TPM FAX 3042674032 MARTINSBURG
9.Taxpayer ID Number Type:
EIN
#l‘art T: Organization Informatiyn
1. Org Type: 2. Classification:
Company Corporation
3. Foreign Tax ID: 4. W-8 Form:
5. Detailed TIN: 6. Location Web Address:
WWW.augmentation.dom
7. Number of Employees: 8.Annual Income:
<50 5 - 10 million

9.0rdcring DUNS: 10.Intemet Catalog:
072661572

11. Preferred Ordering Method: 12. PCard Acceptance level:
Electronic

12, Location Name:
Augmentation, Inc

bl‘art Ni: Legal Name Information

RECEIVED TIME MAY. 16, 2:04PM




05/16/2016 2:07PM FAX 3042874032

MARTINSBURG

@0013/0020

1. Legal Nam¢ On W-0:

2. Bushiess Name Alias/DBAY;

Augmentation, Inc Augmentation

3. First Name: 4. Middle Namc:

5. Last Name: 6. Namc on Check:
Legal Name

#Part IV: 1093 TIN Information

1. Taxpayer Identification Number: 2. TIN Type:

520851012 EIN

3. 1099 Reportable :

Yes

rt'V: Legal (1099) Address Information
1. Street 1: 2. City:
115 Aikens Cir Martinsburg

3. State/Province:

4. Zip/Postal Codc:

wv 25404-6210
%Pnrt VI: EFT Information
1. ABA Number: 2. Bank Name:
3. Account Type: 4.Account Number:

5. Routing ID Number:

6.Remittance Advice Transmission Mode:

L_’art V1I: Discount Tuformation

RECEIVED TIME MAY. 16.

2: 04PM




05/18/2018 2:07PM FAX 3042674032

MARTINSBURG

B0014/0020

1. Number of Days 1:

2. Discount Percent |-

3. Number ofDays 2:

4. Discount Percent 2:

5. Nurnber of Days 3:

6. Discount Percent 3

7. Number of Days 4:

8. DiscountPercent 4

L’nrt VII: Administrative Address

Address Information

1. Sireet 1: 2. Street 2:

5104 Pegasus Ct Ste C

3. City- 4. State/Provinog:
Frederick MD

5. Zip/Postal Code: 6. County:

21704-8323

7. Counlry; 8. Phone:

Us 301-698-1070

9. Additional Addregs Info: 10. Division/Department:

Contact Information

1. Principal Contact-
Nancy Hamilton

2. Phone:
301-698-1070

RECEIVED TIME MAY. 16.

2:04°M




05/16/2018 2:07FPM FAX 3042674032

MARTINSBURA

@0015/0020

3. Phone Extension:

4. Altcmate Phone:

5. Alternatc Phonc lixtension:

6. Fax Number:

7. Vax Number Extension:

8. Alternate Fax NmT:ber:

9. Alternate Fax Number Extension:

10. Email Addrcss:

11. Corvespondence Type: 12. English Spoken:
true

art IX: Ordering Addresy
Address Information

1. Street 1: 2. Street 2:

115 Aikens Cer

3. City: 4. Statc/Province:
Martinsburg WV

5. Zip/Postal Code: 6. County:
25404-6210

7. Country: 8. Thone:
Us 3047075105

9. Additional Address Info:
115 Aikens Center, Suite 20

10. Division/Departme

Contact Information

1. Principal Contact:

2. Phone:

RECETVED TIME MAY. 16.  2:04PM




05/16/2016 2:07PM FAX 3042674032 MARTINSBURG i@oo16/0020
[Rachy Mason 3047075105
3. Phone Extension: 4. Altcrnate Phone:
3047075105
5. Alternate Phonc Extension: 6. Fax Number;
7. IFax Number Extension: 8. Altcrnate Fax Number:
9. Alternate Fax Number Extension: 10. Email Address:
kmason@augmentation.com
11. Correspondence Type: 12. English Spoken:
true
‘hrr. Xz Billing Address
Address Information
1. Strect 1: 2. Street 2:
3. City: 4. State/Provinge:
5. Zip/Postal Codc: 6. County:
7. Country: 8. Phone:
9. Additiona] Address Info: 10. Division/Department;
IContact Information
RECEIVED TIME MAY. 16. 2:04PM




05/1B/2016 2:07PM FAX 3042574032

MARTINSBURG

R0017/0020

1. Principal Contact:

2. Phone:

3. Phonc Ixtension:

4. Alternate Phone:

5. Alternate Phone Extension:

6. Fax Number:

7. F'ax Number Extension:

B. Aliernate Fax Number:

9. Alteraate Fax Number Extension:

10. Email Address:

11. Corrcspoadence Type:

12. English Spoken:

‘Pnrt XI: Payment Address

Address Information

1. Street 1: 2. Street 2:

5104 Pcgasus Ct Ste C

3. Gity: - 4. Statc/Province:
Frederick MD

5. Zip/Postal Code: 6. County:
21704-8323

7. Country: 8. Phone:

Us 301-698-1070

9. Additional Address Info- 10. Division/Departmeht;

RECEIVED TIME MAY. 16,  2:04PM




05/1B/2018 2:07PM FAX 3042874032 MARTINSEBURG @0013/0020
LDI(.T Information

1. ABA Number; 2. Bank Name:

3. Account Type: 4.Account Number:

5. Routing ID Number: 6.Remittance Advice|Transmission Modc:

Contaet Information

1. Principal Contaci:
Nancy Hamilton

2. Phone:
301-698-1070

3. Phong Extension:

4. Alternatc Phone:

5. Alternate Phone Extension:

6. Fax Number

7. Fax Number Extension:

8. Altcrnate Fax Number:

9. Altemnate Fax Number Extension:

10, Email Address:

11. Comrespondence Type:

12. English Spoken:
true

kﬂrt X1J: Account Adminixtrator Information

RECEIVED TIME MAY. 16.

2:04PM




05/18/72016 2:07PM FAX 30426874032 MARTINSBURG

@0019/0020

11. User Name:
Auvpgmentationincl

2, Name:
KATITY
MASON

3. Email;
kmason@augmentation.com

4. Phone:
304-267-4944

FPart XJil: Comwmoydities

Commodity/Service Code

Commodity Desorjption

Part XIV: Business Types

Business Type ID Certification Number

Certification Start

Date

Certification End Date

art XV; Service Areas

Service Area Code

Service Area Zone

RECEIVED TIME MAY. 16.  2:04PM
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@0020/0020

Form W—S Request for Taxpayer “%c Give Form to the
ation

requestor. Do not
(. Docomber 2014) Identification Number and Cert
Department of the Tressury send to the IRG.

1 Hma(m:hnmonwlnmmemreiurn).Namehmquimonmlslha;donolmmhllmmank

Augmentation, Inc.

# Business neme/disregared artity rame, I afferent Trom sbavs

2 Ohmwmmm:brmmumﬁmmmmormmmmm - E(ﬂ'wgla(ﬂﬂesﬂﬂﬂvmlno
D;ﬂh{;ﬂlﬂvsg:’%ﬂmwm Ll coopomion (7] s copomtion [ Partnerstip | [ Trusutostas ey o ek Indhidslc; soe
Ingle-rmem
] Umited Babilty compeany. Enter the tax classiication (C-C corporation, S=5 corperatian, P<parineciiip) > Excomptpayes code (Tam) 5
Note. Fora single-member L1.C it &=  do not chook LLC; chack the approprista box | tive fine 2bove 1o fxemption from FATCA mporting
themchsaiﬁ&ﬂmuﬁhslnylemerom. N has : [ e sbovator code: (if &nyj N/A
Other (see natructions) » Anptts In 00T raltato aursay TR LUE)
[ Mdm(mmbw,sma!.mdmorairsm.) Mmdsmmmm(npﬁmd)

514 Pegasus Court, Suite ¢
6 City, state, snd 2IF codo
Fredarick. MD 21704

7 Lt ecccurd number(s) Ners (apfional)

Print ar3ype
Seq Spazifie instructlons on pege 2,

Taxpayer identification Number (TIN)

Emgrymrnmntheappmpdatebox.meﬂNpmvidedrrmslmawhmunamgivmonlne1toavolu | Social pecuity numbe>

backup withholding. For Individuale, this iz generally your sodal security number {SSN). However, fora
rmideﬁﬂm.aolepmpﬁetoqadﬁamgardedeﬂﬁly,seethepanlmﬂmcﬁommme&Fa - -

ertitles, it i your empioyer identification number (EIN), If your do not have a membes, zea How 19 get 5 i
TiN on page 3. aor
Nah.lftheamtis'mmihanonem:m,seeﬁeimhuﬂionsfcr!k:e‘land!ﬂeciMOHPage4fur [ Smployrer kisntfication nabor
guidetines on whose mimiber 1o erter. 5|2 olals 1|° 1l 2

Il Cortficaton
Under penattios of perjury, 1 cerfify thar;
1. The number shown on this formis Ty comect taxpayer identification number {or | am walling for fumber to be issued to me); and

2. 1 am not subject 10 baclaip withholding because: {s) | am exempt from backup withholding, or (b) | have not beon notified by ihe Intemal Revenue
Servine(lRS)ihatlarnmbiecltobankupwﬂhholdirlgasaremmwafaihmtommndlimm dividaﬂs.m(c)ﬂralﬁ&lﬁsnnﬁﬁedmethﬂtlam

. _ [
Omhﬁcaﬁoniummﬁ‘wmslcmm e Z sbove if you rave been maﬂedbyﬂvemsnmymmwnamyaﬂamohnﬂwpwmhddm
bannuseywhmfaileﬂtompnnauimwm dividands on your tex remim, &rmmmmszmnotamly. For imortgage:
interest peid, acquisition or abandanmeng of secired property, cancellation of deht, canlributions td an individual retiremen amangement (JRA), and
generally, payments other than imerest and dividends, You ara not required to sign the oeﬂil‘mlion,lhm You must provide yaur comect TIN, See the

/) ‘ vbr S/ f10/¢

Geneml l"mm{ons ;mm1m fhome InerasT), 1068-E {student loan Intvesy), 1098-T
Sacdon refusences are lo the hﬂﬂﬂ!ﬂmacﬁﬂmhﬁmm, * Form 1088-C ¢ deb

Future developments. Information 8501 developrnents affecting Romn W.9 fauch = Rorm 1089-A {mcquis abanda e Uned property)
oz legisidtion enacled afor we reinase ) ks at www. s govifw®, ! { Ve ofsac
Use Form W-8 only if you ara.a U.s.pmsm{innlldingamiimaﬁm). tn

Purmposs of Form provite your coract
AD indivicual or enity (Fomm W=9 requester} who is required 1o fife an inforrastion Hyoe) do nat ratuy Yo o2 the st with & TIN. you might ba sotyect
%ugwhhglm"mmﬁmmwmmmm 0 bavkup withholing. Sea What is tackup witiakBg? on pege 2

your soclal gecurity Aumber (SSN, indlvidus! Bxpayer idemificaton By siging the fi Torm, you:
nmnburﬁm),smpdon iduniﬁ:mhnnumbu-mm,armm_ 5
Hmﬁﬂmﬂonnmberﬁlmmmnmaninm&mm&nnmmummum bzﬂwmm B GG 18 coECt {or yous e waiting for a numbae
yuu.nraﬂmranmmqummbionnm'mbnmﬂmmum mMples of informemion
mmlnﬁude.hnnmmmnﬂamo.mmwms: ple 2. Certify that you am atnh]ecnobmhapwuhmuhg.or
* Form 1089-iNT {jnterest aamed or paid) 3. Clalm exerpiion frgm backup withholding fyou am a U.E. exempt payes. if
* Form 1099-DIV (dividencs, including thesa from stockes of mutual funds) o You e 50 poriy e e als. pusan, e e Sl
-Fonn1mmschaﬁwstypasnfhwms.mmugmm whhmuhngﬁnﬁ&;M'mmwmmimm
-Mlmwwmmuﬁmdﬂamdcmnmuwauﬁmw 4, Certify that FATCA mwmmhfwmfﬁmy)mdmhgmmm
brokers) emmﬁmmoﬁmhmmnuhmm&eMmbmmm?m
» Formn 1089-5 (proceats from real estats tansactions) pega 2 for further informaon.

« Farm TWknmchammrdwmimmmrkmhna)

Cat Mo, 10231X_- Form W8 (Rev. 12.2014)

RECEIVED TIME MAY. 16,  2:04PM



