
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
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Virginia’s procurement process, and to maintain the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
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by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov  with  any  other  vendor 
responses  to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the 
Purchasing Division in hard copy format. 
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

1 See attached Pricing Sheet and RFQ
document.

0.00000 EA $13,921.000000 $0.00

43222639

Please complete the attached excel file, Exhibit A - Pricing Page



Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.1 CP-7942G= or Equal 7942 2 line Cisco Phone or 
Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.2 CP-7962G= or Equal 7962 6 Line Cisco Phone or 
Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.3 CP-7915= or Equal 7915 24 Button Cisco Sidecar 
or Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.4 CP-7916= or Equal 7916 UC Phone Color 
Expansion Module or Equal

No Bid No Bid
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Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.5 CP-
SINGLFOOTSTAND= or 
Equal

Single Footstand for 7915 
Cisco Sidecar or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.6 CP-
DOUBLFOOTSTAND= 
or Equal

Double Footstand for 7915 
Cisco Sidecar or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.7 CP-PWR-CUBE-3= or 
Equal

Cisco Unified IP Phone Power 
Cube or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.8 CP-PWR-CORD-NA= or 
Equal

Cisco Unified IP Phone Power 
Cube Country Cord or Equal

No Bid No Bid
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Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.9 CP-7945G= or Equal Cisco IP Phone 7945, 2 Button 
Gig Ethernet, Color, spare or 
Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.10 CP-7965G= or Equal Cisco IP Phone 7965, 6 Button 
Gig Ethernet, Color, spare or 
Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.11 CP-7975G= or Equal Cisco IP Phone 7975, 8 Button 
Gig Ethernet, Color, spare or 
Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.12 CP-7925G-A-K9= or 
Equal

Cisco 7925G FCC; 
Battery/Power Supply Not 
Included or Equal No Bid No Bid
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Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.13 CP-BATT-7925G-STD=  
or Equal

Cisco 7925G Battery, Standard 
or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.14 CP-BATT-7925G-EXT= 
or Equal

Cisco 7925G Battery, Extended 
or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.15 CP-PWR-7925G-NA= or 
Equal

Cisco \Wireless IP Phone 
7925G Power Supply or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.16 CP-DSKCH-7925G-BUN 
or Equal

Cisco 7925G Desk Top 
Charger, Power Supply, AC 
Power Cord or Equal No Bid No Bid
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Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.17 CP-DSKCH-7925G= or 
Equal

Cisco 7925G Desk Top Charger 
or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.18 CP-PWR-DC7925G-NA=  
or Equal

Cisco 7925G Desk Top Charger 
Power Supply For North 
America or Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.19 CP-CAB-USB-7925G= or 
Equal

Cisco 7925G USB Cable or 
Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.20 CP-RUG-CASE-7925G= 
or Equal

Ruggedized case for 7925G or 
Equal

No Bid No Bid
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Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.21 CP-HOLSTER-7925G= or 
Equal

Cisco 7925G Belt Holster or 
Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.22 CP-8811-K9= or Equal Cisco IP Phone 8811 Series or 
Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.23 CP-8841-K9=  or Equal Cisco UC Phone 8841 or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.24 CP-8851-K9=  or Equal Cisco UC Phone 8851 or Equal

No Bid No Bid

Page 6of 90



Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.25 CP-8861-K9=  or Equal Cisco UC Phone 8861 or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.26 CP-BEKEM= or Equal Cisco IP Phone 8800 Key 
Expansion Module or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.27 CP-8831-K9= or Equal Cisco Unified IP Conference 
Phone 8831 base and controller 
or Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.28 CP-8831-MIC-WRLS= or 
Equal

Wireless Microphone Kit for 
Cisco IP Conference Phone 
8831 or Equal No Bid No Bid
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Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.29 CP-MIC-WIRED-S= or 
Equal

Wired Microphone Accessories 
for the 8831 Conference phone 
or Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.30 CP-8945-K9= or Equal Cisco Unified Phone 8945, 
Standard Handset or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.31 CP-8961-C-K9= or Equal Cisco UC phone 8961, 
Standard handset or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.32 CP-CKEM-C= or Equal Cisco Unified IP Color Key 
Expansion Module, or Equal

No Bid No Bid
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Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.33 CP-PWR-CUBE-4= or 
Equal

IP Phone power transformer for 
the 89/9900 phone series or 
Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.34 CP-9951-C-K9= or Equal Cisco UC Phone 9951, 
Standard Handset or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.35 CP-9951-C-CAM-K9= or 
Equal

Cisco UC Phone 9951, Std 
Hndst with Camera or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.36 CP-9971-C-K9= or Equal Cisco UC Phone 9971, 
Standard Handset or Equal

No Bid No Bid
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Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.37 CP-9971-C-CAM-K9= or 
Equal

Cisco UC Phone 9971, Std 
Hndst with Camera or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.38 CP-7811-K9 = “or Equal”

Cisco Unified IP Phone 7811 No Bid No Bid

3.1.39  CP-7821-K9 = “or Equal”

Cisco Unified IP Phone 7821 
Module No Bid No Bid

3.1.40 CP-7841-K9 = “or Equal”

Cisco Unified IP Phone 7841 
Module No Bid No Bid
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Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.41 CP-7861-K9 = “or Equal”

Cisco Unified IP Phone 7861 
Module No Bid No Bid

3.1.42 CP-7926G-W-K9= “or 
Equal”

Cisco Wireless IP Phone 7926G No Bid No Bid

3.1.43 CP-8845-K9= “or Equal”

Cisco IP Phone 8845 No Bid No Bid

3.1.44 CP-8865-K9= “or Equal”

Cisco IP Phone 8865 No Bid No Bid
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Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.45 PVDM3-16= or Equal 16-channel high-density voice 
and video DSP module SPARE 
or Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.46

PVDM3-32= or Equal 32-channel high-density voice 
and video DSP module SPARE 
or Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.47

PVDM3-64= or Equal PVDM3 64 chan or Equal or 
Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.48

PVDM3-128= or Equal PVDM3 128 chan or Equal

No Bid No Bid
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Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.49

PVDM3-192=  or Equal PVDM3 192 chan  or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.50

PVDM3-256= or Equal PVDM3 256 chan or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.51

VWIC3-1MFT-T1/E1= or 
Equal

1-Port 3rd Gen Multiflex Trunk 
Voice/WAN Int. Card - T1/E1 
or Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.52

VWIC3-2MFT-T1/E1= or 
Equal

2-Port 3rd Gen Multiflex Trunk 
Voice/WAN Int. Card - T1/E1 
or Equal No Bid No Bid
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Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.53

VWIC3-4MFT-T1/E1= or 
Equal

4-Port 3rd Gen Multiflex Trunk 
Voice/WAN Int. Card - T1/E1 
or Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.54

VIC2-4FXO= or Equal Four-port Voice Interface Card - 
FXO (Universal) or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.55

VIC2-2FXO= or Equal Two-port Voice Interface Card - 
FXO (Universal) or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.56

VIC3-4FXS/DID= Four-Port Voice Interface Card -
FXS and DID or Equal

No Bid No Bid
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Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.57

VIC3-2FXS/DID or Equal Two-Port Voice Interface Card- 
FXS and DID or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.58

VIC3-2E/M= or Equal Two-Port Voice Interface Card- 
E and M or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.59

MEM-CF-1GB= or Equal 1GB Compact Flash for Cisco 
1900, 2900, 3900 ISR

No Bid No Bid

3.1.60

MEM-2900-512MB 512MB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 2901, 2911, 2921 ISR, 
Spare No Bid No Bid
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Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.61

MEM-2900-1GB or Equal 1GB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 2901, 2911, 2921 ISR, 
Spare or Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.62

MEM-2900-2GB or Equal 2GB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 2901, 2911, 2921 ISR, 
Spare or Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.63

MEM-2951-512MB or 
Equal

512MB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 2951 ISR, Spare or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.64

MEM-2951-1GB or Equal 1GB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 2951 ISR, Spare or Equal

No Bid No Bid
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Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.65

MEM-2951-2GB or Equal 2GB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 2951 ISR, Spare or Equal

No Bid No Bid

3.1.66

MEM-3900-512MB or 
Equal

512MB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 3925/3945 ISR, Spare or 
Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.67

MEM-3900-1GB or Equal 1GB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 3925/3945 ISR, Spare or 
Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.68

MEM-3900-2GB or Equal 2GB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 3925/3945 ISR, Spare or 
Equal No Bid No Bid
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Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.69

FL-SRST-25= or Equal Feat Lic Survivable Remote 
Site Telephony Up To 25 Users 
or Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.70

FL-SRST-35= or Equal Feat Lic Survivable Remote 
Site Telephony Up To 35 Users 
or Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.71

FL-SRST-50= or Equal Feat Lic Survivable Remote 
Site Telephony Up To 50 Users 
or Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.72

FL-SRST-100= or Equal Feat Lic Survivable Remote 
Site Telephony Up To 100 
Users or Equal No Bid No Bid
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Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.73

FL-SRST-175= or Equal Feat Lic Survivable Remote 
Site Telephony Up To 175 
Users or Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.74

FL-SRST-250= or Equal Feat Lic Survivable Remote 
Site Telephony Up To 250 
Users or Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.75

FL-CME-SRST-5= or 
Equal

Communication Manager 
Express or SRST - 5 seat paper 
RTU or Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.76

FL-CME-SRST-25= or 
Equal

Communication Manager 
Express or SRST - 25 seat 
paper RTU or Equal No Bid No Bid
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Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.77

FL-CME-SRST-100= or 
Equal

Cisco Communication Manager 
or SRST- 100 seat Paper RTU 
or Equal No Bid No Bid

3.1.78

Unified Workspace Licensing 
(CUWL)“or Equal”

Cisco Unified Workspace Licensing 
(CUWL), Standard Add-on “or 
Equal”

No Bid No Bid

3.1.78.1

L-CUWL-ADDON-
STDK9

Unified Workspace Licensing - 
Top Level for STD “or Equal” No Bid No Bid

3.1.78.2

CON-ECMU-
LCUWLADD SWSS UPGRADES Unified 

Workspace Licensing - Top 
Level “or Equal”

No Bid No Bid
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Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.78.3

L-LIC-UWL-STD-SLED

Unified Workspace Licensing 
STD, 1 User Govt/Edu “or 
Equal”

No Bid No Bid

3.1.78.4

CON-ECMU-STDSLED

SWSS UPGRADES Unified 
Workspace Licensing STD, 1 
User “or Equal”

No Bid No Bid

3.1.78.5

L-EXST-DEP-OVER10K

Total Deployment is Over 
10,000 users “or Equal” No Bid No Bid

3.1.78.6

L-LIC-UWL-S-SLED-C

Services Mapping SKU, Over 
10K UWL STD users “or 
Equal”

No Bid No Bid
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Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.78.7

CON-ECMU-SSLEDC

SWSS UPGRADES Services 
Mapping SKU, Over 10K UWL 
STD “or Equal”

No Bid No Bid

3.1.78.8

L-CUP-86-UWLA-PAK

Unified Presence 8.6 PAK “or 
Equal” No Bid No Bid

3.1.78.9

L-JAB9-DSK-UWL-RTU

Jabber for Desktop Right to 
Use Certificate “or Equal” No Bid No Bid

3.1.78.10

L-CUCM-UWL

Unified Communications 
Manager UWL DLU Bundle 
“or Equal”

No Bid No Bid
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Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.78.11

L-CUCM-UWL-PAK

Unified Communications 
Manager UWL PAK “or Equal” No Bid No Bid

3.1.78.12

L-CUP-86-UWLA-USR

Unified Presence 8.6 Users “or 
Equal” No Bid No Bid

3.1.78.13

L-UNCN8-UWLA-PAK

Unity Connection 8.x Addon 
PAK for CUWL “or Equal” No Bid No Bid

3.1.78.14

L-UNITYCN8-UWL-USR

Unity Connection 8.x Users “or 
Equal” No Bid No Bid
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Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.78.15

L-CUP-ONPREM-OPT

Included Cisco Unified 
Presence On Premise “or 
Equal”

No Bid No Bid

3.1.78.16

L-CUP-86-UWLA

Cisco Unified Presence Add-On 
8.6 for CUWL only “or Equal” No Bid No Bid

3.1.78.17

L-JAB9-DSK-UWL

Jabber for Desktop 9.x for 
CUWL Only “or Equal” No Bid No Bid

3.1.78.18

L-UNITYCN8-UWLA

Unity Connection 8.0 for 
CUWL Addon only “or Equal” No Bid No Bid
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.79
Unified Contact Center Express 
(Unified CCX)“or Equal”

Cisco Unified Contact Center 
Express (Unified CCX), Enhanced 
Add-on “or Equal”

No Bid No Bid

3.1.79.1
CCX-10-ADD-K9 CCX 10.0 Add-on Licenses “or 

Equal” No Bid No Bid

3.1.79.2
CON-ECMU-CCX10AK9

(SWSS UPGRADES CCX 10.0 
Add-on Licenses “or Equal” No Bid No Bid

3.1.79.3
CCX-10-A-E-LIC CCX 10.0 ENH Seat Qty 1 

ADDON LICENSE ONLY “or 
Equal”

No Bid No Bid

3.1.79.4
CON-ECMU-CCX1ELIC

SWSS UPGRADES CCX 10.0 
ENH Seat Qt “or Equal” No Bid No Bid

3.1.79.5
CCX-10-PAK CCX 10.0 autoexpanded PAK 

“or Equal” No Bid No Bid

3.1.80
Unified Contact Center Express 
(Unified CCX)“or Equal”

Cisco Unified Contact Center 
Express (Unified CCX), Premium 
Add-on “or Equal”

No Bid No Bid

3.1.80.1
CCX-10-ADD-K9 CCX 10.0 Add-on Licenses “or 

Equal” No Bid No Bid

3.1.80.2
CON-ECMU-CCX10AK9

SWSS UPGRADES CCX 10.0 
Add-on Licenses “or Equal” No Bid No Bid
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.80.3
CCX-10-A-P-LIC CCX 10.0 PRE Seat Qty 1 

ADDON LICENSE ONLY “or 
Equal”

No Bid No Bid

3.1.80.4
CON-ECMU-CCX10LIC

SWSS UPGRADES CCX 10.0 
PRE Seat Qt “or Equal” No Bid No Bid

3.1.80.5
CCX-10-PAK CCX 10.0 autoexpanded PAK 

“or Equal” No Bid No Bid

3.1.81
Plantronics HW251N or 
Equal

Supraplus Wideband Office 
Headset - Noise-cancelling 
monaural or Equal

HW251N Or new 
HW510

86433-01

3.1.82
Plantronics HW261N or 
Equal

Supraplus Wideband Office 
Headset - Noise-cancelling 
Binaural or Equal

HW261N Or new 
HW520

89434-01

3.1.83
Plantronics H41N or Equal Over-the-Ear - Noise-cancelling 

monaural or Equal

3.1.84
Plantronics H81N or Equal Three-point- support Over-the-

Ear - Noise-cancelling 
monaural or Equal

3.1.85

Plantronics 26716-01 or 
Equal

H-Series Quick Disconnect to 
Modular Cable Standard - 
Cisco Modular Headset Jack or 
Equal
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.86
Plantronics DA40 or Equal USB-to QD Adaptor or Equal Replaced by DA70 201851-01

3.1.87

Plantronics CS540 
w/HL10 or Equal

Convertible wireless Headset - 
Noise-cancelling 
w/Automatic Handset Lifter or 
Equal

3.1.88
Plantronics CS540 or 
Equal

Convertible wireless Headset - 
Noise-cancelling monaural or 
Equal

3.1.89
Plantronics HL10 or Equal Automatic Handset Lifter or 

Equal

3.1.90
Plantronics CS520 or 
Equal

Over-the-head - Noise-
cancelling Binaural wireless or 
Equal

3.1.91

Jabra BIZ 2400 (2406-820-
105) or Equal

Mono, 3-in-1(Headband, 
Neckband, Earhook), Noise 
Canceling,
 STD(Standard variation 
microphone sensitivity)  or 
Equal

Jabra Biz 2400 II 3 
in 1 mono

2406-820-205
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.92

Jabra BIZ 2400 (2403-820-
105) or Equal

Mono Headband, Noise 
Canceling, 
STD(Standard variation 
microphone sensitivity) or 
Equal

Jabra Biz 2400 II 
Mono

2403-820-205

3.1.93

Jabra BIZ 2400 (2409-820-
105) or Equal

Duo, Noise Canceling, 
STD(Standard variation 
microphone sensitivity) or 
Equal

Jabra Biz 2400 II 
Duo NC

2409-820-205

3.1.94
Jabra BIZ 2400 (2489-820-
105) or Equal

Duo, IP, Noise Canceling, 
Neodymium speakers or Equal

Jabra 2400 II Duo 
IP NC

2489-820-205

3.1.95
Jabra LINK 850 (850-09) 
or Equal

Amplifier, Advanced noise 
canceling, Connects Headset to 
PC and Phone or Equal

Jabra Link 850 850-09

3.1.96
Jabra GN8050 TCA (01-
0125) or Equal

Amplifier, Connects Headset to 
PC and Phone or Equal

Replaced by Jabra 
Link 860

860-09

3.1.97

Jabra GN1200 CC (88011-
99) or Equal

Cord connects Jabra headset to 
Cisco telephone, RJ11 
connector, Quick Disconnect or 
Equal
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.98

Jabra GN1200 (88001-99) 
or Equal

Cord connects Jabra headset to 
Cisco telephone, Microphone 
amplification,
 RJ11 connector, Quick 
Disconnect or Equal

3.1.99

Jabra PRO 9450 Flex 
(9450-65-707-105) or 
Equal

Monaural, Noise-cancelling, 
Wireless, Desk and Softphone, 
Connects via USB or Equal

3.1.100

Jabra PRO 9450 Duo 
(9450-69-707-105) or 
Equal

Duo, Noise-cancelling, 
Wireless, Desk and Softphone, 
Connects via USB or Equal

3.1.101

Jabra PRO 9460 Mono 
(9460-65-707-105) or 
Equal

Monaural, 2.4" touch screen 
display, Noise-cancelling, 
Wireless, Desk and Softphone,  
Connects via USB or Equal

3.1.102

Jabra PRO 9460 Duo 
(9460-69-707-105) or 
Equal

Duo, 2.4" touch screen display, 
Noise-cancelling, Wireless, 
Desk and Softphone,
 Connects via USB or Equal
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description Alternate Item Alternate Part 

Number

3.1.103

Jabra PRO 9465 Duo 
(9465-69-804-105) or 
Equal

Duo,  Triple connectivity, 
Sound enhancing, 2.4" touch 
screen display,
 Noise-cancelling,  Wireless, 
Desk and Softphone, Connects 
via USB or Equal

3.1.104

Jabra PRO 9470 Mono 
(9470-66-904-105) or 
Equal

Monaural,  Triple connectivity, 
Sound enhancing, 2.4" touch 
screen display,
 Noise-cancelling,  Wireless, 
Desk and Softphone, Connects 
via USB or Equal

3.1.105

Jabra LINK 14201-22 
(14201-22) or Equal

Cisco EHS 3 foot Adapter for 
Jabra wireless headsets and 
Cisco Unified IP phones or 
Equal
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.1 CP-7942G= or Equal 7942 2 line Cisco Phone or 
Equal

3.1.2 CP-7962G= or Equal 7962 6 Line Cisco Phone or 
Equal

3.1.3 CP-7915= or Equal 7915 24 Button Cisco Sidecar 
or Equal

3.1.4 CP-7916= or Equal 7916 UC Phone Color 
Expansion Module or Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

1000 0

500 0

300 0

50

0

Page 31of 90



Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.5 CP-
SINGLFOOTSTAND= or 
Equal

Single Footstand for 7915 
Cisco Sidecar or Equal

3.1.6 CP-
DOUBLFOOTSTAND= 
or Equal

Double Footstand for 7915 
Cisco Sidecar or Equal

3.1.7 CP-PWR-CUBE-3= or 
Equal

Cisco Unified IP Phone Power 
Cube or Equal

3.1.8 CP-PWR-CORD-NA= or 
Equal

Cisco Unified IP Phone Power 
Cube Country Cord or Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

20

0

25

0

100

0

100

0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.9 CP-7945G= or Equal Cisco IP Phone 7945, 2 Button 
Gig Ethernet, Color, spare or 
Equal

3.1.10 CP-7965G= or Equal Cisco IP Phone 7965, 6 Button 
Gig Ethernet, Color, spare or 
Equal

3.1.11 CP-7975G= or Equal Cisco IP Phone 7975, 8 Button 
Gig Ethernet, Color, spare or 
Equal

3.1.12 CP-7925G-A-K9= or 
Equal

Cisco 7925G FCC; 
Battery/Power Supply Not 
Included or Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

300

0

150

0

50

0

50

0

Page 33of 90



Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.13 CP-BATT-7925G-STD=  
or Equal

Cisco 7925G Battery, Standard 
or Equal

3.1.14 CP-BATT-7925G-EXT= 
or Equal

Cisco 7925G Battery, Extended 
or Equal

3.1.15 CP-PWR-7925G-NA= or 
Equal

Cisco \Wireless IP Phone 
7925G Power Supply or Equal

3.1.16 CP-DSKCH-7925G-BUN 
or Equal

Cisco 7925G Desk Top 
Charger, Power Supply, AC 
Power Cord or Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

50

0

50

0

30

0

30

0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.17 CP-DSKCH-7925G= or 
Equal

Cisco 7925G Desk Top Charger 
or Equal

3.1.18 CP-PWR-DC7925G-NA=  
or Equal

Cisco 7925G Desk Top Charger 
Power Supply For North 
America or Equal

3.1.19 CP-CAB-USB-7925G= or 
Equal

Cisco 7925G USB Cable or 
Equal

3.1.20 CP-RUG-CASE-7925G= 
or Equal

Ruggedized case for 7925G or 
Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

30

0

5

0

30

0

2

0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.21 CP-HOLSTER-7925G= or 
Equal

Cisco 7925G Belt Holster or 
Equal

3.1.22 CP-8811-K9= or Equal Cisco IP Phone 8811 Series or 
Equal

3.1.23 CP-8841-K9=  or Equal Cisco UC Phone 8841 or Equal

3.1.24 CP-8851-K9=  or Equal Cisco UC Phone 8851 or Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

5

0

400

0

350

0

150

0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.25 CP-8861-K9=  or Equal Cisco UC Phone 8861 or Equal

3.1.26 CP-BEKEM= or Equal Cisco IP Phone 8800 Key 
Expansion Module or Equal

3.1.27 CP-8831-K9= or Equal Cisco Unified IP Conference 
Phone 8831 base and controller 
or Equal

3.1.28 CP-8831-MIC-WRLS= or 
Equal

Wireless Microphone Kit for 
Cisco IP Conference Phone 
8831 or Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

150

0

50

0

200

0

100

0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.29 CP-MIC-WIRED-S= or 
Equal

Wired Microphone Accessories 
for the 8831 Conference phone 
or Equal

3.1.30 CP-8945-K9= or Equal Cisco Unified Phone 8945, 
Standard Handset or Equal

3.1.31 CP-8961-C-K9= or Equal Cisco UC phone 8961, 
Standard handset or Equal

3.1.32 CP-CKEM-C= or Equal Cisco Unified IP Color Key 
Expansion Module, or Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

100

0

100

0

50

0

50

0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.33 CP-PWR-CUBE-4= or 
Equal

IP Phone power transformer for 
the 89/9900 phone series or 
Equal

3.1.34 CP-9951-C-K9= or Equal Cisco UC Phone 9951, 
Standard Handset or Equal

3.1.35 CP-9951-C-CAM-K9= or 
Equal

Cisco UC Phone 9951, Std 
Hndst with Camera or Equal

3.1.36 CP-9971-C-K9= or Equal Cisco UC Phone 9971, 
Standard Handset or Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

50

0

100

0

50

0

100

0

Page 39of 90



Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.37 CP-9971-C-CAM-K9= or 
Equal

Cisco UC Phone 9971, Std 
Hndst with Camera or Equal

3.1.38 CP-7811-K9 = “or Equal”

Cisco Unified IP Phone 7811

3.1.39  CP-7821-K9 = “or Equal”

Cisco Unified IP Phone 7821 
Module

3.1.40 CP-7841-K9 = “or Equal”

Cisco Unified IP Phone 7841 
Module

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

50

0

50

0

50

0

100

0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.41 CP-7861-K9 = “or Equal”

Cisco Unified IP Phone 7861 
Module

3.1.42 CP-7926G-W-K9= “or 
Equal”

Cisco Wireless IP Phone 7926G

3.1.43 CP-8845-K9= “or Equal”

Cisco IP Phone 8845

3.1.44 CP-8865-K9= “or Equal”

Cisco IP Phone 8865

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

100

0

100

0

50

0

50

0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.45 PVDM3-16= or Equal 16-channel high-density voice 
and video DSP module SPARE 
or Equal

3.1.46

PVDM3-32= or Equal 32-channel high-density voice 
and video DSP module SPARE 
or Equal

3.1.47

PVDM3-64= or Equal PVDM3 64 chan or Equal or 
Equal

3.1.48

PVDM3-128= or Equal PVDM3 128 chan or Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

50

0

200

0

50

0

25

0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.49

PVDM3-192=  or Equal PVDM3 192 chan  or Equal

3.1.50

PVDM3-256= or Equal PVDM3 256 chan or Equal

3.1.51

VWIC3-1MFT-T1/E1= or 
Equal

1-Port 3rd Gen Multiflex Trunk 
Voice/WAN Int. Card - T1/E1 
or Equal

3.1.52

VWIC3-2MFT-T1/E1= or 
Equal

2-Port 3rd Gen Multiflex Trunk 
Voice/WAN Int. Card - T1/E1 
or Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

15

0

10

0

100

0

200

0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.53

VWIC3-4MFT-T1/E1= or 
Equal

4-Port 3rd Gen Multiflex Trunk 
Voice/WAN Int. Card - T1/E1 
or Equal

3.1.54

VIC2-4FXO= or Equal Four-port Voice Interface Card - 
FXO (Universal) or Equal

3.1.55

VIC2-2FXO= or Equal Two-port Voice Interface Card - 
FXO (Universal) or Equal

3.1.56

VIC3-4FXS/DID= Four-Port Voice Interface Card -
FXS and DID or Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

25

0

200

0

20

0

5

0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.57

VIC3-2FXS/DID or Equal Two-Port Voice Interface Card- 
FXS and DID or Equal

3.1.58

VIC3-2E/M= or Equal Two-Port Voice Interface Card- 
E and M or Equal

3.1.59

MEM-CF-1GB= or Equal 1GB Compact Flash for Cisco 
1900, 2900, 3900 ISR

3.1.60

MEM-2900-512MB 512MB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 2901, 2911, 2921 ISR, 
Spare

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

10

0

25

0

100

0

100

0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.61

MEM-2900-1GB or Equal 1GB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 2901, 2911, 2921 ISR, 
Spare or Equal

3.1.62

MEM-2900-2GB or Equal 2GB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 2901, 2911, 2921 ISR, 
Spare or Equal

3.1.63

MEM-2951-512MB or 
Equal

512MB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 2951 ISR, Spare or Equal

3.1.64

MEM-2951-1GB or Equal 1GB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 2951 ISR, Spare or Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

100

0

100

0

100

0

100

0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.65

MEM-2951-2GB or Equal 2GB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 2951 ISR, Spare or Equal

3.1.66

MEM-3900-512MB or 
Equal

512MB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 3925/3945 ISR, Spare or 
Equal

3.1.67

MEM-3900-1GB or Equal 1GB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 3925/3945 ISR, Spare or 
Equal

3.1.68

MEM-3900-2GB or Equal 2GB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 3925/3945 ISR, Spare or 
Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

100

0

100

0

100

0

100

0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.69

FL-SRST-25= or Equal Feat Lic Survivable Remote 
Site Telephony Up To 25 Users 
or Equal

3.1.70

FL-SRST-35= or Equal Feat Lic Survivable Remote 
Site Telephony Up To 35 Users 
or Equal

3.1.71

FL-SRST-50= or Equal Feat Lic Survivable Remote 
Site Telephony Up To 50 Users 
or Equal

3.1.72

FL-SRST-100= or Equal Feat Lic Survivable Remote 
Site Telephony Up To 100 
Users or Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

5

0

5

0

5

0

5

0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.73

FL-SRST-175= or Equal Feat Lic Survivable Remote 
Site Telephony Up To 175 
Users or Equal

3.1.74

FL-SRST-250= or Equal Feat Lic Survivable Remote 
Site Telephony Up To 250 
Users or Equal

3.1.75

FL-CME-SRST-5= or 
Equal

Communication Manager 
Express or SRST - 5 seat paper 
RTU or Equal

3.1.76

FL-CME-SRST-25= or 
Equal

Communication Manager 
Express or SRST - 25 seat 
paper RTU or Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

5

0

5

0

5

0

5

0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.77

FL-CME-SRST-100= or 
Equal

Cisco Communication Manager 
or SRST- 100 seat Paper RTU 
or Equal

3.1.78

Unified Workspace Licensing 
(CUWL)“or Equal”

Cisco Unified Workspace Licensing 
(CUWL), Standard Add-on “or 
Equal”

3.1.78.1

L-CUWL-ADDON-
STDK9

Unified Workspace Licensing - 
Top Level for STD “or Equal”

3.1.78.2

CON-ECMU-
LCUWLADD SWSS UPGRADES Unified 

Workspace Licensing - Top 
Level “or Equal”

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

5

0

1000 0

1000 0

1000 0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.78.3

L-LIC-UWL-STD-SLED

Unified Workspace Licensing 
STD, 1 User Govt/Edu “or 
Equal”

3.1.78.4

CON-ECMU-STDSLED

SWSS UPGRADES Unified 
Workspace Licensing STD, 1 
User “or Equal”

3.1.78.5

L-EXST-DEP-OVER10K

Total Deployment is Over 
10,000 users “or Equal”

3.1.78.6

L-LIC-UWL-S-SLED-C

Services Mapping SKU, Over 
10K UWL STD users “or 
Equal”

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

1000 0

1000 0

1000 0

1000 0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.78.7

CON-ECMU-SSLEDC

SWSS UPGRADES Services 
Mapping SKU, Over 10K UWL 
STD “or Equal”

3.1.78.8

L-CUP-86-UWLA-PAK

Unified Presence 8.6 PAK “or 
Equal”

3.1.78.9

L-JAB9-DSK-UWL-RTU

Jabber for Desktop Right to 
Use Certificate “or Equal”

3.1.78.10

L-CUCM-UWL

Unified Communications 
Manager UWL DLU Bundle 
“or Equal”

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

1000 0

1000 0

1000 0

1000 0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.78.11

L-CUCM-UWL-PAK

Unified Communications 
Manager UWL PAK “or Equal”

3.1.78.12

L-CUP-86-UWLA-USR

Unified Presence 8.6 Users “or 
Equal”

3.1.78.13

L-UNCN8-UWLA-PAK

Unity Connection 8.x Addon 
PAK for CUWL “or Equal”

3.1.78.14

L-UNITYCN8-UWL-USR

Unity Connection 8.x Users “or 
Equal”

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

1000 0

1000 0

1000 0

1000 0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.78.15

L-CUP-ONPREM-OPT

Included Cisco Unified 
Presence On Premise “or 
Equal”

3.1.78.16

L-CUP-86-UWLA

Cisco Unified Presence Add-On 
8.6 for CUWL only “or Equal”

3.1.78.17

L-JAB9-DSK-UWL

Jabber for Desktop 9.x for 
CUWL Only “or Equal”

3.1.78.18

L-UNITYCN8-UWLA

Unity Connection 8.0 for 
CUWL Addon only “or Equal”

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

1000 0

1000 0

1000 0

1000 0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.79
Unified Contact Center Express 
(Unified CCX)“or Equal”

Cisco Unified Contact Center 
Express (Unified CCX), Enhanced 
Add-on “or Equal”

3.1.79.1
CCX-10-ADD-K9 CCX 10.0 Add-on Licenses “or 

Equal”

3.1.79.2
CON-ECMU-CCX10AK9

(SWSS UPGRADES CCX 10.0 
Add-on Licenses “or Equal”

3.1.79.3
CCX-10-A-E-LIC CCX 10.0 ENH Seat Qty 1 

ADDON LICENSE ONLY “or 
Equal”

3.1.79.4
CON-ECMU-CCX1ELIC

SWSS UPGRADES CCX 10.0 
ENH Seat Qt “or Equal”

3.1.79.5
CCX-10-PAK CCX 10.0 autoexpanded PAK 

“or Equal”

3.1.80
Unified Contact Center Express 
(Unified CCX)“or Equal”

Cisco Unified Contact Center 
Express (Unified CCX), Premium 
Add-on “or Equal”

3.1.80.1
CCX-10-ADD-K9 CCX 10.0 Add-on Licenses “or 

Equal”

3.1.80.2
CON-ECMU-CCX10AK9

SWSS UPGRADES CCX 10.0 
Add-on Licenses “or Equal”

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

100 0

100 0

100 0

100 0

100 0

100 0

100 0

100 0

100 0
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Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.80.3
CCX-10-A-P-LIC CCX 10.0 PRE Seat Qty 1 

ADDON LICENSE ONLY “or 
Equal”

3.1.80.4
CON-ECMU-CCX10LIC

SWSS UPGRADES CCX 10.0 
PRE Seat Qt “or Equal”

3.1.80.5
CCX-10-PAK CCX 10.0 autoexpanded PAK 

“or Equal”

3.1.81
Plantronics HW251N or 
Equal

Supraplus Wideband Office 
Headset - Noise-cancelling 
monaural or Equal

3.1.82
Plantronics HW261N or 
Equal

Supraplus Wideband Office 
Headset - Noise-cancelling 
Binaural or Equal

3.1.83
Plantronics H41N or Equal Over-the-Ear - Noise-cancelling 

monaural or Equal

3.1.84
Plantronics H81N or Equal Three-point- support Over-the-

Ear - Noise-cancelling 
monaural or Equal

3.1.85

Plantronics 26716-01 or 
Equal

H-Series Quick Disconnect to 
Modular Cable Standard - 
Cisco Modular Headset Jack or 
Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

100 0

100 0

100 0

5 55.21

5 65.62

5 60.41

5 72.92

5 23.93
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Contract Item 
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Number
Part Number Description

3.1.86
Plantronics DA40 or Equal USB-to QD Adaptor or Equal

3.1.87

Plantronics CS540 
w/HL10 or Equal

Convertible wireless Headset - 
Noise-cancelling 
w/Automatic Handset Lifter or 
Equal

3.1.88
Plantronics CS540 or 
Equal

Convertible wireless Headset - 
Noise-cancelling monaural or 
Equal

3.1.89
Plantronics HL10 or Equal Automatic Handset Lifter or 

Equal

3.1.90
Plantronics CS520 or 
Equal

Over-the-head - Noise-
cancelling Binaural wireless or 
Equal

3.1.91

Jabra BIZ 2400 (2406-820-
105) or Equal

Mono, 3-in-1(Headband, 
Neckband, Earhook), Noise 
Canceling,
 STD(Standard variation 
microphone sensitivity)  or 
Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

5 24.46

5 208.33

5 166.67

5 42.1

5 182.29

5 98.91
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Part Number Description

3.1.92

Jabra BIZ 2400 (2403-820-
105) or Equal

Mono Headband, Noise 
Canceling, 
STD(Standard variation 
microphone sensitivity) or 
Equal

3.1.93

Jabra BIZ 2400 (2409-820-
105) or Equal

Duo, Noise Canceling, 
STD(Standard variation 
microphone sensitivity) or 
Equal

3.1.94
Jabra BIZ 2400 (2489-820-
105) or Equal

Duo, IP, Noise Canceling, 
Neodymium speakers or Equal

3.1.95
Jabra LINK 850 (850-09) 
or Equal

Amplifier, Advanced noise 
canceling, Connects Headset to 
PC and Phone or Equal

3.1.96
Jabra GN8050 TCA (01-
0125) or Equal

Amplifier, Connects Headset to 
PC and Phone or Equal

3.1.97

Jabra GN1200 CC (88011-
99) or Equal

Cord connects Jabra headset to 
Cisco telephone, RJ11 
connector, Quick Disconnect or 
Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

5 93.47

5 104.34

5 104.33

5 65.2

5 72.82

5 15.93

Page 58of 90



Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
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3.1.98

Jabra GN1200 (88001-99) 
or Equal

Cord connects Jabra headset to 
Cisco telephone, Microphone 
amplification,
 RJ11 connector, Quick 
Disconnect or Equal

3.1.99

Jabra PRO 9450 Flex 
(9450-65-707-105) or 
Equal

Monaural, Noise-cancelling, 
Wireless, Desk and Softphone, 
Connects via USB or Equal

3.1.100

Jabra PRO 9450 Duo 
(9450-69-707-105) or 
Equal

Duo, Noise-cancelling, 
Wireless, Desk and Softphone, 
Connects via USB or Equal

3.1.101

Jabra PRO 9460 Mono 
(9460-65-707-105) or 
Equal

Monaural, 2.4" touch screen 
display, Noise-cancelling, 
Wireless, Desk and Softphone,  
Connects via USB or Equal

3.1.102

Jabra PRO 9460 Duo 
(9460-69-707-105) or 
Equal

Duo, 2.4" touch screen display, 
Noise-cancelling, Wireless, 
Desk and Softphone,
 Connects via USB or Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

5 15.93

5 189.12

5 204.33

5 211.95

5 217.39
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3.1.103

Jabra PRO 9465 Duo 
(9465-69-804-105) or 
Equal

Duo,  Triple connectivity, 
Sound enhancing, 2.4" touch 
screen display,
 Noise-cancelling,  Wireless, 
Desk and Softphone, Connects 
via USB or Equal

3.1.104

Jabra PRO 9470 Mono 
(9470-66-904-105) or 
Equal

Monaural,  Triple connectivity, 
Sound enhancing, 2.4" touch 
screen display,
 Noise-cancelling,  Wireless, 
Desk and Softphone, Connects 
via USB or Equal

3.1.105

Jabra LINK 14201-22 
(14201-22) or Equal

Cisco EHS 3 foot Adapter for 
Jabra wireless headsets and 
Cisco Unified IP phones or 
Equal

Estimated       
QTY Item Cost

5 239.13

5 228.26

5 21.15

Total Cost

Page 60of 90



Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
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3.1.1 CP-7942G= or Equal 7942 2 line Cisco Phone or 
Equal

3.1.2 CP-7962G= or Equal 7962 6 Line Cisco Phone or 
Equal

3.1.3 CP-7915= or Equal 7915 24 Button Cisco Sidecar 
or Equal

3.1.4 CP-7916= or Equal 7916 UC Phone Color 
Expansion Module or Equal

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.5 CP-
SINGLFOOTSTAND= or 
Equal

Single Footstand for 7915 
Cisco Sidecar or Equal

3.1.6 CP-
DOUBLFOOTSTAND= 
or Equal

Double Footstand for 7915 
Cisco Sidecar or Equal

3.1.7 CP-PWR-CUBE-3= or 
Equal

Cisco Unified IP Phone Power 
Cube or Equal

3.1.8 CP-PWR-CORD-NA= or 
Equal

Cisco Unified IP Phone Power 
Cube Country Cord or Equal

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.9 CP-7945G= or Equal Cisco IP Phone 7945, 2 Button 
Gig Ethernet, Color, spare or 
Equal

3.1.10 CP-7965G= or Equal Cisco IP Phone 7965, 6 Button 
Gig Ethernet, Color, spare or 
Equal

3.1.11 CP-7975G= or Equal Cisco IP Phone 7975, 8 Button 
Gig Ethernet, Color, spare or 
Equal

3.1.12 CP-7925G-A-K9= or 
Equal

Cisco 7925G FCC; 
Battery/Power Supply Not 
Included or Equal

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.13 CP-BATT-7925G-STD=  
or Equal

Cisco 7925G Battery, Standard 
or Equal

3.1.14 CP-BATT-7925G-EXT= 
or Equal

Cisco 7925G Battery, Extended 
or Equal

3.1.15 CP-PWR-7925G-NA= or 
Equal

Cisco \Wireless IP Phone 
7925G Power Supply or Equal

3.1.16 CP-DSKCH-7925G-BUN 
or Equal

Cisco 7925G Desk Top 
Charger, Power Supply, AC 
Power Cord or Equal

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

Page 64of 90



Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.17 CP-DSKCH-7925G= or 
Equal

Cisco 7925G Desk Top Charger 
or Equal

3.1.18 CP-PWR-DC7925G-NA=  
or Equal

Cisco 7925G Desk Top Charger 
Power Supply For North 
America or Equal

3.1.19 CP-CAB-USB-7925G= or 
Equal

Cisco 7925G USB Cable or 
Equal

3.1.20 CP-RUG-CASE-7925G= 
or Equal

Ruggedized case for 7925G or 
Equal

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.21 CP-HOLSTER-7925G= or 
Equal

Cisco 7925G Belt Holster or 
Equal

3.1.22 CP-8811-K9= or Equal Cisco IP Phone 8811 Series or 
Equal

3.1.23 CP-8841-K9=  or Equal Cisco UC Phone 8841 or Equal

3.1.24 CP-8851-K9=  or Equal Cisco UC Phone 8851 or Equal

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.25 CP-8861-K9=  or Equal Cisco UC Phone 8861 or Equal

3.1.26 CP-BEKEM= or Equal Cisco IP Phone 8800 Key 
Expansion Module or Equal

3.1.27 CP-8831-K9= or Equal Cisco Unified IP Conference 
Phone 8831 base and controller 
or Equal

3.1.28 CP-8831-MIC-WRLS= or 
Equal

Wireless Microphone Kit for 
Cisco IP Conference Phone 
8831 or Equal

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.29 CP-MIC-WIRED-S= or 
Equal

Wired Microphone Accessories 
for the 8831 Conference phone 
or Equal

3.1.30 CP-8945-K9= or Equal Cisco Unified Phone 8945, 
Standard Handset or Equal

3.1.31 CP-8961-C-K9= or Equal Cisco UC phone 8961, 
Standard handset or Equal

3.1.32 CP-CKEM-C= or Equal Cisco Unified IP Color Key 
Expansion Module, or Equal

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.33 CP-PWR-CUBE-4= or 
Equal

IP Phone power transformer for 
the 89/9900 phone series or 
Equal

3.1.34 CP-9951-C-K9= or Equal Cisco UC Phone 9951, 
Standard Handset or Equal

3.1.35 CP-9951-C-CAM-K9= or 
Equal

Cisco UC Phone 9951, Std 
Hndst with Camera or Equal

3.1.36 CP-9971-C-K9= or Equal Cisco UC Phone 9971, 
Standard Handset or Equal

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.37 CP-9971-C-CAM-K9= or 
Equal

Cisco UC Phone 9971, Std 
Hndst with Camera or Equal

3.1.38 CP-7811-K9 = “or Equal”

Cisco Unified IP Phone 7811

3.1.39  CP-7821-K9 = “or Equal”

Cisco Unified IP Phone 7821 
Module

3.1.40 CP-7841-K9 = “or Equal”

Cisco Unified IP Phone 7841 
Module

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.41 CP-7861-K9 = “or Equal”

Cisco Unified IP Phone 7861 
Module

3.1.42 CP-7926G-W-K9= “or 
Equal”

Cisco Wireless IP Phone 7926G

3.1.43 CP-8845-K9= “or Equal”

Cisco IP Phone 8845

3.1.44 CP-8865-K9= “or Equal”

Cisco IP Phone 8865

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.45 PVDM3-16= or Equal 16-channel high-density voice 
and video DSP module SPARE 
or Equal

3.1.46

PVDM3-32= or Equal 32-channel high-density voice 
and video DSP module SPARE 
or Equal

3.1.47

PVDM3-64= or Equal PVDM3 64 chan or Equal or 
Equal

3.1.48

PVDM3-128= or Equal PVDM3 128 chan or Equal

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.49

PVDM3-192=  or Equal PVDM3 192 chan  or Equal

3.1.50

PVDM3-256= or Equal PVDM3 256 chan or Equal

3.1.51

VWIC3-1MFT-T1/E1= or 
Equal

1-Port 3rd Gen Multiflex Trunk 
Voice/WAN Int. Card - T1/E1 
or Equal

3.1.52

VWIC3-2MFT-T1/E1= or 
Equal

2-Port 3rd Gen Multiflex Trunk 
Voice/WAN Int. Card - T1/E1 
or Equal

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

Page 73of 90



Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.53

VWIC3-4MFT-T1/E1= or 
Equal

4-Port 3rd Gen Multiflex Trunk 
Voice/WAN Int. Card - T1/E1 
or Equal

3.1.54

VIC2-4FXO= or Equal Four-port Voice Interface Card - 
FXO (Universal) or Equal

3.1.55

VIC2-2FXO= or Equal Two-port Voice Interface Card - 
FXO (Universal) or Equal

3.1.56

VIC3-4FXS/DID= Four-Port Voice Interface Card -
FXS and DID or Equal

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.57

VIC3-2FXS/DID or Equal Two-Port Voice Interface Card- 
FXS and DID or Equal

3.1.58

VIC3-2E/M= or Equal Two-Port Voice Interface Card- 
E and M or Equal

3.1.59

MEM-CF-1GB= or Equal 1GB Compact Flash for Cisco 
1900, 2900, 3900 ISR

3.1.60

MEM-2900-512MB 512MB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 2901, 2911, 2921 ISR, 
Spare

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.61

MEM-2900-1GB or Equal 1GB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 2901, 2911, 2921 ISR, 
Spare or Equal

3.1.62

MEM-2900-2GB or Equal 2GB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 2901, 2911, 2921 ISR, 
Spare or Equal

3.1.63

MEM-2951-512MB or 
Equal

512MB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 2951 ISR, Spare or Equal

3.1.64

MEM-2951-1GB or Equal 1GB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 2951 ISR, Spare or Equal

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.65

MEM-2951-2GB or Equal 2GB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 2951 ISR, Spare or Equal

3.1.66

MEM-3900-512MB or 
Equal

512MB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 3925/3945 ISR, Spare or 
Equal

3.1.67

MEM-3900-1GB or Equal 1GB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 3925/3945 ISR, Spare or 
Equal

3.1.68

MEM-3900-2GB or Equal 2GB DRAM (1 DIMM) for 
Cisco 3925/3945 ISR, Spare or 
Equal

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.69

FL-SRST-25= or Equal Feat Lic Survivable Remote 
Site Telephony Up To 25 Users 
or Equal

3.1.70

FL-SRST-35= or Equal Feat Lic Survivable Remote 
Site Telephony Up To 35 Users 
or Equal

3.1.71

FL-SRST-50= or Equal Feat Lic Survivable Remote 
Site Telephony Up To 50 Users 
or Equal

3.1.72

FL-SRST-100= or Equal Feat Lic Survivable Remote 
Site Telephony Up To 100 
Users or Equal

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.73

FL-SRST-175= or Equal Feat Lic Survivable Remote 
Site Telephony Up To 175 
Users or Equal

3.1.74

FL-SRST-250= or Equal Feat Lic Survivable Remote 
Site Telephony Up To 250 
Users or Equal

3.1.75

FL-CME-SRST-5= or 
Equal

Communication Manager 
Express or SRST - 5 seat paper 
RTU or Equal

3.1.76

FL-CME-SRST-25= or 
Equal

Communication Manager 
Express or SRST - 25 seat 
paper RTU or Equal

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.77

FL-CME-SRST-100= or 
Equal

Cisco Communication Manager 
or SRST- 100 seat Paper RTU 
or Equal

3.1.78

Unified Workspace Licensing 
(CUWL)“or Equal”

Cisco Unified Workspace Licensing 
(CUWL), Standard Add-on “or 
Equal”

3.1.78.1

L-CUWL-ADDON-
STDK9

Unified Workspace Licensing - 
Top Level for STD “or Equal”

3.1.78.2

CON-ECMU-
LCUWLADD SWSS UPGRADES Unified 

Workspace Licensing - Top 
Level “or Equal”

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.78.3

L-LIC-UWL-STD-SLED

Unified Workspace Licensing 
STD, 1 User Govt/Edu “or 
Equal”

3.1.78.4

CON-ECMU-STDSLED

SWSS UPGRADES Unified 
Workspace Licensing STD, 1 
User “or Equal”

3.1.78.5

L-EXST-DEP-OVER10K

Total Deployment is Over 
10,000 users “or Equal”

3.1.78.6

L-LIC-UWL-S-SLED-C

Services Mapping SKU, Over 
10K UWL STD users “or 
Equal”

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.78.7

CON-ECMU-SSLEDC

SWSS UPGRADES Services 
Mapping SKU, Over 10K UWL 
STD “or Equal”

3.1.78.8

L-CUP-86-UWLA-PAK

Unified Presence 8.6 PAK “or 
Equal”

3.1.78.9

L-JAB9-DSK-UWL-RTU

Jabber for Desktop Right to 
Use Certificate “or Equal”

3.1.78.10

L-CUCM-UWL

Unified Communications 
Manager UWL DLU Bundle 
“or Equal”

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.78.11

L-CUCM-UWL-PAK

Unified Communications 
Manager UWL PAK “or Equal”

3.1.78.12

L-CUP-86-UWLA-USR

Unified Presence 8.6 Users “or 
Equal”

3.1.78.13

L-UNCN8-UWLA-PAK

Unity Connection 8.x Addon 
PAK for CUWL “or Equal”

3.1.78.14

L-UNITYCN8-UWL-USR

Unity Connection 8.x Users “or 
Equal”

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.78.15

L-CUP-ONPREM-OPT

Included Cisco Unified 
Presence On Premise “or 
Equal”

3.1.78.16

L-CUP-86-UWLA

Cisco Unified Presence Add-On 
8.6 for CUWL only “or Equal”

3.1.78.17

L-JAB9-DSK-UWL

Jabber for Desktop 9.x for 
CUWL Only “or Equal”

3.1.78.18

L-UNITYCN8-UWLA

Unity Connection 8.0 for 
CUWL Addon only “or Equal”

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.79
Unified Contact Center Express 
(Unified CCX)“or Equal”

Cisco Unified Contact Center 
Express (Unified CCX), Enhanced 
Add-on “or Equal”

3.1.79.1
CCX-10-ADD-K9 CCX 10.0 Add-on Licenses “or 

Equal”

3.1.79.2
CON-ECMU-CCX10AK9

(SWSS UPGRADES CCX 10.0 
Add-on Licenses “or Equal”

3.1.79.3
CCX-10-A-E-LIC CCX 10.0 ENH Seat Qty 1 

ADDON LICENSE ONLY “or 
Equal”

3.1.79.4
CON-ECMU-CCX1ELIC

SWSS UPGRADES CCX 10.0 
ENH Seat Qt “or Equal”

3.1.79.5
CCX-10-PAK CCX 10.0 autoexpanded PAK 

“or Equal”

3.1.80
Unified Contact Center Express 
(Unified CCX)“or Equal”

Cisco Unified Contact Center 
Express (Unified CCX), Premium 
Add-on “or Equal”

3.1.80.1
CCX-10-ADD-K9 CCX 10.0 Add-on Licenses “or 

Equal”

3.1.80.2
CON-ECMU-CCX10AK9

SWSS UPGRADES CCX 10.0 
Add-on Licenses “or Equal”

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            
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3.1.80.3
CCX-10-A-P-LIC CCX 10.0 PRE Seat Qty 1 

ADDON LICENSE ONLY “or 
Equal”

3.1.80.4
CON-ECMU-CCX10LIC

SWSS UPGRADES CCX 10.0 
PRE Seat Qt “or Equal”

3.1.80.5
CCX-10-PAK CCX 10.0 autoexpanded PAK 

“or Equal”

3.1.81
Plantronics HW251N or 
Equal

Supraplus Wideband Office 
Headset - Noise-cancelling 
monaural or Equal

3.1.82
Plantronics HW261N or 
Equal

Supraplus Wideband Office 
Headset - Noise-cancelling 
Binaural or Equal

3.1.83
Plantronics H41N or Equal Over-the-Ear - Noise-cancelling 

monaural or Equal

3.1.84
Plantronics H81N or Equal Three-point- support Over-the-

Ear - Noise-cancelling 
monaural or Equal

3.1.85

Plantronics 26716-01 or 
Equal

H-Series Quick Disconnect to 
Modular Cable Standard - 
Cisco Modular Headset Jack or 
Equal

Extended Cost

-$                            

-$                            

-$                            

276.05$                       

328.10$                       

302.05$                       

364.60$                       

119.65$                       
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3.1.86
Plantronics DA40 or Equal USB-to QD Adaptor or Equal

3.1.87

Plantronics CS540 
w/HL10 or Equal

Convertible wireless Headset - 
Noise-cancelling 
w/Automatic Handset Lifter or 
Equal

3.1.88
Plantronics CS540 or 
Equal

Convertible wireless Headset - 
Noise-cancelling monaural or 
Equal

3.1.89
Plantronics HL10 or Equal Automatic Handset Lifter or 

Equal

3.1.90
Plantronics CS520 or 
Equal

Over-the-head - Noise-
cancelling Binaural wireless or 
Equal

3.1.91

Jabra BIZ 2400 (2406-820-
105) or Equal

Mono, 3-in-1(Headband, 
Neckband, Earhook), Noise 
Canceling,
 STD(Standard variation 
microphone sensitivity)  or 
Equal

Extended Cost

122.30$                       

1,041.65$                    

833.35$                       

210.50$                       

911.45$                       

494.55$                       

Page 87of 90



Exhibit A
Pricing Pages

Contract Item 
Specification

Number
Part Number Description

3.1.92

Jabra BIZ 2400 (2403-820-
105) or Equal

Mono Headband, Noise 
Canceling, 
STD(Standard variation 
microphone sensitivity) or 
Equal

3.1.93

Jabra BIZ 2400 (2409-820-
105) or Equal

Duo, Noise Canceling, 
STD(Standard variation 
microphone sensitivity) or 
Equal

3.1.94
Jabra BIZ 2400 (2489-820-
105) or Equal

Duo, IP, Noise Canceling, 
Neodymium speakers or Equal

3.1.95
Jabra LINK 850 (850-09) 
or Equal

Amplifier, Advanced noise 
canceling, Connects Headset to 
PC and Phone or Equal

3.1.96
Jabra GN8050 TCA (01-
0125) or Equal

Amplifier, Connects Headset to 
PC and Phone or Equal

3.1.97

Jabra GN1200 CC (88011-
99) or Equal

Cord connects Jabra headset to 
Cisco telephone, RJ11 
connector, Quick Disconnect or 
Equal

Extended Cost

467.35$                       

521.70$                       

521.65$                       

326.00$                       

364.10$                       

79.65$                         
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3.1.98

Jabra GN1200 (88001-99) 
or Equal

Cord connects Jabra headset to 
Cisco telephone, Microphone 
amplification,
 RJ11 connector, Quick 
Disconnect or Equal

3.1.99

Jabra PRO 9450 Flex 
(9450-65-707-105) or 
Equal

Monaural, Noise-cancelling, 
Wireless, Desk and Softphone, 
Connects via USB or Equal

3.1.100

Jabra PRO 9450 Duo 
(9450-69-707-105) or 
Equal

Duo, Noise-cancelling, 
Wireless, Desk and Softphone, 
Connects via USB or Equal

3.1.101

Jabra PRO 9460 Mono 
(9460-65-707-105) or 
Equal

Monaural, 2.4" touch screen 
display, Noise-cancelling, 
Wireless, Desk and Softphone,  
Connects via USB or Equal

3.1.102

Jabra PRO 9460 Duo 
(9460-69-707-105) or 
Equal

Duo, 2.4" touch screen display, 
Noise-cancelling, Wireless, 
Desk and Softphone,
 Connects via USB or Equal

Extended Cost

79.65$                         

945.60$                       

1,021.65$                    

1,059.75$                    

1,086.95$                    
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3.1.103

Jabra PRO 9465 Duo 
(9465-69-804-105) or 
Equal

Duo,  Triple connectivity, 
Sound enhancing, 2.4" touch 
screen display,
 Noise-cancelling,  Wireless, 
Desk and Softphone, Connects 
via USB or Equal

3.1.104

Jabra PRO 9470 Mono 
(9470-66-904-105) or 
Equal

Monaural,  Triple connectivity, 
Sound enhancing, 2.4" touch 
screen display,
 Noise-cancelling,  Wireless, 
Desk and Softphone, Connects 
via USB or Equal

3.1.105

Jabra LINK 14201-22 
(14201-22) or Equal

Cisco EHS 3 foot Adapter for 
Jabra wireless headsets and 
Cisco Unified IP phones or 
Equal

Extended Cost

1,195.65$                    

1,141.30$                    

105.75$                       

13,921.00$                  
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