::;;rﬁsin# Di:ris«;_r:t ot East State of West Virginia
ashington oftra as H
N Doct Offios B e o190 Request for Quotation

b, §| Charleston, WV 25305.0130 -

Proc Folder: 81407

Doc Description: STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - MATERIAL & PICKUP BY WVDOH
Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Date Issued Sollcitation Closes | Solicitation No Version

2015-03-10 2015-04-01 CRFQ 0803 DOT1500000072 1
13:30:00

40 RECENING LOCATION

BID CLERK

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON STE

CHARLESTON wv 25305
us

VENDOR
Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number:

C£N‘|’faL %PP’Y CO. a’c W\/
49213 Benvedum Road

Bridge port, WV o330 P;.# Z04-592-SE 77

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Crystal Rink

{304) 568-2402

crystal.g.rink@wv.gov

Signature X ﬁﬂw ,OM rene 5S50402.9]| pate D3~2.4 -201S

All offers subject to all termié anc{?bnditions contained in this solicitation

Page: 1 FORM ID : WV-PRC-CRFQ-001




INVODICE TO SHIP TO
ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA _ o
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City Wv99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty ) Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - 0.00000 TON
MATERIAL & PICKUP BY WVDOH
Comm Gode Manufacturer Specification 7 Model #
11111600 '
Extended Description :

STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - MATERIAL & PICKUP BY WVDOH

Page: 2



INFORMATION ATTACHMENT
Vendor’s Storage Sites
2015 Spring and Summer - Materials and Pickup by WVDOH ONLY

VENDOR NAME __ Central Supply Co Of WV

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.
A Vendor may submit more than one Vendor's Storage Sites information on one Information Attachment form
ONLY if bid pricing is the SAME for all Storage Sites and all WVDOH locations bid. A separate bid submission
and Information Attachment form MUST be submitted when bid price varies between Vendor's Storage Sites.

Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel, Sand, Blast Furnance Slag and Steel Slag

a) SOURCE OF MATERIAL (all sources for which bid prices apply (e.g., Quarry location if Sandstone
or Limestone; dredging or pit location if Gravel; production plant name and location if Slag)

Kelly Mountain Quarry

Rt. 33 Kelly Mountain Road, Elkins, WV 26241

b) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S): A separate bid schedule
must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.

Linn Stone Yard

County Highway 47 West, Linn, WV 26384

Cinders

¢) SOURCE OF MATERIAL: Name and Location of plant which produces Cinder material.

d) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S) A separate bid schedule
must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.




Pricing Page

VENDOR NAME Central Supply Co Of WV

Material and pick up by the WVDOH forces from the Vendor's Storage Site, ONLY.

Bid Price per Ton Items A-W and AA

F.O.B. Vendor's Storage Site
Limestone,
Contract Sandstone, | Blast Furnace
Item Description of Material Gravel, Sand Slag Steel Slag
A Class 1 Aggregate 23.25
B Class 2 Aggregate 23.25
C Class 10 Aggregate 22.75
D AASHTO #1 Aggregate 23.45
E AASHTO #3 Aggregate 23.45
F AASHTO #4 Aggregate 23.70
G AASHTO #467 Aggregate no bid
H AASHTO #57 Aggregate 24.50
I AASHTO #67 Aggregate no bid
J AASHTO #7 Aggregate no bid
K AASHTO #8 Aggregate 23.75
L AASHTO #9 Aggregate 28.00
M Stone for Gabions 24.00
N Fine Aggregate 24.00
OA |Limestone Standard Abrasives 24.00
OB  |Sandstone Standard Abrasives no bid
PA  jLimestone Modified Abrasives 28.00
PB  [Sandstone Modified Abrasives no bid
Q Rip Rap no bid
R Shot Rock 23.45
S AASHTO #8 Modified no bid
T AASHTO #9 Modified no bid
U Pea Gravel no bid
v #11 Limestone Abrasives no bid
W Quarry Waste 19.95
AA  [Cinders | |

no bid




DOT1500000072

Document Phase

Final

Document Description
STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - MA
TERIAL & PICKUP BY WWDOH

Page 3
of 3

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions




CERTIFICATIONAND SIGNATURE PAGE ,

By signing below, or submitting documentation through wvOASIS, 1 certify that I have reviewed
this Solicitation in its entirety; understand the requirements, terms and conditions, and other
information contained herein; that I am submitting this bid, offer or proposal for review and
consideration; that I am authorized by the vendor to execute and submit this bid, offer, or
proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor’s behalf: that I am authorized to bind the
vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, the vendor has
properly registered with any State agency that may require registration.

Centval su#gf Co. of WV

(w Q/w"% - Brady Lowther  Salo Mo,

(Authorized $gnature) (Representative Name, Title)

04-592-5577 [ t-592- e db 0% -2 -201S

{(Phone Number) (Fax Number) (Date)

Revised 02/27/2015



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: CRFQ DOT1500000072

Instructions:  Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: 1 hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the

necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

m Addendum No. | [ ] AddendumNo.6
Addendum No. 2 D] Addendum No. 7
[ ] Addendum No. 3 { ] Addendum No. 8
{ ] Addendum No.4 [ ] AddendumNo.9
[ ] AddendumNo.s [} Addendum No. 10

I understand that faiture to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid.
I further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only
the information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is
binding.

Centval Supply (o, of WV

T ,

Company M

Authorized Sighature
03~ 24- 2015

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite
document processing.

Revised 02/27/2015



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Stone, Aggregate and Cinders — Materials and Pickup by Agency ONLY

94  Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contract, Vendor must
“designate and maintain a primary contract manager responsible for overseeing
Vendor’s responsibilities under this Contract. The Contract manager must be
available during normal business hours to address any customer service or other
issues related to this Contract. Vendor should list its Contract manager and his or
her contact information below.

Contract Manager: Sleve Rogens

Telephone Numbers: _ %04 - 202 -721%

Fax Number: _ 3%4-592- SS4b

Email Address: sk fogcrs (= CEn"-fa_I Sufgp_l 7 wVv, oM

Revised 10/27/2014



Pourchasing Divison State of West Virginia

“Bh| 2019 washington Street East
5 YU Post Office Erve 50150 Request for Quotation

b2 f| Charlaston, WV 25305-0130 -

Proc Folder: 81407
Doc Description: ADDENDUM 1 STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - PICKUP BY WVDOH
Prac Type: Central Master Agreement

Date [seued Soligitation Closes | Sollcitation No Vefsion
2015-03-26 2015-04-01 CRFQ 0803 DOT1500000072 2
13:30:00

L ey

BiE CLERK

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON ST E

CHARLESTON www 25305
us

R .

Vendor Name, Adll d felephon ub:
LEniral 5».”:!7 Co of WV
L}Qq__} B’CM.'-Dﬁm Drive
Beitgeport, WV 4230 ph# 204 925877

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Crystal Rink

{304) 558-2402

crystal.g.rink@wv.gov

rene 55204029 1/ pate D3~ B0 2215

tions contained In this salicitation

Page: 1 FORM ID : WV-PRC-CRFQ-001



ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARICUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City W\99949 No City WV 99939
uUs us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qiy Unlt Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - 0.00000 TON
MATERIAL & PICKUP BY WVDCH
Comm Code lifanufacturer Specification Modal #
11111800
Extended Description :

STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - MATERIAL & PICKUP BY WVDOH

Page: 2



DOT1S00000072

Document Phase
Finat

Document Description
ADDENDOUM 1 STONE, AGGREGATE. C
INDERS - PIGKUP BY WWDOH

Page 3
of3

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions




SOLICITATION NUMBER: CRFQ DOT1500000072
Addendum Number: 1

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identi fied as
{“Solicitation™) to reflect the change(s} identified and described below.

Applicable Addendum Category:
| ] Modify bid opening date and time
[ | Modify specifications of product or service being sought
[¢'i Attachment of vendor questions and responses
[ [ Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet
[¢'1 Cormection of error

| | Other

Descripiion of Modification to Solicitation:
TO ANSBWER VENDOR QUESTIONS

TO PROVIDE PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT AND VENDOR PREFERENCE

Additional Docamentation: Documentation related o this Addendum (if any) has been
included herewith as Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference.

Terms and Conditions:

1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in
full force and effect.

2. Vendor should acknowledge receipt of al addenda issued for this Solicitation by
completing an Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith.
Failure 10 acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. The addendum
acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

Rovised 6/372012



ATTACHMENT A

Revised 6/8/2012



CRFQ DOT1500000072
Question 1:

I wanted to question and verify the quadrupiing of the genaral liabllity insurance reguirement
that was listed for the April 1 aggregate bid for DOH. Is this correct? If so, please give an
explanation. This requirement is going to make already high insurance premiums go up even
more and may lead fo a cease in our operations aitogether leaving some DOH's at a
disadvantage for their work on county roads. | feel sure that this 400% increase in insurance
coverage is going to cause great difficulty for us and | would think most small businesses in
rural areas in trying to make a living and helping our communities as well. Could you please
verify if this is a misprint and if so | am requesting that you please ravert to original insurance
requirement for the upcoming bid opening April 1st. | look forward to your response in this
matier.

Response 1.

Per WWDOH, Legal Division, $1,000,000.00 shall remain on all Maintenance Division master
agreements.



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM

SOLICITATION NO.; DOT1500000072

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form, Check the hox next to.each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledpe addenda may result in bid disqualification,

Acknowledgment: 1 hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, efc.

Addendum Numbers Received:

(Check the box next to each addendum received)

0] Addendum No. 1 [ ] Addendum No.6
[ 1 Addendum No.2 [ ] Addendum No.7
[ 1 Addendum No.3 [ 1 Addendum No. 8
[ ] Addendum No. 4 [ 1 Addendum No.9
[ 1 Addendum No. 5 { 1 Addendum No. 1§

T understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid, 1
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

Ledral Supply Co. of W/
Company !
lroed, ) Loib
Jautildrized Signature

8Z-30- TolS
Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.
Revised S/ER012



Purchasing Divison State of West Virginia

=% | 2019 Washi: Street East -
ek mﬁ";ﬁ'gﬂ‘ N Request for Quotation

| Charleston, WV 26308-0r130 -

Prec Folder: 81407
Deoc Description: ADDENDUM NO. 2-EXTEND BID OPENING-STONE PICKUP BY DCH
Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Data Issued Soficitation Closes | Solicitation No Veorsion
2015-04-01 2015-04-09 CRFQ CBD3 DOT1500000072 3
13:30:00

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2018 WASHINGTON STE

CHARLESTON wv 25305

us

Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number:
CeEntral ﬁtpﬂfy Co of W\
Hg13 Eﬁ':‘lﬁp{um Drive

ﬁn‘djcford} wv 25130

04/0%/15 11:88:‘:”_:6’ _
Wi Purchasing Divizion

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Crystal Rink
(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.rink@wv.gov
P |
Signature X A . FEIN # 550‘1L02—?[} DATE 54'791_25’!3’

All offers subjet to all tonn(jlnuﬁdndiﬁons contalned in this solicitalion

Page: 1 FORM (D : WW-PRC-CRFQ-001



ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE QF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City W/ 55559 No City Wy 99899
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Oty Unit lasue Unit Price Tetal Price
1 STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS -  {.00000 TON
MATERIAL & PICKUP BY WVDOH
Comm Code Manufacturer Spacification Model #
11111600

Extended Description :
ADDENDUM NQ. 2 - YO EXTEND THE BiD OPENING FROM 04/01/2015 TO 04/08/2015 AT 1:30 PM. SEE ATTACHED PAGES.

STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - MATERIAL & PICKLIP BY WVDOH

Page: 2



Document Phase Dacument Description Page 3
DOT1600000072 Flnal ADDENDUM NO. 2-EXTEND BID OPEN of3
ING-STONE FICKUP BY DOH

ADDITIONAL: TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions




SOLICITATION NUMBER: CRFQ — DOT1500000072
Addendum Number: 2

The purpose of this addendum is to medify the solicitation identified as CRFQ - DOT1500000072
("Solicitation™) to reflect the change(s) identified and described below,

Applicable Addendum Category:

[X] Modify bid opening date and time

[ 1 Modify specifications of product or service being sought
[ 1 Attachment of vendor questions and responses

[ 1 Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet

{ 1 Correction of error

[ 1 Other

Description of Modification to Solicitation:

L. The bid opening has moved from 04/01/2015 to 04/09/2015 at 1:30 pm.

Additional Documentetion: Documentation related to this Addendnm (if any) has been included herewith as
Aitachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference.

Terms and Conditions:
1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified hesein shall remain in full force and
effect.

2, Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by comgpleting an
Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith, Failure to acknowiedge addenda
may result in bid disqualification. The addendum acknowledgement should be submitied with the bid to
expedite document processing.



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.;: CRFQ — DOT1500000072

Instructions: Please scknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, ete,

Addendum Nambers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[\l Addendum No. 1 [ ] AddendumNo.6
P Addendum No. 2 [ ] AddendumNo.7
[ ] AddendumNo.3 [ 1 Addendum No.8
{ ] Addendum No.4 [ ] Addendum No.9
[ 1 AddendumNo.5 [ ] Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confinn the receipt of addenda may be canse for rejection of this bid, I
further understand that that any verbal representation made or assumed 1o be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

&ML/J gm?ﬁ/w @ AL w\/
Cempary

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.



[ i AV [ B M- W P /2 o 2F A [ &—

Rev. 04114 State of West Virginia
VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Cartification and application® is hereby made for Praferonce in agcordance with West Virginla Code, §5A-3-37. (Does notapply o
construction coniracts). West Vinginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualliying vendors o request (atthe fime of bid)

1. Appilication is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder Is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously In West Virginia for four (4} years Immediately preced-
ing the daie of this ceriification; or,

—.  Bidderis a paririership, aseociation or corporation resident vendor and hes maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business continuously In West Virginia for four {4) years immediately preceding the date of this oerfification: or 80% of the
ownership inlerest of Bidderis held by another Individual, partnership, assotiation or corporation resident vendor who has
maintained s headguarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four {4) years immediately
preceding the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a norwesident vendor which has an afffiate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained ite headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginta cuntinuously for the four {4}
years immediately preceding the date of this cerification; or,

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the raason checked:

Bidder is a vesident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being hid are residents of West Virginia who have resided inthe state continuously for the two years
tmmediataly preceding submission of this bid; or,

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

——  Bidder s a nonresident vendar employing a minlmum of one hundred state residents or iz 2 nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains it headouarters or principal place of business within Wast Virginia employing 2
minimurn of one hundred state resicents who cerfifies ihat, during the life of the contract, an average at least 75% of the
amployeas or Bidder's affiltie’s or subsidiary’s employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the siate
continuously for the two years immediately preceding submigsion of this bid; or,

Application Is made for 5% vendor preferchee for the reason checked:
__>_< Bidder mests either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and {2) or subdivision (1) and {3) as staled above; or,

5. Appiication Is made for 3,5% vendor preference who is a veterarn for the reason chacked:
Biddier Is anindividual residestvendor who is a veteran of the United States ammed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,
6, ApplicatlonIanwdafor&&%vendorpmferenuawhoisavetemiorﬂmreasonehaclaad:

Bidderisa residem_vandor who l:_i aveteran of the United States amed forcas, the reserves or the National Guard, if, far

P

L

Ld

7. Application Is made for preference as a noh-resident small, women- and minority-owned busine=s, in aceor
dance with Wes? Virginia Code§5A-3-50 and West Virginie Code of Siaie Rules.

Bidder hasbeen orexpecis ko beappmvedpriortooommawardby&u Purchasing Division as a certitied small, women-
and winarity-owned business.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that 2 Bidder recaiving preference has falled 1o continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Sscretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a} reject the bid; or (b) assessa penally
against such Bidder in anamount not (o excead 5% of the bid amount and that such penaity will be paid to the contracting agency
or deducted from any unpald batance on the contract or ptrchase arder,

By submission of this cettificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any réasonably requested informalion o the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Departmant of Revenve 1o disclose tothe Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
e required business taxes, provided tha such infarmation does not contain the amouris of taxes paid nor any other information
desmed by the Tax Cormmissioner to be contidential.

Under penalty offaw for false sweating (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate In all respects; and that if a contract is Issuad 1o Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate
changes during the term of the contract, Bldder will nofify the Purchasing Diviglonin w Immexilalely.

Bidder: (’MJS« lu (o & Signed:
e S ' %ﬂ

Date: Dg' 7 20|




RFQ No, DOT15008C0072

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

EXCEPTION: The prohibltion listed sbove does not apply whare & vendar has contested any tax adminisiered pursuant to

chapler eleven of the W. Va. Code, workars'
the maller has ol become finet or where the vender has entered inle 2 payment plan o agreement and the vendor is not

DEFIITIONS:

"Cakt” means any assesement, premium, penaity, fine. tax or offher smount of morsay owed to the stete or any of its
polificai subdivisions becauss of & judgmant, fine, permit ‘viclalion, fosnse mvscessment, dofaulled workers'
compansation pramium, anzity of othor assessment precently cstinguent or dud aisel required 1o be pald ta.the state
or any of its political subdivisions, including any interegl or additional penolties sotrued theraon.

“Emptayer defeul” means having an outstending batence or liability to the old fund <ar to the uninsured “mployors'
fund or baing in policy dafault, as defined in W. Va. Cods § 23-2¢-2, tailure to melnisicy mandatory workers'
compensation coversge, o failire 1o fuly meet ils obligations es & workers' compensaation selftnsured amployer. An
kamwmummmsmamwmm fh2 Insuance Commissioner
ani romaing in compllancs vsith the obligations undar the repayment agreament.

“Retated party’ means & party. whetfsr an indvidusl, corporotion, patnershi, ass ocietion, imited abily company
w-anymm-«hu&mm-ofﬂhormﬁly whatsoever, rolzied to @any vendor by blood, mnrﬁat?;.
£ A ' 8 ndor so that

conteacd amount.
ACFIREIATION: By sioning this form, tha vendor's authorized signor cffirma und soknowtedyes under penalty of
low for {ates suaaring (17, Va Code §61-5.3) that nelther vondor nor cny relefst putty owe a dobt as defined
dbove and thal solthor vondor ner any related party are in omployer dofeult as dofincd ehova, uninss the debt or

omployar defouit is peraditod under the aiception abova,
YWITHESS THE FOLLOVANG SIGHATURE:

Vendor's Mants: C&WAL SUIP'pl\?l (0 0'£ W\/
Authcrtzed Signetire: ) ofvnz&,

Daie: 03~ Z4-22015”

State of \Ncﬁ\)\«g\n‘m

Ooum_yo( HC‘AV\/‘\'SBV\ . lo-wit:

Token, aubscﬂbad.mdmmhbeforsmemhﬁr:\layof Mavuin L 20]5.

My Cammissior: exgiras_) wng  [O. ,2023

NOTARY PUALIC \/\)M G o Mo

P ARYdav? (Fovisad 07/01/2012)

AFFIX EEAL HERE

RR2Box 2112 dmolew wyzess  BY €dor and Motars's date must be the same, ‘
My Commeaton Expires e 10,2023 Wotary requized te AFFIX SEAL on Purchissing Affduvice.




