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The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wvOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West
Virginia’s procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor
responses to this solicitation submitted to the
Purchasing Division in hard copy format.
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Procurement Folder: 81324
Procurement Type: Central Master Agreement
Vendor ID: 000000200633 3]
Legal Name: CENTRAL SUPPLY CO OF WV
Alias/DBA:

Total Bid: $0.00

Response Date: (3/24/2015

Response Time: 11:04

SO Doc Code: CRFQ
SO Dept: 0803
SO Doc ID: DOT1500000071
Published Date: 4/7/15
Close Date: 4/9/15
Close Time: 13:30
Status: Closed

Solicitation Description: ADDENDUM #3 AGGREGATE,
CINDERS - DEL. BY VNDR NON-

Total of Header Attachments: 0
Total of All Attachments: 0
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Purchasing Division

Post Office Box 50130

2019 Washington Street East

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State Of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder : 81324

Solicitation Description : ADDENDUM #3 AGGREGATE, CINDERS - DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST
Proc Type : Central Master Agreement

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2015-04-09 SR 0803 ESR03241500000002717 1
13:30:00
VENDOR
000000200683
CENTRAL SUPPLY CO OF WV
FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Crystal Rink
(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.rink@wv.gov
Signature X FEIN # DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Page :

1

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - 0.00000 TON $0.00
MAT.& DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Extended Description : [STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - MAT.& DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST LOC.

Page: 2



7%, | Purchasing Divison
% | 2019 Washington Street East
b Post Office Box 50130
7| Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Request for Quotation

Proc Faider: 81324

... Doc Description: STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - MAT.& DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST Loc.

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement
Date Issved Soilcltation Closes | Solicltatlon No Version
2015-03-10 2015-04-01 CRFGQ 0803 DOT1500000071 1
13:30:00

BID CLERK

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON ST E

CHARLESTON Wy

Us

25305

Vendar Name, Address and Telephone Number:

Centbral Supply Co. of w\/
H925 Beve D«erl
Bridaeport, wy/

26230

ph# 04-592.-55 777

FOR INFORMATION GONTACT THE BUYER

Crystal Rink
{304) 558-2402
crystal.g.rink@wv.gov

Slgnature X

FEIN #

5504019()

pate 0%~ 24 2018

All offers subject to all terms ld cofyitions contained In this salicitation

Page :

1

FORM ID : WW-PRC-CRFQ-001



ALL STATE AGENCIES ) STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA :
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED.BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER-
No City e WVGOGD No City WV 99999
us Us
L _
| Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unlt issue Unit Price Total Price
1. STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - 0.00000 TON
MAT.& DEL, BY VNDR NON-EST
Comm Cods Manufacturer - ~ Speclfication Model #
11111600 '

Extended Description :
STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - MAT.& DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST LOC.

Page : 2



DOT1500000074

Document Phase
Final

Document Description
STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - MA T.&
DEL. BY VNDR NONESTLOC.

Page 3
of3

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions




CERTIFICATIONAND SIGNATURE PAGE :

By signing below, or submitting documentation through wvOASIS, I certify that T have reviewed
-.this Solicitation in its entirety; understand the requirements, terms and conditions, and other
information contained herein; that I am submitting this bid, offer or proposal for review and
consideration; that I am authorized by the vendor to execute and submit this bid, offer, or
proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor’s behalf; that I am authorized to bind the
vendor in a contractual. relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, the vendor has
properly registered with any State agency that may require regisiration.

CEMHJ Su.pplq (o oF V\/\/

(Company) o

Phwdy [frts, - Brady Lowbher | Gule Moy

(Authorized Sanature) (Representative Name, Title)

204-591-5571) | By -€94- 554y, 0% 142015

{Phone Number) (Fax Numbef) (Date)

Revised 02/27/2015

e
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ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: CRFQ DOT1500000071

Instructions:  Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the bex next to each addendum received)

{ ] Addendum No. 1 [ ) Addendum No. 6
[ ) Addendum No. 2 { ] Addendum No.7
[} Addendum No.3 [ ] Addendum No. 8
[ ] Addendum No. 4 [ ] Addendum No. 9
D Addendum. No. § D] Addendum No, 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid.
I further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only
the information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is

binding.

CEnﬂmp 34?]?!_-1 (o o WV

| Compa%/“jf/w M V

Authorized Signature

D514 ws

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite
document processing.

Revised 02/27/2015

T



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Stone, Aggregate and Cinders

Materials and Delivery by the Vendor to Non-Established WVDOH Sites

9.3

9.4

Vendor certifies that it can supply the Contract Jtems contained in its bid
response.

Reports: Vendor shall provide quarterly reports and annual summaries to the
Agency showing the Agency’s items purchased, quantities of items purchased and
total dollar value of the items purchased. Vendor shall also provide reports, upon
request, showing the items purchased during the term of this Contract, the
quantity purchased for each of those items and the total value of purchases for
each of those items. Failure to supply such reports may be grounds for
cancellation of this contract.

Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contract, Vendor must
designate and maintain a primary contract manager responsible for overseeing
Vendor’s responsibilities under this Contract. The Contract Manager must be
available during normal business hours to address any customer service or other
issues related to this Contract. Vendor should list its Contract Manager and his or

her contact information below.

Contract Manager: Sleve Rogecs
Telephone Number: __%04~- 203 - 72.1%
304-59L- 554,

Fax Number: o
Email Address: sv_rog]gré @ ceptral igﬁg!\?t wV, (o)

Revised 10/27/2014



RFQ No. DOT1500000071

STATE QF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

MANDATE: Under W. Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any.contract may be awarded by the state or any
of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a refated party
to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debl awed is an amount greater than one thousand dollacs in

the aggregate; or (2) the debtor is in employer default.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above does naot apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to
chapter eleven of the W. Va. Code, workers' compensation premium, permit-fee or environmental fee or assessment and
the-matter-has-nat become final-or- where the vendor has-entered into a payment-plan or-agreement-and-the vendor is-not—

in defaulf of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premiurn, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed o the state or any of its
political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit viotation, license assessment, defaulted workers'
compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state
or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

“Employer default” means having an oulstanding bafance or liability to the old fund or to the uninsured employers'

fund or being in policy default, as defined in W. Via, Code § 23-2¢-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers'
compensation coverage, o failure o fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An

employer is not in employer default if it hias entered Into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Commissioner
and remaing in compliance with the obligatlons under the repayment agreement. .

“Related party" means 2 party, whether an individual, carporation, parinership, assaclation, limited liability company
or any other form or business association or other enlity whatsoever, related fo any vendor by blood, marriage,
ownership or contract through which the party has a relaffonship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that

the parly will actually or by effect receive or confrol a pertion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from
performance of a vendor coniract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five peicent of the tolal

contract amount.

. AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor's authorized sigher affirms and acknowledges under penalty of
taw for false swearing (W. Va. Code §61.5-3) that nelther vendor nor any related: party awe a debt as defined
above and that nelther vendor nor any related party are in employer default as defined above, unless the debf or

employer default is permitted under the exception above.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:

Vendor's Name: CEM{'Y’WQ %pﬁ]u C0 Opw\/

LIS -y .
Authorized Signature: Wa ' M Date: O 3’7,-4 - 2—0] 5

State of \_Dbs’r \H%mic\

Countyai. \—\cw’i 30~ , to-wit:
¥
Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this ﬁ day of Mo ,201S.
My Commission expires __~J wnt  \0 2025
NOTARY PUBLIC k}b wdM GTR dnetts

AFFIX SEAL HERE

g Affidavit (Revised 0741/2012)

{ NoTE:

) m”ﬁﬂ;ﬂ}:‘” § Vendor and Notary’s date must be the same.
f rR2Box2it 2, smetow w2 [ Notary required to AFFIX SEAL on Pur-chasing Affidavit,

My Conminsion Expires Juna 10,2023 B




INFORMATION ATTACHMENT
Vendor’s Storage Sites
2015 Spring and Summer - Materials and Delivery by Vendor to Non-Established WVDOH Sites

VENDOR NAME __ Cental Supply Co of WV

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.
A Vendor may submit more than one Vendor’s Storage Sites information on one Information Attachment form
ONLY if bid pricing is the SAME for all Storage Sites and all WVYDOH locations bid. A separate bid submission

and Information Attachment form MUST be submitted when bid price varies between Vendor's Storage Sites.

Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel, Sand, Blast Furnance Slag and Steel Slag

a) SOURCE OF MATERIAL (all sources for which bid prices apply (e.g., Quarry location if Sandstone
or Limestone; dredging or pit location if Gravel; production plant name and location if Slag)

Kelly Mountain Quarry

Rt. 33 Kelly Mountain Road, Elkins, WV 26241

b) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S): A separate bid schedule
must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.

Linn Stone Yard

County Highway 47 West, Linn, WV 26384

Cinders

¢) SOURCE OF MATERIAL: Name and Location of plant which produces Cinder material.

d) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S) A separate bid schedule
must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.




Pricing Page

VENDOR NAME Central Supply Co. Of WV

Material and delivery by the Vendor to Non-Established WVDOH locations, ONLY.

Bid Price per Ton Items A-W and AA
F.O.B. Vendor's Storage Site
Limestone,
Contract Sandstone, | Blast Furnace
Item Description of Material Gravel, Sand Slag Steel Slag
A Class 1 Aggregate 23.25
B Class 2 Aggregate 23.25
C Class 10 Aggregate 22.75
D AASHTO #1 Aggregate 23.45
E AASHTO #3 Aggregate 23.45
F AASHTO #4 Aggregate 23.70
G AASHTO #467 Aggregate no bid
H AASHTO #57 Aggregate 24.50
I AASHTO #67 Aggregate no bid
J AASHTO #7 Aggregate no bid
K AASHTO #8 Aggregate 23.75
L AASHTO #9 Aggregate 28.00
M Stone for Gabions 24.00
N Fine Aggregate 24.00
OA |Limestone Standard Abrasives 24.00
OB [Sandstone Standard Abrasives no bid
PA Limestone Modified Abrasives 28.00
PB Sandstone Modified Abrasives no bid
Q Rip Rap no bid
R Shot Rock 23.45
S AASHTO #8 Modified no bid
T AASHTO #9 Modified no bid
U Pea Gravel no bid
\ #11 Limestone Abrasives no bid
W Quarry Waste 19.95
AA [Cinders | nobid
X Haul by Vendor - First Ton-Mile 2.00
Y Haul by Vendor - Additional Ton-Mile 0.20




gg:glﬁsinhg Dlt\gsogk East State of West Virginia
ashington Street Eas :
Post Office Box 50130 Request for Quotation

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 =

Proc Folder: 81324

Doc Description: ADDENDUM 1 AGGREGATE, CINDERS - DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST
Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Date Issued Solicitatlon Closes | Solicltatlon No Version
2015-03-28 2015-04-01 CRFQ 0803 DOT1500000671 2
13:30:00

BID CLERK
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON STE

CHARLESTON Wv 25305
us

CEvtral éu)op/nf lo. of W/
Y923 Benedum Drive

Bridgepart, wV 245230 pht 304-$92-5577

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Crystal Rink

(304) 558-2402

crystal.g.rink@wv,gov

Signatute X glﬁf{/;( /Q(—lnga rENg 5504072.91] patve £2-30-2015

All offers subject to all ternis and fyﬂitn’bﬁs contained in this solicltation

Page: 1 FORM 1D : WW-PRC-CRFQ-001



ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED B8Y ORDER

No ity WV99999

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARICUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED 8Y ORDER

No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit lssue Unit Price Total Price
1 STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - 0.06000 TON
MAT.& DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST
Comm Cade Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Estended Description ;

STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - MAT.& DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST LOC.

Page: 2




DOT1500000074

Document Phase
Draft

Document Description

ADDENDUM 1 AGGREGATE, CINDERS -
DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST

Page 3
of 3

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions




SOLICITATION NUMBER: CRFQ DOT1500000071
Addendum Number: 1

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as
(“Solicitation”) to reflect the change(s) identified and described below.

Applicable Addendum Category:
| 1 Modify bid opening date and time
[ | Modify specifications of product or service being sought
[ 1 Attachment of vendor questions and responses
[ | Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet
[¢'] Correction of error

[ ] Other

Description of Modification to Solicitation:
TO ANSWER VENDOR QUESTIONS

TO PROVIDE PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT AND VENDOR PREFERENCE
TO ATTACH CORRECTED PRICING SHEET

Additional Documentation: Documentation related to this Addendum (if any) has been
included herewith as Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference.

Terms and Conditions:

1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in
full force and effect.

2. Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by
completing an Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. The addendum
acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

Revised 6/8/2012



ATTACHMENT A

Revised 67852012



CRFQ DOT1500000071
Question 1:

| wanted to question and verify the quadrupling of the general liability insurance requirement
that was listed for the April 1 aggregate bid for DOH. s this correct? if 50, please give an
explanation. This requirement is going to make already high insurance premiums go up even
more and may lead to a cease in our operations altogether leaving some DOH's at a
disadvantage for their work on county roads. | feel sure that this 400% increase in insurance
coverage is going to cause great difficulty for us and ! would think most small businesses in
rural areas in trying to make a living and helping our communities as well. Could you please
verify if this is a misprint and if so | am requesting that you please revert to original insurance
requirement for the upcoming bid opening April 1st. [ look forward to your response in this
matter.

Response 1;

Per WVYDOH, Legal Divisien, $1,000,000.00 shall remain on all Maintenance Division master
agreements.

Question 2:

tam looking over the new bid forms for aggregates and noticed on this one that has the Haul by Vendor
items that there is not a separate item for hauling items Q and R. There needs to be a separate hauling
item for shot rock and riprap due to the type of trucks needed to haul large rock such as this. Haufing
this size rock can only be done on a heavier steel bed truck

Response 2:

Vendor is correct; adjustment to the pricing page will be made



Rev. 04/14 State of West Virginia
VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application” is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. {Does not apply to
construction contracts). West Virginla Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only 1o the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This cerificate for application is to be used 10 request such preference. The Purchasing
DCivision will make the determination of the Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this ceriificafion; or,

Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headguarters or principal glace of
busingss continuously in West Virginia for four {4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has
maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4} years immediately
preceding the date of this certitication; or,

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

2. Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the gontract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residenis or is a nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimurm of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, an average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiiate’s or subsidiary’s employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuousty for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

4. Application is made for 5% vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision {1} and {3} as stated above; or,

5. Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is anindividual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the Nationa] Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding 1he date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

6. Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who Is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of praducing or distributing the commedities or completing the project which is the sulsject of the vendor's bid and
continuously over the antire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

7. Application is made for preference as a non-resident small, women- and minority-owned business, in accor-
dance with West Virginia Code §5A-3-59 and West Virginia Code of State Rules.

Bidder has been or expects to be approved prior to contract award by the Purchasing Division as a cerlified small, women-
and minortly-owned business.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder recgiving preference has failed 1o continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid, or (b) assess a penalty
against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the hid amount and that such penaity will be paid to the contracting agency
or deducted frem any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

e

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees fo disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Birector of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bldder and if anything contained within this certificate

changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notity the Purchasing Division in \Mdiately.
Bidder: CEndral 5uPp)u lodf w\/ Signed: %ﬂ%@ Q f

Date:__ ()3~ %0~ wrlg Tile:  Sales /gﬂn({eﬁe/'




RFQNo. 080%™ DOT 1SpoorooT|

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

MANBATE: Under W, Va. Gode §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any
of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party
fo the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dolfars in
the aggregate; or (2) the debtlor is in employer default.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to
chapter eleven of the W. Va, Code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and
the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not
in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agresment.

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessmeant, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its
poiitical subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers'
compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently definquent or due and required 1o be paid to the state
or any of its poiitical subdivisions, including any interest or additional penaities accrued thereon.

“Employer default” means having an cutstanding balance or liability to the ofd fund or to the uninsured employers'
fund or being in policy default, as defined in W. Va. Code § 23-2¢-2, failure lo maintain mandatory workers'
compensation coverage, or failure to fully meet its abligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An
employer is not in employer default if it has entered into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Gommissioner
and remains in compliance with the obligations under the repayment agreement.

"Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company
or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, refated to any vendor by blood, marriage,
ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that
the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from
performance of a vendor contract with the party recejving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total
contract amount,

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor's authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penalty of
taw for false swearing (W, Va. Code §61-5-3) that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined
above and that neither vendor nor any related party are in employer default as defined above, unless the debt or
employer default is permitted under the exception abova,

WITHNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:
Vender's Name: CEN"’"’G-O SM(P'DII?' (o A‘ﬁ Wy
Authorized Signature: _&Ma ,}\ Date: _ 8%-30-201S

7

State of \JQQ.H" \ \'3 16,

County of Howvrvison , to-wit:
n
Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this o0 day of _ Mewcdn , 2015
My Commission expires June 10 , 2023,
AFFIX SEAL HERE NOTARY PUBLIC bbw M G RodherAy

. . ) . - urchasing Affidavit {Revised 07/01/2012)
S EIT%, NOTARY PUBLIC OFFICIAL SEAL
At o State of West Virginia
.\ Py Wendy G. Richunis
"7 RR2Box 211 Z, Jano Low WV 26378
My Compiagion Expiras June 10, 2023




ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NQ.: DOT1500000071

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below,
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: [ hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[ ] Addendum No. 1 [ 1 Addendum No.é6
[ ] Addendum No.2 [ 1 Addendum No.7
[ ] Addendum No, 3 [ ] Addendum No. 3§
[ ] Addendum No. 4 [ '] Addendum No. 9
[ 1 Addendum No. 35 { 1 Addendum No. 10

[ understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. 1
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held betwecn Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding,

Leal. Supply Go of WV

Com;;any !
i 0 Aﬁ{hoﬁzed Signature
J3 30~ 20|15

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.
Fevised 8/2012



Pricing Page

REVISED 03/23/2015

VENDOR NAME Central Supply

Material and delivery by the Vendor to Non-Established WVDOH locations, ONLY.

Bid Price per Ton Items A-W and AA
F.O.B. Vendor's Storage Site

Limestone,
Contract Sandstone, | Blast Furnace
Item Description of Material Gravel, Sand Slag Steel Slag
A Class 1 Aggregate 23.25
B Class 2 Aggregate 23.25
C Class 10 Aggregate 22.75
D AASHTO #1 Aggregate 23.45
E AASHTO #3 Aggregate 23.45
F AASHTO #4 Aggregate 23.70
G AASHTO #467 Aggregate no bid
H AASHTO #57 Aggregate 24.50
I AASHTO #67 Aggregate no bid
J AASHTO #7 Aggregate no bid
K AASHTO #8 Aggregate 23.75
L AASHTO #9 Aggregate 28.00
M Stone for Gabions 24.00
N Fine Aggregate 24.00
OA |Limestone Standard Abrasives 24.00
OB [Sandstone Standard Abrasives no bid
PA Limestone Modified Abrasives 28.00
PB Sandstone Modified Abrasives no bid
Q Rip Rap no bid
R Shot Rock 23.45
S AASHTO #8 Modified no bid
T AASHTO #9 Modified no bid
U Pea Gravel no bid
\ #11 Limestone Abrasives no bid
W Quarry Waste 19.95
AA [Cinders | [ nobhid
Items A-W and AA (Except for Q and R):
X1 Haul by Vendor - First Ton-Mile 2.00
X2 Haul by Vendor - Additional Ton-Mile 0.20
Items Q and R ONLY:
Y1 Haul by Vendor - First Ton-Mile 3.00
Y2 Haul by Vendor - Additional Ton-Mile 0.30




y, | Purchasing Divison

1| 2019 Washington Street East
> | Post Office Box 50130

J§i Charleston, WV 25305130

State of West Virginia
Request for Quotation

Proc¢ Folder: 81324

Boe Description: ADDENDUM 1 AGGREGATE, CINDERS
Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

- DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST

Date issued Solicitation Closes | Solicitation Mo Version
2015-03-26 2015-04-01 CRFQ 0803 DOT1500000071 2
13:30:00

BIQ CLERK

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
PURCHASING DIVISION

2018 WASHINGTON ST E
CHARLESTON

us

Wwv

ilﬂ

Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number:

CeEsrul éuf)f)h( Lo, of wV/
Y923 Benedum Prive

Bridgeprt  w\ 24220

ph# Y- 592-5577

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Crystal Rink

{304) 558-2402

crystal.g.rink@wv.gov

o |
Signature X W / ] M

rene SSOHOT9 ”

pate J2-20-2015

Ali offers subject to ail ternte and fyﬁiﬁ‘oﬁs contained in this sotlcitation

Page: 1

FORM 1D : Wv-PRC-CRFG-001




ALL STATE AGENCIES

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

VARIGUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City Wv99389 Ne City Wv 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - 0.00000 TON
MAT.& DEL, BY VNDR NON-EST
Comm Code Manufacturer Spacification Mode) #
11111600

Extended Description :
STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - MAT.& DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST LOG.

Page: 2



Document Phase Document Description Page 3
DOT1500000071 Draf{ ADDENDUM 1 AGGREGATE, CINDERS - of 3
DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions




SOLICITATION NUMBER: CRFQ DOT1500000071
Addendum Number: 1

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as
(“Solicitation”) to reflect the change(s) identified and described below.,

Applicable Addendum Category:
| 1 Modify bid opening date and time
[ | Modify specifications of product or service bein g sought
[ | Attachment of vendor questions and responses
[ | Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet
[¢'] Correction of error

[ | Other

Description of Modification to Solicitation:
TO ANSWER VENDOR QUESTIONS

TO PROVIDE PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT AND VENDOR PREFERENCE
TO ATTACH CORRECTED PRICING SHEET

Additional Documentation: Documentation related to this Addendum (if any) has been
included herewith as Attachment A and is speci fically incorporated herein by reference.

Terms and Conditions:

! All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in
full force and effect.

2. Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by
completing an Addendum Acknowledgment, 2 copy of which is included herewith.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. The addendum
acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

Revised 6/8/2012



ATTACHMENT A

Revised 6/872012



CRFQ DOT1500000071
Question 1:

I wanted to question and verify the quadrupling of the general liability insurance requirement
that was listed for the April 1 aggregate bid for DOH. s this correct? If 80, please give an
explanation. This requirement is going to make already high insurance premiums go up even
more and may lead to a cease in our operations altogether teaving some DOH's at a
disadvantage for their work on county roads. | feel sure that this 400% increase in insurance
coverage is going to cause great difficulty for us and | would think most small businesses in
rural areas in trying to make a living and helping our communities as well. Could you please
verify if this is a misprint and if so | am requesting that you please revert to original insurance
requirement for the upcoming bid opening April 1st. | look forward to your response in this
matter.

Response 1;

Per WYDOH, Legal Division, $1,000,000.00 shall remain on all Maintenance Division master
agreements.

Question 2:

tam looking over the new bid forms for aggregates and noticed on this one that has the Haul by Vendor
items that there is not a separate item for hauling items Q and R. There needs to be a separate hauling
item for shot rock and riprap due to the type of trucks needed to haul large rock such as this. Hauling
this size rock can only be done on a heavier steel bed truck

Response 2:

Vendor is correct; adjustment to the pricing page will be made



Rev. 04/14 State of West Virginia
VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application* is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply 1o
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors o request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only toa the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This centificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this certification; or,

- Bidderis aparinership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four {4} years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 86% of the
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has
maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately
preceding the date of this cerlification; or,

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a mirimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immedialely preceding the date of this certification; or,

2. Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuousty for the two years
immediately precading submission of this bid; ar,

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an
affiiate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimum of ene hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiliate’s or subsidiary's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuousiy for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

4.X Application is made for 5% vendor preference for the reason checked:
5

g

Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and {2) or subdivision (1) and {3} as stated above; or,

Appilication is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is anindividual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

6. Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commadities or compieting the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employess are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

7. Application is made for preference as a non-resident small, women- and minority-owned business, in accor-
dance with West Virginia Code §5A-3-59 and West Virginia Code of State Rules.

Bidder has been or expects to be approved prior to contract award by the Purchasing Division as a certitied small, women-
and minority-owned business,

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: {a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penally
against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty wili be paid to the contracting agency
or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Depariment of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information veritying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissionerto be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate
changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Pummion in writing immediately.

Bidder: (L Endral 5»!'9]0)3; lo of W\ Signed: g azp

Date: 3~ %0~ 2015 Title: a1 €5 /g&m%j&/




RFQ No._OB0%~ DOT 15000007

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

MANDATE: Under W, Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any
of its political subdivisions to any vendor or praspactive vendor when the verdor or prospective vendor or a related party
{o the vendor.or prospective vendor is a debtor and: {1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in
the aggregate; or (2) the debior is in employer default.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition tisted above does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to
chapter eleven of the W. Va. Code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmenta! fee or assessment and
the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment ptan or agreement and the vendor is not
in defauit of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement,

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessmant, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of maney owed to the state or any of its
political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit viclation, license assessment, defaulled workers'
compensation premium, penalty or cther assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state
or any of its political subdivisions, incfuding any inlerest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

“Employer default” means having an outstanding balance or liability {o the oid fund or to the uninsured employers'
fund or being in policy default, as defined in W, Va. Code § 23-2¢-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers'
compensation coverage, or failure to fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An
employer is not in employer default if it has entered into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Commissioner
and remains in compliance with the obligations under the repayment agreement.

“Related party" means a party, whether an individuat, corporation, parinership, association, limited liability company
or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by bleod, marriage,
ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that
the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the bensfit, profit or other ¢onsideration from
performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the fotal
contract amount,

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor’s authorized signer affirms and acknowiedges under penalty of
taw for false swearing (W. Va. Code §61-5-3) that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined
above and that neither vendor nor any related party are in employer default as defined above, unless the debt or
employer default is permitted under the exception abova.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:
Vendor's Name: CEN“'LWLQ SMPP it}f lo A)D' wy
Authorized Signature: _&Lﬂ/“q O* rfow/cg(_ Date: __ 0% 30-201S

[

State of U\)QH— 'R fg (A6

County of Haovv: San , to-wit:
I
Taken, subscribed, and swom to before me this S0 day of _ Mawcir 2015
My Commission expires June 0 , 2023,
AFFIX SEAL HERE NOTARY PUBLIC l\,‘\ o M G R

urehasing Affidavit (Revised 07/01/2012)

Stata of West Vinginia
Wondy G. Richords

RR 2 Box 211 2, Javs Lew WV 26378
My Coneniesion Expirgs Juna 10, 2023




ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NQ.; DOT1500000071

Instructions: Please acknowledge recei pt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: [ hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

{1 Addendum No. 1 [ ] Addendum No. 6
[ ] Addendum No.2 [ 1 Addendum No.7
[ ] Addendum No. 3 [ ] Addendum No. 3
[ 1 Addendum No. 4 [ 1 Addendum No. 9
f ] Addendum No. 5 [ 1 Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. |
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an offictal addendum is binding.

Letal Supply Go o wV
Company /

s,

F 0 Aéfhoﬁzed Signature
1330~ 20|15

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing,
Revised 6/8/2012



Purchasing Divison State of West Virginia

2\ | 2019 Washington Street East ion
i| Post Office Box 50130 Request for Quotatio

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 -

Proc Folder: 81324
Doc Description: ADDENDUM 2 AGGREGATE, CINDERS - DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST

Proc Type: Central Master Agreemeant

Date Issued Solicltation Closes | Selicitation No Version
2015-04-01 2015-04-09 CRFQ 0803 DOT1500000071 3
13:30:00

BID CLERK

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON ST E

CHARLESTON wv 25305
us

Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number:

CEN“J g"“f’f’l“’] Co. oF WV
4922 Bemvebum Drive

Bridyepoet, WV | Zp>30 ph 3045925677

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Crystal Rink
{304) 558-2402
crystal.g.rink@wv.gov

Signature X M W reng S50402.9)) pare O4H-o01- 20(S

All offers subject to all terms and ¢ mons contained in this solicitation

Page: 1 FORM ID : WV-PRC-CRFQ-001



ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WY 86590 No City WA 99989
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - 0.00000 TON
MAT.& DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Extended Description @
STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - MAT.& DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST LOC.

Page: 2




DOT1500000071

Document Phase

Final

Document Description
ADDENDUM 2 AGGREGATE. CINDERS -
DEL. BY YNDR NON-EST

Page 3
of 3

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions




ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: DOT1506000071

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[X] Addendum No. 1 [ ] Addendum No. 6
[X ] Addendum No. 2 [ ] Addendum No.7
[ 1 Addendum No. 3 f ] Addendum No. 8
[ ] Addendum No.4 [ ] Addendum No.9
[ ] Addendum No. 5 [ ] Addendum No. 10

[ understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. 1
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

C’E;\hlr’al- -Su,pp}:f (a OF wV

thorized Signature

OU-01-2015

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.
Revised £/8/2012



Furchasing Divison State of West Virginia

2019 Washington Street East :
\[ Post Office Box 50130 Request for Quotation

#| Charleston, WV 25305-0130 -

Proc Folder: 81324
Doc Description: ADDENDUM #3 AGGREGATE, CINDERS - DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST
Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Date Issued Sollcitation Closes | Solicitation No Version
2015-04-07 2015-04-09 CRFQ 0803 DOT1500000071 4
13:30:00

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON STE

CHARLESTON Wy 25305
us

AW Rl 3 i Bt AN

Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number:

el 9»1[3,9/7 (o ¢fwV
4923 Bewepum Drve

Bridepoet, WV 24330 phlt 20d4-592-5577

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Crystal Rink

{304) 558-2402

crystal.g.rink@wv.gov

Signature X { P FEIN # 5504- 02-4 } ’ DATE ﬂ"{"l‘?? - 2015_

All offers subject to all terms‘dnd’f ditions contalnad In this sollcitation

Page: 1 FORM (D : WV-PRC-CRFQ-001



ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City Wv08963 Na City WV 99999
us Us
Line Comm Ln Besc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - 0.00000 TON
MAT.& DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST
Camm Code Manufacturer Specificatlon Model #
11411600

Extended Description :

STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - MAT.& DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST LOC.

Page: 2




DOT1500000071

Document Phase
Final

Document Description
ADDENDUM #3 AGGREGATE, CINDERS -
DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST

Page 3
of 3

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions




Purchasing Divison State of West Virginia

2019 Washington Street East ;i
Post Office Box 50130 Request for Quotation

Charleston, WV 25305.0130 -

Proc Foilder; 81324
Doc Description: ADDENDUM #3 AGGREGATE, CINDERS - DEL, BY VNDR NON-EST
Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Date Issued Solicitation Closes | Salicitation No Version
2015-04-07 2015-04-09 CREQ Q803 DOT1500000071 4
13:30:00

BID CLERK
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2013 WASHINGTON 5T E

CHARLESTON WV 25305
us

Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number:

LEal S 17(0 ot wV/
4927 Bzmom Drive
bridsepmt, wv 26330 P)”# 204-592-5577

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Crystal Rink
{304) 558-2402
crystal.g.rink@wv.gov

Signature X &M{/%vt% g S50 ‘7"02,? H vate OY-47-20I5

Al offers subject to al) terms(jnd conditions contalned in this solicitation

Page: 1 FORM ID : WV-PRC-CRFQ-001



O E

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIQUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City W\/09909 No City WV 85099
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit [ssue Linit Price Total Price
1 STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS - 0.60000 TON
MAT.& DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST
Comm Code Manufacturer Specificatlon Model #
11111800

Extended Description :

STONE, AGGREGATE, CINDERS -~ MAT.& DEL. BY VNDR NON-EST LOC.

Page: 2




Document Phase Docurment Description Page 3
DOT1500000074 Draft ADBENDUM #3 AGGREGATE, CINDERS - | of 3
’ DEL. BY YNDR NON-EST

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions




SOLICITATION NUMBER: CRFQ DOT1500000071
Addendum Number: 3

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as
(“Solicitation™) to reflect the change(s) identified and described below.

Applicable Addendum Category:

[ | Modify bid opening daie and time

I | Modify specifications of product or service being sought
{ | Attachment of vendor questions and responses

[ | Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet

[ | Correction of error

[¢/) Other

Description of Modification to Solicitation:

To explain calculation of central detlivery order (CDO)

Additional Documentation: Documentation related to this Addendum (if any) has been
included herewith as Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference.

Terms and Conditions:

1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in
full force and effect.

2

Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by
completing an Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. The addendum
acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

Revised 6/8/2012



ATTACHMENT A

Revised 67820712



Addendum #3

Tan Mile is the cost to transport one ton of material a distance of one mile.

The centrai delivery order (CDO) will be issued to the vendor with the lowest total cost per delivery as
caiculated below, with distance computed as per Section 5 of the CRFQ (DETERMINING LOW BID
PER DELIVERY TO NON-ESTABLISHED WVDOH STORAGE SITE)

Bid price per ton of material X number of tons requested X first ton mile price = A

Bid price per ton of material X number of tons requested X additional ton mile price x {miles from
vendor storage site to non-estabtished DOH Storage Site — 1 mile) = B

A + B = ¢ost of CDO,

Each delivery order will show the above calculation as well as the determination of distance.



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICIT ATION NO,: DOT1500000071

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the fellowing addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
{Check the box next to each addendum received)

[X1 Addendum No. 1 [ ] Addendum No.6
(%] Addendum No. 2 [ ] Addendum No.7
[')(] Addendum No. 3 { ] Addendum No. 8
[ ] Addendum No. 4 [ ] Addendum No. 9
I 1 Addendum No. 5 [ 1 Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. |
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor's representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

Lol Su P"f Co of w/

Bty V)

thBlnzed Signature

O04-97-2013

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.
Revised 6/8/2012



