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SOLICITATION NUMBER: DPS1431 000002
Addendum Number: 1

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as DPS1431 (“Solicitation”) to reflect the
change(s) identified and described below.

Applicable Addendum Category:
[ X] Modify bid opening date and time
[ ] Modify specifications of product or service being sought
[ X] Attachment of vendor questions and responses
[ 1 Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet
[ 1] Correction of error

[ X] Other

Description of Modification to Solicitation:
1. Response to vendor question attached.
2. Revised pricing pages attached.
3. The bid opening date have moved from 05/07/2014 to 05/14/2014.
Additional Documentation: Documentation related to this Addendum (if any) has been included herewith as
Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference.
Terms and Conditions:

1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in full force and
effect.

2. Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by completing an
Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith. Failure to acknowledge addenda
may result in bid disqualification. The addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to
expedite document processing.



DPS1431 - Pricing Pages

Revised by Addendum No. 1

600006

*Estimated
Annual Extended

Item # Description Quantity Unit Price Price
Below 520 MHz frequency coordination NO BID

4.1.1.1 (Per frequency 3 $ $
Below 520 MHz frequency coordination

4.1.1.2 (Per pair) 5 $ ¢ NO BID
769-775/799-805 MHz frequency 2

4,1.1.3 coordination (Per frequency) $ $ NO BID
769-775/799-805 MHz frequency

4.1.1.4 coordination (Per pair) * $ $ NO BID
806-817/851-862 MHz (NPSPAC)

4.1.1.5 frequency coordination (Per frequency) 2 $ $¢ NO BID
806-817/851-861 MHz (NPSPAC 2

4.1.1.6 frequency coordination (Per pair) $ $ NO BID
806-817/851-862 MHz (Non-NPSPAC,
General Pool) frequency coordination 2 NO BID

4.1.1.7 (Per frequency) $ $
806-817/851-862 MHz (Non-NPSPAC,
General Pool) frequency coordination 2 NO BID

4.1.1.8 (Per pair) $ $

4.1.1.9 License preparation Fee 5 $ $ NO BID

4.1.1.10 Interoperable License Administrative Fee 5 $ $ NO BID
Public Safety Coordination Council inter-

4.1.1.11 service coordination Fee 3 $ $ Ol BED

4.1.1.12 Miscellaneous services — Hourly Rate 5 $ $ NO BID
Microwave frequency coordination,

4.1.2.1 Interference Analysis (Single frequency) a $ 200.00 $1,000.00
Microwave frequency coordination, Prior .

4.1.2.2 coordination, 1% path $4_2_2L00 $1,125.00
Microwave frequency coordination, each

4.1.2.3 additional path/ f req . s $ 200.00 §1,.OO0.00
Microwave frequency coordination, Minor 2

4.1.2.4 changes and modifications $ 200.00 $ 400.00
Microwave frequency coordination, Prior

4.1.2,5 coordination, No response < $ 200.00 ¢ 400.00
Microwave frequency coordination, 6

4.1.2.6 month renewal notice, 1% path % $ 75.00 $ 150.00
Microwave frequency coordination |

4,1.2.7 Verbal coordination - expedited ?ZWK MIN) 2 4225.00 $ 450.00
Microwave frequency coord ination,

4.1.2.8 Verbal coordination, each additional 2 $225.00 $ 45 0.00
Microwave frequency coordination,

4.1.2.9 Frequency Protection 100 1$ 250/month| $ 3000.00
Microwave frequency coordination,

4.1.2.10 | License Audits 4 $ 75/month | $900.00
Microwave frequency coordination, 2

4.1.2.11 Interference Analysis $200.00 $00.00
Microwave frequency coordination, 2 %2 00.00 400.00

4.1.2.12 License Preparation Fee $
Microwave frequency coordination, 2 _

4.1.2.13 Miscellaneous Services — Hourly Rate $ 75 $.52 150.00
Failure to use this form may resuit in OVERALL 9825.00
disqualification. TOTAL: $




600005

Q10: 22, Small, Women-owned, or minority —owned businesses: Please provide more details
regarding MWBE certification for this RFP, i.e. what is the primary contact’s information
and process to proceed with this certification? What is the estimated time it takes to
receive certification? Would you disqualify vendors whom are unable to receive the
certification in time for bid submittal?

A10: See the vendor registration page, link provided -

http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/VendorReg.html

Clarifications:

1. To delete Section 4.1.1.4 in its entirety and replace with the following:
4.1.1.4 —769-775/799-805 MHz frequency coordination (per pair).
See revised pricing pages attached.
2. To delete Section 4.1.1.6 in its entirety and replace with the following:
4.1.1.6 — 806-817/851-862 MHz (NPSPAC) frequency coordination (per pair).
See revised pricing pages attached.
3. To delete Section 4.1.1.8 in its entirety and replace with the following:

4.1.1.8 — 806-821/851-866 MHz (non-NPSPAC, General Pool) frequency
coordination (per pair).

See revised pricing pages attached.

Other Information:

1. The bid opening has been moved from 05/07/2014 to 05/14/2014. The bid opening time
remains at 1:30 pm.



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM 060008
SOLICITATION NO.: DPS1431

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[ ] Addendum No. 1 [ ] Addendum No. 6
[ ] Addendum No. 2 [ ] Addendum No. 7
[ ] Addendum No. 3 [ ] Addendum No. 8
[ ] Addendum No. 4 [ ] Addendum No.9
[ ] Addendum No. 5 [ ] Addendum No. 10

[ understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. I
further understand that that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

CONSOLIDATED SPECTR UM SERVICES
Company

Authorized Signature

05/11/2014

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.



¢G6000"/

Bidder / Vendor Information:

Name: consolidated Spectrum Services
Address: 231 Sagamore Road
Gilford, NH 03249

Phone #:/Fax: 603-293-0002

Email _
Address: Sales@FCCl.bilz

Contact Coordinator Information:

Name: Howard Epstein
Address: 231 Sagamore Road

gilford, NH 03249
Phone #: 603-293-0002

Email :
Howard@FCCl.biz
Address:

*Quantities are estimated annual usage for bidding purposes and bidder’s information.
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SOLICITATION NUMBER: DPS1431 U002

Addendum Number: i

The purpese of this addendur: is to modify the solicitation identified as DPS 143 | (“Solicitatior™) 1o reflect the
tharge(s) identified and deseribed below.

Applicable Addeaduesn Category:
[ X] Modifv hid opening date and time
[ ] Modify specifications of product or service being sought
[X] Attachment of vendor questions and Tesponses
[ ] Attactument of pre-bid sigo-in sheet

[ ] Correction of error

05/07/14 011238 37PM

[{X] Other

Descrintion of Modification to Solicitation:
i. Resporse 10 vendor question attached.
4. Revised pricing pages attached.
2. The bid opening date have moved from 05/07/72014 to 05/14/72014.
Additional Docementation: Documentation related to this Addendum (if any; has been vichaded herewith as
Attachment A and is specifically incorporated hetein by reference.
Terms and Conditions:

1. Al provisions of the Sclicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in fuli force and
effecs.

ta

Vendor should zcknowledge receipt of al) addenda jssued for this Solicitatior hv cornpleting an
Addendum Ackrowledgment, a copy of which is included herewitl:. Failure to acknswledge addends
may result in bid disqualification. The addendum acknowledgement should be submuittzd with 2he M4 1o
expedite document processing.




@5/85/2014 22:17 6832930082 - CONSOLIDATED SPECTRU | PAGE .02

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENY FORM SG060s
CI NNO.: §$1431

Instrucrions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this sclicitation by compleiing this
aadetidum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure © acknowledge addenda may resuit in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgmens: 1 hereby acknowledge receips of the following addenda and have rrede the
agcessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specificatior, etc.

(Check the box next to each addendum received)
[“AI.} Addendum No. 1 [ ] Addendum No. 6
[ T Addendum No.2 [ ] Addendam No. 7
[ ] Addendwn No.3 [ ] Addendurn No. 8
[ 1 Addendumn No. 4 { ] Addendum No.?
[ 1 Addendum No. 53 [ ] Addendum No. 10

Iunders:and that fajlure 1o confinm the receipt of addendz may be cause for rej=ction of <hjs bid. |
further ur3erstand that that say verbal representation made or sssumed 10 be cade during any ovel
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel s not binding. Only the
informanon igsued in writing and added to the specifications by an officizl addendum is kinding.

CONSOUIDATED SPECTH YT SEALIEES
Cowpany

7 Authorized Sigaatare

05/o7 /20y

Darte

NOTE: Ths adderdum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid ta expedite document Processiag.
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DPS1431 ~ Pricing Pages
Revised by Addendum No. 1
“Estimated
Annual Extended
Item # Description Quantity Unit Price Price
Buiow 310 MHz froquerncy coordination ) ,
4.1.1.1 (Par fraguency 3 $ § NG Elg
Balow 520 MHe frecusncy cecrdination 3
4.1.1.2 (Par pair) 3 $ g o8 "
763-775/799-805 MHx frequancy . .
4.1.1.3 ccardination (Per frequancy) 4 $ Mo gis
769-775799-805 MHx freguancy
4.1.1.4 coordineton (Per puir) 4 $ $ o 814
806-817,851-861 MMz (NPSPAC) N '
4.1.1.% fraquancy coordinatlon (Por frequency) $ 35 pp Bl
806-817/Bu1-861 MHx {NPSPAC 7
4.1.1.6 fraguenicy coordination (Per pair) & S s A8 #
806-817 /651-B62 MMy (Non-NPSPAC,
Garieral Pool) frequency coordination 2
4.1.1.7 (Par frequancy) $ 3 i 5/ g
B06-817/851-682 MHx (Non-NPSPAC, '
Ganeral Pop!) frequancy coordimation 2 e V.24
4,1,1.8 (Por poir) $ :
4,1.1.9 iLicense preparation Pea 5 § 3 Vo Br#
4.1.1.10 Interopersbie License Administative Foe 5 $ 5 pNo d¢
Public Safety Coordination Coundl nter e
4.1.1.11 service coordination Fee 5 § L fﬁ"/
9.1.1.12 Miscaliaroous servicew — Mously Rate 3 5 Mo B
Miaowave fraquency coordinaton, 5 joco
4.1.2.1 Intertarance Analysls (Singlo Arequancy) $ 400 p
Micowave frequency coordination, Prior -
4.1.1.2 coordinetion, 1* path 5 $ 290 3 JIAS
Micrownve frequancy coondination, sech P 3
4.1.2.3 additonal path 3 § 200 s /00
Microwave frequandty coordination, Minur .
4.1.2.4 chanpes and modificabons 2 s AdJ z Yog
Microwave frequency coordination, Prior
4,1.2.5 coardinetion, Mo response * $ X0 s Yoo
Microwave frequency coordinetdon, &
4.1.2.6 manth renewal notice, 3% path 2 $ & $ /50
Microwave frequoncy coordioation, 2 .
4.1.2.7 Varbal coordination - expeditod ¥ 3L My § Aa§ 3 Y56 .
Micrownve frequency coordination, 5 .
4.1.2.8 Varbal coordination, anch addidonal 2 $ 15 $ Y5
Microwave frequency coordination,
___4.1.29 Frequency Protecdon i $ ,W/’”’ 3 ‘? ]
Micrewavey Nty coordinatign, g oy
4.1.2.10 Limnmﬁiﬁ,’(sﬂ" ¢ {F uilooy 0%‘9‘ 2 5 ?5’/ i ¥ m
Micrewave frequency coordirmation, A =
4.1.2.11 Intarference Anslysis * § 00 5 700
Microwave frequancy coordlration, 2 Lo
4,1.2.12 License Preparation Pee A $ o 7 - 4 oo
Micrgwave fraguency coordination, y
4.1.2.13 Miscollanwous Services — Hourty Rete * $ 75 s | 5_0
Fallure to usa this form may result In OVERALL
disqualification, TOTAL: « 7335
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PAGE 84
May ? 2014 04.33om PQO7/003

Bidder / Vendor Information:

Narne: HownRD EF3 76 /H /[0/\/55)(/4-7/529 J/ﬂ-wuﬂgﬂlrg

Address: RZ) £ALAsMCRE _&ZF

=7 WA EEL A
Phone #: O03-R33- pRLA —
Email BAl@s @ FcLdbi®

Address: T gu c o3 2e2-5977

Contact Coordinator Information:

Name: HOWARY £ PSTEN
Address; 291 sSacar7oxt K[
Gl LRoR - 02247 e
Phone &: £ 07- e .
Emall HowARgY @ FccA -bix
Address:

*Quantities are estimated annual usage for bidding purposes and bidder's ‘nforination.




