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www.stateavv.us/admin/p wrchase

13. BID SCHEDULE 6612C029
Vendor West Virginia Paving, Inc.
Name:

Modifiad Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix

Delivery: F.0.B. WV Divislon of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICT 1

*Quantities listed In this RFQ are approximations only. Itls understood and agreed that the contract shall

cover the quantitles actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than

{he quantities shown below in the Bid Schedule.

Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Dellvery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Boone Clinton @ WV85 TON 275 108.00 | 29,700.00
Boone Rock Creek TON 250 108.50 | 26,625.00
Boone Seth TON 15 106.50 7,987.50
Clay Widen Road & CR 11 TON 200 109.00 | 21,800.00
-|Clay Maysel TON 0
Kanawha |Chelyan TON 200 103.00 | 20,600.00
Kanawha |Elkview TON 100 99.00 9.900.00
Kanawha [North Charleston TON 100 97.50 | 9,750.00
Kanawha |St. Albans TON 100 99.50 9,950.00
Kanawha |-64 @ Rt. 119 and Penn. Avenue TON 50 98.00 | 4,900.00
Kanawha |I-77 @ Sissonville TON 40 96.00 3,840.00
Kanawha |-79 @ Amma TON 30 104.00 | 3,120.00
Kanawha |Corridor G @ Alum Creek TON 30 100.00 | 3,000.00
Mason Pt, Pleasant TON 200 96.00 | 19,200.00
Putham  |Red House TON 75 97.50 7,312.50
Putham  |Hurricane @ Rt. 34 TON i) 102.00 | 7,650.00
Putnam  |Scary TON 30 100.00 | 3,000.00
NOTR: The “Bid Schedule” is available for downlond on Purchasing’s Web site at




13. BID SCHEDULE 66120029
Vendor West Virginia Paving, Inc. 4\
Name:
Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 2
*Quanlities listed n this RFQ are approximations anly. ItIs understood and agreed that the contract shall
cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the tarm of the contract, whether more or less than
{he quantities shown helow in the Bid Schedule.
Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Cabell Barboursville TON 200 105.00 | 21,000.00
Cabell I-64 @ Huntington TON 20 106.00 | 2,120.00
Lincoln  |West Hamlin TON 40 106.00 | 4,240.00
Lincoln  |Yawkey TON 15 106.00 | 1,590.00
Lincoln  |Harts TON 25 112.00 | 2,800.00
Logan Corridor G @ Chapmanville TON 60 108.00 | 6,480.00
Logan Wilkinson TON 60 110.00 | 6,600.00
Logan Man TON 40 113.00 | 4,520.00
Mingo Mingo County @Miller's Creek TON 50 112.00 | 5,600.00
Mingo Gilhert TON 25 114.00 | 2,850.00
Wayne _ |Crum TON 75 116.00 | 8,700.00
Wayne  |Pritchard TON 100 112.00 | 11,200.00
Wayne  [Wayne TON 100 112.00 | 11,200.00
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1o BID SCHEDULE 6612C029
Vendor West Virginia Pavi
Name: ginia Paving, Inc.

Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix

Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICT 3

sQuantities listed In this RFQ are approximations enly. It is understood and agreed that the contract shall

cover the quantifies actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contrzct, whether more or less than

the quantifies shown below in the Bid Schedule.,

Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Dellvery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost

Calhoun _ [Millstone TON 200 100.00 20,000.00
Jackson  [Ripley TON 300 92.00 | 27,600.00
Jackson  |I-77 @ Medina TON 20 96.00 1,920.00
Pleasants [Belmont TON 0
Pleasants |St, Mary's (Colin-Anderson Lof) TON 0
Ritchie  |APD Pennshoro TON 0
Ritchie  [Ellenboro TON 75
Ritchie Corridor D @ Nulter Farm TON 0
Ritchie  [Smithville TON 30
Roane Lefthand @ WV 36 TON 50 100.00 | 5,000.00
Roane Ambler Hill @ US 119 TON 0
Roane Spencer TON 200 96.00 | 19,200.00
Wirt Elizabeth _ TON 75
Wood Parkersburg @ Rt 95S TON 150
Wood Corridor D @ River Hill TON 0
Wood [-77 @ Mill Run Road TON 35




13.

BID SCHEDULE 6612C029

Vendor
Name:

West Virginia Paving, Inc.

Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix
Delivery. F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 4

*Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only. Itis understood and agreed that the contract shall
cover the quantilies actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than
the quantities shown below In the Bid Schedule.

17

Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended

County Dellvery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Daddridge  |Smithburg TON 60 105.00 | 6,300.00
Harrison Gore TON 300 100.00 | 30,000.00
Harrison 79 @ Lost Creek TON = 75 100.00 | 7,500.00
Harrlson APD 50 @ Tunnel Hill TON 75 102.00 | 7,650.00
Marion Fairmont TON 100 102.00 | 10,200.00
Marion Mannington TON 75 103.00 | 7,725.00
Monongalia {I-79 @ Goshen Road TON 15 105.00 | 1,575.00
Monongalia |Ridgedale TON 500 102.00 | 51,000.00
Monongalia |Pentress TON 75 103.00 | 7,725.00
Preston Albright TON 300 102.00 | 30,600.00
Preston Bruceton TON 100 104.00 | 10,400.00
Preston Terra Alta TON 100 103.00 | 10,300.00
Preston Fellowsville TON 100 102.00 | 10,200.00
Preston Aurora TON 100 101.00 | 10,100.00
Preston I-68 @ Copper's Rock TON 25 106.00 | 2,625.00
Taylor Fetterman/Prunytown TON 75 98.00 | 7,350.00
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13. BID SCHEDULE 6612C029
Vendor o
Name: West Virginia Paving, Inc.
Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix
Delivery: F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 5
*Quanlities listed I this RFQ are approximations only. Itls understood and agreed that the contract shall
cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than
the quantities shown below In the Bid Schedule.
Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Berkeloy  [I-81 @ Martinsburg TON 300 120.00 36,000.00
Berkeley  |-81 @ Exit 8 TON 0
Grant Petershurg TON 75 107.00 8,025.00
Grant Mt. Storm TON 50 103.00 5,150.00
Grant Corridor H @ Knobley Road TON 0
Hampshire _[Roimney TON 80 109.00 | 8,720.00
Hampshire |Capon Bridge TON 30 114.00 | 3,420.00
Hampshire [Slanesville TON 0
Hardy Moorefield TON 75 106.00 | 7,950.00
Hardy Baker TON 75 108.00 | 8,100.00
Jefferson_ |Charles Town TON 100 120.00 | 12,000.00 |
Mineral New Cresk TON 75 106.00 | 7,950.00
Mineral Sky Line TON 25 105.00 | 2,625.00
Mineral Short Gap TON 25 110.00 | 2,750.00
Mineral District Headquarters TON 0
Morgan Berkeley Springs TON 160 119.00 | 17,850.00
Morgan Largent TON 0




13. BID SCHEDULE 6612C029

\I\/i(;“r;l;r West Virginia Paving, Inc.

Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix

Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICT 6

*Quaniilies listed in this RFQ are approximalions only, Itis understood and agreed that the contract shall

cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than

the quantities shown below In the Bid Schedule.

Unit of Estimated UnitCost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost

Brooke  |Wellshurg TON 200 No Bid No Bid
Brooke  |Welrton TON 0 No Bid No Bid
Hancock |[New Manchester TON 300 No Bid No Bid
Marshall  |Glen Dale TON 1300 No Bid No Bid
Marshall |Gameron TON 700 No Bid No Bid
Ohio Triadelphia TON 150 No Bid No Bid
Ohio -70 @ Triadelphia TON 100 No Bid No Bid
Tyler Centerville TON 100 No Bid No Bid
Tyler Sistersville TON 200 No Bid No Bid
Tyler Sistersville Old Headquarters TON 0 No Bid No Bid
Wetzel Hundred TON 100 No Bid No Bid
Wetzel New Martinsville TON 150 No Bid No Bid
Wetzel Pine Grove TON 100 No Bid No Bid

19




13. BID SCHEDULE 6612C029
\I(I:?T?Sr West Virginia Paving, Inc.
Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Divislon of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 7
*Quantities listed In this RFQ are approximations only. itis understood and agreed {hal the contract shall
cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract, whather more or less than
the quantities shown below in the Bid Schedule.
Unit of Estimated Unlt Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Barbour | Phillipi TON 80 97.00 7,760.00
Braxton  |Laurel Court TON 120 105.000 | 12,600.00
Braxton  |I-79 @ Coon Knob TON 30 102.00 3,060.00
|Braxton |79 @ Bumsville TON 30 103.00 3,090.00
Gllmer Glenville Headquarters TON 50 105.00 5,250.00
Lewis Weston (Ben Dale) TON 80 99.00 | 7,920.00
Upshur _ |Clow Lot @ Buckhannon TON 80 97.00 7,760.00
Webster  [Cherry Falls TON 30 103.00 3,090.00
Webhster  {Cowen TON 30 105.00 3,150.00
Webster  |Hacker Valley TON 30 102.00 | 3.060.00

20




21

13. BID SCHEDULE 6612C029
Vendor West Virginia Paving, Inc.
Name:

Modified Winter Grads Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix

Dellvery: F.Q.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICT 8

*Quantilies listad in this RFQ are approximations only. Itis understood and agreed that the contract shall

cover the quantities actually ardered for delivery during the-term of the contrac, whether more or less than

the quantities shown below In the Bid Schedule.

Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost

Pendleton  |Franklin TON 100 99.00 9,900.00
Pocahontas |[Marlinton TON 26 104.00 2,600.00
Randolph  |Elkins TON 126 92.00 11,500.00
[ Tucker Parsons TON 60 95.00 5,700.00




13; BID SCHEDULE 6612C029
Vendor West Virginia Paving, Inc.
Name:

Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix

Delivery: F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICT 9

*Quantilles listed in this RFQ are approximations only. It is understood and agreed fhat the contract shall

cover (he quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the conlract, whether more or less than

the quanities shown below in the Bid Schedule.

Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost

Fayette  |Oak Hill TON 200 111.00 22,200.00
Fayette  |Corridor L @ Oak Hil TON 0
Fayette  |Lookout TON 100 111.00 11,100.00
Fayette  |Glen Ferris TON 100 107.00 10,700.00
Greenbrier |Lewishurg TON 125 102.00 12,750.00
Greenbrier |Crawley TON 100 106.00 10,600.00
Greenbrier |1-64 @ Hart's Run TON 18 104.00 1,560.00
Monroe Union TON 275 107.00 29,425.00
Monroe Peterstown TON 0
Nicholas  |Summersville TON 75 104.00 7,800.00
Nicholas  [Curlin TON 26 101.00 2,525.00
Nicholas  |Corridor L. @ Muddiety TON 100 103.00 10,300.00
Summers _|Hinton TON 50 109.00 5,450.00
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13. BID SCHEDULE 6612C029
Vendor West Virginia Paving, Inc.
Name:

Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix

Delivery: F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICT 10

*Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only. [tis understood and agreed that the contract shall

cover the quantitios actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than

the quantities shown below in the Bid Schedule.

Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost

McDowell |County Headquarters TON 100 119.00 11,900.00
Mercer  |County Headquarters TON 100 116.00 11,600.00
Raleigh  |County Headquarters TON 100 110.00 11,000.00
Wyoming |County Headquarters TON 100 115.00 11,500.00
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State of West Virginla Request for pmem R
Dapariment of Adminlstration  Quotation 6612C02

Purchas]n? Divislon
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504 -558-2402

RFQ COPY
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VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

%] West Virginia Paving, Inc.
PO Box 544
Dunbar, VWV 25064
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ADDENDUM NO. 01

[GSUED TO DIPTRIBPTE ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS
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DOOL 'N 7145-67
1,
JINTER GRADE| BITUMINOUB PATCHING

e xxx k% THIS| IS THE ENP OF RFQ 6612Cp29 *xxkx*x TOTAL:

SEEAEVESE ADEFOR NS ARG EONDITIONS

% 7 Luthprs— TELEPHONE  307-768-9733 " June 27, 2012

Vice President | 55-057570769 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESFONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

1. Awards will be mada in the best interest of the State of West Virglnla,

9. The State may accept or rejoct In part, o in whola, any bid.

3. Prlor to any award, the apparent sticcessiul vendor must be properly reglstered with the Purchasing Division
aid have pald ihe required $125 fes,

4, Al services performed or goods delivered under Slate Purchase Ordey/Contracls are to be continued for the
term of the Purchase Order/Contracts, contingant upon funds being approprlated by the Leglslature or otherwise
helng made avallable. In the event finds are not approptiated or olherwlse avallable for these setvices or goods
this Purchase Order/Gonltract bacomes volc and of no elfect after Juna 30.

5, Payment may anly be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.

6. Interest may be pald for late payment Ih accordance with the West Virglnia Code,

7. Vendor preference will be granted upon wrilten recjuest in accordance with the West Virginia Cotle.

8. The State of West Virginla ts exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay ot relmburse such taxes.

9, The Diractor of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Gontract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.

10, The laws of the State of Waest Virginla and the Leglslative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern the
purchasihg process,

11, Any reference to automatic renawal Is hereby deleted, The Contract may bo renawed only upon mulual written
agreement of the parties.

12, BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendorfeontractor flles for bankruptey protection, the Slate may deem
this contract null and void, and terminate such contraot without further order.

13, HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associale
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attormey Ganeral, is avallable online at www.smte.wv.usfmimin!mrrchasalwclhhma.lmnl
and Is heraby made part of the agreement provided hat the Agency meets lhe definition of a Cover Enlily
(45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protectad Heallh Information (46 CFR §160.108) to the vendor.

14, CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose lo ahyohe, direclly or lndlrecllr, any such
parsonally dentifiable Information or olhar confidential information galhed fram the agency, unless the Individual who ls
the subject of the ihformation consents to the disclosure In wiiting or the disclosura Is mada pursuant to the agencys
policles, procedures, and rules. Vendar further agrees 1o comply with the Confidentiality Policlas and Information
Secutlly Accountabllity Requirements, sel forth In hllp:llwww.slate.wv.usIadmin/purchase!pr!Vacy:’notIcaConlidenlIa!ily.pdl.

15. LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and in good standing In accordance wilh any and all slate and local laws and
requiremants by any state or local agency of West Virginla, inclucing, but not limited fo, the Woaslt Virginla Secratary
of State's Office, he West Virginla Tax Depariment, and the West Virginla Insurance Commission. The vandor must
provide all nhecessal releases to obtaln Information lo anable the director or spending unlt o
verlfy that the vendor is | consad and in good standing with the above entitles,

16, ANTITRUST: In submitling a bid lo any agencr for the State of Wast Virginla, the biddor offers and agrees thal
If llte bid Is accepled the bldder will convey, soll, assign or ransfer to the Stale of West Virginla all tights, title ahd interast
In and lo all causes of action it may now or hareaftar acquire under the antitrust laws of the Unllad States and the State of
Wast Virginla for price fixing andlor unreasonable restralnts of lrade relaling to the pattlcular cominodities or services
purchased or acquired by the State of West Virginla. Such assignment shall b made and become effeclive at the time the
purchasing agency tenders the nillal payment to the biddar.

| corlify that this bid Is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connaotion with an‘r corporatlon, firm, limited
llability company, parinership, or person ot enllty submilting @ bid for the same maltetial, supplies, equipment ot
services and I8 In all respeots falr and without “callusion or Fraud, | further cettify that | am authorized to sign
the cerliilcatlon on behalf of the bidder or this bld.

INSTRUGTIONS TO BIDDERS
1, Use the quotation forms provided by lhe Purchasing Divislon, Complete all seclions of the cuotation form.
2. ltams offered must be Iy compliance with the speclifcations. Any daeviation from the specillcations must be clearly
indicated by the bidder.  Altarmates offerad by lhe bldder as EQUAL to the speclfications must be clearly
defined. A bidder offering an_allemate should attach complete specliications and literature to the bid. The
Purchasing Divislon may walve minor devialions ta spaciflcations.
3, Unit prices shall rrevan ih case of discrepancy. Al quotations are considered F.O.B. destinallon unless alternate
shipping terms are clearly Identifled in the quotalion.
4. Al quotations must ba delivered by the biddar to the offlca listad below prior to lhe date and time of the bid
apening. Fallure of the bldder to deliver the quotations on time will resull In bld disqualifications: Dapartment of
Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washinglon Street East, P.O, Box 50130, Charleston, WV 26306-0130
5. Communlcation during the solicitatlon, bid, evaluation or award periods, except through the Purchasing Division,
Is striolly prohibited (W.Va. C.S.R. §1 48-1-6.6).

Rov. 11/08/11




7012EC10
ADDENDUM NO. 1

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

Various Legislative acts passed in the 2012 session require inclusion of certain provisions in
all state contracts, Accordingly, this addendum will add the three provisions listed below
to the solicitation and resulting contract entered info between the State of West Virginia
and the vendor, In the event that the solicitation is not for construetion or
architectural/engineering worlk, scctjons 2 and 3 helow will not apply.

{. BACKGROUND CHECK: In accordance with W. Va. Code § 15-2D-3, the Direstor of
the Division of Protective Services may require any serviee provider whose employees
are regularly employed on {he grounds or in the buildings of the Capitol complex or who
liave access to sensilive or critical information to submit to a fingerprint-based state and
federal background inquiry through the state repository.

After the contract for such services hag been approved, but before any such employces
arc permitted to be on the grounds or in the buildings of the Capitol complex or have
access to sensitive or critical information, the service provider shall submit a list of all
persons who will be physically present and working at the Capitol complex to the
Director of the Division of Protective Setvices for purposes of verifying compliance with
this provision,

The State reserves the right to prohibit a service provider’s employces from accessing
sensitive or critical information or to be present at the Capitol complex based upon results
addressed from a eriminal background check.

2. SUBCONTRACTOR LIST SUBMISSION: In accordance with W, Va, Code § 5-22-
1, The apparent low bidder on a contract for the construction, alteration, decoration,
painting or improvement of a new ot existing building or structure valued at more than
$500,000.00 shall submit a list of all subcontractors wha will perform more than
$25,000.00 of work on the project including labor and materials, This provision shall not
apply to any other construction projects, such as highway, mine reclamation, watet ot
sewer projects.

a. Required Information. The subcontractor list shall contain the following
information:

I. Bidder’s name
T1. Name of each subcontractor
11T. License numbers as required by W. Va, Code § 21-11-1 et, seq.




iv. Notation that no subcontractors will be used if the bidder will perform the
work

b, Submission. The completed subcontractor list shall be provided to the
Purchasing Division within one business day of the opening of bids for review.
Failue to submit the subcontractor Jist within one business day after the deadline
for submitting bids shall result in disqualification of the bid.

¢, Substifution of Subcontractor. Written approval must be obtained from the
Purchasing Division before any subcontractor substitution is permitted.
Substitutions are not permitted unless:

I.  The subcontractor listed in the original bid has filed for bankruptcy;
II.  The subcontractor in the oviginal bid has been debarred or suspended; or
ITI. . The confractor certifies in wriling that the subcontractor listed in the
original bill fails, is unable, oy refuses to perform his subcontract.

3. GREEN BUILDINGS MINIMUM ENERGY STANDARDS: In accordance with §

92-29-4, all new building construction projects of public agencies that have not entered
(he schematic design phase prior to July 1, 2012, or any building construction project
receiving state grant fands and appropriations, including public schools, that have not
entered the sohematic design phase prior to July 1, 2012, shall be designed and
constructed complying with the ICC International Energy Conservation Code, adopted by
the State Dire Commission, and the ANSI/ASHRAE/IESNA Standard 90.1-2007:
Provided, That if any construction project has a commitment of federal funds to pay for a
portion of such project, this provision shall only apply (o the extent such standards are
consistent with the federal standards.



RFQ COPY

State of West Virginla
Department of Administration
Purchasing Divislon

2019 Washinglon Slreet East
Post Office Box 50130
Chatleston, WV 25305-0130

TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

*709044732 304-768-9733

West Virginia Paving, Inc.
PO Box 544 .
Dunbar, WV 25064

Solicitation [ s:NUMBER . W
' 6612029
7. _ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TOATTENTION OF: o

ItLAN CUMMINGS
304-558-2402 ]

| DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
| VARTOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

00l

e Ly

IN
1

-

SYUED TO CORRECT [RFQ
PDENDUM NO. |1 TO |READ

HIG OPENING HATE

INTER GRADE |BITUMINOUS

Axxwx% THIS |[IS THE ENL

D RY

e
A

pOM NO. 2

UMBER ON PAGE 2 |OF
6612C029

MAINS 06/27/12 @1:30 P.M.

45-67

PATCHING

OF RFQ 6612C(29 *¥**** TOTAL:

e N

SIGHATURE

AT

June 27, 2012

e

v

Vice Presidont "M e5.057570769

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO SOLICITATION, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED VENDOR'



Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

1 *709044732 304-768-9733
WV PAVING INC
PO BOX 544

DUNBAR WV 25064

DATE PRINTED

State of West Virginia Solicitation HUMOER il

6612C029 1
ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

ALAN CUMMINGS
B04-558-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

C— T—=In

0R/26/2012
S0P ENING DATE: 07/11/2012 , BID_OPENING TIME 01:30BM
LINE QUANTITY uar ti’jg ITEM NUKMBER UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

001

POCUMENTATTION .

1

ADDENDUM NO. 03

[SSUED TO DISTRIBUTE INFORMATION PER THE ATTACHED

TN 745-67

WINTER GRADE|BITUMINOUS PATCHING

Fkkxk% THIS| IS THE END OF RFQ 6612C0H29 ***%%x% TQOTAL:

:“%%Lﬂ JM 0

TELEFHONE

UATE
304-768-9733 07/11/2012

TITLE

Vice President FEN  55.057570769

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO SOLICITATION, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




SOLICITATION NUMBER: 6612C029
Addendum Number: 3

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as 6612C029
(“Solicitation™) to reflect the change(s) identified and described below.

Applicable Addendum Category:

[ x] Modify bid opening date and time

[ ] Modify specifications of product or service being sought

[ ] Attachment of vendor questions and responses

[ ] Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet

[ x] Correction of error

[ ] Other
Description of Modification to Solicitation: Issued to distribute addendum acknowledgement
form and move bid opening date and time from 06/27/2012 at 1:30 P.M. to 07/11/2012 at 1:30
P.M.

Additional Documentation: Documentation related to this Addendum (if any) has been
included herewith as Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference.

Terms and Conditions:

1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in
full force and effect.

2, Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by
completing an Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. The addendum
acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

Revised 6/8/2012



ATTACHMENT A

Revised 6/8/2012



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.:6612C029

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Aclknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

Vi /4 [ ){_] Addendum No. 1 [ ] Addendum No. 6
(2 [X] Addendum No. 2 [ 1 Addendum No.7
@R) [\[] Addendum No. 3 [ ] Addendum No.8
[ ] Addendum No. 4 [ ] Addendum No. 9

[ ] Addendum No.5 [ ] Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. I
further understand that that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

West Virginia Paving, Inc.

Company

VALY D

Authorized Signature

July 11, 2012
Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.
Revised 6/8/2012
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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MMDDIYYYY)
6/27/2012

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

cortiflcate holder In lleu of such endorsement(s).

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder Is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(les) must be endorsad. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
the terms and condItlons of the policy, certaln policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the

PRODUCER
Mountain State Insurance Agency
1206 Kanawha Blvd. E,

HAMEACT annette Dearth

FHONE o (304)720-2000 FRAX | oy (304) 720-2002

ibess. adearth@mountainstateinsurance.con

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #

Charleston WV 25301 NSURERA BrickStreet Insurance

INSURED INSURERB ¢

West Virginia Paving, Inc. | INSURERC :

2950 Charles Ave. IHSURERD :

P.0O. Box 544 INSURERE :

Dunbar Wwv 25064 INSURERF :

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER:CL1262709218 REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO GERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY GONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

NSR ADDLISUBR POLICY EFF | POLICY EXP
LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE INSR WD POLICY NUMBER (MRYDDIYYYY) | (MAVDDIYYYY) LIMITS
GENERAL LIABILITY EACH occURRgEFNCE 3
= DANAGE TO REFTED
COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY PREMISES (Ea cecurrence) s
CLAIMS-MADE D OCCUR MED EXP (Any ona person) s
PERSOMAL & ADVINJURY | 8
GENERAL AGGREGATE $
GENL AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: PRODUGTS - COMPIOP AGG | $
PRO- s
POLICY JECT LCG i
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY C%"ﬁ?]c}'é%? SINGLE LIMIT <
| anvauro BODILY INJURY (Perperson) | §
ALL OWNED SCHEDULED idan!
| autos AUTOS BODILY INJURY (Per accident)| &
NON-OWNED FROPERTY DAMAGE s
HIRED AUTOS AUTOS {Per accident)
$
UMBRELLA LIAB OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE $
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $
DED | 1 RETENTION $ e - 5
A | WORKERS COMPENSATION WG STATU- -
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY vIN TORY LIMITS ER
grg PROPFEJFORJPARTNEWEXECUTNE NIA E.L EACH ACCIDENT § 1,000,000
ICERMENBER EXCLUDED?
{Mandatory In NH) HCB1005725 7/1/2012  [1/1/2013 | g\ piSEASE - EA EMPLOYES $§ 1,000,000
If yes, descrice under
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E L. DISEASE - POUICY LIMIT | $ 1,000,000

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VERICLES (Attach ACORD 101, Addilional Remarks Schedule, If more space Is required)

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

WVDOT-Division of Highways
1900 Kanawha Blvd. East
Building 5, room A737
Charleston, WV 25305

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLIGY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

Annette Dearth/ANNE Lvmiie . fhat=he

ACORD 25 (2010/05)
INSD25 roninasy 04

©1988-2010 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

Tha ACORN nama and lann ara ranietarard marke nf ACNRD




Certificate of Insurance

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON YOU THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS CERTIFICATE IS NOT AN
INSURANCE POLICY AND DOES NOT AMEND, EXTEND, OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES LISTED BELOW. POLICY LIMITS ARE NO LESS THAN THOSE
LISTED, ALTHOUGH POLICIES MAY INCLUDE ADDITIONAL SUBLIMIT/LIMITS NOT LISTED BELOW.

This is to Certify that

West Virginia Paving, Inc. _|

PO Box 544 NAME AND
2950 Charles Ave. ADDRESS
Dunbar, WV 25064 OF INSURED

|

is, at the issue date of this certificate, insured by the Company under the policy(ies) listed below. The insurance afforded by the listed poliuy{ies& is subject to all their terms, exclusions and

Conditions and is not altered by any requirement, term or condition of any contract or other document with respect to which this certificate may be issued.
EXP DATE
CONTINUOUS
TYPE OF POLICY 0 POLICY NUMBER LIMIT OF LTIABILITY
EXTENDED
E POLICY TERM
) WA7-C8D-004095-021 COVERAGE AFFORDED UNDER WC e ;
WORKERS 9/1/2012 LAW OF THE FOLLOWING STATES: EMFLOYERS LIADILITY
COMPENSATION WV Employers Liability Coverage [gogily Injury by Accident
Only $7, 000,000 esch aceies
Bodily Injury By Disease
$1,000,000 popicy Limit
Bodily Injury By Disease
$1 .000.000 Fach Person]
COMMERCIAL 912012 | TB2-C81-004095-111 General Aggregate
GENERAL LIABILITY $2,000,000
[Z OCCURRENCE Products / Completed Operations Aggregate
$2,000,000
D CLAIMS MADE Each Occurrence
$2,000,000
RETRO DATE Personal & Advertising Injury
$2'000|000 Per Person / Organization
Othg Oth
Bfe Damage $100,000 her
Per Project Aggregate
AUTOMOBILE Each Accident—Single Limit
UIEMORI 9/1/2012 | AS2-C81-004095-121 $2,000,000 b1 nd P, Combined
Each Person
|Z| OWNED
[ nox-ownED Each Accident or Occurrence
m HIRED Each Accident or Occurrence
OTHER Auto Comp Ded $10,000/Coll Ded $10,000
ADDITIONAL COMNMENTS
2012 Cold Mix Purchase Orders Counties: Various

* If the certificate expiration date is continuous or extended term, you will be notified if coverage is terminated or reduced before the certificate expiration date.

Liberty Mutual
NOTICE OF CANCELLATION; (NOT APPLICABLE UNLESS A NUMBER OF DAYS IS ENTERED BELOW.) Insurance Group
BEFORE THE STATED EXPIRATION DATE THE COMPANY WILL NOT CANCEL OR REDUCE THE
INSURANCE AFFORDED UNDER THE ABOVE POLICIES UNTIL AT LEAST 30 DAYS NOTICE

OF SUCH CANCELLATION HAS BEEN MAILED TO:
B o T ot L ele
WVDOT-Division of Highways Mark A. Truelove

1900 Kanawha Blvd. East AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

i 112 Brent Way
Building 5, Room A737 ; o,
Charleston, WV 25305 Hurricane, WV 25526  8688-222-8800  06/26/2012

| | OFFICE PHONE DATE ISSUED

This certificate is executed by LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE GROUP as respects such insurance as is afforded by those Companies NM 772 07-10
LDI COI 268896 02 11

Certificate
Holder
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WEST VIRGINIA
CONTRACTOR
LICENSING
BOARD
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CONTRACTOR LICENSE

West Virginia Contractor Licensing Board

Number: {IV001429
Classification:

GEMERAL ENGINEERING

WEST VIRGINIA PAVING TINC
DBA WEST VIRGINIA PAVING INC
PO BOX 544

DUNBAR, WV 25064-0544

Date [ssued Fxpiration Date
AUGUST 15, 2011 AUGUST 15, 2012

> ffons Midkoot A, ol

Authorized Company Signature Chair, West Virginia Contractor
Licensing Board

‘Thls license, or a copy thereof, must be posted in a consplenous place at every construction site where work ks being
performed., This license number must appear in all advertisenents, on all bid submisstons and on all fully executed
and binding contracts, This license cannot be assigned or transfevred by licensee, Issued under provisions of West
Virginin Cade, Chapter 21, Avticle 11,

. e
Al




FRew: OIE State of West Virginia =
VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application* Is hereby mada for Preference In accordance with West Virginia Codo, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply lo
construction conlracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunlly for qualifyling vendors to raquest (al the lime of bid)
preference for their residency stalus. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid In
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This cerlificate farapplication s to be used lo request such preference. The Purchasing
Divislon will make the determinationof the Resldent Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application Is mado for 2.6% resident vendor preference for the reason checked!

Bidder Is an Individual resident vendor and has resided continuously InWest Virginia for four (4) years immeciately preced-
Ing the date of this certification; ot}

Bidder Is a parinership, assoclation or corporalion resident vendor and has maintained ils headquarters or principal place of
business continuously n Wast Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the dale of this certification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Bldder is held by another individual, parinership, assoctation or corporation resident vendor whohas
malntained its headquarters or principal place of bisiness continuously In Wesl Virginta for four (4) years Immediately
preceding the date of this cerlification; of,

Bldderis a nonresidentvendor which has an affiliate or subsldiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has malntained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this cerlificalion; of,

2 Application ls macle for 2,6% residont vendar preference for the roason checked:

Bidder Is a resident vendor who cettifies that, durlng the life of the conlract, on average at least 76% of the employees
working oh the project being bid are resldents of West Virginia who have reslded In the state continuously forthe two years
mmedlately preceding submission of this bid; of,

Application ls made for 2.6% residant vendor preforenco for tho reason chacked:

Bidder Is a nonrasident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents oris a nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintalns ils headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginla employing @
minimum of one hundred slate residents who cerlifies (hat, during the life of the contract, on average at least 76% of the
employees or Bldder's affillate’s or subsidiary's employees are residents of West Virginia whio have resided In the stale

continuously for the lwo yoears immediately preceding submission of his bld; or

4. Application is made for §% resident vendor preference for the reasorn chacked:
_X_ Bldder meets elther the requirement of hoth subdivistons (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; o,

G. Application s mado for 3.6% resident vondar proferenco who {s a veteran for the roason checked:

Bidderis an Individual resident vendor whols aveleran of the United Slates armed forces, the resenves of the National Guard
and has reslded In Wesl Virginia continuously for the four yoars immediately precading the dale on which the bld is
submilled; oF,

6. Application s made for 3.8% resldent vendor proference who Is a vetoran for the reasot checked:

Bldder ls a resldent vendor who Isa veleran of lhe Unlted States armed forces, theresaves ar the Nalional Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commoditles or compleling the project which 15 the subjectof the yendor's bld and
continuously over the entire lerm of the project, on average al loast sevenly-five percent of the vandor's employees are
residents of Wost Virgintawho have rosided in the slate continuously for the lwo immediatoly precading years.

Bidcler understands If the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder recelving preference has failed to continue to mesat the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order (he Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; of (b) assess a panalty
against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 6% of the bld amount and that such penally will be pald to the contracling agency
or deducted fromany unpaid balance on fie contract or purchase order.

By submigslon of this certificate, Bldder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
aulhorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate Information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business laxes, provided that such Information does not contain the amounts of taxes pald nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissloner to bo confidentlal,

Undor penalty of law for falso swearing (West Virginla Codo, §61-5-3), Bldder herehy certifies thatthis certificate is true
and accurate In all respects; and that If a contract is Issuad to Bldder and if anything contalned within thls certlficate
changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Divislot In writing immediately.

—

&

Bliddet: West Virginia Paving, Inc. Signed: w WY
Date: June 27, 2012 _ Title: Vice President ___ . .

'Clieck any combination of preference consideration(s) indicalod above, which you are entilled lo recoiva.
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RFQ No, _ 6612C029 *

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

Waest Virginla Code §5A-3-10a states: No confract or ronewal of any contract may.be awarded by the slate or any of its
political subdlivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospactive vendor or a refated parly lo the
vendor or prospective vendor Is a debtor and the debt owed Is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the
aggregale.

DEFINITIONS:

*Debt" means .any assessment, premium, ponally, fine, tax or otlier amount of money owad to the state or any of lts
polllical subdivislons hacause of a judgment, fine, permit violatlon, llconse assossmant, dofaultad workers' compensalion
premium, penally or other assessiment presently dellnguent or due and required to be pald to the state or any. of It
polilfeal subdivislons, Including any Intarast or additional panaltles accrued fhereon.

“Debtor* means any Individual, corporation, parinership, assoctallon, limited labllity comrany or any olher form or
business assoclallon owing a dabt to tho state ar any of lts polltical subdivisions, “Polltical subdivislon® means any counly
comdlsslon; municipality; counly board of aducalion; any Instrumentallty oslabllshed by a counly or munlclpality; any
separato corporallon or instrumentalily established by ono or more countles or municipalllies, as permilted by lav; or any
publlo body charged by law with the performanco of a govaramont function or whose Jursdiotion ls coextensiva with ono
or more counlles or munlelpalities. “Related parly® means a paity, whother an Individual, corporaflon, partnership,
assoolatlon, limited llabllity company or any other form or buslness assoclatlon or other onllly whatsoover, related to any
vendor by blood, mariiage, ownership or contract through vich the party has a rolallonship-of ownership or othar Interost
with tho vendor so {hat the parly will aclually or by offect racelvo or controt & portlon of (ho benefit, profit or olher
conslderatlon from porformance of a vandor conlract with the party recelving an amount that meols or excaed {iva percant
of tive total contract atount.

EXGEPTION: The prohibition of this sectlon does not apply whare a vendor has cantasted any tax administered pursuant
fo chapter eleven of this code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or anvironmental fee or assessment and the
malter has not become final or where the vandor has entered Into a payment plan or agreement and {ho vendor Is not In
default of any of the provislons of stch plan or agreemont,

Under panaity of lew for false swearing (West Virglnla Code §61-5-3), It Is heraby cerlified that the vendor affirms and
acknowledges the Inforration In this affidavit and [s In compliance with the requirements as stated.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE
\ ] .
\endor's Name: West Virginia Paving, Inc.

7
Authorlzed Slgnature: ﬁ;&f% Date;  June 27, 2012 B

State of West Virginia

Gounly of Kanawha , to-wit:

Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this A7/ 8ay of EEJ {anrd 2002

My Commission expires 5’/ 0-260/ &l L 20 & .

| ) ﬁ/[/ Y/ ﬂiﬂ«(}/
AFFIX SEAL HERE NOTARY PUBLIC ' . / .

somstes L

Purchasing Affldavit (Revisad 12/1509)




