State of West Virginia
Depariment of Administration
Purchasing Division

Post Office Box 501230
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

 RFQ COPY
‘TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

. Central Salt LLC :
‘385 Airport Rd., Suite 108
Elgin, IL 60123

2019 Washington Street East

Request for prm=ma = RO
Quotation 6611(:026 1

BUYER 33
306-558-2602

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIQUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

06/05/2011

BID OPENING DATE:

06/29/2011

BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM

0001

ROAD MAINTENANCE [SALT

775-45

In MANDATORY PRE~BID WI

10:00 A.M. ,
256305, ALL INTERESTED

THEIR E-MAIL|{ ADDRESS Al

ALL POTENTIAL BIDDERS

[THE STARTING| TIME| FOR

LATE, BUT PRIOR T THE|

- PORTION OF THE PRE-BID

BIDDERS WHQ RRIVE AFT

POTENTIAL BIDDERS| TO.COMPLETE.
VUFFICIAL DOCUMENT| VERIFYING ATTENDANCE
TO PROVIDE YOUR COMPANY, AND
' REPRESENTATI‘E NAME ON THE. ATTENDANCE [SHEET WILL RESULT
IN DISQUALIFICATION OF THE BID. .
:ACCEPT ANY OTHER DOCUMENTATION TO VERIFY ATTENDANCE.
ONSIBLE FOR ENSURING| THEY HAVE-
CDMPLETED THE INFORMATIION REQUIRED ON [THE ATTENDANCE™
, .. SING/ DIVISION AND THE STATE AGENCY
MWILL NOT .ASSUME ANY RESPONSIBILITY FOR| A BIDDER-S
FAILURE TO COMPLETE THE PRE-BID ATTENDANCE SHEET. IN
ADDITION, WE| REQUEST THAT ALL POTENTIAL BIDDERS INCLUDE
D FAX NUMBER. .

AN ATTENDANCEASHEET,WILL BE 'MADE AVAI;FBLE FOR ALL
I

ATORY PRE~BID k
LBE HELD ON JUNE 15, 2011,
INTON STREET E,| CHARLESTON, WV
ARTIES ARE REQUIRED TO

AILURE TO ATTEND THE MANDATORY
. ESULT IN THE- DIE

THE BID.. NO| ONE PERSON MAY REPRESENT

QUALIFICATION OF
ORE THAN ONE

LL SERVE AS THE
AT THE MANDATORY

THIS |

THE STATE -WILL NOT . .

ARE REQUESTED TO| ARRIVE PRIOR TO | *© YRR
THE PRE-BID. BIDDERS WHO ARRIVE L o #
DISMISSAL OF THE TECHNICAL
WILL BE PERMITTED 7O SIGN IN. ! 7423 A o
ER CONCLUSION OF| THE TECHNICAL o

Y] .

[SiBNATURE

ELEPHONE DATE
’ 847 608-8130 r4L6/21/2011

M General Maﬁgg

FEIN

43-1788697

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHKEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



State of West Virginia - Request for ==
Department of Administration  Quotation
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East

Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

304-558-2402

3 RFQ COPY
TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

Central Salt LLC
385 Airport Rd., Suite 108]
Elgin, IL 60123

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER '

06/05/3011
‘BID OPENING DATE:

ID OPEN

PORTION OF THE PRE-BIDj, BUT DURING ANY| SUBSEQUENT PART
OF THE PRE-BID WILL NOT BE PERMITTED T SIGN THE
ATTENDANCE SHEET.

QUESTIONS: WRITTEN QUESTIONS. WILL BE ACCEPTED THROUGH
THE CLOSE OF BUSINESS [(5:00 PM EST) ON| TUESDAY, JUNE-
21, 2011.. : : :

PURCHASING DIVISICN
ATTENTION: PAUL REYNOLDS

201{9 WASHINGTON STREET EAST
CHAﬁLESTUN, WV 25308 -

SEND QUESTIONS TO

L1

QUESTIONS MAY BE [SENT VIA FAX; E-MAIL,  OR REGULAR MAIL:
E-MAZIL: PAUL .REYNOLDSaWv. OV
{1 FAX: : 304 558 4115

3 IT IS THE VENDOR'S RES ONSIBILITY TO VERIFY. THAT THEIR
' |QUESTIONS HAVE BEEN REKCEIVED BY CALLING 304-558-0468.

EXHIBIT 2

RACT:| THIS CONTRACT BECOMES EFFECTIVE
ND EXTENDIS FOR A -PERIOD OF ONE- (1)
SUCH "REASONABLE TIME™ THEREAFTER AS IS
OBTAIN A NEW CONTRACT OR RENEW THE

THE *"REASONABLE TIME' PERIOD SHALL
(12)] MONTHS. DURING| THIS "REASONABLE
ERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR
THE DIRECTOR OF| PURCHASING
EN NOTICE.

LIFE OF CONT]
UPON AWARD,
YEAR OR UNTI

TIME™ THE VE
ANY REASON U
THIRTY (30)

10NS ARE STIPULATED IN THIS
TERMS, CONDITIONS, AND PRICING
THE LIFE OF THE CONTRACT.

oo S e i 6/21/2011
FEN  43-1788697 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
(WHENRESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED VENDOR'




TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

Central Salt LLC
385 Adirport Rd., Suite 108
Elgin, IL 60123

State of West Virginia Request for
Department of Administration Quotation
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East

Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 I§UYE§5:324 -
04 - -

RFG COPY
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

06/05/2011 T i I

NING TIME _ 01:

30PH

BID OPENING DATE: 06/29/2011 BID

RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACIT MAY BE RENEWED| UPON THE MUTUAL
WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE| SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR,
SUBMITTED TO THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (302
DAYS PRIOR TP THE} EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL
BE IN ACCORDANCE MITH [THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE
ORIGINAL CONTRACT|] AND [SHALL BE LIMITED| TO TWO (2) ONE

ANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE
RIGHT TO CANCEL - THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN
NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICE
SUPPLIED ARE! OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR| DO NOT CONFORM

ITH THE SPECIFI TIONE OF THE BID AND| CONTRACT HEREIN.

OPEN MARKET (CLAUSE: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING MAY
AUTHORIZE A SPENDING UNIT TO PURCHASE ON THE OPEN
ARKET, WITHOUT. THE FIJLING OF A REQUIS[ITION OR COST
ESTIMATE, ITEMS SPECIFIED ON THIS CONTRACT FOR IMME-
DIATE DELIVERY IN EMERGENCIES DUE TO UNFORESEEN CAUSES
CINCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO DELAYS IN TRANSPORTATION
OR AN UNANTICIPATED INCREASE IN THE VOLUME OF WORK).

QUANTITIES: | QUANTITIES LISTED IN THE REQUISITION ARE
APPROXIMATIONS ONLY, BASED ON ESTIMATES SUPPLIES BY THE
STATE SPENDING UNIT. |[IT IS UNDERSTOOD; AND AGREED THAT
HE CONTRACT| SHAL|L COVER THE QUANTITIES ACTUALLY
ORDERED FOR DELIVEERY DURING THE TERM OF CONTRACT,
WHETHER MORE| OR LIESS THAN THE QUANTITIES SHOUN.

ORDERING PROCEDURE: SPENDING UNIT(S) [SHALL ISSUE A
MRITTEN EQUIPMENT] CONTRACT ORDER (FORM| NUMBER WV-35)
FOR COMMODITJIES COVERED BY THIS CONTRACT. THE ORIGINAL
IV-35 MUST BE SENT TO [THE PURCHASING DIVISIOCN
OF THE DEPAR[TMENT| OF
AND ENCUMBRANCE, KONE (]

TELEPHONE

847 608-8130

6/21/2011

5
LE
[i, Gene

S
rgl-flanager FEN 43-1788697

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

C/WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




Elgin,

State of West Virginia
Deparment of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

RFQ COPY
TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

Central Salt LLC
385 Airport Rd., Suite 108

IL 60123

Request for
Quotation

BUYER 33
2046-5R8-2602

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIODUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

06/o§/éb11

BID GPENING DATE:

BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM

FOR

REV.
EXHI

ND
IRG

E RETURNED [TO THE SPE
ARDED TO THE VENDOR Ak
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Y THE PURCHASING DIVI

ANKRUPTCY: | IN. THE EV
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ITHOUT FUTHER ORPDER.

LOCAL GOVERNMENT [BODIE|
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ND CONDITIONS OF| THE
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GLITICAL SUBDIVI
LEARLY INDICATE
HALL NOT PREJUDICE TH
ANNER. :

" REV. :

o A

BANKRUPTCY PROTECT,

572009.

BIT 4

{BID TO COUNTY, SICHOOL, MUNICIPAL

S AUTHORIZATION FOR SHIPMENT.

ﬁDING UNIT AND ONE COPY FOR-
NCUMBERED
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ENT THE:VENDOR/CENTRACTDR FILES
ION, THE STATE MAY DEEM THE
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0 POLITICAL] SUBDIVISIONS OF THE STATE| OF WEST
INIA. 1IfF THE| VENDOR DOES NOT WISELTO EXTEND THE

3/88 entliities,
NOT

f SIGNED BID MUST| BE SUBMITTED TO:

F ADM

TERMS, AND CONDITIONS OF THE
SIONS! OF THE STATE, T,
SUCH REFUSAL IN HIS B

Centfral Sallt wilf

INISTRATION

ENT BODIES, THE| BID SHALL EXTEN

1D TO ALL -
E VENDOR :MUST
ID. SUCH REFUSAL
AWARD OF THIS CONTRACT IN ANY

1 not extend pricing to other local govelrnment

ICE

R
SIANATURE

DATE

6/21/2011

TLE '
Geneggl/ﬁén

FEN 43-1788697

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

CWHEN RESPONDING TORFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




State of West Virginia Request for
Department of Administration Quotation
Purchasing Division

20192 Washington Sireet East

Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Z06-558-2602

RFQ COPY
TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

Central Salt LLC
385 Airport Rd., Suite 108
Elgin, IL 60123

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

06/d5/2011
BID OPENING DATE: 06/29/

2011

THE BID SHOULD CONTAIN THXIS INFORMATION ON THE FACE OF
THE ENVELOPE OR THE BID MAY NOT BE CONSIDERED: .

SEALED BID
BUYER : PAUL REYNOLDS - FILE 33
REQ NO 6611c02l6

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 29, 2011

BID OPENING [TIME: 1:30 PM

PLEASE PROVIDE A FAX NUMBER IN CASE IT| IS NECESSARY
TO CONTACT YOU REGARDING YOUR BID:

847 608-8135

L | R L R Y L e A R TS LR B BT R T

CONTACT PERSON (PREASE PRINT CLEARLY):
Jude Parazo

B EONDITIONSE R
TELEPHONE DATE

847 608-8130 6/21/2011
FEN 431788607 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

C—wWHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'
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- 12. BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chioride 66-11-C026
Defivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 1 _ ' _
: ' _Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site | Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Boone Clinton @ WV85 TON - 850 No Bid No Bid
Boone Rock Creek TON 1300 No Bid No Bid
Boone - [Seth TON 850 No Bid No Bid
Clay - [Widen Road &(_)R 11 TON 1350 No Bid No Bid
Clay Maysel TON 450 No Bid  |No Bid
Kanawha Chelyah TON 2100 No Bid No Bid
Kanawha _|Elkview | o TON 1850 No Bid No Bid
Kanawha _[North Charleston TON 2500 ‘No Bid No Bid .
Kanawha |[St. Albans TON 2100 No Bid No Bid
Kanawha |64 @ Scary Creek , " TON 2100 No Bid No Bid
Kanawha |I-64 @ Rt. 119 and Penn. Avenue TON 1700 No Bid No Bid
Kanawha_[I-77 @ Sissonville TON 1350 | No Bid | No Bid
‘tKanawha |I-79 @ Amma TON 1700 No Bid No Bid
_[Kanawha ICorridor G @ Alum Creek _TON 1700 No Bid No Bid
: .Mason, Pt. Pleasant TON 3000 No Bid No bid
Putnam |Red House TON 1300 . No Bid | No Bid
Putnam __[Hurricane @ Rt. 34 TON_ 1700 No Bid No Bid
|Putnam__[US 35 | TON 2100 [ No Bia | Ne Bid

The “Bid Schedule” is available for download on Purchasing’s Web site at

NOTE: Bid Schedule should be typed.

www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase




12. BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chioride 66-11-C026
Delivery: F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICT 2 _

Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons|{ Per Ton Cost
[Cabell __ |Barboursville TON 2500 No Bid No Bid
Cabell __]I-64 @ Huntington TON 1350 No Bid No Bid
Lincoln  .|West Hamlin TON 1550 No Bid No Bid
[Gncoln__ [Yawkey TON 1000 | No Bid No Bid
|Lincoln  {Harts | TON 850 No Bid No Bid

Logan Chapmanville _ TON 0 No Bid No Bid
| Logan Cotridor G @ Chapmanville TON 1800 No Bid No™ Bid
|Logan  [Wilkinson TON 1800 No Bid No Bid
| Logan -Mé_n o TON 1300 No Bid No Bid
Mingo Corridor G @ Miller's Creek TON 1650 No Bid No Bid
Mingo Mingo County @Miller's Creek TON 1800 No Bid No Bid
Mingo  |Gilbert TON | 700 Yo Bid Vo Fid
Wayne Pritchard TON 2150 No Bid No Bid
Wayne : Wayne TON 2150 No Bid No Bid
‘ Wayne __ [Crum - TON 1400 No Bid No Bid
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12. BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chioride 66-11-C026
Delivery: F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT3 . . ,
| Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | _Per Ton Cost

Calhoun  {Millstone TON 1450 No Bid . |No Bid
Jackson |Ripley TON 2850 No Bid No Bid
Jackson |I-77 @ Medina TON 1450 No Bid No Bid
Pleasants |Belmont TON 1900 | No Bid _ [No Bid
Ritchie APD Pennsboro TON 2350 [ No Bid No Bid
Ritchie  |Ellenboro TON 28580 No Bid No Bid
Ritchie _ |Corridor D @ Nutter Farm TON 750 No Bid No Bid
Ritchie Smithville TON 250 No Bid No Bid
Roane  |Lefthand @ WV 36 TON 700 No Bid No Bid
Roane  |Amber Hill @ US 119 TON 350 No Bid No Bid
Roane S_pencer TON - 1450 No Bid No Bid
Wirt Efizabeth TON 1450 No Bid No Bid
Wood Parkersburg @ Rt. 95S TON 4300 No Bid No Bid
Wood __]I-77 @ Parkersburg TON 1450 o Bid . o Bid
Wood __[Corridor D @ Riverhil TON 1450 [No Bid [N Bid




BID SCHEDULE-Sodium Chloride

66-11-C026

13

12.
Delivery: F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 4 . ‘
. Unitof | Esfimated | UnitCost | Extended
County _ Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton ~ Cost
Doddridge  |Smithburg TON 1700 No Bid No Bid
Hartison Gore TON 4700 No Bid No BId
Harrison  [Saftwell TON 0 No Bid No Bid
Harison 79 @ Lost Creek TON 2800 | No Bid __ |No Bid
[Harrison _ [APD 50 @ Tunnel Hil TON 2300 No Bid No Bid
Marion Fairmont TON 2000 No Bid No Bid
Marion Mannington TON 1100 No Bid No Bid
M_ono_ngaiia I-79 @ Goshen Road TON 2500 No Bid No Bid
Mohongaﬁa {Ridgedale TON 4200 No Bid No Bid
Monongalia_ |Pentress TON . 950 No Bid No Bid
Preston .- |Bruceton Mill TON 4200 | No Bid | No Bid
Preston Albright TON 2100 No Bid No Bid
Preston Bruceton TON 0 No Bid No Bid
Preston Terra Alta . TON 1100 No Bid No bid
Preston Fellowsville TON 1300 No Bid No Bid
Preston |Aurora TON 1400 No Bid No Bid
Preston = {I-68 @ Copper's Rock TON 3300 No Bid No Bid
Taylor Fetterman/Prunytown TON 2350 No Bid No Bid




© 66-11-0026
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12. BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chloride
Delivery. F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT

| Unit of Estimated | UnitCost | Extended

County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons { Per Ton Cost
Berkeley ~Tis1 @ Martinsburg TON 2750 No Bid No Bid
Berkely I-81 @ Exit 12 TON 700 No Bid No Bid
Grant Petersburg TON . 900 No Bid No Bid
Grant ML, Storm TON 1800 No Bid | Yo Bid
Grant Corfidor H @ Knobley Road TON 2750 No Bid No Bid
Hampshire |Romney TON 1260 No Bid No Bid
Hampshire |Capon Bridge TON 1100 No Bid No Bid
Hampshire {Slanesville TON 600 No Bid No Bid
Hardy Moorefield TON 1350 | No Bid No Bid
Hardy Baker TON 1800 | No Bid | No Bid
Jefferson  |Charles Town TON - 1800 No Bid No Bid
Jefferson _ |Charles Town -~ New Shed TON 2300 No Bid No Bid
Mineral New Creek TON 800 No Bid No Bid
Mineral  |Sky Line . TON 800 No Bid No Bid
Mineral _ [Short Gap TON 550 No Bid | No Bid
Mineral District Headquarters TON 450 No Bid - |{No Bid
Morgan - |Berkeley Springs TON 1000 No Bid No Bid
Morgan Largent - TON 300 No Bid No Bid




66-11-C026

15

12. BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chioride
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Stdrage Site
DISTRICT 6 .
Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site | Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Brooke  |Wellsburg TON 2500 $73.25 $183,125.00
Brooke _ |Weirton TON 2500 §73.25  |$183,125.00
Hancock {New Manchester TON 2500 $73.25 $183,125.00
Marshall  {Glen Dale TON- 3500 $75.25 $263,375.00
Marshal_|Cameron TON 1500 $75.25_ |$112,875.00
Ohio Triadelphia TON 3000 $73.25 $219,750.00
Ohio -70 @ Triadelphia TON 2500 $73.25 £183,125.00
Tyler Sistersville TON 2000 No Bid No Bid
Tyler Centerville TON 1200 No Bid No Bid
Tyler Sistersville Old Headquarters TON 800 No Bid No Bid
Wetzel New Martinsville TON 2000 No Bid No Bid
Wetzel Pine Grove TON 1,000 No Bid No Bid
Wetzel  |Hundred TON 1200 No Bid  |No Bid




66-11-C026
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12. BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chioride
Delivery: F.O0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 7
| ~ Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended

~ County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Barbour _|Phillipi TON 2500 o mig Lae min
Barbour  iBelington TON 2000 No Bid No Bid
Braxion  |Gassaway TON 2000 No Bid  |No Bid
Braxion __|Heaters TON 1400 No Bid | No Bid
Braxton  {I-79 @ Coon Knob TON 2400 No Bid No Bid
Braxton  |I-79 @ Bumsyville TON - 2500 No Bid No Bid
Gilmer Glenville TON 2200 No Bid No Bid
Lewis - [Weston (Ben Dale) TON 2700 No Bid _ |No Bid
Lewis Corridor H @ Mudlick TON 1400 No Bid No Bid
Upshur __ |Clow Lot @ Buckhannon TON 3500 No Bid | No Bid
Upshur  |Tennerton TON 200 No Bid No Bid
Upshur  |Kanawha Head TON 900 No Bid No Bid
Webster  |Cherry Falls TON 1400 No Bid No Bid

. |Webster  |Cowen TON 1100 No Bid No Bid
Webster  [Hacker Valley TON 700 No Bid | No Bid
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12. BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chioride © 66-11-C026
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 8
Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended

County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Pendleton  [Franklin TON 1000 No Bid No Bid
Pendleton  |Judy Gap TON 600 No Bid No Bid
Pendleton  |Brandywine TON 400 No Bid No Bid
Pendieton - {Onego TON 350 No Bid No Bid
Pendleton  |Franklin, 220 South TON 300 No Bid No Bid
Pocahontas _|Marlinton TON 800 No Bid No Bid
Pocahontas [Seshert TON 700 No Bid No Bid
Pocahontas {Greenbank TON 500 No Bid No Bid
Pocahontas |Bartow (Thornwood) TON 600 No Bid No Bid
Pocahontas {Snowshoe TON 300 No Bid No Bid
Pocahontas [Slaty Fork TON 700 No Bid No Bid
Rendolph __|Elkins TON 3000 I¥o Bid__ | No Bid
' Randolphl Harman TON 1500 No Bid No Bid
Randolph  |Coalton TON 1500 No Bid No Bid
Randolph _|Valley Head TON 1000 |No Bid_ |No pid
Randolph  [Mill Creek TON 1500 No Bid No Bid
Randolph  [Pickens TON 600 No Bid ‘No Bid
Randolph  |Corridor H Lot @ Elkins TON 2500 | No Bid No Bid
Tucker Parsons TON - 1500 {No Bid No Bid
Tucker Thomas 1800 No Bid No Bid
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66-11-0006

12. BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chlotide -
'Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 9
Unit of Estimated | UnitCost | Extended

County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons |  Per Ton Cost
Fayette  [Oak Hill TON 3450 No_Bid No Bid
Fayette Corridor L @ Oak Hill TON 1050 No_Bid No Bid
Fayette Lockout TON 1850 No Bid No Bid
Fayette Glen Ferris TON 500 No Bid _No_Bid
Greenbrier [Lewisburg TON 1300 No Bid No Bid
" |Greenbrier [Crawiey TON 1850 No Bid No Bid
Greenbrier [I-64 @ Hail's Run TON 1300 No Bid No Bid
Monroe . [Union TON 1150 No Bid No Bid
Monroe Peterstown TON 1000 No Bid No Bid
Nicholas  |Summersville TON 1700 |No Bid No Bid
Nicholas  |Curtin TON 1200 No Bid No Bid
Nicholas _|Corridor L @ Muddiety TON 4350 No Bid | No Bid
Summers |Hinton TON 1300 No Bid No Bid




66-11-C026

13

12. - BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chioride
Delivery. F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 10
| Unit of Estimated | UnitCost | Extended

County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
McDowell |Havaco TON 3000 No Bid No Bid
McDowell |Yukon TON 500 No Bid ~ [ No Bid
McDowell |Johnnycake Mountain TON 700 No Bid No Bid
McDowell |Raysel TON -500 No Bid No Bid
Mercer Princeton @ WV 20 TON 4000 No Bid No Bid
Mercer  {Flat Top TON 900 No Bid | No Bid
Mercer  |I-77 @ Princeton TON 2000 No Bid . | No Bid
Raleigh _|Skelton TON 4500 |No Bid | Wo Bid
Raleigh ~ |Bolt TON 2000 No Bid No Bid
Raleigh  [I-64 @ Bragg TON 3000 No Bid No Bid
Wyoming |Pineville TON 3000 No Bid No Bid
Wyoming  {Still Run TON 1000 No Bid No Bid
Wyoming |Hanover TON 1000 No Bid No Bid




66-11-C026

28

12. BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chloride
D'eiii/ery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site |
WV Turnpike
Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended

County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Kanawha |Chelyan TON 1000 |No Bid | No Bid
Kanawha |Standard TON 3500 No Bid No Bid
Mercer  |Princeton TON 1500 No Bid  |No Bid
Raleigh  |Beckley TON 8500 No Bid - |No Bid
Raleigh _|Ghent 5000 [No Bid _ [No Bid

TON




13. BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chiloride
F.0.B. Vendor's Storage Site

Location of Storage Site

Monaca, PA

*Bid price shall include cost of
vendor loading District’s trucks.

66-11-C026

Cost Per Ton* -

$70.00

24
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CENTRAL SALT

June 21, 2011

Mr. Paui Reynolds

State of West Virginia
Department of Adminisiration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street, East
Charleston, WV 25305

Re: RFQ 6611C026 Rood Maintenance Sait

Dear Mr. Reynolds:

On behalf of Central Salt, | would like to thank you for the opportunity to
provide a bid for the State of West Virginia's road deicing salt for the 2011 -~
2012 season.

Enclosed is Central Sali’s bid for road salt. Please feel free o contact us at
847 608-8130 if you have any questions.

Sincerely,

Doug Williams
Cenfral Sait, LLC

ELGIN OFFICE LYONS MINE OFFICE
385 Alrport Road, Suite 108, Elgin IL 60123 1420 Stote Road 14, Lyons KS 67554
888-499-7258 Phone / 847-408-8130 Phone / 847-408-8135 Fax 800-879-7258 Phone / 620-257-5624 Phone / $20-257-5052 Fax



June 24, 2011

Mr. Paul Reynolds

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street, East
Charleston, WV 25305

Re: RFQ 6611C026 Road Mdaintenance Salt ADDENDUM NO. 1

Dear Mr. Reynolds:

Enclosed is Addendum No. 1 for RRQ 6611C0246 Road Maintenance Sali, Our
bid had been submitied prior to receipt of the addendum. Please include
this signed addendum with Central Salt’s bid.

Sincerely,

oylati b

Doug Willioms
Central Salt, LLC

Y ED
a2 A2
Lea DVISION
CUor HY
ELGIN OFFICE LYONS MINE OFFICE
385 Airport Road, Suite 108, Elgin IL 60123 1420 State Road 14, Lyons KS 47554

888-499-7258 Phone / 847-608-8130 Phone / 847-608-8135 Fax 800-879-7258 Phone / 620-257-562¢ Phone / 620-257-5052 Fax
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CENTRAL SALT LL

ELGIN TIIL. 60123

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130
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c
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EXHIBIT 10

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

I HEREBY ACKNOWLEDGE RECEIPT OF THE FOLLOWING CHECKED
ADDENDUM(S) AND HAVE MADE THE NECESSARY REVISIONS TO MY
PROPOSAL, PLANS AND/OR SPECIFICATION, ETC.

ADDENDUM NO.'S:

I UNDERSTAND THAT FAILURE TO CONFIRM THE RECEIPT OF THE
ADDENDUM(S) MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF BIDS. VENDOR
MUST CLEARLY UNDERSTAND THAT ANY VERBAL
REPRESENTATION MADE OR ASSUMED TO BE MADE DURING ANY
ORAL DISCUSSION HELD BETWEEN VENDOR'S REPRESENTATIVES
AND ANY STATE PERSONNEL IS NOT BINDING. ONLY THE
INFORMATION ISSUED IN TING AND ADDED TO THE
SPECIFICATIONS BY ICIAL ADDENDUM IS BINDING.

....................

............................

.............................

REV. 11/96
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CENTRAL SALT

June 28, 2011

Mr. Paul Reynolds

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street, East
Charleston, WV 25305

Re: RFQ 6611C026 Road Maintenance Salt ADDENDUM NO. 2

Dear Mr. Reynolds:

Enclosed is Addendum No. 2 for RRQ 6611C026 Road Maintenance Salt. Our
bid had been submitted prior to receipt of the addendum. Please include
this signed addendum with Central Salt’s bid.

Sincerely,
Doug Williams
Central Salt, LLC
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RFQ#6611C026 Addendum #2

Question:

1.

“What is the starling day for the order; will it be the day after the order is received? For example, if
an order is feceived on Monday, would the first of the four days be considered Tuesday?”

Response:  The first of the four days will be considered 12:01 AM the morning {working day)
following the issue of the release.

“Is there a limit to the size of an order, or is there an average order size for orders placed? For
example, would the State order in 1,000 ton quantities, or would a fypical order run 200-300 fons?*

Response: There is no typical order size.

“Does the option of accepting an attemnative delivery schedule mean there is flexibility to the four
day deadline (assuming a schedule is worked out that ensures prompt deliveries at acceptable
volume levels)?”

Response; Yes.

| see that Page 7 states one price for county sites in the Bidding Instructions section and yet on

. the Contract Award section, it sounds fike each line will be awarded and there is a space to write

different pricing on each bid line.”

Response:  This was discussed and clarified at the pre-bid meeting and is also addressed in
Addendum #1, tem #7. See halow:

7. Page 7, Section 5. Contract Award reads:

“Afl qualified Vendors who submit a valid bid for “FOB Division's Storage Site”,
Section 12, Bid Schedule will be awarded a confract for those locations for which
their bid is low,

Response: The ierm “locations” should read “county locations”.

“Are the O tons for the locations fisted on the bid schedule page for pricing, considered place
holders?”

Response: Please refer to Seclion 2. Scope of Wark, from the Bid Specifications. Even
though the Division of Highways does not list an estimated quantity to be delivered
to some county locations, we do not want fo remove these county lecafions in
case of a need for Road Salt at that county location. If the need should arise, an
Agency Release will be issued by ihe Division of Highways to the awarded vendor.
Quantities listed on the Bid Schedule are estimates.



EXHIBIT 10

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

I HEREBY ACKNOWLEDGE RECEIPT OF THE FOLLOWING CHECKED
ADDENDUM(S) AND HAVE MADE THE NECESSARY REVISIONS TO MY
PROPOSAL, PLANS AND/OR SPECIFICATION, ETC.

ADDENDUM NO.'S:

I UNDERSTAND THAT FAILURE TO CONFIRM THE RECEIPT OF THE
ADDENDUM(S) MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF BIDS. VENDOR
MUST CLEARLY UNDERSTAND THAT ANY VERBAL
REPRESENTATION MADE OR ASSUMED TO BE MADE DURING ANY
ORAL DISCUSSION HELD BETWEEN VENDOR'S REPRESENTATIVES
AND ANY STATE PERSONNEL IS NOT BINDING. ONLY THE
INFORMATION ISSUED IN TING AND ADDED TO THE
SPECIFICATIONS BY ICIAL ADDENDUM IS BINDING.

--------------------
............................

June 24, 2011’ June 289 2011

.............................

REV. 11/96
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Rev. 09/03 State of West Virginia

VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application® is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to
constiuction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to requestsuch preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if appiicable. ‘

1. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this certification; or, o
Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business contintiously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has
malntained Its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four {4) years immediately
preceding the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a honresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; o,

—

2. Application is made for 2.6% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Riddar is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

3. Application is made for 2.6% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiliate’s or subsidiary’s employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

4. Application Is made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

' Bidder mests sither the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; o¥,

5. Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who Is a veteran for the reason checked:
Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or, : '
Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

l &

Bidder is a resident vendor who s a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commedities or compleling the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Vifginia who have residsd in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penalty
against such Bidder in an amount notto exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penally will be paid to the contracting agency
or deducted from any unpaid balance on the confractor purchase order. : '

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61 -5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate
" changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Division in writing immediately.

Bidder: N/A ' Signed: N/A

Date: Title:

*Check any combination of preference considerafion(s) indicated above, which you are entifled to recelve.
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REQ No. 6611C026

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division .

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: No contract of renawal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its
poiitical subdivisions {o any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospeciive vendor or a related party o the
vendor or prospective vendor is a debior and the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the

aggregate.

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt" means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the siate or any of &s
political subdivisions pecause of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers' compensation
premiurn, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required o be paid 1o the state or any of its
political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thergon.

“Nebtor” means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, fimited liabifity company or any other form or
business association owing a debt to the state or any of ils political subdivisions. “Political subdivision™ means any county
commission; municipality; county board-of education: any instramentality established by a county or municipality; any
separate ‘corporation or instrumentafity established by one or more counties or municipalities, as permitted by law; or any
public body charged by law with the performance of a government funciion or whose jurisdiction is coexlensive with one
or more counties or municipalities. “Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, .
_assodiation, fimited liability company or any other form or business association or other endity whalsoever, related o any
vendor by blood, marriage, owriership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest
with the vendor so that the party will dctually or by effect receive or confrel a portion of the benefit, profit or other
consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent
of the total contract amount,

EXCEPTION: The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendot, has contested any tax administered pursuant
to chapter eleven of this code, workers® compensation prermium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the -
matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in
default of any of the provisions of such plan of agreement.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code §61-5-3}, it is hereby certified that the vendor affirms and
acknowledges the information in this affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE /
Central Salt LLC _

Was Peterson, General Manager
‘State of 11linois ,
Kane C——/#. to-wit:

Vendor's Name: .
Date:  6/21/2011

Authorized Signature: .

County of

Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this 2| day of jwnﬁ 2011,

My Commission expires 7-1-1\ ,20 . '
AFFIX SEAL HERE " NOTARY PUBLIC @\Q

SONDRA CHMIOLA
Notary Public, State of ILLINOIS
Commission No, 583458
County of McHenry
Commigsion gxpiras July 07, 2011

Purchasing Affidavit {Revised 12/15/09)



