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GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

1. Awards wlill be mads in the best interast of the State of West Virginia.

2. The State may accept or reject In part, or in whole, any bid,

3. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly regisiered with the Purchasing Division
and have pald the required $125 fee.

4. All services performed or goods deliverad under State Purchase Order/Contracts are to be continued for the
term of the Purchase Qrder/Contracts, contingent upon funds being appropriated bY the Legislature or otherwise
being made available. [n the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise avallable for these services or goods
this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.

5. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.

6. Interest may be pald for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

7. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

8. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will hot pay or reimburse such taxes.

9. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.

10. The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Divislon shall govern the
purchasing process. :

11. Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted, The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual wtitten
agreement of the pariies.

12. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, the State may deem
this contract nuil and void, and terminate such contract without further order.

13. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Buslness Associate
Addendum (BAA}, approved by the Attorney General, is available online at www.state.wv.us/adminipurchase/vrc/hipas.htm
and Is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entity
{45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

14. CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such
{)ersonaily [dentiflable information or other confidential information galned from the agency, unless the individual who |s
he subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made %ursuant to the agency's
policies, procedures, and rules. Vendor further agress to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and Information
Security ‘Accountabliity Requirements, set forth In hitp://www.state.wv.usfadmin/purchase/privacy/noticeConfldentiality.pdf.

15, LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and
requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginla, including, but not fimited to, the West Virginia Secretary
of State's Office, the West Virginia Tax Depariment, and the West Virginia Insurance Commission. The vendor must
provide all necessarr releases 1o oblain Information to enable the director ~or spending unit to
verify that the vendor is licensed and In good standing with the above entitles.

16. ANTITRUST: In submiiting a bid to any agency for the State of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that
if the bid Is accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or transfer to the State of West Virginla all rights, title and Interest
in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and the State of
Waest Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the particular commodities or services

purchased or acquired by the State of West Virginla, Such assignment shall be made and become effective at the time the
purchaging agency tenders the Initlal payment to the bidder. :

| cerlify that this bid Is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with an¥ corporatian, firm, limited
llabllity company, parinership, or person or entity submitting a bid for the same materlal, supplies, equipment or
services and Is In all respects falr and without collusion or Fraud. | further certify that | am authorized to sign
the cerlification on hehalf of the bidder or this bid.

. INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS
1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division, Complete all sections of the quotation form.

2. lems offered must be in compllance with the specifications. Any devlalion from the specifications must be clearly
indicated by the bidder. Altemates offered by the bidder as EQUAL tfo the speclfications must be clearly
defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications and literature to the bid. The
Purchasing Division may walve minor deviations to speclfications.

- 3. Unit prices shall prevall in case of discrepancy. All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless alternate
shipping terms are clearly identified in the quotation.

4. All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time of the bid
opening. Fallure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result In bid disquallfications: Depariment of
Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Street East, P.O. Box 50130, Charleston, WV 25305-0130

5. Communlcation during the sollcitation, bid, evaluation or award perlods, except through the Purchasing Division,
Is strictly prohibited (W.Va. C.S.R. §148-1-6.6).

Rev. 12/16/00



State of West Virgnia  Request for e

Department of Administration  Quiotation 6611C026
Purchasing Division :
2019 Washington Street East BEREBREAT )5 A | ol L e eI s

Post Office Box §0130
Chatrleston, WV 25305-0130 - IBUYER 33

014-558-26402

RFQ COPY
TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS -
VARIOQUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

PORTION OF THE PRE-BID|, BUT DURING ANY SUBSEQUENT PART
OF THE PRE-B[ID WILL NOf BE PERMITTED TP SIGN THE '
ATTENDANCE SHEET.

QUESTIONS: WRITTEN QUESTIONS. WILL BE ACCEPTED THROUGH
THE CLOSE OF|{ BUSINESS |[(5:00 PM EST) ON| TUESDAY, JUNE~
21, 2011.. : :

SEND QUESTIONS TO

-

ATTENTION: PAUL REY
2019 WASHINGTON STR
CHARLESTON, WV 2530

0LDS

PURICHASING DIVISION
EET EAST
5

Y BE [SENT NIA FAX, E-MAIL,|-OR REGULAR MAIL.
E-MATL: PAUL.REYNOLDSQWV .50V
| Fax: 3004-558-4115 |

QUESTIONS MA

i IT 1S. THE VENDOR'S RESPONSIBILITY TO VERLFY THAT THEIR
' RUESTIONS HAVE BEEN RECEIVED BY CALLING 304-558-0468.

EXHIBIT 2

LIFE OF CONTRACT:
UPON AWARD, (A

YEAR OR UNTI|L SUC
EECESSARY TO OBTA

CONTRACT BECOMES EFFECTIVE

RENEW THE

E" PERIOD SHALL
THIS "REASONABLE
TRACT FOR
“"PURCHASING

RIGINAL CONTRACT|.
0T EXCEED TMWELVE
TIME“ THE VENDOR

ED IN THIS
‘AND PRICING

(888)762'7258 ® ne 27,2011

”ﬁ kefi ﬂ F ] | 'E‘" ' 18 '1 516458 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
HEN ESPONDING TO BRFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'WENDOR'




AR PR
6/0

5/2011

Department of Administration
Purchasing Divislon

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charlaston, WV 25305-0130

RFQ COPY
TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

State of West Virginia Request for rrrrmoNNEERTmS

Quotation 6611C026 3

NCEERDLTENFION O s

NG-KE53-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

81D OPENING DATE:

Marketifig M

RENEWAL: THIS CONTRAC[T
UBMITTED TO| THE
BE IN ACCORDANCE
(1) YEAR PER[IODS.
ANCELLATION
NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IfF

SUPPLIED ARE| OF Al
ITH THE SPECIFICATIONS

OPEN MARKET ICLAUS

QUANTITIES: JITIES

APPROXIMATIONS ONLY, BASED ON ESTIMATES SUPPLIES BY THE
STATE SPENDING UNIT. {IT IS UNDERSTOOD} AND AGREED THAT
HE CONTRACT| SHALL COVER THE QUANTITIES ACTUALLY
DELIVERY DURING THE TERM OF CONTRACT,
HETHER MORE| OR LESS THAN THE QUANTITIES SHOWN.

ORDERED FOR

ORDERING PROCEDURE: SPENDING UNIT(S) [SHALL ISSUE A
MENT| CONTRACT ORDER (FORM| NUMBER WV-35)

WRITTEN EQUI}
FOR COMMODITIIES COVERE(D

IV-35 MUST BE SENT TO THE PURCHASING DIVISION
OF THE DEPAR[TMENT] OF ADMINISTRATION. [AFTER APPROVAL
ONE COPY OF THE PURCHASE ORDER WILL

e DR MEVE RO gD T ER S AND EUNDUIBING R

i e
Lo ANl

AND ENCUMBRANCE,

e
e

RITTEN CONSENT OF THE| SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR,
DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30)
DAYS PRIOR T THE] EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL
ITH [THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE
ORIGINAL CONTRACT; AND [SHALL BE LIMITED] TO TWO (2) ONE

t THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASiNG RESERVES THE
RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATEELY UPON WRITTEN

INFERIOR QUALITY OR| DO NOT CONFORM

: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING MAY
AUTHORIZE A SPENDING UNIT TO PURCHASE ON THE OPEN
ARKET, WITHOUT. THE FYXLING OF A REQUIS[ITION OR COST
STIMATE, ITEMS SPECIFIED ON THIS CONTRACT FOR IMME-
DIATE DELIVERY IN| EMERGENCIES DUE TO UNFORESEEN CAUSES
CINCLUDING BUT NOF LIMITED TO DELAYS IN TRANSPORTATION
DR AN UNANTICIPATED INCREASE IN THE VOLUME OF WORK).

MAY BE RENEWED| UPON THE MUTUAL

THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICE
OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.

LISTED IN THE REQUISITION ARE

BY THIS CONTRACT. THE ORIGINAL

TELEFHONE

(888) 762-7258

N g
anage 16-1516458

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN BESPONDING 70 REQ. INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE AROVE LARELED 'WENDOR



State of West Virginla Request for TR

Department of Administration  Quotation 6611C026 . 4
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East

Post Offlce Box 50130
Charieston, WV 25305-0130 BUYER 33
-RE8-26402
RFQ COPY

TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

[EEEE RS S OHRE SR ONE N O AT T EN TGN R

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

P

06

705/2011

BID OPENIN

Q DATE:

BIGNATURE

BE RETURNED
ARDED TQ TH
0 ORDER IS
BY THE PURCH

BANKRUPTCY ¢
FOR BANKRUPT
“ONTRACT NUL
ITHOUT FUTH
EV. 5/2009.
EXHIBIT 6

LOCAL GOVERN

IN THE BID HIS REFUSAL| TO EXTEND THE PRICES, TERMS,

ND CONDITIONS OF| THE [BID TO COUNTY, SCHOOL, MUNICIPAL
ND OTHER LOCAL GOVERNMENT BODIES, THE| BID SHALL EXTEN
0 POLITICAL| SUBDIVISIONS OF THE STATE| OF WEST :
IRGINIA. IF THE| VENDOR DOES NOT WISH TO EXTEND THE
RICES, TERMS, AND CONDITIONS OF THE BID TO ALL -

OLITICAI sU
LEARLY INDI
HALL NOT PR
ANNER .

REV. 3/88

f\ SIGNED BID
DEPARTHM

CHARLES

74

TO TH

VALID
IASING

IN.T
CY PR
L. AND
ER OR

ENT.

BDIVI
CATE
EJUDI

ON,

E VENDOR Af

E SPEEDING UNIT AND QGNE COPY FOR-
S

AUTHORIZATION |[FOR SHIPMENT.
UNLEISS APPROVED AND [ENCUMBERED
DIVIISION.

HE EVENT THE. VENDOR/CONTRACTOR FILES
OTECTJION, THE STATE MAY DEEM THE
VOID, AND TERMINATE |[SUCH CONTRACT
DER. ' :

BODIES : UNLESS THE VENDOR INDICATES

SIONS| OF THE -STATE, THE VENDOR :MUST
SUCH REFUSAL IN HIS BJID. SUCH REFUSAL
CE THE AWARD OF THIS CONTRACT IN ANY

- NOTICE
BE SUBMITTED TO:

F ADMINISTRATION

WV  25305-0130
B PR AN

=

o 7

e

2-7258

; .r_;m'm

® June 27, 2011

TITLE

L1

(rLcLManaqer .

FEIN

16-1516458 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

Market

. WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



State of West‘\ﬁ reinta quutesttl for ROz e B R
Department of Administration uotation

Purchasing Division 661 1c026 2
2019 Washington Street East

Post Office Box 650130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 BUYER 33.
-BBR-2610°2
RFQ COPY

TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

BY ORDER

. 06/0575011 1
BID QPENING DATE:

THE BID SHOULD CONTAINJ THIS INFORMATION ON THE FACE OF
THE ENVELOPE| OR THE BID MAY NOT BE CONSIDERED:

SEALED BID

BUYER 1 PAUL. REYNOLDS - FILE 33
REQ NO 6611C026

BID OPENING DATE:| JUNE 29|, 2011

BID OPENING [TIME: 1:30 PM

PLEASE PROVIDE A [FAX NUMBER IN CASE IT| IS NECESSARY
TO CONTACT YU REGARDING YOUR BID:

re e ABPRLZAIOTG e ma s ~

CONTACT PERSON (PLEASEl PRINT CLEARLY):
Michele Booher

----- - - W st i gl oo e Sl W e B M S B M M I T Mmoo o o g e M e

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ. INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE L ABELED 'VENDOR'



1, SPECIFICATIONS

The following sections of the West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways Standard
Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2010 as modified by the January 1, 2011 Supplemental
Specifications shall apply to the administration of this contract. Secfions 101, 102.4, 102.5, 105.1, 105.3, 105.4,
105.10, 105.11, 105.12, 105.13, 106.3, 106.4, 106.5, 106.6, 106.7, 106.9, 107.1, 1072 107.3, 10714 107.18,
107.20, 108.8, 109.1, 109.2 and 109.20. :

The requirements of the West Virginia_Depariment “of Transportation; Division of ngh ays, Standard
Specifications Section 109.20, PRICE ADJUSTMENT FOR LOAD LIMIT VIOLATIONS shall apply o all material
supplied under this contract. This will include matenal loaded by the vendor into Division of Highways owned
and/or rented trucks.

The terms "Contractor’ and "Vendor" used in the above spectﬁcatlons of this contract are mterchangeable
Contractor shall mean Vendor and Vendor shall mean Contractor. '

West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways' Standard Specifications Roads and Bndges
adopted 2010 as modified by the January 1, 2011 Supplemental Spemf:cahons may be obtatned from:

West Virginia Division of Highways

Contract Administration

Building 5, Room 722

1900 Kanawha Bivd,, East

Charleston, West Virginia 25305

Phone: 304-568-2885

http:llwww.transportatton.wv.govlhighwayslcontractadminlspeclficattonslzotOStandSpeclPagesldefault.aspx

Sodium Chloride shall conform to the requ:rements of ASTM D632-83 and Type |, Grade 1 and shall bs delivered
in bulk:

2. :: 'SCOPE OF WORK

The purpose of this contract is to provlde for the deitvery of Sodlum Chtonde to the various locations listed in
Section 12, Bid Schedule. ‘Actual quantities to be delivered to each location will be specified in an Agency '
Release, which will be issued by the Division of Highways at the time delivery is required.

3. " ACCEPTANCE AND DELIVERY GUARANTEE '

The Division of Highways guarantees acceptance of elghty percent (80%) of the total estimated quantity awarded
to an individual vendor, However, condmons may dictate adjustment of the actual quantities defivered to
spacified sites,

The Vendor shall guarantee delivery, as requested by the Division of Highways, of one hundred and twenty
percent (120%) of the total estimated award quantity stated in this contract. Quantilies purchased F. OB
Vendor's.Storage Site will not be included in the acceptance and delivery guarantee.



All guaranteed deliveries shall be completed prior to March 15, 2012,

4, BIDDING INSTRUCTIONS

Vendors submitting bids for a specific county shall bid all of that county's locations-— one unit price - for the
county sites listed in Seotion 12, Bid Schedule. This shall apply to the listed Interstate and Corridor sites as well.

Any quallflcatlon of bids or any modaﬁcai:on of the specifications or conditions governing the bids may be cause
for their rejection,

8, CONTRACT AWARD

All qualified Vendors who submit a valid bid for "FOB Division's Storage Site", Ssction 12, Bid Schedule will be
awarded a contract for thosea locations for which their bid is low.

All qualified Vendors who submit a valid bid for “FOB Vendor's Storage Site”, in Section 13, Bid Schedule will be
awarded a contract for this ifem.

8. DELIVERY

An Agency Release for delivery to Division of Highways Storage Sites, Section 12, Bid Scheduls, will be Issued
to the awarded Vendor at the time delivery Is needet.

When an Agency Release is issued to an awarded Vendor, from December 1, 2011 through March 15, 2012, a
delivery date of four (4) working days shall be established by the Division of Highways and provided on the
Agency Release; however, the Division of Highways-shall have the option of accepting an alternative delivery
schedule provided by the awarded Vendor which shall be established at the time of the Agency Release.

inabllity fo Deliver: If delivery has not beén recelved at the Division of Highways slte after five (5)
working days and an alternative delivery schedule has not been established for
this delivery, the Division of Highways reserves the right fo cancel the Agency
Release and proceed to obtain the required quantity of Sodium Chloride from.
an alternate economical source.

At the discretion of the Divislon of Highways, the first aiternate economical
source shall be the next low bidder, if that bidder has availability; or secondly,
may obfain pricing on the Open Market.

The quaniity, required' to fulll the canceled Agency Release obtained through
an alternate source, whether by the next low bidder or the Open Market, will be
deducted from the awarded Vendor's 80% guaranteed minimum quantity.

If the alternate economical source chosen to fulfll this request is a Vendor
which has also been awarded a contract for other Division of Highways



storage sites, this quantity shall be included in that Vendor's 80% guaranteed
minimum quaniity.

The Division of Highways will also invoice the awarded Vendor the difference in
cost from the awarded Vendor's price and the alfernate obtained source's
price. In addition to the difference in cost, the Divislon of Highways may
include, but not limited to, any additional transportation charges associated with
this delivery to fulfil the need of the canceled Agency Releass,

Original delivery tickets for each delivered load to the Division of Highways’ storage sites must be sl’gnéd and
retalned by a Division of Highways employee at the delivery locafion.

T SAMPLING AND TESTING

Upon award of contract, the Vendor shall provide the Divislon of Highways with the proposed source of supply.
Acceptance shall be based on suppliers’ cerfification of quality and gradation. This information shall be directed
to: -

West Virginia Division of Highways

Materials Division

190 Dry Branch Road

Charleston, West Virginia 25306

Phone Number 304-558-3175

- The Division of Highways may conduct sampling and festing to verify'materiaI'QUality or gradation.

8. WEIGHING MATERIALS DELIVERED BY TRUCK

Material delivered by truck shall be weighed in accordance with Section 308.5 of the West Virginia Depariment of
Transportation, Division of Highways Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges adopted 2010 as modified by
the January 1, 2011 Supplemental Specifications. '

9. SUPPLYING OTHER ORQANIZATIOI_\]AL ENTITIES

In accordance with Chapter 5A, Arficle 3, Seciion 9 of the Code of West Virginia the commodities or services
contracted for herein shall be available to all local governmental bodies in accordance with the same prices,
terms and conditions afforded to the State of West Virginia.

In the event any Vendor does not wish to extend the prices, terms and condltions of his bid and subsequent
contract to all political sub-divisions of the State, he must so indicate in a clear and unambiguous manner in his
bid. This indication does not prejudice the award of the contract. If a Vendor does not indicate his refusal to
extend the prices, terms and conditions of his bid to other entlties of the State, he is bound to extend them upon
issuance of a purchase order by these entities.

Other organizational entities using this provision of the contract shall do so without any involvement of the
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Division of Highways. That is, the enfity shall make its own purchase arrangements with the Vendor and shal
make its own arrangements for payment.

10.  VENDOR'S INVOICES

Vendors are encouraged to utilize a paperless invoice process submitting the following information via e-mail to -
the Division of Highways ordering locations: '

a) Al weight ticket numbers for material delivered during the invoicing period.

b} Division of Highways' Agency Release number and this contract number.

¢} Total quantity and unit price with the total cost of each type of material furnished.
{Total quantity invoiced shall be scale weights supported by wsight tickets).

NOTE: Under no circumstance will the Diviston of Highways accept or pay for quantities of mateiials in excess of
the quantily stated on the Agency Relsase.



BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chloride

19

12, 66-11-C026
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 1 - | |
. ‘ . Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site '| Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Boohe Clinton @ WV85 TON - 860 101.62 86,377.00
Boone Rock Creek TON 1300 101.62 132,106.00
Boone - [Seth TON 850 101.62 86,377.00
Clay - [Widen Road & CR 11 TON 1350 100.91 136,228.50
Cléy Maysel | TON 450 100.91 45,409.50
Kanawha Chelyah TON 2100 95.78 201,138.00
Kanawha_|Elkview TON 1850 | 95.78 177.193.00
Kanawha_[North Charleston . TON 2500 [ 9578 1268,184.00
Kanawha [St. Albans TON 2100 95.78 201,138.00
Kanawha 164 @ Scary Creek “TON 2100, | 95.78 201,138.00
|Kanawha |64 @ Rt. 119 and Penn. Avenue | TON 1700 _ | 95.78 162,826.00
Kanawha |I-77 @ Slssohville TON 1350 95.78 . 1129,303.00
Kanawha _[I-79 @ Amma TON 1700 | 9578 162,826.00
{Kanawha |Corridor G @ Alum Creek . TON 1700 95.78 162,826.00
- [Mason___[P. Pleasant TON 3000 ssse _ |265080.00
Putnam  |Red House TON 1300 .93.08 158,236.00
Putnam___ |Hurricane @ Rt. 34 TON 1700 93.08 121,004.00 A
|lPutham __JUS 35 TON 2100 | 93.08 195,468.00

NOTE: Bid Schedule should be typed

The “Bid Schedule” is available for download on Purchasing’s Web site at
www.state,wv.us/admin/purchase
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12. BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chloride 66-11-C026
DeliVery: F.0.B. WV ‘Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 2 _
Unit of Estimated Unit Cost Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | NumberTons| PerTon Cost
Cabell Barboursville TON 2500 92.88 232,200.00
Cabell ___|I-64 @ Huntington TON 1350 92.88 125,388.00
Lincoln [ West Hamiin TON 1550 96.42 | 14945100
Lincoln Yawkey | TON 1000 06.42 96,420.00
Lincoln__|Harts TON 850 96.42 81,957.00
Logan Chapmanville TON 0 103.13 0.00 -
Logan Cotridor G @ Chapmanville TON 1800 103.13 185,634.00
Logan Wilkinson TON 1800 103.13 185,634.00
Logan _ Man - TON 1300 103.13 | 134,069.00
Mingo  |Corridor G @ Miller's Creek TON 1650 101.77 167,920.50
Mingo Mingo County @Milier's Creek TON 1800 101.77 183,186.00
Mingo _ |Gilbert TON ] 700 101.77 71,239.00
Wayne  {Pritchard TON 2150 04.33 - | 202,809.50|
Wayne = |Wayne TON 2150 94.33 202,809.50
Wayne Crum - TON 1400 94.33 132,062.00
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12. BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chloride 66-11-C026
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 3. .
- Unitof | Estimated | UnitCost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost

Calhoun  [Millstone TON 1450 97.19  1140,925.50
Jackson  |[Ripley TON 2850 90.88 259,008.00
Jackson [I-77 @ Medina TON 1450 90.88 131,776.00
Pleasants [Belmont | "TON 1900 93.41 177,479.00
Ritchie APD Pennsboro TON 2350 - 03.26 219,161.00
Ritchie Ellenboro TON ' _2850 93.26 265,791.00
Ritchie . |Corridor D @ Nutter Farm TON 750 9326 [ 6994500
Ritchie Smithvifle TON 250 93.26 23,315.00
Roane  |Lefthand @ WV 36 TON 700 95.97 67,179.00
Roane  jAmber Hill @ US 119 TON 350 95.97 33,589.50
Roane Spencer TON 1450 _95.97 139,156.50
Wirt Elizabeth TON 1450 92.15 133,617.50
Wood Parkersburg @ Rt. 958 TON - 4300 89.62 385,366.00
Wood __ |1-77 @ Parkersburg TON 1450 | 89.62 129,949.00
Wood Corridor D @ Riverhill TON 1450 89.62 129,949.00




BID SCHEDULE-Sodium Chioride

66-11-C026

13

12.
Delivery; F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 4 . |
Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County | _ Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons| Per Ton Cost
Doddridge  [Smithburg TON 1700 89.38 151,946.00
Harrison Gore TON 4700 84.91 399,077.00
Marfison  |Saltwell TON 0 84.91 0.00
Harison _ |-79 @ Lost Creek TON 2800 | 84.91 237,748.00
* [Harrison APD 50 @ Tunnel Hill TON 2300 84.91 195,293.00
Mation Fairmont TON 2000 84.56 169,120.00
Marion ___ [Mannington TON 1100 | 84.56 84,560.00
Monongalia_|I-79 @ Goshen Road TON 2500 79.85 199,625.00
Monongalia_|Ridgedale TON 4200 | 7985 335,370.00
Monongalia |Pentress TON . 950 79.85 75,857.50
Preston . . {Bruceton Mills TON 4200 67.91 285,222.00
Preston Albright TON 2100 67.91 142,611.00
Preston Bruceton TON 0 67.91 0.00
Preston Terra Alta . TON 1100 67.91 74,701.00
Preston Fellowsville TON 1300 67.91 88,283.00
Preston [Aurora TON 1400 [ 67.91 95,074.00
Preston ~ |1-68.@ Copper's Rock TON 3300 | 67.91 224,103.00
Taylor - |Fetterman/Prunytown TON 2350 | 8099 190,326.50




© 66-11-C026
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12, BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chioride
Delivery. F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 5 .

_ Unit of Estimated | UnitCost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Berkeley  [1-81 @ Martinsburg TON 3750 | 84.27 531,742.50
Berkely I-81.@ Exit 12 TON 700 84.27 58,989.00
Grant Petersburg TON . 900 91.35 82,215.00
Grant M. Storm TON 1800 | o135 "164,430.00
Grant Corridor H @ Knobley Road TON 2750 91.35 251,212.50
Hampshire |Romney TON 1250 93.95 117,437.50
Hampshire |Capon Bridge TON 1100 93.95 103,345.00
Hampshire {Slanesville TON 600 93.95 56,370.00
Hardy Moorefield _ TON 1350 | 99.91 134,878.50
Hardy Baker TON 1800 99.91 179,838.00
Jefferson  |Charles Town TON - 1800 81.35 146,430.00
Jefferson__|Charles Town - New Shed TON 2300 | 81.35 187,105.00
Mineral New Creek TON 800 78.64 62,912.00
Mineral  [Sky Line . TON 800 26,64 62,912.00
Mineral __ |Short Gap TON 550 | 7864 | 43,252.00
Mineral District Headquarters” TON 450 78.64 35,388.00
Morgan - [Berkeley Springs TON 1000 84.18 84,180.00

Morgan Largent - TON 300 84.18 25,254.00 | -




66-11-C026
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12, BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chioride
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Stdrage Site
DISTRICT 6 _
Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | PerTon Cost

Brooke  [Wellsburg TON 2500 77.23 193,075.00
Brooke  |Weirton TON 2600 77.23 193,075.00
Hancock |New Manchester TON 2500 80.16 200,400.00
Marshall  [Glen Dale TON- 3500 79.89 279,615.00
Miarshall _|Cameron TON 1500 79.89 | 119,835.00
Ohio Triadelphia TON 3000 76.05 228,150.00
Ohioc |70 @ Triadelphia TON 2500 76.05 | 190,125.00
Tyler Sistersville TON 2000 90.42 180,840.00
Tyler Centerville TON 1200 90.42 108,504.00
Tyler Sistersville Old Headquarters TON 806 N/A

Welzel New Martinsville TON 2000 87.50 175,000.00
Wetzel Pine Grove TON 1,000 87.50 87,500.00
Wetzel  |Hundred TON 1200 87.50 105,000.00




66-11-C026
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12. BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chloride
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 7 :
| ~ Unit of Estimated | UnitCost | Extended

. County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | PerTon Cost

Barbour__|Phillip TON 2500 86.00 | 215,000.00

Barbour  |Belington TON 2000 86.00 172,000.00

Braxton |Gassaway TON 2000 97.85 195,700.00

Braxion __|Heaters TON 1400 97.85 -13619'90.00

Braxton  {1-79 @ Coon Knob TON 2400 97.85 234,840.00

Braxton  [I-79 @ Burnsville TON - 2500 97.85 244,625.00

Gilmer  |Glenville TON 2200 96.13 211,486.00

Lewis . |Weston (Ben Dale) TON 2700 88.65  |239,355.00

Lewis Corridor H @ Mudlick TON 1400 88.65 124,110.00 |

Upshur __ [Clow Lot @ Buckhannon TON 3500 90.16 ‘| 315,560.00

Upshur  |Tennerton ' TON 200 90.16 18,032.00

Upshur  |Kanawha Head TON 900 90.16 81,144.00

Webster  |Cherry Falls TON 1400 101.90 142,660.00
. {Webster  [Cowen TON 1100 101.90 112,090.00

Webster _|Hacker Valley TON 700 101,90 | 71,330.00




BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chioride
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12. - 66-11-C026
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 8
Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Pendlefon  {Franklin TON 1000 100.86 100,860.00
Pendleton  [Judy Gap TON 800 100.86 60,516.00
Pendieton _ |Brandywine TON 400 | 100.86 | 40,334.00
Pendieton - |Onego TON 350 100.86 35,301.00
Pendleton  |Franklin, 220 South TON 300 100.86 50,258.00
Pocahontas_|Marfinton TON 800 [106.97 | 957600
Pocahontas |Seebert TON 700 106.97 74,879.00
Pocahontas {Greenbank TON 500 106.97 53,485.00
Pocahontas {Bartow (Thornwood) TON 600 106.97 64,182.00
Pocahontas |Snowshoe TON 300 106.97 32,091.00
Pocahontas {Slaty Fork TON 700 106.97 74,879.00
Randolph __|Elkins TON 3000 |-9360 | 280,800.00
" [Randoiph _[Harman TON 1500 [ 93.60 | 140,400.00
Randolph  |Coalton TON 1500 93.60 140,400.00
Randolph __{Valley Head TON 1000 93.60 . 93,600.00
Randolph  |Mill Creek TON 1500 93.60 140,400.00
Randolph  [Pickens TON 800 93.60 - 56,160.00
Randolph  |Corridor H Lot @ Elkins TON 2500 93.60 234,000.00
Tucker Parsons TON - 1500 | 87.67 95,780.00.
Tucker Thomas TON 1800 - | 87.67 335,230.00
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", BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chloride 66-11-C026

'Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 9
Unit of Estimated | Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Fayelle  |Oak Hil - | TON 3450 NoBid |
Fayette Cotridor L. @ Oak Hill TON 1050 No Bid
Fayette _{Lockout TON 1850 No Bid
Fayette Glen Ferris TON 500 No Bid
Greenbrier |Lewisburg TON 1300 No Bid
" {Greenbrier |Crawley ' TON 1850 ~ | No Bid
Greenbrier |I-64 @ Hart's Run TON 1300 No Bid
Monroe . |Union ~ TON 1150 No Bid
Monroe Peterstown . TON 1000 No Bid
Nicholas  |Summersville - TON 1700 | NoBid
Nicholas  |Curtin | TON 1200 No Bid
Nicholas _[Corridor L @ Muddiety TON 4350 No Bid
Summers _[Hinton ' TON 1300 No Bid




. BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chioride

66-11-C026
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12.
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 10 _

[ | Unit of Estimated | Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
McDowell |Havaco TON 3000 | NoBid |

McDowell |Yukon TON 500° No Bid

McDowell |Johnnycake Mountain _TON 700 No Bid
McDowell [Raysel TON 500 No Bid
Mercer Princeton @ WV 20 TON 4000 No Bid
Mercer Flat Top TON 900 No Bid
Mercer |77 @ Princeton TON 2000 No Bid
Raleigh  |Skelton TON 4500 No Bid
Raleigh ' {Bolt TON 2000 No Bid
Raleigh  |I-64 @ Bragg TON 3000 No Bid
Wyoming _ [Pineville TON 3000 No Bid
Wyoming _|Still Run TON 1000 | No Bid
Wyoming |Hanover TON 1000 No Bid




8

12. BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chloride 66-11-C026
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
WV Turnpike :
Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost

Kanawha |Chelyan _ TON 1000 | 95.78 95,780.00
Kanawha |Standard TON 3500 95.78 335,230,00
Mercer  |Princeton TON 1500 No Bid

Raleigh _ |Beckley TON 8500 | No Bid

Raleigh _ |Ghent TON 5000 | NoBid




13. BID SCHEDULE - Sodium Chloride
F.0.B. Vendor's Storage Site

Location of Storage Site

Belle Vernon, PA

*Bid price shall include cost of
vendor loading District’s trucks.

66-11-C026

Cost Per Ton* -

65.00/Ton

21



AMERICAN ROCK SALT COMPANY LLC

Authorization fo Execute Bids

One of the following representatives (the “Authorized Representative”) of American
Rock Salt Company LLC, a New York limited liability company (the “Company”):

Ann M. Blake Chief Financial Officer
Jamie A. McClain Marketing Manager

Is hereby authorized to execute and deliver, in the name and on behalf of the Company, any
contract or bid, including any amendment thereto, with respect to the sale of salt by the
Company, in all such form and containing such terms and conditions as any Authorized
Representative shall approve, such approval to be conclusively evidenced by the execution
thereof by an Authorized Representative.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Company has caused this Authorization to be
executed by its duly authorized manager, on July 19, 2010.

AMERICAN ROCK SALT COMPANY LLC

By: B

Gunther K/Buerman
Mapager,

STATE OF NEW YORK )
COUNTY OF MONRCE ) 8s.

On this 19th day of July, 2010, before me personally came GUNTHER K.
BUERMAN, to me known, who being by me duly sworn, did depose and say that he is a
Manager of American Rock Salt Company LLC, the limited liability company described in,
and which executed this Authorization.

Sl abelt O fpies_

// Notary Public

ELIZABETH C. BRICE
NOTARY PUBLIC, STATE OF NEW YORK
QUALIFIED IN MONROE GOUNTY
COMMISSION EXPIRES DEC. 11, AAO(2

108120 8466166
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RFQ#6611C026 Addendum #1

Question:

1.a

1.b

™~

On page 7, #6, Delivery; If the DOH intends to purchase from an alternate vendor as an alternate
source, wlll DOH notify the original awarded vendor of its intention?

Response: Yes.

s the decision of whether to exercise fhe open market option held at the delivery location or held at
the central office?

Response: =~ Central Office

Does the WVDOH still intend to use the VISA purchasing program?

Response: Yes. Please add the following:

Purchasing Card Acceptance The State of West Virginia currently utilizes a VISA Purchasing Card
Program which is issued through a bank. The successful vendor(s) must accept the State of West
Virginia VISA Purchasing Card for payment of orders placed by Divislon of Highway Agency
Releases for order as a condition of award.

Can DCH please provide complete addresses (ship to and bill to) for each location listed on the bid
by 06/15 so we can prepare the bid accurately and timely? (For example, we would like to have
the sireet name and number, city and zip code).

Response: Requested Information is provided on the attached spreadshest.

Can DOH please provide contact names and phone numbers for each delivery location by 06/157

Response: Requested information Is provided on the attached spreadshest,

Is it possible to submit a bid via mail, then bring In another bid and exchange the bids prior to the
opening date and time?

Response: Yes, the latter received bid will override any earlier bids as long as both bids are
received prior to the bid opening time and date.

Standard State of West Virginia contract language reads on page 2, regarding the Life of Contract:

“This contract becomes effective upon award, and extends for g period of ane (1) vear or until such

"reasonable time" thereafter as is necessary fo obtain a new contract or renew the originat contract.
The “reasonable time” period shall not exceed twelve (12) months.

Response: Please replace “for a period of one (1) year” with the actual date and wording of
“until May 31, 2012".

Page 7, Section 5. Contract Award reads:



10.

1.

12,

13.

13.

"All qualified Vendors who submit a valid bid for “FOB Division's Storage Site”, Section 12, Bid
Schedule will be awarded a contract for those locations for which their bid is iow.

Response:  The term "Jocations” should read “county locations”.

Page 7, Section 6. Delivery, 27 paragraph reads:

“When an Agency Release is issued to an awarded Véndor, from December 1, 2011 through
March 15, 2011, a delivety date of four (4) working days ......"

Response: To further explain what is required on this “delivery date” and expected thereafter
until the amount requested on the Agency Release is filled:

“‘An initial defivery must be made to the Division of Highways within four (4) working days or an
accepted alternative delivery date must be established; delivery must be completely filled within
(10) working days or an accspted alternative completion date must be established.”

Additional comment regarding Page 7, Section 6. Delivery:

The inability to deliver per the guidelines set forth in this section can still result In Vendor
Performances.

. Page 8, Section 6. Delivery, Inability to Deliver Section, 5% paragraph reads:

“The Division of Highways will also invoice the awarded Véndor the difference in cost from the
awarded Vendor's price and the alternative obtained source’s price.”

Response; Please replace "will also” with the wording, “reserves the right to'".

Page 14. Bid Schedule for District 5, the second delivery/storage site currently reads:
"Berkely, I-81 @ Exit 12"
Response: Please replace with: "Berkeley, |-81 @ Exit 8"

Page 15. Bid Schedule for Disttict 8, please remove the delivery /storage site locatiori and
estimated quantity from this bid schedule for:

"Tyler County, Sistersville Old Headquarters, 800 ton”

Page 17. Bid Schedule for District 8, the first delivery/storage site currently reads:
“Pendleton, Franklin”

Response: Please change to: "Franklin, 220 North"

The Bid Opening Date of June 29, 2011 at 1:30 pm will remain the same.
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EXHIBIT 10
. REQUISITION NO.: ............
ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

I HEREBY ACKNOWLEDGE RECEIPT OF THE FOLLOWING CHECKED
ADDENDUM(S) AND HAVE MADE THE NECESSARY REVISIONS TO MY
PROPOSAL, PLANS AND/OR SPECIFICATION, ETC.

ADDENDUM NO.'S:

[ UNDERSTAND THAT FAILURE TO CONFIRM THE RECEIPT OF THE
ADDENDUM(S) MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF BIDS. VENDOR
MUST CLEARLY UNDERSTAND THAT ANY VERBAL
REPRESENTATION MADE OR ASSUMED TO BE MADE DURING ANY
ORAL DISCUSSION HELD BETWEEN VENDOR'S REPRESENTATIVES
AND ANY STATE PERSONNEL IS NOT BINDING. ONLY THE
INFORMATION ISSUED IN WRITING AND ADDED TO THE
SPECIFICA'PION Y AN OFFICIAL ADDENDUM IS BINDING.

" SIGNATURE
Amertcan Rock Salt Co., LLC

..........................

COMPANY
June 27, 2011

ooooooooooooooooooooooooooo

REV. 11/96
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State of West Virginla
Purchasing Division
Paost Office Box 50130

RFQ COPY
TYPE . NAME/ADDRESS HERE

Department of Administration

Request for
Quotation

2019 Washington Street East
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

304-558-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

06/26/2011
BID OPENING DATE:

pooL .-

IADDENDUM

IANSWERS TO QUESTIONS
(ROAD SALTY.

BID DPENING DATE JAND
_ FROM- 06/29v11 AL:30

TO: '.07/06/11 A 1:3

'NO OTHER CHANGES.

STN

Np. 2

P.M.

of P.M.

- . [775-45
ROAD MAINTEN%NCE SALT :

xx¥x¥% THIS| IS THE END OF RFQ

SUBMITTED FOR SODIUM CHLORIDE

TIEME CHANGED

6611CI026 %x%%%%x%x TOTAL:

,f_-u.x“‘%g “ﬁ"ﬁloi
U“ "ﬁf '

RRRRAR
DATE

E"%”ﬁ'é) 762-7258 June 30, 2011

16-1516458

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



RFQ#6611C026 Addendum #2

Question:

1.

“What is the starting day for the order; wilt it be the day after the order Is received? For example, if
an order is raceived en Monday, would the first of the four days be considered Tuesday?”

Response:  The first of the four days will be considered 12:01 AM the moming (working day)
following the issue of the release.

“Is there a limit to the size of an order, or is there an average order size for orders placed? For
example, would the State order in 1,000 ton quantities, or would a typical order run 200-300 tons?"

Response: There is no typical order size,

“‘Does the option of accepting an alfemative delivery schedule mean there is flexibility to the four
day deadline (assuming a schedule is worked out that ensures prompt deliveries at acceptable
volume levels)?”

Response: Yes.

‘I se@ that Page 7 states one price for county sites in the Bidding Instructions saction and yet on

. the Confract Award section, it sounds like each line will be awarded and there is a space to write

different pricing on each bid line.”

Response: This was discussed and clarified at the pre-bid meeting and-is also addressed in
Addendum #1, ltem #7. See below:

7.  Page7, Section 5 Contract Award reads:
“All qualified Vendors who submit a valid bid for ‘FOB Division’s Storage Site”,

Seclion 12, Bid Schedule will be awarded a contract for those lgcations for which
their bid is low. -

Respanse: The term “locations” should read “county locations’.

“Are the 0 tons for the locations listed on the bid schedule page for pricing, considered place
holders?”’

Response: Piease refer to Section 2. Scope of Work, from the Bid Specifications. Even
though the Division of Highways does not list an estimated quantity to be delivered
to some county locations, we do not want to remove these county locations in
case of a need for Road Salt at that county location. If the need should arise, an
Agency Release will be issued by the Division of Highways to the awarded vendor.
Quantities listed on the Bid Schedule are astimates.
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State of West Virginia
VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application™ is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. {Does notapply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for thelr residency stafus, Such preferance is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code, This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division wilt make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reagon checked:

____ Bidderis an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this certification; or, ,

... Bidderisapartnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business contintiously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has
malntained lts headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately
preceding the date of this certification; or,

.. Bidderis anonresidentvendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date ofthis certification; or,

Application is mada for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certiftes that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West \iirginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding subimission of this bid; or,

Application Is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonrestdent vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimum of one hundred state residents who cerfifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiliate’s or subsidiary's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid: o,

Application ts made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets sither the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1} and (3) as stated above; o¥,

Application is made for 3.6% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:
Bldderis anhindividual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard

and has resided in West Vlrg|ma continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

i ®

l w

b

Application is made for 3,5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who is & veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Vitginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penalty
against such Bidder in an amount not to excesd 5% of the bid amount and that such penally will be paid to the contractlng agency
or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By subm!ssuon of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissloner to be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swaaring (West Virginia Gode, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and If anything contained within this certificate
" changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Divisfon in writing immediately,

[ &

Bidder: ' Signed:

Date: Title:

*Cheock any combinallon of preference consideration(s) indicated ahove, which you are enfitled to receive.
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STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division )

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: No contract or renewal of any' contract may be awarded by the state or any of its

poliical subdivislons to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party to the

vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the
aggregais,

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt" means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its
political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulied workers' compensation
premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state or any of its
political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

“Debtor" means any Individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or
business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions. "Political subdivision” means any county
commission: municipality; county board-of education; any instrumentality established by a county or municipality; any
separate corporation or Instrumentality established by one or more counties or municipalities, as permitted by faw; or any
public body charged by law with the performance of a government function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one
or more counties or municipalities. “Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership,.
-association, limited liability company or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, refated to any
vendor by blood, marriage, owrership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest
with the vendor so that the party will dctually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other
consideration from petformance of & vendor coniract with the party receiving an amount that mests or exceed five percent
of the total contract amount.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuani
to chapter eleven of thls code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the
matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in
default of any of the provisions of such plan of agreement.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginfa Code §61-5-3), it is hereby cerlified that the vendor affirms and
acknowledges the information in this affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE

Vendor's Name: _American Rock Salt Co., LLC

L L07 f/// (@ pates _lune 27, 2011

ie A. McClain

Authorized Signature: .

‘State of _ New York

County of _L jvingston , to-wit:
Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this 27thday of _June . 2013.

My Commission expires April 25 , 2013,

AFFIX SEAL HERE “ NOTARY PUBLIC m}\}‘ % ™~

Michele E. Booher
Notary Public, State of New York
No. 01B06126032
Qualified in Livingston County
Commission Expires April 25, 201>
Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 12/15/09)




