

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

### Request for Quotation

PAPER10

PA	GE
	1

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

JO ANN ADKINS

\*709055310 304-547-0414 LIBERTY DISTRIBUTORS INC PO BOX 498 TRIADELPHIA WV 26059

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

DATE PRINTED TERMS OF SALE SHIP VIA F.O.B. FREIGHT TERMS 08/27/2010 BID OPENING DATE 09/15/2010 01:30PM BID OPENING TIME CAT LINE QUANTITY UOP ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE AMOUNT REQUEST FOR QUOTATION THE PURCHASING DIVISION IS SOLICITING BIDS FOR A BLANKET OPEN END STATEWIDE CONTRACT TO PROVIDE VARIOUS SIZES OF PAPER TO WEST VIRGINIA STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISONS. ATTACHMENTS TO THIS REQUEST FOR QUOTATION: 1. PAPER10 SPECIFICATIONS, DATED 08/26/10, 4 PAGES. 2. PAPER10 PRICING PAGES, DATED 08/27/10, 4 PAGES. B VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE RECEIVED 4. PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT 2010 SEP 14 A 9: 261 PURCHASING DIVISION STATE OF WV b001 ĖΑ B95-50 1 MISCELLANEOUS PAPER-COMPUTER-TYPING, ETC. EXHIBIT 3 LIFE OF CONTRACT: THIS CONTRACT BECOMES EFFECTIVE ON AND EXTENDS FOR A PERIOD OF ONE (1) /ear or until such "reasonable time" thereafter as is NECESSARY TO OBTAIN A NEW CONTRACT OR RENEW THE THE "REASONABLE TIME" PERIOD SHALL ORIGINAL CONTRACT NOT EXCEED TWELVE (12) MONTHS. DURING THIS "REASONABLE FIME" THE VENDOR WAY TERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR ANY REASON UPON GIVING THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 30 DAYS WRITTEN NOTICE. SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS SIGNATURE TITLE FEIN

## GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

- 1. Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginia.
- 2. The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.
- 3. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division and have paid the required \$125 fee.
- 4. All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Order/Contracts are to be continued for the term of the Purchase Order/Contracts, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or goods this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.
- Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.
- 6. Interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.
- 7. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.
- 8. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.
- 9. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.
- 10. The laws of the State of West Virginia and the *Legislative Rules* of the Purchasing Division shall govern the purchasing process.
- 11. Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written agreement of the parties.
- **12. BANKRUPTCY:** In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, the State may deem this contract null and void, and terminate such contract without further order.
- 13. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, is available online at www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.htm and is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.
- 14. CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the agency's policies, procedures, and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and Information Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy/noticeConfidentiality.pdf.
- 15. LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia Secretary of State's Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, and the West Virginia Insurance Commission. The vendor must provide all necessary releases to obtain information to enable the director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good standing with the above entities.
- 16. ANTITRUST: In submitting a bid to any agency for the State of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that if the bid is accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or transfer to the State of West Virginia all rights, title and interest in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and the State of West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the particular commodities or services purchased or acquired by the State of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders the initial payment to the bidder.

I certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm, limited liability company, partnership, or person or entity submitting a bid for the same material, supplies, equipment or services and is in all respects fair and without collusion or Fraud. I further certify that I am authorized to sign the certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid.

#### **INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS**

- 1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division. Complete all sections of the quotation form.
- 2. Items offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the specifications must be clearly indicated by the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as **EQUAL** to the specifications must be clearly defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications and literature to the bid. The Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications.
- 3. Unit prices shall prevail in case of discrepancy. All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the quotation.
- 4. All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications: Department of Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Street East, P.O. Box 50130, Charleston, WV 25305-0130
- 5. Communication during the solicitation, bid, evaluation or award periods, except through the Purchasing Division, is strictly prohibited (W.Va. C.S.R. §148-1-6.6).



State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

# Request for Quotation

PAPER10

P/	AGE
	2

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

TO ANN ADKINS 304-558-8802

#OOZ#<

\*709055310 304-547-0414 LIBERTY DISTRIBUTORS INC PO BOX 498

TRIADELPHIA WV 26059

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

DATE PRIN	ITED	TER	IMS OF SAL	E	SHIP	/IA		F.O.B.		FREIGHT TERMS
08/27/	/2010									
BID OPENING DATE		09/15/	2010	100000000000000000000000000000000000000		BID	OPE	NING TIME	01	:30PM
LINE	QUAI	YTITY	UOP	CAT. NO.	ITEM NU			UNITPRICE		AMOUNT
						•	1000000	•	<u> </u>	
	IN THI	S CONT	RACT :	росим		TERMS,	CON	DELSEWHER: NDITIONS AND OF THE		
	WRITTED SUBMITT DAYS PO BE IN A ORIGINA	N CONS: FED TO RIOR TO ACCORD	ENT OF THE SANCE NEARCH	F THE DIREC EXPI WITH	SPENDING TOR OF PU RATION DA THE TERMS	UNIT AL RCHASING TE. SUG AND COL	NDI CH NDI	ON THE MUT VENDOR, THIRTY (30 RENEWAL SI TIONS OF 1	) HALL PHE	
•	RIGHT TO NOTICE SUPPLIE	TO CANC TO THI ED ARE	CEL TI E VENI OF AI	HIS CO DOR II N INFI	ONTRACT IN F THE COMM ERIOR QUA	MMEDIATI MODITIE: LITY OR	ELY S A DO	RESERVES UPON WRI ND/OR SER NOT CONFO	TTEN /ICES DRM	
	AUTHOR: MARKET ESTIMA: IMMEDIA CAUSES	IZE A S , WITH FE, IT ATE DEI (INCLU ION OR	SPEND DUT TI EMS SI LIVER JDING	ING UNITED TO THE PECIFORM IN	NIT TO PU LING OF A LED ON TH EMERGENCI NOT LIMIT	RCHASE ( REQUIS IS CONTI ES DUE ' ED TO DI	ON TTI RAC TO ELA	ON OR COST	1 1S-	
	APPROXITHE STATEMENT THAT THE ORDEREI	MATION TE SPI TE CONT FOR I	NS ONI ENDING FRACT DELIVE	LY, BA SUNIT SHALI ERY DU ESS TI	ASED ON EST. IT IS LOVER TO THE LAN THE QUENTY	STIMATES UNDERS HE QUANT TERM OF	S S TOO TIT T T		Z EED LLY	
SIGNATURE				SEE RE	VERSE SIDE FOR T	ERMS AND CO	NOITION	UNS	DATE	
						LECTIONE			DATE	
TITLE		FE	IN					ADDRESS C	HANGES	TO BE NOTED ABOVE
147	IEN DEOD	ONIDINIO :	TO DEO	INOU	TAIAAAT AND	ADDDEGO	<del>     </del>	DACE ADOVE	ADE: 6	D 8/51/2001



POCZEK

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

## Request for Quotation

PAPER10

PAGE 3

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

JO ANN ADKINS 304-558-8802

\*709055310 304-547-0414 LIBERTY DISTRIBUTORS INC PO BOX 498

TRIADELPHIA WV 26059

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

DATE PRINT	ED TEI	RMS OF SALE	SHIP VIA		FOB	FREIGHT TERMS
08/27/2	2010					
BID OPENING DATE:	09/15/		100000000000000000000000000000000000000	BID OP	PENING TIME 01	:30PM
LINE	QUANTITY	UOP CAT.	ITEM NUMBER	3	UNITPRICE	AMOUNT
	THE VENDOR FOR THE ORIGINAL VENDOR AS AUMAILED TO THE RETAINED BY BANKRUPTCY:  FOR BANKRUPTCY:	CEDURE: SP E CONTRACT OR COMMODI COPY OF T THORIZATIO E PURCHASI THE SPENDI IN THE EV	ORDER (FORI TIES COVEREI HE WV-39 SHA N FOR SHIPMI NG DIVISION, NG UNIT. ENT THE VENI ION, THIS CO	M NUMBE D BY TH ALL BE ENT, A , AND A  OOR/CON ONTRACT	ALL ISSUE A ER WV-39) TO HIS CONTRACT. MAILED TO THE SECOND COPY A THIRD COPY HIRD COPY	
S C C A	SHALL SUPERS CONDITIONS W OCCUMENTS SU	EDE ANY ANI HICH MAY A CH AS PRICI R MAINTENAI EDIUM SUCH	D ALL SUBSEÇ PPEAR ON ANY E LISTS, ORI NCE AGREEMEN	QUENT T Y ATTAC DER FORI	HED PRINTED	
		•	OF RFQ	PAPER1	, 0 ***** TOTAL:	
	•	SEE RE	VERSE SIDE FOR TERM	S AND CONDIT	TIONS	
SIGNATURE				PHONE	DATE	
TITLE	I <sub>E</sub>	EIN				
					ADDRESS CHANGES	TO BE NOTED ABOVE

### Inquiries:

Written questions shall be accepted through close of business, Tuesday, September 7, 2010. Questions may be sent via USPS, fax, courier or email. In order to assure no vendor receives an unfair advantage, no substantive questions will be answered orally. If possible, e-mail questions are preferred. Address inquiries to:

Jo Ann Adkins
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street, East
Charleston, WV 25305
Fax: 304.558.4115

Email: jo.a.adkins@wv.gov

### Delivery:

All orders of paper must be delivered within 10 working days after receipt of order.

All orders totaling \$1,000.00 or more to a single West Virginia delivery point shall be F.O.B. destination.

Orders totaling less than \$1,000.00 to a single West Virginia delivery point may (at the vendor's discretion) be F.O.B. shipping point. Vendor must inform the ordering agency of the estimated freight charges for all orders on which a delivery charge shall be made.

If the vendor has a fixed delivery charge for orders less than \$1,000.00, the vendor shall indicate the amount on the pricing pages.

If the vendor will ship all orders, regardless of dollar total, they should so state on the pricing pages.

### **Paper Requirements**

All paper is to be ream wrapped (except where noted). All fine papers are to be listed in the most current edition of "Grade Finders".

### **Specifications – PAPER 2010**

There are two envelopes on the pricing pages. The price per box of 500 envelopes should be entered in the unit price column.

### Computer paper

Construction: continuous, marginally punched on both sides for high speed printer feed. Paper shall be blank, ½" green bar, 1/6" green bar, or three lines per inch as indicated at the time the order is placed. No up-charge will be permitted on green bar paper.

Horizontal Perforations: All sets of forms shall have horizontal perforation between sets through all parts and carbons. Horizontal perforations shall be at right angle to marginal aligning holes and fall halfway between marginal aligning holes; 12 cuts per inch vertical perforations: Paper shall be non-perforated on right and left sided unless specified for a particular item. If specified, vertical perforations are to result in clean edges when aligning strips are removed.

Fastening: paper shall have temporary crimping or incomplete holes. Carbons, if any, shall be mechanically removable without aligning strips. Wire stitching or stapling is unacceptable.

Packaging: Paper shall be folded, with no breaks, in close-fitting cartons, with a corrugated or fiberboard pad on top and bottom. Cartons shall be labeled on one end, identifying form size, type, number of parts, and vendor name and address.

### **Award**

The State of West Virginia reserves the right to award multiple contracts if it is deemed to be in the best interests of the State of West Virginia.

### **Recycled Paper**

Recycled paper must meet the minimum recycled content guidelines issued by the Environmental Protection Agency (EPA). The EPA guidelines require minimums of 30% post consumer content for most uncoated printing and writing papers, and 10% for most coated paper.

**NOTE**: In addition to those items identified as recycled, recycled items meeting individual specifications may be bid for other items on this contract. Recycled paper shall be given a 10% preference over virgin paper.

#### **Bids**

### **Specifications – PAPER 2010**

All prices for paper are to be quoted per 1,000 sheets. If the item is a multiple page set, prices must be quoted per 1,000 sets. For example, the pricing pages may show 25; that would be 25,000 sheets.

All bids submitted must be firm for 90 days from contract award date. After the initial 90 days, Vendors will be permitted to make substantiated requests for increase at 90 day intervals, with 30-days notice. Vendor shall be required to submit a complete price list on both paper and electronic (CD or email) in an Excel format. For each price where a price change occurs (+ or -) the vendor must indicate + or – and the new price of each item. If no changes occurs, the price column shall remain unchanged, but shall reflect the same cost.

This, in effect, will limit the number of change orders to a MAXIMUM of four (4) per year. Prices bid are not subject to any "upcharges". Failure to hold prices firm for each 90-day period shall be grounds to disqualify the bid or cancel any subsequent contract.

Change orders shall not be done at interim periods for price decreases. The vendors shall be expected to quote the lesser prices and invoice accordingly in the event that decreases occur during each of the 90-day periods. Decreases may be done at the normal 90-day timetable, but shall not be changed via change order until the next 90-day cycle.

#### NO ALTERNATE TERMS SHALL BE ACCEPTED.

At any time the vendor requests a price adjustment, the purchasing division may either accept the price adjustment and amend the contract accordingly, or reject the adjustment in its entirety and cancel the contract.

Vendors should indicate the brand names for all items bid. Samples may be required for any and all of the items bid. When/if samples are requested, vendors must submit samples within 10 days of the request for the bid on that item or group of items will be rejected. Vendors bidding should include mill swatch books (covering all applicable items) with their bid. Successful bidder(s) may also be required to furnish swatch books to any and all agencies upon request throughout the life of this contract.

**NOTE**: "PM" in the unit of measure column = per thousand

**NOTE**: All quantities are estimates and are not to be construed as any guarantee of any quantity.

Contract Coordinator

### **Specifications – PAPER 2010**

Vendors should complete the vendor contract coordinator information at the end of the pricing pages. If the individual who "manages" any subsequent contract is a different person, please list that information also.

### Reports

Successful vendor shall be required to submit quarterly reports of all purchases against the contract. Additionally, vendor shall be required to submit an annual report that contains the total amount of purchases and the agencies which have placed orders against the contract.

Γ			<del> </del>				<u> </u>		]
	ltem	Description	Size	Weight	Color	EST Usage (1000)	Price Per 1,000	Total	_
	1	bond: #1 watermark, sulphite	8-1/2 x 11	20#	white			3336	00
-	2	bond: #1 watermark, sulphite bond: #1 watermark, sulphite	8-1/2 X 14 11 x 17	20#	white	75 75			1
-	<u>3</u>	bond: #4 premium	8-1/2 x 11	20#	white white	110,000		671,000	1.00
-	5	bond: #4 premium	8-1/2 x 14	20#	white	150		1260.	
	6	bond: #4 premium	11 x 17	20#	white		13.23	793.8	0
_	7	bond: #4 premium	17 x 22	20#	white	30		310	
$\vdash$	8	bond: #4 premium bond: #4 premium	17-1/2 x 22-1/2 23 x 35	20#/50 20#/50	white white	30	2695 5588	8685	415
$\vdash$	10	bond: #4 premium	25 x 38	20#/50		30	66.15	1972	10
	11	bond: #4 premium, 3 hole punch, unlined	8-1/2 x 11	20#	white	150	7.17	1075	50
	12	bond: #4 premium recycled, 3 hole punch, unlined	8-1/2 x 11	20#	white	150	7.90	1185.	00
	13	bond: #4 premium recycled	8-1/2 x 11	20#	white		7.40	814,00	0.0
,  -	14 15	bond: #4 premium recycled bond: #4 premium recycled	8-1/2 x 11 8-1/2 x 14	20#	colors white		7.88	197000	00
۴  _	16	bond: #4 premium recycled	8-1/2 x 14	20#	colors	100	10.58	217 4	5
٠Ľ	17	bond: #4 premium recycled	11 x 17	20#	white	100 20	15.86	1586.	00
, [	18	bond: #4 premium recycled	11 x17	20#	colors	25,000	16.41	41025	0.00
	19	bond: #4 premium recycled	17-1/2 x 22-1/2	20#/50	colors	30	31.85	955.5	10
$\perp$	20	offset: #2 coated,regular, smooth	17-1/2 x 22-1/2	60#	white	30		810	ł
$\vdash$	21 22	offset: #2 coated,regular, smooth offset: #2 coated,regular, smooth	17-1/2 x 22-1/2 17-1/2 x 22-1/2	70# 80#	white white	30		810	-
	23	offset: #2 coated,regular, smooth	17-1/2 x 22-1/2	100#	white	30		810	
	24	offset: #2 coated,regular, smooth	19 x 25	60#	white		38.80	1164,	60
	25	offset: #2 coated,regular, smooth	19 x 25	70#	white	30	43.64	13 09.8	20
_	26	offset: #2 coated regular, smooth	19 x 25	80#	white	30	49.87	1496.	10
-	27	offset: #2 coated,regular, smooth	19 x 25	100#	white	30	6235	1870.	50
-	28 29	offset: #2 coated,regular, smooth offset: #2 coated,regular, smooth	23 x 35 23 x 35	60# 70#	white white	30	65.92 14.20	2226	00
	30	offset: #2 coated,regular, smooth	23 x 35	80#	white	30	84.80	2504.	00
	31	offset: #2 coated,regular, smooth	23 x 35	100#	white	30	10543	3162.	90
	32	offset: #2 coated,regular, smooth	25 x 38	60#	white	30	22.66	2329	80
	33	offset: #2 coated regular, smooth	25 x 38	70#	white		87.30		
-	34 35	offset: #2 coated,regular, smooth offset: #2 coated,regular, smooth	25 x 38 25 x 38	80# 100#	white white	30	99.76	2992	80
$\vdash$	36	offset: #2 coated,regular, smooth	28 x 40	60#	white	30	124.71	27721	50
-	37	offset: #2 coated,regular, smooth	28 x 40	70#	white	30	102.88	3086	40
	38	offset: #2 coated,regular, smooth	28 x 40	80#	white	30	117.85	3535	,5c
	39	offset: #2 coated,regular, smooth	28 x 40	100#	white		147.15		50
-	40	offset: #2 recycled, coated, regular, smooth offset: #2 recycled, coated, regular, smooth	17-1/2 x 22-1/2 17-1/2 x 22-1/2	60# 70#	white		NO	BID	
-	41 42	offset: #2 recycled, coated, regular, smooth	17-1/2 x 22-1/2	80#	white white	30	NO	310	
-	43	offset: #2 recycled, coated, regular, smooth	19 x 25	60#	white	30	38.82	1164	60
	44	offset: #2 recycled, coated, regular, smooth	19 x 25	70#	white	i 30 i	43641	1309	20
	45	offset: #2 recycled, coated, regular, smooth	19 x 25	80#	white	30	49.87	1496.	10
_	46	offset: #2 recycled, coated, regular, smooth	23 x 35	60#	white	30	65.92	1911.	60
-	47 48	offset: #2 recycled, coated, regular, smooth offset: #2 recycled, coated, regular, smooth	23 x 35 23 x 35	70# 80#	white white	30	74.20	2226	00
$\vdash$	49	offset: #2 recycled, coated, regular, smooth	25 x 38	60#	white	30	77.64	23 19	80
	50	offset: #2 recycled, coated, regular, smooth	25 x 38	70#	white	30	87.30	2619,	00
	51	offset: #2 recycled, coated, regular, smooth	25 x 38	80#	white	30	99.76	2992	80
	52	offset: #1 regular finish	8-1/2 x 11	50#	white	105	No	310	
<u> </u>		offset: #1 regular finish	8-1/2 x 11	60#	white		7.68	460.8	0
-		offset: #1 regular finish offset: #1 regular finish, recycled	8-1/2 x 11 8-1/2 x 11	70# 50#	white white	60 30		538.4	9
-		offset: #1 regular finish, recycled	8-1/2 x 11	70#	white	30	NO	B10	
$\vdash$		offset: #1 regular finish	8-1/2 x 14	50#	white			810	
	58	offset: #1 regular finish	8-1/2 x 14	60#	white	120 20	10,46	12551	20
L		offset: #1 regular finish	8-1/2 x 14	70#	white	120 20	12.20	1464.	00
·	60	offset: #1 regular finish	11 x 17	50#	white	100 30	13.12	1372.	00
-		offset: #1 regular finish offset: #1 regular finish	11 x 17	60# 70#	white . white	30	16.45	4431	οn On
		offset: #1 regular finish	17-1/2 x 22-1/2	50#	white	301	19.20	2/2	50
		offset: #1 regular finish	17-1/2 x 22-1/2	60#	white	30	32.02	960.	60
1		offset: #1 regular finish	17-1/2 x 22-1/2	70#	white	30	37.14	1114	20

Ž

9

EST Usage Price Per Size Weight Color (1000)1,000 Total ltem Description 66 offset: #1 regular finish 19 x 25 50# white 19 x 25 60# offset: #1 regular finish white 67 68 offset: #1 regular finish 19 x 25 70# white 50# 23 x 35 white 69 offset: #1 regular finish 70 offset: #1 regular finish 23 x 35 60# white 71 offset: #1 regular finish 23 x 35 70# white 72 offset: #1 regular finish 25 x 38 50# white 73 offset: #1 regular finish 25 x 38 60# white 74 30 89.67 2690,10 25 x 38 70# white offset: #1 regular finish 6.56 1312.00 8.55 641.25 99.6 747.00 NO BID NO BID 50# white 75 offset: #1 vellum 8-1/2 x 11 8-1/2 x 11 60# white 75 76 offset: #1 vellum 77 offset: #1 vellum 8-1/2 x 11 70# white 78 offset: #1 vellum 8-1/2 x 11 50# colors NO offset: #1 vellum 8-1/2 x 11 60# colors 79 offset: #1 vellum 8-1/2 x 11 70# colors 30 NO B10 80 30 13.15 1315.00 30 19.13 513.90 50# 81 offset: #1 vellum white 11 x 17 60# 513.90 82 offset: #1 vellum 11 x 17 white ND 11 x17 70# 30 B 1/1 83 offset: #1 vellum white 84 offset: #1 vellum 11 x17 50# colors NO BID 0 810 5.71 107 1. NO BID NO BID 72.85 2185.50 50 85.002550,00 30 99.342980 20 30 NO BID 10 NO BID 10 810 10 NO BID 60# 30 85 offset: #1 vellum 11 x 17 colors 86 offset: #1 vellum 11 x 17 70# colors 87 offset: #1 vellum 17-1/2 x 22-1/2 50# white 88 offset: #1 vellum 17-1/2 x 22-1/2 60# white offset: #1 vellum 17-1/2 x 22-1/2 70# white 89 offset: #1 vellum 17-1/2 x 22-1/2 80# white 90 50# 91 offset: #1 vellum 23 x 35 white 60# 92 offset: #1 vellum 23 x 35 white 93 offset: #1 vellum  $23 \times 35$ 70# white 94 offset: #1 vellum 23 x 35 80# white 95 offset: #1 vellum 23 x 35 50# colors 96 offset: #1 vellum 23 x 35 60# colors offset: #1 vellum 70# 97 23 x 35 colors offset: #1 vellum 23 x 35 80# colors 98 70# 99 offset: #1 opaque, embossed 23 x 35 white 25 x 38 70# 100 offset: #1 opaque, embossed white 70# offset: #1 opaque, embossed 23 x 35 101 colors 102 offset: #1 opaque, embossed 25 x 38 70# colors 60# 103 cover: #3 coated 20 x 26 white 104 cover: #3 coated 23 x 35 60# white 30 103.40 3102.00 30 16031 4809 30 30 139243877 20 105 cover: #3 coated 20 x 26 80# white 23 x 35 80# white 106 cover: #3 coated 107 cover: #3 coated 20 x 26 100# white 30 200,33 6009, 90 75 18.95 1421.25 108  $23 \times 35$ 100# white cover: #3 coated 8-1/2 x 11 65# 109 offset: #1 opaque, cover white 45 23.34 1050.30 80# 110 18-1/2 x 11 offset: #1 opaque, cover white offset: #1 opaque, cover 30 20 111 8-1/2 x 11 65# colors 810 30 NO 310 112 offset: #1 opaque, cover 8-1/2 x 11 80# colors 30 /1.48 524. 30 /8.48 554. 113 index: #4 8-1/2 x 11 90# white 114 index: #4 8-1/2 x 11 90# colors 30 20.68 620. 40 30 21.98 659.40 index: #4 115 8-1/2 x 11 110# white index: #4 8-1/2 x 11 110# 116 colors 30 142 96 4288.80 117 90# index: #4 22-1/2 x 35 white NO BID 151404542.00 25-1/2 x 30-1/2 90# 118 index: #4 white 22-1/2 x 35 90# 119 index: #4 colors 120 index: #4 25-1/2 x 30-1/2 90# colors 30 NO B10 30 169.36 5080 80 121 index: #4 22-1/2 x 35 110# white 30 /67.04 50/1, 20 30 /79.70 53 9 1, 00 30 /77.29 53 1 8, 10 25-1/2 x 30-1/2 110# index: #4 white 122 00 22-1/2 x 35 110# 123 index: #4 colors index: #4 25-1/2 x 30-1/2 110# colors 124 30 / 77.24 53/8.70
30 / 42.96 42.88,80
30 / 67.04 5012.70
30 / 67.04 5011.20
75 / 1.71 878.25
75 / 3.20 990.00 90# 125 index: #4 recycled 22-1/2 x 35 white 126 index: #4 recycled 25-1/2 x 30-1/2 110# white 22-1/2 x 35 90# colors 127 index: #4 recycled 128 index: #4 recycled 25-1/2 x 30-1/2 110# colors 129 8-1/2 x 11 carbonless: 2 part carbonless: 3 part, straight 8-1/2 x 11 130 8-1/2 x 11 131 carbonless: 4 part, straight 14.60 1095,00 132 carbonless: 5 part, straight 8-1/2 x 11

\*\*

XX

\*\* 40 case Minimum.

ltem	Description	Size	Weight	Color	EST Usage (1000)	Price Per 1,000	Total	
133	carbonless: 6 part, straight	8-1/2 x 11			75	NO	BID	1
134	carbonless: 2 part, straight	8-1/2 x 14				14.92	11190	
135	carbonless: 3 part, straight	8-1/2 x 14			75	16.80	1260.	po
136	carbonless: 4 part, straight	8-1/2 x 14			75	17.96	1347,	]00
137	carbonless: 5 part, straight	8-1/2 x 14				1860		00
138	carbonless: 6 part, straight	8-1/2 x 14			75	NO	BIA	_]
139	carbonless: 2 part, straight	11 x 17				23.40		
140	carbonless: 3 part, straight	11 x 17			75	26.37	1970.	75
141	carbonless: 4 part, straight	11 x 17			75	28.19	2114	25
142	carbonless: 5 part, straight	11 x 17			75	29.21	2190	. 15
143	carbonless: 2 part, reverse	8-1/2 x 11			60	11.71	702.	60
144	carbonless: 3 part, reverse	8-1/2 x 11			60	13.20	192.	,00
145	carbonless: 4 part, reverse	8-1/2 x 11			60	14.10	846.	00
146	carbonless: 5 part, reverse	8-1/2 x 11			60	14.60	8761	00
147	carbonless: 6 part, reverse	8-1/2 x 11				15.02	9011	20
148	carbonless: 2 part, reverse	8-1/2 x 14		1	60		895,	20
149	carbonless: 3 part, reverse	8-1/2 x 14			60		1008.	00
150	carbonless: 4 part, reverse	8-1/2 x 14				17.96		
151	carbonless: 5 part, reverse	8-1/2 x 14	<u> </u>	ļ		18.60		60
152	carbonless: 6 part, reverse	8-1/2 x 14		<b></b>	60	NO	B10	1
153	carbonless: 2 part, reverse	11 x 17		<b></b>	60		1404.	00
154	carbonless: 3 part, reverse	11 x 17		<del>  </del>	60	26.37	1582	120
155	carbonless: 4 part, reverse	11 x 17		-	60	28.19	1691	40
156	carbonless: 5 part, reverse	11 x 17				29.21	1752	160
157	carbonless: 6 part, reverse	11 x 17		ļ l	60	NO	BID	1/2
158	carbonless: 4 part, reverse	17-1/2 x 22-1/2		<b> </b>	60	60.29	3617	120
159	carbonless: cb	8-1/2 × 11		white	75	13.01	9801	20
160	carbonless: cb	8-1/2 x 11		color	30	13.26	397	100
161	carbonless: cfb	8-1/2 x 11		white	75	15.84	11886	00
162	carbonless: cfb	8-1/2 x 11		color		16-03		
163 164	carbonless: cf	8-1/2 x 11		white	75	9.36	100,0	P I
165	carbonless: cb	8-1/2 x 11 8-1/2 x 14		color	301	10.31	309.0	0
166	carbonless: cb			white	75	16.55	1241.	25
167	carboniess; cb	8-1/2 x 14 8-1/2 x 14		color	30	16:16	5000	00
168	carbonless: cfb	8-1/2 x 14		white		20.20		
169	carbonless: cf	8-1/2 x 14		color white	- 30	20.40	61000	
170	carbonless: cf	8-1/2 x 14		color	75	11.88	371,6	80
171	carbonless: cb	11 x 17		white	30	13.10	2720	2
172	carbonless; cb	11 x 17		color		26.50		
173	carbonless: cfb	11 x 17		white	30		954.	
174	carbonless: cfb	11 x 17		color	30	32.15	9/04.	50
175	carbonless; cf	11 x 17		white	30	18 80	564 6	0
176	carbonless: cf	11 x 17		color		20.11	621.3	0
177	carbonless: cb	22-1/2 x 34-1/2		white		111.00		
178	carbonless: cb	22-1/2 x 34-1/2		color	30	112,73	<del>3387.</del>	40
	carbonless: cfb	22-1/2 x 34-1/2		white	30	134.43	403 ≈.	
180	carbonless: cfb	22-1/2 x 34-1/2	1	color	30	135.88	4076	40
181	carbonless: cf	22-1/2 x 34-1/2	-	white	30	79.10	237 3	(CC)
182	carbonless: cf	22-1/2 x 34-1/2		color	30	87.12	7613.	6
183	carbonless: cf tag	22-1/2 x 34-1/2		white	30	25661	7698	30
184	carbonless: cf tag	22-1/2 x 34-1/2		manila		256 61		
185	compound: padding for carbonless paper	quarts			300	25.35	1605.4	0
	compound: padding for carbonless paper	gallons			600	74.56	44.136	.00
	laser print: 25% cotton fiber	8-1/2 x 11	24#	white	150	22.53 3	3379	50
	laser print: BR 92	8-1/2 x 11	24#	white	150	10 43 1	564.	50
	laser print: BR 92	8-12 x 14	24#	white	60	13 26	795.	60
	laser print: BR 92	11 x 17	24#	white	30	13.26	025.	80
	chipboard, plain, .030 calipre bundle	8-1/2 x 11			300	28.26	8478	00
	chipboard, plain, .030 calipre bundle	8-1/2 x 14			150	37.04	5556	.00
	chipboard, plain, .030 calipre bundle	22-1/2 x 34-1/2	_			19.16		
	paper: wrap, kraft or equal roll	18"w x 9"dia.	40#		75	16.40 1	230.	SO
	paper: wrap, kraft or equal roll	24"w x 9"dia.	40#		75	21,92	1644.	00
	paper: wrap, kraft or equal each	30"w x 9"dia.Roll	40#		75	27.45	20581	75
197	paper: wrap, kraft or equal, recycled each	18'w x 9"dia. Roll	40#		75	16.40 /	230.	00
		,						
198 199	wrap: plastic shrink, center fold each	16" width Roll	75 gauge		75	128.02	1601.	50

\*\* \*\*

\* 40 ease minimum

AXX pries per Bundle 90 sheets/Bundle

					EST Usage	Price Per	
ltem	Description	Size	Weight	Color	(1000)	1,000	Total
200	Linen - Ivory	8 1/2 x 11	24#		1000	23.18	23,01
201	Linen Envelope - Ivory	#10	24#		1000	36.51	3651
202	Writing Ivory	8 1/2 x 11	24#		1000	9.24	92401
203	lvory Envelope	#10	24#		1000	1656	16,56
	Company Liberty Di	istributors					
	Contact BARBARA WIN	UDON Signature	Back	der	W.	uda	
	Company Liberty Distributors  Contact BARBARA WINDON Signature Barbar Windon  (Print Name)  Phone: 800-828-9920  Date 9-9-10						
	Fax: 304-547-04	90					
	Email: BARBARA W @ Libe	astu Distribu	tores.	20m			

\* 40 case winimum



State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

# Request for Quotation

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF:

JO ANN ADKINS 304-558-8802

1	*7(	9055
۱	LII	BERTY
1	PO	BOX
1		9055 BERTY BOX

310 304-547-0414 DISTRIBUTORS INC 498

TRIADELPHIA WV 26059

ALL STATE AGENCIES \$ H P AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

DATE PRIN	TED	TER	MS OF SAL	É	SI	IIP VIA	F.O.B.		FREIGHT TERMS
09/14/ BID OPENING DATE	2010								
BID OPENING DATE	:	9/28/2	2010	505000500050000000000000000000000000000	T-000000000000000000000000000000000000	BID	OPENING TI	ME 01	:30PM
LINE	OUAN	ITITY	UOP	CAT. NO	ITEM	NUMBER	UNITPR	ICE	AMOUNT
	x <del>1000000000000000000000000000000000000</del>	<u> </u>	incomensativida.						
	1						•		
		11111			NT 370		1		
	*****	****	Υ × ×	ADDENI	DUM NO.	T ****	******	****	
	l pro c	אואדואים	יייי ארו א	ם אנו ק	מאלים אורי	ህኒኒቲኒን መረጎ ሲ	9/28/2010.		
	T.BID (	) E E II T II (	DAII	r nao	DEEN MC	DAED IO O	9/20/2010.		
	! 2. SUMI	TTED I	BID PI	RICINO	: A MUST F	T MATT E	OR ONE YEA	R	
	SEE ATT							•••	:
					•				:
	*****	*****	NO	ADDI:	CIONAL C	CHANGES	******	****	
									1
•	ļ							and the second	EIVED
			·						2000 g & COND 2000.
							·		
				-				tud tieP :	20 A II: 10'
									V
								JAAS	E OF WV
								STAT	E OF MA
									1
									•
001			CA	17	95-50				
١,	MT CORT T	1		ID CON		WDTMG TIM			, <u>uşu</u> . 10
1	HISCETT	AMEOUS	PAPE	rK-CON	IBOIEK-I	YPING, ET	4.		
;	*****	THIS	IS TH	E ENI	OF RFQ	PAPE	R10 *****	TOTAL:	
		-			!				
	e e						e e e		
7	<u> </u>			SEERE	ERSE SIDE FO	R TERMS AND CO	L INDITIONS		
SIGNATURE	. Ki	<u></u>	<u> </u>	<u></u>	and the second s		547-0414	DATE	2//
THIE MEAN		croe	iN			1 304-			1/1/10
Wir. of Pul	rchasi	ng	.گ	5-06	77029		ADDRE	SS CHANGES	TO BE NOTED ABOVE
<i>U</i> \\\\\\\	EN DEQD	<b>つがごいた</b> :	TO DEO	INCED	T NIAME AN	ID ADDDESS	IN SPACE ABO	VELADELE	D VENDOR'



State of West Virginia Joe Manchin III

Telephone: (304) 558-2000 Toll Free: 1-888-438-2731 FAX: (304) 342-7025 www.wvgov.org

MEMORANDUM

To:

Office of the Governor

Charleston, WV 25305

1900 Kanawha Boulevard, East

State Capitol

All Cabinet Secretaries and Bureau Chiefs

From:

Joe Manchin III

Governor

Date:

June 7, 2010

Re:

**Budget Constraints** 

By my memo dated August 24, 2009, each agency was instructed to institute budget constraints to meet the challenges we faced from the declining economy. Be aware these directives are still in force.

Currently, our general revenue collections are below that of last fiscal year's collections and projections for fiscal year 2011 reflect continued collection shortfalls. Therefore, you are still expected to hold operational, maintenance, licensing costs and rental/lease rates flat over the next twelve (12) month period.

Agency heads are not authorized to approve such fees or rates. Please notify each vendor or landlord of these fiscal constraints.

Thank you.

### LIBERTY DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

PO Box 498, Rt. 40 East Triadelphia, WV 26059 304-547-0414

September 13, 2010

Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street E. Charleston, WV 25305

RE: Paper10

Enclosed please find quote from Liberty Distributors, Inc. for the Paper10 Request for Quotation, which opens September 15, 2010 at 1:30pm. Enclosed also are swatchbooks/samples for the items quoted, except for the Genuine Gloss & Genuine Gloss Cover, which are in the process of being refurbished by the manufacturer.

Thank you for the opportunity to quote and if there are any questions I can be reached at 1-800-828-9920 x-517 or by email at <a href="mailto:barbaraw@libertydistributors.com">barbaraw@libertydistributors.com</a>.

Sincerely.

Barbara Windon

Customer Service/Purchasing.

Jahara Wishon

Enclosure:
Paper10 Bid
Accent Opaque
Williamsburg
Springhill
Hammermill Digital
Imation
Royal Linen
Coronado SST
Atlas Bond

Rev. 09/08

### State of West Virginia

### **VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE**

Certification and application\* is hereby made for Preference in accordance with **West Virginia Code**, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to construction contracts). **West Virginia Code**, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid) preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in accordance with the **West Virginia Code**. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1.	Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:  Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,
	Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,
	Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,
2.	Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked: Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,
3.	Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:  Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees or Bidder's affiliate's or subsidiary's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,
4.	Application is made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:  Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,
5.	Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked: Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is submitted; or,
6.	Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked: Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.
requirer against	understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the nents for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penalty such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to the contracting agency cted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.
authoriz the requ	nission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and es the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid irred business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information I by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.
and acc	cenalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true curate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate is during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Division in writing immediately.
Date:	9-4010 Title: C.S./ Purchesing
*Check a	ny combination of preference consideration(s) indicated above, which you are entitled to receive.

REQ No. PAPER 10

## STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA Purchasing Division

### **PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT**

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate.

#### **DEFINITIONS:**

WITHEOU THE FOLLOWING CONTAINE

"Debt" means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers' compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

"Debtor" means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions. "Political subdivision" means any county commission; municipality; county board of education; any instrumentality established by a county or municipality; any separate corporation or instrumentality established by one or more counties or municipalities, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by law with the performance of a government function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or municipalities. "Related party" means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total contract amount.

**EXCEPTION:** The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to chapter eleven of this code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (**West Virginia Code** §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor affirms and acknowledges the information in this affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE
Vendor's Name: Liberty Nixtributars, Inc.
Authorized Signature: Date: 9-9-10
State of TUU
County of Ohio, to-wit:
Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this $\frac{Q_{TH}}{Q_{TH}}$ day of $\frac{Q_{TH}}{Q_{TH}}$ day of $\frac{Q_{TH}}{Q_{TH}}$ , $\frac{Q_{TH}}{Q_{TH}}$ , $\frac{Q_{TH}}{Q_{TH}}$ , $\frac{Q_{TH}}{Q_{TH}}$
My Commission expires AUSUST 31 , 2014.
AFFIX SEAL NOTARY PUBLIC LAND Y. Blickste
C. State of West Virginia
**************************************